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High levels of lead detected in children 
by Susan Allen 
Staff Writer 

For the second time in about a 
year, high lead levels in children liv­
ing in the West Prestonsburg area 
have local health officials concerned 
and state environmental inspectors 
are trying to determine where the 
problem is originating. 

The Floyd County Health Depart­
mentconductcd an after-school clinic 
yesterday to perform cluster screen­
ing of children residing in the West 

Prestonsburg area. 
Carol Holbrook, director of the 

health department. said Thursday that 
she is very concerned about the situ­
ation. 

"It's very much of a concern," 
Holbrook said. "We hope everyone 
takes advantage of (the screening 
clinic)." 

Ann Johnson, state coordinator for 
the Kentucky Childhood Lead Poi­
soning Prevention Program, said 
Thursday that it was reported last 
week that approximately 25 children 

Jones stumps 
for park plan 
at Jenny Wiley 

By Matt McCarty 
Staff Writer 

. 
Governor Brereton Jones was at 

the Jenny Wiley Lodge to dnnn up 
support for his $100 million parlc­
renovation plan Thursday as he con-

House okays 
proposal for 
road system 

The U.S. HouseofRepresentatives' 
Public Works and Tmnsportation 
Committee gave final approval Tues­
day to legislation which could lead to 
the development of an interstate high­
way in southeastern Kentucky. 

The legislation, which creates a 
National Highway System (NHS), 
could also signal the first step in a 
long-standing effort to four-lane 
Route 114 from Prestonsburg to 
Salyersville. The committee authO­
rized $6 million for widening that 
access to the Mountain Parkway. 

Fifth District Congressman Hal 
Rogers said in a news release issued 
Tuesday that the NHS "recognizes 
the needs of road-starved and eco­
nomically-needy counties in south­
em and eastern Kentucky." 

tinued his week-long bus trip to "no­
where." 

In his introduction before a capac­
ity crowd in the lobby of the lodge, 
Jones disagreed with a recent Lex­
ington Herald-Leader editorial that 
characterized bis trip to the state parks 
as a "road to nowhere." "Floyd 
County is somewhere," he declared 
as he wadded a copy of the Herald­
Leader's editorial and threw it to­
ward the crowd. 

Jones said that about $13 million 
of the $100 million would be directed 
toward the Jenny Wiley State Park 
with $6.6 million of Ulat going to a 
"world class" golf course. 

"I predict to you that will be one of 
the best investments that we make," 
Jones said, "because it will be world 
class." 

Government officials from six 
counties, including Floyd; park em­
ployees and area business leaders 
wereonhandfortheGovernor'svisit. 

Although most of the crowd was 
in attendance to show their support 
for the park-renovation plan, there 
were also several faculty and stu­
dents from Prestonsburg Community 
College, who thought PCC' s build­
ing projects should also be included 
in the budget. 

(See Jones, page two) 

in West Prestonsburg area have el­
evated levels of lead in their blood. 
Johnson said the local health depart­
ment was granted permission to con­
duct the cluster screening of children 
in the area. 

Holbrook said that the health de­
partment was notified by alecal physi­
cal of the high lead levels and that 
Thursday's screening would be per­
formed on children not covered un­
der the department Well Child pro­
gram. 

Usually, children six months to 

six years of age are screened under 
the Well Child program. Children 
over the age of six will be screened at 
the after-school clinic. 

In a letter to parents living in the 
that area, health department officials 
say that the lead levels are "rising 
again after a previous decline." 

Health department field workers 
made door-to-door visits in the com­
munity, distributing the letter and 
talking with residents about the con­
cern, Holbrook explained. She said 
thatthereareapproximately 150fami-

lies living in the area. 
Blood specimens taken during 

Thursday's clinic will be sent to the 
Jefferson County Health Department 
for analysis and the results are ex­
pected to known in about three weeks. 

Health ofhcials will do a "finger­
stick" to obtain the blood sample 
needed for test. Holbrook said. 

If anyone is unable to attend 
Thursday's clinic, an appointment 
with the health department can be 
made for a later date or parents may 
take their children to a physician for 

.. I've got to read some of these signs ..... 
Governor Brereton Jones shook hands with Betty Hunt, • Prestonsburg Community College student and 
employee, outside the May Lodge at Jenny Wiley State ParkThuraday. Hunt was one of several students from 
the college who demonstrated her support for projects at the college. (photo by Polly Ward) 

Industrial site near Allen 
is optioned by authority 

by Susan Allen 
Staff Writer 

Floyd County's Development 
Authority is eyeing a 35-acre tract 
near Allen valued at just under $1 
million for the development of an 
industrial site. 

Board members voted Wednes­
day to take a six-month option on the 
site owned by Marshall Davidson 

and his heirs. The authority's execu­
tive director, Darrell Gilliam, said 
the property has a $900,000 price tag. 

After apparently discussing the 
issue in closed session, Gilliam rec­
ommended the board take the option 
on the property. No details were of­
fered about the site or plans for devel­
opment. 

Gilliam said Thursday that the site 
is located three miles south of Allen 

and would only say that it's "looking 
good for an industrial prospect" to 
locate at that site. 

Also Wednesday, Gilliam reported 
that Floyd County has almost a half 
million dollars in coal sevemnce tax 
revenues. Gilliam said that that fig­
ure should double next year when the 
return of severance tax money paid 
by counties will jump from six to 
thirteen percent 

Corridors identified by the legisla­
tion, which sets priorities for future 
construction, modernization and im­
provements, include Kentucky Route 
80, Route 114 and Route 15 and U.S. 
Route 23 and Route 119. At Rogers' 
request, U.S. Route 460 from 
Paintsville to Salyersville was added 
to the priority list for federal funding. 

New director sought to replace Mayo 
for downtown Main Street program 

County Attorney Jim Hammond 
told the board that the county's strat­
egy for using those funds is to ex­
haust Floyd County's share by buy­
ing and developing industrial sites 
and then "leap frog" into the multi­
county account 

The committee-approved legisla­
tion also finalizes a southeastern route 
for a new, cross-country Interstate 
66, which will pass within 25 miles of 
Pikeville and which will run from 
Washington D.C. to the west coast. 

by Scott Perry 
Times Editor 

The city of Prestonsburg has initi­
atedasearch fora new director for the 
city's grant-funded Main Street pro­
gram. following the dismissal last 
week of Main Street manager Henry 
Mayo. 

Long waits likely on 
birth record requests 

Parents who plan to register their 
children for kindergarten or fu-st grade 
should obtain children's birth certifi­
cates now, said Jennifer Martin, Floyd 
County School Health Coordinator/ 
School Nurse. 

"Parents need to go ahead and get 
thatordered,"Martin said. "They may 
have to wait a little longer this year." 

Martin expressed concern that 
parents may experience delays in re­
ceiving their children's records of 
birth after the Cabinet for Human 
Resources announced Friday that the 
usual four-week wait for obtaining 
the certificate could be as much as six 
weeks. 

Barbara White, registrar of vital 
statistics in the Kentucky Department 
for Health Services, said the office 
had to shut down for a week in Janu­
ary due to weather conditions and 
that the shutdown has lengthened the 
waiting period. 

"Birth certificates are needed for 
various activities,'' she said, "and 

there's always a wait if you request a 
certificate by mail. This time of year 
always has the longest wait because 
of the number of requests for certifi­
cates for summer activities." 

"This year is worse because of the 
time we lost during the snow week in 
January," she said . 

White also advised anyone who 
will need a birth certificate for sum­
mer to get the request in as soon as 
possible. 

Birth certificates are needed for 
signing up for some summer athletic 
leagues and tournaments, for obtain­
ing a passport. and for pre-register­
ing for kindergarten and first grade. 

Certificates cost $7 each. To ob­
tain a certified copy of a birth certifi-. 
cate, complete and mail an order form 
(available at the Floyd County Health 
Department), or write to the Vital 
Statistics Office, Cabinet for Human 
Resources, 275 E. Main St, Frank­
fort,KY 40621-000I.Includeacheck 
or money order for each copy or­
dered. 

Mayor Jerry Fannin confirmed 
Tuesday that Mayo had been fired 
because city officials "weren't happy 
with the amount of work being ac­
complished" in the Main Street pro­
gram. 

The Main Street project, funded by 
a one-time state gmnt. offers grants 
and low interest loans to businesses 

located within specific boundaries in 
downtown Prestonsburg. Funds can 
be used for upgrading storefronts or 
other structural improvements. 

Fannin said he and city council 
members would administer the pro­
gram until a replacement for Mayo is 
hired. 

Mayo could not be reached. 

Gilliam said that the multi-county 
fund has $4.5 million in it and the 
contribution to that account should 
also double by next year. Surround­
ing counties can apply forfunds from 
the multi-county account to be used 
for economic development 

Board member Paul Gearheart was 
absent from Wednesday's meeting. 

Flying high and drug free 
Fifth grade D.A.R.E. students got to look Inside a Health Net helicopter Wednesday during the annual D.A.R.E. 
Day in the Park sponsored by the Floyd County Sheriff's Department. The event Is held at the downstream area 
at Jenny Wiley State Park. (photo by Susan Allen) 

the test. Holbrook said. 
It was discovered some time last 

summer that children living in the 
West Prestonsburg area had high lead 
levels in their blood, Holbrook said. 
Those children were given medica­
tion to lower those levels, and once 
the medication was stopped, the level 
began to rise again, Holbrook said. 

Environmental officials have not 
notified the health department if they 
have determined what is causing the 

(See Lead, page two) 

Two races 
on ballot; 
light vote 
expected 

by Susan Allen 
. Staff Writer 

Local election watchers aren't 
expecting a big turnout for Tuesday's 
Primary Election with only two mces 
on the ballot 

Voters will pick from four Demo­
cratic challengers for state represen­
tative from the 92nd district Incum­
bent Russell Bentley faces candidates 
Donnie Newsome, Alonzo Combs 
and Hubert Halbert. 

In the other mce, two candidates 
are vying to be the Democratic candi­
date who will try to upseat United 
States Representative Harold "Hal" 
Rogers in the Fifth Congressional 
District. 

StevenMaynardandWalter"Doc" 
Blevins face off Tuesday to see who 
will challenge Rogers in the Novem­
ber General Election. 

Not all Floyd Countains will cast 
their votes in the 92nd State Repre­
sentative mce. Only residents voting 
in the Middle Creek/Jack Allen, 
Rough & Tough, Maytown, Bosco, 
Garrett/RockFork,Lackey/Wayland 
and Beech Grove will vote in that 
race. 

StateRepresentativeGregStumbo 
represents the other areas of Floyd 
County and he is' unopposed in his re­
election bid. 

There are no Republican races on 
next week's primary ballot. 

Polls open at 6 a.m. and close at 6 
p.m. 

Hot topics to greet 
court in meet today 

Floyd County's Fiscal Court will 
meet at 10 a.m. Friday (today) in 
what is expected to be a meeting 
filled with much debate. 

Court members are expected to 
discuss a proposal from Rumpke of 
Kentucky for solid waste pickup and 
disposal . 

Representatives from solid waste 
disposal companies are expected to 
attend the meeting to ask why they 
were not approached about submit­
ting a proposal similar to R umpke' s. 

Also expected to attend today's 
meeting are local business and school 
officials whose garbage rates will 
triple under Rumpke's plan. 

Prior to the 10 a.m. meeting, the 
court will hold a budget hearing at 9 
a.m. to discuss how funds in the 
county's road aid and LGEA will be 
used. 

Dope smuggling 
case goes to panel 

A Floyd County Grand Jury will 
hear charges against a Floyd County 
man who is accused of trying to 
smuggle marijuana into the Floyd 
County Jail in a fast food dinner. 

Terry McCutcheon, 30, of Betsy 
Layne, is charged with flfSt degree 
promoting contraband for allegedly 
putting a bag of marijuana in a con­
tainer of mashed potatoes that he 
brought to his jailed brother-in-law. 

In a preliminary hearing Wednes­
day in Floyd District Court, Judge 
Danny Caudill found that there was 
probable cause to warmnt the charge 
and the case was waived to the grand 
jury. 
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Mining industry 
under fire on Frontline 

The General Mining Law of 1872 
allows mining companies virtually 
free access to billions of dollars in 
public minerals. While Interior Sec­
retary Bru~e Babbitt bas vowed to 
overhaul this exploitative industry, 
the Clinton administration's recent 
compromises have sent a different 
message. 

Frontline takes a bard look at the 
current state of the mining industry in 
the American West in "Public Lands, 
Private Profits," airing on KET at 10 
p.m. Saturday, May 28. The battle 
between Western mining interests and 
federal policy makers is really a fight 
over who will rule the West in the 
21st century, says producer Stephen 
Talbot. Meanwhile such disasters as 
the one at Summitville, Colo., the 
"Exxon Valdez" of the mining indus­
try, cost taxpayers millions. 

Officers who mend hearts 
Mended Hearts Big Sandy Chapter 220, Installation of 1994 officers was held at May Lodge, Tuesday, May 
10. New officers, left to right, are: Walter Snavely, treasurer; Mosaleete Patton, secretary; William Hughes, 
3rd vice president; Joe Adams, 2nd vice president; Ray Prather, vice president; Beverly Goble, president; 
Freddie Goble, co-treasurer. The installation ceremony was conducted by Charles Christmas, of Louslville, 
vice president of National Mended Hearts, Inc. (photo by Zina Goble) 

Pre-teen finalist 
Karl Michelle Ross, daughter of 

Christine and J obnnie Ross of Pres­
tonsburg, bas been selected asafmal­
ist in the 1994 Pre-Teen Kentucky 
Scholarship and Recognition Pro­
gram to be held June 3-5 at the Galt 
House Hotel in Louisville. Jones------------------ (Continued from page one) Pre-Teen Kentucky is a by-invita­
tion only Scholarship and Recogni­
tion event involving young ladies 7 
to 12 years Qf age ranking in the top 
10% of the state academically. Addi­
tionally, young ladies are invited who 
have been recognized publicly for 
their outstanding personal achieve­
ments, leadership abilities or creative 
talents. 

The group of demonstrators held 
up signs outside the lodge before 
Jones' arrival and during his speech. 

Some of the signs said, "Don't let 
our students and community down 
- please support Prestonsburg Com­
munity College," and 'Prestonsburg 
Community College projects belong 
in Ky' s budget." 

"We want him to put our pro­
grams, which include two buildings, 
back in Kentucky's budget," Betty 
Hunt, a student at PCC who also 

works as an office assistant in the 
Business Affairs office, said in an 
interview outside the lodge. 

The buildings that the demonstra­
tors want in the budget are a wellness 
center for the main campus and a 
classroom building for the Pikeville 
campus. 

They don't, however, think that 
Governor Jones should ignore the 
parks either. 

"We're saying in addition to," 

Vaccinate your children to 
protect them from disease 

Advances in the way children are 
vaccinated have made it easier than 
ever to protect your child from com­
mon, but potentially lethal, childhood 
diseases. 

New, combination vacci,pes allow 
physicians to protect children from 
several diseases with one inocula­
tion, which should make every one 
who bas tried to reassure a child that 
"the shot won't hurt for very long" 
feel better about the ordeal, accord­
ing to Janet Kurzynske, extension 
nutrition specialist with the Univer­
sity of Kentucky College of Agricul­
ture. 

The development of vaccines to 
protectagainstcbildhooddiseaseshas 
been the hallmark of the second half 
of the 20th century. Before vaccines, 
thousands of children died each year 
from common diseases, such as 

Pre-retirement conference 
If you are a public employee par­

ticipating in the county employees, 
Kentucky employees or State Police 
retirement systems, you are invited 
to attend a General Pre-Retirement 
Conference on May 26 and 27 from 
8:30a.m. to 3:30p.m. atJennyWiley 
State Park. 

Speakers will discuss retirement 
benefits, social security and other 
aspects of retirement The confer­
ence is free. 

Are you afraid of 
the next beating? 

Call someone 
who can help. 

886-6025 
(Floyd County) 

1-800-649-6605 
(Outside Floyd County) 

measles, mumps, whooping cough 
and polio. And many more thousands 
suffered permanent damage as a re­
sult of the diseases. 

Today, vaccineshavenearlyeradi­
cated several diseases, such as small­
pox, polio, whooping cough and 
Haemophilus influenza B, she said. 

"The near eradication of these dis­
eases has come from two factors. 
First, children vaccinated were pro­
tected against the disease. Second, 
because so many children were vac­
cinated-and did not develop the dis­
eases-there were drnmatically fewer 
sources of infection for exposure for 
children who did not receive the vac­
cinations," Kurzynske said. 

As a result of fewer outbreaks of 
these diseases, many parents have 
not worried about getting their child 
vaccinated. The outcome is that sev­
eral of the diseases that previously 
were on the decline have sprung up 
with new infections among those 
children not protected, she said. 

Measles, for example, dropped to 
fewer than 1,500 cases in the U.S. in 
1983, only to surge to more tlian 
55,000casesbetween 1989and 1991, 
leading to 132 deaths. 

Estimates on the number of 
unvaccinated children range from 37 
to 56 percent of American children 
under two years of age. In certain 
areas where poverty is pervasive, the 
Center for Disease Control estimates 
that fewer than 10 percent of children 
have been vaccinated. 

"If you have not had your child 
vaccinatedagainstthecommoncbild­
hood diseases, you need to schedule 
your child for them at once. Your 
health care provider will be able to 
start your child on the schedule or 
bring your child up to date on over­
due vaccinations," Kurzynske said. 

In Kentucky, families can have 
their children immunized at the 
county health department The cost 
of the immunizations varies accord­
ing to the family's income, she said. 

For The Best In Paving 
Roads • Parking Lots • Sealing 

Highland Paving Co. 
Call any time: 

452·2078 or 452-2059 

DR. W.C. THORNDYKE 

T MDCM, FRCS T 
Specialist in Urology 

606-638-1311 
Three Rivers Medical Plaza Suite 201 
P.O. Box 569 Louisa, KY 41230 

Office Hours: 9:00-5:00, Mon.-Fri. 

Hunt said. 
Jones responded to the group by 

saying, "We're going to continue to 
(bring money to PCC)." 

Jones also made it clear that tax­
payers would not face an increase to 
pay for the park-renovation plan. 

"We will not raise taxes," Jones 
said. "We are not proposing any tax 
increase on anybody." 

Jones plans to use an tmbudgeted 
surplus of at least $35 million in the 
current fiscal year to begin renova­
tion of the parks in 1994-95. If the 
extra revenue proves to be recurring 
next year, Jones plans to issue bonds 
to finance the remainder of his 
projects. 

The governor will call a special 
session of the General Assembly in 
June to pass a new, two-year state 
budget 

The remainder of the $13 million 
allocated for Jenny Wiley Park will 
be for a $675,000 thousand pool area 
expansion and renovation and a$1.3 
million boat dock replacement. 

State Representative Greg 
Stumbo, wboalsomadeabriefspeecb 
after Jones, supp<Xting the Governor's 
park proposal, said in an interview 
afterwards, "I don't think there' sany 
question that Governor Jones bas the 
support of the people (in improving 
the state's parks)." 

"We'll be a golfer's destination," 
Jim Kennedy, Jenny Wiley Park 
Manager, said after the Governor's 
speech. 

The hope is that the golf course 
will bring in more tourists to the area 
which will mean added revenue and, 
according to Kennedy, that will 
prompt more private sectors to build 
hotels and motels in the area. 

Jenny Wiley Park employees 115 
people and brings in $10 million an­
nually. 

The National Headquarters for the 
Pre-Teen America Scholarship and 
Recognition Program is located in 
Baton Rouge, Louisiana. Patricia 
Daniel is the Founder and National 
Director. 

Lead--
(Continued from page one) 

elevated lead levels. 
State officials could not be reached 

Thursday for comment. 
According to the World Book 

Encyclopedia, lead poisoning can be 
caused by eating dried paint chips or 
it can be absorbed by the body from 
inhaling lead dust or fumes. Some 
forms ofleadcan be absorbed through 
the skin. 

Lead interferes with the body's 
ability to produce read blood cells 
and can damage the brain, liver and 
other body organs. 

Holbrook said that elevated lead 
levels in children can cause mental 
retardation. 

Symptoms of lead poisoning in­
clude anemia, headaches, irritability, 
weakness, abdominal pain, vomiting 
and constipation. In severe cases, 
symptoms may include convulsions, 
coma and paralysis. Such cases may 
cause death. 

For more infonnation contact the 
Floyd County Health Department at 
(606) 886-2788. 

tiJie cfiiUren of ~ran{( ana 9-fester L es{ie of Cow Cree{( 
would Cik.? to e~tenc£ an invitation to a{[ famiCy ana 
friendS to cefe6rate tfuir fiftie tli wetftfing anniversary 
on Suncfay, !May 22, 1994, from 2 p.m.-4 p.m., at tfie 
Cow Creef(tJ3aptist Cfiurcfi. 

No gifts, please. 

SMp 7M ~~Ut«at ?'tJ4t«<ee 2uae 
IJ~ '8~ SaLe/ 91ant 

Twin Size Set ............ $21999 Queen Size Set ..• $35999 

Full Size Set ...••..•.••••. $29999 King Size Set •..•.• $39999 

ajar 
Ji_:b:- u .......... ~ Prestonsburg Village, Hwy. 23 
1 ~-11 ~"! Prestonsburg, KY 41653 

F U E • ' {606) 886•8668 

Let us help your child lose weight. Allen 
First Baptist Church is offering a First 
Place Weight Loss Program for 
Children. 

The program will consist of: 
1. Motivational leadership 
2. Children's activities 
3. Weekly weigh-ins 

An organizational meeting will be held 
May 24th at 6:00p.m. For more information 
call: 

886-1600 
874-8063 
874-2873 

Back'ey Yfsl.hma 

& Yfllergy Cenler 
is now open for treating allergies and asthma 
in adults and children. 

If you have frequent colds, coughs, sinus 
problems, asthma, headaches, sore throat, 
watery eyes, dizzy spells, skin rashes or ear 
infections, you may have allergy problems. 

For an appointment for evaluation call 

( 606) 358-2381 
We accept SA, Medicate, Visa, MasterCard 

and most insurances. 

Located at Potter Medical Clinic, Lackey, Ky. 

Now Open For Business 

Come in today and take advantage of our special price on computerized wheel 
alignment. You'll appreciate the quality work and fast. friendly service that 

on I~ MIK E'S ran g1ve. 

~ ~BrakeRepalr!- .~ _ Computerized 
Shocks • · ·, . 4-WHEEL 

I 
& Struts alignment machine 

~11 - (fmnrcmdbm:l.:. 

!iii.< --4- I.G~ Replacement """'.~ "';·~""''1111 
! M , n,:>..,._ - :_:::_- -==-·------ -

For a smoother ride ll-Aluminum 
. . wheel changer 

bnng your automobile tO We can change 

MIKE'S B&W I almostanytire. 
. Mag. or Steel 

NOW SELLING 
Goodyear and Cordovan Tires 

Computerized Wheel Balancer 

Audio Video 

HOURS: 
Monday Saturday 9:00 - 5:00 

PHONE 
886-9682 

Located beside Pizza Hut, 
on U.S. 23 N., 

Prestonsburg, Ky. 
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Courthouse News 
AIDS update 
seminar at Pikeville 

Pikeville Methodist Hospital will 
present AIDS Update on May 20, 
June 3, and July 29 from 6-8 p.m. at 
the Educational Center located on the 
corner of 4th Street and Hambley 
Boulevard in Pikeville. Dr. Mary 
Pauline Fox will be the speaker. 

PROPERTY TRANSFERS Hayes Branch of Turkey Creek; 
Mae Banks Martin to Esta Mae Minnie Sammons to Gary Tuttle 

Banks Murton, two tracts of prop- and Thurman Tuttle, property on 
erty, one on Bull Creek and one on Beaver Creek; Paul Bryan and Edith 
Prater Creek; Jewell Blevins to Roy Glen and 

Robert B. and Marsha Boggs, Wanda Kaye Justice, property loca­
Christopher Boggs, Michael Boggs, tion not listed; 
Larry H. and Selma Lowe, Gary E. Elden and Norma Lee Bailey, 
and Glendora Lowe, John C. Lowe, Genevea Beverly to Paris and Ruby 
Ruth Melton, Lois and Don Amlin Blankenship, property on Right bea­
and Joan McRae to Palmer and Julia ver Creek; Larry Spears to Kenneth 
A. Bush, property location not listed; and Ethel Wallace, property at Prater 

Stallard and Betty E. Martin to Creek; 
MartinJ. and Cindy Green, property Paul and Frankie Tackett to Gor-
location not listed; don Lee Tackett, property location 

Virginia Keathley, Betty K. Hall, not listed; 
RobertA. Keathley, Jack and Winnie Rhonda Castle to Anthony Castle, 
Keathley to Commonwealth of Ken- quitclaim deed to property on Abbott 
tucky, property location not listed; Mountain; Peggy and Lloyd Stanley, 
Moses and Roberta Frasure to Elmer RubertNeal andDorothy Hackworth, 
Frasure,propertyonFrasure'sCreek; Charles Darwin and Cheryl 
Moses and Roberta Frasure to Buenal Hackwortb,NinaL. and Jim Hostetler 
FrasureRobertsonAgee,propertyon to Jerry Alan Patton, property on 
Frasure's Creek; Coppers Lick Fork of Abbott Creek; 

Elizabeth Rice, Clara Jean and Oma McCoy to Wanda Fern 
Harry Hamilton, Harry Gordon Rice Stephens, property in Burton Village 
Sr. and Diane Rice, Audrey Marie Subdivision;TheFloydCountyBoard 
and Hallard Lowe, Shirley Ann and of Education to Tivis Johnson, prop­
JohnDavis,RubyRice,AmandaRice, erty at Bypro; Russell and Sarah 
Barbara Rice and Debra Kay Rice to Laven to Jimmie Roger and Pauline 
RandolphandMarshaRiceMaynard, N. Green, property in the New Addi­
property on Rice Branch of Prater tion to Allen; 
Creek; Mary and Delbert Clemons, 

Pearl Spears to Goldie Moore, • Donald and Peggy Craft, George and 
propertyinAuxier;JuneandSheridan Catherine Craft, Phyllis Joseph, 
Ray Martin to Kenton Noel Martin, Johnny and Luann Craft, Kenneth 
property on Hayes Branch of Turkey and Lena Craft, Barbara Adkins, 
Creek; Doris and Dave Marsillett, Debra and 

June and Sheridan Ray Martin to Keith Coleman, Rebecca Eubank, 
Rodney Dean Martin, property on Marvin and Tammy Eubank, Ronnie 

Court of Justice Regional 
Legislative update 

Stephanie DeRossett, Barb 
Lykens, Lerena Wallace, Angela 
Spurlock, Linda DeRossett, Jean 
Compton, Vickie Howell, Johnnie 
Calhoun, Priscella Sammons, Linda 
Yates, Denise Ousley, Dovie 
Damron, Davis Anderson, and Sandra 
Johnson, Court of Justice official(s) 
from Floyd County, participated in a 
regional legislative update meeting 
at Jenny Wiley State Park on May 11. 

The Regional Legislative Update 
is designed to provide all employees 
of the Court of Justice with an oppor­
tunity to ask questions and discuss 
recent legislation passed by the Ken­
tucky General Assembly. 

Don Cetrulo, Director of the Ad­
ministrative Office of the Courts, 
opened the one-day session with a 
report on the 1994-96 Court of Jus­
tice budget. Specifically, Cetrulo ad­
dressed the Judicial Branch budget 
for the next two years, including sala­
riesandhealthcarereformforelected 
and appointed officials. 

Following Cetrulo's remarks, 
attenders separated into groups, de­
termined by profession. Judges met 
to discuss the recently-passed legis­
lation and its impact on the court 
system. The discussion leaders for 
the judges' group included one cir-

cuit and one district judge, both of 
whom were experienced instructors 
and bad received specific training for 
the regional meetings. 

Circuit clerics, deputy clerks, and 
judicial secretaries met with Cicely 
Lambert, General Counsel to the 
Administrative Office of the Courts, 
who reviewed the Court of Justice 
Sexual Harrassment Policies. The 
employees identified the · types of 
behaviorwhichmayconstitutesexual 
harassment and what procedures 
should be followed if sexual harass­
mentoccms. Circuit and deputy clerks 
also met with D. J. Simpson, AOC 
Field Services Representative, and 
discussed new legislation and its ef­
fect on circuit clerks office proce­
dures. 

Court Designated Workers and 
Pretrial Officers also met to discuss 
the effects of implementation of re­
cent legislation. The CDW meeting 
was conducted by AOC' s Juvenile 
Services staff, while pretrial officers 
met with AOC' s Pretrial staff. 

The regional legislative updates 
were sponsored and conducted by the 
Administrative Office of the Courts' 
EducationServicesDepartment, with 
special support from the deparunents 
ofLegal Services and Field Services. 

Kentucky advocates seek 
Acorn award nominations 

Kentuckians have until May 31 to 
submit nominations for the third an­
nual Acorn Award, which will be 
presented this fall to a teaching pro­
fessor exhibiting excellence in ser­
vice and commitment to students. 

Students, faculty, parents and the 
general public are invited to submit 
nominations. Nominees must be full­
time faculty members of any accred­
ited four-year Kentucky college or 
university. This year the advocates 
also have opened up the competition 
to any full-time faculty member of 
Kentucky'sjuniororcommunitycol­
leges. 

"This award is designed to recog­
nize inspired college teaching," said 
Dan Lacy, vice president of Corpo­
rate Communications for Ashland 
Oil. Lacy is chairman of the advo­
cates, a non-profit, all-volunteer or­
ganization dedicated to promoting 
the value of higher education in the 
Commonwealth. 

"Kentucky colleges and universi­
ties are filled with outstanding teach­
ers who embody the highest charac­
teristics of scholarship, teaching and 
service," Lacy said. 'This award gives 
much-deserved attention to those 
college professors who continually 
stimulate fertile young minds to 
search ant\ to stretch." 

The advocates chose the name 
"Acorn Award" to continue the theme 
established by the Advocates' presti­
gious OAK Awards, which are pre­
sented to outstanding alumni of Ken­
tucky colleges and universities. The 
Acorn Award symbolizes the pro­
cess of individual growth signified 
by the phrase, "Mighty oaks from 
little acorns grow." 

Acorn Award recipients receive a 

hand-carved plaque with an acorn 
and leaves in high relief and a $5,000 
honorarium. An endowment fund has 
been established to provide funding 
for the award. To nominate a teacher, 
write to the Kentucky Advocates for 
Higher Education, P.O. Box 391, 
Ashland, KY 4114. Please include 
the teacher's full name, the name of 
the college or university where the 
teacher works and the city where the 
school is located. 

1250 North Lake OltVe 

BEST VALUE 
$7.22ctn. 

DORAL $7.72 ctn. 
QPC $6.72 ctn. 

Wlnaton 8elec:t $10.72 ctn. 
cam.IAIWS 

$10.72 ctn . 
Martboro 

Buy 4 pks. get one FREE 
Free Marlboro Country Store 

Catalogs 
Trophy 

$7.00ctn. 
REDMAN 
$11 .00 ctn. 

LEVI GARRETT 
$11.19 ctn. 

BIMd 51$1 .9Q or 45¢ loaf, 
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31$1 .09, 

BrNd Crumbll -41$1 .00, 
LM~ Fresh Pie• $1 .00 
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and Debbie Eubank, Donna Eubank, 
Brian and Lisa Eubank, and Tracy 
Eubank to Melba Brown, property in 
Prestonsburg; 

Elizabeth Hall to Thomas M. and 
Faye Arlene Ellis, property on 
Frasures Creek; 

Reese Ray to Linda (Ray) Pat;k, 
quitclaim deed to property on 
Spurlock Fork of Middle Creek; Paul 
Bradford and Rhonda Hughes to 
Donald Shockey, property on Middle 
Creek; 

Robert B. and Marsha Boggs, 
Christopher Boggs, Michael Boggs, 
Larry H. and Selma Lowe, Gary E. 
and Glendora Lowe, John C. Lowe, 
Ruth Melton, Lois and Don Amlin 
and Joan McRae to Timothy and Lisa 
Malone, property location not listed; 

Darryl Gene and HermaLisaAllen 
to Herman and Jessie Sue Gray, prop­
erty on Bull Creek; Brenda K. Hatfield 
to David Justice, property at David; 

The seminar is free of charge and 
designed to meet the AIDS continu­
ing education requirement for Ken­
tucky relicensure of heaithcare pro­
fessionals. It is approved for all II 
healthcare professions. Two contact 
hours will be awarded at the comple­
tion of the seminar. 

At the completion of the seminar, 
participants will be able to: 

•Identify relevant facts pertinent 
to the disease prevalence within tl1e 
United States which includes basic 
medical and epidemiological infor­
mation. 

•Identify the verifted modes of 
HIV transmission. 

•Describe the current medical 
treatment for HIV. 

•Describe the method which pre­
vents the transmission of HIV, in­
cluding universal precautions. 

•Describe the managementofHIV 
in the health care workplace. 

Local 
789-4o6& 

agape 

scars 

Wedding Bands 1/4 ckt. 

Toll Free 
1-800-:346-4066 

Lloyd and Ethel Meade, Chloe 
Meade Hamish to Florence Meade, 
property onLeftBeaverCreek; Tilden 
R. and VervieEllis to Brenda Hatfield, 
property location not listed; Alicia 
Setser Salisbury to John L. Salisbury, 
quitclaim deed to property in Rolling 
Acres Estates; 

Randolph and Marsha Rice 
Maynard to Billy Gene Hunt and 
Pamela S. Bentley, property on Rice 
Branch of Prater Creek. 

•Identify the moral, ethical, and 
legal issues related to HIV, including 
methods to facilitate changes in atti­
tudes and behavior relative to AIDS 
patients. 

•Identify the comprehensive hu­
man services available for HIV pa­
tients. 

~$1~:95 
· Insect 

I 

Solitaires ~~. 
$189.00 and up 

Not exactly as shown. Not u:.:Uy as shown. 

Pikeville National Bank's innovative Rate RiderTM Five 
Year Certificate of Deposit lets you take advantage of rate 
increases automatically for the life of the certificate ... 

In an ever changing investment climate, Pikeville National Bank and Trust now offers a 
certificate of deposit that allows you to earn more for your money without a lot of red tape. 
The Rate Rider will adjust the interest rate automatically at the end of each quarter. For 
example, using today's rate: 

Amount Invested APY Rate* 
$2500 4.77% 4.69% 

$25.000 - $49 999.99 4.93% 4.84% 
$50 000 - $99 999.99 

iii 

4.98% 4.89% 
$100.000 - up 5.03% 4.94% 

The minimum deposit for the Rate Rider is $2,500 and the interest rate paid is based upon 
the amount invested. 
Additional deposits are allowed and quarterly interest may be added to the Rate Rider or 
transferred to another Pikeville National Bank account. 
Give us a call...find out more about the RATE RIDERTM Five Year Certificate of Deposit 
that lets you relax and collect the interest! 

· ~ 
. . 

·Pikeville 
National® 

Bank and Trus~ Con..pa.ny 
Member FDIC 

*Interest rate as of 5/17/94. Interes t rate is based on the amount of the certificate and will adjust at the end of each 
quarter. There is an early withdrawal penalty of six months interest. 
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Letters to the Editor are welcomed by the Floyd County Times. 
In accordance with our editorial page policy, all letters must include the signature, address and telephone number of the 

author. 

Phone 886-8506 
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USPS202-700 
Entered as second class matter. June 18, 1927, at the post office at Prestonsburg. Kentucky 
under the act of March 3. 1879. 

Second class" postage paid at Prestonsburg. Ky. 

Subscription Rates Per Year: 
In Floyd County, $28.00 

Outside Floyd County. $38.00 

Postmaster: 
Send change of address to: The Floyd County Times 
P.O. Box 391. Prestonsburg. Kentucky 41653 . 

ALLAN 5. PERRY 111-Publlsher·Editor 
Liberty of thought is the life of the soul-Voltaire 

To each his own • • • 

by Scott Perry 

You can't fit a square peg into 
a round hole, and Floyd County 
school officials would do well 
to recall that simple lesson when 
they continue the debate over 
the future ofFloyd County Tech­
nical High School. 

It's easy to suggest that every 
child ought to fit in to "tradi­
tional" molds where our educa­
tional system is concerned. 

But, fundamentally, that's an 
absurd notion. 

Traditional schools cannot be 
all things to all students for ob­
vious reasons. 

Students are as different as 
snowflakes and their interests 
as vari¢ as blades of grass. 

Why should we assume ... or 
demand ... that all children can 
fit together like sardines in a can 
when it comes to preparing them 
for their futures? 

Vocational education has got­
ten a bad rap for too long now as 
a dumping ground for kids who 
can't make it in the traditional 
classroom. 

That's a bunch of baloney. 

Somekidsarejustbettersuited 
to working with their hands than 
they are at deciphering quantum 
theories or interpreting the mo­
tives of Macbeth. 
If Shakespeare were alive to­

day, you can bet he wouldn't be 
capable of changing the oil in 
his own car. 

Vocational education is a vi­
able alternative to dropping out 
for many students, and we're 
darned if we can find any fault 
with that. 

If there is any criticism of the 
state's program, it should be with 
the state itself for failing to un­
derstand and promote vo-ed for 
what it is worth. 

The Floyd County School Sys­
tem would do itself and its stu­
dents a great disservice by cur­
tailing the system's vo-ed pro­
gram at Garth. 

Instead, they should be explor­
ing ways to make it more effec­
tive. 

It takes all kinds of people to 
make this world go 'round. 
Square pegs, round pegs, physi­
cists and auto mechanics. 

Why force everyone into the 
same mold? 

Letters may be edited for clarity and length. 

Mud Creek Reds 
Pee Wee team's 
roadblock success 

Editor: 
The Mud Creek Reds Pee Wee 

team would like to thank everyone 
whosupportedthemduringtheirroad­
block Saturday, May 14, at Harold. 

It was a huge success, and the 
proceeds will purchase new WlifotmS. 

A special thanks to Pizza Express 
for the pizza donated and delivered 
during the roadblock. 

The Reds would like to invite ev­
eryone to their games held at the 
Stumbo School Park on Monday, 
Wednesday,andSundayat5:30p.m. 

Thanks again for your support 

The Mud Creek Reds 
PeeWee Team 

"Kentucky Sheriffs' 
Association and Ranch 
needs your help" 

Editor: 
The Kentucky Sheriffs' Associa­

tion and the Kentucky Sheriffs' Boys 
and Girls Ranch will honor their own 
on Saturday, September 10, 1994. 

We need your help!! Maybe your 
father, husband, brother, uncle, grand­
father, great-grandfather or an ac­
quaintance, who was a Kentucky sher­
iff or deputy sheriffkilled or wounded 
in the line of duty. Ask your friends 
and neighbors if they know of any 
Kentucky sheriff or deputy ~heriff 
who was killed or wounded in the 
line of duty, dating back to when 
Kentucky became a state in 1792. 

You may have to do some "dig­
ging" genealogically speaking, but it 
might give us a name we do not 
already have on our Memorial Wall. 
If possible, a newspaper clipping or 
other such documentation detailing 
the circumstances of the death or 
injury of a sheriff or deputy sheriff 
would be most helpful and appreci­
ated by us. 

Sheriff Jim Murphy, President of 
the National Sheriffs' Association and 
other distinguished individuals from 
Kentucky will help us to memorial­
ize these individuals who gave their 
lives or were wounded in service to 
others. 

The sheriffs office has multiple 
duties including law enforcement; 
collecting taxes; serving the courts; 

serving process and other type pa- our organization, coming to our 
pers; transporting prisoners; and per- monthly meetings the third Friday of 
fonns election duties. Most of us each month at 7 p.m., held at the 
don't realize what they accomplish K.B.L.A.office. Have a voice in this: 
and the risks involved in carrying out help us to fight for your livelihood 
their duties. The Memorial Ceremony for you and your family. 
is our way of expressing our appre- Mrs.Davis,alongwithsomeother 
ciation for their service to others. volunteers will be traveling to Frank-

Our office number is (502) 362- fort the 12th of this month (May) to 
8660 and our mailing address is The meet with our governor. She will 
KY. Sheriffs' Ranch-P.O. Box 57, ,again be asking for help for you and 
Gilbertsville, KY. 42044. Our Fax your families. The need is great for a 
number is (502) 362-7534. Please, Black Lung clinic in our area for our 
send us any information you might coal workers and their fami · ~- Mrs. 
have on Kentucky sheriffs and deputy Davis and our volunteers v. .u be ask­
sheriffs who have been killed or ing our governor for his support to 
wounded in the line of duty so that we help us get this clinic which would 
may give them the recognition they enable us to be of greater help to our 
deserve. people who have this dreadful dis-

Ray Stoess ease. 
Executive Director Mrs. Davis has also scheduled a 
Kentucky Sheriffs' Association T.V. program with WPRG May 16, 
and Ranch at 7 p.m. At this time, she will have as 
P.O. Box 57 several guest speakers: a pulmonary 
Gilbertsville, KY 42044 specialist, a specialist in cardiology, 

and two lawyers. They will have a 

Black Lung group 
express thanks 
for help at festival 

Editor: 
Kentucky Black Lung Associa­

tion would like to take this opportu­
nity to thank everyone who so gra­
ciously gave of either merchandise 
from their business, baked or volun­
teered their time during Hillbilly 
Days. It would not have been pos­
sible without your support. There is 
no way we can thank all of you per­
sonally, but most of all God knows 
each of you and you will be blessed 
for helping your fellow man. 

The new bill that we have fought 
so hard for, is just a few weeks away 
from becoming a reality. Susie Davis 
as president of Kentucky Black Lung 
Association, has made numerous trips 
toW ashington, D.C. along with other 
volunteers, to lobby, talk to the sena­
tors personally and to testify before 
the senate. 

We cannot quit now. The out­
come looks very favorable, but we 
must continue to fight to make this 
dream come true for all you miners, 
coal truck drivers, tipple workers, 
railroad workers,.or any of you who 
have worked in any coal related job. 

Again, we cannot do this alone, 
we need you to support us and what 
you believe in to see this bill go 
through. You can do this by: joining 

"call-in" portion on this IX'Ogram. 
Phone 478-4200 and show your sup­
port by giving them a call. 

For more information, you may 
contact: Susie Davis, K.BL.A. 3402 
South Mayo Trail, Pikeville, Ky. 
41502. Or, telephone us Tuesdays or 
Wednesdays at (606) 437-0391. 

Erva Jean Ousley 
Pikeville 

Season for tornadoes 
As spring arrives, so does ttl$ 
~season for tornadoes. · , 
These treacherous storms ar& 
most common from April to July. 
~What are tornadoes? 
VIOlent rotating columns of alr 
that touch th& grouod; spaWOGd 
by large severe thunderstorms 
• Where is tornado alley? 
The wide open plains of the 
Central and Southam states, 
with the Gulf to the south and 
the Rockies to the west, make It 
most vulnerable to these storms. 

..,_"JYplcaJ path: 2 miles long, 49 
yards wide; SlOAt move from 
southwest to northeast 

..,_ Wind speed: 100 to 300 mph 

... ,.,,.,. _ou.r . . . .. ::'"' ,,,,,. . ............ . ··... '''')'t?,,.,, . ,, . , ..• . .. . ;i':::::r:::::::=;:::::r:· ·:::,:;:·" ._ .. . . . . . . 
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Ten Years Ago May23, 1984 

Phase 2 of the four-county Big Sandy Regional airpon wu 
awarded S 1,118,906 by the U.S. DepartmentofTrusportation .. Jury 

selection began in the trial of Charles Martin, 40, of Estill, who is 
charged with murdCI' in the shooting deaths of WalterS. Lazar and 
Reginald Lazar ..• Tite attempt of Romey and Mary Rose Spean to 
ltop mining company from crossing their Prater Creek property wu 

blocked by order of Floyd Circuit Judge Hollie Conley ... Burglaries 
and thefts dominated the list o{ 39 indictments returned by the Floyd 

Circuit Court grand jury ... FEMA reprcsematives said they would be 
keeping a close watch on how flood relief funds would be spent ... Tom 
Music, 36, of Lexington wu found guilty by a Floyd Circuit Court 

jury, of selling seven grams of cocaine and wu ordered to pay a 
4S,OOO fine: a panel composed mainly of the same jury convicted 

Ishmael Glen Hamilton, 26, of Teaberry, of selling two tablets of a 
prescription of p&inkillec and a small quantity o{ marijuana and was 
sentenCled to 18 months in prison and fined $3,000 ... A nearly non­
ltop stream o{ trucks hauled flood debris into the county landfill at 
Garth last week, filling in afew days a section that would usually take 

a month to fill ... There died: Sarah Blair, 51, olTram, Monday at OIA" 
Lady of the Way Hospital; Ted Stepp, 51, formerly of Prestonsburg, 
Thursday at the University of Alabama Hospita1; John C. Sanders, 74, 
formerly of Allen at the Baptist Health Care Center; De ward Wilcox, 
73, of Bays Branch, Thursday at the MOUiltain Manor Nursing Home; 

Cassie Johnson,68, of Dayton, Ohio Wednesday at the Miami Valley 
HoopJt.al in Dayton; Eugene Davis, S4, of Dwale, Tuesday at St. 

Joseph's Hospital in Lexington; Bennie Blackburn, 70, Saturday at 

his home at Allen following an apparent heart attack; Ricky 
Thornsberry, 18, of Garrett, Tuesday, when he wu allegedly struck 
by an automob1le accident while he wu fishing at Jones Fork. 

1 Twenty Years Ago (May 22, 1974) 

A dynamiting incident early Sunday morning, the second in the 
Prestonsburg area this year, almost demolished a coal tipple at West 

Prestonsburg and u of Tu8.5day, stAte and federal investigators were 
"in the dark" as to the identity of the person or penons 
respoDSible ... Work began Friday on the construction for the Fim 
Guaranty Bank of Martin of a half-million-dollar bank building at the 
junction of KY 80 and KY 122 (the Right and Left Beaver Creek 
highways) at the western limits of Martin ... Eieven-year-old Anthony 
Howell wu killed and a brother injured Sunday in the collapse of a log 
barn near their home on Mink Bruch, near Craynor ... The Prestons­
burg Blackcau bueball team last week won their second straight 
diruict baseball championship under Coach Fred Setser and his 

usistant, Russell Shepherd ... Born: to Mr. and Mrs. Clifford Sword, of 
lvel,ason. Tony Edward, May ll;toMr.andMrs.Milt Hunt, of Betsy 
Layne, a son. Tony Edward, May 11; to Mr. and Mrs. Milt Hunt, of 
Betsy Layne, a son, Brudford Otester, May 13 ..• Tbere died: James 
William Salisbury, 61, of Primer, veteran Floyd ccunty educator, 
Monday at Cellll'lll Baptist Hospital, Lexington; A. Dewey Allen. S6, 

of South Shore, Ky., formerly of Floyd ccunty, May 13; Ot•lctte 
FuherCole, 91, olWeebbury, last Friday atMcDowell;Mrs. Minnie 
England Whitaker, 70, Friday at her home at Ivyton; Mn. Dora 
Bentley, 70, formerly of East McDowell, last Wednesday in Hilliard, 
0.; Bill Jarrell, 70, ol Cow Creek, Saturday at Highlands Regional 
Medical Center; Mrs. Lula Click, 85, oC Langley, Thunday at the 
home of a daughter; Julius C. Hall, 59, of Weeksbury, Thursday at 
Lexington; Mrs. Gracie Slone W atkiD.ll Miller. 84, of David, Monday 
at Mountain Manor here. 

Thirty Years Ago (May 28, 1964) 
Every opportunity will be given the 1964 crop o{ high school 

graduates to take advantage of the facilities o{ the Prestonsburg 

Community College when it opeD.ll in September, and so student 
applications will be taken beyond the previously announced 

deadline ... Although the firSt and second fi00£3 oC the new courthowe 
will be completed within the next 10 days, the structure may DO( be 
occupied by county offices before mid-summer, it wu indicated this 

week. .. The chairmanship oC the Republican in this county wu won 
Saturday by J. L. (Jack) Hyden. ofPrestonsburg ... Congressman Carl 
D. Perkins won the Democratic nomination for the Seventh district 
Congressional post with the greatest of ease Tuesday, and at the same 
time former Circuit Judge Edward P. Hill, of PrestoDSburg, wu 

emerging a decisive winnerin asix-cand.idate race for the Democratic 
nomination for Appellate Judge from the Seventh district. .. The Pres­
tOD.llburg strawberry processing plant, which began operation here 
three years ago, had received 2,700 crates by Tuesday evening, it wu 

said by plant owner Carl Abbott. •. 602 high school seniors received 
diplomas this week during graduation exercises at each of Floyd 
county's high schools ... There died: Mrs. Cynthia M. Porter, 95, last 

Wednesday at hu home 011 Third street here; John R.Jarvis, 76, of 
Endirou, dead on arrival at PrestoDSburg General Hosptal, Thursday; 
Charles F. Burnett, 77, olWayland, Monday at McDowell Appala­
chian Regional Hospital; Rev. Tona Hall, 63, Sunday at his home at 
Hippo; Mrs. Lora Wells, S6, of Auxier, Monday at a Lexington 
hospital; Harry Praler, 78, fonnerly ol Floyd county, Friday at his 
home in Akron, Indiana; Harold D. Hall, 43, former resident of this 

county, May 21 at Toledo, Ohio; Mrs. Mary Abbott, native of Floyd 
county, May 20 at an Ashland ho3pital. 

Forty Years Ago 
(Files from Fony Years Ago missing) 

Fifty Years Ago (May 25, 1944) 

Floyd county's Honor Roll in the courthouse yard here, bearing 
the names of more than 4,000 young men in the nation • s armed forces, 
will be dedicated May 30 •.• The AdjuiADt General's office hu con­
fmned the death of Pfc. Douglu Vaughan, of Prestonsburg, in the 

sinking of a troop tranaport ship in the Mediterrauean ... S-Sgt. Jay 
Joyce, of Wayland, ftrSt listed u missing after the Flying Fortress on 
which he wu radio operator had been shot down, is now known to be 

aGermanprillonerofwar ... Tberedied:Mrs.JosieB.Harria,63,Fioyd 
teaching veteran, at the Prestonsburg General Hospital last Thursday; 

Mrs. Louise Greer Culbertson. 32, of Prestonsburg, this morning 
(Thursday) at a Paintsville Hospital; Mrs. Darcus Bingham, 78, today 
at bee home near Cliff; Alfred PanoD.ll, 38, Amba postmastec, Satur­
day at a Martin hospital. 

Sixty Years Ago (May 25, 1934) 
Walter Johnson, 19, wu fatally wounded by gunfJre Saturday Ill 

Melvin .•. Earl Allen, 27, of Garrett. suffered a spinal fracture Monday 

in a slatefall inside a mine oC the Elk Horn Coal Corporation Ill 
Wayland .. .J. D. Harlc.iD.ll, Jr., of PrestoDSburg, will, becau.!e of an 
outstanding scholastic record, be a member olthe Court of Honor Ill 
next month • s commencement at the University of Michigan ... The 1. 

W. Western Showa and Bud Haw kiDS will return to Prestonsburg next 
month ... Three Floyd COUilty Board of Education members and a 
number of county teachers joined in the demonstration at Frankfm 

Monday in support of the sales tax ... Piot of Garren High School's 
senior play dealing with the theft of proceeds derived from the 
presentation of a college play obviously appealed to somebody. The 
night after the play, "The College Hobo," was presented, the "gate" 
amounting to $55.75 wu stolen from the school office ... There died: 

G. C. Fitzpatrick, 49, Saturday, at Garrett; Mrs. W. E. Perry, 70, 
mother of Mrs. Valentine P. Hoplc.ins, of Prestonsburg, May 14 at 

Danville. 
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The Nuntbers Game: Kentucky Lottery Results 

. : J:: 09-19-22-30-32-41 
Wednesday's 
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, ... I~/ WEATHER 

~Q:= WATCH 
FRIDAY(TODAY):Partlysunny.Highsnear 
70. 

FRIDAY NIGHT:Mostly clear. Low around 
50. 

SATURDAY: Sunny. Highs in mid 70s. 

SATURDAY NIGHT: Mostly clear. Low 
45-50. 

SUNDAY: Mostly sunny. Mild. Highs 75-80. 

SUNDAY NIGHT: Partly cloudy. Lows in 
mid 50s, 

MONDAY: Partly sunny. Highs around 80. 

TUESDAY: Mostly cloudy. High 75-80. Low 
around 55-60. Chance of thunderstorms. 

TUESDAY NIGHT: Chance of thunder­
stonns continues. 

Weat~r Watch provided 
by J~ckson Weather Service . 

Pike man dies in weekend 
motorcycle accident 

A weekend motorcycle accident claimed the 
life of Mark K. Howell, 26, of Chloe Road in Pike 
County, Sunday. 

Pikeville City Police reported that Howell, and 
a second motorcycle driven by Curtis Hall, were 
eastbound on Ky. 1460 at a high rate of speed. 

Howell lost control of a 1994 Honda, leaving 
the roadway and striking a culvert before coming 
to a stop. 

He was transported to Pikeville Methodist 
Hospital where he was pronounced dead by Deputy 
Coroner Jack Salyers. 

Hall was also transported to the hospital, treated 
for minor injuries and released. 

The accident is still under investigation by the 
Pikeville City Police. 

-Appalachian News-Express 

Miner injured in accident 
An early morning accident at the Tall Tllllber 

Mining Company at Blackberry in Pike County 
resulted in injuries for one miner. 

Ralph Smith, 44, of Borderland, West Vir­
ginia, was injured around 6:36a.m. Tuesday. 

Accordning to EMT Joe Pollis, Smith was 
pinned beneath a piece or mining equipment and 
the mine wall. He was transported to the Belfry 
High School football field where Health Net 
Aeromedical Services was waiting to transport 
him to a Huntington, W~st Virginia, hospital. 

Reportedly, Snuthsufferedinjuries to his lower 
body, however his condition was not known at 
prcsstime. -Appalachian News-Express 

' :-:· 

Williams is hired as new 
Paintsville superintendent 

A 17-year veteran of the Paintsville Indepen­
dent school district will become the system's new 
superintendent Paul W. Williams, 53, was hired 
Tuesday night to replace Leon Burchett, who is 
retiring June 30. Williams was one of two persons 
recommended for the job by a selection commit­
tee from a list of eight applicants . 

-Lexington Herald-Leader 

Disposal plan for 
~agoffinisapproved 

The state Tuesday approved a solid-waste plan 
for Magoffin County that does not include a large 
private landflll that local opponents have been 
fighting for nearly three years. 

"We finally did it," said Judge-Executive 
Charles Hardin. "We will have no out-of-state, or 
in-state, garbage in Magoffm County." 

The plans calls for Magoffin County's gar­
bage to be transported to Rowan County or, as a 
backup site, Greenup County. It also places em­
phasis on public education, recycling, waste re­
duction and cleanups open dumps, Hardin said 
Tuesday during a news conference on the court­
house steps. 

The waste plan, which is more than two years 
overdue, has been in limbo since 1991 when 
residents discovered that a fonner judge-execu­
tive had quietly included the prosped landfill as 
part of the county's mandatory solid-waste pro-
gram.' 

A citizens group- Magoffm Countians for a 
Better Environment- sued in late 1991 to stop 
the landfill, saying the then-fiscal court members 
grants Eastern Kentucky Resources an illegal 
franchise. A judge ruled in the group's favor, but 
the case is still pending in the Kentucky Court of 
Appeals.- Lexington Herald-Leader 

Ads targeted women; 
more girls smoked 
Percentage of non-smoking 
16-year-old girls who began 
smoking each year 

Virginia Slims, Silva Thins 
and Eve cigarettes 
introduced around 

- 1967; sales 10 7.1 

peaked • 10 

in 1976 
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JohnM. Stumbo students 
participate in Forensics 
State Tournament 

The John M. Stumbo Speech and 
Drama Club recently returned from 
Bowling Green, and the Forensics 
State Tournament, in which they 
gained valuable experience in repre­
senting their school. 

The students participated in the 
categories of broadcasting, poetry, 
extemporaneous speaking, improvi­
sational, and interpretation of litera­
ture . 

. The hard work paid off. The fo­
rensics students spent four days and 
three nights in Bowling Green, and 
attending Western Kentucky Univer­
sity. They learned a great deal of 
history of the area by talking to pro­
fessors t11ey met on campus. 

The students treated themselves 
to a tour ofManunoth Cave and Crys­
tal Onyx Cave in Cave City. 

The :Floyd County Time.<; 

Richmond Plaza 
Prestonsburg 886-3142 

SIX LOCATIONS: 

Mon.-Fri., 8-5 
Sal, i-5 

difficult 

Pikeville • Zebulon • Belfry • Betsy Layne 
Elkhorn City • Hambley Blvd. - Pikeville 
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• 

WE'VE GOT A BARGAIN JUST FOR YOU! ~11 1 1'1 

Returning clippings to 
lawns apparently has 
no effects on diseases Pennies for flood victims 

With public concerns about fill­
ing up landfllls with grass clippings, 
more and more homeowners are opt· 
ing to leave the clippings on the lawn. 
But docs that practice increase dis­
eases? 

In October, Mrs. Anna Thornsbury's sixth grade class at Melvin Grade School organized a fund raiser for the 
victims of the severe flooding in the Midwest. The class distributed cups to each classroom for five straight 
days and collected pennies from those who wished to contribute. At the end of the week, the money was 
counted. The total amount of money was $55. The sixth grade class walked to the Melvin post office and 
purchased a money order to send to the Red Cross. They were assisted by Mrs. Jlmmi Lou Johnson, the 
postmaster. The children were pleased to receive a letter from the Red Cross thanking their school for the 
donation. They also sent pins for the children to wear displaying the symbol for the organization. 

Look for the upcoming 

GRADUATION 
SECTION 

giant 

"Leaving grass cuttings on the 
lawn generally is not related to dis­
ease development in the lawn," ac­
cording to Paul Vincelli, Extension 
plant pathologist with the University 
of Kentucky College of Agriculture. 

"Based on our experience andre­
search in Kentucky, there may be a 
slight advantage to bagging clippings 
during an active outbreak of brown 
patch in tall fescue," he said. 

Centre president to speak at ·lOOth 
Pikeville College commencement 

in The Floyd County Times 

Brown patch is only a problem 
during warm, muggy conditions dur­
ing the summer and not during spring­
time, when most growth of turf oc­
curs, Vincelli said. 

Research conducted at Texas A 
and M University found that clip­
pings returned from mulching mow­
ers, a new type of mower that shreds 
the clippings to a frne text:ut:e, did not 
increase disease; instead the research­
ers found tllat the frnely shredded 
clippings were an excellent home for 
bacteria that kill disease-causing 
fungi, he said. 

''The added bonus to returning 
clippings to the lawn is that they 
return nutrients to the soil that other­
wise would be lost," Vincelli said. 

1Oth birthday 
Brian Douglas Chaffin was1 0 years 
old on Friday, May13.Hecelebrated 
his birthday on Saturday at the 
home of his grandparents, Doug 
and Priscilla Chaffin. In attendance 
were his dad Larry, stepmom 
Lenora, his little brother Kyle and 
his uncle Jeff, and his many friends 
and neighbors. 

Michael F. Adams 
Michael F. Adams, president of 

Centre College in Danville, will be 
the featured speaker at the 1994 
Pikeville College Commencement. 
Founded in 1819 and among 
America's 20 oldest liberal arts col­
leges, Centre is one of the nation' s 
leading institutions of higher learn­
ing and has a tradition of excellence 
in the ~ and sciences. 

Dr. Adams is a nationally recog­
nized speaker and consultant who 

recently was selected as keynote 
speaker at the Aspen Institute sum­
mer series on strategic planning for 
college and university presidents. He 
is a Division III representative on the 
prestigious NCAA Presidents Com­
mission and also is a member of the 
Board of the National Association of 
Independent Colleges and Universi­
ties (NAICU). 

Dr. Adams recently was elected 
by his fellow presidents to serve a 
one-year term as vice-chairman of 
NAICU as a prelude to becoming its 
chairman in 1995. 

Regionally, Dr. Adams serves on 
the board of the Kentucky Center for 

Public Issues and was co-chairman 
of its fli'St issues conference. He has 
participated in Leadership Kentucky 
and represents Kentucky higher edu­
cation on the accreditation review 
committee of the Southern Associa­
tion of Colleges and Schools (SACS). 
Hecurrentlyservesasfli'Stvicepresi­
dent and 1994 campaign chair of the 
Heart of Kentucky United Way and 
will serve as the organization's presi­
dent in 1995. 

ACHS FHA attend regional meeting 
The Allen Central Hi'gh School 

Chapter of F.H.A. attended the re­
gional meeting on April 26, at 
Magoffin County High School. 

The meeting was for the initiation 
of new regional officers for 1994-95. 
Mary Ann Pratt, student at Allen 
Central, served on the nominating 
committee for Group B officers and 
Chrystal Mullins, student at Allen 
Central, served on the nominating 
committee for Group A Officers. 

Ginny Ellington, state FHA/ 
HERO advisor, brought greetings 
from the state association. Laura 
Picklesimer, Johnson Central High 
School, and Laura Prater, Magoffm 
County High School, were recog­
nized for serving as state historian 
and state parliamentarian for the 

Pacific rim close up 

1993-94 school year. Entertainment 
was provided by members of the 
Betsy Layne Chapter. 

Twenty-eight members of the 
Allen Central Chapter attended the 
meeting. They were: Kim Hunter, 
Mary Ann Pratt, Stephanie Scott, 
Heather Robinson, Melissa 
Thornsbeary, Stacy Conn, Judy 
Handshoe, Chrystal Mullins, Misty 
Goble, Loretta Yates, Michelle 
Corbett, Karen Vanderpool, J y Shep­
herd, Crystal Taylor, Lisa Wallace, 
Crystal Stumbo, Angel Hancock, 
Tabitha Meade, Martha Stephens, 
Tina Hall, Carrie Mosley, Spring 
Vandetpool, Kristie Rister, Steve 
Turner, Charla Bartrum, Larissa 
Hicks, Amy Adams and Chrystal 
Bartrum. 

On April 9, 36 South Floyd Close Up students began a study program of the Pacific rim region In Honolulu, 
Hawaii. Close Up's goal for the Pacific Basin Program explores how the nations of the Asia-Pacific region 
interact and pursue their national Interests. The program also fosters an appreciation fort he diverse cultures 
that comprise the Asia-Pacific region. For six days the students were involved in work shops and seminars 
with students from Chuuk, Kosrae, Pohnpei, Yap (Federated States of Micronesia), Saipan, Tinian, Rota 
(Commonwealth of the Northern Matianas), Guam, the Republic of Palau, and the states of Alaska, Oregon, 
Minnesota, Massachusetts, Michigan, Louisiana, and California. Importing, exporting, trade agreements, 
environmental issues, education, and cultures were some of the topics studied by this diverse group. Study 
visits were made to Diamond Head, Pearl Harbor, University of Hawaii, Pali Lookout in the Tropical Rainforest, 
and Hawaii's capitol. The culminating activity for a successful week was a luau at Paradise Cove. Mahalol 

Since coming to Centre, Dr. 
AdamshasstrengthenedtheCollege's 
commitment to excellence in the lib­
eral arts. He bas opened two residen­
tial foreign studies programs in Lon­
don, England and Strasbourg, France 
and has approved new degree pro­
grams in anthropology and computer 
science. He has initiated a long-range 
strategic planning process and re­
cently announced a $20 million cam­
pus improvement project to prepare 
Centre for the 21st century. 

The commencement ceremony is 
scheduled for 2:00p.m., May 21, in 
the Pikeville College gynmasium. A 
reception for the graduates and their 
families will take place immediately 
following commencement activities. 
Members of the community are cor­
dially invited to attend. SUNDAY MATINEE-Open i :00, start 1:30, over 3:15 
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PCC Peopfe 
News aboutjacultij. staff and students at prestonsbu.!E_ Communitlj College 

Thomas Carroll, associate profes- Council. PCC President Dr. Deborah ferent-what' s wrong with that?" 
sor of history, will spend June 13- L. floyd also served on a panel on StacieGailPatrickofSalyersville 
July22at the University of Kentucky economic development and higher is the new Office Assistant 1 for the 
participating in a seminar on education during the leadership con- Single Parent and Homemaker Pro­
Ethnohistory of Southeastern Indi- ference. gram replacing Judy Tackett who 
ans. His study is sponsored by the Pam Shingler, instructor of En- transferred to the business office. 
National EndowmentfortheHumani-

glish and public relations director, Also new to the college staff is 
~es. was a guest columnist for the ApriV Carol Meadows, who has joined the 

(" ~ tt!~ 

lf ,,;, 
Easter Parade 

On Friday, April 1, the students in Mrs. Hope Tackett's Kindergarten 
class at Melvin Elementary had an Easter parade for the school. The 
students dressed as Easter symbols to show their holiday spirit. 
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Come dance the night 
away with us at 

G & L's Bar & 
Carry Out Inc. 
Located at McDowell. 

Live entertainment every 
Friday and Saturday night. 
Also if you're thinking of 
having a party (of any kind, 
wedding, birthday, etc.) call 
us, we'll treat you right. More 
info call 377-2473 or 377-
2185. 

Participating in the Eastern Ken- May edition of Kentucky Journal. In president's office as an Office Assis­
tucky Intercollegiate Computer Semi- the issue which focused on Eastern tant 2. She lives at Staffordsville and 
nar, hosted by PCC in April, were Kentucky, she wrote, "A World of recently graduated from Kentucky 
associate professor Arif Azeem and Difference: Mountain culture's dif- Tech/Mayo. 

associateprofessorJamesFuller,both•-----------------------------------------------------------------, of computer science. Azeem made a 
presentation on "Computer Memory: 
Installation and Writing Configura­
tion file for different memory types." 
Fuller, who teaches at PCC's Pike 
County Campus, spoke on "Robot­
ics: Robots, Robots, Robots." 

Newly appointed to the policy 
committee for Floyd County Head 
Start is Mazola Salmons, associate 
professor of business. 

Hassan Saffari, professor of math, 
was invited to participate in the spe­
cial opening ceremony of the 76th 
annual international convention of 
Phi Theta Kappa honor society, in 
April in Anaheim, Calif. Saffari, fac­
ulty advisor for PCC' s chapter of the 
society, also won a Mosal Scholar­
ship, given by the organization to a 
small group of advisors and coordi­
nators. The scholarship carries a 
$2,000 stipend for "a cause commen­
surate with the concept of the two­
year college faculty scholar." Stu­
dent Glenda France also attended the 
Anaheim meeting. 

Thomas Orf, assistant professor 
of geography, attended the annual 
conference of the Association of 
American Geographers March 30-
April 2 in San Francisco. He was on 
a panel on "Geography's Role in 
Community Coll~es" and attended 
the frrstmeeting of the Committee on 
Community College Geography, of 
which be is a member. 

Gay Herrin's battle with cancer, 
the triumph of her faith and the love 
of her friends and family formed the 
subject of an article in the March 29 
edition of the Western Recorder, the 
newspaper of Kentucky's Southern 
Baptists. Herrin is associate profes­
sor of writing. 

Steve Newsome, part-timeinstruc­
tor of business at the Pike County 
Campus, was recently elected to the 
board of trustees of the Kentucky 

School of Banking . 
Attending the spring conference 

of the Kentucky Association of Stu­
dent Financial Aid Administrators, 
April 13-15 in Lexington, were 
Brenda Music, acting dean of stu­
dents affairs, and fmancial aid staff 
members LeslieM. Bays, Gail Cooley 
and Cindy Hall. 

The abstract of the paper "Success 
as perceived by community college 
students," by Dr. John G. Shiber, 
associate professor of biology, was 
published in the March issue ofTrans­
actions of the Kentucky Academy of 
Sciences. He presented the paper in 
the Science Education Section of the 
annual KAS conference last fall. Also 
in the same publication is the abstract 
of a paper sponsored by Shiber and 
presented at the conference by two 
former students, Timothy Lavender 
and Steve Berger. Their paper, "Wa­
ter Quality of the Big Sandy River," 
was the partial result of a mini-grant 
research project by Shiber and the 
students. 

Dr. Doug Herman, associate pro­
fessor of history, played a Union sol­
dier in a Civil War drama presented 
by a community theater group to fifth 
graders at Prestonsburg Elementary 
School recently. After the play, 
Herman made a presentation on the 
Civil W ai and the Battle of Middle 
Creek. The theater group also per­
formed the play twice for audiences 
at the First United Methodist Church 
in Prestonsburg. 

John D. Sammons, professor of 
math, served on a panel in an inten­
sive session discussing the Kentucky 
Education Reform Act during the 
Eastern Kentucky Leadership Con­
ference April 29-30 in Pikeville. He 
is a parent representative and vice 
chair of the Adams Middle School­
Based Decision-Making Council and 
co-chair of the Floyd County Site­
Based Decision Making Advisory 

Melvin Primary 
News 

The Melvin Elementary Primary 
is publishing a primary newspaper 
twice a month. Each two weeks, a 
group of three stu <_tents are appointed 
as reporters from each of the primary 
classes. These students collect the 
class news during their two weeks. 
On 'Friday the students type their ar­
ticles on the computers. Then, with 
the help of "Miss Mary," publish a 
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AUXIER 
Auxier Freewill Baptist Church, 
Auxier; Sunday School, 9:45a.m.; Morn­
ing Worship, 11:00 a.m.; Youth Meeting, 
5:00p.m.; Evening Worship, 6:00p.m.; 
Thursday Prayer Meeting, 7:00 p.m.; 
Pastor, Bobby Joe Spencer; Assistant. 
Southie Fannin, Jr. 
Horn Chapel Methodist, Auxier Rd.; 
Sunday School, 10 a.m.; Morning Wor­
ship, 11 a.m.; Pastor, John P. Salyer. 

ABBOTI 
The Father House, Big Branch, Abbott 
Creek; Sunday School, 10:00; Worship, 
6:00p.m.; Pastor, J.J. Wright. 

ALLEN 
Allen First Baptist Church, Allen; Sun­
day School, 10:00 a.m.; Worship, 11:00 
a.m.; Evening Worship at 6 p.m.; Wed­
nesday Night Prayer Meeting, 7 p.m.; 
Pastor, Rev. French Harmon. 
Christ Unlted Methodist, Allen, Ky.; 
Sunday School, 9:45; Worship, 11 a.m.; 
Wednesday, 7 p.m.; Sunday Night, 7 
p.m.; Pastor, Kenneth Lemaster. 

BETSY LAYNE 
Calvary Southern Baptist Church, 
Betsy Layne; Sunday School, 9:45 a.m.; 
Morning Worship, 11:00 a.m.; Evening 
Worship & Youth Meeting, 7:00p.m.; 
Wednesday prayer meeting and Bible 
study, 7:00p.m.; Pastor, Paul Grainger. 

Betsy Layne United MethodJst Church, 
nexttoB.L. Gymnasium; Sunday School, 
10 a.m.; Morning Worship. 11 a.m.; 
Wednesday Bible Study, 7 p.m.; Pastor, 
Dennis Love. 
Betsy Layne Church of God, Old U.S. 
23; Sunday School, 10:00 a.m.; Moming 
Worship, 11:00 a.m.; Sunday Night Serv­
ice, 6:00p.m.; Wednesday Night family 
training hour, 7:00 p.m.; Pastor, Judith 
Caudill. 
Betsy Layne Free Will Baptist Church; 
Sunday School, 10:00 a.m.; Morning 
Worship, 11:00 a.m.; Sunday Evening 
Worship, 6:00 p.m.; Wed. Night Prayer 
& Youth Services, 7:00 p.m.; Pastor, 
Tracy Patton. 

BLUE RIVER 
Middle Creek Baptist Church, Blue 
River; Sunday School, 10 a.m.; Sunday 
Morning Worship, 11 a.m.; Sunday Eve­
ning Worship, 6 p.m.; Wednesday Serv­
ice, 7:00p.m.; Pastor, Vernon Slone. 

BONANZA 
Bonanza Freewill Baptist, Abbott Creek 
Road; Sunday School, 10:00 a.m.; Sun­
day Morning Worship Service, 11:00 
a.m.;WednesdayBibleStudy, 7:00p.m.; 
Pastor, Herb Arms. 

CORN FORK 
Brandy Keg FreewUl Baptist, Corn 
Fork; Sunday School, 10 a.m.; Sunday 
Night, 6 p.m.; Prayer Meeting and Youth, 
Wednesday, 7 p.m.; Pastor, Darrell 

Howell. COW CREEK 

Cow Creek Freewill Baptist, Cow 
Creek; Sunday School, 10 a.m.-11 a.m.; 
Sunday Evening, 6 p.m., 7:30p.m.; 3rd 
Sunday Worship Service, 11:00 a.m. to 
12 noon; Prayer Meeting and Youth 
Group, Wednesday, 7:00p.m.-8:00p.m.; 
Pastor, Nathan Lafferty. 

DANA 
Sammy Clark Branch FreewUl Baptist 
Church, Dana; Sunday School, 10:00 
a.m.; Church, 11:00 a.m.; Sunday Night 
Service, 6:00p.m.; Youth Meeting Sun­
day, 6:00p.m.; Wednesday Night Prayer 
Meeting, 7:00p.m.; Pastor, Mike Ham­
mond. 

DAVID 
Goodloe Pentecostal Church, Rt 850, 
David, Ky.; Sunday Night, 7 p.m.; Fourth 
Saturday Night, 7:00p.m.; Pastor, Warnie 
Allen. 

DRIFT 
Drift Pentecostal Church, Drift; Sun­
day School, 10:00 a.m.; Wednesday 
Night, 7:00p.m.; Worship Service, Sat­
urday and Sunday Night, 7:00p.m.; Pas­
tor, Ted Shannon. 
Drift Freewill Baptist Church, Drift; 
Prayer Service, 6:30 p.m., Thursday; 
Sunday School, 10 a.m.; Sunday Church 
Service, 6:30p.m.; Pastor, Randy Turner. 
Drift Presbyterian Cburch,Route 1101, 
Drift; Sunday Services, 11:00 a.m.; Part­
time minister, Mary Alice Murray. 

DENVER 
Llberiy Baptist Church, Denver; Sun­
day School, 10 a.m.; Morning Worship, 
11 a.m.; Evening Service, 6 p.m.; Wed­
nesday Night Bible Study, 6 p.m.; Pastor 
Merle Little. 

EASTPOINT 
Free Pentecostal Church of God, East 
Point. Rt. 1428; Sunday School, 10:00; 
Sunday Service, 11:00; Sunday Night, 
6:30; Thursday Night. 6:30;Pastor,Buster 
Hayton. EMMA 
Emma United Methodist, Emma, Ky.; 
Sunday School, 10:00 a.m.; Sunday Morn­
ing Worship, 11 :00; Sunday Night. 6:30 
p.m.; Wednesday, 6:30 p.m.; Jack 
Howard, Pastor 

ESTILL 
Marttn Branch FreewiU Baptist, EsdU; 
Sunday School, 10 a.m.; Services, 11:15 
a.m.; Sunday Night. 7:00p.m.; Wednes­
day, 7:00p.m.; Pastor, Wayne Stevens. 

GARRETI 
Rock Fork Regular Baptist Church, 
Garrett; 4th Saturday and Sunday of each 
month at 9:30a.m.; 4th Saturday evening 
at5:30 p.m.; Moderator, Elder Earl Slone; 
Assistant Moderator, Elder Jerry Manns. 
Rock Fork FreewUI Baptist, Garrett. 
Ky.; Sunday School, 10 a.m.; Sunday 
Worship, 11 a.m.; Prayer Meeting, 
Wednesday, 7 p.m.; Pastor, Elder Brodey 
Amburgey. 
First Baptist Church, Garrett; Sunday 
School, 10 a.m.; Morning Worship, 11 
a.m.; Evening Worship, 6 p.m.; Bible 
Study, 7:00 p.m., Wednesday; Pas.cz·, 
Randy Osborne. 
Garrett Church or God, Garrett; Sun­
day School, 10:00 a.m.; Worship Serv­
ice, 11:00 a.m. and 7:00 p.m.; Wednes­
d·.IY at 7:00p.m.; Pastor, Donald Bragg. 

GOBLE ROBERTS ADDmON 
Landmark Church of God, Goble Rob­
erts Addition; Sunday School, 10:00 a.m.; 
Morning Worship, 11:10 a.m.; Sunday 
Night, 7:00p.m.;Wednesd&yNight, 7:00 
p.m.; Pastor, Kenneth E. Prater, Jr. 

·Mike Sloane's 

PIC PAC 
Martin, Kentucky 

If you would like to help 
sponsor this pag~, · 

Call ·aas~asos· · 
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Community FreewUI Baptist, Goble 
Roberts; Sunday School, 10 a.m.; Morn­
ing Service, 11:00 a.m.; Wednesday 
Prayer Meeting, 7 p.m.; 4th Saturday 
Night, Regular Service & Business, 6:00 
p.m.; Sunday Night Service, 6:00 p.m.; 
Pastor, Elder Jack DeRossett 

GRETIIEL 
Grethel Baptist Church, State Route 
33 79, (Branham's Creek Road), telephone 
587-2043; Sunday School, 10:00 a.m.; 
Morning Worship, 11:00 a.m.; Youth 
Meeting, 5:30 p.m.; Evening Services, 
6:30p.m.; Wednesday, Prayer Meeting 
and Bible Study, 7:00p.m.; Pastor, David 
L. Givens. 

MAYTOWN 
Maytown First Baptist Church, Main 
Street; Sunday School, 10:00 a.m.; Morn­
ing Worship, 11:00 a.m.; Sunday Eve­
ningServicc, 6:00p.m.; Wednesday Eve­
ning Bible Study at 7:00 p.m.; Pastor, 
Bob Varney. 

MIDDLE CREEK 
Spurlock Bible Church, Spurlock Fork 
of Middle Creek, Prestonsburg; Sunday 
School, 10 a.m.; Morning Worship, 11 
a.m.; Evening Service, 6 p.m.; Wednes­
day Prayer Service, 7 p .m.; Pastor, Rev. 
Dan Heintzelman. 

If we confess our sins, he is 
faithjid andjust to forgive us 
our sins, and to cleanse us 
from all unrighteousness. 

HI HAT 
The Church of God of Prophecy ai Hi 
Hat, invites you to worship with us each 
week. Sunday School, 10 a.m.; Sunday 
Morning Worship Service, 11 a.m.; Sun­
day Evening Worship Service, 7 p.m.; 
Wednesday Service, 7 p.m.; Wednesday 
night is family night! Every6ne welcome! 
Pastor, Don Fraley, Jr. 

IVEL 
Tom's Creek Freewill Baptist, U.S. 23, 
first exit (north of Layne Brothers); Sun­
' day School, 10 a.m.; Morning Worship, 
11 a.m.; Evening Service, 6 p.m.; Wed-
nesday Prayer Meeting, 7 p.m.; Pastor, 
Chuck Ferguson. 

LANCER 
Lancer Baptist Church, Lancer, wel­
comes you to the services. Sunday School, 
10:00 a.m.; Suoday Morning Worship, 
11:00 a.m.; Sunday Evening Worship, 
6:00 p.m.; Wednesday Evening Bible 
Study, 7:00p.m.; Pastor, Jennings West. 
Trimble Chapel Free Will Baptist, 
Water Gap-Lancer; Sunday Service, 10 
a.m.; Morning Service, 11 a.m.; Nightly 
Service, 7:00; 4 Saturdays each month; 
Pastor Joe Coleman. 
Pleasant Home Baptist Church, Lancer, 
Watergap Road; Sunday School, 10 a.m.; 
Morning Service, 11 a.m.; Sunday Eve­
ning Service, 7p.m.;SundayYouthMeet­
ing, 7 p.m.; Wednesday Evening Service, 
7 p.m.; Wednesday programs available 
for children; Pastor, Mark Tackett. 

LANGLEY 
Maytown United Methodist Church, 
Langley; Morning Worship, 9:30 a.m.; 
Sunday School, 11 a.m.; Youth Sunday, 
5:00p.m.; Sunday Night, 6 p.m.; Wed­
nesday Night, 6 p.m.; Pastor, Troy Poff. 

MARTIN 
Stephens Branch Missionary Baptist 
Church, Stephens Branch; Sunday 
School, 10:00 a.m.; Sunday Worship, 
11:00 a.m.; Mid-Week Bible Study! 
Wednesday, 6:00p.m. 

1 John 1:9 

MOUNTAIN PARKWAY 
Free Pentecostal DeUverance Church, 
Rt 114, East Mt. Parkway, Saturday and 
Sunday, 7:00 p.m.; Pastor, Patricia 

Crider. PRATER CREEK 
Prater Creek Baptist Church, Prater 
Creek; Sunday School, 10:00; Sunday 
Morning, 11:00; Sunday Evening, 7:00; 
Wednesday Prayer Meeting, 7:00; Pastor, 
Gary Fish. 

PRESTONSBURG 
Seventh-Day Adventist, 5 miles West 
on Mountain Parkway; Sabbath School, 
9: 15;ChurchService, 10:30;Pastor, Mike 
Foraker, 886-3459. 

Highland Avenue Freewill Raptis• 
Church; Sunday School, 10:00 a.m.; 
Sunday Morning Worship, 11:00 a.m.; 
Sunday Evening Worship, 6:00 p.m.; 
Wednesday Evening Bible Study, 7:00 
p.m.; Pastor, David Garrett 

First Bapllst Church, (Irene Cole Me­
morial), 27 S. First A venue, Prestons­
burg; Sunday School, 9:30 a.m.; Morn­
ing Worship, 10:50 a.m.; Evening Wor­
ship, 6:00p.m.; Wednesday night. 7 pm.; 
Bible Study & Prayer Meeting, 7:00p.m.; 
Interim Pastor, Quentin Lockwood. 
Praise Assemtly, 1 mile North of 
Prestonsburg, Old U.S. 23; Sunday 
School, 10 a.m.; Praise & Worship, 11 
a.m.; Prayer & Bible Study, 6:30 p.m.; 
Sunday e•:cning services, 6:30 p.m.; 
Wednesday Prayer & Bible Study, 6:30 
p.m.; Pastor, Calvin Hickson. 
Katy Fl'lcnd Freewill Baptist Church, 
located two miles up Abbott; Sunday 
School, 10 a.m.; Morning Worship, 11 
a.m.; Evening Worship, 6 p.m.; Wed. 
Bible Study, 7 p.m.; Pastor, Van West 
Faith Christian A.embly of God, 431 
South Lake Drive, Prestonsburg; Sunday 
School, 10:00 a.m.; Morning Worship, 
11:00 a.m.; Evening Worship, 6 p.m.; 
Wednesday Prayer and Bible Study, 7 
p.m.; Pastor, Doug Lates. 

St.MarthaChurch, WaterGap;M3Sses, 
Saturday, 7 p.m.; Sunday, 11 a.m.; Reli­
gious Education Classes, Sunday, 9:45-
10:45 a.m.; Adult Class, Wednesday, 7:30 
p.m.; Rev. David Powers. 
Community United MethodJst Church, 

a.m. 710 Burke Ave., Prestonsburg; Morning 
First Assembly of God, Martin; Sunday Fellowship Service, 9:30 a.m.; Sunday 
School, 10a.m.;MorningWorship, 11:00 School, 10:00 a.m.; Morning Worship, 
a.m.; Sunday Night Service, 6 p.m.; 10:45 a.m.; Evening Worship, 6 p.m.; 
WednesdayPrayer&BibleStudy, 7p.m .. ; Wednesday Worship, 7 p.m.; Pastor, 
Missionettes & Royal Rangers, 7 p.m.; Raymond E. Snider Jr. 

Pastor, Lorie Vannucci. Morning Star Ministries FuU Gospel 
Faith Bible Church, MartlD; Sunday Church, Rt. 1428 (Old Rt 23), between 
School, 10 a.m.; Morning Worship, 11 · Allen and Prestonsburg; Sunday School, 
a.m.; Sunday Evening, 6 p.m.; Wednes- 10:00 a.m.; Sunday Morning Worship, 
dayEvening,6p.m.;IndependentFunda- 11:00 a.m.; Thursday, 7:00p.m.; Pastor, 

The Church of Jesus Christ of Latter 
Day Saints, Rt. 80, Martin; Sunday 
School, 10:30a.m.;ReliefSociety/Priest­
hood, 9:30a.m.; SacramentService, 11:20 

mental Baptist; Pastor, Don Crisp. Hamilton. 

Martin Freewill Baptist Church, Mar- The Third Avenue FreewUI Baptist 
tin, Ky.; Sunday School, 10 a.m.; Wor- Church, Prestonsburg; Sunday School, 
ship Service, 11 a.m.; Evening Service, 6 10:00; Morning Worship, 11 :00; Eve­
p.m.; Bible Study, Wednesday, 6 p.m.; ning Worship, 6:00; Wednesday Prayer 
Youth League, Tuesday, 6 p.m.; Pastor, Meeting, 7:00; Pastor, Manford Fannin. 
Elder Bobby Baldridge. First Christian Church, 429 North 
First Baptist Church, Martin, Ky.; Bible Arnold Avenue, Prestonsburg; Sunday: 
Study, 10:00; Worship, 11:00; Evening Bible study, 10:00 a.m.; Morning Wor­
Worship, 6:00; Mid Week, 7:00; Pastor, hi 11 00 E · w hi 7 00 s p, : a.m.; vemng ors p, : 
Russ Taylor. p.m.; Wednesday: Midweek Bible Study, 
Jesus Christ Church of God, Arkansas 7 00 E li t H nd 1 Ad 
Creek, Martin; Friday, 7 p.m.; Sunday 
Morning, 11 a.m.; Deacon, Harry Conn. 
Martin Church of Christ, Martin; Sun-

: p.m.; vange s , o e ams. 

day School, 10 a.m.; Sunday Morning :;;;;;;;;;;::::========::::;;;;;;=======: Worship, 11 a.m.; Evening, 7 p.m.; 
.41 Wednesday Bible Study, 7 p.m.; Wed-

First PRSbyterlan, North Lake Drive, 
Prestonsburg; Sunday School, 9:30a.m.; 
Morning Worship, 11 a.m.;InteriptPastor, 
Rev. Richard Guerrant 

First United Methodist Church, 60 S . 
Arnold Ave., Prestonsburg; Sunday 
School, 10:00; Morning Worship, 11:00; 
Evening Worship, 7:00; Wed. Prayer 
Meeting, 7:00; Sun., WPRT AM, 11:00; 
RadioBroadcastWXKZ 105.5 FM; Pas­
tor, Russell Holland. 

l{~~~ 
~URNITURE 

Prestonsburg Village 
886-8668 

nesday Youth Group, 7 p.m.; Evangelist, 
Gary Mitchell. 
Martin Methodist Church; Sunday 
School, lO:OO;MorningWorship,ll:OO; 
Wednesday Night Bible Study, 1:00; 
Pastor, Roy Harlow. 

These area businesses urge you 
to attend your place of worship 
this week! 

VIctory Christian Ministries Church, 
1428 E., Prestonsburg; Sunday Worship, 
11 a.m.; Sunday School, 11:30 a.m.; 
Wednesday Night, 7 p.m.; Pastor, Sherm 
WiUiams. 

Parkway Baptist, Mt. P~ttkway; Sun. 
School, lOa.m.;MorningWorship, 11:00 
a.m.; Evening Service, 6:00p.m.; Wed­
nesday Prayer Service, 7:00p.m.; Pastor 
Ed Taylor. 

Church or Christ, South Lake Drive; 
Sunday, 10 a.n1.; Sunday Evening, 6:00 
p.m.; Wed11esday Evening, 7:00p.m.; 
Evangelist, Benny Blankenship. 

St. James Episcopal, University Drive, 
Prestonsburg, Ky.; Sunday Worship, 11 
a.m.; luncheons immediately following 
services. 

Prestonsburg Community CoUegeBap· 
tlst Student Union; meets every Wed­
nesday, 11:30-12:30 inJ102. Lunch, dis­
cussion, travel available to all students, 
faculty and staff. French B. Harmon, Di-

, rector; Ella C. Goble, presiden. For more 
information, call: 87 4-9468 or 4 78-2978. 

Free Pentecostal Church or God, f 
Weeksbury; Wednesday, 7:00p.m.; Sat- / 
urday, 7:00 p.m.; Sunday, 7:00 p.m.; 
Sunday School, 10:00 a.m.; Pastor, John r 
"Jay" Patton. 

Weeksbury Church of Christ; Sunday. 
10 a.m.; Sunday Worship, 10:45 a.m.; 
Sunday Evening, 6:00p.m.; Pastor, Mike 

Hall. WEST PRESTONSBURG 
Fitzpatrick First Baptist Church, P.O. 
Box 184, West Prestonsburg, (across from 
Clark Elem. School); Sunday School, 
lO:OOa.m.; Morning Worship, 11:00 a.m.; 
Sunday Evening, 6:00p.m.; Wednesday, 
7:00p.m.; Pastor, Stephen Whitaker. 

Faith Deliverance Tabernacle, West 
Pres~nsburg; Sunday School, 10:30 a.m.; 
Thursday, 7:00p.m.; Pastor, Don Shep­
herd. 

First Assembly or God, West Prestons­
burg; Sunday School, 10 a.m.; Worship, 
11 a.m.; Sunday Evening, 6 p.m.; Wed­
nesday night, Bible Study and Youth 
Power Hour; nursery provided; Pastor, 

First Church of God, Prestonsburg; Jim Nabors. 

Sunday school, 10 a.m.; Morning The Church of God or Prophecy, West 
Worship, 10:4~; SundayEvening,6p.~.; Prestonsburg; Sunday School, 10 a.m.; 
~ednesday Bible Study, 7 ~.m.; ~ds MorningWorship,1h.m.;SundayNight. 
Bible Club, 7 p.m.; Pastor Kevrn Collins .. 6 p.m.; Wednesday night, 7 p.m.; Pastor, 

PAINfSVILLE Arner B. Whitaker. 

Our ·Savior Lutheran Church, Sipp 
Bayes Room Carraige House Motel, 
Paintsville; Sunday School, 11:00 a.m.; 
WKLW (600 a.m.) "Chapel Window", 
12:05 p.m. every Sunday; Pastor Rev. 
Rolland Bentrup. 

PRINTER 
Salisbury United Methodist Church, 
Printer; Sunday School, 10:00 a.m.; Wor­
ship, 11:00; Evening Service, 7:00p.m.; 
Wednesday Services, 7:00p.m.; Pastor, 
Bobby G. Lawson. 

Old Time Baptist Church, Printer; 
services 2nd and 4th Saturday night at 
7:00p.m. Sunday mornings, 11:00 a.m.; 
Wednesday night at 7:00p.m. Everyone 
welcome. Pastor, Farley Howard. 

SALYERSVILLE 
Bethel Assembly of God, behind the 
Salyersville courthouse; nursery pro­
vided; Sunday School, 10 a.m.; Sunday 
Worship, 11 a.m.; Sunday Evening, 6 
p.m.; Thursday Evening, 7 p.m.; Pastor, 
Arthur (Sam) Smith. 

St. Luke CathoUc Mission Center, 1221 
Parkway Drive, Salyersville, Kentucky 
41465; Saturday, 4 p.m.; Sunday, 9 a.m.; 
Wednesday, 6:30p.m.; Rev. David Pow­
ers; Pastoral Associate, Sr. Mary Cathe-
rine. WAYLAND 
Zion DeUverance Church, Wayland; 
Sunday SchooL 11 a.m.; Evening Wor­
ship, 7 p.m.; Wednesday Prayer Service, 
7 p.m.; Saturday Evening Worship, 7 
p.m.; Pastor, Ada Mosley. 

Wayland United Methbodlst Church, 
Wayland; Sunday School, 10 a.m.; Morn­
ing Worship, 11 a.m.; Bible Study, 
Wednesday, 10:00 a.m.; Youth Meet­
ings, Sunday, 4:00p.m., (ages 11 & up); 
Wednesday, 6:00p.m., (ages 10 & un­
der); Pastor, Troy Poff. 

Free United Baptist Church, West 
Prestonsburg; Sunday School, 10 a.m.; 
Morning Worship, 11 a.m.; Sunday Eve­
ningWorship,6:30p.m.;MidweekPrayer 
Service, 6:30pm.; Pastor. Willis Adkins. 

WHEELWRIGHT 
Wheelwright United Methodist 
Church, Wheelwright; Sunday School, 
10:00 a.m.; Worship, 11:00; Evening 
Service, 6:00p.m.; Wednesday, 7:00 ser­
vices; Pastor, Bobby Isaac. 

Wheelwright Church or God; Sunday 
School Services, 10:00 a.m.; Sunday 
Morning Services, 11:00 a.m.; Sunday 
Night Services, 7:00 p.m.; Thursday 
Night Services, 7:00p.m.; Pastor, Donald 
R.Cox. 

Wheelwright FreewUl Baptist, Wheel­
wrightjunction; Sunday Scbool, 10 a.m.; 
Morning Worship, 11 a.m.; Evening Wor­
ship, 7 p.m.; Wednesday evening wor­
ship, 7 p.m.; Pastor, Louis Ferrari. 

Free Pentecostal HoUness Church, Rt. 
122, Upper Burton; Wednesday Wor­
ship, 7 p.m.; Sunday School, 10:30 a.m.; 
Sunday Morr.ing Worship, 11:30 a.m.; 
Sunday Evening, 6 p.m.; Pastor, Lewis 
Sandlin. 

Lighthouse Temple, Hall Hollow, 
Wheelwright, Kentucky; Sunday Serv­
ices, 11:00 a.m. and 7:00p.m.; Wednes­
day and Friday Services, 7:00; Pastor, 
Roy Cosby. 

Nelson-Frazier 
Funeral Home 

285-5155 
Owned & operated by: 

Roger Nelson & Glenn 0. Frazier 

2565 South Lake Drive 
Prestonsburg 

• • • • • • • • • • 

886-2291 

LAYNE BROS. 
• Ford • Lincoln • Mercury • Honda 

• Ford Trucks 
Located between Prestonsburg and Pikeville 

478-1234 •lvel, Ky. • 886-1234 

• 

• 

• 

• 
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• 
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Melvin 4-H Clubs 
officers listed 

The 1993-1994 Melvin Grade 
School 4-H club officers are: 

Community Calendar 
Teacher-Dale Pack, 4th; presi­
dent-Ronald Miller; vice-presi­
dent-JoshJohnson;secretary,Kayla 
Ray; project chairperson-Tiffany 
Williams. 

Teacher-Amber Anderson, 4th-, 
5th; president-John Meade; vice­
president, Matthew Tackett; secre­
tary-Jessica Tackett; project chair­
person-James Slone. 

Teacher -Sandra Newsome, 5th-
6th; president-Misty Hall; vice­
president, PJ. Cox; secretary, Arnie 
Tackett; project chairperson­
Amanda Bryant. 

Teacher-Anna Thornsbury, 6th; 
president-Shea Mullins; vice-presi­
dent, Brandi Thornsberry; secre­
tary-Angie Tackett; project chair­
person-Charlie Williams. 

Teacher-Marlene Little, 7th; 
president-Stephanie Castle; vice­
president, Jessica Tackett; secre­
tary-Brandy Scott; project chair­
person-Melissa Dorton. 

Davis and Johnson 
to exchange vows 

April Michelle Davis and 
Brian Scott Johnson 

Mr.andMrs.ElmerDavis,ofPres­
tonsburg, announce the forthcoming 
marriage of their daughter, April 
Michelle, to Brian Scott Johnson, son 
of Ruth Evelyn Johnson of 
Wittensville. 

Davis and Johnson will be united 
as one with Christ on Saturday, May 
28, at four thirty in the afternoon at 
the First United Methodist Church on 
Arnold A venue, in Prestonsburg. 

AreceptionwillfollowintheFam­
ily Life Center at the church. 

The gracious custom of an open 
wedding will be observed. All friends 
of the couple are in vi ted to attend and 
share in their joy. 

Perry and Jarvis 
towed 

Martha Perry of Prestonsburg, and 
Dale Perry of Harrison, Ohio, an­
nounce the upcoming marriage of 
their daughter, Martha, to Scotty 
Jarvis, son of Mr. and Mrs. Darrell 
Belcher of Salyersville. The bride­
to-be is a 1991 graduate of 
Prestonsburg High School. Jarvis 
is a 1990 graduate of Magoffin 
County High School. An open wed· 
ding will be observed at the Katy 
Friend Baptist Church on Abbott 
Creek on May 21 at 3:30 p.m. The 
couple will live in Richmond where 
they are students at Eastern Ken· 
tucky University. 

Bible conference 
begins at Grethel 

Grethel Baptist Church will be 
having their Annual Spring Bible 
Conference beginning Sunday, May 
22 through Wednesday, May 25. 

The topic will be "Turning our 
Hearts towardHome."Topics include 
marriage, husbands, wives, marital 
love, parenting and children's respon­
sibility. 

The speaker, Dr. Paul Reiter, 
serves as chairman of the pastoral 
studies department at Appalachian 
Bible College in Bradley, West Vir­
ginia. His ministry has included pas­
torates as well as educational areas 
over the past 39 years. 

Services begin at 10:00 a.m., Sun­
day, and continue through the day 
until the 11 a.m. and 6:30p.m. ser­
vices, Monday through Wednesday 
evening services begin at 7 p.m. 

The Grethel Baptist Church is lo­
cated on Route 3379 (Branham's 
Creek), approximately seven miles 
from Harold. 

Editor's Note: As a service to the 
many clubs and committees that meet 
in our community, the Floyd County 
Times' Conununity Calendar will post 
meeting and public service announce­
ments. Anicles for the Community 
Calendar must be submitted in writ­
ing to the Times no later than 5 p.m. 
Monday for Wednesday's publica­
tionor5p.m. WednesdayjorFriday's 
publication. These cannot be taken 
over the telephone. 

Walk America 
The March of Dimes Walk­

America will be held Sunday, May 
22, at Paintsville Lake Kiwanis Trail. 
Registration begins at 1:30 and the 
walk starts at 2 p.m. 

For more information, call Lisa 
Burke, Paintsville committee chair­
man, at (606) 789-9324, or conunu­
nity director, Susan Martin at (606) 
329-0703. 

30-year reunion 
The Martin High School class of 

1964 will hold their 30-year reunion 
on July 2, at the Holiday Inn in Pres­
tonsburg. An organizational meeting 
will be held May 13, at 7:30p.m. at 
Giovanni's in Martin. For more in­
formation, contact Marena Hale at 
88~9622 or evenings at 285-9240, 
Juanita Rice at 285-9912 and Nyoka 
Slone at 285-3255. 

Maywwn council election 
Parentrepresentativeelections for 

the Maytown Elementary 1994-95 
school council will be held Tuesday, 
May 24, at 6 p.m. in the school li­
brary. All nominations must be made 
in writing and submitted to the prin­
cipal five days prior to the election. 

Parent members must be a parent, 
step-parent, or legal guardian of a 
student enrolled atMaytownElemen­
tary and shall not be the relative of a 
school employee, andmustbeamem­
ber of the PTA. 

Nominees may nominate them­
selves or any other qualified candi­
date. 

Allen Central reunion 
organizational meeting 

Allen Central High School Class 
of 1974 will hold an organizational 
meeting for their 20-year class re­
union May 23, at 7:30p.m. in the 
library at the school. All classmates 
are welcome. 

Pre-retirement conference 
If you are a public employee par­

ticipating in the county employees, 
Kentucky employees or State Police 
retirement systems, you are invited 
to attend a General Pre-Retirement 
Conference on May 26 and 27 from 
8:30a.m. to3:30p.m.atJennyWiley 
State Park. 

Speakers wifi discuss retirement 
benefits, social security and other 
aspects of retirement The confer­
ence is free. For more information, 
call(502)564-3999andrequestField 
Services. 

AUen Central presents dramas 
The Allen Central drama classes 

will present their spring productions 
at the school this month. "A Hillbilly 
Weddin,"' will be performed Friday, 
May 20, at 7:30p.m. "Lady Dracula" 
will be presented Wednesday, May 
25, at 7:30p.m. All performances are 
free. 

Classic Home Cooking 
Classic Home Cooking ofWPRG 

TV 5 with chef Mark Sohn and pro­
ducer ''Dr." Don Bevins will air on 
Tuesday, May 24, at 11 a.m., Thurs­
day, May 26, and Saturday, May 28, 
at 7 p.m. 

Guests will join Sobn as he pre­
pares a Mountain Country Breakfast. 
The show will be produced in the 
following order: gingerbread-apple 
upside-down cake; sausage casserole; 
fried potatoes and country whipped 
cream; yeast-raised waffles; fried 
apples and soft boiled eggs. 

For further information about the 
show, cal1Sohnat437-6467 <X" Bevins 
at 478-4200. 

McDoweU Reunion 
The 1934-1944 McDowell re­

union will be held Labor Day week­
end. Volunteers are urged to attend 
the next meeting on May 23, at 6 
p.m., in the old McDowell High 
School building. 

Diabetes class 
The ''Living Well" with Diabetes 

class will be held on Thursday, May 
26, in the Learning Center at High­
lands Regional Medical Center. Class 
will begin at 6 p.m. The topic for this 
month's class will be ''Traveling/ 
Summer Vacation with Diabetes." 

Obituaries Overeaters Anonymous 
Overeaters Anonymous meets 

every Thursday at 6 p.m. at High­
lands Regional Medical Center. For 
moreinfonnation, call88~8511, ext. 
278. 

Offices cwsing 
early for election 

Floyd District Clerk's office and 
Circuit Court Clerk's office, Small 
Claims, and Driver's License will be 
closing at noon, May 24 due to the 
May election. Rolla Mae Hall 

Rolla Mae Hall, 80, of Banner, 
died Thursday, May 19, at her resi­
dence following an extended illness. 

BomJune29, 1913inBanner,she 
wasadaughterofthelateGreenberry 
and Rebecca Elizabeth Collins Hall. 
She was a homemaker. 

She is survived by her brother, 
Ballard E. Hall of Banner. 

Funeral services will be conducted 
Saturday, May 21, at 2 p.m. at the 
Nelson-Frazier Funeral Home with 
Regular Baptist ministers officiating. 
Burial will be made in the Hall Fam­
ily Cemetery at Banner. 

Lois B. King 
Funeral services for former 

Weeksbury resident Lois B. King 
will be held at 10 a.m. tomorrow, 
Saturday, May 21, at the chapel of 
Pulaski Funeral Home in Somerset. 

Mrs. King, 88, a resident of 
Burnside, died Thursday, May 19, at 
Sunrise Manor Nursing Home fol­
lowing a long illness. 

She was born in Knott County on 
May 4, 1906. She was a daughter of 
the late Bristol and Letisa Pigman 
Taylor. She was a homemaker and 
member of Burnside First Baptist 
Church. 

Survivors include her husband, 
Clarence W. King; a son, Samuel E. 
King ofB urns ide; a brother, RollaM. 
Chaffin ofLexington; two grandchil­
dren and four great-grandchildren. 

Rev. Dudley Bryant and Rev. Ri­
chard Allen will officiate at the fu­
neral service. 

Burial will be made in Burnside 
Cemetery, 

Expressions of sympathy may be 
made through contributions to the 
Burnside First Baptist Church Build­
ing Fund. 

Pallbearers listed 
Serving as pallbearers for the fu­

neral service of Leonard Conn were 
Rondal Anderson, Phillip Anderson, 
Jody Conn, Shawn Conn, Rodney 
Conn and Revilla Compton. 

Obie Ousley 
Obie Ousley, 81, of Phoenix, Ari­

zona, died Wednesday, May 18, in 
Phoenix. 

A former Floyd County resident, 
he was the brother of Ruth Gunnels 
of Eastern. 

Funeral arrangements were incom­
plete Thursday at the Hall Funeral 
Home. 

Big Sandy children's home 
celebration a big success 

Lura (Peg) 
Branham 

More than 500 people, including 
Kentucky First Lady Libby Jones, 
turned out for the Big Sandy area's 
celebration of Kentucky Baptist 
Homes for Children's 125th birth-

Lura (Peg) Branham, 83, of Pres- day. 
tonsburg, died Wednesday, May 18, The event, held on the grounds of 
at Highlands Regional Medical Cen- the First Baptist Church of Pikeville, 
ter in Prestonsburg after an extended featured live entertainment, a mid­
illness. way of carnival games for children, 

She was born August 6, 1910 at and a special program conunemorat­
Bonanza, and was a daughter of the ing the founding of the children's 
late Clinton and Susan Spradlin ministry in 1869, 
Fraley. AmemberoftheFirstUnited Mrs. Jones attended the program 
Methodist Church at Prestonsburg, and spoke on behalf of Kentucky's 
she was preceded in death by her children. 
husband, John Branham. "Wemustdoeverythingwecanto 

Surviving her are one son, Tho- protect our children and be sure we 
mas E. Branham of Prestonsburg; are providing the type of environ­
two daughters, Opal Fannin and Bar- ment in which they grow up healthy 
bara Howard, both of Prestonsburg; and safely," Jones said. "Certainly, 
one stepdaughter, Ruby Fraley of Kentucky Baptist Homes for Chil­
Somerset; three brothers, Challie dren has a wonderful and long tradi­
FraleyofPrestonsburg,Hop:leaFraley tion of caring for children who need 
of Somerset, William Fraley of help." 
Melbourne, Florida; six grandchil- Event organizers said they were 
dren and five great-grandchildren. extremely pleased by the turnout 

Funeral services will be conducted "We were hoping for 400 and got 
Saturday, May 21, at 1 p.m. at the well over 500," said Bob Norman, 
FirstUnitedMethodistchurchinPres- pastor of Grace Baptist Church in 
tonsburg with Rev. Russ Holland, Pikeville, who <;:o-chaired the eel­
Rev. Kevin Collins ancf Rev. Ray ebration. "I think this really says a lot 
Snyder officiating. for people in the Big Sandy area and 

Burial will be made in the Rich- their desire to help children." 
mond Memorial Cemetery in Pres- . In addition to turning out for the 
tonsburg. celebration, many in the crowd 

Visitation may be made from 2-9 brought "birthday gifts" to be deliv­
p.m. Friday at the Floyd Funeral ered to children in the care of Ken-
Home. tucky Baptist Homes for Children. 

Active pallbearers were James "The gifts were really just the fin-
Alan Goble, John Click, Greg Dixon, ishing touches on a great day," Ken­
James M. Goble, John A Campbell, tucky Baptist Homes for children 
and Roger Combs. President Curtis Mooney said. "The 

HonorarypallbearerswereAdrian people of the Big Sandy area and 
Lafferty, Bill H. Howard, Dr. James especially those from the Baptist 
D, Adams, Arthur Garrett, Doug churches of Pike and Enterprise Bap­
Garrett,BillBailey, Paul Messer, Rev. tist associations really did a fantastic 
Bill Campbell, Tilden R. Ellis, Bill job of making this celebration event 
Boatrwright, Curtis Hatfield, Walter a special one." 
Combs, and Dr. William Moyer. The Big Sandy event was the sec-

ond of nine celebration events sched­
uled around the state as part of the 
children' sministry I 25th celebration. 
An event was held at the Baptist 
Youth Ranch in Elizabethtown on 
April16. 

The next event is scheduled for 
June 4 at the First Baptist Church of 
London. Events in Middletown, 
Dixon, Morehead, Erlanger and 
Mayfield will follow. 

Kentucky BaptistHo esforChil-

dren is affiliated with the Kentucky 
Baptist Convention and provides care 
for children who have been abused, 
neglected, or whose families are in 
crisis. The agency assists more than 
700 children and adults each year. 

Residential programs include 
Spring Meadows Children's Home 
in Middletown, Glen Dale Children's 
Home in Glendale, the Baptist Youth 
Ranch in Elizabethtown, the Dixon 
Temporary Shelter in Dixon, the Bap­
tist Youth Shelter in Morehead, Op­
eration Hope in Somerset, and Gen­
esis Home in Mayfield. 

KBHC also operates the First Step 
Pregnancy Counseling and Adoption 
service, manages private foster 
homes, and provides independent liv­
ing, college, and career services to 
help older youth get established in 
life. KBHC' s Cornerstone Counsel­
ing ministry provides professional 
Christian counseling to individuals 
and families through offices in 
Ashland, Bowling Green, Erlanger, 
Frankfort, Hopkinsville, and 
Madisonville. 

KentuckyBaptistHomesforChil­
dren is the oldest Southern Baptist 
child care ministry and the largest 
private child care program in Ken­
tucky. 

Kentucky Baptist Homes for Chil­
dren is accredited by the Council on 
Accreditation of Services for Fami­
lies and Children, Inc. 

Adams Middle 
School elections 

TheAdamsMiddleSchool SBDM 
Council parent election process is 
presently underway. Nomination 
forms are available from the 
principal's office and official nomi­
nations are due in the principal's of­
fice by 4 p.m. on May 20. The official 
election will be held on May 31, at 7 
p.m. in the school library. 

Kentucky Vretnam 
Veterans reunion 

The sixth annual Kentucky Viet­
nam Veterans Reunion, Landing Zone 
Bluegrass, is scheduled for May 20-
22 in Frankfort at the Capital Plaza, 
adjacent to the Holiday Inn. 

The reunion is for all veterans 
fro many branch or time period. Some 
of the activities include military dis­
plays, live entertainment, vendors and 
veteran information booths. All 
events are free and the public is in­
vited. 

Optimist Club w meet 
The Optimist Club of Floyd 

County will hold its monthly meeting 
May 24 at 6:30 p.m. at May Lodge. 
Each member is invited to attend and 
to bring a friend. The program in­
cludes a guest speaker. 

For further information, call 
Leonard Cieslak at 377-6741, Eric 
Lawson at 452-4553 or Kitty Frazier 
at 358-9803. 

Mothers of Angels 
Mothers of Angels, a support for 

women and their families who are 
coping with the loss of a child, mis­
carriage, stillbirth or postpartum/neo­
natal death, will be held May 25, at 7 
p.m. in the Floyd Room at Highlands 
Regional Medical Center, The group 
meets on the last Wednesday of each 
month. 

For more information, call 886-
3643,789-5025, or 478-1977. 

AARP dinner meeting 
Jenny Wiley Chapter No. 3528, 

AARP will hold its monthly dinner 
meetingFriday,May20,at5:30p.m., 
in the cafeteria ofHighlands Regional 
Medical Center. 

Burieta Gearhart, president, will 
reportonhertriptothenationalmeet­
ing.Allmembersandguestsareurged 
to attend. 

Preswnsburg High 
council tlJ meet 

The SBDM council of Prestons­
burg High School will meet on Mon­
day, May 23, at 7 p.m. in the school 
library. The adoption of by-laws and 
committee assignments are on the 
agenda. The public is welcome. 

Senior games 
The Big Sandy Senior Games, in 

which senior adults compete formed­
als, will be held May 20 at Jetmy 
Wiley State Park. For more informa­
tion, call (606) 886-2711. 

McDoweU Family 
Resource Center 

to host May IJCtivities 
OnMay23, the McDowell Home­

coming Meeting will be held for all 
graduates at 6 p.m. A nutrition class 
for Drift Headstart students and par­
ents will also be held on that date. 
The Headstart class will be held from 
9 a.m. unti110 a.m. 

On May 25, the McDowell Fam­
ily Resource Center will conduct a 
T.B. skin test clinic for all ages, from 
1-3:30p.m. An arts and aafts session 
is scheduled from 6-7:30 p.m. All 
children must be accompanied by an 
adult 

On May 26, the center will host 
Career Day, from 9 a.m. until 2 p.m., 
f<X" fourth, fifth, sixth and eighth grade 
students. Parents are encouraged to 
attend also. 

May 27th is Career Day at the 
center for sixth, seventh and eighth 
grades . 

In Loving Memory 
of 

Dwayne Fraley 
1964-1982 

Another year has oow come to pau, 
Yet your meTTWry, our son, shall 

forever last. 

We know you are in excellent hands, 
For with the Father is were you 

stand. 

I'm sure if you could tell us, t~ 
simple words you would Bay, 

•1 love you all, and soon shall~ a 
brighter day." 

Yes, we understand, physically you 
are oot here, 

But spiritually, our son, you are 
with us everywhere. 

For it is true, a brighter day shall 
come. As we BaJ good·bye for oow, 
we want you to koow, 

That we love you, Dwayne, as much 
as we did years ago. 

Mom, Dad 
Eddie, Ritchie & Tonya 

In ·Memory of 

Randowal 
Sannin 

Glo, Ky 
Died in Italy 
World War II 
May 20, 1944 

PRESTONSBURG, KENTUCKY 

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
South Lake Drive at Entrance to Jenny Wiley Park 

Sun. Bible Study--10 Lm. 
Worahip-10:45 Lm. 

6 p.m. Std. Time 
7 p.m. D.L.S. Time 

Wed. Bible Study-7 p.m. 

RADIO 
WMDJ-Sun. 9 a.m. 

. We Welcome You and Your Bible Questions, 
Evangelist Bennie Blankenship; Ph. 886-6223, 886-3379 

Lancer Baptist Church Revival 
May 23rd-29th 

7 p.m. nightly 

Evangelist, Steve Rice 
Interim Pastor, Cohen Campbell 

Special Singing Nightly 
Nursery provided. 

Everyone Welcome 



Smile 
Awhile 

A mover or a shaker? 
My job required that I 

attend a retreat in Shakertown 
at Pleasant Hill. The brochure 
stated that it is located 
outside of Lexington on US 
68 near Harrodsburg. That is 
basically correct except that it 
is outside Lexington on a 
stretch of 24 miles of deso­
late, curvy pavement 

Upon my arrival, I was 
amazed at the peaceful, 
serene surroundings of the 
quaint Shaker environment I 
hadn't seen that much grass 
since Bonanza went off 1V. 
There were rows of neatly, 
maintained houses and the 
guides wore period dress. The 
only thing that would inter­
rupt this tranquil setting that I 
have described would be that 
there was television, tele­
phones, and the guides wore 
Reebok tennis shoes. 

It was a perfect location 
for a meeting. Forty-five of 
my peers and I were lodged 
in yesteryear rooms where 
Shaker men and women once 
hung their clothes on 
pegs(slightly better than on 
an arm of a chair) and 
climbed into separate beds 
(and rooms) via foot stools. I 
was obliged to do the same. 
The only modem conve­
niences were electricity and 
bathrooms. This was good 
because I have grown fondly 
accustomed to both during 
my life. 

It has been stated that one 
learns a lot about oneself 
when one is placed in unusual 
circumstances, and these 
were unusual circumstances 
as far as I was concerned I 
learned that I don't like living 
without cable TV. The three 
network channels are all right 
if you don't get used to the 
Sports Channel or are not 
addicted to Nickelodeon. 

Aside from the lodging 
accommodations, the eating 
facility was superb. That is if 
you don't mind eating with 
strangers. The food is served 
family style and passed 
around the table. When I told 
my son the food was served 
family style he said, "You 
mean like at Shoney's?" 

We were informed that 
all the food we ate was grown 
on the property. The pickled 
beets, pickled watermelon 
rind, and new potatoes were 
delicious. The only staple that 
probably wasn't produced 
directly on the grounds was 
the Sweet n' Low. And if 
they had ever heard about fat 
free diets, they weren't 
passing any of it around 
unless fried chicken and 
baked country ham have been 
added to Susan Powter's diet 
tape. 

One extremely positive 
thing I would have to say 
about staying at Shakertown 
is that there were absolutely 
no outside distractions. None. 
Nada. I didn't even hear an 
airplane. And being a scant 
24 miles from Bluegrass 
Field, one would think an 
airplane motor could be heard 
in the dark of night in a place 
where any other bodily 
function could be detected 
from a distance of approxi­
mately two miles. 

The Shaker religion is 
no longer in existence. The 
last Shaker died may years 
ago because their theology 
did not adhere to procreation 
of the species. This ideology 
tends to deplete a following 
in quick fashion. If the 
Shakers had given it more 
thought, they might have 
come to a different conclu­
sion. However, since there 
are backsliders in every 
religion, the Shakers might 
have a few of their ancestral 
genes in existence today. 

Personally, I'm glad the 
lifestyle they led has been 
preserved. For my sake, I just 
wish it had been preserved a 
beach with condos. 
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Seedtime on the Cumberland 
cation leaders from across the region. Appalsbop documentaries focusing on the culture and social 

Appalsbop, a media arts and education center will also host a reunion of students who have Issues of the Appalachian region. Roadside The-
paru. cipated in the Appalachian Media Institute, a ater Appalsbop' s ensemble theater company will 

located in Whitesburg, will kick off its 25th anni- ' ' media and lea<fership training program for high perform its original producu·on "Cumberland 
versary year with a special Seedtime on the 
Cumberland festival of traditional mountain arts school students in eastern Kentucky. Mountain Mountain Memories" at 2 p.m. Local musicians 
June 

1
_
5

. crafts will be on display during the afternoon. will be invited to perform during an open stage and 
A 7:30 p.m. concert in the festival tent will square dance from 4-6 p.m. 

The annual festival will be expanded to five feature North Carolina storyteller Ray Hicks and The 7:30 p.m. concert will feature West Vir-
days of traditional music and storytelling, crafts, his nephew, Orville Hicks. Hicks tells traditional ginia singer and storyteller Phyllis Marks; Joe and 
theater, video and film presentations and other mountain Jack tales and family stories. Also per- Odell Thompson; O'Quinn Brothers and the Blue-
activities observing Appalshop' s 25th year. forming will be Etta Baker, who learned her Pied- T 1 d' · al · b d fro 

Appalshopwillbostayear-longseriesofevents, grass rave ers, a tra lUon stnng an m 
mont blues guitar style from her North Carolina southwest vrr· ginia· the Eversole Brothers who 

starting with the Seedtime on the Cumberland ' ' festival. family; Nat Reese, a West Virginia guitarist who are regulars at the Renfro Valley Bam Dance; and 
sings African American coalfield blues; Odus Jean Ritchie and Edna Baker, sisters whose tradi-

The festival will begin Wednesday, June 1, Maggard, a banio player whose three-finger style ti al tam' • • d d 1 • · 
with a 7 p.m. forum reflecting on Appalachia in the 'J on moun smgmg an u Clffier repertoJ.re 

19605 featuring a screening of .. Appalachia: Rich predates modem bluegrass; and the Lee Sexton comes from a rich Eastern Kentucky family heri­
Band, an old-time string band from Letcher County. tage 

Land, Poor People," a 1967 fllm that focused On Saturday, June 4, craftspeople from the S~dtime on the Cumberland will conclude 
national attention to the Appalachian region. mountains of Kentucky will demonstrate their S da J 5 ·th 1 · I On Thursday, June 2, at 6 p.m., Appalsbop un y, une , w1 a p.m. mountam gospe 
filmmaker Herb E. Smith will screen his new film work throughout the day. At noon and 4 p.m., music concert with Ethel Caffie-Austin, an Afri­
history of the Appalachian Appalsbop will present premiers of other video can American song leader and educator from West 

Virginia; the Macedonia Baptist 
economy.At7:30p.m.,blue- Church Youth Choir, an African 
grass artists Troublesome American ensemble from 
Hollow with local favorites I ' · · · 
Larry Webster and the Mule ': ,,\r:. ' ' . About Ap• 'n. alshon .'·.:·.=·.' Cumberland;theSingingRevelations; 
Band will kick off the . J:' 1' and the Hallelujah Singers. The con-
Seedtime concert series as cert is free; donations will be accepted. 
part of Bluegrass Express Appalshop is a media arts and education center whose purpose is to celebrate Tickets for the evening concerts 

Appalachian culture and voice the region's social concerns. Appalshop was are $6 for adults, $4 for seniors and 
Live, a monthly performance founded in 1969 as a War on Poverty initiative to train young people in film and students. Admission to the Roadside 
radio program broadcast by television production. Rather than leave their homes for work outside the Theater performance is $5 for adults, 
WMMT -FM, Appalshop' s Appalachian region, the students incorporated their own not-for-profitorganiza- $3 for seniors and students. The cost 
community radio station. tion and created their own J. obs. f th bean · $5 All 

Activities on Friday, June o e supper IS . other 
Seedtime on the Cumberland, which ben an in 1987, is an annual celebration e ents are free 

3, will include a forum on art "' v · of traditional mountain arts and the work of Appalsbop. R ti be d b all 
in education, featuring edu- eserva ons may rna e Y c -.. ____________________ • ing (606) 633-0108. 

Ointon supporter George W. Smith told the 
Arkansas Democrat-Gazette in February of his 
plan to relieve one of the president's Whitewater 
problems. To reduce potential taxpayer liability 
for the failure of the Madison Guaranty Savings 
and Loan, Smith would encourage private contri­
butions toward the bailout- by rebating baseball 
trading cards to each contributor, from Smith's 
four-room collection, at $2 in card value for each 
$1 contributed. Smith thinks $2 million could be 
raised toward the projected bailout cost of $47 
million. 

COULDN'T POSSmLY BE TRUE 
- In an August raffle to raise money to send 

Australian surfer Trudy Todd. 18, on the world pro 
sunmg tour, the winner of the $1-a-ticket lottery 
got a fling with a Sydney prostitute of his choice, 
and second prize was a sex-shop voucher worth 
about$27. 

- In November, Rrazil's heaviest woman, 
Josel.ina da Silva, who weighs 900 pounds, was 
admitted to a posh health spa in Sao Paolo. A 
specially adapted ambulance was required to trans­
port her to the facility, and when she arrived, 
fmflghters had to remove a window and part of a 
wall so that she could be taken to her room. 

-In court papers submitted in July, federal 
prosecutors moved to revoke the parole of con­
victed Irvine, Calif., bank swindler Charles J. 
Bazarian, who was then on the lam. In those 
papers, the prosecutors accused Bazarian of a 
second swindle: In 1992, be had convinced the 

man who prosecuted him three years earlier in the 
Irvine swindle to personally invest $6,000 in an 
Oklahoma company that turned out to be worth­
less. 

-InDecember,a3-year-oldboysurvivedal9-
story fall from a Hong Kong apartment house, as 
numerous clotheslines impeded his fall. And in 
October, a construction worker in Mountain View, 
Calif., survived when a 10-ton concrete slab fell on 
him, because the slab was slightly concave. 

-As the result of simultaneous in-vitro fertili­
zation, one set of triplets was born to two mothers 
in two cities one month apart Linda Schaper, 33, 
of Chesterfield, Mo., and her sister Barbara Payne, 
32, of Columbia, Mo., gave birth in January and 
February, with Schaper having two babies. Schaper 
and her husband had produced six fertilized eggs, 
three of which were implanted into each woman. 

-The winner of a January contest sponsored 
by the Washington Mutual Bank, to select the most 
unusual places or events in the-Washington-Or­
egon area, was the Douglas flr tree in Vashon 
Island, Wash., that contains a bicycle trapped 
inside the tree's bark. Local residents say that the 
bicycle was parked beside the tree years ago and 
that me bark eventually grew around it and com­
pletely enveloped iL The tree's growth has lifted 
the bicycle seven feet off the ground. 

- In November, a jury in Montrose, Pa., ac­
quitted SamuelJ. Cosmello Jr., who had confessed 
to killing his brother and burning his bouse down. 
The jury accepted the testimony of a psychiatrist 

who said Cosmello suffered from an obsessive­
compulsive disorder that made him need to con­
fess falsely. 

COURTROOM ANTICS 
-In November, a defense lawyer in San Fran­

cisco attempted to call a parrot to the witness stand 
on the chance that it might speak the name of the 
man who killed its owner, but the judge said no; 
last spring, a chicken took the stand in a Tyler, 
Texas, courtroom to facilitate a demonstration of 
vaccination procedures at a local prison; and also 
last spring, a police dog took the stand in a Pitts­
burgh, Pa., courtroom as a defense attorney tried to 
show that the dog, and n~ his client, was the 
aggressor in a fight. 

-A January Associated Press report from the 
GazaStripdescribedrecentsenrenceshanded down 
by one of the best-known of the local religious 
arbiters. (Most Gazans boycott the Israeli-runcourt 
system and opt for private arbitration.) A man who 
"winks" at a woman and says, "Hey, beautiful!" 
should pay the woman's family about $2,500 and 
have his eye gouged ouL As punishment for rape, 
the rapist must ride an oiled camel from his house 
to his victim's, and upon arrival, he must submit to 
having cut off any part of his body that has oil on 
it. A murderer's family wM ordered to pay either 
a large amount of money to the victim's family or 
a smaller amount plus the use of a woman to bear 
a son to replace the victim. 

(See Weird, A 11) 

Yo, Adolph. Is that your 
nose or are you eating a 
banana? 

Ha, ha, ha. 
Uh, better not laugh too 

loud. 
You just might get sued. 
If you thought Florida's 

vegetable anti-defamation 
law was something, get a 
load of this. 

In Germany, there's the 
"Beleidigungsgesetz." 

The insult law. 
Yep. Call your neighbor 

a Kartoffelbauch--a potato 
belly--and you just might 
fmd yourself in court. 

In Germany, an insult is 
defined as "the illegal 
attack on the honor of 
another person through the 
intentional expression of 
disrespect." 

That's an extension, no 
doubt, of the great Ameri­
can Momism .. .If you can't 
say something nice about 
someone, don't say any­
thing at all. 

Of course, a violation of 
that rule in America might 
get your mouth washed 
out with soap. In Germany 
you might have to shell _, 
out some big bucks. 

We could never enact a 
ban on insults in the 
States. They're as much a 
part of our daily lives as 
are inhaling and exhaling. 

Insults are scientifically 
proven deterrents to 
crime, too. 

Rush-hour drivers use 
them most frequently as 
alternatives to physical 
violence. 

Everywhere except Los 
Angeles, that is, where 
freeway drivers prefer to 
just open fire on anyone 
who doesn't give a tum 
signal before changing 
lanes. 

In Germany, 2,262 

people were convicted in 
1992 of violating insult 
laws. 

The most notable case 
involved a rock band, 
which was fined $35,000 
for a song which insulted 
pro tennis player Steffi 
Graf. 

Boy howdy, wouldn't we 
like to be able to use that 
insult law for just a few 
days. 

We could wipe out rap 
music in a matter of 
minutes. 

Nab. Wouldn't be fea­
sible. 

Guess we ought to just 
count our blessings in 
America. where even 
insults are protected by 
our constitutional right to 
freedom of speech. 

Besides, sticks and 
stones may break our 
bones, but words, when 
creatively expressed, can 
really do a number. 

• 
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BY SELl GROVES 

SOAP UPDATES 
ALL MY Children: Palmer was 

upset to learn Del was Seabone' s son. 
Trevor, feeling sad and jealous watch­
ing the warmth between Jack and 
Laurel, approached Janet Maria. who 
knew Del in the past, was aJarmed to 
see his growing closeness with Julia. 
Gloria was upset when Adam blamed 
Alec for the threats. Jamal looked at 
pictures ofJanine then bid them when 
Alec arrived. Laurel saw Janet talk­
ing to her reflection in the mirror. The 
arrivalofatickingpackagepers.uaded 
Adam to call the police. Wait To See: 
Gloria is pushed into making a cru­
cuil decision. 

ANOTHER WORLD: After re­
vealing the contents of his mother's 
letter to Frankie, Cass agreed to check 
into the hospital to be treated for his 
condition. Later, Morgan was sur­
prised to learn that be and Cass bad a 
sibling who died of heart disease in 
infancy. Although he suspected he 
was being followed. Cass refused to 
letRyaninvestigateforfearofspook­
ing Rachel. Thomas confided to 
Maggie -that Kate was another per­
sonality of John's wife, Sharlene. 
Ryan learned Vicky was in Canada. 
Carl downplayed Rachel's anxieties 
over the threats. Later. he pushed her 
outofthewayasaheavymasonstone 
hurled down. Wait To See: Grant 
gets a report on Ryan's activities. 
- ASTiiEWORLDTURNS:Kim 
was stunned by the audience's re-

sponse to the show Janice taped. Lily 
acknowledged that Holden stood in 
the way of her relationship with 
Damian.Mik:erescuedRosannawhen 
her car stalled. In London, Patricia 
Kingsley explained the significance 
of "Rigoletto" to Holden. Craig re­
acted to seeing Cal and Samantha 
together. A confident Eduardo as­
sured Orlena Holden won't be an 
obstacle. Meanwhile, Holden was 
followed as be arranged for a flight to 
Malta. When Barbara received a new 
note, Hal swore he'll find the person 
who is threatening her. Wait To See: 
Danger awaits Holden as he tries to 
meet with Lily. 

BOLD AND THE BEAUTI­
FUL: To Sheila's chagrin, Eric told 
her their marriage may not be worth 
saving. James' curiosity was piqued 
when Mike warned him not to mess 
with Sheila. Sheila suspected 
Stephanie was using James to get 
damaging information on her. Thome 
told Ridge if he didn't act to reunite 
with Brooke soon, he might regret it. 
James shopped for an engagement 
ring for Brooke. Macy was disap­
pointed when Anthony delayed his 
move from Sally's place and into 
Connor's apartment Sally toldMacy 
she believed Anthony was falling in 
love with her. Wait To See: Sheila 
begins her counter-attack against 
Stephanie . 

DAYS OF OUR LIVES: Vivian 
arranged to switch petri dishes and be 

Weird--------- (Continued from A 10) 

-InNewOrleansinJuly,Kevin "There isn't any woman worth the 
Dominique was acquitted of posses- trouble you got yourself into." 
sion of stolen property, a crime for LEAST COMPETENT PERSON 
which he would have received only a - In December, David Posman 
short jail sentence. On hearing the (serving time for a crime for which I 
verdict,anddespitethejudge'swarn- labeled him in my book as one of 
ings on courtroom decorum, Domin- America's Least Competent Crimi­
iqueleapedtohisfeet, yelled "Thank nals) escaped, and on Jan. 6, accord­
God!" and bearhugged his lawyer. ing to police, entered a Providence, 
Judge Leon Cannizzaro then sen- R.I., bank armed with a gun, walked 
tenced Dominique to six months in up to a clerk and demanded money. 
jail for contempt of court (An ap- The woman informedPosman that he 
peals court freed Dominique after . was in the loan department and that 
nine days.) the tellers were on the other side of 

- !n Septell_lber, the .Judicial the lobby. After pulling off the rob­
Council of Manttoba repnmanded bery and jumping in the getaway car, 
Judge Frank Allen for comments he he briefly got lost trying to elude 
made in a domestic violence case. police and was finally subdued after 
According to the council, Allen told a brief chase. 
the male.def~n~t.. who had .threat- UNDIGNIFIED DEATHS 
ened to.ldll his gtrlfriendandhlDlself, _ In April. the Utah Supreme 

BY SALLY STONE 

SOAP SCRAPS 

Court upheld the murder conviction 
of Frank Powell, who in 1987 ran 
over Glen Candland, culminating 
their fight over who had the best 
pickup uuck. 

(Send your Weird News to Chuck 
Shepherd, P.O. Box 8306, St Peters­
burg, Fla. 33738.) 

implanted with Victor and Kate's 
embryo. Laura snuck into Dr. 
Layton's office to get a new prescrip­
tion slip and learnedofVivian's plan. 
Later, after Layton told a shocked 
Kate and Victor that another woman 
now carried their embryo, Kate asked 
if it can be removed and replaced in 
her uterus. Recaptured by Stefano, 
Marlena was forced to call Roman to 
say she and John were having a fling 
in New Orleans. Peterrealized he had 
nowaytoalertStefanothatBo, Billie, 
Kristen, and Jennifer were flying to 
Maison Blanche for the cotillion. 
Later, Hope looked through a win­
dow to where Bo and Billie were 
standing. Wait To See: John's 
memory flashes reveal a disturbing 
image. 

GENERAL HOSPITAL: A 
drunk driver caused irrevocable 
changes in several lives. Meanwhile, 
Bobbie and Tony realized they were 
drifting further apart. Monica faced 
having to perform the most emotion­
ally draining surgery of her career. 
Ned was banned by Sonny's decision 
to become involved in Lois and 
Brenda's business partnership. Luke 
pondered the prospect of new father­
hood while Laura planted a garden at 
their new home. Wait To See: Felicia 
and Frisco face a II'oubling decision, 
while Ned learns something that could 
affect his future. 

GUIDING LIGHT: AsBlakeand 
Ross discussed their upcoming wed­
ding, Tangie gave Cutter a tip on 
where to find the stolen money. Ed 
and Ross coached Bridget for the 
upcoming custody hearing. Snmned 
to see Frank at tbe hotel where he 
expected to find Pauly, Buzz advised 
him to go home and not lose his 
family as he (Buzz) did years earlier. 
Jenna was heartbroken when Nadine 
lied about the night she (Jenna) and 
Buzz were to elope. But later, Buzz 
(prodded by Frank) confrontedJenna 
whoaskedhimabout that night Frank 
angrily threw Julie out when she at­
tempted to move in with him. Julie 
then got a room at the boarding house, 
and agreed to keep Roger informed 
about Bridget and Dylan. Wait To 
See: The fallout from Ross' bachelor 
party continues. 

LOVING: Tess confessed to Jer­
emy that Clay blackmailed her to 
break up Jeremy and Gwyn. Later, 
Tess, hurt that Cooper bad 
downplayed their relationship, spent 
thenightwitbBuck.Deborahusedan 
incriminating photograph of Clay to 
blackmailherwaybackintotheAlden 
mansion. Casey accepted a job with a 
sleazy private investigator to make 
extra money. Shana and Leo learned 
about Patti' sdevelopmental problem. 
WaitToSee:Deborahgetsmore"use-

This June, Ellen Dolan will return 
to "As the World Turns" to resume 
playing Margo Hughes, a role she left 
in 1993 after playing the character 
for some four years. (She replaces 
Glynnis O'Connor, who assumed the 
role after Ellen left the show.) 

In the story, we'll be told that 
Margo, a police detective, will fi­
nally come home to Oakdale, and to 
her lawyer husband, Tom Hughes 
(Scott Holmes) from Washington, 
D.C. where she had been working for 
some time. 

NATASHA'S STARS 

Executive Producer, Lawrence 
Caso. makes it clear that he's de­
lighted withDolan'sdecision to come 
back to the show. As he says. "Margo 
and Tom are special." He says they 
not only share a passion for one an­
other, butarealso best friends, quali­
ties, Caso says "anyone would want 
to have in this life." 

Caso also tells us that both "Scott 
and Ellen (also) have that passion as 
performers." 

As for Holmes, he couldn't be 
more pleased to have his former act­
ing partner back on the set As he 
says. ''Ellen's one of my favorite 
people to work with. No one will be 
happier to have her back on the show 
than me." 

Speaking with all the pride of pa­
ternal expectancy, Maurice Benard 
(Sonny, "General Hospital") told me 
he and his wife, Paula, are expecting 
their fJIStbom in September. "We 
were delighted when we learned we 
would become parents," Maurice 
said. "It's tbe greatest thing tbatcolld 
have happened to us. • • 

On the professional side, Benard 
says playing Sonny has been a very 
rewarding experience. "I enjoyed 
playingNicoon 'AllMyChildren,"' 
he said. "When it was time for me to 
leave the show to do some other 
things, I thought if I ever went to 
another soap, r d probably never have 
as interesting a character to play as 
Nico was. But Sonny has turned out 
to be everything I could want in a 
character." 

Paul Kersey, who plays the sexu­
ally-obsessed Alan on "Days of Our 
Lives," just became a contract player 
on the soap. 

On "Loving," it's Joseph Siravo 
who will be playing private detective 
Tommy Fontana. 

ExpectabigtributetoMacDonald 
Carey to air on "Days of Our Lives" 
this summer. 

ARIES (March 21 to April 19) 
You are on the right track where 
business interests are concerned this 
week. Progress is assured. Later in 
the week, however, you may be 
tempted to overspend on pleasure 
pursuits. Be careful with your use of 
credit cards. Home activities domi­
nate the weekend. 

TAURUS (April 20 to May 20) 
Couples will be sharing happy times 
togethernow, but in business, be care­
ful that you are not taking something 
for granted. Stay on top of current 
assignments . Accomplishment is 
likely to fall short of expectations. 

GEMINI (May 21 to June 20) 
You will have a productive begin­
ning to the week, but later, your ef­
forts may slacken. Try not to get 
sidetracked by unimportant issues. 
Be determined and persistent. Ro­
mantic interests are highlighted and 
you will be making plans for a get­
away. 

CANCER (JWle 21 to July 22) 
Telling someone how much you care 
will mean a lot this week. You should 
avoid taking financial risks now and 
try not to overspend. A relative is 
extra sensitive now so be aware of 
this. 

LEO (July 23 to August 22) You 
may find extra work now that can be 
done from the home. However, don't 
be too eager to make a good impres­
sion. Just be yourself. A slight mis­
understanding could arise with a fam­
ily member over finances. Guard 
against needless expense. 

VIRGO (August23 to September 
22) You are usually careful about 
details but this week you could over­
look something of importance. It will 
take extra patience and understand­
ing to cope with a touchy coworker's 
mood swings. Accent family this 
weekend. 

LIDRA (September 23 to Octo­
ber 22) Shopping for home necessi­
ties is favored now but you could go 
overboard when it comes to spending 
on preasure. Seek less costly ways of 
having fun. Trytoincludesomesports 
or physical activity in your schedule. 

SCORPIO (October 23 to No­
vember 21) Be sure not to make a 
promise to a family member that you 
won • t be able to keep. This week 
fmds you more self -expressive than 
usual. Make important phone calls 
and answer correspondence now. 
Extra drive leads to fmancial gain 
and progress. 

SAGITTARIUS (November 22 

to December 21) Make a point of 
being on time this week. Guard 
against procrastination and exagger­
ated speech. Others may be evasive 
and hard to pin down now. Disregard 
rumors you may hear this weekend. 

CAPRICORN (December 22 to 
January 19) You will have a good 
time socializing this week. However, 
you will have to take what one friend 
says with a grain of salt Adhere to 
budgets now and guard against over­
spending. A slight misunderstanding 
could arise over finances. 

AQUARIUS (January 20 to Feb­
ruary 18) You will hear some big talk 
in business this week and may waste 
your time with a person whose words 
don't amount to much. It's best now 
to catch up on a backlog of work. 
Watch which way the wind blows 
when dealing with a moody superior. 

PISCES (February 19 to March 
20) Visiting friends at a distance will 
soon be on your agenda. After some 
early socializing this week. you will 
want time for yourself to deal with 
some unfinished projects. A family 
member is supportive. 

An•wers to Super Crossword 
IS IE wle 

It:! 

I ; i S IH~ 

'( .(H ~ IP 

II • • 
lli.l IS 

ful" information 
ONE LIFE TO LIVE: A police­

man shot Todd as he prepared to 
surrender to Bo. Later, Bo told Todd 
he'll face new charges in prison. 
Meanwhile,Martydiscussedhercon­
fusion about Todd with Andrew. In 
Atlantic City, Max and Blair lost 
their money to Tommy G. Nora 
squelched Dorian • s attempt to bribe a 
juror and confiscated the money in 
her safe. Blair realized she now had 
no funds torepayTommyG. Max left 
Luna and AI. The jury reached a 
verdict. Wait To See: Cliffs "tip" 
could change Dorian's life. 

YOUNG AND THE REST­
LESS: Victor learned it was possible 
Hope's sight might be restored. After 
apologizing for blowing up at news 
that Jack had visited her, Victor told 
Hope he loved her. Malcolm was 
mugged and taken to the emergency 
room where Olivia stitched him up. 1 

Silva told tbe court April bad not , 
planned to murder Robert, but picked 
up the letter opener and stabbed him 
on impulse. After the court was 
cleared, Chris revealed Paul is 
Heather's father. Ryan surprised Nina 
by proposing marriage. Brad was 
upset when Colleen called him Mr. 
Carlton and referred to Steve as 
Daddy. Wait To See: A new piece of 
evidence could damage April's case. 
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DAVID COPPERFIELD 

WEDDINGTON 
THEATRE 

Downtown P ikt.·villc Ph one: 4 :l7-44A9 
All Sc a t s $ 3 .00 

:\1atinc es, All Sca ts $ 1.5U 

II t . 

Saturday/Sunct.y: !"~~~•j 
1:30 and 4:00 ... ·.o =·= 

No Escape 
NighUy: 7:00 & 9:15 ~~~ 

SatJSun.: 7:00 & 9:15 :=.=: II :=:=:· 

1.1ATINEES. SATURDAY & SUNDAY!!! 
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PROTECT YOURSELF AND YOUR 
CHILDREN FROM VIOLENCE. 

Call someone who con help ... 
886·6025 (Floyd County) 1·800-649-6605 (Outside Floyd County) 

JOHN H. GRAY 

I will beat any Toyota Dealer's 
best price by $200111 

Guaranteed! 
1010 Elizabeth Drive 
P.O. Box 489 (40340) 
Nicholasville, KY 40356 

(606) 887-4200 
1-8(X)-467 -7283 

eaa:y •or s-.__ 
="~ Wrth ·~ 

e;,c The Magic TOUCh ea~ 
Hair & Tanning Salon 

Once you visit our luxurious hair & tanning salon, all others 
will pale by comparison! 

Rt.so 

10 TANNING SESSIONS *25.00 memories 
(lotion & eyeware included) 

874-1288 

p • • • • • I BEST VALUE COUPON I • • • • •. 

: · (11) Little Caesars· Pizza : 
: FAMILY ; 
: CHOICE® ; 
I 2 LARGE PIZZAS ; 
1
1 

One pizza wit• 8 select topplag • for .. e .cl•lb. I 
I One pizza wltla vp to 2 topplags • for .. elcWs. I 

: $12~.? : 
I I I Valid only w~h coupon at participating Little Caesars. Stopping Pizza includes 1 
I pepperoni, mushrooms, onions, ham, ground beef, bacon, green peppers and I 

I 
italian sausage. No substlutions or deletions. •excludes extra cheese. I 

I Explresa 6/4/94 I 

I I 
I I 
I I 
I I 
I I 

; CI)LtttleCaesars· 886·8215 ; 
• • • • • • • BEST VALUE COUPON I • • • • •. 

* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * ' uesday, May 2 

Election Day 
The 

Floyd County Clerks 
office 

will be closed 
for Business 

Floyd County Board 
of Elections 

will be in session. 
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THE FAR SIDE By GARY LARSON THE FAR SIDE By GARY LARSON THE SPATS by JEFF PICKERING 

r------------------

"Boy, Henry ... he really can do you!" 

!J·ZO 

Like frozen sentries of the Serengetl, the century-old 
termite mounds had withstood all tests of time and 

foe -all tests, that Is, except the one Involving 
drunken aardvarks and a stolen wrecking ball. 

Fa reus by David waisglass FarCUS 
Gordon Coulthart 

by David Waisglass 
Gordon Coulthart 

5-19 
019811Fatru~~r0Jtclbyllnwru PrtuS)'"datt 

"It's from Joey. He'll be in law school 
another 3 to 5 years." 

Vision Teaser 

r----------------------------------

"We wanted our lawyer to cut the cake." 

MagicMaze 
DAVID 

HAROL~ WHAf ON cARffl 
HAPPENED To YoUR HRIR?r 

~ 

OUT ON A LIMB by GARY KOPERVAS 

l\ prt~b'lef\'\ ... 

R.F.D. by MIKE MARLAND 

RATZ by BEN SMITH 

HEY. BILL'( I I'VE GOT A 
\-tll~RIOL>S JOKE To TELL! 
L\StEN; WI-lY DID THE EL£­
R\ftNT 'SlANt> Ot--1 Tl-\E 

M~I?S4-
MELLO'J 

7 

Super Crossword 

ACROSS 
1 Cash stash 
5Mottled 
8Unduly 

12 Rob of 
"WCiyne's 
World" 

18 At for 
farming 

18 Union 
member? 

20Chlcken 
cordonbleu 
Ingredient 

21 Scheme 
221talan 

football 
player? 

241taMan 
actress? 

26 Time and 
again 

27 Sue­
Langdon 

28Well· 
Integrated 

30Hybrldf~ 
32 Corne down 

hard 
33~Friend 

38With25 
Down, 
lsrae~ dty 

37 Stephen 
King's forte 

38 It's for the 
birds 

41 Used to be 
44 Conclude a 

deal 82 Play ball 
47 Cry of dismay 94 Hairy 
41 Jocular Addams 

-Johnson 95 Portends 
50 Onassls' H Vane dir. 

nickname 87 Petty officer 
51 ltaHan 98 Lug hider 

poUtlclan? 103 Bit part In 
56 Fleur-de·- "Cleopatra'"? 
57 More 106 Tizzy 

congenial 107 It might be 
58- du Olable proper 
80 ·-You Glad 108 Morning 

You're You" munchle 
81 Take down 112 Passionate 

a peg parrot? 
63 Put In 118 Prohibit 

stitches? 117 Eaglet's 
85 It's between home 

a walk and 119 Italian 
a run spouse? 

66 Gets one's 122 Italian poet? 
bearings 125 Bierce's 

66 Clare Boothe birthplace 

69Miltonor 
Tennyson 

72 Cultural org. 
73 The best 

of times 
76 Forget to 

mention 
77 Selassle site 
81 Put on 
82 Ropes In 
84 Mil. address 
85Zhou-
86 Diffident 
87 Italian song? 
81 Remnant 

126 Junior 
127 Hang a 

hammock 
128 Pocket 

flowers? 
128 High time? 
130 Explosive 

Initials 
131 Navada city 
132 "Peter Pan" 

pirate 
DOWN 
1 Present 

company? 
2 Part of AWOL 
3 Projecting 

edge 
4 Sundown. 

to Shelley 
5 Nero·s 

Instrument 
6 Relating to 
7 Actor 

Wallach 
8 Disco 

denizen 
9Whatyou 

used to be 
10 Fury food 
11 Science 

magazine 
12 Monrovia's 

nation 
13 Lyric poem 
14 Director 

Craven 
15 Do lunch 
16 Flap 
17 Huck"s craft 
19 Serenade 

singer 
23-de mer 
25 See 36 

Across 
29 Medical org. 
31 "Lohengrin'" 

soprano 
32-Gigio 
34 Italian tabloid 

figure? 
35 Creative type 
37 Brobding· 

nagian 
38 "The Longest 

Day'" author 
39Cow 

(\~E YOUR t-tot-i Mlt> ~t> 
(.OuSI t-lS ?_ 

l ~r 
40 Green lights Columbus" 
41 Have a yen author 
42 Notes from 84 Perched on 

Verdi? 88 Chinese 
43 ltaNan principle 

performer? 88 lsraeM 
45 Cleveland's diplomat 

lake iO Jacob's twin 
46 Victorian wit 83 Be favorable 
48 Conductor to 

Klemperer 88 Mighty mite 
51 Fancy fabric 100 Cycle starter 
52 On the big 101 Anesthetizes 

side an audience 
53 Legal claim 102 Snuggle with 
54 Antiprohlbi· a sweetie 

tionists 104 Alpine event 
55 Washington 105 Delight 

peak 108 Semi stuff 
58 Manage to 1U9 Genes 

avoid designer? 
62 "Don't- ill" 110 Singer 
64 Alejandro of Maresca 

"Dallas" 111 Ready to eat 
65 Offer an 113 Enormous 

apple? 114 Schoolboy's 
67 Team scream jacket 
70 Lots of bread 115 Crooked 
71 Lukewarm 118 Green 
73 Impulsive house? 
74 Canyon 118 Wake-up 

sounds goddess? 
75 "Let it stand" 119 Leibman or 
78 Ubiquitous Howard 

Infinitive 120 Triumphant 
79 Bannan cry 

and Holm 121 "0 Sole_ .. 
80 Nurse's 123 Actor Gerard 

helper 124 Audio 
83 "Goodbye. antiques? 

COPPERFIELD (Answers on A 11) 

v v s p y N K F D p c y A X 

v s 0 0 L(R E p 0 R T E R)J s 

H E K c A X uo v T R p E I D 

N R L L y J W B H F D B KH L 

y X E NO T s D R UM R 0 v E 

T R p B 0 F T E 0 E A R 00 

M K I RWG F 0 L B T . E R A F 

D B T ZXAWUG R u N G T K 

R 0 0 N L J c S G A N A G c 
F D S N E K c DC E H A c 
YWOLN E p s M S XPCWW 

Find the listed words in the diagram. They run in 
all directions-forward, backward, up down and 

diagonally. ' 

Agnes 
Bark is 
Canterbury 
Charles 

Dora 
Heep 
Micawber 
Murdstone 

Peggotty 
Reporter 
Rookery 
Speniow 

Suffolk 
Trotwood 
Wickfields 

(Answers on A 11) 
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A 
Look 
At 
Sports 
by Ed Taylor 
Sports Editor 

BELATED BIRTHDAY AND 
MUCHMORE .•• 

Well, I have to first wish a very 
goodbuddyofmineahappybirtb­
day. 

Rick Bentley, Sports Editor of 
the News-Express in Pikeville, 
celebrated his 27th birthday this 
past Tuesday and we want him to 
know that we appreciate him very 
much and hope that he will have 
many, many more. 

Rick is one of those guys that 
is easy to know. An excellent 
sports editor. Doesjustagreatjob 
at Pikeville. 

The boys' 58th District Base­
ball Tournament is history and it 
was a good one. 

Betsy Layne High School, host 
school, did an excellent job of 
putting on the event. A good 
crowd was on band Tuesday night 
as both diamonds (big field and 
Little League field) were being 
used. 

Admission was charged for the 
tournament, but not too many 
complained. It takes a lot of ex­
pense to put on a tournament and 
admission helps offset some of 
the cost 

Mr. Alan Osborne and his staff 
werewonderfulbostsfortheboys' 
and girls' tournaments. A nice 
concession stand was pulled in 
from the Pepsi people. They didn't 
have to use a picnic table. 

It really is a shame that folks 
from the other regions have to 
come into our park and there are 
no rest room facilities or even a 
comfortable place to sit 

I have always said that if the 
county officials would build a 
grandstand, concession stand and 
rest rooms, more people would 
come out to the games. 

The way it is, the fans have 
been complaining about the rest 
room facilities available. They are 
very dirty. 

But who can change all that! 
Russell will be the site for the 

girls' regional softball tournament 
andBetsy Layne and Allen Cen­
tral will advance from this dis­
trict (The district championship 
game was last night.) 

The boys will begin regional 
play this coming week at Pikeville. 
There is a fine facility. That's the 
only place to play the regional. 
Dave Thomas and his group do an 
excellent job of hosting the re­
gional. 

Still a lot of talk around the 
county about some coaches not 
comingbacknextyear. Tbatisall 
talk. Or is it? 

What is the top sport subject 
that everyone is talking about right 
about now? 

Seems to be the Prestonsburg 
Blackcats football team. The 
Blackcats are expected to field 
another outstanding team. The 
schedule will begin with a bowl 
appearance at Pikeville and then 
a trip to Lexington. 

Can they repeat as regional 
champions? I think so! Is that 
putting to much pressure on this 
year's corp. I think not They can 
handle it. 

The Allen Central Rebels bas­
ketball team will get a lot of expo­
sure state wide this fall when they 
play in the King of the Bluegrass 
and in a Lexington tournament. 

South Floyd's new gym is sev­
eral weeks ahead of time, accord­
ing to reports. The facility is to be 
a nice one and will seat around 
1500. The new facility should be 
ready shortly after the season be­
gins this fall. 

What do you think of the Ken­
tucky Rifles signing a woman to 
play baseball for them this sum­
mer? 

They did just that (separate 
story). Kendra Hanes. She will 
never last the season. 

Congratulations to Paul David 
Tackett and his 13-year-old AAU 
basketball team at South Floyd. 
The team made a good showing 
in the recent state tournament 
winning two games while drop­
ping one. 

The folks at Food City and 
WMDJ radio are to be applauded 

(See A Look At Sports, B4) 

Rebels 58th District Chant pions 
by Ed Taylor 
Sports Editor 

Good things continue to come the 
way of Allen Central High School. 
The school's Rebels baseball team 
captured the 58th District Tourna­
ment title with an 11-5 win over the 
Betsy Layne Bobcats. 

It was just another piece of hard­
ware for the trophy case at the Right 
Beaver school to go with a district 
and regional basketball champion­
ship, as well as the Lady Rebels cap­
luring the Class A regional this sea­
son. 

The Rebels won in a big way. 
They have been playing excellent 
baseball the last three weeks of the 
regular season. Coach Jackie Pack 
says the improvement is related to 

the competition they have faced this 
year. 

"I know our record is not as good 
as some of the other teams," he said, 
"but we have been on a roll and that 
is because of the quality of competi­
tion we have played this year. We 
haven't played any patsies on our 
schedule and it has made us a better 
ballclub." 

Austin Shelton, who has been a 
pleasant surprise to the Rebels' pitch­
ing staff this year, picked up the win 
in going the distance. He allowed the 
Bobcats five runs while scattering 
nine hits. He fanned three and walked 
four,. while bitting one batter. 

"Austin is a bulldog when he goes 
out there," said-Coach Pack. "Every 
pitch, every hitter, he's focused. Noth­
ing seems to bother him. He has been 

pitching some excellent baseball for 
us." 

Barry Clark, the ace of the Betsy 
Layne staff, suffered the setback, 
working the frrst four-and a-third in­
nings. Clark gave up nine runs on 
eight hits and walked five. He struck 
out two. 

"We made a couple of costly er­
rors," said Betsy Layne coach Junior 
Newsome." Allen Central played hard 
and the Shelton kid pitched a very 
good game against us. Barryjustdidn't 
pitch well. 

"Allen Central just wanted it more 
and they played a nice game," be 
said. 

The Rebels scored five times in 
the ftfth inning to add to their already 
6-2lead. Jeremy Hall, dropped from 

second to sixth in the batting order, 

singled, stole second and scored on 
designated hitter Roy John Martin's 
base hit 

J osb Hansford reached on an error 
and catcher Todd Bingham walked. 
Clark then departed the game and 
Brandon Castle came on in relief. 

Brian Reed then greeted Castle 
with a double that scored Martin. 
Hansford and B ingbam came on to 
score when Kevin Allen lined a two­
run single that made it an 11-2 game. 

Betsy Layne got three runs back in 
their half of the sixth for an 11-5 
score. 

Betsy Layne took a 1-0 lead after 
holding the Rebels in the first. Der­
rick Newsome singled and scored on 
a ground out. 

Allen Central tied the game at 1-1 
with a run in the second. Jason Martin 
scored, after walking, on Bingham's 

fielder's choice play. Bingham picked 
up the RBI. 

The Rebels plated two more in the 
third to lead 3-1. Floyd tripled with 
one out and scored on Jeremy Hall's 
run-scoringsingle.Martin walked and 
carne in to score on Roy John Martin's 
second hit of the game. 

In the third, Newsome walked and 
scored on Chris Potter's triple to make 
ita3-2affair. Allen Central struck for 
three in the fourth and led 6-2. Floyd 
had a two-run double in the inning. 

Glen Floyd was.perfect at the plate 
with three hits and two RBis. Roy 
John Martin fmished with a strong 
game as he continued to sting the 
baseball. Martin had three bits in the 
game and one RBI. 

"I'm proud of this group of play-

(See District champs, B 2) 

McKinney, Conn homer in 13-5 Allen Central win 
by Ed Taylor 
Sports Editor Lady Rebels advance in district 
Just two weeks ago, the Allen 

Central Lady Rebels' softball team 
dropped a doubleheader to the Lady 

Hornets of Magoffin County. Thfs 
past Tuesday night, the two teams 
met in the frrst round of the women's 
districttournamentatStumboParkin 

Belts three-run home run! 
Allen Central catcher Kathy Conn got all the ball and sent the pitch over 
the fence for a three-run home run that helped the Lady Rebels defeat 
Magoffin County 13-5 in the first round of the women's district tourna­
ment Tuesday night. (photo by Ed Taylor) 

Betsy Layne survives 
Johnson Central scare 

by Ed Taylor 
Sports Editor 

The Betsy Layne Lady Cats en­
tered Wednesday night's semifmat 
game against Johnson Central as one 
of the top three teams in district 
women's softball, sporting a spar­
kling 25-7 record. 

Johnson Central, on the other band, 
bad won once and that came over 
South Floyd. The Lady Eagles were 
just enjoying their frrst season and 
played loose. 

Too loose, as far the Lady Cats go. 
The Lady Eagles would have pulled 
off the upset of the tournament bad it 
not been for the late-inning heroics of 
Ashley Tackett and Jessica Johnson. 

Betsy Layne scored five runs in 
the bottom of the sixth inning to pull 
out a 12-9 win over the determined 
Lady Eagles. For three innings, Betsy 
Laynejustcould not dent the plate as 
they saw Johnson Central roll out to 
an 8-4lead. 

In the sixth, trailing 9-7, Ashley 
Bartley started the rally with a base 
hit. After Shanna Clark, who was 
held hitless, lined to center, Misty 
Clark singled. Christy Osborne roped 
a hase hit to left, scoring Bartley, and 
Tackett drilled a two-run double that 

gave the Lady Cats the lead at 10-9. 
Betsy Layne got two insurance' 

runs when Johnson collected her third 
bit of the game, a double, scoring 
Tackett. Johnson scored on a ground 
out by Dawn Watson. 

Johnson Central put two runners 
on b~e in the top of the seventh, but 
both runners were left stranded as 
Crystal Cantrell bounced back to 
Heather Keathley on the mound for 
the final out. 

Betsy Layne led 4-2 after the frrst 
inning. Johnson Central scored two 
unearned runs in the top of the frrst 
for a 2-0 game. Joy McKenzie singled 
leading off and scored on an error off 
the bat of Cantrell. Cynthia Ousley 
doubled in Cantrell. The error made 
the runs unearned. 

Betsy Layne plated four in the 
frrst on a two-run single by Misty 
Clark, who was back from a one­
game suspension. Johnson drove in a 
run with an RBI single. 

Two runs scored in the Lady 
Eagles' half of the second for a 4-4 
gam'e. Beth Kestner singled and 

scored while the Lady Cats commit­
ted three errors. Michelle Robinson 
scored the second run. 

(See Betsy Layne, B 2) 

Allen. 
The result was a bit different this 

time around with Allen Central post­
ing a 13-5 win to eliminate the Lady 
Hornets and advanced to the semifi­
nals. 

Veronica McKinney and Kathy 
Conn supplied the power and Lisa 
Stumbo gathered in three bits to lead 
the Allen Central bit parade. 

McKinney clubbed a grand slam 
home run in the frrst inning and Coon 
blasted a three-run shot in the second. 
Stumbo bad three consecutive bits 
until she was retired in the seventh 
inning. 

Misty Scott picked up the win for 
the Lady Rebels with Tina Shepherd 
suffering the setback for Magoffm 
County. 

Magoffin County committed nine 
errors in the game while Allen Cen­
tral bad two. 

Allen Central took a 4-0 lead in 

South Floyd 
closes season 
with loss to 
Lady Eagles 

by Ed Taylor 
Sports Editor 

The South Floyd Lady Raiders 
closed out a disappointing flfSl sea­
son with a 16-7 loss to the Johnson 
Central Lady Eagles this past Tues­
day night in the ftrSt round of the 
women's district softball tournament 
at Stumbo Park in Allen. 

It was the first win of the season 
for the Lady Eagles, who is in their 
frrst year of play. 

Misty Shannon led the Lady Raid­
ers at the plate with tbCee bits. She 
picked up four RBis in the game. 
Crystal Newsome had two hits. 

Johnson Central scored seven 
times in the fl.fth inning to break open 
an otherwise close game. The Lady 
Eagles was holding a slim 6-5 lead 
when they went on top 11-5. Crystal 
Cantrell bad a three-run triple in the 
inning and Sarah Castle picked up 
two RBis with a base bit. Crystal 
Hayden bad a run scoring double. 

South Floyd scored first and took 
a 3-0 lead in the second inning. Crys­
tal Newsome singled and scored on 
an error by the Lady Eagles pitcher 
off the bat of Kathy Jo Stumbo. Can­
dida Hamilton was safe when her 
ground ball to second was misplayed. 
Both runners scored on Shannon's 
two-run double. 

Johnson Central struck for five 
runs in the bottom of the second to 
take a 5-3 lead. All the runs scored 
with two outs in the inning. A leadoff 
single by Amy Borders and a walk to 
Michelle Robinson set the stage for 
Castle's fl.rst bit of the game. Alice 
Stapleton followed with a single and 
Joy McKenzie walked to load the· 
bases. Cantrell then cleared the bags 
with a double. 

South Floyd scored single runs in 
the third and fourth to tie the game at 
5. Susan Stephens reached on an er-

(See South Floyd, B 3) 

the top of the first on McKinney's fence. Valinda Turner reached on an 
slam. Melissa Mullins reached on an error to begin the inning. Stumbo 
error at short, Jennifer Mullins col- then doubled her home. Stumbo 
lectedaoneoutbitandConnsingled scored when Melissa Mullins' 
to fill the bases for McKinney's drive grounder to short went through for an 
over the left center field fence. Nikki error. With two out, Jennifer Mullins 
Queen also bad a base bit in the doubled and Conn blasted her home 
inning. run. 

Five runs scored in the Lady Rebels 
secondtogivethema9-0lead. Three (See McKinney, B 3) 
runs came in on Conn's shot over the 

Frustrated, but respected! 
Allen Central second baseman Veronica McKinney trotted to 1irst base 
after being intentionally passed against Prestonsburg Wednesday 
night. Prestonsburg intentionally walked McKinney five times and once 
intentionally with the bases loaded. McKinney hit a grand slam home 
run against Magoffin County the night before and has been a power 
hitter all season for Allen Central. Allen Central mounted a comeback 
and posted a 19-18 win over Prestonsburg. (photo by Ed Taylor) 

Never-give-up Lady 
Rebels defeat Lady 
Blackcats, 19-18 

by Ed Taylor 
Sports Editor 

to the championship game (yester­
day) against the Betsy Layne Lady 
Cats. 

Allen Central girls' softball coach When the third inning bad ended, 
Anthony Moore was ready to throw Allen Central found themselves in a 
in the towel after the frrst inning of very deep hole. Prestonsburg owned 
his team's game with the Prestonsburg a 16-0 lead and it didn't look too 
Lady Blackcats. The two teams met promising for the Lady Rebels. 
in the semifinals of the women's dis- Prestonsburg coach Bridget Clay 
trictsoftballtournarncntatAilenPark refused to allow the softball to be 
Wednesday night tossed to bard-bitting Veronica 

Prestonsburg scored 10 times in McKinney, who bad been busting the 
the first inning, and it wasn't because fences lately. McKinney's bat was 
they were stinging the softball. Allen taken out of her hand on every ap­
Central just couldn't field the ball. pearanceat the plate. She walked five 

The Lady Rebels committed seven times. Clay ordered her walked, even 
frrst-inning errors and all but one with the bases loaded in the fifth. 
Prestonsburg run was earned. "I didn't want her to do a lot of 

"We should have been out of the damage with her bat." said Clay, who 
frrst inning without any runs being said that she wouldn't have changed 
scored," said Moore. anything in the game. 

While confusion reigned defen- Allen Central trailed 18-17 enter-
si vely, Allen Central did manage one ing the top of the seventh inning after 
of the biggest comebacks of the sea- tyin11: the game at 17-17 with four 
son when they edged a very good , 
Prestonsburg team 19-18 to advance (See Lady Rebels, B 3) 



Di~tri ct champs--- (Continued from B 1) 

ers," said Coach Pack. "It is amazing 
what they have accomplished this 
season with no baseball facilities and 
having to practice in the gym. They 
are a great bunch." 

Pack said that he saw his team tum 
things around after their 3-2 loss to 
top-ranked Johnson Central two 
weeks ago. 

"I know that we beat Boyd County, 
but after we played Johnson Central 
the way we did, I realized that they 
could play with anyone," he said. " 
We just started to settle down and got 
better as a team." 

Pack said that be is pleased with 
his present pitching staff and thinks 
they can throw against anyone in the 
regional tournament. 

"Austin is a good kid," said Pack. 
"He has a great altitude. He quit the 
team last year and came back. He was 
out for 10 days with an injury. 

"Jason Martin is a tough competi­
torandagoodpitcher. WehaveGlenn 
Floyd, who is a good three pitcher," 

he said. 
Pack said that his team hasn't been 

scoringalotofrunslately (they scored 
25 in the two game of the tourna­
ment) and getting runs any way he 
can is beneficial, even if it means 
squeezing a run home at times. 

"I always like to play for the first 

run. We're the type of team thnthas to 
score any way we can," he said. "l 
like the suicide squeeze. We used it at 
certain times and against certain 
teams. We have certain players that 
do it. Not everyone can." 

The Allen Central coach thinks 
his team has a shot at a regional 
championship and it will not be some­
thing foreign to him as a coach. 

"I had two regional winners at 
other schools I was at," he said. 

The Rebels improved to 10-15 on 
the year. Betsy Layne dropped to 23-
12. 

Both will advance to the 15th Re­
gional Tournament next week at 
Pikeville. A meeting is scheduled for 
Sunday to determine the pairings. 

A~en Central 
players 
Aeed2b 
Anen ss 
Floyd rf 
K. Martin 1b 
J. Martin 
Hanct 
Shelonp 
A. Manindh 
Hansford r 
Bingham c 

ab r h rt>l 
5 1 1 1 
5 2 1 2 
3 2 3 2 
3 0 0 0 
2 2 0 0 
• 1 2 1 
0 0 0 0 
4 0 3 2 
3 1 0 0 
2 2 1 0 

Betsy layne 
players ab r h rbl 
D. N'some 2b3 2 2 o 
Ponerss 3 1 1 1 
Castle1b 4 0 1 3 
S. Nsome3b2 0 0 0 
Keathley 3b 1 0 0 0 
Clarf<p 2010 
Hunterc 4 0 1 0 
Klddpr 0000 
Ousley cf 4 1 1 0 
Meade rf 4 0 2 1 
Hamlfton I 2 0 0 0 
Rosen 0100 

AUenCentrai... .•. 0123500·1111 0 
Betsylayne ....... 1 01 0030· 5 9 1 
Shetton and Bingham; Clark, Castle (5) and Hunter 2B • 
Clark, Meade, Reed, Floyd 3B·Poner, Castle, Floyd SAC 
• Potter, K. Martin 

Runner and ball arrive! 
Crystal Newsome, South Floyd, slid as she arrived at the time the ball 
did. Newsome was safe as she scored in the second inning against 
Johnson Central. The two teams met in the first round of the women's 
district softball tournament at Allen Tuesday night. Johnson Central 
posted a 16-7 win. {photo by Ed Taylor) 

Photos sponsored · by: 

Takes the ball for Bobcats! 
Barry Clark started on the mound for the Betsy Layne Bobcats when 
they faced the Allen Central Rebels In the championship game of the 
58th District Tournament Wednesday night at the Allen Park. Betsy 
Layne fell to the Rebels 11-5, but will play in the regional tournament 
next week. {photo by Ed Taylor) 

Betsy ~ayne-----CContinuedfromB t) 

The Lady Cats bad runners on in 
the second, third and fourth innings, 
but could not push a run home. 

Johnson Central made it a 8-4 
game with four runs in the top of the 
third. Two errors at second base 
opened the door for the scores. In 
fact, Johnson Central did not have a 
hit in the inning and the Lady Cats 
committed four errors and let the four 
runs cross the plate. 

A three-run flfth pulled the Lady 
Cats to within one, 8-7. Misty Oark 
doubled and scored on Tackett's sac­
rifice fly to right field. Johnson then 
doubled borne Osborne, who had 
reached on an error and moved to 
third on the sacrifice. Johnson came 
on to score on two consecutive errors 
on the Lady Eagles. 

Johnson Central struck for one 
run in the top of the sixth for a 9-7 
game. Ousley tripled to begin the 
inning and scored on a double play 
ball off the bat of Crystal Hayden. 

•·· 

Both teams committed nine errors 
in the game. 

The win improved the Lady Cats 
to 26-7 on the year and a berth in next 
week's regional tournament at 
Russell. The Lady Cats faced Allen 
Central in last night's championship 
game. 

Johnson Central 
players ab r h rt>l 
McKenzie 3b 4 1 1 0 
cantrelc ~ 2 0 0 
L McKenzie ss 3 1 o o 
Brownd 3 0 0 0 
Ousleyrf 3222 
Borders eh 2 0 0 0 
Hayden I 3 1 0 o 
Kestnerp 3 1 1 1 
Robinson 1b 3 1 1 0 
CoDins 1 o o o 
casUest 3 o o o 
Dailey 1000 
Slapleton 2b 3 0 2 0 

Betsy layne 
players ab r h rbl 
Keathley p 3 0 1 0 
Bartley 2b 4 2 1 1 
S. Ciarl<1b 4 0 0 0 
M. Clarf< ss 4 3 3 2 
Osborne 3b 3 3 2 1 
Tackettcf 4 2 2 3 
JohllSOO • 3 2 3 3 
Hamlnon c 3 o o o 
Watson rf 4 0 0 0 
Boyds! 3010 

Johnson Ce~ral. .... 2 2 4 0 0 1 0 • 9 7 9 
Betsylayne ............ 4 00 03 5x · 12 13 9 
KeslnerandCamelt Keathley and Hamilton 2B·Osbome, 
Tackett, Jotvlson (2), Ousley 3B ·Ousley 

Kentucky Rifles break gender 

barrier; sign up first woman 

by Ed Taylor 
Sports Editor 

The Kentucky Rifles just had to be 
the first in our area to do it It was 
bound to happen and now it bas. · 

The Rifles announced that they 
have signed Kendra Hanes to a pro­
fessional baseball contract and she 
-that's right, she- will be on the 
Rifles' roster this summer. 

Hanes, 23, comes to the Rifles. 
from Union City, California and will 
become the only woman_playin_$ on a. 
men's team in the minor leagues. The 
Rifles are a member of the Frontier 
League, a Class NSbort Season in­
dependent minor league. 

Hanes drew the attention of the 
Pikeville based Rifles when she was 
cut from the now famous Colorado 
Silver Bullets, an all-female baseball 
team. 

The Bullets brought Hanes to 
spring training and cut her as one of 
the last six women dropped from the 
24-person squad. As a speedy out­
fielder with good defensive skills, 
she drew notice from the Rifles front 
office. 

Rifles' General Manager 
Whitebeard thinks the ftrst female 
player will be an immediate con­
tributor. 

"We feel that with her speed and 
fielding ability," he said, "Hanes can 
contribute right away. Although her 
hitting needs some work, we are con­
fident that a season of competition 
and workouts will bring all her abili­
ties up to this level." 

Wbitebeard said that his organi­
zation purposely went looking for a 
woman baseball player and his rea­
sons were fourfold. 

''First, we wanted to give a woman 
a shot to play at this level," he said, 
"and perhaps move on to an affiliated 
team, or a higher level of indepen­
dent baseball. No woman will make 
it to the majors until some are given 
the opportunity in the minors. 

"Second, we wanted to promote 
the idea of women in baseball. The 
Silver Bullets have already made a 
big impact in this area. I was at a 
game the Silver Bullets played sev­
eral weeks ago, and I was amazed at 
the number of girls and young women 
that both came to the game and stood 
in line to meet the ballplayers. 

"Thatkindofinterest at the ground 
level is necessary if women are going 

to play in the majors. 
"Third, we want to counter the 

attitude that women don't belong in 
baseball. It is one thing to suggest 
that women don't have the athletic 
ability to play baseball- I disagree 
with that statement, but I understand 
it. Others, however, think that women 
of any ability don't belong on the 
field, front offices or in the media 
covering baseball. These attitudes 
need to be erased, and we believe that 
signing a woman, and giving her this 
chance will help to eradicate some of 
those ancient ideas. 

"Fourth, we're doing it for the 
publicity. I .lmow it sounds strange 
for a team to admit that, but we'd be 
lying if we said it didn't matter to us. 
It does. We are an independent team 
in an independent league in perhaps 
the smallest market in professional 
baseball. We want crowds and spon­
sorships and merchandise sales as 
much as anyone else, and this will 
help a lot of people bear about us -
people who ordinarily would not So 
the publicity is certainly a factor." 

Wbitebeard said that Hanes had 
the potential to advance and that was 
important 

Prestonsburg A's 
open season on 
successful note 

The Prestonsburg A's struck for 
11 runs in the thirdinningandcoasted 
to a 15-2 win over the Prestonsburg 
Giants. 

The two teams hooked up in a 
pitchers battle through the flrst two 
innings until the A's scored big in the 
third. 

Joey Willis led the A's with four 
bits. Robbie Holbrook and Phillip 
Elliot had three hits for the A's. 

Ray Bays drove in both of the 
Giants runs in the bottom of the third 
inning to make it a 11-2 game. 

George Hall was the winning 
pitcher while Jason Carroll suffered 
the setback for the Giants. 

YOU AND YOUR CHILDREN 

HAVE A RIGHT TO BE SAFE. 

Call someone who can help. 
886-6025 (Royd County) 

1-8()()..649-6805 (Outside Royd Co.) 

• 

• 



• 

• 

• 

• 

• 
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McKinney-
<continued from B 1) 

Magoffin County didn't get on the 
scoreboard until Lheftfth inning when 
it scored twice to make it a 9-2 game. 
A walk to Janice Bailey and Niki 
Gibson's one out single set up Nikki 
Reed's two-run base hit. 

Allen Central got those three back 
in its half of the sixth to take a 12-2 
lead. Stumbo and Melissa Mullins 
had consecutive singles and both 
scored on an error at third base off the 
bat of Jennifer Mullins. Mullins 
scored on an error at short. 

Magoffin County mounted a mild 
comeback in the bottom of the sixth 
by pushing home three runs for a 12-
5 score. The big blow was Teresa 
Trusty's three-run triple. Beth Holi­
day led off the inning with a double. 
Allen Central had two errors in the 
inning . 

Wallen lined a single to start the 
Lady Rebels seventh and scored on 
an error at shortstop for a 13-5 game. 
Scott retired the side in the bottom of 
the sevenlh inning after giving up a 
one out double to Stephanie Elses. 

Conn finished with four runs bat­
ted in and McKinney had four RBis. 
Jennifer Mullins collected two hits 
and three runs batted in. 

Allen central Magolfln County 
players ab r h rbl players ab r h rbl 
M. Mullnsss 5 3 1 o Reed2b 2 o 2 2 
Scolt p 5 0 1 o Elsea • 4 0 1 0 
J. Mullins 3b 5 3 2 3 Caba r 4 0 1 0 
CoMe 5 2 2 4 Hollclay3b 3 1 1 o 
McKhley2b 4 1 1 4 Patrickc 3 1 0 0 
Queen n " 0 1 1 Shepherdp 3 0 1 0 
Cooley cl 4 0 0 0 Bailey cl 1 2 0 0 
Hobrook1b 4 0 1 0 Helonep 1 0 0 0 
Tl1!191 sf 3 1 0 0 Trusty ph 2 0 1 3 
Walen ph 1 1 1 0 Gilson rf 2 1 1 0 
stllllbo If 4 2 3 1 Howard If 2 o 1 o 

Pe!11i111b 2 0 0 0 

Alan Central. ...... 45 0 0 0 31 ·13 13 2 
MagolliiCo ......... o o o o 23 o • s 9 9 
28 • Elsea, Holiday, Shepherd, J. Muh, Stllllbo 38 • 
Truaty HR • McKlnney, CoM WP • Scd1 LP • Shepherd 

South Floyd-
<continued from B 1) 

ror to start the third and scored on 
KathyStumbo'sbasehitln the fourth, 
Shannon led off with a single and 
scored the tying run when Crystal 
Tackett grounded out 

South Aoyd reclaimed the lead 
for good with a run in the fourth that 
made it a 6-5 game. Beth Kesmer 
scored an unearned run on two errors. 

The Lady Raiders got single runs 
in the sixth and seventh innings. 
Rachel Howell singled to start the 
sixth, but was thrown out at second 
trying to stretch it to a double. Christy 
Tackett singled and scored on 
Shannon'sseconddoubleofthegame. 

In the seventh, Jessica Frazier 
scored when Stephens' fly ball to 
center field was dropped. Frazier had 
reached on an error. 

Johnson Central scored three times 
in the sixth with Hayden doubling 
home two runs. 

Keswer was the winning pitcher 
while Crystal Tackett suffered the 
loss. 

Sou1h Floyd Johnson Central 
play81S ab r h rbl players ab r h rbl 
C. Taokett2b 4 0 1 0 McKenzie 3b 3 2 1 0 
Frazier cf 4 1 o o Canlrel c 3 2 2 5 
Stephens ss 4 1 0 0 Collns ph 1 0 0 0 
c. Newsome r 4 1 2 o McKenzie ss 3 o 1 o 
Stllnbo eh 3 1 1 1 Brown cf 4 2 0 0 
Howel1b 3 0 1 0 Ousley If 4 1 1 0 
Tacklllt3b 2 1 1 0 Borders 1b 3 2 1 0 
Hamllon If 2 1 0 0 Estep ph 1 0 0 0 
Shannon c 3 1 3 4 Haydelll 4 1 2 3 
Reynolds af 1 0 0 o Kestner p 4 2 o 0 
Slonsph 1 0 o o Roblnsoneh 1 1 0 0 
Tackllltp 2 0 0 0 Ga1llul 3 1 2 3 

Stapleton 2b 1 2 1 1 

Sou1h Flo'fd ........... o 3 11 o 11 • 1 9 6 
JCHS ..................... O 50 1 7 3 X ·16 11 5 
28 ·Hayden (2), Shannon (2), Canlrel 38 ·Cantrell WP 
• Klllner LP·C. Tackett 

South Floyd hurler! 
Crystal Tackett was on the mound for the South Floyd Lady Raiders as 
her team faced Johnson Central in women's softball tournament action 
Tuesday night. The Lady Eagles won over the Lady Raiders 16-7. (photo 
by Ed Taylor) 

Lady Rebels---- (Continued from B 1) 

runs in the sixth. Prestonsburg pushed 
home a run in the bottom of the six to 
lead by one, 18-17. 

Natalie Cooley struck out to start 
the seventh as Allen Central came to 
bat for its final time. Amanda 
Holbrook kept the Lady Rebs hopes 
alive when she singled. But Yates 
fanned for the second out, bringing 
up Lisa Stumbo. 

Stumbo lofted a fly ball toward 
the outfield that bit off the outfielder's 

glove and rolled for a triple, scoring 
Holbrook with the tying run. Melissa 
Mullins then lined a base hit to left, 
scoring Stumbo with the winning run. 

Prestonsburg had the heart of their 
lineup coming to bat in the bottom of 
the seventh, but the Lady Blackcats 
went out in order giving the Lady 
Rebels the victory. 

"You have to give Allen Central 
credit." said Coach Clay, "They never 
quit. They played with a lot of heart. 
In the fourth and fifth inning, they 
really started hitting the ball." 

Allen Central, who trailed 16-2 
after four innings, scorched the ball 
in the f1fth. It sent 16 batters to the 
plate in the inning and scored 11 
times to make it a 16-13 game. 

The Lady Rebels collected 10 hits 
in the frame. Melissa Mullins bad a 
two-run triple in the inning. Kathy 
Conn, who had four hits in the game 
and four RBis, doubled home two 
runs. 

McKinney batted twice in the in­
ning and both times was intentionally 
passed. There were seven walks in 
the inning for Allen Central to go 
wilh the 10 hits. Prestonsburg only 
committed one error in the f1fth in­
ning. 

In Allen Central's four-run sixth, 
Conn doubled home two more runs 
and Holbrook had a double. 

Jamie Clay started the game for 
the Lady Blackcats with an opposite­
field double. She scored on Jamie 

Ratcliffs RBI single. With one out, 
Jennifer Miller singled home Ratcliff, 
but the run scored when two errors 
were made. 

After that it was four consecutive 
errors for the Lady Rebels as 
Prestonsburg led 10-0 after one. 

The Lady Blackcats added three 
in the second and Jenna Fannin hit a 
two-run homerun in the third to make 
it a 16-0 game. 

Allen Central scored two in the 
top of the fourth on a walk and 
Cooley's triple. Cooley scored on a 
ground out. 

"Idon'twantto take anything away 
from my kids," said Coach Clay. 
"They played well and played hard. 
But they just didn't hold on. 

"It has been a good season for us 
(14-8). Mter losing so many players 
fromlastyear,theselddshaveworked 
hard all year," she said. 

Misty Scott fmished with three 
hits in the game and was the winning 
pitcher. Holbrook also collected three 
hits. 

Donna Hall, Jennifer Greathouse 
and Miller each had two hits in the 
game for Prestonsburg. Misty Plice, 

along with Fannin, had two RBis. 
Allen Central will be one of the 

eight teams that will play in next 
week's regional tournament at 
Russell. 

Allen Cenlral Prestonsburg 
players ab r h lbl players ab r h lbl 
M. Mullins ss 6 3 2 2 Clay ss 5 2 2 1 
Scott p 6 3 3 2 Ratclln n 5 I 1 1 
J. Mullins 3b 2 1 0 0 Laferty sf 5 1 1 0 
Conn c 5 1 4 4 Miller 1 b 5 1 2 1 
McKinney 2b 0 2 0 1 Robinson 2b 4 2 0 0 
Queen~ 5 1 0 0 Fannin 3b 3 3 I 2 
Cooley cf 4 2 1 2 HaU cf 4 3 2 1 
Holbrook 1 b 4 3 3 2 Greathouse rf4 2 2 1 
Turner sf 2 1 0 1 Price c 3 1 1 2 
Yates 1 1 0 0 Jonesp 3 1 0 0 
Stumbo rf 3 1 1 1 Clal1< 1 o 0 0 

Allen CentraL... ..... o 00 2114 2 ·19 14 12 
Prestonsburg ...... 10330 11 o .. 1a 9 3 
Scotland Conn; Jones and Price HR • Famln 38· Laferty, 
M. Mullins, Cooley, Stumbo 28 ·Clay (2j, Scott, Conn (2) 

Fields grounders at short! . 
Prestonsburg shortstop Jamie Clay made a good pick up and fired the ball to first baseman Jennifer Miller 
as the Lady Blackcats faced Allen Central Wednesday night in the women's district tournament at the Allen 
Park. Allen Central, who trailed 16-0, rallied for a 19-18 win over Prestonsburg. (photo by Ed Taylor) 

' . 

A Look At Sports 
--- (Continued from B 1) 
for their effort in sponsoring the 
Kids' Day in the Park. It was 
tremendous. 

I enjoyed being there and 
watching some of the games. All 
of them seem to be having the best 
time. 

Good luck to our good buddy 
Tee Watkins as be takes off to 
Oklahoma later this month for the 
RedManTtailflshingtournament. 
I received an invitation to make 
the trip for coverage of the tourna­
ment But. a prior commitment 
keeps me from going. I would 
love to go. 

Alan Edwards will never play 
basketball for UK because be will 
never pass the required test. 

Also,markoffAntoineWalker. 
He has yet to pass it Where does 
thatleave UK in recruiting. Out in 
the cold! Should have taken the 
Lakers job Rick! 

Good luck Allen Central, Betsy 
Layne, Prestonsburg and South 
Aoyd as they lake part in this 
weekend' sregional track and field 
meet. 

Each coach is asked to send 
me, no later than Friday, three 
names (boys and girls) for male 
and female track and field per­
formers. Nominations should be 
sent to me no later than Friday, 
May27. 

UntilVVednesday,goodsports 
everyone and be good sports. Take 
those kids to church Sunday. 
You'll be glad you did. 

Jerry's Husky 
Two large buttermilk pancakes served 
with maple syrup, two eggs and choice 
of bacon or seasoned sausage patties. 

7 Days a Week-6 a.m.-11 a.m. 

No one brings more to the table!T'M 

Available at participating 
Jerry's Restaurants. 

Not valid with any other 
coupon or discount. FAMILY REST AU RANT 

THE PIARIST SCHOOL 
. •.•.·.·.··.···. 

s~~11:~~i;ate, college-preparatory high 
school in Floyd County. 

• Tuition free 
• Transportation available 
• Solid academic program taught within a 

Christian atmosphere 

Pietas et Litterae 
in Montibus For more information, please contact: 

• 5W30 
•10W30 
•10W40 
• 20W50 
• SAE 30 
:SAE 40 

4-Cyl. 
Domestic 

NAPA 
TRAILER LIGHT KIT 
Provides all legal lamps 
and reflectors for trailers 
under 80' wide. 
#5330K 

$2499 

Rev. Thomas Carroll, Sch. P. 
The Piarist School 

Hwy. 80, Box 870, Martin, Ky. 41649 
(606) 285-3950 

, ,, 
t 

~ AUTOLITE OR CHAMPION SPARK PLUGS 
ltl!frl;1 j i ~ il jl ~ :J;t i 41 
AUTO LITE 
SPARK PLUGS 

CHAMPION 
SPARK PLUGS 

SAlE PRICE ......... $ . 94 EACH SAlE PRICE ..... . .. $ .99 EACH 
LESSMAIL· INREBATE .. - .25 LESSMAIL·INREBATL- .30 
FINAL COST AFTER REBA FINAL COST AFTER REBATE 

Prices good through May 31, 1994, or wllile supplies last. at participating NAPA Auto Parts stores. Rebate and speclal offer details available In stores 

ALLEN 
NAPA Auto Parts 

Highway SO 
874-2229 

PRESTONSBURG 
NAPA Auto Parts 

41 0 North Lake Drive 
886-6666 

1' 

4NAPA~ 
® 

WE IEEP AMEIICl RUIIIIC. 



B4 }'riday, May 20, 1994 

MOBILE OF_FICE 
UNITS 

Low cost offiCe units from 560 sq. It 
upto1800sq. lt. leaseorsale. I 
medtate delivery anywhere at unbe­

lieveable prices. 

Showplace Homes 
1-64, Exit 172 
Grayson, KY 

1-800-455-5504 

AMAZING NEW 
DOUBLEWIDES 

SAVE $5,000 
Residential • Shingle Roof 

3 Bedrooms • 2 Baths 

NEW 1994 
SHOW WINNERS 

(1.-. enty floor P!ans to Choose rrom. Vmyl 
Lap Sod ong Sonhcrn Bu il l Vauhc d CcilUlp 
All Apphancca Dehue Gudcn Bath. Utilol 
Room. Walk·&n Oosc:u . Carpel Tlvu-Out. 
Upgndc lnsullloon Shu1gled llay Window 
a.nd \iuc.b More You ch001t c:oi<mJ &. decar 
Free Dclavcry &. Setup on yow lot 

28 WIDE FLOOR PLANS 

ONLY $23.995 
Less than $218/Month 

32 WIDE FLOOR PLANS 

ONLY $26,995 
Less than $245/Month 

NEW 16 X 80 
SINGLEWIDES 
SAVE $4,000 

The Reg10ns 8 ggell Dosplay 

L1nhcllcvahle Savmgs 

Free D<l.•ery &: Set Up 

S mg1ewides from 14KS2 1o 16x80 

• Do~ablcw1des from 24Jt44 to 28Jt80 

Used llomcs J=rorn S2,Cl00 

IF WE DON'T HAVE IT 
NOBODY DOES 

SHOWPLACE 
HOMES 

1979 GLASSMASTER 
BOAT. 17' open hull. Four 
cylinder inboard/outboard, 
12 OMC. Must see! $3,200 
o.b.o. Call377-2185or377· 
2473. 

21 FT. FIBERGLASS 
CHECKMATE SPEED 
BOAT. Red with gray inte­
rior. Chevy 350 engine, 280 
HP, inboard/outboard, 
through transom exhaust, 2 
covers, many extras. Can 
be seen at Jenny Wiley Boat 
Dock. $9,995. Call 432-
2584. 

ELEVEN YEAR OLD 
ROCKY MOUNTAIN MARE 
for sale: Two saddles ·and 
other supplies. Call 886-
0058 or 886-6185. 

FOR SALE: 
Dry kiln lumber. 

4,000 ft., 
all hard wood. 
Different kinds. 

Foley Lumber Co 
606-886-1823. 

FOR SALE: M-14. Brand 
new, still in box. Three 
magazines, $485. Also, 300 
Weatherby Magnum VGX. 
$495. Call 874-2332. 

The Floyd County Times 

886-8506 • 

FOR SALE: Two Lennox 
five ton heat pumps. Gas 
and electric. Commercial 
used units. $600 for both. 
Call 874-9006 after 6. 

FOR SALE· Oak dish cabi­
net; old oak piano; living 
room suit. Call886-1473. 

FOR SALE: 1983 Pontoon 
boat. 24 ft. 1984 Johnson 
50 HP. Call 631-1475 or 
886-9227. 

FOR SALE: 1992 30' Party 
Hut Pontoon boat. 115 HP 
Evinrude, depth finder. full 
cover, anchor, radio and 
tape player, kitchen and 
bathroom facilities. Only 
moderate use by owner. 
Excellent condition. If inter­
ested call 606-886-9640 
after 8 p.m. 

FOR SALE: Stapleton pool 
table. Three piece slate top, 
fancy woodwork and trim. 
Call 886-0800. 

FOR SALE: 15x30 above 
ground swimming pool. New 
liner and solar blanket. For 
more information call 478-
3411 . 

FOR SALE: 14' Lowe's 
aluminum. 6 HP Johnson or 
18 HP Evinrude, trolling 
motor, trailer. $1,185. Call 
886-6358. 

PACKARD BELL 486. 20 
Megahertz, Super VGA 
monitor, 3 1/2 and 5 1/4 disk 
drives, 130 meg hard drive, 
2 meg RAM, CD ROM, 
modem, microphone, 
speakers, mouse, printer 
and $800 worth of software 
included. $1,895. Call874-
9781. 

PLASTIC TANK: 285 gal­
lon. 2" valve, 7" poly lid. 
Super portable and durable. 
Great for water or any liq­
uids. $85. 513-899-4955. 

PROMGOWNSFORSALE: 
Red and silver beaded, size 
small; teal and silver, size 8. 
Call 886-6026. 

SLOW DRAINS? DRAIN 
CARE® ends slow drains. 
Removes years of buildup 
in ~ipes, and it's safe to use. 
Money back GUARAN­
TEED! Available at: SANDY 
VALLEY HARDWARE, 
Hylton Complex, U.S. 23, 
lvel. 

SUNQUEST WOLFF 
TANNING BEDS 
New Commercial­

Home Un~s 
From $199. 

Lamps-Lotions­
Accessories. 

Monthly payments 
as low as $18. 

Call today FREE NEW 
color catalog. 

1-800-462-9197. 

BYOWNER: Newlogcabin 
w/146 acres on Clark/Estill 
county line. Fifty minutes to 
Lexington. $135,000. Call 
606-271-3641, leave mes­
sage. 

DEER HUNTER'S PARA­
DISE: Two ponds, two 
barns, 90+ tillable acres, rest 
woodland. Located near 
Cave Run Lake. An invest­
ment opportunity for devel­
opment or farming. Nego­
tiable. Call 606-743-7612, 
nights. 

FOR SALE: Threebedroom 
house in the Martin area. 
For more information call 
285-0352 after 4 p .m. 

FOR SALE. Three bedroom, 
two bath ranch style house. 
Spacious living room. Large 
lot. Beautiful location. 
Mountain Parkway, five min­
utes from Prestonsburg. Call 
886-8167 for appointment. 

FOR SALE: Two story 
home. Four bedrooms, two 
baths, large living and fam­
ily rooms. All carpeted. 
Large deck, natural gas, 
drilled well, water softener. 
Approximately 68 acres 
located on Skull Road at 
·weeksbury. Caii285-0213 
or 285-3216 for appoint· 
ment. 

1·64, Exit 172 
Grayson, KY 

1-800-455·5504 

FOR SALE: Three pinball 
andtwovideomachines. All FOR SALE: Weedeater, 
for $600. Call 789-39o4. lawn mower and tiller. Call 

886-3976 after 5 p.m. 

TWO HORSES FOR SALE: 
Saddle horses. Very gentle. 
Also have two horse trailers 
for sale. Call 886-3313. 

FOR SALE: Ten acres. · 
House. Central heat/air, 
barn, outbuilding. Caney 
Fork, Middle Creek. Call 
886-6900 or 886-1473. 

14 DAY TRAINING 
Transport Training Group can train you to 
DRIVE TRACTOR TRAILERS 

in less time and save you money! 
Call for appointment • 14 day training 

• Train in East Tennessee 
• Train on days off 
• C.D.L. training and testing 

1-800-868-5800 

,\~lll 
li~Mfll 

CONSOLIDATED 
HEALTH • SYSTEMS 
Medical Assistant, Administrative 

Medical Assistant, Clinical 
(Includes, RN, LPN, Cert. Med. Assistant) 

Hiring office staff for new physician practice 
opening in Prestonsburg, July, 1994. Previous 
experience preferred_ Great opportunity for 
qualified staff. 

To apply, call or visit: 

Highlands Regional 
Medical Center 

Personnel Office, 
Prestonsburg, Ky. 
886-8511, Ext. 530 

An Equal Opportunity Employer 

LAP TOP COMPUTERS for 
sale. Call886-2367. 

LINCOLN SA-200 gasoline 
driven arc welder. Asking 
$2,800. Call 285-0814 after 
5p.m. 

MATT LEWIS 
CORPORATION 
DISCONTINUING 
BUSINESS SALE: 

Mechanic tools; 
construction related 
tools and equipment; 
supplies and parts too 

numerous to hst. 
Sales starts Fnday, 

June 3. Call 886-0058 
or 886-6185 for 

more information. 

3,600 SQ. FT. BRICK 
HOUSE. Off Nicholasville 
Road, five miles from Lex­
ington. Five acres. Five 
bedrooms, three baths, two 
garages, one carport. 
$180,000. Call 606-885-
~627. 

BRICK HOUSE FOR SALE: 
1 ,980 sq. ft. with full finished 
basement, threecargarage, 
three acre lot. Located five 
miles north of West Liberty 
on Hwy. 519 (five miles from 
Cave Run Lake). Call606-
743-3394 after 6 p.m. 

GOVERNMENT HOMES 
from $1. (U repair). Delin­
quent tax property. Repos­
sessions. Your area 1-805-
962-8000, ext. GH-4680 for 
current repo list. 

HOUSE FOR SALE: Little 
Paint Creek. Three bed­
room, 2 1/2 bath. Brick. 
2,300 sq. ft. 4 1/2 acres 
land. Ten minutes from 
Paintsville, five minutes from 
Prestonsburg . Call 886-
8883 for an appointment. 

HOUSE FOR SALE: Three 
bedrooms, living and dining 
roo'm, kitchen , bath. 14x26 
block building. One acre +I 
-. Also, building lot. Call 
874-2556. 

Memorial Day weekend, Bob's Lake will be stocking 
2,000 lbs. of Georgetown farm raised catfish! 

500 lbs. Fd. & Sun., May 27 & 29 at 8 a.m. 
Stocking twice Sat. May 28, 500 lbs. 8 a.m. & 6 p.m. 

Win $50 for Big Fish Daily Jackpots 
Friday and on Saturday 

from 6 a.m. to 6 a.m. on Sunday 
Phone 606-297-3656 

Bob's Lake 
9 miles north ofPalntsvi11e on Rt. 581 
Open 24 hours a day • 7 days a week 

FOR SALE: Mini farm. 13 
acres located 3 1/2 miles 
east of Mt. Sterling, KY (1/ 
16 mile off At. 460). Four 
bedroom brick house with 
two car attached garage, 
medium size pond, 2068 
pound tobacco base and 
50x60 barn. Call 606-498-
4659. 

HOUSE FOR SALE: Three 
bedroom, 2 1 /2 bath. Way­
land Bottom. Full basement, 
deck, cha1n link fence. Call 
358-4152. 

LAND FOR SALE: Located 
at Wayland. $15,000. 
Contact Aileen or Ennis 
Cordial at Steels Creek, 
Wayland, KY. No phone 
number available. 

LOT FOR SALE: Located at 
Auxier. Call 886-14 73. 

LOTS FOR SALE: Cave 
Run Lake, near Longbow 
Boat Dock, At. 1693. City 
water. Phone 768-3204. 

NEAR CAVE 
RUN LAKE 

Vacation cabins and 
mobile homes to rent 
weekly or weekends. 

Lots and cabins for sale. 
Call and make 

an appointment. 
Jim Whitt. 606-768-3061. 

1988 TOYOTA CELICA 
GTS. Black. All options. 
Leather, alloy wheels, all 
power, rebuilt engine, auto­
matic, sunroof. 117,000 
miles. Book value, $7,500; 
asking $4,500 o.b.o. Call 
886-8102. 

1989 MAZDA PICKUP. 
Lowered, aluminum wheels, 
in-dash Pioneer CD player, 
sub-speakers and amps, 
bed cover. Call377-6209. 

FOR SALE: 1986 Buick 
Grand National. V-6 turbo, 
56,000 miles. Like new 
condition. One of a kind 
collectible. $1 0,000 firm. 
John Alan Wright, 285-9912 
or 874-0159. 

FOR SALE: 1980 Olds 
Tornado, $500; 979 Ford F-
150, $500. Both run good. 
Call886-7044. 

FOR SALE: 1982 Ford F· 
350 with utility bed. Needs 
new engine. $2,500. Call 
452-2475. 

FOR SALE: 1982 Ford 
Futura. 64,000 miles. P.S., 
P.B. Good condition. $600. 
1982 Ford pickup. 3.8 L1ter. 
$1,100. Call 886-1876. 

~ 
MasterCard 

'\......)(.._/ 

GARRETT 
AUTO SALES 
GARRETT, KY 

358-4288 
1987 FORD CROWN 
VICTORIA LX. V-8, 
automatic, air, lilt, 

stereo, cruise, telephone. 

LOCAL AUTO DEALER 
GUARANTEES AUTO FI­
NANCING. If you work- • 
you drivel! No co-signers 
necessary. l <" 'I down pay­
ment reqUirr .. Call Mr. 
Green at 606-437-6282 for 
more information. 

Loaded. Looks and 
runs new. $3,500. 

1988 OLDS CUTLASS 
IERA INTERNATIONAL 
V-6, automatic in floor, 
air, stereo. Loaded. 

SHEPHERD'S 
AUTO SALES 

RT.1888 
SALYERSVILLE 

606-349-5058 
1991 CHEVY CORSICA. 

Runs excellent. $3,700. 
1987 PONTIAC GRAND 
AM LE. Four cylinder. 
automatic, air, stereo, 

lilt, power windows 
and locks. Runs 

excellent. $3,200. 
1987 PONTIAC GRAND 

AM. Four cylinder, 
five speed, stereo, cloth 

interior. Runs great. 
$2,500. 

Uke new. $5,995. ~ 
1991 GMC SONOMA 

1983 UNCOLN 
CONTINENTAL V-8, 

302 automatic, air. 
Loaded. One owner. 
New tires, brakes and 
exhaust. Runs new. 

$2,000. 

SLX. V-6, air. $6,200. 
1988 CHEVY 5·10. 

43,000 miles. $3,800. 
1987 CHEVY S-10. 

42,000 miles. $3,600. 

1986 VOL.KSWAGON 
GTI. Four cylinder, four 
speed, stereo, sunroof. 

Runs great. $1,800. 
1984 OLDS CUTLASS 
CIERA BROUGHAM. 
V-6, automatic in floor. 

HOUSE FOR RENT OR f 
SALE: Four bedroom. 
Located at Price. Call 285-
9646 or 1-353-9761. 

air, stereo. Loaded. 
Runs good. $1,500 

1987 FORD RANGER 
XL. 2.9, V-6. five speed. 
air, cloth interior, custom 
aint, tires, wheels, stereo. 

87,000 original miles 
Runs new. $3,800. 
1983 FORD F-150. 

V-8, three speed, short 
wheel base New tires. 

Runs great $1,600 
1982 CHEVY 

SILVERADO PICKUP. 
V-8 , automatic, air. lilt. 

stereo, cruise, dual tanks. 
Black with red interior. 

Clean. $3,200. 
1983 CHEVY 

CONVERSION VAN. 
V-8, automatic, air, stereo, 

cruise. Loaded. Runs 
excellent. $1,900. 

1974 CHEVY PICKUP. 
V-8, automatic, stereo, 

toolbox. Runs 
great. $850. 

APARTMENT FOR RENT: 
Furnished. In Prestonsburg. 
Rent by week or month. 
Utilities paid. Call886-6900. 

FOR RENT OR LEASE: 12 
South Front Street. Ground 
floor. 3,500 sq. ft. for office 
or commercial business. 
ODD Fellows Building. Call 
Bill Howard at 886-6871. 
Available June 1, 1994. 

GET YOUR DRIVER'S LI­
CENSE IN TWO WEEKS! PCC 
D~REDUCATIONT~­
ING-Days, Evenings, Week­
ends-Female and Male Instruc­
tors. Fee: $190. Ca11886-3863 and 
ask for CFJCS to register. 

JOB OPPORTUNITY 
The City of Prestonsburg has a job opening for 
the position of Main Street Manager. The suc­
cessful applicant will direct the City's Main 
Street Program, prepare and administer its an­
nual budget, financial reports and plan of ac­
tion; oversee revolving loan fund; work with 
banks, merchants, and businesses in organiza­
tion, promotion, design and economic develop­
ment of the downtown Main Street district. 
Applicant sould have a degree in advertising, 
journalism, marketing, business, or Associate 
Degree supplimcnted by experience; knowl­
edge of Public relations, marketing, advertis­
ing, historic preservation, administration and 
finance are desirable. Applications may be made 
at the City Clerk's office, Municipal Building, 
90 North Lake Drive, Prestonsburg, Ky. 

Tile C1ty of Prestonsburg is an Equal Opportunity Employer. 

• 



NO DOWN 
PAYMENT 

If you have land (paid for or not) 01 

any kind of trade-In (boat, car, mobile 
home, etc.) (paid lor or not), you can· 
buy a new mobile home with no 
<Xlwn payment. 

Showplace Homes 
l-64, Exit 172 
Grayson, KY 

.. 1-800-455-5504 

Large Driveaway 
Company seeking 

COL drivers 
to deliver new and 
used trucks to all 
points in the U.S. 
Drivers will be inde­
pendent contractors. 
We offer steady year 
'round work, good 

• pay. No health insur­
ance is available at 
this time. 
Please call Bennett 
Motor Express, 502-
222-7525, 8:30-4:00 
M-F. 

1,000 SQ. FT. RETAIL OR 
OFFICE SPACE for rent. 
Call Jim at 886-4001 for 
more information. 

FOR RENT OR LEASE: 
20x16 building on new Hwy. 
80. Suitable for video store 
or like business. $175 
month. Must complete. Call 
874-2332. 

FOR RENT: One bedroom 
apartment. Three miles west 
on Mountain Parkway. Call 
886-6568 or 886-1368 after 
5. 

FOR RENT: Two bedroom 
trailer at Emma. $275/ 
month, $150 deposit plus 
utilities. References re­
quired. Call 874-9983. 

FOR RENT: New Allen. First 
floor two bedroom duplex. 
Completely furnished. 
Washer, dryer, dishwasher. 
Central heat\air. Fireplace. 
No pets. M. Hammond, 874-
9052. 

U.S. DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 
BUREAU OF THE CENSUS 
NEEDS A FIELD INTERVIEWER 

Pay: $7.21/hr. to $8.10/hr 
$.25 per mile car allowance 

Work part time each month conducting personal and 
telephone interviews throughout Floyd County. The wori< will 
require you to be available days, evenings, weekends and up 
to 8 hours per day during the interview period. Paid training. 

To qualify you must: Be a U.S. citizen. Live in above listed 
county. Be 18 years old (or 16 years of age and be a high 

~ school graduate, or have equivalent education and wori< 
experience.) Have a valid drive~s license and automobile to 
use for wori<. Have a private home telephone. Be available to 
attend a five-day training session. 

This position is temporary with the potential to become 
permanent. 

Qualified applicants will be tested and interviewed by a 
Census representative. Interested applicants should call (col· 
lect) weekdays, between 7:30 a.m. and 5:00 p.m. at (704) 
344-6702, for testing and interviewing information. 

The Bureau of the Census is an Equal Opportunity Employer. 
All selections are based solely on meri~ fitness, and 

qualifications, and do not involve discrimination based on 
race, religion, national origin, marital status, sex, age, or 
physical handicap. 

~~--------------------~----~ 

FIRESTONE 
SEIBERLING II 
All-Season Steel Belted 

Radials 
13 ln. tires starting at $35.60 
141n. tires starting at $41.05 

• 15 ln. tires starting at $45.75 
at 

Allen Tire & Muffler 
We also offer 

• Complete exhaust repair with 1 3 years 
combined experience, and reasonable rates. 

• Brake repair 

• Complete Wheel Alignment and Wheel 
Balancing 

• Custom Wheels by Special Order 

Allen Tire & Muffler 
Allen, Ky. 874-8116 

--------------------------------·' - ----· ·---------------------·------
The Floyd County Times 

FOR RENT: Furnished 
mobile home. 14x65, one 
bedroom'. Central heat/air. 
$450/month, all utilities in­
cluded. No pets. Refer· 
ences and deposit required. 
Middle Creek. Call Mui-T­
Storage, 886-1896. 

FOR RENT: One bedroom 
apartment. Suitable for 
couple or one person. Call 
886-2504. 

FOR RENT: Two bedroom 
house located at Wayland. 
$200/month plus deposit. 
Call 358-9653. 

FOR RENT: New Allen. 1 1/ 
2 bedroom mobile unit. 
Suitable for one or two 
people. Completely fur­
nished. Private deck. Cen­
tral air. No pets. M. Ham­
mond, 874-9052. 

FOR RENT: Sleeping rooms 
at Blue Sky Motel. 
$75\week. Call886-0513 or 
886-2797. 

FOR RENT: Two bedroom 
apartment. Junction of Rt. 3 
and U.S. 23 at Auxier 
Heights. Call 886-3552 af­
ter 5 p.m. 

FOR RENT: In 
Prestonsburg. Three bed· 
room apartment. Washer/ 
Dryer. $275/month plus 
utilities. Call377-6970. 

FOR RENT: 
Furnished efficiency 

apartment at Blue Sky 
Motel. $325/month 
includes all utilities, 

phone and cable. Also, 
sleeping rooms for 

$275/month. 
Call 886-2797 
or 886-0513. 

HOUSE FOR RENT: South 
Lake Drive. Five rooms, one 
bath. Security deposit re­
quired. No HUD. Personal 
referencesamust. Call886-
6521 after 6 p.m. 

TRAILER LOT FOR RENT: 
Located two miles up Cow 
Creek. City water with all 
other hookups available. 
$70/month. Out of flood 
plain. Call 87 4·2802, J. 
Davis. 

AVON. BUYORSELL. Call 
Janey at 886-2082. 

COLLEGE & HIGH 
SCHOOL GRADS 

Are you tired of low-paying 
summer jobs? Do you need 
marketing or public relations 
experience? We have open­
ings for hard-working, 
friendly individuals for the 
Floyd and Pike county area. 
Starting at $1 ,200/month. 
Ambitious only need apply. 
No experience necessary. 
Company training provided. 
Must have own transporta· 
tion, be neat in appearance, 
andreadytowork. Calltoday 
only, 478-9701. 

EARN UP TO $1,000 
WEEKLY stuffing envelopes 
at home. Be your own boss I 
Start now. No experience. 
Free supplies, free informa­
tion. No obligation. Send 
self-addressed stamped en­
velope to: Cascade Dept. 
78, P.O. Box 5421, San 
Angelo, TX 76902. 

DENTAL ASSISTANT. 
Pediatric dental office seeks 
bright, cheerful, intelligent 
person to fill the position of 
Dental Assistant. Experi­
ence required. Please send 
resume and hourly pay re­
quirements to: Dental As­
sistant, P.O. Box 1078, 
Pikeville, Ky 41501. 

HELP WANTED: A.S.E. 
Certified mechanic. Ware­
house positions available. 
Apply in person at Commer­
cial Supply, Betsy Layne. 
Ask for Rick. 

IMMEDIATE 
EMPLOYMENT 

Earn a great living selling a 
fantastic product. Local65· 
year-old company with many 
advantages. We train. 478-
9701. 

LAW 
ENFORCEMENT JOBS 

NO EXPERIENCE 
NECESSARY 

Now hiring. U.S. Customs, 
Officers, Etc .... For informa­
tion call219-794-0010, ext. 
3301, 8 a.m.-9 p.m. 7 days. 

LPN NEEDED for new solo 
family practice in Paintsville. 
3-5 years experience. Send 
complete resume and sal­
ary requirements to: P.O. 
Box 734, Staffordsville, KY 
41256. 

MAJOR TELEPHONE 
COMPANY 

Now hiring. Technicians, 
installers, account service 
representatives, operators. 
No experience necessary. 
For information call 1-219-
736-4715, ext. F-3491, 9 
a.m.-9 p.m., 7 days. 

NOW HIRING demonstra­
tors for Christmas Around 
the World or the new Gifts 
by Lloydsll Also booking 
parties. Call606-432-1279. 

POSTAL JOBS 
Start $11.41/hour. For exam 
and application information 
call 219-769-8301, ext. 
KY556, 8 a.m.-8 p.m., Sun­
day-Friday. 

RECEPTIONIST/MEDICAL 
BILLING CLERK NEEDED 
for new solo family practice 
in Paintsville. 3-5 years 
experience in medical bill­
ing and all aspects. Send 
complete resume and sal· 
ary requirements to: P.O. 
Box 734, Staffordsville, KY 
41256. 

SOCIAL SERVICES 
VOLUNTEERS OF 

AMERICA OF KY, INC. is 
recruiting for the Homeless 
Veterans Reintegration 
Program in Paintsville/ 
Prestonsburg, KY area. This 
program outreaches to 
homeless veterans to up­
grade their job skills and 
place them in the workforce. 

PROGRAM MANAGER. 
Coordinates program and 
assumes case management 
responsibility for 10 veter­
ans. Develops and main­
tains linkages with commu­
nity based services provid­
ers, veterans organizations, 
area employers. BAIBS in 
Human Services or equiva­
lent. Two years experience 
in community networking 
and public relations. Case 
management, supervisory 
experience and driver's li­
cense required. 

Send resume to: 933 
Gross Ave., Louisville, KY 
40217; or complete applica­
tion at 720 Bryan Ave., 
Lexington, KY. Equal Op· 
portunity Employer. 

POSITIONS AVAILABLE: R/S 
Truck Body Company has immediate 
openings for several full and part 
time drivers to deliver trucks cross­
country. Applicants must have a high 
school diploma or G.E.D. equivalent, 
and a CDL. To apply, please contact 
Bonnie Ousley at the Department 
for Employment Services in 
Prestonsburg, 606-886-2396. 

TWO COMMISSION ONLY 
SALES PEOPLE NEEDED 
at lvel, KY. Apply in person 
only at Rainbow Homes. 

WANTED: Dependable, 
clean person to mow grass, 
clean kennels. Six morn­
ings per week. Prefer some­
one living near Auxier. 606-
886-3680. 

WANTED: Person(s) to do 
plumbing and service work. 
Full or part time work avail· 
able. Experience and/or 
knowledge of plumbing is 
required. If interested call 
874-2794. 

WANTED: PharmacyTech· 
nician. Please send resume 
to: P.O. Box 477, Betsy 
Layne, KY 41605. 

WANTED: Working parents 
need responsible adult to 
babysit for children on week­
ends. Call 886·0004. 

FOR SALE: Full stock Ger­
man Shepherd puppies. 
Black and tan. Excellent 
quality. Beautiful. Sixweeks 
old. $100. Call 606-886-
6328. 

FOR SALE: Parrots and 
cockatiels. Call 285-0650. 

FOR SALE: Siberian Husky 
Puppy. AKC registered. 
Red and white with green 
eyes. Four months old. 
$150. Call452-2775. 

TWO TOY POODLE PUP­
PIES for sale. $200 each. 
One boy and one girl. Call 
886-1156. 

BASEMENT SALE: Old 
records, books, electronics; 
little boys' and women's 
clothing (some brand new); 
Khaki's white shirts. Near 
Martin (left off Rt. 80 before 
MCA). May 21 and 28, noon 
to 6 p.m. 

FLEA MARKET AT STAN­
VILLE: Open Thursday, 
Friday, Saturday and Sun­
day. Rain or shine. Also, 
need someone to sell pro­
duce. Call 478-5288. 

SALEIII Appliances (guar­
anteed}; good furniture; 
foam mattress, $15; gliders; 
swings; rockers; cabinets; 
windows; doors; trim; tires 
(1 4" 15"and 16");bunkbeds; 
tillers; lawn mowers; large 4 
ft. fan; play pens; walkers; 
baby beds; strollers; lots 
more. It's here! Daylight 
only. No refunds. 285-3004. 

Y ARDSALE: Saturday, May 
21, from 1 0·2. Turn right at 
Allan post office (house on 
end of street). 

YARD SALE: Friday-Satur­
day, May 20·21. Spurlock, 
just off the Mountain Park· 
way. 

YARD SALE: Clothes; home 
interior; dishes; small appli· 
ances; what nots; blue fox 
fur coat; boy's comforter and 
curtains; lots of odds and 
ends. May 20-21 from 9-4 
behind Bank Josephine 
Branch Bank on North Lake 
Drive in Prestonsburg. 

COAL MINE 
SAFETY CLASS 
Annual retraining, 

surface and 
underground; 
48 hour new 

miner training; 
Mine Foreman 

re-training, 
Call 285-0650. 

CONCRETE! 
CONSTRUCTION: 
Patios, driveways, 

retaining walls, etc.; 
block and brick work; 

new roofing and repairs . 
Call 886-6154. 

A.A. TAYLOR 
PAINTING COMPANY 

and CHIMNEY 
CLEANING SERVICES 

Both services 
available anytime. 

Call 886-8453. 

CONCRETE AND CAR· 
PENTRY WORK: New 
homes and remodeling. Any 
type concrete work: drive­
ways, basements, carports, 
etc. Also block and brick 
work. Build fireplaces. Free 
estimates. References fur­
nished. Call 886-6718. 

DAVIDLESLIESTUDIOOF 
MUSIC is now accepting 
new piano students. For 
more information call 886-
2524. 

DOZER FOR HIRE: Con­
tract or hourly. Call 478-
2717. 

DOZER, LOADER, BACK­
HOE AND DUMP TRUCK 
for hire. Install septic sys­
tems, clear house seats, etc. 
Call447-2440 or 452-4704. 

ECONOMY TREE SERV· 
ICE: Tree cutting, topping, 
removal, dead limbing and 
cabling. Twenty-one years 
experience. Licensed, in­
sured and bonded. Bill 
Rhodes, owner. Dump 
truck, chipper and winch. 
Call 1 -800· 7 42-4188 toll f rea 
for free estimates. (local 
606-353-9276.) 

ELECTRONIC REPAiR 
VCR. TV, Compact 

Disc, Nintendo. 
Delco rad1o. 

Free estimates. 
Low pr•ces. 

Located one mile from 
Highlands Hospital. 

D&J Electronics, 
886-7911. 

FENCES INSTALLEB: 
Chain link and wood fences 
installed. We also do re­
pairs. Free estimates. Call 
886-6752. 

JET AND NORWECO 
HOME TREATMENT 
PLANT SERVICE. Factory 
trained. Statecertified. Call 
432-6686. 

MAY TREE SERVICE: 
Cutting, topping, hillside 
clearing, remove dead limbs. 
Insured. Free estimates. 
Thirty-one years experience. 
Phone 1·606-353-7834; or 
toll free 1·800-484-871 0, ext. 
7834. 

NEED A STONE MASON? 
We do anything in stone, 
anything. You may exam­
ine our work and reputation 
at many locations. Call886-
6938. 

NEED A RIDE? 
Call Martin City Cab 

Service, Inc. 24 Hour 
Service. Now accepting 

Medicaid. 285-0320. 
Also, stop by Judy's 
Produce at railroad 

track in Martin. 

OLAN'S METAL 
BUILDINGS 

HC36 BOX 50 
HAZARD, KY 41701 

606·439-4866 
Direct buy pole buildings: 

all steel buildings; 
carports; buy painted 
steel roof and siding 

panels; building 
insulation; residential 
and pole barn wood 

trusses. Olan's carries 
a full line of wood and 

metal building 
accessories. We build 

to suit your needs. 

PAUL'S LAWN SERVICE: 
Grass mowing and 
weedeating; driveway and 
parking lot sealing. Depend­
able service. Quality work. 
Low cost. Free estimates. 
Call874-0161. 

REMODELING, ROOFING, 
ELECTRICAL WIRING. 
Free estimates. Call 886-
3560. 

TEC21 
SERVICE CENTER 

TV, VCR, stereo, 
appliance repaiL 

CAMCORDER REPAIR 
is our specialty. 

Carry-in service only. 
U.S. 23 North, 

Prestonsburg (old 
Colorama building). 
Free estimates on 

carry-in merchandise. 
1-800-837-0810 

or 886-0724. 

THE WRIGHT WOOD­
WORKS can custom build 
and install your cabinets. H 
you need carpentry or deck 
work dona and done right, 
call 478-2520. Free esti­
mates. 

TREE TRIMMING, HJLL· 
SIDE CLEANING, yard work 
and other odd jobs. Call 
886-6456. 

TAXI SERVICE 
East Kentucky 

Transportation, Inc. 
Two locations to better 
serve our customers, 
We accept Medicaid, 
Wayland, 358-9955. 

Wheelwright, 452-2402. 
We appreciate 
your business. 

Hershel Osborne, 
Transporation Manager. 

WANT TO DO: Tree trim- ­
ming and cutting of any kind; 
fruit tree pruning; light haul­
ing. Thirty years expere· 
inca. Call 886-8266 or 87 4-
9947. 

WANT TO DO: Lawn work. 
Reasonable prices. Call for 
free estimates, 285-3308 or 
886-3367. 

WILL DO HOME OR OF­
FICE CLEANING. Can fur­
nish references. Call 285-
3345. 

YARD WORK, HILLSIDE 
CLEANING, TREE TRIM­
MING. Also have firewood 
for sale. Phone 874-9847. 

Friday, May 20, 1994 BS 

$16,995°0 

Plus Tax and Title 
Gets You a New 

141 Wide 2- or 3-BR 
Mobile Home, with 
Air, W/D, Skirting, 

Stove, Refrig., 
Anchored, 

Delivered and 
Blocked. 

IVEL, Ky. 
IVEL, Ky. 

Rainbow Homes 

IVEL, Ky. 
IVEL, Ky. 

On the 4-Lane on 
the Hill on Rt. 23, 
Halfway Between 

Pikeville and 
Prestonsburg 

I'VEL, Ky. 
Rainbow Homes 
Ph. 606·478-4530 

WANTED 
People who wish 
to live in comfort 

and luxury. 
Today's mobile 
housing is top-
notch living. 

Stop by 
Rainbow Homes 

at lvel, Ky. 
And see why all 

Eastern Ky. is 
talking about our 
great selection of 

quality mobile 
homes. We have 
the total package. 

Financing 
and insurance 

available. 

lvel, Ky. 
Rainbow Homes 
606-478-4530 

A # 1 Leasing and 
Financing Services 

A true friend in financial service, including 
availability of finances for: 

• RESTAURANT EQUIPMENT 
• HEAVY MACHINERY 
• TRACTORS & TRAILERS 

We can meet your leasing and financing needsl 
We are 

A '1 Leasing & Financing Services 
(606) 587-1476 

HaveNo'fime 
For Fun. In. The 

Sun.? 

at 

Sun•E•Bunz 

We have top of the line 
Wolff Tanning beds with 
400-watt facial tanners. 

12 sessions 

$25.00 
720 University 

Drive 
Across from 

Archer Clinic 
Call 
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DO YOU WANT TO LOSE 
WEIGHT, feel great for $1/ 
day. 1 00% money back 
guarantee. 24 hr. recorded 
message, 606-275-7842. 

HOUSE SliTER NEEDED: 
Couple moving. Needs 
responsible party to move 
intofurnishedthreebedroom 
home at Melvin and keep it 
up. Rent negotiable to right 
person. You pay utilities. 
Call377-6145. 

PAGEANT. Wanted: Girls 
age 4-19 for the 1994 Miss 
Kentucky CoediT eeniPre­
teeniPrincess Scholarship 
Pageant. For application 
and information call 1-800-
818-2225. 

PROM SPECIALII 
New Wolff beds: 
$2.50 Single or 

12 for $25, 
now through May 30. 

New video 
releases, $2.75. 

Cheap video rates: 
$1.50-$2.50. 

Located across from 
Coral Reef Pet Shop, 

South Lake Drive. 
Variety Video 

886-0213 
Now open Sundays 

from 1~10. 

VISIT THE LARGEST 
PANELING CENTER in 
Eastern Kentucky at Goble 
Lumber. Over 80 different 
prefinished panels in stock 
and as low as $3.99 per 
panel. Call Goble Lumber, 
874-9281. 

2, 700 SQ. FT. FOR LEASE. 
located at the •y• in Martin 
(next to Rite Aid). Suitable 
for commercial business or 
offices. Call285-3294 days; 
or 437-6170 evenings. 

FOR LEASE: Retail or of­
fice space. 6,000 sq. ft. Will 
divide. Parking. North Lake 
Drive, Prestonsburg. Call 
Ronald Frasure, 886-6900. 

HORSEBARNFORLEASE 
21 stalls, tack buildings, 
large loft, clubhouse, city 
water, training ring. $1,000/ 
month. One year lease. 
located one mile from new 
harness track on At. 3. Call 
789-8424; 789-1296; or 1-
803-957-5931 (collect). 

.;~·;\::::::rftq!!.!le~~-'.:;,:::.,,::: 
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TV REPAIR SHOP: In­
cludes everything to start 
your own repair business. 
(Testing equipment, re­
placement parts, repair 
equipment, Schematics, fil­
ing cabinets and several TVs 
to be repaired). Asking 
$2,500. Call 606-358-2634 
after 4 p.m. 

.:'"' lost Or , .. ,,. 
fount~ 

· ... ·:··: .. :·.: 

FOUND: Small, white dog 
with a few light brown spots 
was found in the Food City 
parking lot. Call 886-3326 
after 5 p.m. 

WANT TO BUY: Guitars 
and amps. Other instru­
ments are considered. Call 
789-5584 or 886-8695 after 
6p.m. 

WANT TO BUY TIMBER. 
By boundary or by the thou­
sand. Will reclaim property 
to owner's specifications. 
Call606-886-3313. 
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WANT TO BUY: Floyd 
County annualforthe school 
year 1959-60. Call903-682-
2581; or write Maggie 
(Gunnels) Stevens, Rt. 1 Box 
607, Frost, TX 76641. 

WANT TO BUY: Good built­
in dishwasher and Joveseat 
or small couch. Call 874-
2802, J. Davis. 

MobiJefHome 
Sales · 

14X60 MOBILE HOME. 
Two bedrooms, one bath, 
wood cabinets, three ton air 
conditioner. Excellent con­
dition. Ready to move into. 
In city limits. $11 ,000. Call 
87 4-9790 or 886-2279. 

14x70 MOBILE OFFICE 
FOR SALE. Call 606-478-
4530. 

1976 12X60 TRAILER. 
Central air, extended fire­
place, pak kitchen cabinets, 
8x16 screen/lattice porch. 
Asking $7,400. Call 285-
3163 or 285-0814 after 5 
p.m .. 

1991 FLEETWOOO 14x50 
mobile home. Two bed­
room. All electric. Excellent 
condition. Phone 606-789-
9126. 

24X40 SCOTT DOUBLE­
WIDE. Three bedroom, two 
baths, all electric. Sheet­
rock walls, plywood floors. 
Replaced living room carpet 
and kitchen linoleum. Ten 
years old. Good condition. 
$14,000. Available Septem­
ber 1. Call478-2144, leave 
message. 

BUY NOW, SAVE ALL 
YEAR: Rainbow Homes, 
lvel, KY; phone 606-478-
4530. 

FOR SALE: 1984 Shult 
14x60. Two bedroom, one 
bath. Three ton Carrier air 
conditioner, fireplace. Like 
new. Excellent condition. 
Set up and ready to move 
into. Located in 
Prestonsburg city limits. 
$10,500. Call 874-9878 or 
874-9865. 

NO MONEY DOWN IF YOU 
OWN LAND. Select a new 
Fleetwood, Brandywine or 
North River home of your 
choice-financing up to 25 
years. Only at the Afford­
able Housing Mart, 537 New 
Circle Road, Lexington; 293-
1609 or 800-755-5359. 

FOR SALE: Norris 12x66 
mobile home with expando. 
16' wide living room, three 
bedrooms, one bath with 
washer/dryer hookup. New 
carpet, plywood floors, cen­
tral air, all blinds and top 
treatments included. Nice 
rented Jot with new landscap­
ing. Can stay or be moved. 
Outbuilding and large 
treated/stained front porch. 
Call 886-8167. 

GREAT SELECTION OF 
USED MOBILE HOMES at 
Rainbow Homes, Jvel. 
Phone 606-478-4530 for 
details. We can finance. 

MANUFACTURED HOUS­
ING MONTHLY SPECIALS: 
Two bedroom mobile homes 
starting at less than $150/ 
month. Three bedrooms for 
less than $185/month. The 
Affordable Housing Mart, 
537 New Circle Road, Lex­
ington; 293-1609 or 800-
755-5359. 

SPACIOUS 28x60 THREE 
BEDROOM, TWO BATH. 
Spring Special: Delivery and 
set up for less than $275/ 
month. The Affordable 
Housing Mart, 537 New 
Circle Road, Lexington; 293-
1609 or 800-755-5359. 

SPECIAL!!! Deluxe 16x80 
three bedrooms, air, skirting 
and taxes. Now Jess than 
$225/month. Only at the Af­
fordable Housing Mart, 537 
New Circle Road, Lexing­
ton; 293-1609 or 800-755-
5359. 

CARPENTRY WORK: New 
homes, remodeling, drywall, 
concrete, shingles, decks, 
blocks. Call anytime! James 
Watkins, 886-3052. 

COMPLETE BUILDING 
OR REMODEUNG 

Vinyl siding; replacement 
windows; painting; 
roofing; drywalling; 
concrete and block. 

Twenty years experience. 
References furnished. 
Call L.D. Johnson or 

Johnnie Ray Boyd, day 
or night, 606-886-8293. 

EAST KY GUTTER, 
SIDING AND ROOFING 

5. and s· seamless 
gutters; siding; shingle 

roofs; replacement 
windows; decks. 
Free Estimates. 
Call James Hall 
at 285-9512 or 

1-800-277-7351. 

CARPENTRY WORK 
All TYPES 

New homes from ground up; 
remodeling or additions; all 
finish work; drywall; paint­
ing (interior, exterior and trim 
work}; All types concrete 
work-driveways, side­
walks, foundations, etc.; any 
size pole buildings; garages; 
decks. 
Over 20 years experience. 

Will furnish references. 
Robie Johnson, Jr. 

Call anytime! 
886-8896. 

i::1: .fl~a'lln9?.A!d;:::!:: 
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BLANTON HEATING 
AND 

AIR CONDITIONING 
Sales, Service 

Installation. 
High efficiency 

electric and gas units. 
Electrical services 

available. 
Free estimates. 
Call 874-2308. 

ROSE'S USED FURNI­
TURE: Washers, dryers, 
stoves, refrigerators with 30 
day warranty; beds; chests; 
dressers; cedar wardrobe, 
chest, dresser and night 
stand; air conditioners; baby 
beds; cradle; home interior; 
glassware; dishes; book­
shelves; glass top sofa table 
and coffee table; king, 
queen, full and twin head­
boards; sewing machine in 
cabinet; living room sets; foot 
locker; central air unit; desk; 
dinettes; antique oak table 
and four chairs; glass top 
table and six chairs; bike; 
much more. Come on by 
and browse around. Bring 
your friends, everyone wel­
come. Located between 
Allen and Lancer red lights 
on At. 1428 (across bridge 
to Goble Roberts). Call886-
8085; or 886-3463 after 5 
and Sundays. 

COLLINS FURNJTURE. 
New full size mattress sets, 
$125; new four drawer 
chests, dark color, $60; new 
couch with matching chair, 
$250; new bed frames, ad­
just to twin, full or queen, 
$30; automatic washers; 
dryers; stoves; refrigerators; 
electric stoves, $125 (each 
have a 30 day warranty of 
exchange only); complete 
crib bed, $75; baby stroller, 
$30; high chair and chang­
ing table, $25 each; extra 
long full size mattress, 
boxsprings, $60 set; king 
size mattress set; odd couch; 
oathroom vanity; glider set; 
long fuchsia prom dress with 
sequins. Weappreciateyour 
business. Call874-2058. 

When you use our Classifieds to sell a car, a 
boa or anything else, you've got the greatest 

local sales tool, 

Right in the 
Palm of your Hand! 
Placing an ad is easy, too. Just call our Ad-visors and tell them what you want ~o sell. They'll 
help you compose an ad which will attract potential buyers and have them eatmg out of the 

palm of your hand, too! 

20woRDS, 3DAYS! 
The ad will probably pay for itself, plus a lot more. So stop thinking about it. Pick up the 

phone and call us. The sooner you get your ad into our Classifieds, the sooner you can 

Sell that item and make some money! 

Call Kari at 886-8506 
The Floyd County Times 

ALLEN FURNITURE 
ALLEN, KY 

Living room suits; daybeds; 
gun cabinets; bedroom suits; 
recliners; odd chests; dinette 
sets; bunk beds; odd beds; 
loungers; used washers, 
dryers, refrigerators; and lots 
more! Call 874-9790. 

PORTER PLUMBING 
COMPANY 
ALLEN,KY 

Commercial, residential 
and service work. 

Licensed and insured. 
Rotor rooter service, 
drain cleaning, etc. 
CALL US FIRST! 

874-2794. 

INVITATION 
TO BID 

hearing w1ll be cancelled if 
no request for a hearing or 
informal conference is 
received by June 19, 1 994. 

Written comments, objec­
tions or requests for a public 
hearing or informal confer­
ence must be filed with the 
Director, Division of Field 
Services, #2 Hudson Hollow, 
Frankfort, Kentucky 40601, 
by June 19, 1994. 

F-4/29, 5/6, 5/13, 5/20 

PUBLIC NOTICE 
Pursuant to 405 KAR 

8:010, Section 16{5), the 
following is a summary of 
permitting decisions made 
by the Department for 
Surface Mining Reclamation 
and Enforcement, Division 
of Permits with respect to 
applications to conduct 
surface coal mining and 
reclamation operations in 
Floyd county. 

B & H Elkhorn Coal, 836-
524 7, issued 94104/26; Buck 
Coal, Inc., 836-5264, issued 
94/04/27; Coal Mac, Inc .• 
836-0117, issued 94/04/21; 
Coal Mac, Inc., 836-5227, 
issued 94/04/20; Costain 
Coal, Inc., 636-8005, issued 
94/04/26. F-5/20 

Floyd County Schools is --------­
requesting bids for the 
following: 

1. Security Service 
2. Fir& Extinguisher 

Service 
3. Carpeting 
4. Fencing 
5. Replacing Parts for 

Sewage Treatment Plants 
6. Emergency Lighting 

System 
7. Welding Supplies 
8. Fire Alarm Panels & 

Accessories 
9. Commercial Insecticide 
1 0. Refrigeration Supplies 
For information concern-

ing these bids, call Gregory 
Adams, Director of Facilities, 
Floyd County Schools, 
Maintenance Department, at 
874-2049. 

Bid closing time is 1 0:00 
a.m. June 3, 1 994. 

F-5/20, W-5/25, 6/1 

NOTICE OF 
BOND RELEASE 
In accordance with KRS 

350.093, notice is hereby 
given that Laurel Creek Coal 
Company Inc., P.O. Box 
940, Paintsville, Kentucky 
41240, has applied for 
Phase Ill bond release on 
Increment No. 8 of Permit 
No. 836-Q200which was last 
issuedonJune5,1992. The 
application covers an area 
of approximately 212.00 
acres located 0.5 mile North 
of Ivai in Floyd County, 
Kentucky. 

The permit area is 
approximately 2 miles east 
from State Route 1426's 
junction with U.S. Route 23 
and located 0.25 mile north 
of Davison Branch. The 
latitude is 37"36' 22". The 
longitude is 8211 40' 1 0". 

The Bond now in effect for 
Increment #8 is a surety 
bond in the amount of 
$1,400.00. Approximately 
1 00% of the original bond 
amount of $18,000.00 is 
included in the application 
for Phase Ill Bond Release. 

Reclamation work 
performed to date includes 
the establishment of an 
adequate vegetative cover 
achieved September, 1988. 

This is the final adver­
tisement of this application. 
A public hearing on the 
application has been 
scheduledforJune21,1994 
at 9:00 a.m. at the 
Department for Surface 
Mining Reclamation and 
Enforcement's Prestons­
burg Regional Office, 2705 
South Lake Drive, Prestons­
burg, Kentucky 41653. The 

NOTICE OF 
INTENTION 

TO MINE 
Cumberland River Coal 

Company of H. C. 64, Box 
915, Debord, Kentucky 
41214, has submitted to the 
Office of Surface Mining 
Reclamation and 
Enforcement (OSM) an 
application to conduct an 
underground coal mining 
operation on Dicks Creek in 
Floyd County. The proposed 
site of the operation is 
located approximately 2.7 
milessouthofthecommunity 
of Odds, Kentucky, 
approximately 0.8 miles east 
of Dicks Creek and 
approximately 2.7 miles 
southwest from Daniels 
Branch Road's junction with 
Route 3. The proposed 
permi1 area is located 3711 
42' 33". The longitude is 8211 
39' 18". The operation will 
underlie 196.0 acres of 
forestland owned by the U.S. 
Department of the Army, 
Corps of Engineers. The 
operation will disturb no 
surface acres on federally 
owned lands. Cumberland 
River Coal Company plans 
to gain access to the Broas 
(Stockton) seam, elevation 
1 006, by portals on privately 
owned land. This is permit 
application number KY -o94. 
This application is available 
for public review atthe OSM 
Area Office, 2664 West 
Mountain Parkway, Pres­
tonsburg, Kentucky 41668 
and at the OSM Division of 
Tennessee Permitting, 530 
Gay Street, S. W., Suite 500, 
Knoxville, Tennessee 
37902. OSM will accept 
written comments, objec­
tions, or requests for informal 
conferences relative to this 
application. Any person 
having an interest which is 
or may be adversely affected 
by the decision on the 
application may make such 
written comments during the 
public review period. Such 
persons requesting informal 
conferences shall provide 
the information specified in 
405 KAR 8:010, Section 11. 
Comments and requests for 
informal conferences are to 
be submitted to the Office of 
Surface Mining Reclamation 
and Enforcement, Division 
of Tennessee Permitting, 
530 Gay Street, S.W., Suite 
500, Knoxville, Tennessee 
37902. In making 
comments, refer to the 
application number. 

F-5/13, 5/20, 5/27, 613 

RECEIVING BIDS 
lst. Assembly of God will be 
receiving bids on a 197 5 church 
bus. This is a 3 seater with 55,000 
origional miles. For more infor­
mation call 285-3051 . 

RECEIVING BIDS 
lst. Assembly of God will 

be receiving bids to 
shingle church roof. For 
more information call 

285-3051 

INVITATION 
TO BID 

Floyd County Schools is 
requesting bids for GRASS 
CUTTING AT MCDOWELL 
ELEMENTARY SCHOOL. 
Information may be obtained 
by calling Gregory Adams, 
Director of Facilities, at 874-
2049. 
All bids must be at the Floyd 
County Schools, Director of 
Facilities Office, 
Maintenance Department, 
P.O. Box 620, Allen, 
Kentucky 41601, by 10:00 
a.m. on June 9, 1994 for bid 
opening. 

F-5/20, W-5/25, 6/1 

NOTICE OF 
INTENTION 

TO MINE 
Pursuant to Application 

1836-5320, Transfer 
In accordance with 405 

KAR 8:010, notice is hereby 
given that Bailey Mining 
Company, Inc., H.C. 72, Box 
195, Price, Kentucky 41636, 
intends to transfer permit 
number 636-5107 to 
Progress Land Corporation, 
Bamett Tower One Progress 
Plaza, St. Petersburg, 
Kentucky 33701. The new 
permit number will be 836-
5320. The operation disturbs 
3.41 surface acres and 
underlies 290 acres located 
1/2 miles south of 
Weeksbury in Floyd County. 
No new acreage is affected 
by the transfer. 

The operation is located 
approximately 2.5 miles 
south from KY Route 122 
junction with KY Route 466 
and located 1/2 miles East 
of Beaver Creek. The 
operation is located on the 
Wheelwright U.S.G.S. 71/2 
minute quadrangle map at 
latitude 37" 18' 54" and 
longitude 8211 42' 00". 

The application has been 
filed for public inspection at 
the Department for Surface 
Mining Reclamation and 
Enforcement's Prestons­
burg Regional Office, 2705 
South Lake Drive, Prestons­
burg, Kentucky 41653-1455. 
Written comments or 
objections must be received 
within fifteen (15) days of 
today's date. F-5/20 

NOTICE OF 
INTENTION 

TO MINE 
Pursuant to Application 

Number 860-5023, 
Renewal 

In accordance with KRS 
350.055, notice is hereby 
given that National Mines 
Corporation, P.O. Box 
12022, Lexington, Kentucky 
40579, has applied for 
renewal of a permit for an 
underground coal mining 
operation located 2.5 miles 

south of Garrett in Knott and 
Floyd Counties. The 
proposed operation will 
disturb 3.13 acres and will 
underlie 844.00 acres, and 
the total area within the 
permit boundary will be 
847.13 acres. 

The proposed operation 
is approximately 1.7 miles 
southwestfromKy. Rte. 550 
junction with Ky. Ate. 7 and 
located 0.6 mile southeast 
of Jones Fork. The latitude 
is 37"26' 37". The longitude 
is 8211 50' 05". 

The proposed operation 
is located on the Wayland 
U.S.G.S. 7 1/2 minute 
quadrangle map. The 
surface area to be disturbed 
is owned by, Knott Floyd 
Land Company, Inc. The 
operation will underlie land 
owned by Knott Floyd Land 
Company, Inc., Consoli­
dation Coal Company of 
Kentucky, Gordon Howard, 
Charles and Jean Watkins, 
Earnest and Roxie Keen, 
Vina Slone, Palmer Craft, 
Ray Lute, Goldie Fitch, 
Elisha Thornsburgy, Homer 
Gibson, Violet Moore, Ella 
Keen, and Charles Hall. The 
operation will affect an area 
within 1 00 feet of a public 
road Tripplett Branch. The 
operation will not involve 
relocation of the public road. 

The application has been 
filed for public inspection at 
the Department for Surface 
Mining Reclamation and 
Enforcement's Jackson 
Regional Office, Howell 
Heights Building, Suite 1, 
170 Howell Heights, 
Jackson Kentucky 41339-
9689. Written comments, 
objections, or requests for a 
permit conference must be 
filed with the Director, 
Division of Permits, #2 
Hudson Hollow, U.S. 127 
South, Frankfort, Kentucky 
40601. 

F-5/6, 5/13, 5/20, 5/27 

INVITATION 
TO BID: 

The Floyd County Board 
of Education is requesting 
proposals for Student and 
Athletic Insurance for the 
school year 1994-95. 

Bids must be mailed or 
delivered to Chief of 
Operations, Floyd County 
Board of Education, • 
Prestonsburg, Ky., prior to 
time bids are opened. Bids 
will be opened at the Central 
Office Conference Room at 
10:00 a.m. on Thursday, 
June 9, 1994. 

The Floyd County Board 
of Education reserves the 
right to reject any and all 
bids. F-5/20, 5/27, W-5/25 

INVITATION 
TO BID 

The Floyd County 
Farm Bureau is 
requesting bids for 
building a concrete 
ramp, remodeling bath­
room, and other repairs 
at their office building at 
207 South Lake Drive. 

Plans for the ramp, 
entrance door and 
bathroom must be 
wheelchair accessible 
and meet Federal 
guidelines. An 
intemized list of plans 
may be picked up at the 
office. Bids will be 
received at the Floyd 
County Farm Bureau 
Office, Attention; 
Delphia Hicks, Secre­
tary, 207 South Lake 
Drive, Prestonsburg, 
KY 41653, no later than 
12:00 noon on June 9, 
1993. 

F-5/20, 5/27, W-5/25 

Invitation 
to Bid 

One1995GMC2-Ton 
Truck: 
• All standard equip­

ment 
• 427 gas engine 
• 4-wheel disc hyd. 

brakes 
•107" Wheel Base 
• 80,000 psi steel It 

frame 
• Allison auto. trans- I" 

mission 
•12,000 front axle 
• 23,500 rear axle 
• 50-gallon fuel tank 
• 1 OR X 22.5 12-ply 

tires (radial) 
•Color: red 

Interested bidders 
should contact: 
Maytown Volunteer 

Fire Department 
Box 130 

Langley, Ky. 

Maytown Volunteer 
Fire Department re­
serves the right to " 
reject any and all 
bids. Bids must be re­
ceived by May 29, 
1994 

Invitation 
to Bid 

1-1200 gallon stain-
leas steel tank 

1-10" quick dump 
127" over-all length 
58 112" over-all height 
Complete aet of lights 
per D.O.T. specs 

1-Stainleaa steel por-
table tank holder 

1-MC electronic 4-
llght water gauge 

1-2 112" NPT outlet 
rear of tank 

1-48" wide2-door ala 
cabinet 

2-fJ/a Ladder brackets 
1-10"highx10ft.long 

hose storage rack 

1-30" x8' x40" alumi· 
num storage box 

1-1,000 gpm Ameri­
can Godiva FDS 
front end pump 
mounted with 
bumper extended 
and mounted on our 
chauia. 

Interested bidders 
should contact: 

Maytown Volunteer 
Fire Department 

Box 130 
Langley, Ky. 

Maytown Volunteer 
Fire Department re­
aervea the right to re­
ject any and all blda. 
Bids must be received 
by May 29, 1994 
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MAY27 I KIDS' WORLD 
1·9 ROUNDUPI Object of this exercise is to place the numbers 1-9 in 
blank circles of the diagram at right so that each row of three numbers 

In a straight line through center 
will total 15. 

' Three numbers -1, 4 and B-
are already in place. 

Here are some starter hints: 
Hint 1: Number at center cannot 
be too high or too low. Hint 2: 
Outer circle numbers appear in a 
rather orderly succession. Take 
it from there. 

MAY 26 I 

'I! op II!M 'Z't'~'6'9'l'9' ~ :dOl WOJJ '9S!M)f:>OP U9lU :J9lU90 1e S 90Bid 

PAIR GAMEl Absentminded Uncle AI has one pair of glasses 
for outdoors, one pair for indoors, and one pair for doing what? 
Answer quickly, if you can. \..--------------1 'OMl J94l0 B4J 6U!PU!J JO:f 

WORD TRACER 
DIAGRAM 

BEGINNING with any 
essential letter, see if you 
can connect letters along 
lines in the diagram above 
to form random words in 
accord with definitions be­
low. 

Word 1 has one letter, 
.Word 2 has two letters, 
Word 3 three letters, etc. 

Definitions: 
1. One example. 
2. In such a way. 
3. Period of time. 
4. Garden flower. 
5. Big fibbers. 
6. Popeye 's occupation. 
Then try to find at least 1 0 

more fiVe-letter words, simi-
larly. ·o1e 'sUieJ •uues 

·ueJor 'Jeres 'Jeser 'esu!J 
'1J8US '9J(WS 'J9SOI '9SOJe 

'SJf8t 'rnms :spJOM J&»Bf·B"!:f · • ) 
'Jones-g ·SJ91~ ·esoJ SCHOOL DAZE I Mrs. Octopus thinks she has as many as 21 fish in 

-1- ·eJe-;: ·os-z ·e-~ her class, but isn't sure. How many do you say? 
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