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Effort to rescind resignation called irrelevant 
"WhE!elwriglifblfibialblf.limS he was forced to q~b_Ot~~ stipulates lile,~~ sta.Yout of Floyd County 
by Scott l,erry 
Tunes Editor 

A Wheelwright city commissioner 
who agfted this week to quit his post 
and leave the county apparently has 
decided that the agreement was not so 
agreeable. 

In a letter dated August 30, the 
same day he was released from jail, 
Wheelwright Commissioner Charles 
Harmon alleged through his attorney, 
Larry Webster, that his resignation 

from the commission Tuesday was 
"signed under force and was unlaw­
fully obtained." 

Hannon had resigned from the city 
commission earlier Tuesday, after he 
had been jailed on charges of first 
degree unlawful imprisonment and 
spouse abuse. 

He said in his letter of resignation 
that he "freely and willingly" agreed 
to resign and that he would "physi­
cally leave the City of Wheelwright 

and ... will not return." 
After his releao;c from jail on bond, 

Harmon apparently contacted 
Webster, a Pikeville attorney, who 
issued aleuertothc Wheelwright city 
clerk concerning the "purported res­
ignation of Charles Harmon." 

'lbat letter alleged that Hannon, 
"under force, signed a document pur­
porting to resign as a City Commis­
sioner of Wheelwright, Kentucky." 

The letter further contends that 
"This document was signed under 

force and was unlawfully obtained 
and, as his attorney, I am notifying 
you that be hereby withdraws an at­
tempt to resign. Please let the record 
reflect that Mr. Harmon docs not re­
sign as City CommissionerofWhecl­
wright. Please destroy his purported 
resignation letter when it arrives." 

Webster could not be reached 
Thursday to discuss the letter or elabo­
rate on who might have forced 
Harmon to resign. 

The resignation I Iarmon signed was 

Suspect is 
extradited l 
for trial ' 
in murder 

by Susan Allen 
Staff Writer 

An Ohio man wanted on a murder 
charge in that state waived extradi­
tion Wednesday morning and was 
transported back to Geneva, Ohio, by 
police Wednesday afternoon. 

In Aoyd DistrietCourt Wednesday 
morning, Lawrence Smith, 20, waived 
extrndition to Ohio, where he is charged 
with the August 27 beating death of 
Randy Marshall, 21, of Geneva 

District:Judgc.Danny Caudill ex­
plained the extradition process to 
Smith and Smith signed the extradi­
tion forms. 

During Wednesday's hearing, 
Smith told Judge Caudill, "after to­
day, I will not be back in the state of 
Kentucky." 

Smith was arrested Tuesday morn­
ing at a relative's borne in Buclcs 
Branch near Martin by floyd County 
Sheriff Paul Hunt Thompson and 
deputies Uoyd Powers and Ricky 
Thornsberry. 

Ohio authorities alerted the 
sheriffs department at approximately 
1:30 a.m. Wednesday that Smith 
could be in the county. Deputy Pow­
ers, who was on patrol at Left Beaver 
Townhouses, spotted a vehicle which 
turned out to belong to a relative of 
Smith. 

Officers were tipped that Smith 
was at the Bucks Branch residence. 
He was taken into custody at 9:30 
a.m. Wednesday. 

Smith was also wanted on eight 
charges in Floyd County stemming 
from an incident last spring at the 
Holiday Inn. Prestonsburg policeman 
Ricky Conn arrested Smith and 
charged with him eight misdemean­
ors. 

On Wednesday, Judge Caudill 
sentenced Smith to jail time on those 
charges, but told the suspect that he 
would not have to serve his sentence 
if Ohio authorities extradited him. 

Hearing cancelled 
Floyd County Board of Education members were prepared Wednesday to conduct a hearing Into Issues 
tnvolving a hazing Incident In the Prestonsburg H1gh School football program, but the hearing was 
cancelled at the request of an affected player's parents. (photo by Susan Allen) 

Slone Mountain, Jenny Wiley 
the places to be for festival fun 

by Janice Shepherd 
Managing Editor 

The bills of Floyd County will be 
alive with the sound of music next 
weekend when two mountain festi­
vals present old-fashioned entertain­
ment 

The Kentucky Highland Folk Fes­
tival begins Friday, September 9, at 
the Wilkinson/Stumbo Convention 
Center at Jenny Wiley State Park. 
The Slone Mountain Squirrel Festi­
val will be held on Sunday, Septem­
ber 11, at McDowell. 

This year marks a new era for the 
Kentucky Highlands Folk Festival, 
which was begun 29 years ago by 
Edith James. This year, the festival is 
being incorporated into the Kentucky 
Opry organization. 

Entertainment at the Kentucky 
Highland Folk Festival includes story 
telling, dancing, puppet shows and 
old-time music. Performing Friday 
will be the Festival Band, Hamilton 
Sisters, Georgia Muncie, Lawrence 

Webster/Mule Band, RobMcNurlin, 
Mary A. Neal, the Hill Country Danc­
ers, Bob & Freda Meade and the 
Boys from Middlecrcek. 

Saturday's performers include 
Dave Sizemore, Wanda Hall, Ron 

First Guaranty Bank 
merger is completed 

The merger of Trans Financial 
Baneorp Inc. of Bowling Green and 
FGC Holding, a holding company 
for First Guaranty National Bank, 
was completed Wednesday. 

Under the terms of the merger, 
419.83 Trans Financial Bancorp 
shares will be assigned to FGC Hold­
ing shareholders for each share of 
stock they own in FGC Holding. 

The stock transaction is valued at 
$16.3 million, based on its closing 
value at $15.50 per share Wednes­
day. 

First Guaranty Bank, located in 
Martin and Prestonsburg, has assets 
of $126 million. 

Dobler, Paul Neil Allen, Mike Hall 
and Chuck Tackett. Homer Ledford 
will play his saw. 

The festival features gospel sing­
ing on Sunday. 

Arts and crafts will be exhibited 
on the amphitheatre parking lot dur­
ing the festival. 

Arts and crafts arc also a big at­
traction at the Slone Mountain Squir­
rel Festival. The craft booths sit on 
top of the mountain and crafts people 
demonstrate their handiwork through­
out the day. The crafts makers will 
allow spectators to try their hands at 
helping to produce a product, such as 
stirring the lye soap boiling in an iron 
kettle. 

Four stages also dot the hillside, 
and those listening to the gospel and 
country entertainment there can rest 
in the shade under the trees. Enter­
tainers include Marlow Tackett and 
the Music Company Band, Country 
Persuasion, Eldridge Vance and ''le 

(See ·Festivals, page seven) 

not among the stipulations for his 
bond or release from jail on the un­
lawful imprisonment or spouse abuse 
charges. 

The provisions for bond included 
requirements that Harmon have no 
contact with his wife; that he stay out 
of floyd County except for court ap­
pearances on the charges; that he be 
charged with no other violations of 
the law; and that be post a $20,000 
surety bond. 

FloydDistrictJudgeDannyCaudill 

declined comment on the case, but 
Sheriff Paul Hunt Thompson said 
Thursday that Harmon's bid to re­
scind his resignation was irrelevant. 

"We will enforce the provisions of 
his bond," Thompsoll said, "and if be 
shows up in this county he's going to 
be put under arrest. He's not going to 
have time to serve on the commis­
sion." 

I Iarmon was unavailable Thursday 
for comment. 

Hazing issue is 
settled without 
board hearing 

by Susan Allen 
Staff Writer 

A Prestonsburg High School foot­
ball player has requested that a bear­
ing before the school board concern­
ing an alleged hazing incident last 
month be canceled. 

At a special school board meeting 
Wednesday, board members were set 
to conduct a bearing to examine evi­
dence in connection with the inci­
dent, which resulted in one player 
being kicked off the team and three 
others being suspended for several 
games . 

Board member Eddie Patton an­
nounced that the father of the player 
kicked off the team had called him 
and requested that the proceedings 
not be held because, "(the student) 
didn't want to name names" and he 
felt it would hurt other players on the 
team. 

The grandmother of the player 
forced off the team told board mem­
bers Wednesday that she felt the pun­
ishment was unj ustand that her grand­
son was being penalized because "be 
was the only child man enough to 
come forward and say 'I did it"' 

The grandmother added that dur­
ing her other grandson's freshman 
year on the team, be went through a 
hazing incident that "was so fllthy, I 
don't want to repeat it." 

Hazing is a form of intimidation 
or harassment generally associated 
with initiation rituals. 

SuperintendentSteve Towler gave 
board members a written report on 
the incident and said be felt that prin­
cipal Karen Trivette and coach Bill 
Letton bad made the right decisions 
concerning the incident 

The one player was booted off the 
team, Towler said, because of his 
"accumulative" discipline record at 
the school and that the student was 
"more involved in the incident" 

Board chairman Ray Brackett 
commented that the board did not 
condone that type of activity, but he 
felt that the "punishment should have 

been dealt out on an equal basis." 
Board member Patton agreed and 

asked what type of supervision the 
students were under at the football 
camp and if the staff was aware of 
any other incidents. 

Towler said that coach Letton and 
the principal knew of no prior hazing 

(Sec Board, page two) 

Three nabbed 
by task force 
in drug bust 

1brecpcoplewerearreslCdondrug 
charges in Pike County Saturday dur­
ing separate raids by the Mountain 
Area Drug Task Force, the Kentucky 
State Police and the Pike County 
Sherifr s Department. 

Kenneth Dannon, 35, of Turkey 
Creek in Pike County, was charged 
with cultivating marijuana, traffick­
ing in marijuana, posssesion of mari­
juana and possession of drug para­
phernalia. 

Task force director Frank Fryman 
said that approximately two pounds 
of marijuana were seized from 
Gannon during the raid. 

In a separate raid, Ronnie Bartley, 
38, of Powells Creek, was arrested 
and charged with possession of mari­
juana, possession of a handgun by a 
convicted felon and four counts of 
prescription drugs not in proper con­
tainer, possession of a controlled sub­
stance, codeine, possession of drug 
paraphernalia and two counts of pos­
session of a radio that sends and re­
ceives police messages. 

In a raid at Robinson Creek, po­
lice arrested Richard Burchett, 26, 
and charged him with possession of 
marijuana, possession of drug para­
phernalia and possession of caves­
dropping devices. 

All the suspects were lodged in 
the Pike County Detention Center. 

City delays a date with 
history to examine code 

CEDAR branches out 
Willa Phillips (right), a Pike Countyteacherwhowon first place in last year's CEDAR competition for grade level 
9·12, demonstrated one of her projects to Patricia Watson, John Justice and Gary Frazier at a meeting of Floyd 
County teachers Monday. (photo by Janice Shepherd) 

by Scott J>erry 
Times Editor 

The Prestonsburg City Council 
tabled a date with history earlier this 
month, deciding instead to take a little 
more time to figure out just what kind 
of history they wanted to make. 

I lad council given s<X:ond and final 
reading August 22 to an ordinance 
establishing an ethics code for city 
officials and employees, they would 
have been among tlte first and per­
haps the first muncipality in tltc state 
to do so. Rather than set Ute prece­
dent, council chose to set the ordi­
nance a<:idc for further review. 

Citiesandcountieshavcuntil Janu­
ary I, 1995 to adopt eUtics codes that 
set out certain criteria for t11e conduct 
of local governments. That mandate 
was enacted by Kentucky's Geneml 

Assembly last spring. 
Minimum requirements established 

by the new law include the develop­
ment of financial disclosure state­
ments, to be filed annually by all 
elected officials, appointed officials 
and employees; the development of a 
policy on hiring relatives; and tJ1c 
designation of a tx:rson or group to 
enforce the code. 

Prestonsburg gave first reading to a 
comprehensive ordinance on August 
8 and council had scheduled August 
22 as the date for enacting the code. 
On the advice of city attorney Larry 
Brown, though, final approval was 
delayed so council members could 
scrutinize the provisions before they 
were officially adopted. 

1be substance oftJ1c proposed city 
code wm; developed by the Kentucky 
League of Cities into a model ordi-

nancc which Prestonsburg adapted 
for local usc. I I ere arc some of the 
highlighL<: of the original proposal: 

Standards of Conduct 

No city official or employee or 
their immediate family members shall 
have an interest in any business, trans­
action or activity which is in substan­
tial conflict with the proper discharge 
of public duties. 

Family members defined by the 
ordinance include spouses, parents, 
children, brotltcrs, sisters. mothers­
in-law, fathers-in-law, sons-in-law, 
daughters-in-law, grandparents or 
grandchildren. 

No city oflicial or employee may 
intentionally use their official posi-

(Sec Ethics, page two) 
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Ethics------------------------------ (Continued from page one) We're Here! 
tion to "secure unwarranted privi­
leges or advantages." 

Officials or employees may not 
take or refrain from t~1king discre­
tionary action for linancial benelits. 
Conflicts must be disclosed if the 
ofticial's vote would have an effect 
on a prohibited interest. 

Conflict.; of Interest 

No official or employee may hold 
any contract with tlu~ city unless they 
meet certain exceptions. 

If the contract was awarded com­
petitively, oflicals may be bidders 
unless they have participated in es-

tablishing contract specifications or 
participate in awarding the contract. 
If they have the authority to manage 
contract performance, they are also 
prohibited from holding a contract 
with the city for any goods or ser­
vices. 

If an official or employee had a 
contract for goods or services prior to 
the adoption of\ the code they may 
fullill their contract obligations, but 
renewal would be subject to ethics 
code provisions. 

If an official or employee publicly 
discloses their interest in any contract 
and if they can provide the best deal 

Board-------- (Continued from page one) 

activities, but that those type of inci­
dents do happen. 

"I'm not going to deny that some­
thing like this ha" happened in the 
past." Towler said. "It is not some-
thing that a student would share with 
a coach or parent Mrs. Trivette and 
coach Letton have assured me it will 
not happen in the future. A (supervi­
sor) can't be with youngsters 24-
hours a day." 

The issue has apparently been 
settled. 

In other action Wednesday, the 
board declared that an emergency 
exists at the D .W. Howard Fieldhouse 
at Betsy Layne to forego bidding 
requirements for asbestos removal. 

The gym has been closed since 
last week, when state inspectors man­
dated that several damaged wall pan­
els containing asbestos be repaired. 

At the August 22 board meeting, 
Betsy Layne parent Lance Blackburn 
showed board members pictures of 
the damaged a'ibestos wall panels 
and asked that the situation be inves­
tigated. 

The gym was closed the next day 
and state inspectors were at the scene 
on August 24. 

Towler recommended that the 
damaged panels be sealed, not re­
moved or replaced, so that the gym 
can reopen soon. Alpha Contracting 
of Berea submitted the least expen­
sive proposal for $4,861. 

Board member Phyllis Honshell 
suggested that it would be less ex­
pensive in the long run to remove all 
the asbestos from the gym. 

Towler explained that the asbes­
tos removal was part of a planned 
renovation of the gym, which was put 
on hold after questions arose about 
the validity of the architect and con­
struction manager contracts. The su­
perintendent added that the board has 
paid architect Paul Hoffman to draw 
up specilications for the asbestos re­
moval. 

Operations chief Jim Osborne said 
that Hoffman had been asked to pro­
vide a copy of those plans to the 
board, but the architect has not deliv­
ered them. 

Patton asked that the board be 
given infonnationabouttheestimated 
cost and amount of time it would take 
to remove all the asbestos in the gym 
to determine if it would be feasible. 

Towler said he would provide that 
information. 

The board approved the emer­
gency declaration. 

In other business: 
• Tbe board accepted the low bid 

of $16,103.02 from John Gray 
Pontiac-Buick for a maintenance van. 
Towler recommended that the van be 
purchased from Music-Carter­
Hughes because it was a local 
dealership. The Music-Carter­
Hughes bid was $200 higher, but the 
board opted to stick with the lowest 
bid. 

• The board approved buying 
24,000 BTU air conditioners from 
Wal-Martand 30,000 BTU units from 
Brock McVey. 

• The board accepted the 1994-96 
offer of assistance from the School 
Facilities Construction Commission 
for $65,529. Towler told the board 
that because of state restrictions, the 
board would only be allowed to use 
half of that allocation for school con­
struction projects. The $32,764.50 
equates to approximately $320,000 
in bonding potential. 

• The board approved creating the 
position of a data entry clerk for the 
energy management department. The 
$8 per hour salary will be paid from 
grant monies in that department 

The next meeting of the board will 
be Monday, September 19 at 6:30 
p.m. at Prestonsburg Elementary. 

National marrow 
donor awareness 
week 

Celebrate National Marrow Do­
nor Awareoess Week September 11-
17 by registering to be a volunteer 
bone marrow donor. 

Thousands of patients with leuke­
mia and other diseases search every 
day for matched marrow donors for 
transplants. But there aren't enough 
donors on the national registry. 
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as it relates to price or limited sup­
plie.<; of goods or services, the official 
or employee may be allowed to pro­
vide those goods or services. 

·n1e conflict provisions also pro­
hihit offjcials from accepting or so­
liciting gifts, loans, travel, entertain­
ment or hospitality with a market 
value exceeding $100 if it could be 
reasonably inferred that the gift was 
intended to influence the actions of 
the official or employee. 

Usc of city property is also prohib­
ited under the code, unless the gen­
eral public has the same opportuni­
ties or the usc is authorized by a stated 
city policy. 

No officer or employee, with the 
exception of recognized bargaining 
organizations, may represent any busi­
ness before the city in connection 
with any cause, proceeding, applica­
tion or other matter pending before 
tile city or any city agency. 

lbe misuse of confidential infor­
mation is prohibited as is the accep­
tance of honoraria with market value 
in excess of $100. 

Financial Disclosure 

1be proposed ordinance would re­
quire elected oflicials, candidates for 
elect.:on, members of the planning 
and zoning commission and the board 
of adjusunent, members of the board 
of ethics and all non-elected officers 
and employees who have purchasing 
power to make certain personal fi. 
nancial disclosures each year. 

lbe contents of those reports would 

include information that identifies 
each source of income for not only 
the filer of the report but for the filer's 
immediatefamilythatexceeds$5,000 
during the preceding calendar year. 

1be filer would also have to iden­
tify the source of any business owner­
ship worth more than $10,000 and 
they would have to identify any busi­
ness relationship inside or outside the 
state which is anticipated to engage in 
business with the city. 

Financial disclosure criteria would 
not require filers to specify amounts, 
but only sources of income. 

Non-compliance would be punish­
able by fines of $25 to $500 per in­
fraction. 

Nepotism 

The code would prohibit any of­
ficer or employee from advocating or 
recommending the employment, ap­
pointment, promotion, transfer, or 
advancement of a family member. 

No officer or employee would be 
permitted to supervise or manage the 
work of a family member, or partici­
pate in any other action relating to the 
employment or discipline of a family 
member except for setting budgets 
which include compensation. 

A board of ethics would be created 
under the ordinance to oversee provi­
sions. No member of that board may 
hold any elected or appointed office 
with the city or any city agency. 

Council is expected to discuss the 
proposed ethics code at its next regu­
lar meeting on Septemebr 12. 

Happy 46th 
Anniversary 

Mr. & Mrs. 
Ted Shannon 

We love you 
Mom&Dad, 

TheF 
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Blood drive 
Tracy Wells of Central Kentucky Blood Center presented the program at 
the August 25 Rotary meeting at the Prestonsburg Holiday Inn. The 
program encouraged members to recruit donora for the holiday blood 
drive next week at the Prestonsburg Blood Center. Pictured with Walla 
Ia Joe Bolton, club secretary and chairman of thia year'a blood drive. 
(photo by Allen Bolling) 

Cable Vision announces Project TEACH 
Demonstrating its continuing com­

mitment to area schools, Prestons­
burg Cable Vision recently announced 
the launch of a major education ini­
tiative, Project TEACH (faking Edu­
cation Along the Cable Highway). 

An entirely locally-oriented ini­
tiative, Project TEACH is dedicated 
to assisting Clark Elementary, Pres­
tonsburg Elementary, Prestonsburg 
High and Adams Middle schools in a 
number of important areas: educa­
tional programming, teacher training 
and recognition and fundraising. It is 
intended to build on, coordinate and 
widen the efforts Cable Vision bas 
already undertaken on behalf of edu­
cadon which, in addition to deliver­
ing hundreds of hours of educational 
cabJep-ogranuning at no charge, have 
also generated significantrevenue for 
schools through donations of cash, 
awards and equipment 

According to Prestonsburg 
Cable Vision's General Manager Dan 
Perry, "We at Prestonsburg 
Cable Vision flfDlly believe there can 
be no greater contribution to a com­
munity than working to enhance the 
education of its young people. The 
launch of Project TEACH marks an 
even greater commitment on the part 
of all of us at Cable Vision to use our 
technology and position in the com­
munity to benefit area schools." 

Scheduled to coincide with the 
start of the 1994-95 school year, 
Project TEACH kicks off in Septem-

bee with Cable Vision's You+ Cable 
=Money for our School's campaign. 
With this effort, CableVision will 
offer free installation and donate one­
half of the f~rst month • s service fees 
for new customers and premium sec­
vice upgrades to area schools. 

Other elements ofProject1EACH 
include: CableVision's 1994-95 
Teacher Award, Cable in the Class­
room program, Teacher Training 
Workshops and more. 

"Project TEACH is our way of 
giving back to the community we 
feel fortunate to serve. We hope teach­
ers, administrators, media special­
ists, parents and anyone else inter­
ested in education will take an active 
part in this effort and offer further 
suggestions as to how CableVision 
can work to benefit area schools." 

Speech camp 
scheduled 

Aworkshopforjuniorhighschool 
and high school speech and drama 
students has been scheduled for Sat­
urday, September 10, at Pikeville 
College. 

The flat fee is $30 per student or 
coach and allows participants to at­
tend all event workshops from public 
speakingtosoloacting to radio broad­
casting. 

For more information and appli­
cations, contact Don Lowe at 478-
9438. 

Labor 
Day 

Special!!! 

Writers Reading 
contest planned 

WPRG-TV 5 and the "Writers 
Reading" program are sponsoring a 
personal narrative contest for stu­
dents in grades four through twelve. 

Judges will choose a winner and 
runner-up from each of the following 
groups: grades 4-6, grades 7-9 and 
grades 10-12. 

Winnerswillreceive$50,andrun­
ners-up will receive $25. Prizes will 
be awarded on the "Writers Reading" 
program by Dr. Don Bevins. 

This contest is open to any student 
in Pike and Floyd counties in one of 
the gradesmentionedabove, whether 
in public, private, or home school. 
Students wishing to enter should send 
one legible copy (handwritten or 
typed) or an original personal narra­
tive to Ernestine Meade, P.O. Box 
543, Betsy Layne, KY 41605. 

Deadline for entry is December 
15. Include name, address, and phone 
number on entry. 

Money for prizes to be awarded 
has been donated by East Kentucky 
Publishing and MF. Sohn Publica­
tions. For more information, call 
Ernestine Meade at (606) 478-9712 
or478-1820. 

Jobless rate 
drops in July 

In the Big Sandy region, the job­
less rate slid from a preliminary 8 
percent in June to a revised 7.3 per­
cent rate in July. Local rates ranged 
from 5.1 percent iD Johnson County 
to 10.8 percent in Magoffin County, 
tbe ooly cotmty in the ADD with a 
double-digit rate. 

Floyd County recooled a 6.8 per­
ceotrate. 

The monthly sample of claimants 
of unemployment insurance benefits 
showed 37 percent had worked in 
mining, 15.7 percent iD trade, 15.5 
percent in services and 12.2 percent 
in transportation, communications 
and utilities. 

I)() .,()U Live In 
r=~-4~1 

Call someone who can help. 
886-6025 or 1-80()-649-6605 

Big Sandy Family Abuse Cent•! 

3 million dollars worth of 
inventory to be moved •.. 

Savings up to $3,000_ 

We will trade for anything 
Push it, Pull it, Tow it 

Get it here and we'll trade 
TWO CONVENIENT LOCATIONS: 

LAYNE BROS. HONDA LAYNE BROS. HONDA 
US 23 & 460 Between 

Prestonsburg & Pikeville 
lvel, Ky. 

478-1234 or 886-1234 

North Mayo Trail · 
Pikeville, Ky. 
433-1234 

*7.99o/o A. P.R. financing available to qualified buyers 

NO GEMMICKS, NO FRILLS, JUST GOOD, HONEST DEALS! 

ANNOUNCEMENT 
The Law Office of 

Stumbo, Bowling 
& Barber 

IS PLEASED TO ANNOUNCE 
THE OPENING 

OF THEIR NEW LOCATION 
IN PRESTONSBURG 

We have moved 
our main office from Martin 

to 461 North Lake Drive, Prestonsburg 

Our new address is 
P.O. Box 511, Prestonsburg, KY 41653 

Our new phone number is 

886-1515 
and our toll-free number remains 1-800-248-1440 

Stumbo, Bowling & Barber maintains a general practice of 
law, including Workers Compensation, Social Security 
Disability, automobile accidents, wrongful death, divorce, real 
estate, deeds and wills. No appointment necessary. 

(This is an advertisement. Kentucky Law does not certify specialties of legal practice). 

Introducing 

f" 0 I I f r· 1 I 0 r..· '" 

Bath Gels, Beads, 
Lotions and Soaps. 

HOURS: 
10 a.m.-6 p.m. Mon.-Fri. 
10 a.m.-5 p.m. Saturday 

Call for after hours appointments 

886-1040 
301 N. Lake Drive 

Prestonsburg 
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Two things are bad for the heart-running 
up stairs and running down people. 

-Bernard M. Baruch 
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Liberty of thought is the life of the soul-Voltaire 

Follow the 
leaders 

by Scott Perry 

Prestonsburg is about to em­
bark on an uncharted journey 
into the land of ethics, a frontier 
where few political associations 
have gone before. 

Though they had little choice 
but to make this trip, it's impor­
tant that they decided to get an 
early start so they could get the 
bugs worked out before a Janu­
ary 1, 1995 deadline. 

Some branches of local gov­
ernment have yet to utter the 
word "ethics" in public, 1etalone 
start working on a code that is 
mandated by state law. 

A few, no doubt, will do as 
little about ethics as they can to 
get by, and as late in the game as 
they can manage. 

Prestonsburg's proposed eth­
ics code is pretty comprehen­
sive. 

It covers nepotism, conflicts 
of in tcrcst, financial disclosures 

and enforcement. .. things the 
code is supposed to address. 

That's good. 
It goes beyond the minimum 

requirements set down by state 
law, too. 

That's better. 
We've never believed, though, 

that ethics are things that can be 
legislated. 

You either have them or you 
don't. 

Public officials without any 
sense of moral responsibility 
aren't public servants, they're 
self-servants. 

While every government 
agency has its share of the latter, 
Prestonsburg's City Council is 
taking a pretty good stab at de­
veloping the kind of trust and 
accountability its public de­
serves. 

Others in the business of pub­
lic business should follow their 
lead. 

The sooner the better. 

A4 

-Letters to the editor----
Letters to the editor policy 

Letters to the Editor arc welcomed by the Floyd County Times. 
In accordance with our editorial page policy, all letters must include the signature, address and telephone 

number of the author. 
Letters must be received no later than 10 am. Tuesday for publication in Wednesday's issue and 10 a.m. 

Thursday for Friday's issue. 
Letters may be sent to Editor, The Floyd County Times, P.O. Box 391, Prestonsburg, KY 41653. 
Letters may be edited for clarity and length. 

Let's stand together 

Editor: 
Last week I was in Columbus, 

Ohio, visiting my sister, and when I 
saw those garbage trucks that said 
Rumpke, that made me sick. I used to 
work up there and how these Buck­
eyes made fun of us hillbillies. 

And I thought, "Well, bow would 
it be now?" They really have a right 
to. You poor hillbillies don't know 
enough to take care of a garbage bole, 
or can't be trusted with the collection 
or the money. 

Where are our own elected offi­
cials that said they would stand by 
and help us any time? The poor don't 
have a chance. At least we arc honest. 
We pay our taxes to you fat cats so 
you can give yourself a raise and 
educate your own children. You ought 
to stand up for the poor cause they 
have kept you many years and still 
are. 

I think people that don't have any 
children should pay school taxes. 
What do you think? I know our taxes 
will go up again this year. According 
to the Left Beaver news, they bad to 
hire guards at the Left Deaver town 
house. Isn't that a joke? Who does 
that belong to? Let's find out. You 
may be surprised. An old, poor, single 
person couldn't get in there, and I 
thought it was for the poor. It's just 
like everything else in Floyd County. 
It all goes to our fat cats. You can't 
even watch T.V. without some fat cat 
showing up on the screen, saying, "If 
you get injured, come and sec me and 
if you don't get anything, it won't 
cost you." 

Why don't they teit it just like it is, 
say, "Come see me if you've worked 
in the mines for thirty years, and if 
you get anything, we will do our best 
to take half of it and starve you to 
death in the meantime." 

My brother was eight months try· 
ing to get anything and !.hey wouldn't 
even give him a food stamp. And 
think of the taxes that he paid in. You 
fat cats ought to think about bow 
many of these poor people that have 
given you an education and now you 
are trying to rob them without a gun, 
like our garbage bill, wanting every-

one to pay three months in advance. 
What if they passed away? Would 
they get a refund? What a joke. 

Did you see what Mr. Perry said 
about 911? Looks as though we need 
it more every day. Maybe our state 
police can take care of us. I don't 
know what we would do without 
them. We really should stand up for 
them. 

A few weeks ago in the paper I 
saw where this little bald-headed fel­
low from New York made a few 
remarks about this little fellow from 
Somerset, Kentucky. I didn't appre­
ciate that one bit I believe, if I'm not 
mistaken, that fellow from New Y ark 
came here and was on county welfare 
for awhile (or state). At least be was 
our free lawyer, so you leave our little 
fellow from Somerset alone. He has 
some good things going for us poor 
people. He is one of our own. 

Thanks again to our Floyd County 
Times. They are wonderful people. 

Nora Martin 
Printer 

Slone letter 

Editor: 
Our 911 number went to join our 

long lost garbage bill we have been 
paying for all along and then was sent 
a double garbage bill to pay again. 

What do these county and city 
workers think we are, a bunch of 
fools? I'll tell you something, I'm not 
paying no more than I owe, $6.22 a 
month. You all can cater to politics. 
I'm not, or not give them my vote no 

more. I know someone who is so old 
and sick that one day he'll kick the 
bucket and slide right into bell on a 
banana peeling. You know who I'm 
talking about, old man. You are cor­
dially invited to Highland (Avenue) 
Freewill Baptist Church and we will 
pray for you in the meantime. Church 
is atll; Sunday scboolis at 10 o'clock 
each Sunday. 

We have got two good ministers, 
very best. 

County bonds are gone property 
taxes. Now I believe the blacktop 
went to harness races, and where is 
blacktop for school roads? Children 
will cover time, walkingmuddyroads. 
As usual, Jones said a big grant was 
supposed to fut streets up. Here in the 
streets I fell and busted my face and 
nose and chin and eyes on the broken 
pavement along the Floyd County 
TlDleS (building). Where is all the 
sewer system we were going to get? 
(And) drain pipe? The harness I3CeS 
got that, plus 62,846 aaes of laud 
where poor paid city taxes for race 
track land to use, was used. 

These were campaign promises I 
heard. People get a hold of your life. 

People, I'm angry now, but I'm 
going to pray a big long prayer to­
night. I know Goo will bear me. I 
always feel better afterwards. Every­
one is welcome to our church, High­
land (Avenue) Freewill Baptist 
Church. There's room for all. 

Bertha Slone 
Prestonsburg 

Got sontething to say? 
Say it with a 

Letter to the Editor 
in the 

Floyd County Times. 
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Ten Years Ago (September 5, 1984) 
Donald Ray Terry, 23,ofMartin, Jackie Bentley, 27, 

of Estill, and Worley Craft, 60, of Lackey, were killed 
as the result of a collision of their auto with a Floyd 
County school bus ... The murder charge against 43-
year-old Geraldine Jarrell, of Dana, was dismissed in 
Floyd Circuit Court...llighlands Plaza adds seven new 
stores to the shopping ccnter .. .Jenny Wiley's Grave 
sparks new interest, due to the poor condition of the 
neglected gravesite and suggestions have been made 
that the grave be moved to Floyd County ... There died: 
Lilly H. Tackett. 68, of Printer, Sunday in Mountain 
Manor Nursing Home in Pikeville; Cheryl J. Dye. 40, of 
Printer, Friday at her residence; Emma Hall, 68. of 
Teaberry, Saturday at McDowell Appalachian Regional 
Hospital; Jordan Hatfield, 80, ofWaterGap, August28, 
at Highlands Regional Medical Center; Henry Ratliff, 
67, of Hueysville, Friday at his home; Daisy Hall 
Mitchell, 73, of Deaver, Saturday at her home. 

Twenty Yellrs Ago (September 10, 1964) 
1beFloyd Circuit Court convened Tuesday morning 

in the second-lloor courtroom of the new courthouse for 
the ftrst time ... Floyd County's school population shows 
a loss Ill is ye;trof332 from last year's total, with 11,644 
pupils enrolled t11is year ... Low bidder on construction 
of the nursing and convalescent home proposed to be 
built on Colle gc Lane here is As tor Meade, Prestonsburg 
contractor ... The Floyd, Knott and Perry county pilot 
food stmnp program will continue to operate under 

~ existing regulations until furlhcr notice, Carl R. Hom. 
federal project supervisor, said lac;t week ... Bom: to Mr. 
and Mrs. Robert J. Spradlin, a daughter, I cslie Alpha, 
July 31 at Richmond, Ky.; to Mr. and Mrs. Richard E. 
Ray a son, Richard Edward, Augusl 24 at the 
Prestonsburg Gen rnl hospital .. There died: William 
Bruner, 80, of Garrett, Saturday at Our Lady of the Way 

Hospital, Martin; William (Preacher Bill) Woods, 76, 
of West Prestonsburg, Monday at the Prestonsburg 
General Hospital; Ambers Ousley, 60, Thursday at his 
borne at Langley; Hatler Rogers, 43, of Galveston, 
Saturday at the McDowell Appalachian Regional Hos­
pital; Newberry Hall, 79, of Topmost, Sunday at the 
Beaver Valley Hospital, Martin. 

Thirty Years Ago (September 4, 1974) 
The Floyd Circuit Court began its September crimi­

nal tennMondaymoming with fivemurdercaseson its 
docket and two others ready for grand jury 
action ... Thomas 0. Harris, head of the state Depart­
ment of Natural Resources and Envirorunental Protec­
tion, told coal operators in a meeting here recently they 
would do well to "load up" on stripmining permits 
before the bill now in Congress becomes law and 
imposes new federal requirements ... When the million­
dollar-plus development and improvement program is 
completed within the next year, the Harold Telephone 
Company will have 4,000 or more subscribers ... The 
McDowell Regional Medical Clinic will move into its 
new facility at the Appalachian Regional Hospital 
there, Friday of this week .. .Newspaper publisher Tom 
Gish said last Thursday, State Police had confmned the 
fire that struck the offices of his Mountain Eagle 
August 1 was started by an arsonist... There died: James 
Sammons, 63, of Wayland, Monday at U.K. Medical 
Center, Lexington; Willie Hall, 76, Monday at his 
home at Martin; Charles Crawford Mullins, 40, of 
Athens, 0 .. fonnerly of Waland, Friday; Spencer Lee 
Hurd, 45, of Ypsilanti, Mich., fonnerly of Prestonsburg, 
Wednesday, August 28; Kenas Tackett, 64, of Grethel, 
Friday at a Pikeville hospital. 

Forty Years Ago (September 9, 1954) 
Two pauents at Our Lady of the Way Hospital, 

Martin, were transferred this week to other hospitals, 
suspected as being sufferers from polio. Lawrence 
Keathley, veteran Martin theatre man, and his wife, 
Mrs. Virginia Keathley, completed the purchase 
Wednesday of the Prestonsburg Theatre Corporation 
Property on Lake Drive here, and on the same day began 
operation of the Strand 'Ibeatre ... Floyd is one of the 10 
worst counties in Kentucky in the matter of failing to 
collect taxes due the county and its schools, according 
to Hugh Morris in a Courier-Journal feature this 
week. .. Two raids by Sheriffs deputies in as many days 
on the American Legion Club at Garrett netted a quan­
tity of beer and whiskey and resulted in the arrest of the 
club's manager on each visit by the officers ... Born: to 
Assistant County Agent and Mrs. Ervine Joseph, a son, 
Stephen Clay, Sept. 4 at Prestonsburg General 
Hospital ... There died: D.P. Hamilton, 73, Wednesday 
at his home at Grethel; Mrs. Margaret Slone, 77, of 
Jack's Creek, Monday at Our Lady of the Way Hospital, 
Martin; Miss Edna Robinson, 68, oflli Hat, September 
1 at Our Lady of the Way Hospital, Martin. 

Fifty Years Ago (September 7, 1944) 
Hoyd county's milkweed crop will be harvested this 

year for the first time, it was said here this week. The 
floss will be used in the making of life jackets for 
members of the anned forces ... Pfc. Arthur Dixon, for­
merly of Wayland, has been awarded the Soldier's 
Medal for heroism in the southwest Pacific rescue of 
two crewmen of a submarine chaser .. .J. B. Tackett, of 
Big Mud Creek, wao; one of 1,300 American prisoners 
of war who last December made a mass break from a 
concentration camp, it was reported in The Times Ill is 
weck .. .'l11el·loydcounty casualty list: Dcad-Pfc.James 
I lorton, 24, of Garrett, killed in New Guinea; Pfc. Trudy 
Salisbury, 25. of Prestonshurg, died July 3 of wounds 
sustained in Fnmce, June 10; missing-T-Sgt. Gamis 

Martin, 21, Wheelwright. after air action over Yugo­
slavia; wounded-John D. Rice, EastPoint, Augu.st 15 
in France; Pvt. Richard Shepherd, David, August 17 in 
France; Pfc. Claude Hicks, West Garrett, July 7 in 
France ... Lee Howard, 44, of Prestonsburg, was killed 
Wednesday in Huntington, W. Va ... Born: to Lt and 
Mrs. Quentin Lockwood, September 2 at an Ashland 
hospital, a son; to Mr. and Mrs. James Donahoe, of 
Prestonsburg, September 1 at a Winchester hospital, a 
son-Michael; to Mr. and Mrs. Estill Howell, August 
18 at Spradlin Branch, near here, a son-Larry 
Estill... There died: Oliver Wooten, 45, fonnerly of this 
county, Tuesday of last week in a mine accident at 
Marrowbone Creek, Pike County. 

Sixty Years Ago (September 7, 1934) 
Demanding a thorough grand jury investigation of 

crime, Circuit J udgc Caudill Monday told a courtroom 
crowd that "Aoyd County has become the laughing 
stock of the state" ... W. B. Boyd has purchased the 
Unique Theatre here from T. II. Dingus ... Merlin C. 
(Butch) Turner, 33, was killed, and Estill Burchett. of 
Prestonsburg, was seriously hurt, Monday in an auto 
wreck near Wayne, West Virginia .. .JakeTurner,43, of 
Northern, died Monday of a self-inflicted bullet 
wound ... Paul B. Francis has announced plans to open 
a drygoods store in Paintsville ... Mrs. Mary Smith, 
about65, wa~ killed Tuesday when hit by a passenger 
train near her home at Colonial Hollow. near 
here ... Reprcsenting Floyd Post at the state American 
Legion meeting in Ashland last week were M. J. 
Meador, commander, W. S. Harkins, Jr., Earl Layne, 
W. G. Africa, George T. Roberts, Otto Fannin. Dick 
Roberts, Lon S. Moles, Dcmra Taylor. G. D. Ryan and 
Harry Ma;rs. 
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-Other Voices--
Parents + teachers = more 

successful children 
by Thomas C. Boysen 
Kentucky Commissioner of Edu­

cation 

As schools open each August, two 
Nonnan Rockwell-type memories 
emerge. One is of children running 
from their homes to catch a yellow 
bus. The other is of parents driving 
away from school while their chil­
dren skip toward the front door. 

For the children the feeling is an­
ticipauon. But for parents, it's the 
pang of separation. And too often, 
gradually and unintentionally, it be­
comes a sense of exclusion, with par­
ents feeling that they arc being barred 
from a critical part of their child's 
development. 

As we move forward in Kentucky 
with efforts to dramatically improve 
student performance, it becomes in­
creasingly apparent that including 
pare s as full partners in their 
children's learning presents a critical 
challenge. 

Kentucky's experience with 
school-based decision making pro­
vides some insight into the dimen­
sions of the challenge. School-based 
decision making, one of the key pro­
visions of the Kentucky Education 
Refonn Act of 1990, provided an 
unprecedented opportunity for par­
ent-school partnerships. W enow have 
1,500 parents in 750 schools-com­
pared to zero four years ago-help­
ing to make meaningful educational 
decisions. 

But progress has been slow. While 
the number of schools with school 
councils continues to increase 
steadily, 45 percent of Kentucky 
schools still exclude parents from 
formal decision-making. And in those 
witb councils, the percentage of par­
eots voting in elections has been small. 

Simple demographics tell another 
part of the story. Increasingly, the 
parent profile clashes with that of 
professional educators. 

In fact, educators tend to be over 
40, pareots under 30. Eighty percent 
of our teachers have masters degrees 
while 30 pm;ent of parents dropped 
out of high school and even fewer 
finisbed coUege. Wbile most educa­
un earn more than $30,000 a year, 
40 percent of parents have incomes 
below abe poverty line. 

Educators often explain low par­
ticipation by citing statistics about 
the growth of two-job families, single­
parent households and poverty. But 
parents say that schools, in various 
ways, make it hard for them to par­
ticipate. 

Whatever the reasons, parents and 
people who work in schools have 
grown increasingly remote from each 
other in recent decades. The quality 
of home-school relationships has de­
teriorated. 

It has also become apparent that 
reaching school reform's goal-dra­
matically improving student perfor­
mance-requires schools to work 
bard at strengthening both school­
home and parent-child relationships. 
We need parents' help and they need 
ours as all of us work together toward 
the common goal of responsible, high­
achieving youngsters. 

Fundamental questions need to be 
addressed: 

** How can schools support par­
ents as their children's first and mosl 
important teacher? 

**What is the best mechanism for 
parents and teachers to set and work 
toward common goals for a child's 
learning? 

** How can parents effectivelJ 
help with academic work? 

** How can schools engage all 
parents as partners? 

**How can schools make parents 
feel welcome at school? 

** Should schools initiate home 
visits, parent training and other ef­
forts? 

Fortunately, efforts are already 
underway this year in Kentucky. 
Many schools, local parent-teacher 
associations and other parent groups 
are working diligently to encourage 
parental participation. Their suc­
cesses and failures will serve as ex­
amples for other schools that are seek­
ing answers to these questions. 

In addition, the Prichard Commit­
tee is starting a program to foster 
conversations between teachers and 
parents while theDepartmentofEdu­
cation (with federal Goals 2000 as­
sistance) will give schools grants to 
develop and implement model parent 
engagement programs. 

The payoff will be more learning 
and better discipline, both at home 
and at school. The payoff, in short, is 
kids learning more. 

Addington Resources Inc. reports 
second quarter earnings of $1.5 million 

Addington Resources, Inc. 
(NASDAQ/NMS: ADDR), a waste 
management. coal mining and min­
ing technology company, last week 
reported it earned $1.5 million (10 
cents per share) on revenues of$35.5 
million, for the three months ending 
June 30, 1994. 

That compares with a loss of 
$8,000, or less than one cent per 
share, on $92.1 million in revenues 
for the second quarter of 1993, when 
Addington Resources was primarily 
a coal mining and marketing com­
pany. 111c company sold the bulk of 
its direct coal mining operations, coal 
reserves and coal supply contracts in 
January 1994. 

Per-share figures reflect 15.5 mil­
lion common shares outstanding in 
the second quarter of 1993, and 16.1 
million shares in 1994'ssecondquar­
ter. The company issued 148,673 
shares in May 1994 in conjunction 
with a landfill acquisition. 

Addington Resources Chairman 
Larry Addington said the company's 
downsized coal mining operations 
contributed $1.2 million in operating 
income during 1994's second quar­
ter, compared with $2.Y million in 
the year-ago quarter. 

Environmental revenues rose 52 
percent over 1993's second quarter 
to $8.9 million. Operating income 
rose sharply as well-a 64 percent 
increase to $1.6 million. 

Second quarter 1994 coal mining 
revenues and operating income were 

adversely affected due to the closure 
of one of the company's major mine 
operations, Job 17 in Pike County. 
Job 17 contributed to operating in­
comeduring thefirstquarterof1994. 
Addington said a new mine is ex­
pected to open during the third quar­
ter and eventually replace Job 17's 
production. 

The company sold 906,000 tons 
of coal in 1994'ssecondquarter,com­
pared with 2.8 million tons during the 
similar 1993 period. Coal operations 
during the second quarter of 1993 
generated $86 million in revenues 
and $2.9 million in operating income. 

A positive effect on profitability 
was the elimination of net interest 
expense, which totaled $3.5 million 
during 1993's second quarter. The 
proceeds from the January sale of 
Addington's coal operations were 
used to redeem $125 million in Se­
nior Secured Notes and repay other 
long-term debt. Interest income to­
taled$223,000in 1994's second quar­
ter. 

For the six -month period through 
June 30, 1994, the company earned 
$4.4 million (27 cents per share) on 
revenues of $75 million. 1bat com­
pares with a loss of $1.7 million (a 
loss of 11 cents per share) and rev­
enues of $174.7 million during the 
similar 1993 period. 

Addington Resources Inc. is traded 
on the NASDAQ National Market 
System under the symbol ADDR. 

· Weather Watch 
FRIDAY (TODAY): 
Partly sunny. High in the mid 70. 

SUNDAY AND MONDAY: 
Partly cloudy both days. High from 70-75 Sunday. Monday, high ncar 80. 
Lows around 55. 

Weather Watch provided 
by Jackson Weather Service 

The Floyd County Times J<'riday, September l, 1994 AS 

Fitness craze appears to be fizzling 
A survey by the National Sporting Goods Association found 9. 7 million fewer Americans 
were exercising regularly in 1993 than In 1991, especially men and those 55 or older. 

Frequent exerclsel'8 as a percent of the U.S. population 

Olerall figure By ge1der By age 
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t/1. Transmission 

t/2. Brakes, Tires, 
Tire Balance 

t/3. Shocks and 
Suspension 

t/4. Muffler and 
Exhaust System 

t/ S. Battery and 
Cables 

t/6. Filters and 
Belts 

t/1. Spark Plugs r--- ~~··''\\~ --.,... and Wires 

tis. Coolin!! System 

t/9. Windshield Wipers 
and Washers 
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1994 Camry LE Three to 
cho6se from, wine, black and 
deep blue, 4-door, 4 cyl., 
maroon, power windows and 
door locks, tilt and cruise, cas­
sette. 

1994 Toyota Corolla OX 
Whitewi(h blue interior, power 
windows and door locks, air, 
automatic, low miles. 

1993 Toyota Paseo Satin 
black metallic, 5-speed, air, 
cassette, sun roof, low miles, 
extra clean. 

1993 Toyota Paseo Ruby 
red, automatic, air, cassette, 
very low miles. 

1994 Toyota SRS 4-Runner 
Five to choose from, all low 
miles, V/6, automatic, power 
windows and door locks, tilt, 
cruise, AMIFM cassette, al­
loy wheels, remainder of fac­
tory warranty. 

1994 Toyota 4x4 Low, low 
miles, air, 5-speed. 

~ 

t/10. Heating and 
A;r Conditioning 

Cars 
1993 Toyota Tercels Pro­
gram cars, two to choose 
from, 4-door, air conditioned. 

1992 Toyota Corolla Almond 
beige, 4-door, air condition­
ing, one local owner. 

1992 Toyota Corolla OX 
4-door, white, air, auto., new 
tires, one local owner. 

1992 Toyota Camry LE 
Bicentennial edition, sunroof, 
spoiler, cassette, woodgrain 
dash. 

1990 Toyota Tercel 2-door, 
medium blue, A/C, automatic, 
52,000 miles, one local 
owner. 

1990 Toyota Corolla Red, 
automatic, air conditioned. 

1994 Nissan Sentra XE Dark 
blue, 4-door, air, automatic, 
power steering, cassette, only 
4, 700 miles! 

1993 Pontiac Grand Am SE 
2-door, green, V/6, powerwin­
dows and locks. 

1991 Oldsmobile Cutlass 
Supreme White with red In­
terior, power windows and 
locks, air, cassette, 31,000 
miles. 

1990 Honda Accord EX 
4-door, full power, auto., air, 
sunroof. 

1988 Toyota Celica ST 

1993 Nissan Sentra XE Locallyowned,A/C,5-speed. 

White, automatic, air, AM/FM 1985 Buick Regal 2-door, 
cassette, tilt wheel, cruise V/6, A/C, automatic, cassette, 
control. local owner. 

Trucks 
1994 Toyota 4x2 Green, air, 
cassette, aluminum "'iheels, 
1 ,000 miles. 

1993 Toyota 4x4 Midnight 
blue, air, cassette, bedliner, 
low miles. 

1993 Toyota4x4 Silver gray, 
4 cyl., 5-speed, air, bed liner, 
14,000 miles, like new. 

1993 Chevrolet Lumina 
APV Van 14,000 miles, V/6, 
power windows & locks, tilt & 
cruise, auto., anti-lock brakes 
(ABS) one-owner, like new, 
perfect for back-to-school! 

1993 Nissan Charcoal gray, 
14,000 miles, cassette, 5-
speed, like new. 

ARTE 
TOYOTA 

H 

1989 Chevy S-1 0 4.3 V/6, 
automatic, A/C, 40,000 miles, 
local owner, medium blue. 

1989 Toyota 4x4 62,000 
miles, one owner, 4-cyl.,5-
speed, A/C, aluminum 
wheels, sunroof, and more. 

South Lake Drive, Prestonsburg • 886-3861 • 1-800-489-3861 
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FESTIVAL EVENTS 1994 
e~.st41ttU 
Throughout Paintsville 

SATURDAY, SEPTEMBER 24 

?1t«4u tJH 7k SUuU 
Friday - Saturday 

Dog Show· JCHS Flaldhou11 
& Central Elementary Gym 

8:00a.m. · 8:00p.m. 

SUNDAY, SEPTEMBER 25 
Dog Show • JCHS Flaldhouaa 

& Central Elementary Gym 
8:00a.m. · 8.00 p.m. 

FRIDAY, SEPTEMBER 30 (Continued) 
Quill Block Contest Awarda 
School Actlvltl11 

10.00 am Courthou11 
Apple Art Awards 
Apple Penmanship Awarda 
Of'Fashlon Adding Match 
Of' Fashion Spelling Baa 

IN CONCERT 
5 • K Apple Run ·Third Street 

2:00p.m. 
Apple Baby Cont .. t 

PHS Gym 
Girl a· 3:00p.m. 
Soya· 4:00p.m. 

MONDAY, SEPTEMBER 26 
Mini • Prince & Prlnc .. a Contest 

5:00p.m. PHS Gym 
Prince & Prlnceu Conf .. t 

8:30p.m. PHS Gym 
Lillie MI .. Apple Blouom 

Pageant 
8:30 p.m. PHS Gym 

TUESDAY, SEPTEMBER 27 
Junior MI .. Appla Blo11om Pageant 

5:00p.m. JCHS Flaldhoull 
MI .. Apple Bloesom Pageant 

7:00 p.m. JCHS Flaldhouae 
Amu11mant Rld11 

WEDNESDAY, SEPTEMBER 28 
Little Apple Bowl 

1:00 p.m. Memorial Field 
Amuaamant Rldn 

Mayo Schoof · " Parada of Trad11" 
WSIP Chill Cooking Contest 

12 00 Noon· 4:00p.m. Main Street 
Tarrap!n Trot 

1:00 p.m. Our Lady oflha MI. School 
Clogging {Bring llwn Chalra) 

6:00p.m. to 10:30 p.m. 
Citizens Bank Lot Downtown 

Crank· II ·Up Stereo Competition 
Citizens Bank on Broadway 

Gospel Sing & Enlertalnmanl Featuring: The McKamey'• 
&The Casl/aa 
7:00p.m. \JCHS Fltldhouaa 

(/ 111 p (/ Apple Brawl •g4 Featuring: 
' v v ELC!.O mE. "_}Q Smoky MI. Wrea1flng. 8:00p.m. PHS Gym 

Count~! 

SATURDAY,OCTOBER1 
Arta & Crafta 

g;oo a.m. to 5:00p.m. 
Paintsville Grade School lot, 
First Baptlat Church lot & Collag• St. 

Flea Market 
City Parking Lot 

Marchant• Markel 
Court St. from 2nd to 3rd Streett 

Amul8ment Rld11 
Poataga Cancellation 

SATURDAY, OCTOBER 1st 

8:00p.m. 

Johnson Central 
High School Fieldhouse 

$1 0.00 General Admission 
$12.00, $14.00 & $15 Reserved 

Main Street Booth 
Auto Show. 

THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 211 VISIT THE MOBILE MUSEUM VANS 
Flea Market ·City Parking lot 
Amuaamant Rld11 ON SECOND STREET LITTLE TEXAS 
Grade School Folk Danca· Court Straat Antique, Corvette and StrNC Meehl net 

Raglatratlon TUI Noon g:oo a.m.· 2:00p.m. 
Apple Bowl 

1:00 p.m. Memorial Field 

FRIDAY, SEPTEMBER 30 
Art a & Craft a 

11:00 a.m. to g:oo p.m. 
Palntavllla Grade School lot, 

Citizens Bank· Broadw.y 
FESTIVAL AWARDS CEREMONIES 

10:00 a.m. Courthouee 

TRAIN RIDES Apple Auctlor~ 

First BapUat Church Lot & Collage Slrllt 
Flea Markel 

1 1:00 a.m. Courthouea 
ON COLLEGE STREET Auto Show Parada Run 

1:45 p.m. 
Apple Faatlval Parade 

2:00p.m. 
City Parking lot 

Marchanta Market 
Court Straat 

From 2nd to 3rd Straala 
Amuaamant Rldaa 
Poataga Cancallaflon 

Main Straal Booth 
01' Faahlon Coatuma Contaat 

11:00 a.m. Courthou11 

OFFICIAl. SOUVENIRS 
AVAILA8LE 

At Information Booth 
During The Festival 

.:.;. 

Country Mualc Show featuring: , 
LmLE TEXAS & MIKE MORRISON and 
tha SWINO SHIFT BAND 
1:00 p.m. JCHS Fleldhou11 

Downtown Square Danca 
11:00 p.IYI. 
Cltlzana Bank lot • Downtown 
(Bring Lawn Chalra) 

Above Schedule SubJect To Last-Minute Change• 

I FORMATION ON ANY VENT 
MAY BE OBTAINED BY SENDING A SELF-ADDRESSED ENVELOPE TO: 

MIKE MORRISON & 
THE SWING SHIFT BAND 

Tickets on sale at area businesses and 
financial institutions. KENTUCKY APPLE FESTIVAL 

OF JOHNSON COUNTY 
P.O. BOX 879 

PAINTSVILLE, KY. 41240 

What You've Been Looking f'or 
or write to P.O. Box 879 

Paintsville, Ky. 41240 
Make checks or money orders payable to 
Kentucky Apple Festival 

H. B. RICE AGENCY 
SU«:e 190K 

e Commercial Insurance e Auto • Homeowners 
• Personal Insurance e Mobile Home e Motorcycle 
• Workmans Compensation • Life • Health • Cancer 

THE ONE AGENCY To serve all your Insurance Needs 

347 Main St. e Paintsville 

KIDSEATFREEONFAMILYNIGHTI 
Every Wednesday, two kids cat 

free with each adult meal 
purchased. Other nights, kid;; 

under 5 eat froo with adult 
purchase at Soup, Salad & 

Fruit Dar. 
RegularKids'McalStart.sat$1.29 

•BOOTS•JEANS•COATS•HATS 
• HAT SHAPING • WESTERN WEAR 
• LEATHER WORK, AND MORE 

Robert L. Williamson, II 
Insurance Sales Executive 

789-4051 

221 Broadway • Paintsville 
789-7701 

• Tropical Birds 
• Small Animals 

STOP BY ONE OF OOR CONVENIENT LOCATIONS: 
Pikeville Paintsville 

432-0511 789-6335 

The Pawn Shop 
Large Selection of Guns, Jewelry and Much More! 

FANNIN'S 
Plumbing, Heating & 

Electrical Co., Inc. 
~

8
~~~ Rt~~ 432 Main Street 

~ Smart ffi Paintsville f":; ., ~ 

~- Call 789-3696 
for more information 

on the Electric Heat Pump 

Flowers ... 
Say It Best! 

~A:, 
'{jg 
S i.st-er .s fiori.st­

"Welcomes You To Apple County" 
249 Court St.· Paintsville 

After 5 p.m. call 789-2125 • 265-3200 

r--------------------, ~ J,. AND 
7J THE PURPLE 

/1 "8~ DINOSAUR 
tJ. U.S. 23 By-Pass • Paintsville 

789-6892 

~Bonus 20o/o off 
your most expensive regular prtce 

item with coupon. 
Expires September 5 

L--------------------~ 

FDIC 

COME JOIN US AT THE 
ARTS 'N CRAFTS 

FRIDAY, SEPTEMBER 
30TH AND SATURDAY 

OCTOBER 1ST 

Citizens C1P National 
Bank 
Patntsvollc KY 41240 Jil£ Phone 606 789 4001 
24-Hour Tetter 

• 

• 

• 

• 

• 

• 
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Labor Day holiday 
travel to reach 
10-year high, 
AAA says .. 

Americans are expected to close 
out the summer travel season with 
the heaviest Labor Day travel in ten 
years, according to AAA Blue Grass/ 
Kentucky. 

AAA estimates 33.3 million trav­
elers will vacation 100 miles or more 
from home, a 4 percent increase from 
last year. Almost 30 million will travel 
by motor vehicle. Another 3.8 mil­
lion are expected to travel by plane, 
train or bus, a 15 percent jump from 
the same time a year ago. The most 
popular Labor Day destination is a 
city, followed by the beach, town or 
rural area. 

'Mustang Lola' 
• lola Weddington of Pikeville, was the winner of a 1994 Mustang convert­

Ible given away last Saturday by the Kentucky Lottery. Weddington 
arrived at Downtown Ford In Louisville Thursday morning to pick-up the 
vehicle. Weddington won the Mustang In the lottery's Summer Fun 
contest, In which entrants sent In non-winning scratch-off tickets. (photo 
by Susan Allen} 

AAA' s most recent survey of ser­
vice stations nationwide shows the 
average price of self-serve regular 
unleaded is $1.198, the highest for a 
Labor Day holiday since 1990 and 
nearly a dime per gallon more than 
last year, AAA reports. 

Nationally, self-serve regular un­
leaded is 5.5 cents higher than last 
month. Locally, a survey of 40 Lex­
ington service stations found the av­
erage price is $1.117, while state­
wide, the average is $1.14. 

• 

Flood projects, road funds 
signed into law by Clinton 

President Bill Clinton has given Army Corps of Engineers, Appala­
fmal approval to nearly $75 million chian Regional Commission, Ten­
in funding for the 5th Congressional nessee Valley Authority, and other 
District by signing the 1995 Energy similargovemmentagenciesdealing 
and Water Development Appropria- with energy development and watez 
tions Act into law, Congressman Hal projects. 
Rogers announced Friday. 

The bill provides funding for the 

Festivals-
(Continued from page ooe) 

AAA reports 67 percent of sta­
tions will be open over the Labor Day 
holiday weekend and 34 percent will 
operate 24 hours. 

AAA Blue Grass/Kentucky is a 
not-for-profit motoring organization 
serving 122,000 members in Ken­
tucky, Virginia and West Virginia. 

• PinetopRamblecs,theBluegrassNew 
Edition, the Shepherd Family and 
Buddy Smith, and Beaver Creek 
Grass. 

Another attraction at the festival 
istheold-fasbionedentertainmentthat 
used to be found on the Fourth of 
July, such as pig-catching contests, 
greasy pole climbs, sack races and 
egg catching contests. 

The Squirrel Festival is celebrat­
ing its 15th year. It began as a family 
reuinion about 31 years ago for the 

e family of Virginia Slone and the late 
Helton Slone. As more people began 
going to the top of the mountain dur­
ing the reunion, the Slone family 
opened it to the public, and the Slone 
Mountain Squirrel Festival became 
an annual event. 

The festival is hosted by Ray and 
Kelly Slone, and is held on Slone 
Mountain at McDowell, on Route 
1086,justoffRoute680(theGarrett­
McDowell Road). 

Lunch is free at the festival, so 
come prepared to eat mountain cui­
sine. The menu includes roast pig, 

• roast beef, mutton, ribs, soup beans, 
sauerkraut, potatoes, and bread. 

Jerry's Husky 
ThQ large buttermilk pancakes served 
with maple syrup, two eiiS and choice 
of bacon or seasoned sausaie patties. 

Learn to Prepare 
Income Taxes 

H&R BLOCK 
INCOME TAX TRAINING SCHOOL 

0 CURRICULUM: During the 66-hour course, students will study all phases of income tax 
preparation including current laws, theory and application. 

0 H&R BLOCK KNOWS TAXES and how to teach them. Our instructors are experienced 
H&R Block personnel who make each session an exciting experience with discussion 
sessions, reference materials and instructions using regulation forms and schedules. 

0 THE TUITION COST IS LOW and covers the complete course, including textbooks, all 
materials, supplies, reference guides and registration. There are no extra charges. An 
installment payment plan is available if desired. 

0 GRADUATES WILL RECEIVE an H&R Block certificate of achievement as well as the 
opportunity to interview for employment with H&R Block. However, completion of the 
course does not guarantee employment. 

0 RJLL DETAILS ARE AS CLOSE AS YOUR TELEPHONE. Just call for complete 
information as to class locations, starting dates, tuition, etc. Act promptly as classroom 
space is limited. Early registration will ensure your place in the school. 

For More Information, Call: 

1-800-T AX-2000 
or call 886-3685 --------------------------------1 Please send me free H&R BLOCK I 

1 information about the H&R I 
1 BLOCK Income Tax Course Name I 
I I 
I MAIL TO: Address I 
I H&R BLOCK City State I 

• I 2A Richmond Plaza Zip Code I 
I Prestons ... ··rg, Ky. 41653 Phone I 

L--------------------------------~ 

GO UK WILDCATS! 
Big Blue Fans Can Cash-In On The U.K . 

Football Team's Success This Season With A 

SALYERSVILLE NATIONAL BANK 

It's the only one-year Certificate of Deposit that actually pays you for every Wildcat football 

victory during the 1994 season. With a Minimum deposit of$1 ,000 (FDIC Insured), you can 
be the proud owner of a Wildcat Touchdown CD. 

You can't loc;e!! Thr rate cannot fall... it can only rise with the touchdowns and wins of the 
University of Kentucky Wildcats' rootball Team. 

PRODUCT' rEATURES: 

The opportunity to e<~rn hettrr than market rates hy earning additional interest for every 

touchdown score, each win, bowl victory and national championship. Parlay Big Blue wins 
into Long Green earned hy your Wildcat TO CD. 
A high rate of interest for 365 days. 

Points A \varded 
.01% For every touchdown 
.05% For each (I lome) victory 
.10% For each (Away) victory 
.10% For bowl bid 
. IS% For howl victory 
1.0% For National Championship 

Rate will he ndjustcd each Monday following each game. 

Substantial penalty for early withdrawals. 

Salyersville National Bank 

Member F.D.I.C. 
nranch nank- 349-6121 Main Dank- 349-3131 

'• 

KENT-UCKY WINNERS! 
WINNERS! 

"AND THE WINNERS IRI~.~?}~; 

• LOLA WEDDINGTON, PIKEVILLE- 1994 CONVERTIBLE MUSTANG GT 
• TIM MORRIS, EVANSVILLE IN- HYDRA SPORTS FISH & SKI BOAT 
• ROGER AKERS, FLATWOODS- $5,000 CASH 
• JOAN CLARK, LOUISVILLE- VACATION TO LONDON/PARIS & $1,000 CASH 
• LARRY DAVENPORT, OWENSBORO- $5,000 GE SHOPPING SPREE 
• MillY EVANS, VERSAILLES- YAMAHA VIRAGO 535 SPECIAL MOTORCYCLE 
• WILLIAM OVINGTON, LOUISVILLE- 1994 TIGERSHARK MONTEGO JET SKI 
• FRANCES RUSSELL, LOUISVILLE- HOT SPRING PRODIGY HOT TUB 

CONGRATULATIONS TO THE 72 OTHER WEEKLY 
WINNERS AND THANK YOU FOR MAKING 
OUR KENTUCKY SUMMER FUN PROMOTION 
SUCH A SUCCESS! IT'S YOUR GAME! 

•tOTTER\£ 
I N S T A N T S 
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Community Calendar 
PRESTONSBURG, KENTUCKY 

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
South Lake Drive at Entrance to Jenny Wiley Park 

Editor's Note: As a service to the 
many clubs and conunittees that meet 
in our community, the Floyd County 
Times'CommunityCalendarwillpost 
meeting and public service announce­
ments. Anicles for the Community 
Calendar nwst be submitted in writ­
ing to the Times no later than 5 p.m. 
Monday for Wednesday's publica­
tionor 5 p.m. Wednesday for Friday's 
publication. These cannot be taken 
over the telephone. 

Special meeting 

at Wayland on 
September 13 

Wayland City Council bas called 
a special meeting for September 13 at 
5 p.m. at the Wayland Senior Citi­
zens Center. 

Tile council will open and review 
qualifying statements submitted by 
engineering fum.s interested in as­
sisting the city in planning, designing 
and construction of a wastewater 
treatment system. 

The regularly scheduled meeting 
of the Wayland City Council is Mon­
day, September 19. 

The meeting will begin at 5 p.m. 
and will be held at the Wayland Se­
nior Citizens Center. 

The meetings are open to the pub­
lic. 

Writen Reading 
to air September 4 & 5 

Writers Reading with host 
Ernestine Meade will air on WPRG 
TV-5 on Sunday, September 4, at 6 
p.m., and on Monday, September 5, 
at 11 a.m., with guest Darla Stacy. 

Parent election 
September 8 at PHS 

Due to a parent representative va­
cancy on the Prestonsburg High 
School Council, there wiJl be a parent 
election held in the gym at 7 p.m., 
September 8. All parents of PHS stu­
dents are urged to attend. 

Ifyouareinterestedinbeingnomi­
nated for the parent scat on the coun­
cil, or if you would like to nominate 
another parent, nominations may be 
brought to the principal's office in a 
sealed envelop labeled "Parent Nomi­
nation" until September 7, at 3:30 
p.m. 

DeeandPoUy 
HoweU reunion 

The Dee and Polly Howell re­
union will be held at Archer Park, 
Prestonsburg, on Saturday, Septem­
ber 10, all day. Call 377-6937 for 
more information. 

Oleika Shrinen to 
solicit contributions 

The "Red Fez" will identify those 
members of Oleika Shrine Temple 
who will be in the Allen, Garrett, and 
Harold communities soliciting con­
tributions for the support of the 
Sbriners' Hospital for Crippled Chil­
dren on Saturday, September 3. 

All contributions received will go 
to provide patient care for children in 
our area. 

When you see a Shriner, take one 
of his papers, and if you think what 
they are doing is worthwhile, make a 
contribution. 

Morrison reunion 
The 17th annual Morrison reunion 

will be held on Sunday, September 4, 
from 11 a.m. until ??? • at the picnic 

area behind the South Central Bell 
building on Lancer-Watergap Road, 
across the highway from Center 
Stage. 

Signs will be posted! All family 
and friends are welcome. Lots of 
food, family and fun! 

McDoweU School 
reunion-homecoming 

The KFWC Drift Womans Club 
invites all family and friends of 
McDowell School to dinner Septem­
ber3,atnoon,intheMcDowelllunch­
room. 

Bring a covered dish, vegetable 
salad or dessert, and then attend the 
memorial services for all the deceased 
graduates and teachers of McDowell 
school1934-1993. Roses will be pre­
sented in memory to the family. For 
more information, call 377-2296 or 
285-0221. 

Clark council to meet 
A meeting of the Clark Elemen­

tary school-based decision-making 
council will be held Wednesday, Sep­
tember 7, at 6 p.m., in the school 
library. All concerned parents and 
citizens are welcome. 

lAbor Day 
Weekend celebration 

There will be a Labor Day Week­
end celebration at Jenny Wiley State 
Resort Park, Prestonsburg, on Sep­
tember 2-4. Recreational and inter­
pretive activities daily. Square, folk 
and country line dancing on Friday, 
Saturday and Sunday. For more in­
formation, call (606) 886-2711. 

Rondal Hayes Day 

Obituaries 
•••• 1.' 

A special ceremony will be held 
on Saturday, September 3, at 6 p.m. 
at the Allen Central High School gym 
at Eastern, to present a proclamation 
by Gov. Brereton Jones proclaimillg 
Sunday, September 4, as Rondal 
Hayes Day in Kentucky . 

Phena Hamilton 
Phena Hamilton, 92, of Grethel, 

died Tuesday, August30, at St. John • s 
Nursing Home in Covington, follow­
ing a long illness. 

Born October 1, 1901 at Grethel, 
she was the daughter of the late 
Lawrence and Sally J. Hamilton Rob­
erts. She was a member of the Old 
Regular Baptist Church. She was pre­
ceded in death by her husband, Hiney 
H. Hamilton. 

Survivors include three sons, Wil­
liam F. Hamilton and Link Hamilton, 
both of Lexington, and Winford L. 
Hamilton of Greenfield, Indiana; 
three daughters, Georgia Mitchell of 
Grethel, Angie Gillam and Sbelia 
Hamilton, both of Lexington; one 
brother, Lee Roberts of Pikeville; 
one sister, Billie Mullins of Grethel; 
14 grandchildren, 16 great-grandchil­
dren and four great-great-grandchil­
dren. 

Funeral services will be Friday, 
September 2, at 1 p.m., at the Hall 
Funeral Home Chapel with the Regu­
lar Baptist Church ministers officiat­
ing. 

Burial will be in the Roberts Cem­
etery at Grethel under the direction of 
Hall Funeral Home. 

Serving as pallbearers will be u.e 
grandsons. 

Jean L. Auxier 
Jean L. Auxier, 94, of Lexington, 

died Sunday, August 28, at Veterans 
Administration Medical Center, Lex­
ington. 

Born October 13, 1899 in Pike 
County, be was the son of the late 
Nathaniel J. and Ollie Leslie Auxier. 
He was an attorney and veteran of the 
U.S. Army, World War I. He was a 
member of the First Presbyterian 
Church of Pikeville since 1913. He 
was a graduate of Centre College and 
College of Law, University of Vir­
ginia. He was a member of the Sons 
of the American Revolution, and 
Kentucky Bar Association. He was a 
former judge of Hazard, federal dis­
trict attorney for Eastern Kentucky 
and past president of Kentucky His­
torical Society. He was preceded in 
death by his f~rst wife, Sylvia Trent 
Auxier, on December4, 1967. 

Survivors include his wife, Patricia 
Preston Auxier, one son, Michael 
Trent Auxier of Emma; one sister, 
Marion Heibeck of Baton Rouge, 
Louisiana; three grandchildren and 
five great-grandchildren. 

Funeral services were Tuesday, 
August30, at 11:30 a.m., at the Perry 
A. Justice Memorial Funeral Home 
with the ministers Charles R. Elswick 
and Calvin Hickson officiating. 

Zada A. Shannon 
Zada A. Shannon, 83, of Drift, 

died Wednesday, August 31, at 
McDowell Appalachian Regional 
Hospital, following a long illness. 

Born July 8, 1911 in Lawrence 
County, she was the daughter of the 
late John Kenneth and Vigin Cyrus 
Artrip. She was lheoldestmemberof 
the Drift Pentecostal Church. She 
was preceded in death by her bus­
band, Earl Denver Shannon. 

Survivors includeoneson,Donald 
Ray Shannon of Drift; two daugh­
ters, Betty Sue Tackett and Sally Lou 
Tackett, both of Drift; two brothers, 
Lawrence Artrip of Drift and Carlos 
Artrip of Martin; two sisters, Mary 
Yates of Albion, Michigan, and Lassie 
Tackett of Drift; nine grandchildren, 
14 great-grandchildren and three 
great-great-grandchildren. 

Funeral services will be Friday, 
September 2, at 11 a.m., at the Drift 
Pentecostal Church with the clergy­
man Ted Shannon officiating. 

Burial will be in the Drift Cem­
etery under the direction of Hall Fu­
neral Home. 

Serving as pallbearers will be her 
nephews. 

Alice Clay 
Alicte Clay, 87, of Dwale, died 

Wednesday, August 31, at Highlands 
Regional Medical Center, Prestons­
burg, following an extended illness. 

Born August 14, 1907 at Dwale, 
she was the daughter of the late Jim 
and Rhoda Frazier Clifton. She was a 
member of the Little Dove United 
Baptist Church at Dwale. She was 
preceded in death by her husband, 
Odd Clay. 

Survivors include four sons, Tom 
Clay of Dwale, Charles Clay of Cin­
cinnati, Ohio, James "Red" Clay of 
Dwale and Vernon Clay of Ypsilanti, 
Michigan; three daughters, Phyllis 
Fields, VernieClayandRubyBailey, 
all of Dwale; one sister, Ethel 
Sherman of Ironton, Ohio; 20 grand­
children, 35 great-grandchildren and 
six great-great-grandchildren. 

Funeral services will be Saturday, 
September3,at 11 a.m., at the Nelson­
Frazier Funeral Home Chapel with 
burial in the Hoot Shepherd Cem­
etery at Dwale. 

ATIENDYOUR 
PLACE OF WORSHIP 

THIS WEEK 

Special singing and tributes from 
friends will mark the occasion. A 
reception will follow. The public is 
invited to attend. This event is part of 
the HueysvilleJBosco homecoming 
celebration on Labor Day weekend. 

MitcheU reunion 
The Mitchell reunion will be held 

Jehovah's Witnesses 
attend September 17 
Circuit Assembly 

The Prestonsburg Congregation 
of Jehovah's Wimesses will be at­
tending their annual Circuit Assem­
bly in Frankfort, September 17 and 
18. 

The biblical theme of the gather­
ing will be "Stay Awake, Stand Firm, 
Grow Mighty" based upon 1 
Corinthians 16:13. 

Bymeansoftalks, demonstrations, 
and experiences, the audience will be 
reminded of the constant need for 
spiritual self examination. 

The group will also be instructed 
in ways to improve their Christian 
qualities and conduct. Practical sug­
gestions on how individuals and fami­
lies can maintain a regular spiritual 
feeding program will also be dis­
cussed. 

The highlight of the Circuit As­
sembly will be the dedication talk, 
followed by baptism of those wbo 
qualify. 

The public address, "Wbatls Your 
Standing With God?" is scheduled to 
be delivered by Richard Morlan, a 
representative of the Watchtower 
Bible and Tract Society, beginning at 
1:30p.m. Sunday, September 18. 

Saturday, the session will be from 
9:50a.m. to 3:50p.m. Sunday, the 
program will start at 9:50 a.m. and 
end at3:35 p.m. The public is always 
welcome at any of the sessions, as 
well as the local meeting ofJ ehovah • s 
Witnesses. 

There is never an admission charge 
or a collection taken. 

Correction 
Funeral services for Heather Diane 

Webb, three-month-old infant of 
Bobby Edward Webb and Nancy 
Bowens, both of Water Gap, were 
officiated by Rev. Fred Garrett, not 
Lawrence Tackett. 

All friends and past members of The 
First Baptist Church of Martin are 

Burial was in the City Cemetery in · 
Pikeville. 

invited to our Second Homecoming 
on Sunday, September 11th, 1994 at Serving as pallbearers were Larry 

Webster, Johnny Cornette, Billy 
Elliott. Herbie Deskins, Randy Clark, 
Tim Trent, Gene B. Leslie, Frank 
McCoy and Randy Bartley. 

11:00 a.m. 
. :::. . <~:··.'.:·o·', . 

Sun. Bible Study-10 Lm. 
Worahip-10:45 Lm. 

6 p.m. Std. Time 
7 p.m. D.LS. Time 

Wed. Bible Study-7 p.m. 

RADIO 
WMDJ-Sun. 9 Lm. 

Sunday, September 4, at Allen Park 
shelter (at walking track, tum Teft at 
railroad track). Members are asked to 
bring a covered dish. 

We Welcome You and Your Bible Questions, 

9th annual 
Blackburn reunion 

Evangellat Bennie Blankenahip; Ph. 886-6223, 886-3379 

The 9th annual Blackburn reunion 
will be held on Sunday, September 4, 
at 11 a.m., at the home of Troy and 
Rite Blackburn on Clark Branch at 
Endicott. The dress theme for this 
year is Lhe 50s and 60s. Plenty of food 
and fun for everyone. All family and 
friends arc invited to attend. 

Card Of Thanks 

line dancing classes 
begin September 8 

Each Thursday, beginning Sep­
tember 8, line dancing classes will be 
held in the gymnasium atBetsy Layne 
High School. Classes will begin at 6 
p.m. and are taught by Prestonsburg 
Community College instructor Paul 
Thompson. To pre-enroll or for in­
formation, call thecenterat478-3389. 

We would like to extend our 
sincere thanks to the people of 
Floyd County for their generosity 
and support following the death 
of Emogene Moore. 

CHARLES-JIMMY­
JENNIFER MOORE 

Twin Eagle Flying 
Club annual picnic 

The Twin Eagle Flying Oub will 
have their annual picnic on Saturday, 
September 10 (rain date, Sunday, 
September 11), starting at 11 a.m., at 
the Pike County Airport. 

Bring only yourself, family and 
friends and enjoy the cookout and 
free airplane rides. For more infor­
mation, call the airport at 437-9548. 

Hunt£r family reunion 
inc Hunter family reunion will be 

held on Saturday, September 3, at the 
Allen Convention Center, from 10 
a.m. until ???. Bring all the good 
food! Games, fun, food, singing, 
white elephant auction and fun, fun, 
fun. Everyone welcome. For infor­
Jll2tion, call Polly Justiceat886-6462 
or Mertie Hunter at 285-3649. 

ARE YOU LOOKING FOR A CHURCH HOME? 

DO YOU HAVE QUESTIONS ABOUT GOD, RELIGION, 
THE BIBLE OR THE CHUCH? 

Neonaflll resuscitation coune 
A neonatal resuscitation course 

for physicians, nurses, respiratory 
therapy personnel and paramedics 
will be held on September 23 at 8 
a.m. at the Pikeville Methodist Hos­
pital 8th floor classroom. Call 437-
3525 for more information. 

St. Martha Catholic Church fnvitM you to 1 llries of MONDAY 
NIGHT QUESTION AND ANSWER SESSIONS. We will meet 
weekly, beginning SEPTEMBER 12, 1994. 

~TIME: 7:00 p.m. 

PLACE: St. Martha Church Parish Hall 

INFO: (606} 874-9526 

Pikeville College 
Community Education Dance Program 

presents its 

Fall 1994 Schedule of Classes 

Boys ages 7 & up 
Ballet 10~teen 
Beginning Pointe 
Ballet 6-8, Beg/Inter. 
Ballet 8-10, Beginning 
*Advanced Pointe 

Beginning Adult 
Pre~ Ballet 4-5 
Ballet 5-6 

*Beg/Inter. Children's Tap, 6 & up 
*Inter. Children's Tap, Level ll 
Inter. Children's Tap, Level~ 8-10 
Beginning Adult Tap 
Advanced Adult 
Boys ages 7 & up 

*Beginning Jazz, 7 & up 
Intermediate Children's Jazz, 10-teen 
Advanced Adult Jazz 
Teen Advanced Jazz 

Monday 
Monday 
MonJWed. 
Tuesday 
Tuesday 
Tuesday/ 
Thursday 
Wednesday 
Thursday 
Thursday 

Monday 
Monday 
Tuesday 
Wednesday 
Wednesday 
Monday 

Monday 
Tuesday 
Tuesday 
Thursday 

*These classes begin the week of September 15. 

6:00-6:45 p.m. 
6:00-7:00 p.m. 
7:00-8:30 p.m. 
5:15-6:15 p.m. 
5:15-6:15 p.m. 
7:00-8:30 p.m. 
6:30-8:00 p.m. 
6:00-7:00 p.m. 
5:00-5:45 p.m. 
5:45-6:30 p.m. 

4:30-5:15 p.m. 
5:15-6:00 p.m. 
4:30-5:15 p.m. 
6:00-7:00 p.m. 
5:30-6:30 p.m. 
6:00-6:45 p.m. 

5:15-6:00 p.m. 
4:30-5:15 p.m. 
6:00-7:00 p.m. 
4:30-5:30 p.m. 

Tuition at PikevilJe College for the Continuing Education Dance Classes fs based on the 
amount of time spent in the classroom per week. A class that meets 45 minutes per week 
is $7 5, and classes that meet one hour per week cost $125. Classes that meet twice a week 
cost $175. Many of the class times have been adjusted to allow students to participate in 
more than one form of dance. 

A 10 percent discount will be given ofT any additional classes after full payment of the 
first class. A second family member may also receive a 10 percent discount after full 

payment of first family member. 

REGISTRATION 
Due to the December production of the Nutcracker, all students are encouraged 

to preregister as soon as possible by contacting: Sadie Altman at (606) 432-9319 
or Claire Olson at (606) 437-4846. 

Please Note: A $10 nonrefundable deposit 
toward your tuition is required for registration. 

Give the gift of dance to someone special. 
Purchase a Pikeville College dance gift certificate. 

Registration deadline is September 20. Classes begin the week of September 6. 

The Community Education Program reserves the right to cancel or change the times of classes. 

• 

• 

• 

• 

• 



• 

• 

• 

• 

Auxier Freewill Baptist Church, 
Auxier; Swtday School, 9:45a.m.; Morn­
ing Worship, II :00 a.m.; Youth Meeting, 
5:00p.m.; Evening Worship, 6:00p.m., 
Thursday Prayer Meeting. 7:00 p.m.; 
Pastor. Bobby Joe Spencer; Assistant, 
Soutbie Fannin, Jr. 

Horn Chapel Methodist, Auxier Rd., 
Sunday School, 10 a.m.; Morning Wor­
ship, 11 a.m.: Pastor, John P. Salyer. 

ABBOTT 
The Father House, Big Branch, Abbott 
Creek; Sunday .School. 10.00; Worship, 
6:00p.m.; Pastor, J.J. Wright. 

AI.LEN 
Allen First Baptist Church, Allen; Sun­
day School, 10:00 a.m.; Worship, 11:00 
a.mi Evening Worship at 6 p.m.; Wed­
nesd:ly Night Prayer Meeting, 7 p.m.; 
Pastor, Rev. French Harmon. 

Christ United Methodist, Allen, Ky.; 
Sunday School, 9:45; Worship, 11 a.m.; 
Wednesday, 7 p.m., .Sunday Night, 7 
p.m.; Pastor, Kenneth Lemaster. 

BETSY LAYNE 
Calvary Southern Baptist Church, 
Betsy Layne; Sunday School, 9:45 a.m.; 
Morning Worship, 11 :00 a.m.; Evening 
Worship & Youth Meeting, 7:00p.m.; 
Wednesday prayer meeting and Bible 
study, 7:00p.m.; Pastor, Paul Grainger. 

Betsy Layne United Methodist Church, 
next to B.L. Gymnasium; Sunday School, 
10 a.m.; Morning Worship, i 1 a.m.; 
Wednesday Bible Study, 7 p.m.; Pastor, 
Garfield Potter. 
Betsy Layne Church of God, Old U.S. 
23; Sunday School, 10:00 a.m.; Morning 
Worship, 11:00 a.m.; Sunday Night Serv­
ice, 6:00p.m.; Wednesday Night family 
training hour. 7:00 p.m., Pastor, Judith 
Caudill. 
Betsy Layne Free Wlll Baptist Church; 
SUDday School, 10.00 a.m.; Morning 
Wonhip, 11:00 a.m.: Sunday Evening 
Wonhip, 6:00p.m.; Wed. Night Prayer 
cl Youth Services, 7:00 p.m.; Pastor, 
Tracy Patton. 

BLUE RIVER 
Middle Creek Baptist Church, Blue 
River; Sunday School, 10 a.m.; Sunday 
Morning Worship, 11 a.m.; Sunday Eve­
ning Worship, 6 p.m.; Wednesday Serv­
ice, 7:00p.m.; Pastor, Vernon Slone. 

BONANZA 
Bonanza Freewill Baptist, Abbott Creek 
Road; Sunday School, 10:00 a.m.; Sun­
day Morning Worship Service, 11:00 
a.m.;WednesdayBibleStudy, 7:00p.m.; 
Pastor, Herb Anns. 

CORN:FORK 
Brandy Keg Freewlll Baptist, Com 
Fork; Sunday School, 10 a.m.; Suuday 
Night. 6 p.m.; Prayer Meeting and Youth, 
Wednesday, 7 p.m.; Pastor, Darrell 
Howell. 

COW CREEK 
Cow Creek Freewill Baptist, Cow 
Creek; Sunday School, 10 a.m.-11 a.m.; 
Sunday Evening, 6 p.m., 7:30p.m.; 3rd 
Sunday Worship Service, 11:00 a.m. to 
12 noon; Prayer Meeting and Youth 
Group, Wednesday, 7:00 p.m.-8:00p.m.; 
Pastor, Nathon Lafferty. 

Sammy Clark Branch Freewill Baptist 
Church, Dana; Sunday School, 10:00 
a.m.; Church, 11:00 a.m.; Sunday Night 
Service, 6:00p.m.; Youth Meeting Sun­
day, 6:00p.m.; Wednesday Night Prayer 
Meeting, 7:00p.m.; Pastor, Mike Ham-
mond. DAVID 

Goodloe Pentecostal Church, Rt. 850, 
David, Ky.; Sunday Night, 7 p.m.; Fourth 
Saturday Night, 7:00p.m.; Pastor, Warnie 
Allen. 

DRIFT 
Drift Pentecostal Church, Drift; Sun­
day School, 10:00 a.m.; Wednesday 
Night, 7:00p.m.; Worship Service, Sat­
urday and Sunday Night, 7:00p.m.; Pas­
tor, Ted Shannon. 

Drift Freewill Baptist Church, Drift; 
Prayer Service, 6:30 p.m., Thursday; 
Sunday School, 10 a.m.: Sunday Church 
Service, 6:30p.m.; Pastor, Randy Turner. 
Drift Presbyterian Church, Route 1101. 
Drift; Sunday Services, I 1:00 a.m.; Part­
time minister, Mary Alice Murray. 

DENVER 
Liberty Baptist Church, Denver; Sun­
day School, 10 a.m.; Morning Worship, 
11 a.m.; Evening Service, 6 p.m.; Wed­
nesday Night Bible Study, 6 p.m.; Pastor 
Merle Little. 

EASTPOINT 
Free Pentecostal Church of God. East 
Point, Rt. 1428; Sunday School, 10:00; 
Sunday Service, 11 :00; Sunday Night, 
6:30; Thursday Night, 6:30; Pastor,Buster 
Hayton. 

EMMA 
Emma United Methodist, Emma, Ky.; 
Sunday School, I 0:00 a.m.;Sunday Morn­
ing Worship, 11:00; Sunday Night, 6:30 
p.m.; Wednesday, 6:30 p.m.; Jack 
Howard, Pastor. 

ESTILL 
Martin Branch Freewill Baptist, Estill; 
Sunday School, 10 a.m.; Services, 11:15 
a.m., Sunday Night, 7:00p.m.; Wednes­
day, 7:00p.m.; Pastor, Wayne Stevens. 

GARRETT 
Rock Fork Regular Baptist Church, 
Garrett; 4th Saturday and Sunday of each 
month at 9.30 a.m.; 4th Saturday evening 
at5:30 p.m.; Moderator, Elder Earl Slone; 
Assistant Moderator, Elder Jerry Manns. 
Rock Fork Freewill Baptist, Garrett, 
Ky.; Sunday School, 10 a.m.; Sunday 
Worship, 11 a.m.; Prayer Meeting, 
Wednesday, 7 p~.; Pastor, Elder Brodey 
Amburgey. 
First Baptist Church, Garrett; Sunday 
School, 10 a.m.; Morning Worship, 11 
a.m.; Evening Worship, 6 p.m.; Bible 
Study, 7:00 p.m., Wednesday: Pastor, 
Randy Osborne. 
Garrett Church of God, Garrett; Sun­
day School, 10:00 a.m.; Worship Serv­
ice, 11:00 a.m. and 7:00p.m.; Wednes­
day at 7:00p.m.; Pastor, Donald Bragg. 

GOBLE ROBERTS ADDITION 
Landmark Church of God, Goble Rob­
erts Addition; Sunday School, 10:00 a.m.; 
Morning Worship, 11:10 a.m.; Sunday 
Night, 7:00p.m.; Wednesday Night, 7:00 
p.m.; Pastor, Kenneth E. Prater, Jr. 

CARTER 
HuGHES 

South Lake Drive, Prestonsburg • 886-3861 •1-8()0...489-3861 

Mike Sloane's 

PIC PAC 
Martin, Kentucky 

Church Directory 
Community Freewill Baptist, Goble MAYTOWN . 
RoberL~; Sunday School, 10 a.m.; Morn- Maytown First Baptist Church, Mam 
ing Service, 11:00 a.m.; Wednesday Street; Sunday School,lO:OOa.m.; Morn­
Prayer Meeting, 7 p.m.; 4th Saturday ing Worship, 11:00 a.m.; Sunday Eve­
Night, Regular Service & Business, 6:00 ningService, 6:00p.m.; Wednesday Eve­
p.m.; Sunday Night Service, 6:00p.m.; ning Dible Study at 7:00 p.m.; Pastor, 
Pastor, Elder Jack DeRossett Bob Varney. 

GRETHEL 
Grethel Baptist Church, State Route 
3379, (Branham' sCreekRoad), telephone 
587-2043; Sunday School, 10:00 a.m.; 
Morning Worship, 11:00 a.m.; Youth 
Meeting, 5:30 p.m.; Evening Services, 
6:30p.m.; Wednesday, Prayer Meeting 
and Bible Study, 7:00p.m.; Pastor, David 
L. Givens. 

MIDDU: CREJ.:K 
Spurlock Bible Church, Spurlock Fork 
of Middle Creek, Prestonsburg; Sunday 
School. 10 a.m.; Morning Worship, ll 
a.m.; Evening Service, 6 p.m.; Wednes­
day Prayer Service, 7 p.m.; Pastor, Rev. 
Dan Heintzelman. 

But of that day and that 1wur knoweth no 
man, no, not the angels which are in heaven, 
neither the son, but the Father. 

Take ye heed, watch and pray: for ye know 
not when the time is. 

HI HAT 
Tbe Chun:h of God of Prophecy at Hi 
Hat, invites you to worship with us each 
week. Sunday School, 10 a.m.; Sunday 
Morning Worship Service, 11 a.m.; Sun­
day Evening Worship Service, 7 p.m.; 
Wednesday Service, 7 p.m.; Wednesday 
night is family night! Everyone welcome! 
Pastor, Don Fraley, Jr. 

IVEL 
Tom's Creek Freewlll Baptist, U.S. 23, 
first exit (north of Layne Brothers); Sun­
day School, 10 a.m.; Morning Worship, 
11 a.m.; Evening Service, 6 p.m.; Wed­
nesday Prayer Meeting, 7 p.m.; Pastor, 
Chuck Ferguson. 

LANCER 
Lancer Baptist Church, Lancer, wel­
comes you to the services. Sunday School, 
10:00 a.m.; Sunday Morning Worship, 
11:00 a.m.; Sunday Evening Worship, 
6:00 p.m.; Wednesday Evening Bible 
Study, 7:00p.m.; Pastor, Tom Biddle. 

Trimble Chapel Free Will Baptist, 
Water Gap-Lancer; Sunday Service, 10 
a.m.; Morning Service, 11 a.m.; Nightly 
Service, 7:00; 4 Saturdays each month; 
Pastor Joe Coleman. 
Pleasant Home Baptist Church, Lancer, 
Watergap Road; Sunday School, 10 a.m.; 
Morning Service, 11 a.m.; Sunday Eve­
ning Service, 7 p.m.; Sunday Youth Meet­
ing, 7 p.m.; Wednesday Evening Service, 
7 p.m.; Wednesday programs available 
for children; Pastor, Mark Tackett. 

LANGLEY 
Maytown United Methodist Church, 
Langley; Morning Worship, 9:30a.m.; 
Sunday School, 11 a.m.; Youth Sunday, 
5:00 p.m.; Sunday Night, 6 p.m.; Wed­
nesday Night, 6 p.m.; Pastor, Troy Poff. 

MARTIN 
Stephens Branch Missionary Baptist 
Church, Stephens Branch; Sunday 
School, 10:00 a.m.; Sunday Worship, 
11:00 a.m.; Mid-Week Bible Study, 
Wednesday, 6:00p.m. 

Tbe Church of Jesus Christ of Latter 
Day Saints, Rt. 80, Martin; Sunday 
School, I 0:30a.m., ~eliefSociety/Priest­
hood, 9:30a.m.; Sacr. mentService,11 :20 
a.m. 
First Assembly of God, Martin; Sunday 
School, lOa.m.;MorningWorship, 11:00 
a.m.; Sunday Night Service, 6 p.m.; 
WednesdayPrayer&BibleStudy, ?p.m .. ; 
Missionettes & Royal Rangers, 7 p.m.; 
Pastor, Lorie Vannucci. 
Faith Bible Church, Martin; Sunday 
School, 10 a.m.; Morning Worship, 11 
a.m.; Sunday Evening, 6 p.m.; Wednes­
day Evening, 6 p.m.; Independent Funda­
mental Baptist; Pastor, Don Crisp. 

Martin Freewill Baptist Church, Mar­
tin, Ky.; Sunday School, 10 a.m.; Wor-
ship Service, 11 a.m.; Evening Service, 6 
p.m.; Dible Study, Wednesday, 6 p.m.; 
Youth League. Tuesday, 6 p.m.; Pastor, 
Elder Bobby Baldridge. 

First Baptist Church, Martin, Ky.; Bible 
Study, 10:00, Worship. 11:00; Evening 
Worship, 6:00: Mid Week, 7:00; Pastor, 

St. Mark 13:32, 33 

MOUNTAIN PARKWAY 
Free Pentecostal Deliverance Church, 
Rt. 114, East Mt. Parkway. Saturday and 
Sunday, 7:00 p.m.; Pastor, Patricia 
Crider. PRATER CREEK 
Prater Creek Baptist Church, Prater 
Creek; Sunday School. 10:00; Sunday 
Morning, 11:00; Sunday Evening, 7:00; 
Wednesday Prayer Meeting, 7 :00; Pastor, 

Gary FishPRESTONSBURG 

Seventh-Day Adventist, 5 miles West 
on Mountain Parkway; Sabbath School, 
9: 15; ChurchService,l0:30; Pastor, Mike 
Foraker, 886-3459. 

Faith Christian Assembly of God, 431 
South Lake Drive, Prestonsburg; Sunday 
School, 10:00 a.m.; MQrning Worship, 
11:00 a.m.; Evening Worship, 6 p.m.; 
Wednesday Prayer and Bible Study, 7 
p.m.; Pastor, Doug Lates. 
St. Martha Church, Water Gap; Masses, 
Saturday. 7 p.m.; Sunday, 11 a.m.; Reli­
gious Education Classes, Sunday, 9:45-
10:45a.m.; Adult Class, Wednesday, 7:30 
p.m.; Rev. David Powers. 

Communlty United Methodist Church, 
710 Burke Ave., Prestonsburg; Morning 
Fellowship Service, 9:30 a.m.; Sunday 
School, 10:00 a.m.~ Morning Worship, 
10:45 a.m.; Evening Worship, 6 p.m.; 
Wednesday Worship, 7 p.m.; Pastor, 
Raymond E. Snider Jr. 

Morning Star Ministries Full Gospel 
Church, Rt. 1428 (Old Rt. 23), between 
Allen and Prestonsburg; Sunday School, 
10:00 a.m.; Sunday Morning Worship, 
11:00 a.m.; Thursday, 7:00p.m.; Pastor, 
Hamilton. 

The Third A venue Freewill BaptJst 
Church, Prestonsburg; Sunday School, 
10:00; Morning Worship, 11 :00; Eve­
ning Worship, 6:00; Wednesday Prayer 
Meeting, 7:00; Pastor, Clinton (Buddy) 
Jones. 
First Christian Church, 429 North 
Arnold Avenue, Prestonsburg; Sunday: 
Bible study, 10:00 a.m.; Morning Wor­
ship, 11:00 a.m.; Evening Worship, 7:00 
p.m.; Wednesday: MidweekBibleStudy, 
7:00p.m.; Evangelist, Handel Adams. 

HlghlaDd A veDue Freewill Baptist 
Church; Sunday School, 10:00 a.m.; 
Sunday Morning Worship, 11:00 a.m.; 
Sunday Evening Worship, 6:00 p.m.; 
Wednesday Evening Bible Study, 7:00 
p.m.; Pastor, David Garrett. 

First Baptist Church, (Irene Cole Me­
morial), 27 S. First A venue, Prestons­
burg; Sunday School, 9:30 a.m.; Morn­
ing Worship, 10:50 a.m.; Evening Wor­
ship, 6:00p.m.; Wednesday night, 7 pm.; 
Bible Study &Prayer Meeting, 7:00p.m.; 
Interim Pastor, Quentin Lockwood. 

Praise Assembly, 1 mile North of 
Prestonsburg, Old U.S. 23; Sunday 
School, 10 a.m.; Praise & Worship, 11 
a.m.; Prayer & Bible Study, 6:30p.m.; 
Sunday evening services, 6:30 p.m.; 
Wednesday Prayer & Bible Study, 6:30 
p.m.; Pastor, Calvin Hickson. 

Russ Taylor. 

"Our people make the difference" JesusChrlo;tChurchofGod,Arkansas 
Creek, Martin: Friday, 7 p.m.; Sunday 

Katy Friend Io'reewUI Baptist Church, 
located two miles up Abbott; Sunday 
School, 10 a.m.: Morning Worship, 11 
a.m.; Evening Worship. 6 p.m.; Wed. 
Bible Study, 7 p.m.; Pastor, Van West. 

First Presbyterian, North Lake Drive, 
Prestonsburg; Sunday School, 9:30a.m.; 
MorningWorship,11 a.m.; Interim Pastor, 
Rev. Richard Guerrant. 

PRESTONSBURG VILLAGE Morning, 11 a.m.; Deacon, Harry Conn. 

886-6 681 
Martin Church of Christ, Martin; Sun-
day School, 10 a.m.; Sunday Morning 

'===========================C Worship, 11 a.m.; Evening, 7 p.m.; .li Wednesday Bible Study, 7 p.m.; Wed-

4{~-M'Y(»JU 
FURNITURE 

nesday Youth Group, 7 p.m.; Evangelist, 
Gary Mitchell. 
Martin Methodist Church; Sunday 
School. 10:00; Morning Worship, 11:00; 
Wednesday Night Bible Study, 7:00; 
Pastor, Roy Harlow. 

First United Methodist Church, 60 S . 
Arnold Ave., Prestonsburg; Sunday 
School, 1 0:00; Morning Worship, 11 :00; 
Evening Worship, 7:00; Wed. Prayer 
Meeting, 7:00; Sun., WPRT AM. 11:00; 
Radio Broadcast WXKZ 105.5 FM; Pas­
tor, Russell Holland. 

Prestonsburg Village 
886-8668 

These area businesses urge you 
to attend your place of worship 
this week! 

Victory Christian Ministries Church, 
1428 E., Prestonsburg; Sunday Worship, 
11 a.m.; Sunday School, 11:30 a.m.; 
Wednesday Night, 7 p.m.; Pastor, Sherm 
Williams. 

Parkway Baptist, Mt. Parkway; Sun. 
School,10a.m.; MorningWorship,11:00 
a.m.; Evening Service, 6:00p.m.; Wed­
nesday Prayer Service, 7:00p.m.; Pastor 
Ed Taylor. 

Church or Christ, South Lake Drive; 
Sunday, 10 a.m.; Sunday Evening, 6:00 
p.m.; Wednesday Evening, 7:00 p.m.: 
Evangelist, Benny Blankenship. 
St. James Episcopal, University Drive, 
Prestonsburg, Ky.; Sunday Worship, 11 
a.m.; luncheons immediately following 
services. 

Free Pentecostal Church of God, 
Weeksbury; Wednesday. 7:00p.m.; Sat­
urday. 7:00 p.m.; Sunday, 7:00 p.m.; 
Sunday School, 10:00 a.m.; Pastor, John 
'"Jay" Patton. 

Weeksbury Church of Christ; Sunday, 
10 a.m.; Sunday Worship, 10:45 a.m.; 
Sunday Evening. 6:00p.m.; Pastor, Mike 
II all. 

WHEELWRIGHT 
Wheelwright United Methodist 
Church, Wheelwright; Sunday School, 
10:00 a.m.; Worship, 11 :00; Evening 
Service, 6:00p.m.; Wednesday, 7:00ser­
vices; Pastor, Bobby Isaac. 

Wheelwright Church or God; Sunday 
School Services, 10:00 a.m.; Sunday 

PrestonsburgCommunltyCollegeBap· Morning Services, 11:00 a.m.; Sunday 
tlst Student Union; meets every Wed- Night Services, 7:00 p.m.; Thursday 
nesday, 11:30-12:30 in 1102. Lunch, dis- Night Services, 7 ;00 p.m.; Pastor, Donald 
cussion. travel available to all students, R. Cox. 

faculty and staff. French B. Harmon, Di- Wheelwright Freewill Baptist, Wheel­
~ctor; E~a C. Goble, presiden. For more wright junction; Sunday School, 10 a.m.; 
mformauon, call: 874-9468 or478-2978 .. Morning Worship,11 a.m.; Evening Wor­
First Church of God, Prestonsb~rg; ship, 7 p.m.: Wednesday evening wor­
Sunda_y school, 10 a.m.;. Mormng ship, 1 p.m.; Pastor, Louis Ferrari. 
Worshlp,l0:4~; Sunday Evemng, 6 P-~·; Free Pentecostal Holiness Church, Rt. 
~ednesday Bible Study, 7 ~.m.; ~ds 122, Upper Burton; Wednesday Wor-
Btble Club, 7 p.m.; Pastor Kevm Collms. hi 1 S d S h 1 10 30 

PAINTSVILLE 
Our Savior Lutheran Church, Sipp 
Bayes Room Carraige House Motel, 
Paintsville; Sunday School, 11:00 a.m.; 
WKLW (600 a.m.) "Chapel Window", 
12:05 p.m. every Sunday; Pastor Rev. 
Rolland Bentrup. 

PRINTER 
Salisbury United Methodist Church, 
Printer; Sunday School,10:00 a.m.; Wor­
ship, 11:00; Evening Service, 7:00p.m.; 
Wednesday Services, 7:00p.m.; Pastor, 
Bobby G. Lawson. 

Old Time Baptist Church, Printer; 
services 2nd and 4th Saturday night at 
7:00p.m. Sunday mornings, 11:00 a.m.; 
Wednesday night at 7:00p.m. Everyone 
welcome. Pastor, Farley Howard. 

SALYERSVILLE 
Bethel Assembly of God, behind the 
Salyersville courthouse; nursery pro­
vided; Sunday School, 10 a.m.; Sunday 
Worship, 11 a.m.; Sunday Evening, 6 
p.m.; Thursday Evening, 7 p.m.; Pastor, 
Arthur (Sam) Smith. 

St.LukeCathoUcMisslonCenter, 1221 
Parkway Drive, Salyersville, Kentucky 
41465; Saturday, 4 p.m.; Sunday. 9 a.m.: 
Wednesday, 6:30p.m.; Rev. David Pow­
ers; Pastoral Associate, Sr. Mary Cathe­
rine. 

WAYLAND 
Zion Deliverance Church, Wayland; 
Sunday School, 11 a.m.; Evening Wor­
ship, 7 p.m.; Wednesday Prayer Service, 
7 p.m.; Saturday Evening Worship, 7 
p.m.; Pastor, Ada Mosley. 

Wayland United Methbodlst Church, 
Wayland; Sunday School, 10a.m.; Morn­
ing Worship, 11 a.m.; Bible Study, 
Wednesday, 10:00 a.m.; Youth Meet­
ings, Sunday, 4:00p.m., (ages 11 & up); 
Wednesday, 6:00p.m., (ages 10 & un­
der); Pastor, Troy Poff. 

s p, p.m.; un ay c oo, : a.m.; 
Sunday Morning Worship, 11:30 a.m.; 
Sunday Evening, 7 p.m.; Pastor, Donnie 
Hamby. 

Lighthouse Temple, Hall Hollow, 
Wheelwright, Kentucky; Sunday Serv­
ices, 11:00 a.m. and 7:00p.m.; Wednes­
day and Friday Services, 7:00; Pastor, 
Roy Cosby. 

WEST PRESTONSBURG 
Fitzpatrick First Baptist Church, P.O. 
Box 184, West Prestonsburg, (across from 
Clark Elem. School); Sunday School, 
lO:OOa.m.;Moming Worship,Il:OOa.m.; 
Sunday Evening, 6:00p.m.; Wednesday, 
7:00p.m.; Pastor, Stephen Whitaker. 
Faith Deliverance Tabernacle, West 
Prestonsburg; Sunday School, 10:30 a.m.; 
Thursday. 7:00p.m.; Pastor, Don Shep­
herd. 

First Assembly of God, West Prestons­
burg; Sunday School, 10 a.m.; Worship, 
11 a.m.; Sunday Evening, 6 p.m.; Wed­
nesday night, Bible Study and Youth 
Power Hour: nursery provided; Pastor, 
Ji\n Nabors. 
The Church or God or Prophecy, West 
Prestonsburg; Sunday School, 10 a.m.; 
MorningWorship,11 a.m.;SundayNight, 
6 p.m.; Wednesday night, 7 p.m.: Pastor, 
Arner B. Whitaker. 
Free United Baptist Church, West 
Prestonsburg; Sunday School, 10 a.m.; 
Morning Worship, 11 a.m.; Sunday Eve­
ning Worship, 6:30p.m.: Midweek Prayer 
Service, 6:30pm.; Pastor, Willis Adkins. 

Nelson-Frazier 
Funeral Home 

285-5155 
Owned & operated by: 

Roger Nelson & Glenn 0. Frazier 

2565 South Lake Drive 
Prestonsburg 

• • • • • • • • • • 

886-2291 

LAYNE BROS. 
• Ford • Lincoln • Mercury • Hon~a 

• Ford Trucks 
Located between Prestonsburg and Pikeville 

478-1234 •lvel, Ky. • 886-1234 
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Pepsi 
6 pack 

34 

Sling Chair 

Now 

Stk 17874236850 
Reg. $11.84 

$ 50 

Wai-Mart 

Paper Towels 

¢ 
2 pack 

Stk #787 4200002 Reg. 92¢ 

Square Smoker 

Now 

Stk 12856480083 
Reg. $29.96 

Kordite 

Foam Plates 

50 
50 Ct. Reg. $1.17 each 

Sling Lounger 

Now 

Stk 17874223849 
Reg. $13.84 

Rubbermaid 

Combo Cooler 
Reynolds Wrap 

Reg.$19.96,Now $ 00 

------::1 Foam Cups 

12-oz., Now 

Stk 17129000504 
Reg.94¢ 

¢ 

Stk #1090000018 Reg. $4.27 

Moores 
Potato Chips 

10-oz. bag 

¢ 

$ 97 
200ft., Now 

Kingsford 
Charcoal 

Stk 14460071160 
Reg. $3.24 

~$ 00 
10-lb. bag, Now 

• 

• 

• 

• 

• 

• 

• 



• 
Mobile dental hygiene program coming 
to Prestonsburg Community College 

Aoyd County studems will soon 
have the option of enrolling in a new 
educational program at Prestonsburg 
Community College. PCC will be 
offering a new associate degree pro­
gram in dental hygiene beginning in 
the swnmer of 199 5. 

Plans arc now underway atPCC to 
remodel the northeast comer of the 
Johnson Building on the Prestons­
burg Campus to accommodate the 
new program. Several classrooms will 
be remodeled to house 12 dental sta­
tions fully equipped with all the teeth 
cleaning apparatus that you find in 
any modern dental office, including a 
chair, lights, basin, drill, air line, 
plumbing, radiological equipment, 
laboratory, darkroom equipment, and 
library. 

The curriculum for the associate 
degree program includes courses in 
general education and in dental hy­
giene as required by the Commission 
ofDerual Accreditation. Clinical and 
laboratory experiences throughout the 
curriculum are related to classroom 
coursework. Clinical experiences in­
volve working with persons of all 

August activities 
at DuffElementary 

August brought the start of a new 
school year. Summer found those at 
tbe center on the road a lot with trips 
to Jenny Wiley Theatre, Keotuclcy 

• Opry, Children's Museum and Ken­
bJcky Horse Park. 

•• 

• 

• 

• 

The resource center also spon­
sored a trip to Camden Park for stu­
dents with perlect attendance. 

GED classes have been changed. 
They are now on Mondays and 
Wednesdays at tbe school from 6-9 
p.m. Exercise classes are on Tu~ 
days and Thursdays from 6-7 p.m. 

Pam Patton, health department 
nurse, is continuing health sezvices at 
tbecenteron Wednesdays and Thurs­
days. 

Receives diploma 
Regina Osborne. Jobs Opportu­

nity and Basic Skills Program par­
ticipant recently received her OED 
diploma. She was presented a certifi­
cate of achievement by ber JOBS 
case manager, Barbara Crider. 
Osborne earned her diploma through 
tbe Drift Learning Center operated 
by tbe David School. She plans to do 
volunteer work to gain work experi­
eoce. 

ages with varying kinds of dental 
health problems. During these learn­
ing experiences, students develop 
competencies in performing those 
dental hygiene functions permitted 
by law. 

The mobile dental hygiene pro­
grams generally stay on site for a 
minimum of three years, enabling at 
least two classes lo graduate. Job 
placement has been excellent and stu­
dents have tended to find employ­
ment in the area served by the col­
lege. 

The first mobile dental hygiene 
program was implemented at Ash­
land Community College in 1975. 
That program has moved from Ash-

land, to Somerset, to Hazard, back to 
Ashland, to Maysville, and is pres­
ently located at Hopkinsville Com­
munity College. 

The university established a sec­
ond mobile program in 1978. The 
second mobile program began at 
Paducah Comoumity College before 
moving on to Madisonville Commu­
nity College, to Southeast Commu­
nity College, to Northern Kentucky 
University and now on to Prestons­
burg Community College. 

Like most states, Kentucky suf­
fers from an uneven distribution of 
allied health professionals, especially 
in rural areas. Studies conducted in 
the early 1970s indicated a need for 
an associate degree program in den­
tal hygiene in some of the commu­
nity colleges' service areas; however, 
the need did not justify the expendi­
ture of funds for a permanent pro­
gram in each of the colleges where a 
need existed. Also, permanent based 
programs in small communities re-­
sult in job saturation of the surround­
ing area, thus aeating employment 
problems for the graduates. 

To avoid the problem of job satu­
ration and to limit expenses, tbe Uni­
versity ofKentuckyCommunityCol­
lege System developed the concept 
of a mobile dental hygiene program 
in which a top quality educational 
program would move from site to 
site, meeting a community's educa­
tional needs and then moving on be­
fore saturation would occur. 

PCC's dental hygiene program 
willgetunderwayduring the summer 
of 1995. Students interested in this 
program should contact Jenny Bot­
toms or Gia Hall at the college at 
(606) 886-3863 for more informa­
tion. Completed applications must 
be on file at the college by March 1. 

New faculty 
Ten new faculty members are at Prestonsburg Community College this 
year for the fall semester. They are {back row, left) Elizabeth M. Cole, of 
Des Moines, Iowa, counselor at PCC's Pike County Campus; Dr. Roger 
H. Hall, from Bowling Green State University, assistant professor of 
history; Dr. Thomas L Vlerheller and Dr. Chenzhao Jlan Vlerheller, both 
assistant professors of biology moving to the area from Pittsburgh, 
Pennsylvania; Christopher G. Fleming, from Clemson, South Carolina, 
project health coordinator and Instructor; Timmy G. Bremer, from 
Llvepool, New York, an Instructor of mathematics; Bertie Kay Oldham 
Salyer, from Salyersville, an Instructor of sociology; and Dr. Cralghton 
s. Mauk, from Asheville, North Carolina, an assistant professor of 
biology. Not shown are Dr. Yonghong Sarah Chen, an assistant profes­
sor of mathematics from the University of Connecticut, and Dr. Khalld 
Khanfar, an Instructor of computer science from Winona, Minnesota. 

Weddington attends judicial conference 
Kentucky Court Designated 

Worker Charlotte Weddington, rep­
resenting the 31st judicial district, 
comprisedofAoyd,att.ended the 1994 
statewide CDW conference in Louis­
ville, August 22-25. 

Seminars, workshops, and small 
group discussions, which focused on 
a variety of topics including legisla­
tive issues, policies and procedures, 

public and status diversions, teen vio­
lence, and interviewing strategies, 
provided COW's with an opportu­
nity to develop professional skills in 
juvenile justice. 

Guest speakers were Susan Clary, 
Supreme Court administrator, and 
David Garrard, of Program Re­
sources. 

Rock Around the Clock! 

Every Friday 
7:00am thru midnight 

Farm & Traffic Report 
Up the Creek 

The Rock Zone 
Ben's Rock 

Mr. Bill's Neighborhood 

WMMT88.7FM 
Mountain Community Radio 

(Pikeville & Prestonsburg at 88.1- PaiotSlille at 89.3) 
'" ... , 

TRANSFER 
CASE 

SERVICE 

$12.95 

Friday, S(•ptcmhcr 2, 1994 All 

A Special Ceremony 
To present a Proclamation by Governor Brereton Jones 

Proclaiming Sunday September 4th 

Rondal Hayes Day in Kentucky 
will be held on 

Saturday, September 3rd, at 6 p.m. 
at the Allen Central J:Iigh School Gym at Eastern, Ky. 

r------- during the---------. 
Hueysville/Bosco Homecoming 

on Labor Day Weekend 
Special singing and tributes from friends will mark the 
occasion. A reception will follow. 

The public is cordially invited to atte11d. 

,,·II STRAND TWIN 
. Absher PRESTONSBURG, KY. • 606-886-2696 
Enterprises 

ALL TICKDS, ALL SHOWING5-$3.00 

STRAND I STRAND II 
HELD OVER . ,~ ~ 

LiPrtc 
~ 

SMOwiiMES: 7:00 Nightly 

Starts Friday, September 2 

(/)LOR ()F 

BHl CE NJGHT .I \\1·: 
\\ ll.l.IS \I \HCII 

• lmG! ~ 
CIMIIOr --.....-. ....... 

~---·-·-----
SHOwnMES: Nightly at i:OO & Sundtly MllllnM 

'. 'SUNDAY MATINEE-Open 1:00, start 1:30, over 3:30 

NOW 
OPEN 

Come in and visit 
6 

our brand new 
Fast Change. 

With our 
state-of-the-art 

equipment, 
we offer 

oil changes, 
transmission 

service, 
and other 
lubrication . 
serv1ces. 

~Lov~ 
~rnal{~ 

Lordy,Lordy 
Look Who's 

2x: 
40 

(that's 80, Folks) 

Happy Birthday 
with love! 

MANUAL 
TRANSMISSION 

SERVICE 

$16.95 

Gl YN VIEW PLAZA, PRESTONSBURG, KENTUCKY 
Hours: 8:30-6:00, Monday-Saturday 

606-886-6794 



_A_12_Fr_ida~y,S~ep~tem~~~r2~,19~~---------------------·~rhe~FI~oyd~C~oun~ty~Tim~es~· ----------------------~------- ~ 

THE 

Today: 
How To Install 
ceramic Tile 

saturday: 
How To Install 
ceramic Tile 

How To Install A dbolt 1pm 
ooorlock & oea . 

How To Install A Water 3pm 
Heater 

sunday: 
How To Install A dbolt 1 ipm 
ooorlock & oea 

Lever Handle 
Bath Faucet 
With Pop-Up Drain 
• Chrome or polished brass flmsh 1128583,4 

5-Gallon 
Driveway Filler-Sealer 
Reconditioner 
• Fil ls cracks up to 1/8" w1de • Creates a sk1d res1stant 
surface • Protects blacktop aga1nst gasoline and 011 11 10470 

@McGruff 
the Crime Dog 

and a local Crime 
Prevention Officer 

Will Conduct Home 
Safety Demonstrations 

1 <><> <.:assidy Blvd. 

Saturday, 1 Oam • 2pm 

Spas sllOwn may 
requ re spec&al order 
lOr some colors Not 

all colors stocked 

4DeysO.ty! 

6MONIHS 
NO PAT 

2-Pack 3-Way 
- ··- Soft White Bulbs 

• 50/100/150 watts N76236 

(At IJucklcys Creek Bridge) 
Pikeville. Kentucky ({i06) 433-0<>2<> 

Monday - Saturday. 7an'l - Hprn 
Sunday. 1 oe:un - 6pm 
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Smile 
Awhile 

Sara Hopson 

THAT'S ENTERTAINMENT! 

My mother and I (along with 
approximately 50 million other 
Americans) had already seen 
''Forrest Gump,'' the movie 
starring last year's Academy 
Award winning best actor, Torn 
llal\ks, but my sister, Jenny, 
had not. Since Jenny was home 
for a visit, Mom and I insisted 
that she sec the movie. 

This is where you might say, 
the plot thickens. Last Saturday 
evening, Mom and I took Jenny 
to see the movie and, as usual, 
things didn't turn out the way 
we'd hoped. 

We purchased the tickets, 
bought popcorn and drinks, and 
seated ourselves in U1e same 
tJ1catcr IJlY husband and I had 
been in the previous week to 
view the same movie. 'Then we 
waited. I started eating my 
popcorn and several minutes 
passed before my mother said, 
"It sure is chilly in here, don't 
you think?" 

"Yes, it was cool last week, 
too. It'll warm up when more 
people get in here," I assured 
her. 

Several more minutes passed 
and my sister nudged me and 
said, "Wasn't this movie 
supposed to start at 9?" 

"Yeah, it was," I replied. 
"Well, it is 9:10 now." 
"And I'm getting cooler," 

Mom said. 
"I' 11 go check on the air 

conditioner," I quickly offered. 
When I got up to the 

concession stand I asked, "Has 
anyone ever complained about 
it being cool?" 

"In which theater?" the man 
asked. 

"In one," I answered matter­
of-factly. 

"No, but I'll tum it down 
and if anyone complains of it 
being too hot I'll turn it back 
on," he said nicely. 

"Oh, thank you so much," I 
said graciously. "Mom and I 
have seen Gump but my sister 
hasn't. We know she'll love it" 

'Inc three faces behind the 
counter stared back at me 
before one of them had the 
courage to say, "If you're in 
theater 1, you're missing 
Gump. It's in theater 5. It's 
been on for nearly 15 minutes 
now." 

"But it was on in this theater 
last week when my husband 
and I were here." I gasped. 

"Well, we changed it this 
week," they replied. 

I had to muffle a scream. 
Mother and I had been talking 
aboutthemo~eallw~.We 
barely had a conversation that 
hadn't included the movie or 
something about Tom Hanks. 
Now we were in danger of 
letting Jenny miss it. 

Running back down the 
aisle, I grabbed mother by the 
arm and said, "Let's go! 
Gump's on in 5. We're in the 
wrong theater!" 

Mom and Jenny jerked up 
our jackets, sofl drinks, and 
purses and went running wildly 
back up the aisle and to the 
other theater. When we walked 
into the nearly full theater, we 
began searching for three scats 
together. Unfortunately, there 
were none. 

"Aren't there three up 
front?" I whispered loudly to 
Mom. 

"I'll sit here," she said as she 
plopped down on an aisle scat. 

Jenny and I proceeded onto 
tJte front and sat down on the 
first row. From our positions, 
we could sec tJtc hairs in Sally 
Field's nose. 'J he last time my 
head was in that position I was 
l<X)king for UFO's. Not wishing 
to disturb Ute patrons any 
further, Jenny and I walked 
back up the aisle and persuaded 
mother to give it up and go 
home. 

Needless to s.ay, Mom wao; 
mad at me for screwing things 
up even if it was unintentional. 
But I made up for it by taking 
her to my house for a rousing 
g:unc or Scrabble. 

And tlmt's all I'm going to 
say about that. 
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Product liability law­
suits are becoming a 
major source of income 
for many Americans, 
who are finding the 
chances of getting big 
bucks from businesses a 
lot more reasonable than, 
say, winning the lottery. 

Take, for instance, the 
81-year-old New Mexico 
woman who recently 
picked up the tidy sum of 
$2.9 million from 
McDonald's after she 
spilled a cup of coffee in 
her lap. 

The restaurant made 
the coffee too hot, the 
jurors said, and they 
ought to be punished. 

While we sympathize 
with the victim, it's hard 
to figure how she ought 
to deserve 2.9 million 
bucks. 

She spilled the stuff, 
after all, in her car. 

You know, hardly a day 
goes by where somebody 
isn't suing some com­
pany over some sort of 
claim for negligence. 

Some are 
legitimate .. .like explod­
ing gas tanks on 
cars ... but many, we 
suspect, are little more 
than attempts to make a 
quick buck. 

A lot of companies are 
as responsible as anyone 
for the proliferation of 
liability suits, too, be­
cause they often settle 
with claimants just to 
keep from going to court. 

Gingerbread Festival in Knott County 
to add variety of talented musical groups. 

It's getting to the point 
where there is just no 
such thing as an unfortu­
nate accident anymo1e. 

Someone (other than 

A wide variety of music, including a 
Friday evening performance by the 
nationally-known Goose Creek Sym­
phony, will highlight Knott County's 
13th annual Gingerbread Festival, 
September 8-11. The festival theme is 
"Celebrating Knott County's 11 Oth 
Birthday." The family saluted this year 
is the Mullins family. And, once again, 
the festival will crown the best ginger­
bread cook and will host the world's 
largest gingerbread man. The parade 
will be held at 11:45 a.m. on Saturday, 
September 10. 

Hindman Promart and TV Service are 
sponsoring the Goose Creek Symphony 
performance, Friday, September 9, from 
9 a.m.-11 p.m. Goose Creek is known 
for their own creative rock and roll 
sound. which mixes various music 

styles, including country, folk, blues and 
bluegrass. The name of the group came 
from a Floyd County hollow where the 
band's leader, Charlie Gearheart was 
raised. The Goose was formed in 1968 
in Phoenix, Arizona. They reunited 
three years ago and produced the Oso 
Special record on the June Appal re­
cording label. 

Celebrating the 30th anniversary of 
the Beatles' visit to America, the hot 
Louisville rock and roll band Nervous 
Melvin and the Mistakes will perform 
Thursday night, September 8, and 
include a salute to the Beatles and the 
Rolling Stones. The Bank of Hindman is 
sponsoring the group's performance 
from 8 p.m. to 11 p.m. 

For the first time, the festival will 
have a rock and roll group which will 

have a distinct soul music sound. Rumor 
Hazit of Louisville will perform soul, 
classic rock and roll and Top 40 tunes 
Saturday night from 8 p.m. to midnight. 

Vince Combs and the Shadetree 
Bluegrass Boys will return from Xenia, 
Ohio, for the Sunday bluegrass show 
from 1 p.m. to 4 p.m. Vince is a Knott 
County native. Joining Vince will be 
Herb Stamper and the New Bluegrass 
Edition. The New Bluegrass Edition will 
perform also on Friday night. Bluegrass 
Uprising will perform on Thursday 
night. 

The Hindman Settlement School is 
again hosting the Gospel Sing on its 
campus from 4 p.m. to 8 p.m. The 
nationally-known gospel groups the 
Frecmans and t~e Singing Cookes will 
return. 

News of the Weird-----------ByChuckShepherd 

A new TV game show set to air 
early next year in England and It<lly 
pil<; against each other couples who 
have decided to divorce, with the 
objective of determining how the 
marital property will be divided. In­
stead of relying on costly lawyers or 
counselors, the spouses answer ques­
tions on the air about each other ami 
their relationship. 'Inc spouse who 
gives the "better" answers will get 
more of the property. 

THE ENTREPRENEURIAL 
SPIRIT 

-Jn"July, the Tokyo-b~tc;cd drug 

finn Dairin announced it would soon 
market a pre-meal pill to make bowel 
movements completely odorless. Al­
though t11e pill wa.'\ developed princi­
pally for the health care market, to 
improve working conditions for 
nurses' aides, some commentators in 
Japan fear that the availability of the 
pill for consumers will increase 
Japan's obsession with cleanliness. 
Psychiatry professor Susumu Oda 
said that. already, overreaction to 
unpleao;ant smells is a cause of unso­
ciahle bcha\·ior. 

- 'lbe Economist magazine re­
ported in January Ulat one of Secre-

tary of Energy Ilazd O'Leary's suc­
cess stories about government re­
search scientists hired out for civilian 
business uses was the Argonne Na­
tional Laboratory's helping 
McDonald's to find a way to speed 
up french-frying. A team headed by 
physicist Tuncer Kuzay, who inter­
rupted his work on advanced pho­
tons, placed sensors inside the frozen 
fries and was able to lh.:sign S()l:cial 
frying baskcL-; to deal with the effect 
of steam created by melting icc crys­
tals and to cut 30 to 40 seconds off 
each batch's frying time. 

- The Minnesota Chamber of 

Commerce recently lauded the waste­
management practice oflllc Crib Dia­
per Service of Plymouth, Minn., in 
capturing and donating Ule lint gath­
ered from laundering 250,000 dia­
pers per week to a casket manufae­
turerto use in stuffing ca.,ket pillows. 
which saves the diaper service $3,000 
a year. 

-The Massachusetts board that 
regulates funeral homes took away 
the license of Robert Miller for two 
years in July after fmding that he had 
dug up the ashes of two cremated 

(Sec Weird, D 2) 

the accident victim) is 
always to blame, and 
they must be made to 
pay up. 

We can think of a few 
opportunities lost at 
making megabucks 
because we were too 
naive to realize that our 
propensity toward self­
injury was really some­
one else's fault. 

Man, we've got scars 
on both legs, from knee­
cap to big toe, to remind 
us of various encounters 
with low-lying 
objects .. .like coffee table 
edges, chairs, bicycles, 
and short children with 
pointy heads. 

Heck, they've financed 
a wing at the local emer­
gency room from the 
money we've paid for X­
rays alone. 

We'll never, ever have 
the chance at winning a 
beautiful legs contest. 

And it wasn't our fault! 
How much can we get 

for that? 
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ARIES (March 21 to April 19) 
You' rc entering a cycle in which you 
become more involved witll a group 
activity. You may become a spokes­
person for a cause. A romantic intro­
duction may come tluough t11e job. 
It's continued success for you re­
garding career endeavors tllis week. 

TAURUS (April20 to May 20) A 
busy round of talks relating to busi­
ness interests begin. De sure to fol­
low t11rough on promises made to 
t11osc close to you. A call from afar 
may be romantic. Delays and extra 
duties at work keep you hopping. 

GEMINI (May 21to June 20) Do 
your best not to let things slide on tlle 
job tllis week. De careful you don't 
overlook somctlling of importance. 
An intellectual interest soon becomes 
all-consuming. Defore taking an in­
vestment risk, consult with experts. 

CANCER (June 21 to July 22) 
This week is likely to bring a roman­
tic surprise. You'll be paying extra 
attention to financial record-keeping 
and investmem planning in tllc com­
ing weeks. You'reon tllcsarne wave-

HOME TIPS 

RIPENING TRICK-Put hard 
avocados in a flour canister, cover 
well wiU1 flour, and in two to tllree 
days you '11 have soft avocados ready 
to eat. Gina T., Brookline, Mass. 

A REMEMBRANCI<~I make 
quilts for family and friends and as an 
added feature, I've learned to crochet 
in my name, to whom I gave it, and 
the date fhis makes wonderful 
memories in years to come. I Iclcn R., 
Blackfoot, Idaho 

BREAD BAGS- I save all my 
plastic bags, even bread wrappers. I 
cut tllem in strips and crochet tllem 
into rugs for foot wipers at tlle door­
step. I make tllem round and use a 
double stitch. That way, tllcre is a 
right and wrong side to tllem. Sally 
C., Okeechobee, Fla. 

CARPET SHAMPOOING­
After shampooing my carpet, umil it 
dries, I place step-size squares of an 
old sheet just far enough apart in 
order to be able to walk on tlle carpet 
witllout gelling it dirty. I store tlle 
"steps" witll my sharnpoocr until next 
time. Hilda W., Duena Park, Calif. 

Answers to Super Cro,o;word 

J A F F E A B c s BTU BAM B A 

AIR E 0 NA RA ORS AR l E EN 

B l A Z I NG SA DO l E S l E 10 EN 

FO l K S HE AR T S A F I R E 
F E B I T E s ORO R A TE. II 
EX 0 R C I S T I 0 B A T H T l C 
S P I T E 0 l F A CIE R A H 

T I l E B A K E OA l A S K A BO DE 
ARI R I V E T S I K E S A p E S 
l EN A K IN HU MID s p l I NT 

GA Z E 0 10 E R S T OIC 
AMP l E R v E N 0 S A L OE ABU 
BOOM R E ADE A l ARM l 0 N 
A R I A B u R N IN G l OVE A F A R 
BAN. 8 l I S S E L F E l I S E 
A l T •o ONA RUN T E MP E S T S 

s l OE E A RTO MOl H S T 

WAR MS p R IN G S RA 8 AT 
IDE AT e• HO T A N 0 BO T H E R E 0 

G E E Z E R. A l A. E E l I EOI NA 

S E 0 E R -OA o. A R E I TAN OY 

_, 

lengtll witll a loved one this week. 
I Iowever, watch your temper over 
tlle weekend. 

LEO (July 23 to August 22) 
You're likely to meet witJ1 an unex­
pected romantic flirtation tllis week. 
Avoid lavish expenditure on home 
entertaining. A period of important 
negotiations begins. You· re on a roll 
where job interests arc concemed. 

VIRGO (August23toSeptcmbcr 
22) You are easily distracted as tlle 
week begins. However, tlle coming 
weeks will find you very much in­
volved in your work. A spur-of-tllc­
momentromantic outing is romantic. 
You may be trying too hard to find a 
solution to a certain domestic prob­
lem. 

LIDRA (September 23 to Octo­
ber 22) A meaningful dialogue be­
tween you and a family member be­
gins. Changes at home may involve 
decor. The search for good times 
could lead to extravagant spending. 
This weekend, home life is favored 
over socializing. 

SCORPIO (October 23 to No­
vember 21) You'll be allotting more 
time for reading and catching up witll 
correspondence now and in tlle next 
few weeks. Self-discipline will en­
able you to accomplish what you set 
out to do, especially duties at home. 
However, be aware of a loved one's 
hurt feelings. 

SAGITTARIUS (November 22 
to December 21) Guard against an 
embarrassing slip of the tongue. Be 
diligent about money interests. The 
coming weeks may fmd you signing 
up for a class, lecture or seminar. You 
may overhear remarks that aren't to 
your liking. 

CAPRICORN (December 22 to 
January 19) Charm is your ally early 
in tlle week but socializing may lead 
to excessive spending. Finding ways 
to augment your income is a major 
focus for tlle rest of this montll. You 
have some wonderful new plans and 
insights. 

AQUARIUS (January 20 to Feb­
ruary 18) Try not to overplay your 
hand in business. You'll be express­
ing yourself to good effect in tlle 
coming weeks. It's not a time for 
confrontation on the home front. 
Loved ones feel you are being too 
domineering. 

PISCES (February 19 to March 
20) You may meet with a sudden 
romantic attraction this week. Otllers 
confide in you. A study project will 
be all-important in the near future. Be 
sensible about travel, especially over 
tlle coming weekend. 

bodies after relatives failed to pay 
funeral bills. The families said the 
bills had been inflated from the origi­
nal estimates. 

EH-UUUH, GROSS! 
- According to two officials of 

Kentucky Baptist organizations, a 
recent trend to move baptisms in­
doors was caused primarily by the 
increasing pollution of creeks and 
river. Said Pastor Dick Vanhoose,­
"You've got dead animals, you've 
got open sewers" thatmakesuch bap­
tisms unsafe. Said Rev. James Kelly 
Caudill (Caudill is aministerofTom's 
Creek Freewill Baptist Church in 
Johnson County), "There's [no 
nearby river) fit to baptize a dog in, to' 
be honest with you." 1 

-Milton Ross, 41, who was feud­
ing with co-workers in St. Joseph, 
Mo., was fired in July after a video 
camera caught him urinating directly 
into the office coffee pot before co­
workers arrived at worlc. The video­
tape trap was set after people noticed 
that tlle coffee's taste in recent days 
had become sour. The next day, in 
Lanagan, Mo., 200 miles south of St. 
Joseph, four arrests were made after 
witnesses reported seeing men uri­
nating into the town's water supply. 
Residents were advised for more than 
a week to boil their water. 

-InaJulyreport, TheNewYork 
Times contrasted the image of 
Singapore as a clean, sweet-smelling 
nation with the characteristics of its 
national fruit, thedurian. The "spiky, 
soccer ball-sized globe" of sweet 
custard-like fruit, with purported aph­
rodisiacal qualities, has, according to 
local descriptions, the aroma of"over­
ripe cheese, rotting fish, unwashed 
socks [or) a city dump on a hot 
summer's day." A popular saying is 
that tlle durian has "the smell from 
bell and a taste from heaven." 

-A Wall Street Journal feature 
in I une reported on British executive 
Jim Rose, the manager of a new line 
of pet food for Britain's Safeway 
Stores PLC. AlthougbSafeway Stores 
uses a "test panel" of2,000 dogs and 
cats, Rose nonetheless carefully tastes 
every single product under develop­
ment, as well as competitors' prod­
ucts, leading his wife to refer to him 
affectionately as "dog breath." A 
spokesman for rival Ralston-Purina 
said, "We don't use humans to test 
pet foods." 

- According to a New York 
Times report in November, Romesb 
Sharma ofNew Delhi, India, has fm­
gernails a combined 196 inches in 
length on his left hand, which he has 
not trimmed in 30 years. His right-

DR. W.C. THORNDYKE 

T 
MOCM, FRCS T 

Specialist in Urology 

606-638-1311 
Three Rivers Medical Plaza Suite 201 
P.O. Box 569 Louisa, KY 41230 

Office Hours: 9:00-5:00, Mon.-Fri. 

NOTICE 
UMWA HEALTH & RETIREMENT FUNDS 

BENEFICIARIES 
In October of 1993, the UMWA responded to its beneficiaries and 

rewrote the contract regarding the dispensing of hearing aids. In the 
past, the beneficiary was eligible only for one of the cheapest hearing 
instruments that would meet the beneficiary's needs and would only 
qualify for one new instrument every three years. 

The new contract allows the beneficiary to be fitted with top quality 
hearing aids, and to be fitted with two instruments if a clinical 
audiologist determines they are appropriate. 

DON'T BE MISLED!! The new contract requires that you be tested 
by a clinical audiologist before any benefits can be considered. There 
will be absolutely no cost to you for these services. All charges are 
submitted to and paid by the UMWA. If you qualify for benefits, your 
only expense in the future will be for batteries to run the instruments. 

As a SPECIAL OFFER, all eligible UMWA beneficiaries who 
respond to this letter within 30 days will receive, absolutely free, a one 
year supply of batteries with their new hearings aids. 

DON'TDELAY!!YOUMUSTACTNOW!!Calltodaytofindout 
if you qualify for two new hearing aids and free batteries for a year. 

Eastern Kentucky Speech & Hearing Clinic 
1298 North Lake Drive 

Prestonsburg, KY 41653 

606-886-3773 or 1-800-488-EARS 

hand fmgemails are trimmed nor­
mally. 

- In a two-week period begin­
ning in late April, a male logger in 
Western Kentucky working on a truck 
engine and a female employee clean­
ing a commercial blender in Los 
Angeles had tlleir scalps torn com­
pletely from tlleir heads, from ear to 
ear, from eyebrows to tlle back of tlle 
neck, but survived witllout obvious 
disfigurement. The scalps were re­
trieved and reattached after 
microsurgery of 12 to 14 hours' dura­
tion. 

CRIES FOR HELP 
Earlier tllis montll, a 69-ycar-old 

man in San Mateo, Calif., distraught 
overrecenteyesurgery, attempted to 
kill himself five times during a two­
day period, failing each time. He 
slashed his wrists, stabbed himself in 
the stomach witll a 12-incb knife, 
tried to drown himself, took an over­
dose of Tylenol, and jumped from a 
second-story window witll his neck 
tied to the house with a clothesline, 
which broke off. At that point, he 
decided he wanted to live. 

LEAST COMPETENT PERSON 
In March, Adelio Vazquez, 50, 

was arrested in Chicago and charged 
with attempting to rob tlle downtown 
Liberty Bank. According to a teller, 
Vazquez presented a note saying a 
bomb would go off unless he re­
ceived $45,000. The teller told 
Vazquez that such a large request 
required a manager's approval, and 
that Vazquez should take a seat until 
the teller could get tlle money. The 
teller called the police, who arrived 
to fmd Vazquez still seated in the 
waiting area, cbatling with a bank 
manager. 

(Send your Weird News to Chuck 
Shepherd, P.O. Box 8306, St. Peters­
burg, Fla 33738.) 

AUSTRALIA 

IS PLEASED TO ANNOUNCE THE ASSOCIAnGN OF 

~~rm1~ ~~ ~INII~~, M.l. 
Pediatrician 
Dr. Norman graduated from the 
UniversityofCapcTown, Cape 
Town, South Africa. Dr. de 
Carvalho joins us from Shands 
Teaching Hospital, University 
of Florida, where he has just 
completed a residency in 
Pediatrics. 

Patients may call 377-3420 for 
an appointment. 

McDOWELL ARH 

AUCTION 
Saturday, September 3, 1994 at 9:00 a.m. 

GOING OUT OF BUSINESS!!/ 
EAST KENTUCKY PAWN BROKERS 

Location: Highland Plaza (near Foodland) off University Drive, 
Prestonsburg, Kentucky 

WATCH FOR SIGNS 
Bassett sofa sleeper, love seat, chairs, recliners, love seat, coffee table, 
home safe, store safe, solid oak fireplace mantle, compact disc, cassettes, 
video games, 3-unit book shelve (pecan), VCRs, VCR movies, Nintendo 
sets, movie projector set (professional model), ceiling fan, 5000 btu wndow 
air units (2), numerous household items, gold jewelry 14 kt.~hains, 
diamond rings (men and women), watches, knives, guns, SK-47 rifle, 
shotguns, black powder rifles, .22 bolt-action magnum, hunting bows and 
arrows, large display gun rack, electric fence charger, 3" water pump, filing 
cabinets, desks, glass jewelry display case, depression glass, storm doors, 
house windows (Ceco ), electric heaters, oak doors, 8' florescent bulbs and 
fixtures, yard lights, water heater, 40' & 20' aluminum ladders, ceramic tile, 
wood cabinet and counter tops 5 1/2', scaffolding, 225 Lincoln welder, cart 
for oxygen and acetylene tank, mortar mixer (pull behind truck), glass door, 
weed eaters, lawn mowers, torch gauges, tools, electric jack hammer, akil 
saws, ceiling speakers, mining lights, CB base station, telephone intercom 
system, amplifiers, Peavy speaker (400 watt), TVNCR combo, atereo.. 
radios, TVs, electric guitars, car radios, stereo cabinet, Royal typewriter, 
two 40ft. tractor-trailer vans and much, much morel!! 

TERMS: Payment in full day of sale and before items are removed from 
premises. 

AUCTIONEER'S NOTE: Announcements made day of sale tau prece­
dence over previous written advertisement or remarks made. 

Sale conducted by a local auction company 

ALLIED AUCTION & REALTY 
Stallard Martin, AuctlonMr 

For further details, call 886-9500 

First Commonwealth Bank 
is open more hours 
than any other bank 

in Floyd County 

First Commonwealth Bank is open 48 hours each week for your banking 
convenience. Our hours, effective September 12, are: 

Lobby: Monday, Thesday and Wed~esday: 8:00 am to 4:30 pm 
Thursday and Friday: 8:00 am to 6:00pm 

Drive Thru: Monday, Thesday and Wednesday: 7:30am to 4:30pm 
· Thursday and Friday: 7:30am to 6:00pm 

24-hour banking available at: 
Main Office • NorthSide Branch • Martin Branch 

Coming Soon, Betsy Layne Branch 

Our Roots Run Deep. 

First 
Commonwealth 

Bank M_be,FOJC 

Prestonsburg • Martin • Betsy Layne 

• 
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" Satisfaction, not money, drives trainer 
by Ed Taylor 
Sports Editor 

Larry Broughton has been in the 
horse training business for the past 
nine years and be still enjoys the 
daily grind of caring for and training 
horses. 

"Horse training is bard now," be 
• said from Thunder Ridge. "It used to 

be that you could make it and it was 
fun. But it's not easy anymore." 

But Broughton is just one of sev­
eral trainers who have left their homes 
for the thrill of just being around 
horses. 

"I like horses," said Broughton. "I 
have always been around them. It's 
not the money, although you do need 
that; but I just love being around 
them." 

Broughton recalled the days that 
he worked for the Roger Cullipher 
Stables. 

"I worked for Roger about four 
.. years," he said. "Then I went off with 

my dad, who worked with horses. He 
asked me if I wanted to go with them 
and I did. I saw one horse that I really 
liked and ended up owning him four 
years later." 

Broughton, like all the other train­
ers at Thunder Ridge, will be moving 
on after the race season ends at Thun­
dec Ridge on September 11. He will 
gather the six horses that he handles 
and will move on to Lebanon, Ohio. 

"They race six months out of the 
• year there," he said. "Then I'll go 

back to Lexington and then come 
back here." 

The day in the life of a trainer can 
be a long one, but Broughton likes to 
allow time for himeself. 

"I getup around seven in the morn­
ing and feed the horses," he explained. 
"I always like to let my horses stand 
for an hour before I jog them. Some 
trainers don'L 

"I'll make three bips with the 
bones," Broughton said. explaining 

how he tries to build up the horses' 
stamina. 

"That puts the wind back in them 
to where thev can go a longer mile. 

and fix their legs if they have bad 
legs. I'll feed them again at4 p.m. and 
again at 10 p.m.," he said. 

BroughtOn said that it is a 24-hour 

Learning to be a trotter! 

questions," be explained. "My dad 
used to say that I asked too many 
questions. But you don't learn until 
you ask somethinsz. 

Thunder Ridge trainer Larry Broughton Is one of several trainers who are staying at Thunder Rider for the 
racing season. He Is shown taking• Free to Win on his morning jog. The horse, which Is owned by Gwen 
Baldwin of Paintsville, Is just learning the ropes as a race horae. Broughton thinks the horse will be ready 
for the track In January. (photo by Ed Taylor) 

Most horses will go three-quarters of 
a mile and won't finish the race," said 
the veteran trainer. 

After the jogging workout, 
Broughton says he likes to give his 
horses a soap bath, let them stand to 
dry and then brush them. 

"I keep their feet packed, painted 

a day job if a trainer wants it to be. 
"This job, I work from seven to four 
and leave. But come back to feed the 
horses again." 

Skills in caring for horses is one 
thing a trainer must possess. But the 
skills are not learned in a classroom. 

"The way I started is, I would ask 

"I would hang around the race 
track with the older guys. If the horse 
had bad legs, while they were pack­
ing them, I would ask, 'What are you 
doing?"' 

Broughton said that they would 
not only explain what they were do-

(See Broughton, B 4) 

Coach Clark: "Prestonsburg fmds ways to win." 

.. Baldwin pins 
hojJes on Free to Win 
by .Ed Taylor 
Sports Editor 

In two weeks, Thunder Ridge 
will say goodbye to all tbe 
trainers, jockeys and owners when 
the harness track closes for the 
racing season. 

For local horse 
owners that means 
their horses will be 
moving out with 
the trainers, who 
were hired to 
break them in or 
to care for them. 
Some will· 
move on to 
Qhio, Pennsyl-: .. ; 
vabici or tracks · 
in other stateS( .. :\ •· 

Gwen ·• .. · 
Baldwin of 
Paintsville is one a 
few in the local area 
who has a horse • 
stabled at Thunder·· 
Ridge. Her horse. Free 
to Win, will move on to 
Lebanon, Ohio, while it is still in 
the training phase. 

Baldwin, like many local horse 
ownecs, is thankful for the new 
facility at Thunder Ridge. She 
believes that it is something the 
area has needed Jot a long time. 

"It's just so exCiting for the 
track to be here/She' said. "I just 
couldn't watt for them t9 getit 
in... . ... .<·: ::::: .. ;: 

Ats&lil¢manyowners~ having 
a bamesHace 1lbtse iS a·resutt of 
'her love :roc uie.·aliimal. 
· ·· "It'sjust beirig around them 
and the atmosi}bere of itall,H • she 
said, u sbe s.P<*e of bet love for · 
hethotses. "We.fiaveamarewe .. .:·.~. ·. 

raised and we have a colt. Free to. :·· 
Win is one that we bought to see 
what he could do." 

To watch the powerful horse. 
one could see the beauty of its 
shining coat and its strong legs 
and strong will. It was easy to see 

that this horse has the 
makings of a cham­

pion. 
"We think he is 

a good horse," 
she said, " and 
we hope that he 
will be a good 
race horse." 

If all fails? ~ 

"Then we 
willjusttake 
him home and 
make a saddle 
horse out of 

him," she said. 
Baldwin 

spends a lot of 
time at Thunder 

Ridge and often 
video tapes the horse's 

jogging sessions in the 
mornings. 

"We bought Free To Win sight 
unseen," she said. "My husband 
hasn't even seen him yet. I'll tape 
the horse jogging and go home 
and sbow my husband what be 
looks like." 

A borse will go for a selling ' 
price between $2,000 or $2,500. 
Some horses have been bought for 
less and made fine harness racing .. 
horses. , . {?-

. Baldwin is looking forward to 
the time Free to Win makes his 
racing debut, which will be 
sometime in January. 

"111 be there watching when he 
dOes, II she said. 

Blackcats travel to Lexington for game two 

Ratliff to Risner! 
• Prestonsburg quarterback Thomas Ratliff (11) faked a handoff to back 

Robbie Risner (40) during the Pikeville game. Risner will be missing 
tonight against Lafayette as he serves a one-game suspension for being 
ejected at Pikeville. (photo by Ed Taylor) 

by Ed Taylor 
Sports Editor 

What is the mark of a champion­
ship team? 

If you ask Lexington Lafayette 
coach Terry Clark that question, his 
answer would be "finding ways to 
win a game." 

Clark has been impressed with the 
Prestonsburg football program and 
the coaching ability of Bill Letton. 
The Generals' coach feels that 
Prestonsburg has built a solid reputa­
tion as a state team and he looks for 
the Blackcats to be a hard team to 
contain. 

"What bas hit me about this team 
and this program is the tradition they 
have," he said. "They are coming off 
a very successful season last year, 
having gone to the championship 
game of Oass 2A. Coach Letton bas 
done a fantastic job and one of the 
best coaching jobs of all time last 
year." 

Prestonsburg will take to the road 
for the second consecutive time as 
they face a top 4A school. But the 

Generals' coaCh doesn't measure a 
team by what class they play in. 

"I look at the athletes they have," 
he said, "and Prestonsburg bas some 
good athletes. 

"We'rea4Aschool but that doesn't 
mean that we are better than a 2A 
school," he said. "I followed 
Prestonsburg last year in the playqtfs 
and they found ways to win. 

"Again, this year they are finding 
ways to win. Last week at Pikeville 
they found a way to win. That is a 
mark of a championship ballclub, 
fmding ways to win." 

Lexington Lafayette found their 
first game last week a rathec disap­
pointing one. They fell to Henderson 
Cmmty 14-7. 

"We bad a good showing under 
the conditions that we had to play 
under. We bad to travel a long dis­
tance to get there and that never helps." 
Coach Clark's scouting report. .. 

"Prestonsburg is a quick team," be 
said. "But what concerns us the most 
is their power and strength. They are 
a strong team." 

The Generals will have to contain 

one of the premier players in the 

state, according to Clark 
"Their quarterback (Thomas 

Ratliff) is the key for them," be said. 
"He is a solid football player and we 
will have to get him under control 
quickly. 

"They also return one of the na­
tion's top linebackers (Larry Morris) 
and a strong lineman (Tim Lewis) 
and nose guard (Paul Collins). They 
are going to be a strong team fa- the 
second week of the season." 

Senior Bill Pollitt will quarter­
back the Generals. He is the team's 
returning quarterback. Pollitt, accool­
ing to Coach Oark, likes to put the 
ball in the air. He threw for 850 yards 
last season and gives the Generals a 
balanced attack. 

"We like to open it up on offense," 
saidClark. "WeareabaJancedteam." 

In the backfield the coach's son, 
Chris Clark, a senior, will run at the 
fullback position. Sherman Shelton 
will be at wingback and the halfback 
slot will be filled by Kelvin Woolfolk. 

"We have several kids who go 
both ways," said the Generals' coach. 

"Jamie McDowell will be our cen­
ter." 

Keys for a General win ... 
"We will have to overcome last 

week's Joss to Henderson County," 
said Coach Clark. "It is the mental 
state that we may be in that will be a 
key. 

"We need to cut down on our 
turnovers and be careful that we don't 
beat ourselves." 

Blackcat confidence. .. 
Prestonsburg, in coming off a 26-

21 win over Class lA Pikeville, has 
to be confident going to Lafayette. 
Before a huge crowd and television 
cameras, the Blackcats showed that 
they are a team that doesn't know the 
meaning of quitting. 

Ratliffwassuperbagainst the PaD­
tilers. The senior quarterback made 
thingshappenandrushedfor98yards, 
scoring two touchdowns. 

Mike Shepherd had a solid perfor­
mance for the Blackcats out of the 
backfield. Shepherd rolled the Pan­
ther blockers for good second and 
third efforts. 

(See Blackcats, B 4) 

A Look At Sports byEdTaylor,sportsEditor-----------

• 

NO race results; Grigsby honored .. 
RACE 

RESULTS? 
I have had 

several folks 
stop me or call me to ask why 
the harness racing results 
from Thunder Ridge are not 
in the Floyd County Times. 
It isn't because we don't want 
to print them. The reason is 
that we do not get the results 
sent to us and, therefore, can­
not print them. 

So, if you want to know 
who won what race, your best 
bet is to call the track. 

HERE AND THERE ... 
Floyd County's Gerri 

Grigsby was inducted into 
her fourth Hall of Fame this 
past Monday night when she 

became a member of the Ken­
tucky Athletic Hall of Fame. 

I was scheduled to be in Lou­
isville the night of the awards, 
but car trouble forced me to 
stay home. But I am, as are 
many Floyd Countians, proud 
of Gerri and her great accom­
plishments. She has been a good 
ambassador for Eastern Ken­
tucky and certainly is always 
ready to greet you with a warm 
smile. 

I think Floyd County should 
proclaim a Gerri Grigsby Day. 
This young lady should be rec­
ognized locally for her accom­
plishments. After all, she is the 
nation's all-time leading scorer 
in basketball -- boys and girls. 
She is a member of the Na-

tional Hall of Fame. 
CAR SHOW ... 

I am looking forward to Oc­
tober 15. That is the day that 
the First Guaranty National 
Bank Car Show will be held in 
conjunction withMartin'sRed, 
White and Blue Days. 

Tina Mills (Boy! does she 
work hard to put together this 
event) says that the show will 
have a different twist this year 
in that the top 50 cars in the 
show will be recognized. 

If you have been to one of 
the shows, you know how it 
has grown over the years to 
become one of the top shows in 
the area. 

I love looking at the old cars. 
My brother Bob has also caught 

the fever since retiring. He went 
out and bought himself a 1965 
Plymouth, showcase ready. I 
am trying to get him to bring it 
down for the show. Said he 
would consider it. 

Be sure to come out for the 
show. Just take a look at the 
cars of the past and visit with 
other car enthusiasts. 

George Barnette has a barn 
full of the old-timers that are 
constant winners. George says 
that he just enjoys showing 
them. I love the old Hudson 
that George has. Someday he 
will take me for a ride in it. 

Mark it on the calendar. You 
will enjoy the show. The Ken­
tucky Opry Junior Pros will be 
providing the entertainment for 

the day. Just a great day has 
been planned. Please rain, stay 
away. 

LOUISVILLE 
AT KENTUCKY 

Should be a classic first-time 
matchup. I believe the Cards 
maybe a tad better than this 
year's Cats. But I also believe 
that Coach Bill Curry is round­
ing the comer with the Big Blue 
football program and that they 
will be winners next year. Fi­
nal score: Louisville 14, Ken­
tucky 10. 

BASKETBALL CATS ... 
The tube will be crowded 

with Wildcat basketball this 
winter. I know, you can't wait! 
Neither can I. 

A REMINDER ... 

Everyone's favorite coach, 
"Hoss" Halbert, will be in­
ducted into the KHSAA/ 
Dawahare's Hall of Fame in 
March just before the Sweet 
Sixteen gets under way. 

"Hoss" is yet another Floyd 
Countian being honored. He 
will become a member of the 
Class of '95 and it cenainly 
will be an honor for the man 
who helped make basketball 
what it is in the 15th Region. 
Yours truly expects to be there 
with camera in hand and I 
want my photo taken with 
"Hoss." 

Until Wednesday. good 
sports everyone and be good 
sports. Take the kids to church 
Sunday. 
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in g. but what the process of packing 
docs to a horse's leg. 

Broughton said that what be docs 
in caring for and training horses is 80 
percent common sense. 

"'Il1ere's no classroom work," he 
said. "If a horse's leg is bot, you cool 
it off. Water is the best thing for it" 

Is it all fun and games? Are there 
those trying moments? 

"Yes, it can get aggravating at 
times. A week ago (actually three 
weeks ago), I was ready to go home. 
I was tired, had bad luck, horses broke 
do.,..n and didn't race good. The own­
ers came down and we didn't have 
any luck. This makes you sour." 

Watching a trainer put all the rig 
on a horse is fao;cinating because there 
is so much involved. Broughton re­
called the first time be tried to figure 
out how a trainer puts a rig on a horse. 

''1 went w1th a trainer from New 
Castle, Kentucky named Ron 
Dingman. I just watched and watched. 
1be one day he said, ~roday's the day 
you arc going to put the harness on 
yourself. I said. 'Noway. I can'tdo it.' 
But now I can do it with my eyes 
closed." 

Broughton is hoping that Thunder 
Ridge makes it in the harness racing 
business because, "We need places to 
race." 

"'Ibis is a beautiful place. I think 
tl1ey will make it. They need to lower 
tlle prices some," he said. 

Broughton thinks that sometlling 
should be done to get more people in 
on Tuesday and Wednesday nights. 

"Those arc our two worst nights," 
he said. "We can't make it on Tues­
day and Wednesday nights. They just 
don't have enough bets to keep us 

going." 
lbe Frankfort trainer said that the 

new facility needs more improve­
ments around the stable area. 

'"lbe track is perfect," he said. "It's 
just the little minor things. The elec­
tricity cuts off now and t11cn." 

Being around horses is the most 
enjoyable tlling about being a trainer 
for Broughton. "I love race horses. I 
figure theyarejustasmuch my friends 
as I am theirs," he said. "llley don't 
get any care unless I give it to tllcm. 
They can't take care of themselves. ' 
My horses know they are getting 
cared for." 

Some horses arc naturals when it 
comes to harness racing. But foroth· 
ers, Broughton says it takes time to 
train them. It is up to the horse as to 
how long a trainer will work with one. 

"It's all according to how he races 
as to how long I'll spend with a horse," 
be said. "If be shows he is capable 
enough to make me money, I'll keep 
him for a year or so. If he shows he 
can't pace enough, then I'll sell bim.l f 
I'm putting $200 into him and he's 
only getting me $50, then I sell him.'' 

Broughton is presently the trainer 
for tlle horse of Gwen Baldwin of 
Paintsville. Baldwin's horse is a stal­
lion that Broughton is training to pace. 

"He hasn't raced as of yet," said 
the trainer. "We will harness him and 
put the hobbles on him to get hirn 
used to it He has no gait (foot move­
ment of a horse such as a trot, pace, 
canter or gallop). He's a regular stan­
dard bred, but he has no gait I le 
doesn't know what a gait is." 

Jones stopped! 

Hobbles on the horse's legs train 
him to move his feet a certain way. 
Some are taught to pace, others to 
trot. 

Baldwin's horse, "Free to Win," is 
a five-year-old that is easier to train 
than a two or three-year-old. 

Brian Jones of the Prestonsburg Blackcats' junior varsity team carried 
for 5 yards against Belfry Monday night in JV action. The Pirates 
ambushed the junior Blackcats 28-0. (photo by Ed Taylor) "Their bones are more developed 

and it is easier for them to learn," said 
Binky. "After we teach him a certain 
gait, he will just keep getting faster 
and faster. 

Prestonsburg Blackcats 
JV falls 28-0 to Belfry "He's better than what he was a 

week ago. Right how he's high strung. 
He can't get his mind together as to 
what he wants to do. There has been 
a 100 percent improvement I think 
he will go on and make a good race 
horse." 

by Ed Taylor 
Sports Editor 

The Prestonsburg BlackcaLc; jun­
ior varsity team got their season off 
with a home date against Belfry. The 
Pirates posted a 28-0 defeat on tlle 
younger Blackcats as Prestonsburg 
had trouble moving tlle football. 

The Blackcats picked up only one 
frrstdown against the Pirates defense' 
and that came early in the second 
half. From that point on, it was three 
downs and out for the Cats. 

Belfry scored on their frrst posses­
sion of tlle contest when quarterback 
Barry Crum went around left end on 
a sweep and ran 43 yards for the 
touchdown to give the Pirates a 6-0 
lead. 

The Pirates scored late in the sec­
ond period to take a 14-0 lead at the 
half when David Oliver went in from 
10-yards out to score. Oliver ran the 
two-point conversion for tlle half­
time margin. 

Third quarter play saw tlle Pirates 
add to the lead. They went on top 22-
0 when Dwight Stepp scored on a 1-
yard plunge and Crum bit a receiver 

Blackcats-
<Continued from B 3) 

What can you say about Larry 
Morris that hasn't already been said? 
Morris bas been referred to as a "man­
child." A hard-bitting linebacker, 
Morris Icadc; the Blackcat defense. 

But the character development for 
tllis program came long before the 
Cats posted a 14-1 record last year. Il 
began back in 1989 when Coach 
Letton came to Prestonsburg and in­
stilled in the program that a team can 
always find a way to win. 

Last season is just a memory now, 
but the Blackcats have established a 
new goal and that is to return to 
Louisville. To do that, they must find 
ways to win. And tlley will. 

Co~ning 
Soon 

in tlle end zone for the conversion. 
Belfry's final score came in tlle 

fourth quarter on a 4-yard run by 
Albert Ruppennan to make it 28-0. 

Brian Jones looked impressive in 
tlle punting gmne for the Blackcats. 
He a vcraged nearly 40 yards per punt. 
He rushed for 21 yards on seven 
carries. Matt Laferty, trying hard to 
go up tlle middle of tlle Pirate de­
fense, grounded out 16 yards on seven 
carries. 

Quarterback Mike Castle did not 
complete a pass. 

Broughton stated tllat he told 
Baldwin that in two months he could 
tell if the horse will make it. 

"It takes four to six months to get 
one to where he can race. If nothing 
goes wrong, Free to Win will be 
ready in five months. He should get 
his frrst start in January. He's been a 

super horse to break." 

Vinyl Siding Factory Outlet 
Rt. 680 Minnie, Ky. • (606) 377-0502 

Double 4 White Vinyl Siding .................... $36.50per~. 
Foam Insulation, P-14 ............................... $13.50peraq, 
22" White Octagon Vinyl Vent •..•••••••••••••••••••••• $38.98 
24"x50 ft. Trim Coil {white) •.... A •••••••••••••••••••••••• $49.98 
24"x50 ft. Trim Coil {color) ............................... $53.98 
12" White Vinyl Soffit ............................... $6.26 per sheet 
All Colors Double D/4 Vinyl Siding ......... $46.50per~. 

WE ALSO CABBY: 
Shutters, aluminum columns, windows, seamless guttering 
supplies, carports, awnings, a multitude of exterior maintenance­
free items for your home. 

EFFECTIVE SEPTEMBER 06, 1994, THE 
DRIVERS' LICENSE DIVISION OF THE 
FLOYD CIRCUIT COURT CLERK'S OF­
FICE WILL BE OPEN DURING THE 
FOLLOWING HOURS: 

Monday-Tuesday: 11:00 a.m.-4:00p.m. 
5:00 p.m.-7:00 p.m. 

Wednesday-Friday: 8:00 a.m.-4:00 p.m. 
Saturday-Sunday: CLOSED 

FRANK DEROSSETT JR. 
Clerk, Floyd Circuit & District Courts 

SHIP 
-~~-JIXCSIS 

Between Quality Carpet 
and Quality Video 
Big yellow building 

Prestonsburg 886-2060 
*FAX *Photo Copying *UPS, USPS, Federal Express, Airborne, Roadway 

-====::..1 

While most trainers get a percent­
age of the purse, Broughton gets paid 
by the month. 

"I get a monthly trainer's check," 
he said. 

ALL 
PERMS 

Education about the harness rac­
ing business is what is needed at 
Thunder Ridge, according to 
Broughton. 

• MODERN CUTS 
• FROST . 
• COLOR 

OWner: Debbie Gibson 

Stylists: 
"They need to advertise in the 

paper more," he said. "Most people 
don't know anything about horses or 
how to bet on them." 

Walk-ins Welcome 
Leah Adkins 

Melissa Coleman Martin 

Broughton said that Thunder 
Ridge has to make it and needs to 
draw a crowd with advertisment. 

t1~mnesfro.mHarold 478 188• 8 
Brtdge on R1ght -

L--------------------~ 

This Week's 
Picks 

This Week's 
Consensus 

Prestonsburg vs. Lafayette Prestonsburg 
Allen Central at Fleming Neon Fleming Neon 

Betsy Layne at South Floyd South Floyd 
Cleveland at Cincinnati Cleveland 

Dallas at Pittsburgh Dallas 
San Diego at Denver Denver 
Seattle at Washington Washington 
Louisville at Kentucky Kentucky 
Auburn at Mississippi Auburn 

Arizona at Georgia Tech. Georgia Tech. 
Cincinnati at Indiana Indiana 

Maryland at Duke Maryland 
•••••••••• • ••••••••• 

Four way tie for first place. Jimmy Goble will not admit that Marie (his wife) did the actual 
picking, but "Global Goble" still is the top seed. Jenny, Scott and April vow to see that change 
next week. Prestonsburg· will win over Lafayette despite our fearless publisher saying 
otherwise. South Floyd and Betsy Layne hook up in a top county game with the Raiders getting 
the nod. On the pro level, Cleveland will hand the Bengals an opening season loss and 
Kentucky will win over the Cardinals. Some may have to hang their heads on this one. Auburn 
takes a win over Mississippi with Maryland topping Duke. 

Jimmy Goble 
9·3, .750 

This Week's Picks 
Prestonsburg 
Aeming Neon 
Betsy Layne 
Cleveland 

Dallas 
San Diego 
Washington 
Louisville 
Au bum 
Arizona 
Indiana 

Maryland 

Mike Burke 
8-4,.666 

This Week's Picks 
Prestonsburg 
Fleming Neon 
South Floyd 
Cleveland 
Pittsburgh 

Denver 
Washington 

Kentucky 
Au bum 
Arizona 
Indiana 
Duke 

Tammy Goble 
7-5, .583 

This Week's Picks 
Prestonsburg 
Fleming Neon 
Betsy Layne 
Cleveland 
Pittsburgh 
San Diego 

Washington 
Kentucky 
Au bum 
Arizona 
lnciana 

Maryland 

Lynne Baldwin 
4-8, .250 

This Week's Picks 
Prestonsburg 
Fleming Neon 
South Floyd 
Cleveland 

Dallas 
Denver 
Seattle 

Kentucky 
Au bum 
Arizona 
Indiana 

Maryland 

';: •. _..'."':~,· .. -... ········.·.,~ ... 

i . -. ' 

.. ·. ::-::' 

Jenny Ousley 
9-3, .750 

This Week's Picks 
Prestonsburg 
Allen Central 
South Floyd 
Cincinnati 

Dallas 
Denver 

Washington 
Kentucky 
Au bum 
Arizona 
Indiana 
Duke 

Karl Shepherd 
8-4, .666 

This Week's Picks 
Prestonsburg 
Fleming Neon 
Betsy Layne 
Cleveland 

Dallas 
Denver 
Seattle 

Kentucky 
Au bum 

Georgia Tech. 
Indiana 

Maryland 

Ed Taylor 
7-5, .583 

This Week's Picks 
Prestonsburg 
Allen Central 
South Floyd 
Cleveland 

Dallas 
Denver 

Washington 
Louisville 
Au bum 

Georgia Tech. 
Indiana 

Maryland 

Chuck Scovlle, WXLR 
8-<4, .666 

This Week's Picks 
Prestonsburg 
Aeming Neon 
South Floyd 
Cleveland 

Dallas 
Denver 

Washington 
LouisVIlle 
Au bum 
Arizona 
Indiana 

Maryland 

Scott Peny 
9-3, .750 

This Week's Picks 
Lafayette 

Aeming Neon 
Betsy Layne 
Cleveland 

Dallas 
Denver 

Washington 
Kentucky 
Au bum 
Arizona 
lnciana 

Maryland 

Jodi Blackburn 
7·5, .583 

This Week's Picks 
Prestonsburg 
Aeming Neon 
South Floyd 
Cincinnati 

Dallas 
Denver 

Washington 
Kentucky 

Missiseippi 
Georgia Tech. 

Indiana 
Maryland 

Pam Burgess 
6-6.500 

This Week's Picks 
Prestonsburg 
Fleming Neon 
Betsy Layne 
Cincinnati 

Dallas 
San Diego 
Washington 
Kentucky 

Mississippi 
Georgia Tech. 

Cincinnati 
Maryland 

Jim Allen, 095 
8-<4, .666 

This Week's Picks 
Prestonsburg 
Aeming Neon 
Betsy Layne 
Cleveland 

Dallas 
Denver 

Washington 
Kentucky 
Au bum 

Georgia Tech. 
lnd.-.a 
Duke 

April Stephens 
9-3, .750 

This Week's Picks 
Prestonsburg 
Aeming Neon 
South Floyd 
Cincinnati 

Dallas 
Denver 

Washington 
Kentucky 

Mississippi 
Georgia Tech 

Cincinnati 
Maryland 

Tim Burke 
7-5,.583 

This Week's Picks 
Prestonsburg 
Aeming Neon 
South Floyd 
O.veland 
Pittsburgh 

Denver 
Washington 

Kentucky 
Aubum 
Arizona 
lnciana 

Maryland 

Chris Fields 
6-6, .500 

This Week's Picks 
Prestonsburg 
Allen Central 
South Floyd 
Cincinnati 

Dallas 
Denver 

Washington 
LouisviHe 
Aubum 

Georgia Tech. 
lndana 
Duke 

Jeff Meek, WXKZ 
8-<4, .666 

This Week's Picks 
p,.atonsburg 
Allen Central 
South Floyd 
Cleveland 

Dallas 
Denver 
Sea tie 

Kentucky 
Mississippi 

Arizona 
lnciana 

Maryland 

Susan Allen 
8-4, .666 

This Week's Picks 
Prestonsburg 
Allen Central 
South Floyd 
Cleveland 
Pittsbu~ 
San Diego 
Washington 
Kentucky 

Mississippi 
Arizona 
lndana 
Duke 

BeckyCrum 
7-5,.583 

This Week's Picks 
Prestonsburg 
Aeming Neon 
Betsy layne 
Cincinnati 

Dallas 
Denver 
Seattle 

Kentucky 
Au bum 
Arizona 
lndana 

M81)'1and 

Shawn Hamilton 
6-6,.500 

This Week's Picks 
Prestonsburg 
Aeminy Neon 
South Floyd 
Cleveland 
Pittsbu~ 
San Diego 
Washington 
Kentucky 
Au bum 

Georgia Tech. 
lnciana 
Duke 

Rick Hughes 
8-<4, .666 

This Week's Picks 
Prestonsburg 
Allen Central 
South Floyd 
Cleveland 

Dallas 
Denver 
Sea tie 

Kentucky 
Au bum 

Georgia Tech. 
lnciana 

Maryland 

• 

• 

., 

• 
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Betsy 
Layne 

Bobcats 
'94 

~NAME Iii'. wr. YR ~ (44) Rodney Hamilton 6-2 240 JR RB-LB 

(1) Craig Hamilton 5-9 140 JR RB-DB ( 45) Rocky Hamilton 5-7 180 SR RB-LB 

( 4) Jackie Bush 6-1 205 SR RB-LB (54) Tim Hunt 5-11 210 .JR OL-DL 

(10) Tim Nunemaker 5-10 140 so RB-DB (55) Clifton Boyd 5-9 185 FR OL-LB 

(13) Willie Meade 6-0 176 .JR RB-LB (62) Stewart Hall 5-8 220 so OL-DL 

R (14) Matt Rose 5-5 108 FR RB-DB (65) Brad Kimbler 6-0 237 so OL-DL 

(20) Brent Akers 5-9 170 SR RB-DB (73) John Hall 6-3 305 SR OL-DL 

(32) Tay Lyon 5-9 135 JR RB-DB (75) Shannon Hall 5-10 285 SR OL-DL 

(33) Eric Cecil 5-6 145 FR RB-DB (78) Bubba Combs 6-4 290 SR OL-DL 

0 
s 
T (35) Chris Hicks 6-1 180 JR RB-LB (79) Darrin Reynolds 5-10 214 so OL-DL 

E (36) Nick Newsome 5-10 170 JR RB-LB (84) Jarred Newsome 5-9 165 so RB-LB 
• 

R (42) Jason Hamilton 5-7 246 SR RB-LB (99) Shawn Keathley 6-0 245 so OL-DL 

Confident Betsy Layne travels to South Floyd 
by Ed Taylor 
Sports Editor 

If you think the loss to Paintsville 
at Johnson Central in the Big Sandy 
Bowl hurt the morale of this year's 
Betsy Layne Bobcats football team, 
you had better think again. 

The Bobcats came off a strong de­
fensive effort when they dropped a 7-
0 decision to coach Walter Brugh's 
ballclub. Betsy Layne came into the 
game a decisive underdog to the Ti­
gers, but came away with confidence 
and the respect of other teams. 

The Bobcats will be on the road for 
the second consecutive week. It should 
be a classic county matchup when 
they face the Raiders of South Floyd. 

The Bobcats defeated the Raiders 
at home last year, 14-8, allowing South 
Floyd to score in the closing seconds. 

Brent Akers will quarterback the 
Bobcats or fans could sec sophomore 

Craig Hamilton. 
Bubba Combs, "Big" John Hall and 

Shannon Hall form a solid line for the 
Bobcats' defensive line. 

Hard-working Tim Hunt will be at 
the center position where, according to 
Coach Derossett, the offense begins. 

Rocky Hamilton will be at a line­
backer slot where South Floyd coach 
Donnie Daniels thinks he is the best. 

Daniels thinks that Rocky Hamilton 
is a better linebacker than running 
back, and he could be a problem on 
defense. 

"He's just a solid athlete all the way 
around," Daniels said. "He runs hard 
and is hard to bring down. 

"John (Derossett) only has 24 play­
ers, but the 11 he puts on the field can 
play with anyone." 

Betsy Layne will be able to go deeper 
against the Bobcats, although the num­
bers are down for Betsy Layne this 
year. Brad Kimbler, Shawn Keathley 
and Stewart Hall are expected to add to 
that depth. 

On defense, Rodney Hamilton, who 
is very athletic, will be at the nose 
guard position with Keathley and Hall 
at a tackle and guard slot. 

The Raiders will go with Justin 
Ray at the quarterback slot. Chad 
Slone, Chet McCarty and Adam 
Wright_ will run the football. 

Kevin Johnson will be at one end 
spot for Ray to toss to. Ray threw for 
146 yards last week against Magoffin 
County. 

Wright gathered in 198 yards rush­
ing for the Raiders last Friday. 

Dr. Stephen Towler and The Floyd County Board of Education 

Combs will kick the football for 
Betsy Layne against the Raiders. The 
Bobcats will look to throw the foot­
ball more, testing the Raiders' sec­
ondary. 

Willie Meade will be at the split 
end position and will play a line­
backer spot as well. Meade is on the 
return speciality team. 

A third Hamilton, Jason, carries 
the football in the backfield, as well 
as Jay Lyons. 

Last year when the two team met, 
Betsy Layne presented Coach Daniels 
and the Raiders a plaque to com­
memorate their first season and first 
game as a new school. 

But this year, the Raiders and Bob­
cats will hook up on the field and both 
teams will be going for win number 
one of 1994. 

Game time is set to kickoff at 7:30 
p.m at Brackett Field. 
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SF Raiders. may lead county in scoring but ... 
by Ed Taylor 
Sports Editor 

You'recoming off the biggest scor­
ing night in the early history of your 
school, but you still lose the game. 

You're going to face what you con­
sider to be one of the top defensive 
teams in the county. 

You're nursing sick players who 
have been under the weather the first 
week of the season and haven't really 
gotten their legs back yet. 

What do you do? 
You just respect your opponent, 

and line up and play football. That's 
the way South Floyd coach Donnie 
Daniels views tonight's matchup with 
county rival Betsy Layne. 

"As far as their line goes, I think 
that, tackle to tackle, they have one of 
the best in the area," he said. "Ire­
spect them. They are a good football 

team and they proved that against 
Paintsville last Saturday." 

The Raiders are coming off a high 
performance, though a losing one, 
where they put 40 points on the 
scoreboard. But the defense gave up 62 
to the opposition, Magoffm County. 

Still, Daniels said that the players 
are, "feeling pretty good about them­
selves." 

"We had some good practices since 
the game last Friday night," said 
Daniels. "The kids are coming to prac­
tice with confidence and they feel pretty 
good about themselves." 

Last year Betsy Layne defeated the 
Raiders at the Lloyd Hamilton Com­
plex 14-8. But Daniels think that this 
may be a different time. 

"We think we will have a good game 
against them," he said. "We're better 
health-wise than we were for the 
Magoffm County game. Some are still 

sick and some are feeling the effects of 
the sickness. But, we'll be ready." 

Although the Raiders and Hornets 
put 102 points on the scoreboard last 
week, Daniels doubts if that is going to 
happen tonight. 

"Itwillbealow-scoringgame. There 
won't be that much scoring. They are a 
good defensive ballclub and we're play­
ing better on defense." 

Terrance Mullins, who went out 
early against Magoffin County, is ex­
pected to return tonight and fill his spot 
in the secondary. 

"Terrance is a tough kid," said 
Daniels. "I asked him if he wanted to 
sit out a day and rest, he said that no he 
wanted to practice. He's a little stiff 
and sore some." 

But Betsy Layne doesn't throw the 
ball that much, so will the Raiders fill 
the gaps to stop the running game of 
Betsy Layne? 

"We will have to contain Rocky 
Newsome," said Daniels. "He could 
be a problem for us if he gets on a roll. 
He can pick up three to five yards a 
carry if we don't stop him. 

"Then we have to be concerned 
about (Brent) Akers and (Craig) 
Hamilton. We will have to stop them 
from tackle to tackle. 

"They play a good defensive game. 
They run a 5-3 and play it as well as 
anyone. I only saw them make a 
couple of mistakes on defense against 
Paintsville," said Daniels. 

Daniels added that he likes the 
play of Bubba Combs and Shannon 
Hall and thinks they could pose some 
problems for the Raiders. 

"There's not many better in the 
area than those two," he said. "They 
are very fast coming off the ball. 
They are deceivingly quick for their 
size." 

Have A Safe an.d Win.n.in.g Season. 

South 
Floyd 

Raiders 
•g4 

R 
0 
s 
T 
E 
R 

Wl NAME 
(1) Nick Compton 
(2) Aaron Hall 
(5) Scott Johnson 

(10) Adam Wright 
(11) Justin Ray 
(14) Terrance Mullins 
(20) Chet McCarty 
(21) Brent Hamilton 
(22) William Willard 
(24) Richie Johnson 
(26) Chad Slone 
(28) Charles Kendrick 
(37) Ronald Wright 
(38) Mark Smallwood 
( 41) Chris Isaac 
( 42) Ketrin Mays 
( 44) Heath Hall 
(SO) Dustin Hall 
(51) Billy Micheal 
(52) Jarrod Compton 

Ronnie M. Slone 
Attorney 

South Lake Dr., Prestonsburg 

886-0006 

HT. YlL .YB ~ Wl~ 
6-0 160 FR QB (55) Matt Taylor 
6-2 200 so QB-T (60) Jason Woods 
6-0 170 so FB-TE (61) Kevin Stancil 
5-11 185 JR RB (62) Kenny King 
5-10 165 SR QB-S (63) Andree Faine 
6-1 170 JR QB-S ( 65) Aaron Caudill 
5-8 175 JR FB (66) Jesse Little 
5-8 160 FR RB ( 67) J efT Sexton 
5-7 160 JR E ( 68) Matt Slone 
5-8 160 so CB (69) Nathan Reed 
5-11 180 SR RB (72) Markus Little 
5-9 150 FR G-RB (74) Joe Caudill 
6-0 225 so FB (75) Pete Lawson 
5-9 160 so E (76) Emit Thompson 
5-10 165 so RB (77) Bo Rogers 
5-11 155 FR FB (78) Shawn Curry 
S-6 130 so s (80) Travis Johnson 
5-8 155 FR G (82) Kurtis Anderson 
6-0 225 JR c (84) Coby Little 
6-0 200 SR (88) Kevin Johnson 

HL WL YB ~ 
5-11 170 FR LB 
6-0 200 so c 
6-2 285 JR T 
6-0 185 SR G 
6-3 225 so C-T 
6-2 275 so T 
5-10 165 so G 
5-10 200 so T 
6-1 280 so c 
6-1 210 FR E 
5-10 170 so G 
6-1 210 FR T 
6-0 270 JR G 
5-10 200 FR T 
6-3 208 SR G 
6-6 345 SR T 
5-11 175 so E 
5-9 160 FR E 
5-10 170 FR RB 
6-2 210 SR E 
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Allen Central hopes to regroup at Fleming-Neon 
FIELD 

TECHNICIAN by Ed Taylor 
Sports Editor 

Coach Glenn Reeves and his Allen 
Central Rebels (0-1) will head into 
Letcher County where his football 
team will face another stiff test on the 
road in the second week of high school 
football. 

The Rebels are still smarting from 
their 16-8 loss to Elkhorn City last 
Friday ni~bt and will be looking to 
even their record as they face Steve 
Holbrook's Pirates. 

Neon is smarting a little them­
selves after being shellacked by 
Middlesboro, 51-8, last Saturday 
night. 

The Rebels need to generate some 
offense in the worst way. Allen Cen­
tral looked very good on defense 
against the Cougars, but it was a 
fumbled option play that did the 
Rebels in. 

"We'll be coming into this game 
more educated," said the Allen Cen-

tral mentor. "We've made some ad­
justments and we've pointed some 
things out to the players." 

Quarterback Adam Coleman 
failed to book up with his receivers 
on some crucial plays in the waning 
moments of the game. He bad receiv­
ers open but failed to connect. 

The inability to complete the 
passes just may cause Coach Reeves 
to move senior quarterback and de­
fensive linebacker Brad Blackburn 
back into the signal calling slot. 

"We don't want Coleman to think 
be bas a lock on the position," said 
Coach Reeves after the Elkhorn City 
loss. "We may take a look at Brad 
back there against Neon." 

The Rebel coach indicated that he 
may go with both quarterbacks against 
Neon. 

"Instead of sending in a play via a 
back, we just used our quarterbacks 
to bring in the play," said Reeves. 

The backfield for the Rebels also 
failed to move the ball as they rushed 

for only 83 yards in last Friday's 
encounter. 

,One of the adjustments that the 
Rebel coach expects to make is a 
movement in the backfield. 

"We're going to move James 
Osborne back to the backfield," said 
Reeves. "He can give us more block­
ing there." 

Osborne starred in the backfield 
for the Rebels last year and readily 
accepted the move to the line. 

"I want to do whatever I can to 
help us win," he said at the start of the 
season. 

The old saying "Your backfield is 
only as good as your offensive line," 
certainly holds true here. While the 
Rebels' line must open up holes for 
the backfield to run through, Coach 
Reeves said that his backs are going 
have to quit dancing around and bit 
the boles. 

"The holes are there," be said. 
"But when they get the ball, they 
have to dance around. We showed 
them that on film and told them, 
There's the hole- get to it." 

The offensive line will be anchored 
by Jy Shepherd (6'3", 265), Shawn 
Robinson ( 6'3", 245) and Chris Bailey 
(6'4", 260). The size is there, but 
there must be heart also. 

On the defensive side of the foot­
ball, the Rebels will have one of the 
top linebackers around, Brad 
Blackburn, who plays with a lot of 
heart. 

Blackburn has come out to play in 
his senior year and was very strong 
on defense against Elkhorn City last 

Friday night. Hard-hitting Matt 
Varney (5'10", 160) will be at an­
other lineback slot and fans could sec 
Varney carry the ball on offense. 

The surprise on the defensive side 
for the Rebels last week was Mike 
"Bubba" Osborne, who led the Rebel 
charge with seven first hits and five 
assists. 

Reeves scouting report ... 
"Neon has very good size," said 

Coach Reeves. "They will run the 
wing T and the 52 on defense. 

"We will have to beef up our inte­
rior defense some. They have one 
back that really runs the ball well. 
They will mix it up and they will 
throw the football." 

Neon found themselves down 
early to a good Middlesboro team 
and they trailed 41-0 at the half. 

"Middlesboro is a great team," 
said Reeves. "I've played them be­
fore and I know about their program. 

"Neon is going to be a strong team 
because of their size. But I feel we 
will play well. Our defense needs to 
hold them." 

Coach Reeves said that Rebel fans 
should not be surprised to see the 
Rebels come out and throwing early 
in the game. 

Keys of the game ... 
• Off tackle play. 
"Our linebackers and dcfensi ve 

ends must play hard," said Reeves. 
• Penalties. "We have to cut down 

on our penalties. We had too many 
against Elkhorn City." 

The Rebels received nine flags 

Floyd County 
Football Standings - Scoring Leaders 

Player School 1D CONV/FGIXP 
Chad Slone South Aoyd 4 
Thomas Ratliff P'Burg 2 
Kevin Johnson South Aoyd 1 
Adam Wright South Aoyd 1 
Blake Leslie P'Burg 1 
Larry Morris P'Burg 1 
Beau Tackett Allen Central 1 
Josh Reeves Allen Central 0 

Week One 
Prestonsburg 
Allen Central 
Betsy Layne 

0-0-0 
1-0-0 
1-0-0 
0-0-0 
0-0-0 
0-0-0 
0-0-0 
1-0-0 

TOTAL 
24 
14 
8 
6 
6 
6 
6 

2 

last Friday for 95 yards in penalties; 
several came from personal fouls. 

"Levi (Wells) needs to learn that 
at the defensive end position that be 
is lined up with the official," said 
Reeves. "He's right there to see him 
and be can't be swinging his fists. 
He'll get caught." 

Coach Reeves will switch Josh 
Reeves from his linebacker position 
to defensive end. "Wewanttokindof 
hide Levi a little bit," he said laugh-
in g. 

Rebel notes: 
• The Rebels have grown in num­

bers, from 33 to 45 players on the 
roster now. 

"We got a good number of fresh­
men out now," said Reeves. "We 
need to be getting more equipment 
for them." 

The 45 players are the most who 
have dressed for a Rebel team. 

If you're a skilled technician 
who likes to travel, with prior 

experience in construction 
equipment mechanics, and 

have a good working know­
ledge of diesel engines & 

hydraulics, here's your chance 
to earn top pay from one of 
Kentucky's oldest and most 
respected equipment com-

panies. Added benefits include: 
health insurance, sick leave, 

vacation, tool allowance, and 
tuition reimbursement Send 

your resume or call our 
Prestonsburg, KY branch 
office, contact]. C. Miller. 

II Wilson 
Equipment 
Company 

Route 3, Watergap Road 
Prestonsburg, KY 41653 

1-800-955-9457 

7f2J_rfc/e.rness Jfe_ryh/s 
Prime Building lots For Safe 

With Restrictions 
1/4 mile up Mare Creek Road, Stanville, Ky. 

Day Phone: 478-5000 Evening Phone: 478-4450 
Private living equidistant from Pikeville or Prestonsburg. Reasonably priced. 
Above flood stage. All utilities available, including city water. Over751ots available. 

To Prestonsburg 

<!" • 

~ 
~ 

~ 
LOTS 

Mare Creek --......... 
OBiackburn's Green House N 

§~Stanville, Ky. 

Scale: 1~=2000' 

CLOSED 
FOR VACATION 

tooamW fll%11-
af PKESTDNSBUIG 

Tackett needs to hit holes! 
South Floyd 

1-0 
0-1 
0-1 
0-1 South Lake Drive 

886-8070 Schedule 
The Allen Central Rebels will travel to Fleming-Neon tonight looking for 
their first win In the second week of the season. Beau Tackett (34) will 
carry, not only the football, but the hopes for a Rebel win. (photo by Ed 
Taylor) Friday night, September 2 

Betsy Layne at South Floyd, 7:30p.m. Closing Monday, Sept. 5th 
thru Open house scheduled 

for Paintsville Lake 

Prestonsburg at Lexington Lafayette, 7:30 p.m. 
Allen Central at Fleming-Neon, 7:30 p,m. 

Last Week 
Prestonsburg 26, Pikeville 21 

Magoffin County 62, South Floyd 40 
Elkhorn City 16, Allen CentralS 

Paintsville 7, Betsy Layne 0 

Sunday, Sept. 11th 

WILL REOPEN ON 
Monday, September 12th 

at 10:30 a.m. 

The U.S. Army Corps of Engi­
neers will sponsor an open house 
Friday, September9, from noon tmtil 
9 p.m., at the Paintsville Dam. 

Representatives will be present 
from several area agencies, includ­
ing the Kentucky Department ofFish 
and Wildlife, the Kentucky Water 
Patrol, the Kentucky Division ofFor­
estry, the Paintsville Tourism Com­
mission, and the Paintsville Lake 
Marina. A question and answer ses­
sion from 7 p.m. until 9 p.m. will 
offer an opportunity for public com­
ments and suggestions. 

In addition to the question and 
answer portion, the open house will 
sponsor guided tours and live exhib­
its. Refreshments will be served and 
everyone is urged to attend. 

For more information, contact 
Robert Beverley, Resource Manager, 
Monday-Friday, 7:30 a.m. to 4 p.m. 
at (606) 297-6312 or write to Re­
source Manager, Paintsville Lake, 
807 Ky. Rt 2275, Staffordsville, KY 
41256-9035. 

Pleasure Rid9e 
Golf Driving Range 

21/2 mi. North of Prestonsburg 
on US23 

Weekdays-2 p.m. til dark 
Weekends-noon til dark 

Golf lessons are now available 
on weekends! 

McDowell ARH Hospital 
is pleased to announce the association of 

CHANDRA VARIA, M.D. 
Certified by the American Board of Obstetrics and Gynecology 

Beginning 
September 7th, 1994 

and 
September 21st, 1994 

Appointments may be made by calling 
377-3400 

Days and hours to be expanded, as 
needed. 

Patients will be seen in 
Dr. Ruben Singayao's office. 

~ 
McDOWELL APPALACHh"\.N 
REGIONAL HOSPITAL 

Floyd Counry 
Schools 

WanT You! 
The following positions are currently 
available through the Floyd County 
Schools. Applications, resumes and cre­
dentials may be delivered Monday-Fri­
day, 8 a.m. until4 p.m. at the Floyd County 
Board of Education Offices at 69 North 
Arnold Avenue, Prestonsburg, Ky. 41653. 

• Head Start/Preschool Teacher (Non-Certified): Positions available at Drift, Martin Head 
Start Centers; requires high school diploma or GED and Child Development Associate 
(CDA); COL preferred. Salary: $8.41 per hour, 185 days. 

• Instructional Assistant (Aide), Martin Head Start: Must have high school diploma or 
GED. Must have passed Adult Basic Learning Examination (ABLE). 

• Jobs After Graduation Comprehensive Specialist: Located at Betsy Layne High School; 
Responsible for working with students to develop job skills and leadership ability and 
enhance employment viability. Requires secondary teaching certificate, appropriate 
background and experience. 

• Assistant Coordinator, Adams Middle School (20 hours per week, $8,000 per year): 
Requires high school diploma or GED, some college preferred. CPR training required, 
must be able to pass physical exam, crime check. 

• Custodial Trainer: Works around district, training custodial staff in safety and cleaning 
techniques. Requires high school diploma or GED. Experience preferred. Must pass 
physical exam, criminal records check. 

• Class AA Maintenance, Carpentry Plus: Located at maintenance department. Requires 
high school diploma or GED; vast experience preferred. Must be able to pass criminal 
records check, have own transportation. 
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South Lake Drive 

Golf Club Repair 
Trophies 

Polo, Ralph Lauren 
& much more 

OPEN 
Monday-Friday, 10-6 

Saturday, 10-2 

886-0674 

For Sale 

1974 CAMPER. 26 ft w/ 
bath. Tandem axle. $1,800. 
Call 358-41 67 after 5 p.m. 

BOLEN APPLIANCE 
SERVICE: The best in the 
business! Fast, clean and 
friendly service on washers, 
dryers, stoves and refrigera­
tors. Two technicians with 
37 years combined experi­
ence to serve you. New and 
used parts in stock or spe­
cial orders. We are the 
best-ask your neighbor. 
Call358-961 7 or 946-2529. 

JOB ANNOUNCEMENT 
KENTUCKY 

DEPARTMENT OF PARKS 
Job Announcement Number: 94-106(A) 

Date: 08/24/94 

Position: Park Worker (Part-time) 

Location: Jenny Wiley State Resort Park. 
Prestonsburg, KY 

Grade and Salary: Grade 04, Salary $4.991 per Hour 

Minimum Requirements; None. 
Apply by submitting a state application (which can be 
obtained at the local Department of Employment Ser­
vices or any other state government office) to: 

Kentucky Department of Personnel 
200 Fair Oaks Lane 
Suite 517 
Frankfort, KY 40601 

Job announcement number should be placed in the 
upper right-hand corner of the application in the "Spe­
cial Announcement No." blank. 

Deadline for applying: You must qualify, test, • and be 
placed on the register by September 24, 1 994. (*Writ­
ten test not required.) 

Filling this position is subject to any state government 
hiring restrictions. 

AN EQUAL OPPORTUNITY EMPLOYER MIF/0 

886-8506 I 

CAR BATTERIES from 
$19.95. Cash toroid batter­
ies. The Batte:y Connection, 
Paintsville. Call 789-1966. 

CA TILE: Cows and calves. 
Cows yet to birth calves and 
young Limousin bull of 
breeding age. Serious in­
quiries only. Call874-9794. 

COMICS FOR SALE: Many 
at $1 each. Send $1 for 
catalog (refundable with 
order) to COMICS, P.O.Box 
254, Banner, KY 41603. 

FOR SALE: New 1 2' tram­
poline. Paid $330. Will sell 
for $275. Call886-0351. 

FOR SALE: One Bundy 
trumpet, $350; and, one 
Bundy clarinet, $100. Used. 
Both in good condition. Call 
377-6496. 

FOR SALE: 1979 Runabout 
boat w/trailer. JayBee, 90 
HP. Hasnewseatsandnew 
carpet. Asking $2,500. Call 
789-7196 or 478-3211. 

FOR SALE: 8ft. wall cabinet 
and 8ft. base cnbinet. $125. 
Call 358-4524. 

FOR SALE: Robinson-Mars 
crane. 10 ton, 30 ft. span, 
60 ft. travel. Call 946-2662 
or 946-2663. 

FOR SALE: Baby swing, 
walker, high chair, bath, 
playpen. etc.; queen size 
waterbed; gymnastic mats 
and spotting belt; office desk 
with chair; four piece can­
opy bedroom set. Call 606-
478-1107. 

FOR SALE: Browning Mi­
rage compound bow with 
overdraw; Thompson 50 
calibur White Mountain car-

. bine gun; also, GE camcor­
der with hardshell case. Call 
478-9828. 

FOR SALE: 15x27 above 
ground swimming pool with 
good sand filter; 1987Honda 
80 motorcycle; Gravely with 
walk behind tractor. Call 
874-0024 after 5 p.m. 

GOLDEN GIFTS WHOLE· 
SALE OUTLET. Jewelry 
(new and used); jewelry 
supplies; diamond testers; 
scales; ring boxes; gold 
testers. Gold and diamonds 
tested free. Call 886-8990 
for directions. 

1/2.0FF SPECIAL fur limited· time 
call and rcscnc )'Ours toda)' 

mrs. earol 
PSYCHIC READER AND ADVISOR 

Can help you in all problems of life including 
Love, Business, Marriage and affairs of lhe 

bean. Spca3117.tS in rt:lding tarot catds, palm 
and aystal rea:! ings. 

304n36-t599 
i..DcJitdClllUS. RT 60EIII.3ailes!'csiii'H~mt.Uil 

""'" 1/0GJ Piw H<1 in Blllxutnle, Well Vi'ptia. 

HEY LOOK! Need a used 
appliance with new war­
ranty? All used Maytag 
appliances guaranteed for 
one year. All others 4-6 
months. No one beats our 
warranty, prices or service. 
Washers, dryers, stoves and 
refrigerators ready for deliv­
ery. Call 358-9617 or 946-
2529. 

KENMORE WASHER AND 
DRYER. Excellent condi­
tion. $250. Also, 1980 
Toyota Tercel. Rebuilt 
engine, new tires. Excellent 
work car. $500. Call 874-
2750. 

LIQUIDATION SALE 
MISTY K MINING 

CO., INC. 
Mining Equipment: Elkhorn 
AR-4 scoops; Joy. 16-RB 
cutting machine AC; ACME 
D-3 roof bolter DC, with 
ATRS; long Aridox 24-B 
mobile coal drill DC; belt 
head drives; belt; belt cen­
ters; high line; rock picking 
table; shaker; John Deere 
front end loader 646-A; 
Gould 3 phase battery charg­
ers; and assorted mining 
supplies. Call weekdays 
until 3 p.m., 606-377-6305; 
or after 5 p.m. call 606-886· 
8077. 

SUNQUEST WOLFF 
TANNING BEDS 
New Commercial­

Home Units 
From $199. 

Lamps-Lotions­
Accessories. 

Monthly payments 
as low as $18. 

Call today FREE NEW 
color catalog. 

1-800-462-9197. 

KILL ROACHES! 
Buy ENFORCER OJerNite® 
Roach Spray or OverNite 
Pest Control Concentrate. 
Makes 2 gallons. Kills 
roaches overnight or your 
money back; GUARAN­
TEED! Available at Sandy 
Valley Hardware, Hylton 
Complex, U.S. 23. 

"' '(. Real-Estate 
For Sale 

BARGAIN HOMES: Fore· 
closed, HUD, VA, S&L Bail­
out properties. Low down. 
Fantastic savings. Call 1-
805-962-8000, ext. H-4680 
for list. 

BRIARWOOD:· Four bed­
room, two bath brick ranch. 
New roof and paint. Call 
606-224-3852 after 6 p.m. 

BUILDING LOTS FOR 
SALE: Copperas Lick Es­
tates. Abbott Road. Ap­
proximately 3.3 miles from 
Prestonsburg. Beautiful 
community. Call 285-9201, 
dayG; or 886-6476 after 5. 

DEER HUNTER'S PARA· 
DISE: Two ponds, two 
barns, 90+ tillable acres, rest 
woodland. Located near 
Cave Run Lake. An invest­
ment opportunity for devel­
opment or farming. Nego­
tiable. Call 606-743-7612, 
mghts. 

FOR SALE: Four bedroom 
house at Estill. Central heat/ 
air. Small outside building. 
Call 358-4152. 

~ 
Mastercard 
\...._)(_/ 

FOR SALE: Three bedroom, 
1 1/2 bath home. Full fin­
ished basement. Large lot. 
Dana. Call478·9173. 

FOR SALE: 35 acres. Two 
trailers completely set up 
and rented. Room for more. 
Prestonsburg area. 
$36,000. Serious inquiries 
only. 606-666-4667. 

FOR SALE: 11 acres, 
house. Good water. Arkan­
sas Creek. $29,000. Call 
606· 7 44-2070. 

FOR SALE: Two year old 
home. 1 1/2 story. Three 
bedroom, two bath. Approxi­
mately 5 acres w/three 
additional lots. Mare Creek, 
Stanville. 478-4950. 

FOR SALE: Five bedroom 
house. 20 acres +1-. Also, 
three piece living room suit; 
baby bed: miscellaneous 
items. 422 Jane Brown 
Branch. 606-886-2882. 

HOUSE FOR SALE: Three 
bedroom, one bath. Re­
cently remodeled. Storage 
shed. Large lot. Stone Coal, 
near Garrett. Call358-21 04 
after 6 p.m. 

IVEL, KY 
IVEL, KY 
Lfaekwhat 

$29,590°0 

will get you­
A 56-ft. doublewide with 
3 bdrms., air, WID, skirt· 
ing, pads, stove, ref rig., 
dinete set, couch & 
chair, delivered, set, 
blocked and anchored. 

IVEL, KY 
• 
IVEL, KY 

Rainbow Homes 
On the 4-lane on the 
hill, halfway between 

Pikeville and 
Prestonsburg at 

IVEL, KY 
Phone 

(606) 478-4530 
Price does not Include 

tax and title. 

· ·Colorama 
Rental Center 

. Seeking credit manager trainees. 
ualific tions: Neat in appearance hiCJilly 

motivated and desire to succed. 
Apply in person only at 
----Colorama -----. 

Glyn ,View Plaza 
Prestonsburg. Ky 

• 

• 

• 



• 

NEAR CAVE 
RUN LAKE 

Vacation cabins and 
mobile homes to rent 
weekly or weekends. 

Lots and cabins for sale. 
Call and make 

an appointment. 
Jim Whitt, 

606-768-3061. 

$16,995°0 

Plus tax and title gets 
you a new 14' wide 2 
or 3 BR mobile home 
with air, WID, skirting, 
stove, refrig., an­
chored, delivered and 
blocked. 

IVEL, KY 
IVEL, KY 

Rainbow Homes 

IVEL, KY 
IVEL, KY 

On the 4-lane on the 
hill, on Rt. 23, 

haHway between 
Pikeville and 
Prestonsburg 

IVEL, KY 
Rainbow Homes 

Phone 
(606) 478-4530 

LOTS FOR SALE: Cave 
Run Lake, near Longbow 
Boat Dock, Rt. 1693. City 
water. Phone 768-S204. 

LOW ENERGY THREE 
BEDROOM HOME w/two 
large decks. 1 OOx200 lot. 
Quiet and private location 
near Paintsville Lake. Call 
789-462S. 

TWO HOUSES FOR SALE: 
One eight room w/two baths. 
1 4 acres more or less. One 
six room w/bath. 1 2 acres 
more or less. Call87 4-2556. 

:{:· Autos······· Y•r'··· 

wtK· Fo~\$alflJ ··· 
1979 THUNDERBIRD. N 
C, P/8. Runs good. $600, 
will negotiate. Caii606-478-
49SS after 5 p.m. 

1984 CHEVY CAVALIER. 
Fuel injection. Needs some 
work. For more information 
call 285-S762. 

1991 CHEVY S-10 4X4 
BLAZER. Whitewlburgundy 
interior. Loaded with extras. 
Low miles. Well taken care 
of. Never used for off road 
driving. Call 886-8167. 

FOR SALE: 1 979 Ford F-
350 Dump; 1980 Ford F-
1 50 4x4 truck; 1983 Jeep 
Wagoneer 4x4. Call 358-
9777. 

TEAM EFFORT 
Unlimited earnings opportunity to 
$500.00 per week for husband and/or 
wife. Start a joint career with one of the 
nation's leading companies. Good in­
come, flexible hours, benefits. 

can Tracy 

606-874-1226 
E.O.E. 

GET YOUR .DRIVER'S LI­
CENSE IN T\VO WEEKS! PCC 
DRIVEREDUCATIONTRAIN­
ING-Days, Evenings, Week­
ends-Female and Male Instruc­
tors. Fee: $190. Call886-3863 and 
ask for CFJCS to register. 

NATIONWIDE 
INSURANCE COMPANY 
HAS AN IMMEDIATE OPENING 

FOR A CLAIMS REPRESENTATIVE 
TO HANDLE CLAIMS IN THE 

PI KEVILLE AREA 
Three to five years experience required 
to investigate and resolve property, li­
ability and physical damage claims. Start­
ing salary commensurate with experi­
ence; excellent benefits and company 
car provided. 

To apply, please send resume to: 

The Employment Counselor 
P.O. Box278 

Memphis, TN 38101 
E.O.E. 

HICKS' AUTO SALES 
114 W. MT. PKWY. 

886-3451 
1987 SUBARU WAGON. 
Five speed, 4x4 Turbo, aJ 
c. 87,000 miles. $3,300. 
1987 GMC S-15 PICKUP. 
Automatic, V-6, a/c. 
68,000 miles. $4,000. 
1992 FORD RANGER. 
Five speed, ale, V-6. 
30,000 miles. $6,800. 
1991 MERCURY COU­
GAR XR7. Automatic, all 
power, a/c, sunroof, 
leather seats, JBL sound. 
68,000 miles. $9,500. 
1993 CHEVY ASTRO 
VAN LT. Luxury package. 
Automatic, front/back air. 
2,000 miles. $12,500. 
1986 FORD F-150. Auto­
matic, air. High miles. 
$2,400. 
1994 CHEVY S-10 
PICKUP. Automatic, 4.3. 
Loaded. 4,000 miles. 
$9,500. 
1SI90 CHEVY CORSICA. 
Automatic, air, V _6. All 
power. 50,000 miles. 
$4,300. 
1992 FORD AEROSTAR 
EXTENDED VAN. Auto­
matic, air. Sport package. 
30,000 miles. $11,500. 
1988 OLDS CUTLASS 
SUPREME. Automatic, 
air, all power. 80,000 
miles. $4,200. 

FOR SALE: 1982 280ZX 
Turbo. Excellent cond~ion. 
58,000 miles. One owner. 
$4,800solid. Call639-2252. 

FOR SALE: Nice older 
dually truck. 1978 Chevy 
one ton. Has new paint, 
sunvisor, six new tires, hitch 
and a lot more. Ready to 
workforyou. Call886-1758 
after 7:SO p.m. 

1985 FORD ESCORT: 
Automatic. $900. 
1981 CHEVROLET 
PICKUP. Automatic. 
$1,500. 
1988 PLYMOUTH SUN­
DANCE. Automatic, air. 
$1,900. 
1985 HONDA ACCORD. 
Automatic, air, white. 
$2,900. 
1986 BUICK LESABRE 
UMITED. Silver. One 
owner. $3,900. 
1984 CHRYSLER NEW 
YORKER. Blue. 85,000 
miles. $3,900. 
1986 CHEVROLET VAN. 
Customized, blue. $4,900. 
1990 OLDSMOBILE Cl· 
ERA. Maroon. $5,900. 
1988 BUICK LESABRE. 
Gold. 60,000 miles. 
$6,900. 
1990 PONTIAC GRAND 
AM. Red. Automatic, air. 
$7,900. 

MUSIC CARTER 
HUGHES 

482 South Lake Drive 
Prestonsburg 

886·9181. 

FOR SALE: 1977 Buick Park 
Avenue. Low miles. Real 
good condition. Call 886-
2474 or 886-2212. 

FOR SALE: 1987 BMW. 
Five speed, standard shift. 
Sunroof, power steering, 
power brakes, four door. 
Good condition. Call 285-
3318 or 285-3912. 

LOCAL AUTO DEALER 
GUARANTEES AUTO FI­
NANCING. If you work­
you drivel! No co-signers 
necessary. Low down pay­
ment required. Call Mr. 
Green at 606-437-6282 for 
more information. 

1988 16-1/2 ft. ProCraft Fish & Ski boat. Red and 
Silver with 90-h.p. Mercury motor with tilt and 
trim. 12/24 volt Minn Kota trolling motor, 2 live 
wells, walk-thru windshield, Hummingbird depth 
finder, and drive-on trailer. Stored in dry. $6,800 
firm. Will also consider smaller aluminum bass 
boat on a partial trade. 

Call 886-2896 
Serious inquiries only. 

The Floyd County Times 

.. For Sale 
or Rent 

FOR SALE OR LEASE: 
Commercial property lo­
cated in Prestonsburg, KY. 
Formerly John Gray Auto 
Sales. Consists of 225 foot 
frontage with a building 
approximately 1,800 sq. ft. 
with new carpet and central 
air and heat. Suitable for 
any type busines. Plenty of 
parking. Call513· n2-5944, 
ask for Terry Branham. 

APARTMENTS FOR RENT: 
One bedroom and efficiency. 
Convenient location. Cen­
tral air. Reasonable rent. 
References and deposit re­
quired. Call 886-0S26. 

FOR RENT OR LEASE: 
Building containing space for 
small business or office and 
three room apartment. Inter­
section of U.S. 23 and Rt. 
80. Call Curtis Hatfield at 
606-673-3452. 

FOR RENT: Two bedroom 
trailer. Half mile from Thun­
der Ridge. Unfurnished. 
Garden space. Large yard. 
No inside pets. Call or see 
Don Howard's Guide Serv­
ice at Pelphrey's Bait Shop 
in Louisa, 638-4248. 

FOR RENT: Two bedroom 
trailer. Near HRMC. $285/ 
month plus utilities. Deposit 
required. Call S58·9761. 

FOR RENT: At McDowell. 
One bedroom furnished 
apartment. $200/month plus 
utilities and security deposit. 
No pets. HUD accpeted. 
Call S77 -6881. 

FOR RENT: Three bedroom 
house on Highway 1 426, 
Banner. Central heat/air. 
$400/month plus utilities and 
depos~. Call874-9814. 

FOR RENT: Nice apart­
ment. Two bedrooms, heat 
pump, dishwasher, washer/ 
dryer hookups. U.S. 23, near 
Jenny Wiley entrance. Call 
789-5973. 

FOR RENT: Nice clean 
trailer space. Just outside 
city limits. Also, camper 
space just outside city lim­
~s. Call886-2474. 

FOR RENT: 12x60 trailer. 
One bedroom. Located at 
Lancer. No pets. Call 285-
0214 after 4 p.m. 

FOR RENT: Private trailer 
lot. Five minutes from 
Prestonsburg. One lot avail­
able. Call 886·8167. 

FOR RENT: One bedroom 
house located at McDowell. 
Call3n·2520. 

HOUSE FOR RENT: Two 
bedrooms. Riverside Drive, 
Prestonsburg. $4SO/month 
plus utilities. Deposit re­
quired. Call 886-3404. 

OFFICE SPACE FOR 
RENT: 2,400 sq. ft. of office 
and storage space which 
can be leased all together or 
as three separate units of 
800 sq. ft. each with sepa­
rate utilities and paved park­
ing to accommodate up to a 
total of 1 2 vehicles. Each 
unit separately heated and 
cooled with separate con­
trols. Contact TOM ROSE 
at 886-2S21. 

THREE BEDROOM 
TRAILER FOR RENT: Cow 
Creek area. $300/month. 
Gas paid. References and 
deposit required. No inside 
pets. Call 87 4-9968. 

TRAILER FOR RENT: New 
Allen. Deposit required. No 
pets. Call874-8151 or874-
21 14 after 5 p.m. 

TRAILER FOR RENT: One 
bedroom. Completely re­
modeled. Partially fur­
nished. Ten minutes from 
town. $300/month plus 
deposit. Private. Also, 1988 
Kawasaki EX500 for sale. 
$1 ,595. Call 874-9646. 

TRAILER FOR RENT: 
$200/month. Located on Rt. 
7, Salt Lick. Call358-4524. 

TRAILER LOT FOR RENT: 
Located two miles up Cow 
Creek. City water with all 
other hookups available. 
$70/month. Out of flood 
plain. Call 874-2802, J. 
Davis. 

Em{lloyment 
r··· ··· iJtvai/able 

ACCOUNT ANT: An oppor­
tunity exists for an account­
ant with area coal company. 
Minimum qualifications in­
clude: College or university 
degree in accounting with 
five years experience or 
equivalent combination of 
education and experience 
in coal or coal related field. 
CPA certificate preferred. 
Compensation includes a full 
benefit package. For con­
sideration, send complete 
resume to: Human Re­
source Manager, HC 64 Box 
915, DeBord, KY 41214. 

Attention Prestonsburg ... 
...POSTAL JOss·•• 

$12.26 perhourtostart, plus 
benefits. Postal carriers, 
sorters, clerks, mainte­
nance. For an application 
and exam information caii1-
219-7S6-4715, ext. P-S491 
from 9 a.m.-9 p.m., 7 days. 

AVON. BUYORSELL. Call 
Janey at 886-2082. 

BABYSITTER NEEDED: 
Light housekeeping. Flex­
ible hours. References 
required. Call 886-6557. 

BASS PLAYER NEEDED 
FOR HARD ROCK BAND. 
Serious minded only need 
apply. Band is currently 
doing studio work. Call87 4-
9127 or 886-9652 after 6 
p.m. 

DRIVER NEEDED: Deliv­
ery person wanted. COL 
license preferred, but not 
necessary. Call Marco In­
dustrial Tire for appointment, 
S77-6568. 

EARN UP TO $1,000 
WEEKLY stuffing envelopes 
athome. Beyourboss. Start 
now. No experience. Free 
supplies, free information. 
No obligation. Send self­
addressed stamped enve­
lope to: Cascade, Dept. 78, 
P.O. Box 5421, San Angelo, 
TX 76902. 

EASTERN KY 
VETERANS 

Volunteers of America helps 
unemployed veterans who 
can't afford rent or are near­
ing eviction (FREE). We 
pay for COL or mine safety 
training, safety equipment, 
etc., to help make you em­
ployable. We link you with 
employers, housing and 
social services. Call Alex 
Carroll (collect), 886-S582. 

EMPLOYMENT OPPOR­
TUNITY: RIS Truck Body is 
looking for several new 

· employees: Welders, both 
aluminum and steel; me­
chanics; and painters. Must 
have high school diploma or 
G.E.O. equivalent. To ap­
ply, please contact Bonnie 
Ousley at the Department 
for Employment Services in 
Prestonsburg, 606-886-
2S96. 

GREAT OPPORTUNITY 
FOR LADIES AND MEN 
selling Americana Jewelry 
in their spare time or full 
time. $25-$50 per hour or 
more. Also, 1991 Pontoon 
for sale. Excellent condi­
tion. Two motors. grill, ste­
reo. Call 886"671S. 

POSITION AVAILABLE 
SERVICE COORDINATOR 
in Kentucky IMPACT Pro­
gram. Working with chil­
dren and adolescents with 
severe emotional disabilities 
and their families. RE­
QUIRES BACHELOR'S 
DEGREE in Psychology, 
Social Work, Human Serv­
ices or Special Education 
and ONE YEAR EXPERI­
ENCE working with children. 
Highly competitive salary, 
excellent benefits. Two po­
sitions available, one in 
Floyd County and one in 
Johnson/Martin Counties. 
You may complete an appli­
cation at Mountain Compre­
hensive Care Center, Front 
Street, Prestonsburg (old 
hospital building, third floor). 

POSTAL JOBS 
Start $1 1 .41/hour. For exam 
and application information 
call 21 9-769-8S01 ext. 
KY556, 8 a.m.-8 p.m., Sun­
day-Friday. 

RESUMES ARE BEING 
SOUGHT FROM laborers, 
electricians, welders, equip­
ment operators and others 
wishing to be considered for 
possible short and long term 
temporary work assign­
ments at surface mines, 
surface facilities of under­
ground mines and related 
industries. Interested per­
sons may submit resumes 
or request one of our appli­
cations by writing to: Indus­
trial Manpower Services, 
Inc., P.O. Box 1S24, 
Prestonsburg, Ky 4165S. 

THE PEKING RESTAU­
RANT IS now taking appli­
cations for all positions. 
Applications can be picked 
up at Tobacco Mart, High­
lands Plaza, Paintsville; or 
Department for Employment 
Services, second floor of 
Paintsville Courthouse; or 
the Department for Employ­
ment Services in 
Prestonsburg. 

WANTED: Babysitterforsix­
year-old child in my home at 
Auxier. Several evenings a 
month. Must have refer­
ences. Call 886-0579 and 
leave a message. 

WANTED: Experienced 
partsperson. PreferablyGM 
trained. Send resume to: 
P.O. Box 278, Betsy Layne, 
KY 41605. 

WANTED: Insurance 
agency in Pikeville needs 
an experienced Personal 
Lines CSRICSA. Prefer 
General Lines license. Must 
have excellent written and 
oral communication skills 
and be proficient on com­
puters. Salary is negotiable. 
Send resume to: CSRICSA, 
c/o Floyd County Times, 
P.O. Box391, Prestonsburg, 
KY 41653. 

WILDLIFE/ 
CONSERVATION JOBS 

Game wardens, security, 
maintenance, etc. No expe­
rience necessary. Now hir­
ing. For information call21 9-
794-Q01 0, ext. 7619,8 a.m.-
9 p.m. 7 days. 

··.;x: 

Pets And 
A~~ Supplies 

AKC DALMATION PUP­
PIES. Black/white, liver/ 
white. Shots and wormed. 
$150 each. Call 886-2253. 

FOR SALE: AKC German 
Shepherd puppies. Eight 
weeksold. Firstshots. Black 
andtan. Call886-7942after 
6p.m. 

FREE TO GOOD HOME: 
Cats and kittens. Different 
ages. Call 886-3721. 

FREE TO GOOD HOME: 
Three kittens. Seven weeks 
old. Call 886-9107. 

The world's largest 
wooden building is the 
Hall of the Great 
Buddha in Nara, Japan. 
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Rummage 
Or Yarp S@.!~s 

BIG YARD SALE: Septem­
ber 1, 2, and 3 from 9-5. 
1616 Town Branch Road. 
Clothes; household items; 
little of everything. 

BIG, BIG, BIG YARD SALE: 
This Saturday and Sunday 
at home of Faye Fraley on 
Rt. 550, Eastern. Furniture, 
clothing, shoes, lots of • 
household items. 

CARPORT IV ARD SALE: 
Fifth Street, Goble Roberts. 
Beginning Wednesday, 
August S1, lasting till Sep­
tember S. Couch, chairs, 
tables, lamps, tape player, 
what nots, etc. 

CLOTHING SALE: Bring a 
grocery bag and fill it with 
summer clothes for $3 or 
two bags for $5. Place: St. 
Vincent Mission, David. 
Time: 9:S0-2:30. When: 
Tuesday, September 6 and 
Friday, September 9. 

FIVE FAMILY YARD SALE: 
Saturday, September S, 
from 9-5. 21/2 miles up Left 
Fork of Abbott Creek. Resi­
dence of James R. and 
Velma Shepherd. Tractor 
tire and tube; two auto stud­
ded tires; deepwell pump, 
tank and pipe; household 
items and clothing of vari­
ous sizes. Canceled if rain. 

GARAGE SALE: Cars, 
camper, four motors, tires, 
bicycles, shower doors, 
central air, men, women and 
children's jackets, pants and 
shirts, odds and ends, toys. 
Lots more. Beginning Fri­
day, September 2. Banner, 
2 1/2 miles up Prater. White 
garage. Goldie Conn, 87 4-
2662. 

GARAGE SALE: 680 N. 
Arnold Avenue (next to high 
school). Clothing, house­
hold items, bed, odds and 
ends, tires, etc. Saturday, 
Sept. S, from 9-S. 

HUGE YARD SALE: Satur­
day, SeptemberS, from9-4. 
What nots; appliances; fur­
niture; men, women and 
children's clothing. Behind 
Bank Josephine in Allen, 
second street on right. 

MOUNTAIN PARKWAY 
FLEA MARKET is open 
Saturday and Sunday. Lots 
of new and used items. Free 
parking. Fresh produce. 
Come and check it out. Ev­
eryone welcome! 

MULTI FAMILY YARD 
SALE: Saturday, Septem­
ber S, beginning at 9 a.m. 
King's Supply, Rt. 1428, 
between Allen and Martin. 
Nothing over $2. 

MULTI FAMILY YARD 
SALE: September 2-S from 
8 a.m. ·4 p.m. Household 
items, toys, clothing and 
home interior. Across from 
Hall Block Company, New 
Allen. Rain or shine. 

SALE!!! Gun cabinets, all 
sizes; kitchen, bathroom 
cabinets; windows; doors; 
furniture; appliances, $100/ 
up, guaranteed; trim; tag 
along trailers; bath tubs, $40; 
long, wide camper top; lots 
more. Located in Martin. 
Daylight only. No refunds. 
Call 285-S004. 

THREE FAMILY GARAGE/ 
YARD SALE: Just across 
Auxier Bridge . at Abbott 
Creek Kennel. Onedayonly, 
Saturday, SeptemberS. 

YARD SALE: Friday, Sep­
tember 2 and Saturday, 
SeptemberS. Martin,across 
from Youth Center (white 
house on corner). Women's 
plus size clothing; men and 
women's clothing. 

YARD SALE: Lancer, base­
ment of Cablevision build­
ing. Saturday, September 
s. 

YARD SALE: Wednesday, 
September 7, from 1 0-5. 
Clothes: Girls' S-4T, women 
plus sizes, some men's 
clothes; carseat; changing 
table; walker; toys; dishes; 
other items. Cliff Road, 1/4 
mile past church. Rain or 
shine. 

YARD SALE: Friday-Satur­
day, Sept. 2·3, from 9-5. 55 
Greer Street, Prestonsburg. 
Miscellaneous items. 

YARD SALE: August SO­
September S from 9-6. Cr· 
ider Branch, East Point. 
Watch for signs on Rt. 23. 
Too many items to list. 

YARD SALE: September 2-
3 from 9-6. 2 1/2 miles up 
Wilson Creek at Langley. 

YARD SALE: Saturday, 
September S, at Branham 
Village, behind 
Prestonsburg Auto Sales on 
Auxier Road. Crib bed and 
lots of other things. 

YARD SALE: Friday, Sep­
tember 2, and Saturday, 
September S. 9-? Route 
550 at Hueysville (near coal 
tipple). Many miscellane­
ous items. Lots of young 
children's clothing. 

YARD SALE: Saturday, 
from 8-2. Two miles up 
Abbott Creek. Electric 
sewing machine; family, 
maternity and baby clothes; 
full size bed frame; 8/W TV; 
couch and chair; bent wood 
rocker. 

YARD SALE: September 5 
from9-5. Behind Ken'sGulf. 
Household items, children 
and adult clothing. 

Services 

AS SWIMMING POOLS 
CONCLUDE their season, 

The heat is gone and 
we'll soon be freezin.' 

'Bout what to do 
you needn't frown, 
Call Blue Bayou­
we'll shut 'er down. 

S49-6517. 

COMPLETE BUILDING 
OR REMODEUNG 

Vinyl siding; replacement 
windows; painting; 
roofing; drywalling; 
concrete and blocl<. 

Twenty years experience. 
Referen<les furnished. 
Call LD. Johnson or 

Johnnie Ray Boyd, day 
or night. 606-886-8293. 

A.A. TAYLOR 
PAINTING COMPANY 

and CHIMNEY 
CLEANING SERVICES 

Both services 
available anytime. 

Call 886-8453. 

DOZER FOR HIRE: Con­
tract or hourly. Call 478-
2717. 

ECONOMY TREE SERV­
ICE: Tree cutting, topping, 
removal, dead limbing and 
cabling. Twenty-one years 
experience. Licensed, in­
sured and bonded. Bill 
Rhodes, owner. Dump 
truck, chipper and winch. 
Call1-800-7 42-4188 toll free 
for free estimates. (Local 
606-S53-9276.) 

MAY TREE SERVICE: 
Cutting, topping, removing. 
hillside clearing. Thirty-one 
years experience. Caii606-
S53-78S4 or toll free, 1-800-
484-871 0, ext. 7834. 

NEED HELP? Get an opin· 
ion on life by Psychic Read­
ings. Call 1·900-820-9966, 
ext 705. $2.99/min. 24 
hours. Ttone only. 18+. 

NEWMAN BORTHERS 
SEAMLESS GUTTERS. 
Free esitmates. Fifteen 
years experience. Call587· 
2049. 
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NEED A RIDE? 
Call Martm C1ty Cab 

Serv1ce. Inc 24 Hour 
Serv1ce. Now acceptmg 

Med1ca1d. 285-0320. 
Also. stop by Judy's 
Produce at ra1lroad 

track m Martm. 

OLAN'S METAL 
BUILDINGS 

HC 36 BOX 50 
HAZARD, KY 41701 

606-43~4866 

Direct buy pole buildings; 
all steel buildings; 

carports; buy painted 
steel roof and siding 

panels; building 
insulation; residential 
and pole bam wood 

trusses. Ohm's carries 
a full line of wood and 

metal building 
accessories. We build 

to suit your needs. 

STUMPED? Tired of un­
sightly tree stumps on your 
lawn or property? Our 
machine will grind up these 
stumps in place, roots and 
all, one foot below ground 
level. No mess. Ready to 
seed. Insured. Free esti­
mates. Call Sandy Valley 
Contracting, Inc. at 478-
9241. 

TACKETT APPLIANCE 
REPAIR. 25 years experi­
ence. Owner: Mack Milford 
Tackett. Will repair name 
brand appliances, buy or sell 
used appliances, also do 
electrical work. Call 478-
8545 or 874-2750. 

TEC 21 
SERVICE CENTER 

TV, VCR. stereo, 
appliance repair. 

CAMCORDER REPAIR 
is our specialty. 

Carry-in service only. 
U.S. 23 North, 

Prestonsburg (old 
Colorama building). 

1-800-837-0810 
or 886.0724. 

WANT TO DO: Tree trim­
ming and cutting. Also, light 
hauling. Thirty years expe­
rience. Call 886-8266 or 
874-9947. 

WILL CARE FOR ELD­
ERLY. Day or night. Have 
experience. For more infor­
mation call285.0162 or 285-
3762 ask for Linda. 

YARD WORK, HILLSIDE 
CLEANING, TREE TRIM­
MING. Also have firewood 
for sale. Phone 874-9847. 

Miscellaneous 

FOR ALL THE GOOD 
BUYS, stop at Daniels Gun 
and Ammo Shop on Cliff 
Road. We buy, sell or trade. 
New and used guns, shells, 
black powder and much 
more. Call 886-2212. 

FREE: Top soil and fill dirt. 
Old Mare Creek Road. Call 
478-4230. 

ALLEN FIRST BAPTIST 
CHURCH has a First Place 
weight loss program for 
adults and children. Call 
87 4-8063, 87 4-2873 or 886-
1600. 

VISIT THE LARGEST 
PANELING CENTER in 
Eastern Kentucky at Goble 
Lumber. Over 80 different 
prefinished panels in stock 
and as low as $3.99 per 
panel. Call Goble Lumber, 
874-9281. 

·s_usiness 
Opportunity 

ESTABLISHED BEAUTY 
SHOP FOR SALE. Some 
equipment included. 1 Ox20 
building. Also have other 
beauty shop equipment for 
sale. Call358-9157. 

LOST: White female dog. 
Lost 4 weeks ago. Left Fork 
of Toler. Reward offered. 
Call 478-5375. 

Want To Buy 

WANT TO BUY TIMBER. 
By boundary or by the thou­
sand. Will reclaim property 
to owner's specifications. 
Call 606-886·3313. 

''".·. w 

Mobile Home 
Sales 

1994 INDIES. Two bed­
room, two bath, a/c. On 
rental lot in Allen. Must sell! 
$26,000. Call Dan at 513-
661-2541. Serious calls 
only. 

1995 THREE BEDROOM. 
Central air, skirting, washer 
and dryer. Free delivery and 
set up. 

Only $16,995 plua tax. 
OAKWOOD MOBILE 

HOMES 
Call JOHN now, 
606-623-1121. 

FOR SALE: 12x60 two 
bedroom trailer. Three 
rooms have been re-floored. 
New hot water tank, new 
sink. $1,500 or best offer. 
Also, 1976 Ford truck. 
Overhauled motor. $600. 
Call 886.0366. 

HINDMAN MOBILE 
HOMES. Located on Hwy. 
80, Hindman. New 3 bed­
room 14x70for$15,900with 
5% down. Also, many good 
used homes. Free delivery 
and set up. Call 606-785-
5985. 

THE 95's ARE COMING to 
Rainbow Homes at I vel. See 
us today for the deal of a 
lifetime. Open 7 days a 
week. Located on the four 
lane, on the hill at lvel, KY. 
Phone 606-478-4530. 

USED MOBILE HOMES 
GALORE. "Fixer-Uppers• 
of all kinds. Many from 
$3,000 to $5,000. Phone 
606-478-4530 for details. 

Carpentry 
Work 

ALL TYPES OF CARPEN· 
TRY WORK: New homes, 
remodeling, will build FmHA 
homes, painting, wallpaper­
Ing, concrete drives, patios. 
Call Ricky Yates at 886-
3452. Seventeen years 
experience. No job too big 
or too small. 

CARPENTRY AND CON­
CRETE WORK. New 
homes or remodeling; vinyl 
aiding; concrete drives; pat­
los; carports; basements; 
any type of block laying or 
brick work. Also do fire­
places. References fur­
nished. Free estimates. Call 
886-6718. 

EAST KY GUTTER, 
SIDING AND ROOFING 

5' and 6' seamless 
gutters; siding; shingle 

roofs; replacement 
windows; decks. 
Free Estimates. 
Call James Hall 
at 285·9512 or 

1-800·277-7351. 

Contractors 

LAFFERTY'S 
CONTRACTING: 

Certified electrician 
In both high and low 

voltage in the state of KY. 
House wiring, both new 

and remodeling, or 
trailer hook-ups. 

For free estimates 
call 874·2259. 

WantroR~nt 
. ·::; •' . .... ,,~ . 61-l:.ease ,,*ft 

WOULD LIKE TO RENT 
BARN AND PASTURE for 
horses. Prestonsburg area. 
Call886-3313. 

FLOYD COUNTY CLERK FINANCIAL STATUS REPORT 
Carla "Robinson" Boyd 

P.O. Box 1089, Prestonsburg, Ky. 41653-5089 

Period from Jan. 1, 1993 thru Dec. 31, 1993 
RECEIPTS 

Motor Vehicle License ...................................................................................................... $ 812,381.09 
Advalorem Tax ................................................................................................................... 1,853,262.55 
Usage Tax ......................................................................................................................... 2,499,820.06 
Fish & Game License ............................................................................................................ 162,414.57 
Marriage License ................................. ................................................................................ .... 13,748.00 
Deeds Easements & Powers of Attorney ............................................................................... 20,934.60 
Real E'state Mortgages ............................................................. ............................................... 25,848.40 
Chattel Mortgages & Financing Statements ............................................................................ 72,856.00 
Leases ....................................................................................................................................... 1 ,497.40 
Deed Transfer Tax ............................................................. : .................................................... 22,602.00 
Releases .................... ...................... ..... .................................................................................... 9,363.10 
Affidavits of Descent ................................................................................................................. 1,100.00 
Articles of Incorporation ............................................................................................................... 757.20 
Wills ........................................................................................................................................... 1 ,507.50 
Delinquent Tax ...................................................................................................................... 275,838.42 
Bonds ....... ........................................................................................................ ......................... 2,248.00 
Occupational/Beer/Liquor Licenses ........................................................................................ 20,261.28 
Copies ............................................................... ...................................................................... 10,809.50 
Miscellaneous Fees ................................................................................................................ 45,875.45 
Refund Check Deposits ............................................................................................................ 5,903.24 
Interest on Checking Account ................................................................................................... 4,358.73 

TOTAL RECEIPTS ............................................................................................................... $5,863,387.09 

EXPENDITURES 

County Clerk Salary ......................................................................................................... $ 27,987.92 
Deputies Salaries .................................................................................................................. 171 ,431 • 70 
City Tax ..................................................................................................................................... 3,077.~~ 
Employer's Share FICA ........................................................................................................... 71,284. 
Kentucky State Tax ................................................................................................................. 1 1,554.57 
Employees Retirement ............................................................................................................ 13,419.27 
Unemployment Insurance ......................................................................................................... 5,089.33 
Health Insurance ..................................................................................................................... 64,190.55 
Employee Savings .................................................................................................................... 1,200.00 
Employee Life Insurance .............................................................................................................. 800.54 
Motor Vehicle Usage Tax ................................................................................................... 2,458,035.72 
Motor Vehicle License ........................................................................................................... 651 ,894.22 
Fish & Game- State Fee ...................................................................................................... 181 ,656.05 
Utilities ....................................................................................................................................... 1,464.43 
Advalorem Tax ................................................................................................................... 1 ,761,682.80 
Supplies .................................................................................................................................... 9,997.91 
Fish & Game Commissions/Refunds ........................................................................................ 1 ,664.25 
Clerk Travel Expense ................................................................................................................ 3,300.00 
Deputy Clerk Travel Expense ................................................................................................... 2,476.91 
Delinquent Tax Disbursements ............................................................................................. 214,556.43 
Legal Process Tax .................................................................................................................. 34,233.23 
Occupational License/Beer & Liquor Licenses ............................................ : ........................... 20,284.20 
Election Expenses ..................................................................................................................... 5,070.28 
Deed Transfer Tax .................................................................................................................. 21,486.17 
Conf/Reg/Association Dues ...................................................................................................... 5,463.97 
Indexing ................................................................................................................................... 1 0,316.25 
Postage ................................................................................................................................... 13,972.00 
Office EquipmenVExpenses .................................................................................................... 14,693.85 
Refunds ................................................................................................................................... 17,805.71 
Copier Expel'lse ....................................................................................................................... 19,718.04 
Office Cleaning ...................................................................................................................... ··· 5,430.00 
Safe Deposit Box ......................................................................................................................... 114.79 
Storage Bldg Rent .................................................................................................................... 7,740.00 
Transfer of F~nds .................................................................................................................... 15,457.85 
Misc. Expenses ......................................................................................................................... 4,064.64 

TOTAL EXPENDITURES ..................................................................................................... $5,852,615.57 

EXCESS FEES OVER EXPENDITURES ................................................................................... 10,771.52 

1 certify that this statement to the best of my knowledge is true and correct. 

CARLA "ROBINSON" BOYD, County Clerk 

New& Used 
Furniture 

ALLEN FURNITURE 
ALLEN,KY 

Living room suhs; daybeds; 
gun cabinets; bedroom suits; 
recliners: odd chests; dinette 
sets; bunk beds; odd beds; 
loungers; used washers, 
dryers, refrigerators; and lots 
more! Call874-9790. 

ROSE'S USED FURNI­
TURE: Costume jewelry, 
trombone, organ, 3/4 HP well 
pump, hide-a-bed, bedroom 
and living room sets, wash· 
ers, dryers, stoves, refrig­
erators with 30 day warranty, 
cherry hutch, antique rope 
bed, wardrobes, dressers, 
waterbeds, dish cabinet, 
recliners, color TV, wringer 
washers, bunk beds, gas, 
wood and coal burners, oil 
furnace, 90 gallon hot water 
heater, coffee and end 
tables, blanket chest, metal 
cabinets and more. Come 
on in and browse around. 
Located between Allen and 
Lancer red lights on Rt. 
1428, across bridge to Goble 
Roberts. Call 886-8085 or 
886-3463 after 5 p.m. 

Heating/Air 
Conditioning 

BLANTON HEAllNG 
AND 

AIR CONDITIONING 
Sales. Service 

Installation. 
High efficiency 

electric and gas units. 
Financing available. 

Free estimates. 
Call 874·2308. 

Plumbing 

PORTER PLUMBING 
COMPANY 
ALLEN,KY 

Commercial, residential 
and service work. 

Licensed and insured. 
Rotor rooter service, 
drain cleaning, etc. 
CALL US FIRSll 

874·2794. 

flOYD COUNTY IOARD OF EDUCATIOH 
STEPiiEN W. TOWlfR, IUP£RfjTEHOENT 

• ARNOLD AVENUE 
PRESTONSBURQ, KENTUCKY 

DIPI.OYEE I'IIOIIOTIONAL PIIOGRAM 

VACANCY 
POSTING NOTICE 

Augull24,11l94Sopl.mblr 7,11l94all2:01 a.m. 

DATE OPEN DATE CLOSED 

Official Title of Position: 
School Bus Driver 
Job Location: Allen Central 
Area 
Salary Range: $36.20 per 
day 
Contact Person: Earl D. 
Ousley, Director of 
Transportation 
Brief Job Description: 
Transport students to and 
from designated areas. 
Minimum Requirements: 
Certification as required by 
the Kentucky Department of 
Education. Applicant must 
have high school diploma or 
GED. Applicant must have 
the Commercial Drivers 
License (COL). 

Additional Job Require­
ments: none 
Applicant must submit an 
updated, signed application 
to the Superintendent of the 
Floyd County Board of 
Education no later than 
September 6, 1994 to be 
considered for an interview. 
• Applicant will be notified 
for an interview as soon as 
arrangements have been 
completed. 
The Floyd County Board of 
Education does not 
discriminate on the basis of 
race, color, national origin, 
age, religion, marital status, 
sex, or handicap in 
employment, educational 
programs, or activities as 
set forth in Title IX & VI, & in 
Section 504. W-8/31, 9/2 

NOTICE OF 
INTENTION 

TO MINE 
Pursuant to Application 

Number 836-8035 
In accordance with the 

provisions of KRS 350.055, 
notice is hereby given that J 
& J Coal and Sand Co., Inc., 
P.O. Box 26, Prestonsburg, 
Kentucky 41653 has filed 
an application for a coal and 
sand dredging and 
reclamation permit. The 
operation will create a 
surface disturbance of 3.00 
acres for a total permit 
acreage of 3.00 acres. The 
operation is located on the 
Levis a Fork of the Big Sanely 
at Emma in Floyd County. 

The operation is 
approximately 4200 feet 

~=~~:;==:;===~ southwest of State Route 

lew Mal
'estic 8Ave 1428's junction with State 

'I ~W Route 194 on the North bank 
of the Levisa Fork. The 

• latitude is 37d 37m 58s 
DOUble WGIIecl Pipes North. The longitude is 82d 

--·- • 5 0000 42m 28s west. 
Small Refrigerator The operation is located • 2 S on the Lancer U.S.G.S. 7.5 

minute quadrangle map. 
88&•594'1 'The surface area to be 

L....:=..:=...::::;__=-~--........ disturbed is owned by David 
fLOYD COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATIOH 

ITEPiiEN W. TOWLER, SUPERINTENDENT 
t1 ARNOLO AVENUE 

PAESTOHSBURQ, KENTUCKY 
EMPlOYEE P!IOUOTIOHAL PAOGIWI 

May. The methods of mining 
to be used for coal extraction 
will be river bottom dredging. 

The application has been 
VACANCY filed for public inspection at 

POSTING NOTICE the Department for Surface 
Augu1126, 11l94Seplemb«e, 18841112:a1 a.m. Mining Reclamation and 
DATE OPEN DATE CLOSED Enforcement's Prestons-

burg Regional Office, 1346 
Official Title of Position: South Lake Drive, Prestons-
School Bus Driver burg, KY 41653. Written 
Job Location: Prestonsburg comments. objections or 
Area requests for a permit 
Salary Range: $36.20 per conferencemustbefiledw~h 
day the Natural Resources and 
Contact Person: Earl D. Environ-mental Protection 
Ousley, Director of Cabinet, Department for 
Transportation Surface Mining Reclamation 
Brief Job Description: and Enforcement, No. 2 
Transport students to and Hudson Hollow Complex, 

Frankfort, KY 40601. 
from designated areas. F-

9
/
2

, 
919

• 
9116

, 
9123 

Minimum Requirements: 
Certification as required by 
the Kentucky Department of 
Education. Applicant must 
have high school diploma or 
GED. Applicant must have 
the Commercial Drivers 
License (COL). 
Additional Job Require­
ments: none 
Applicant must submit an 
updated, signed application 
to the Superintendent of the 
Floyd County Board of 
Education no later than 
September 8, 1994 to be 
considered for an interview. 
• Applicant WI I be notified 
for an interview as soon as 
arrangements have been 
completed. 
The Floyd County Board of 
Education does not 
dtscriminate on the basis of 
raca. color, national origin, 
age, relig1on, manta! status, 
sex, or handicap in 
employment, educational 
programs, or activities as set 
forth in Title IX & VI, & in 
Section 504. W-8/31, 9/2 

FLOYD COUNTY BOARD Of EDUCATIOH 
STEPHEN W. TOWLER, SUP£R1HTDIDEHT 

W ARNOLD AVENUE 
PRESTONSBURQ, KENTUCKY 

DIPt.OYEE PROIIOTIOHAL PAOGIWol 

VACANCY 
POSTING NOTICE 

A19J1125,11l94Sep1ombof 8,18114 al12:01 a.m. 

DATE OPEN DATE CLOSED 

Official Title of Position: 
School Bus Driver 
Job Location: Prestonsburg 
Area 
Salary Range: $36.20 per 
day 
Contact Person: Earl D. 
Ousley, Director of 
Transportation 
Brief Job Description: 
Transport students to and 
from designated areas. 
Minimum Requirements: 
Certification as required by 
the Kentucky Department of 
Education. Applicant must 
have high school diploma or 
GED. Applicant must have 
the Commercial Drivers 
License (COL). 

Additional Job Require­
ments: none 

Applicant must· submit an 
updated, signed application 
to the Superintendent of the 
Floyd County Board of 
Education no later than 
September 7, 1994 to be 
considered for an interview. 
• Applicant will be notified 
for an interview as soon as 
arrangem~nts have been 
completed. 
The Floyd County Board of 
Education does not 
discriminate on the basis of 
race, color, national origin, 
age, religion, marital status, 
sex, or handicap in 
employment, educational 
programs, or activities as set 
forth in Title IX & VI, & in 
Section 504. W-8/31, F-9/2 

FLOYD COUNTY BOARD OF 
EDUCATlON 

aTEPHEN W. TOWL£R, 
SUPERINTEHOENT 

"ARNOLD AVENUE 
PRE8TON8BURQ, KENTUCKY 

EMPLOYEE 
PROMOTIONAL 

PROGRAM 
VACANCY 

POSTING NOTICE 
W2:LJIM , D ,, tW•1Z91 •• 

I». It OPBI l».l'l! Q.OIB) 

Official Title of Position: 
School Bus Driver Aide 
Job Location: Betsy Layne 
area 
Salary Range: $36.20 per 
day 
Contact Person: Earl D. 
Ousley, Director of 
Transportation 
Brief Job Description: 
Transport students to and 
from designated areas. 
Minimum Requirements: 
Certification as required by 
the Kentucky Department of 
Education. Applicant must 
have high school diploma or 
GED. Applicant must have 
the Commercial Drivers 
License (COL). 
Additional Job Require­
ments: none 
Applicant must aubmit an 
updated, signed application 
to the Superintendent of the 
Floyd County Board of 
Education no later than 
Septeut>er 14. 1994 to be 
considered for an interview. 

• Applicant will be notified 
for an interview as soon as 
arrangements have been 
COI'Tllleted. 
The Floyd County Board of 
Education does not 
discriminate on the basis of 
race, color, national origin, 
age, religion, maritalatatus, 
sex, or handicap In 
employment, educational 
programs, or activities as 
set forth in Title IX and VI, 
and in Section 504. 

F-9/2, W-9n 

FLOYD COUNTY BOARD 
OFEDUCAnOH 

STEPHEN W. TOWLER, 
SUPERINTENDENT 

"ARNOLD AVENUE 
PRE.STONSBURQ, KENTUCKY 

EMPLOYEE 
PROMOTIONAL 

PROGRAM 
VACANCY 

POSTING NOTICE 
W2:LJIM a 1 t 1S , ... ,m,. 
I».TtOPBI l».l'fQ.OIEO 

Official Title of Position: 
School Bus Driver 

Job Location: (County at 
Large) 
Salary Range: $36.20 per 
day 
Contact Person: Earl D. 
Ousley, Director of 
Transportation 
Brief Job Description: 
Transport students to and 
from designated areas. 
Minimum Requirements: 
Certification as required by 
the Kentucky Department of 
Education. Applicant must 
have high school diploma or 
GED. Applicant must have 
the Commercial Drivers 
License (COL). 

Additional Job Require­
ments: none 
Applicant must submit an 
updated, signed appliGation 
to the Superintendent of the 
Floyd County Board of 
Education no later than 
September 14, 1994 to be 
considered for an interview. 

• Applicant will be notified for 
an interview as soon as 
arrangements have been 
completed. 
The Floyd County Board of 
Education does not 
discriminate on the basis of 
race, color, national origin, 
age, religion, marital status, 
sex, or handicap in 
employment, educational 
programs, or activities as set 
forth in Tnle IX and VI. and in 
Section 504. F-9/2, W-9n 

ADVERTISEMENT 
FOR BIDS 

At the August 19, 1994 
Floyd County Fiscal Court 
meeting, the Court 
authorized the following 
placement of bids: 

Three (3) 6 cylinder, 4 
wheel drive pick up trucks 

One (1) 6 cylinder, 4 wheel 
drive sport utility vehicle 

Complete bid specs may 
be picked up at the office of • 
the Floyd County Judge/ 
Executive, John M. Stumbo, 
during normal business 
hours, Mondaythru Fridays. 

Sealed bids will be opened 
on September 16, 1994, at 
the hour of 10:00 a.m. in 
Fiscal Court. The Court 
reserves the right to reject 
any and all bids. 
FLOYD COUNTY FISCAL 

COURT 
John M. Stumbo 

Floyd County Judge/ • 
Executive 
F-9/2, W-9/7, 9/14 

NOTICE OF 
INTENTION 

TO MINE 
Purauant to Application 

Number 436-8005, 
Renewal 

In accordance with KRS 
350.055, notice Is hereby 
given that Branham and 
Baker Coal Collllany, Inc., • 
148 South Lake Drive, 
Prestonsburg, Kentucky, 
41653, has applied for 
renewal of a permit for a 
refuse disposal coal 
processing facility affecting 
52.00 acres located .75 
miles northwest of Goodloe, 
in Floyd County. 

The proposed facility is 
approximately 1.0 miles 
northweat from State Route 
404 junction with State 
Route 850 and located .1 
mlle1 aouth of Buckeye 
BranchofMiddeCreek. The 
latitude is 37' 38' 10". The 
longitude Is 82' 52' 25". 

The proposed facility is 
located on the Martin & 
David U.S.G.S. 71/2 minute 
quadrangle mapa. The 
surface area II owned by 
Pierre Mather. 

The application hal been 
flied for public Inspection at 
the Department for Surface 
Mining Reclamation and 
Enforcement'• Preatona- II 
burg Regional Office, 2705 
South Lake Drive, Prestons­
burg, Kentucky 41653. 
Written comments, objec­
tions, or requests for a permit 
conference must be filed with 
the Director of the Division 
of Permits, 12 Hudson 
Hollow, U.S. 127 South, 
Frankfort, Kentucky 40601. 

F-9/2, 9/9, 9/16, 9/23 

I'LOYD COUNTY IIOARD 
OF EDOCATlON 

STEPHEN W. TOWLER, 
BUPERINTDIDEHT 

II ARNOLD AVENUE 
JORE.ST~UIIQ, K!NTUCKY 

EMPLOYEE 
PROMOTIONAL 

PROGRAM 
VACANCY 

POSTING NOTICE 

Official Title of Position: 
School Bus Driver Aide 

Job Location: Betsy Layne 
Area 

• 

Salary Range: $25.24 per • 
day 

Contact Person: Earl D. 
Ousley, Director of 
Transportation 

Brief Job Description: Assist 
the special needs students 
to and from designated 
areas. 

Minimum Requirements: 
Certification as required by 
the Kentucky Department of 
Education. Applicant must 
have high school diploma or 
GED. 

Additional .Job Require­
ments: none 

Applicant must subm~ an • 
updated, signed application 
to the Superintendent of the 
Floyd County Board of 
Education no later than 
Septermer 14, 1994 to be 
considered for an interview. 
• Applicant will be notified for 
an interview as soon as 
arrangements have been 
completed. 

The Floyd County Board of 
Education does not 
discriminate on the basis of 
race, color, national origin, 
age, religion, marital status, 
sex, or handicap in 
employment, educational 
programs, or activities asset 
forth in Title IX and VI, and in 
Section 504. F-9/2, W-9n 

• 
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• 

• 
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BUTCH AND DOUGIE by ALEX HOWELL 
... 4566, 7'H~ It:£ C~ 
ts J:02 MG ANt:'~ 
S"f"ICK IS FOR VOU .~ 

Fa reus by David Wa1sglass 
Gordon Coulthart 

"He dashed out of cubicle four 
without signalling!" 

Magic Maze 

AUSTRALIA (Answers on B 2) 

K P N K I G D B Z X V S Q OM 

K@ U T B A c K) I G E c s A y 

wuos D Q R p AN L E E T J 

H FE C p A p R c A H 0 N N y 

XV D E s E R T UCUO IE s 

Q p R N E EMWN B K TGN J 

H T F H B EM A I c AAI A 

HBSNOORAGNAKRTL 

ZTABMOWYJXVCONA 

UCTRQPOMLK I OBOO 

HGEDCYENDYSCACK 

Find the listed words in the di-:.gram. They run in 
aU directions-forward, backward, up, down and 
diagonally . 

Aborigines 
Canberra 
Cockatoo 
Continent 

Darwin 
Desert 
James Cook 
Kangaroo 

Kookaburra 
' Outback 

Perth 
Ranches 

Sheep 
Sydney 
Wombat 

Tht! Floyd County Times l"a·iday, September 2, 1994 Bll 

The often romanticized image of cowboys and aliens 

Fa reus 

THAT'S 
P12ECISEL Y WHAT 

WE WANT, 
MIN6. 

1\ 

by David Waisglass 
Gordon Coulthart 

"Wow, this has to be some sort of record -
a full day's shift and not one weirdo!" 

Vision Teaser 

-~II •1!)1 ·11 Je0uot • 1!1.1. "S ·pe-J" .-otl'ld ·• 
1UIUIJW II eoue:I"C 'Cu!a!w- _,.1. ~·~II~. L .se::~Wall() 

OUT ON A LIMB by GARY KOPERVAS 

• Show I'Y'€ q roCIN\ 'fu\\ of COL.mlry 
dociOYs S1pp1n9 'Dc::~nona b\e.,de\" cl'r.,nKS, 

..o oO al'\d 1.'11 sheW y'ov. q bl.\nch of 
nicl<o'rf dqi~v.\n docs.'' 

AATZ by BEN SMITH 
~--------------~ 

ACROSS 
1 Sam or Rona 
6"Sesame 

Street" 
subject 

10 A/C measure 
13"La-" 

('87film) 
18 Broadcast 
1tJapan·s first 

capital 
20 Hosp. areas 
21 Ms. Sorkin 

of TV 
22 Mel Brooks 

film 
25 Rembrandt's 

birthplace 
26 People 
27 Ritter/Post 

sitcom 
2t Wlnter mo. 
32 Ideologue's 

suffix 
33 ·spartacus" 

35 ~~mportant 
36 Father 

Merlin's 
occupation 

39-Jima 
40 Soap setting? 
41 AN's 

specialty 
44111will 
45 Symbol of 

wisdom 
47Prlma­

(self·evldent) 
48Stadium 

shout 

ooOOOI4. 848Y I 

TAKE IT 
AWAY, DADl 

/ 

Super Crossword 
4t Word-game 83 Outlaw 

piece 84 Sheer joy 
50 Dessert 85 Subordinate 

118 Ornery 31 The edge of 
Olymptan anger 

118 Jessica of 34 Unrestrainod 
choice Claus? ·used 37 Map abbr. 

54 Portend 86 Beethoven's People"" 38 Symbol 
55 Onassis' "FOr_ .. DOWN 40 Stationed 

nickname 87 Cover girl 
56 Shipbuilding Carol 

need 88 Geraldine 

1 Bowe blow 41 Aquarium 
2 Be under the denizens 

weather 42 Brimm~ng 
57 "Olver Twist" Chaplin's 

vtllafn mom 
3 Monk's title 43 It's often 
4 Turl<ish topper heaved 

58 Fossey's 88 Kennel 
friends feature 

59 Author 81 Teapot 
Deighton disturb· 

60 Related ances? 
61 Warm and 84 Gin flavoring 

sticky 85 Keep an -
62 Arst-aid the ground 

device 97 Miss Piggy's 
64 Looked pronoun 

5 Impressive 46 Speakeasy 
building patron 

6 Geometry 47 Muslim 
topics mendicant 

7 Enjoy the 50 Peter Fonda 
sunshine role 

8 Vulgar 51 Enthusiastic 
8 Crushed 52 All of -

10 Fandango kin (unexpect· 
11 Riser's edly) 

longingly 88 ODE's 
66 Less limited predecessor 
67 Imperturbable 99 Georgia 
68 More health resort 

relative 53 Bar fruit 
12 Former nat. 54·- HaT" 
13 Respire 56 Bring down 
14 "Get -" the house 

abundant 103 Morocco's 
70 Sells capital 
71 Burn remedy 105 Form a 
72 - Dhabi concept 
75 Explosive 106 Flustered 

sound 112 Coot 

(Chris Elliott 61 Sanskrit 
sitcom) derivative 

15 Word form 62 Mall 
for •center" component 

16 Pilsner 63 Marvell 
17 Designer marvel 

76 English 113 Chicken-
novetist king 
Charles 114 Elver's 

Klein 65- mater 
21 Ancient 66 Estranges 

French 67 Pole, for one 
77 Eye·opener? parents 
78 Actor Chaney 115 Minneapolis 
78 Notes from suburb 

Verdi? 116 Ceremonial 

province 68 Addis-
23 Uttle Red Hen 69 Decent 

response 70 Vice follower 
24 Arab craft 71 Overhead 

80 Elvis Presley supper 
hit 117 Mr. Hammar· 

28 Uses a hamer 73 Blows one's 
28 Gala own horn 

82 Out of range skjold 30 Run out 74 Troubled 

MAI'I. THI'J PLACE 
IS (3tJf? lNG . 

state 
76 Bull in a 

china shop, 
for instance 

77 Half and 
half? 

80 Outtake 
81 Fellow 
82 Maugham·s 

"Cakes 
and-" 

84 Build up 
86 Descript•v• 

name 
89Motley 
80 Bear In the 

air? 
92 Give relet? 
93 Ditch under a 

drawbridge 
94 C1ty masma 
85 ·-Gay" 

(bomber) 
96 Ask for meat 

loaf 
99 Dome covers 

100 "Zip·-. 
Doo·Dah" 

101 Country 
music's Jerry 

102"1f- a 
Hammer" 

104 Skilled 
107 Teachers' 

org. 
108 Author 

LeShan 
109-Tin Tin 
110 Wind up 
111 Doris or 

Denn1s 

(Answers on B 2) 



B12 Friday, September 2, 1994 The Floyd County Times 

'5 LUMINAl! 

• 


	09-02-1994_Page_01
	09-02-1994_Page_02
	09-02-1994_Page_03
	09-02-1994_Page_04
	09-02-1994_Page_05
	09-02-1994_Page_06
	09-02-1994_Page_07
	09-02-1994_Page_08
	09-02-1994_Page_09
	09-02-1994_Page_10
	09-02-1994_Page_11
	09-02-1994_Page_12
	09-02-1994_Page_13
	09-02-1994_Page_14
	09-02-1994_Page_15
	09-02-1994_Page_16
	09-02-1994_Page_17
	09-02-1994_Page_18
	09-02-1994_Page_19
	09-02-1994_Page_20
	09-02-1994_Page_21
	09-02-1994_Page_22
	09-02-1994_Page_23
	09-02-1994_Page_24
	09-02-1994_Page_25
	09-02-1994_Page_26

