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Office Here To Eye 
Reclamation in Area 
Governor Marks 
$75,000 To Aid 
PCC Expansion 

Governor Wendell H. Ford in a special 
news release to The Times announced 
Tuesday morning the establishing in 
·Prestonsburg of a Department of Natural 
Resources and Environmental Protection 
reclamation office and the appropriation of 
$75;000 from his contingency fund for an 
expansion program at Prestonsburg 
Community College. 

The reclamation office, due to open April 
1 in the old Lincolm-Mercury building on 
South Lake Drive here, will employ 16, 
including an area supervisor, 14 inspectors 
and a clerk-typist. The office will serve 
Floyd, Pike, Johnson, Martin, Magoffin, 
Wolfe, Powell, Lee, Morgan, Menifee, 
Lawrence, Rowan, Elliott, Boyd, Carter, 
Greenup and Lewis counties. 

Personnel will be engaged, mainly, in the 
reclamation of surface-mined lands in the 
17-county area. 

The $75,000 check from the Governor's 
contingency fund for the benefit of the 
college here has already been turned over 
to the University of Kentucky Expansion of 
the PCC campus has long been planned, 
and this fund is regarded as a break in the 
direction of future land acquisition and 
construction. 

Governor Ford credited State 
Representative W. J. Reynolds with the 
successful develop'ment of both projects. 
"The projects,'' he said, "resulted from the 
interest and leadership of Bill, who worked 
on both programs and personally requested 
that I proceed on these matters." 

Mayor Asks Citizens 
To Attend Meeting 

Mayor George P. Archer said Monday 
that next Tuesday's meeting of the 
Prestonsburg Area Chamber of Commerce 
will be one of special interest to the com­
munity. 

Importance of the meeting, he said, 
arises from the fact that if Prestonsburg is 
to receive planning funds from the U. S. 
Department of Housing and Urban 
Development <HUD), its most significant 
needs and problems must be determined, 
and the Chamber meeting will be the oc­
casion when such determination will be 
made. 

Mayor Archer said he is inviting all 
concerned citizens to attend the Chamber 
of Commerce meeting and help determine 
the direction of Prestonsburg's planning 
program for the fiscal year beginning next 
Judy 1. 

The meeting will be held at 12 noon at the 
TCT Truck Stop. 

Loses 7th Class Rating 
Joe D. Smith, manager of the Kentucky 

Insurance Services Office, has notifed 
insurance company representatives that 
fire protection facilities at Wheelwright 
have deteriorated to the extent that the 
town has been rerated eighth class instead 
of its former seventh class rating. 

Election Costs 
To Rise, Result 
Of Redistricting 

Reapportionment of legislative districts 
earlier this year by the General Assembly 
to make legislative districts conform with 
the federal court one-man, one-vote rule 
will be costly, dollar-wise, to this county 
and place a small section of it with a 
heavier voting bloc in adjacent Pike 
county. 

The redistricting bill cut off six precinct­
s..:...Harold, Toler, Tickey, Antioch, Head of 
Mud and Branham's Creek-from the 95th 
legislative district and threw them into the 
94th, most of which is in Pike county. 

[Court Howe Happenings ] 

SUITS FILED 
Boyd Shepherd vs. Mary Shepherd, et al. 

BiUy Elmer Frasure vs. Betty Jo M. 
Frasure. Maude M. Compton vs. Henry 
Compton, Jr. Dezire Kidd Hall vs. Terry 
Lee Hall. Floyd Federal Savings & Loan vs. 
H. D. Blackburn, et al. Floyd Federal 
Savings & Loan vs. Thurman Coleman, Jr., 
et al. First National Bank vs. W. R . Hat­
field, Jr., Larry Bert Case, et al and 
Forrest Little, Jr., et aL (three separate 
cases). James A. Hamilton vs. Nally & 
Hamilton Construction Co., etc. John Kidd, 
et al vs. Peter Justice. Timothy Sizemore, 
et al vs. Troy Shepherd, et al. Mrs. Bill 
Jarrell vs. Sally Goble, ind., et al. 

MARRIAGE LICENSES 
William Rice Bollen, 58, Garrett, and 

Hester Patton, 40, Mousie. Willard Goble, 
22, R. 1, Prestonsburg, and Rebecca Lewis, 
23, Banner. Charles Alan Ratliff, 18, 
Langley, and Linda Louise Moore, 18, 
Martin . Bobby Joe Lewis, 24, Lexington, 
and Sarah Jane Robinson, 23, West 
Prestonsburg. Joe Allen Horn, 22, West 
Prestonsburg, and Carol Ann Holbrook, 19, 
Prestonsburg. Harold Sparkman, 21, 
Cardington, 0., and Paula Kaye Slone, 18, 
Estill. 

Whitt Wounded., 
Drift Man Held; 
3 Hit by Raiders 

Fred Marshall, of Drift, was jailed here 
Monday afternoon, shortly after he had 
allegedly shot his fellow-worker at a coal 
operation, Rudolph Allen Whitt, at Minnie. 
. Whitt suffered a flesh wound in his leg. 

He was taken to the McDowell Regional 
Hospital, where his condition was said to be 
good. State police and Sheriff Frank Leslie 
investigated the shooting. A family quarrel 
was blamed for the shooting. 

Gary B. Sexton, of Kendallville, Ind., who 
was arrested on a charge of assault and 
batterv with an automobile after Charles 
Reed, "of Lexmgton, was critically injur;;:d 
March 11 in a wreck near Emma, has been 
released under $4,000 bond. Reed was 
reported still unconscious in a Lexington 
hospital. 

Three men have been arrested within the 
week on charges of possessing intoxicants 
for the purpose of sale. Paul Tackett was 
jailed by State Troopes Dennie Williamson 
and A. C. Cantrell after they had found on 
his premises at Tram 312 cans of beer, 56 
half-pints of whiskey, 5 half-pints of gin, 15 
"fifths" of wine and 28 pints wine. The 
following day, the same troopers arrested 
Junior Wells, of the Auxier road. They 
reported taking 328 cans of beer, 9 "fifths" 
of wine 4 pints of vodka and 9 pints of 
wuikey in the raid on his premises. 

(Wells said the intoxicants were not on 
his premises but in an old truck on property 
which he had leased to Bill Hall, of Melvin. 
Guy Rorrer, of Cliff, stated as a basis for 
the search warrant, however, that he 
bought beer from Wells.) 

The third man arrested was Lum Carr. 
He was jailed by Trooper Danny Stumbo 
and Phillip Tucker, but the amount of in­
toxicants found was not learned. 

Others booked at the jail within the week, 
charges lodged against each, and names of 
arresting officers follow: 

Ben Sellards, selling mortgaged 
property, arrested by Deputy Sheriff R. 

(See Story 3, Back Page, Sec. 1) 

REVIVAL SERVICES SET 
FOR SUNDAY, MARCH 25 

Revival services will be held at the 
Highland Free Will Baptist Church 
beginning Sunday, March 25 with services 
starting at 7 each evening. Arnold B. 
Johnson, of Boldman will be the featured 
evangelist. Special singing will be 
presented at each evening's service and 
bus service will be available. 

Read Each Week by More Tha~ 7,500 Families 

Highway Closed 
Except to Boats 

Backwater from the Big Sandy helped Abbott Creek cut the highway 
atthis point, near the home of Harris Howard, last week-end. Similar 
scenes existed temporarily at other points in the county. 

Anonymous 'Tip' Fails 
Of Solution to Murder 

~his _Town ... That World] 

In reply to all who have asked, "Have you 
got straightened out after your fire?" 

Yes. Horizontally. 

Commonwealth's Attorney Harold J. 
Stumbo said Monday new "information" is 
at hand in one of the county's three un­
solved murders but that not enough is yet 
known-to present the case to the grand jury. 
when it meets here early next month. 

"A woman telephoned me recently and 
told me two men had told her husband of 
the killing of Jimmy Chaffins on Arkansas 
Creek, but she refused to give her name, 
and so we are still working as much in the 
dark as ever," Stumbo told The Times. 

Chaffins was found, shot to death, two 
years ago. The prosecutor and others in­
vestigating the slaying have felt at times 
that a solution to the mystery was near, but 
they never have been able to name a slayer 
with any confidence of winning a con­
viction. 

Judge Denies 
Dismiss Motion 
In US 23 Suit 

An attempt by one of the defendants in 
the $4 million lawsuit concerning rejection 
of US 23 projects in this county in 1970 to 
gain dismissal of the action failed last 
Friday in Franklin circuit court. 

The motion to dismiss was filed by Victor 
E . Comley, executive director of the 
Kentucky Association of Highway Con­
tractors, on the grounds that the plaintiff, 
Mattingly Bridge Company, lacked legal 
standing because it was not a bidder or 
subcontractor in bids offered on the Floyd 
project. 

Circuit Judge Henry Meigs held that 
Mattingly Bridge does have standing to 
maintain the suit against Comley and that 
its failure to be a bidder applies only to its 
standing with the Department of Highways. 
The question of whether the Highway 
Department should be dropped as a 
defendant will be decided later. 

Although its was not a bidder or sub· 
contractor in the bidding on three projects 
on which the J. D. Barter Construction 
Company offered bids, Mattingly Bridge 
claims it had an understanding with the 
Barter company to be a subcontractor on a 
major part of the work. 

(See Story 4, Back Page, Sec. 1) 

Stumbo said he has no way to trace the 
anonymous call he received about the 
slaying but has been hoping that the woman 
or her husband will be conscience-led to 
name the persons involved. 

"We have a situation in which people 
know who committed murder. This is true 
in the slayings of the two Conleys at Garrett 
and Wayland last year. But those who could 
help are either afraid, or unwilling, to talk. 
As long as this situation prevails, murder­
ers will go free, unless we are 
l_ycky " 

Chaffins was killed, a matter of hours 
after be left him home in Louisville to drive 
to the Garrett vicinity to visit his parents. 

The coming court term has more than 100 
cases on its docket, and the com­
monwealth's attorney said is important 
that persons interested in the prosecution of 
criminal cases contact him wen in advance 
of trial date. 

The docket inc1udes three murder cases, 
and the grand jury will investigate a fourth 
slaying, that of Dennis Watson on Mud 
Creek. Watson's brother, Johnny, is ac­
cused of the slaying. The trial of Mont 
Robinette, charged with the slaying of his 
wife, is booked for April 9, that of Adrian 
Burchett in the slaying of George 
L. Kendrick, for April 11, and 
Barbara Newsome in the slaying of her 
husband, Paul, April 23. 

In addition to these cases, the docket lists 
eight for possession or sale of alcoholic 
beverages, six for shooting, striking or 
cutting and wounding, six for breaking aQd 
entering, five for grand larceny, two for 
arson and four for avoiding testifying 
before the grand jury. In the miscellaneous 
list of other cases child desertion remains 
the most frequently mentioned offense. 

THEN IT HIT US 
The patient has done better than ex­

pected. We didn' t miss an issue, did right 
well with what we didn't have and what 
others had. Until last week, back in our own 
quarters, using our own equipment, it hit 
us . We printed a picture upside down on 
Page 1, we left a caption off the McDowell 
basketball team picture . . . we should, as 
one of the boys said, quoting Zanuck or 
Zukor or somebody, "have stood in bed." 

BUZZARD BOUNTY 
The buzzards returned to Hinckley, Ohio 

at8:18a.m. lastThursday, the same March 
15 date traditionally marked for their 
arrival every year since the memory of 
man knows not when. The newspaper item 
a bout these critt~rs recalls a yarn I heard 
the late "Coon" Moore tell, years ago. 

It was at election time, and Mr. Moore 
was back home, campaigning for a 
relative. He was resting up from his labors 
at the old Valley Inn and was amusing 
himself and regaling his listeners with a 
rich store of anecdotes. 

One he told was of his arrival in Elliott 
county to reside and of his decision to get 
acquainted. He noted, he said, an especially 
large crop of buzzards sailing about the 
countryside, and that gave him an idea . He 
passed the word a round at the country store 
that he would pay a reward of $5 for every 
buzzard gizzard brought him within the 
next 10 days. 

That did it. Money was scarce, those 
days, and the boys thereabouts pooled their 
efforts. One contributed a sheep which they 
killed and left on a bald point as bait. 

It wasn't long till the buzzards flocked in 
for the feast, and those interested in the 
reward began blasting away. Then they 

CSee Story 2, Back Page, Sec. 1) 

Hot, Wet., Cold-the Weather 
Poses Varied Area Problems 

Two weeks of summery weather which 
brought flower and leaf a month ahead of 
schedule were broken by heavy rains last 
Wednesday night which threatened 
lowlying sections with flood, and this 
threatened crisis ended with snowfall 
Saturday and a killing frost Sunday night. 

Three homes at Allen, those of Marvin 
Rice, Woodrow Crum and Alberta Adams, 
were flooded at Allen. County Judge Henry 
Stumbo said one bridge was washed out on 
Frazier's Creek, near McDowell, and that 
other road damage was suffered. Rice said 
the water rose 15 inches in his home. 

WEDNESDAY, MARCH 21,19.73 

Camp Area 
For Season, 
Lost Cause 

Goble Branch Work 
Contract Not Let; 
Use, Months Away 
Department of Parks' plans for a modem 

camping area in the Goble Branch section 
of Dewey Lake by camping season this year 
have gone awry. 

"There's no way," George Barker, Jenny 
Wiley State Park manager, said Friday 
when asked if the new camping facilities 
will be ready as scheduled. 

In fa~t. n0 contract has been awarded for 
making the necessary installations in the 
area-tent pads, water and electric 
facilities, and the like. 

Worse, engineering as a preliminary to 
asking bids on the work has not been 
completed. 

And road construction into the area is far 
from complete. The Qepartment of High­
ways is still engaged in making a fill for the 
approach to the camping area and has an 
access road to build. 

The water supply for the area will 
probably come from the Auxier water 
system, but the line is yet to be laid. 

Approximately 125 camping sites have 
been planned for Goble Branch, and these 
were promised last year to be ready for use 
with the opening of the 1973 camping 
season. 

Lack of such facilities at Jenny Wiley has 
resulted in a loss of business, Prestonsburg 
Mayor George P . Acher and others have 
claimed, urging speedy action. 

Park Manager Barker indicated a 
temporary camping area on Stratton 
Branch, where water is available, may be 
used this season. 

The only other a reas available to 
campers in the lake area are at German 
and at two or three designated spots on the 
lake shores. At German the Corps of 
Engineers installed water and electricity 
and made various other improvements for 
its camping area, and its use last year was 
heavy. Equally heavy use is expected this 
year. 

The number of visitors to the lake last 
year was 1,005,860, Dean Murray, reservoir 
manager, said. This was a drop of about 

(See Story 1, Back Page, Sec. l ) 

Court Moves 
To Gain Entry 
For Span Work 

Although the Floyd fiscal court has en­
countered difficulty in acquiring right-of­
way for the proposed bridge across the Big 
Sandy a t Emma from one property-owner, 
the resultant delay in advertising for 
contractors' bids is not expected to be of 
more than a few weeks' duration. 

A condemnation suit has been filed for 
approximately 2.5 acres of land owned by 
Ralph Leslie, appraisers are being ap­
pointed, and when their evaluation of the 
property is reported the fiscal court will 
execute bond for that amount and thus gain 
legal right of entry. If no settlement is 
reached with Leslie, the condemnation case 
will be heard later in circuit court. 

Advertising for bids awaits only the 
acquisition of right-of-way. Planning is 
complete, the county has given permission 
for the old suspension span to be torn down 
when the new bridge is completed, and all 
other requirements have been met, it was 
said . 

Acquisition of rights-of-way is at county 
expense. Leslie and the court are ap­
proximately $17,000 apart in the 
negotiations for the property. The land­
owner emphasized that he is interested in 
construction of the bridge but was not 
satisfied with the fiscal court's offer. 

Rural Highway Commissioner said the 
two-lane concrete bridge will cost an 
estimated $400,000 and that work is planned 
for this year. 

And this, County Clerk C. "Ollie" 
Robinson says, will cost Floyd county about 
$3,000 for the printing of the primary and 
November ballot for those six precincts 
that is different from the ballot used 
elsewhere in the county. Much of the Pike 
county vote in the district to which this part 
of Floyd will belong lies in the Pond Creek 
section. 

Drop in Enrollment 
Lowers Teacher Need 

The flood damage in this county was 
minor, although some highways were cut 
by rising waters. Motor traffic on Abbott 
Creek was stopped by water, Saturday and 
Sunday, and for a time the Left Beaver 
Creek highway in the vicinity of McDowell 
was blocked. US 119 from Pikeville to 
Williamson, W.Va. was flooded. So was KY 
1760 between US 23 and KY 32 in Lawrence 
county. 

The flooding was widespread in the South 
and particularly damaging in Tennessee, 
Mississippi, the Carolinas, Georgia and 
Alabama. 

Two years from now-if the courts do not 
relent in their insistence on districts- being 
nearly equal in population-not only the 
election of a State Representative but also a 
State Senator will be affected by the 1973 
redistricting. The 29th Senatorial district 
now includes Floyd, Knott, Martin and 
Perry counties, but Floyd county lost up­
wards of 500 voters on Abbott Creek and at 
Auxier to the 25th district, which is com­
posed mainly of Johnson, Lawrence and 
Boyd counties. 

After be and other county clerks had 
received instructions to accept help from 
designated persons of both political parties 
in the re-registration of voters this year, 
County Clerk Robinson said last week that 
he will accept good, reputable people from 
both parties for the work, if they will take 
necessary training. 

But he indicated there is no real need in 
this county for such help. He said almost 
10,000 voters already have re-registered, 
that this is approximately half of the 
eligible voters, and that his own staff will 
do a house-to-house canvass of voters in 
time to meet the registration deadline. 

Prospects are dim for the employment 
next school year of any new teachers in 
Floyd county, Supt. of Schools Charles 
Clark said last week after comparing 
enrollments in the schools for the first six 
months of the current term with the same 
period a year ago. 

The enrollment shows a drop of 328 
pupils, and that, the superintendent said, 
"makes it next to impossible to employ any 
new teachers." 

In fact, he said, the enrollment loss 
means 10 fewer teachers next year and if 
that number of teachers now employed do 
not retire or otherwise leave their positions, 
some who are not on continuing contract 
must be cut from the teacher list at the end 
of this school year. <State law provides for 
one teacher for every 27 children in 
average daily attendance.) 

Enrollment gains have been recorded in 
only eight schools. Meanwhile, 17 schools 
were losing pupils and one, Bonanza; held 
its own with an enrollment of 63. 

Enrollment of schools with enrollment 
gains <increases shown in parentheses l: 

Daniels Creek 28 (3); Allen elementary 
370 (6); Betsy Layne elementary 444 (10) 
Drift 90 (6); Harold 268 (2) ; Prestonsburg 
elementary 946 ( 18); Prestonsburg high 810 
(1 l; Weeksbury elementary 129 (9); home 
instruction class No. 2, 12 (1) 

Schools with losses: 
Dwale 'J:l (3); Home Branch 52 (10); 

Lackey 82 ( 3); Prater 128 (2), Spruce Pine 
63 ( 10); Tram (school closed, enroJlment of 
3 last year); Allen Central high <con­
solidation of Wayland, Garrett, Maytown, 
Martin) 590 (88); Auxier elemen­
tary 189 (4); Betsy Layne high 465 
(19); Clark elementary 471 (10); Garrett 
elementary 330 (1); J. M. Stumbo 
elementary 661 (33); Maytown elementary 
245 (20); Martin elementary 513 (11); 
McDowell elementary 612 (29); McDowell 
high school340 (36); Melvin elementary 211 
( 16); Osborne elementary 436 (53); 
Wayland elementary 257 (19 l; Wheelwright 
high 320 ( 12); Spradlin Branch trainable 
class 8 (ll; Allen trainable 6 Ul. 

The total enrollment for the six-month 
period this school year is 9,178 down from 
9,506 last year. 

In this county the cold weather may have 
caused worse damage than high waters. 
Peach, plum and pear, all in bloom, may be 
a total loss. 

In Prestonsburg, where the lowlands 
flood stage ranges from 35 to 38 feet, the Big 
Sandy crested at 1 a.m. Sunday at 34.48 
feet. Pikeville and Paintsville have the 
same flood stage, 35 feet. At Pikeville the 
river crested at 8 a.m. Saturday at 34.27 
feet; at Paintsville, at 9 a.m. Sunday, at 
31.94. 

The rainfall, reported by Dean Murray. 
Dewey Reservoir manager: 

At Martin, 2.42 inches; Freeburn, 3.05; 
Paintsville, 1.49; Salyersville, 1.05; Dewey 
Dam, 1.98. 

Dewey Lake rose 7.75 feet above summer 
pool. The drawdown began at 10 a.m. 
Monday but the water will not be dropped 
below the summer stage unless rainfall of 
two to three inches is predicted, Mr. 
Murray said. The lake is expected to be 
down to its seasonal pool by Friday night. 

SOLID WASTE DISPOSAL NEARER ••. Members of the Floyd 
fiscal court and others inspect a sanitary landfill site near Stephens 
Branch on Right Beaver Creek. From left, they are Magistrate Zeb 
Ousley; James B. Goble, Floyd County Health Department ad­
ministrator; County Judge Henry Stumbo; Magistrate Denzil Ray 
Hall; County Attorney James R. Allen; Carl Ha le, soil scientist; 
Jimmy Jones, soil conservationist. Four landfill sites are sought for 
the county's solid waste program, but one may be put to use while 
others are being approved. 
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Women's Club Hears 
Social Security Tal~ 

The Prestonsburg Woman's Club held its 
regular meeting at the Floyd County 
Library with club president, Mrs. James D. 
Adams, presiding. A devotional, entitled 
"Fun," was presented by Mrs. E. L. 
Bierman. 

Mrs. Fred Francis introduced the 
speaker of the evening Charles Marlow, 
field representative for the Social Security 
Office at Pikeville. Mr. Marlow discussed 
retirement and disability rules. A question­
and-answer period followed. 

Correspondence read to clubwomen 
included an announcement of tours 
available to woman's clubs and a note of 
thanks from Meals On Wheels. 

Mrs. Paul Combs also read a letter of 
a ppreciation from Chalmer Frazier for the 
Woman's Club operation of the gift shop at 
Highlands Regional Medical Center. She 
reported sales were increasing and there 
remains a need for more volunteer 
workers. 

Mrs. William 0. Goebel, Jr., Educational 
chairman, announced that the department 
is sponsoring a "Grooming and Manner 
Workshop" during April for young girls, 
ages 9-12. The workshop will be held on 
Saturdays from 1 until 2 p.m . 

Mrs. James Allen reported on the Green 
Stamp collections and appealed for more 
donations of books to be used toward the 
purchase of a kidney machine. 

The club agreed with the suggestion of 
Mrs. D. L. Brown that pins be purchased 
for four past presidents who had not 
received them at the termination of their 
service. 

The Prestonsburg City Council had 
requested that the Womans Club send a 
committee to a combined meeting of civic 
organizations. Mrs. Adams appointed Mrs. 
L. B. Fairchild, Mrs. Stanley Combs, Mrs. 
Byron Nunnery and Mrs. Paul Combs to 
attend this meeting. 

Mrs. Adams named a nominating 
committee consisting of Mrs. Joe 
Buchanan, Mrs. Clyde Burchett, Mrs. 
Clyde George, Mrs. Woodrow Greenwade, 
and Mrs. Victor Hale. She urged all 
members to give serious consideration to 
the committee requests for service. 

The Executive Board recommended that 
the May meeting be held April 30, in order 
that the club year be completed before Mrs. 
Adams leaves on a trip to Spain. 

Hostesses for the evening were Mrs . 
Robert Burchett, Mrs. Stanley Combs, Mrs. 
T. A. Combs, Mrs. Dick Davis, Mrs. Huck 
Francis, Mrs. Woodrow Greenwade, Mrs. 
Ailene Riffe, Mrs. William Rose, Mrs. 
Byron Nunnery, Mrs. Christine Spradlin, 
Mrs. John Allen. 

Stretch, Sew Workshop 
To Be Held March 21 

A stretch and sew workshop will be held 
in Prestonsburg, March 21, at the Regional 
Library. Mrs. Bonnie Lacy, of Fabrics For 
Fun , Inc., Charleston, W. Va., will 
demonstrate how to fit, cut, sew and press 
knit materials. She will have on display 
several completed garments made with 
knit materials and new sewing notions. 

For mformation, contact Frances Pitts in 
the County Extension Office, 886·2668. 

PLAN SQUARE DANCE 
An oldtime square dance will be held at 

the Maytown gym Saturday night, March 
24, sponsored by the Allen Central high 
school Band Boosters. All proceeds will go 
to buy band uniforms. The time will be 
from 8 till 12, music by Jerry Martin and 
the Beaver Creek Boys. 

In MSU Pageant 

Morehead, Ky.-Christie Ankrom, 
Prestonsburg sophomore at Morehead 
State University, is among 31 coeds vying 
for the title of "Miss MSU of 1973" in the 
sixth annual campus pageant April 11 and 
12. 

She is the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Rex 
W. Ankrom of 220 Trimble Branch, 
Prestonsburg, and is a graduate of 
Williamson High School. 

Five judges considering beauty, talent 
and poise will choose a successor to the 
current Miss MSU, Nancye Chandler 
Williams of Pineville. The "Miss MSU" 
pageant is an official preliminary of the 
Miss Kentucky Scholarship Pageant which 
sends its winner to the Miss America 
Pageant in Atlantic City. 

Miss Ankrom, a math and accounting 
major, is a member of Delta Gamma social 
sorority. She participated in the 1972 Miss 
MSU pageant. 

Floral Arranging Course 
To Begin March 27 at PC<2 

The Community Service Program of 
Prestonsburg Community College is 
providing training in floral arranging. The 
course will consist of demonstrations and 
laboratory sessions in the proper selection 
of containers, flowers, and other materials 
and the arrangement of these items in 
pleasing and decorative ways. 

The group will meet at 7 p.m ., March 27, 
through May 8 in Room 102 in the Pike 
Technology Building, with Mrs. Ethel 
Colvin instructing. 

Additional information may be procured 
from James W. Ratcliff, coordinator of 
Community Services. 

VISIT NEW GRANDDAUGHTER 
Mrs. Inez Hammonds and daughter, 

Patsy, went to Louisville Sunday to visit 
her , new granddaughter, Mary Ellen 
Scutchfield, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Carl 
H. Scutchfield. Mr. and Mrs. Brady 
Shepherd accompanied them to Louisville. 

'RETURNED HOME LAST WEEK 
Mrs. Nelle A. Ribble returned to 

Warrenton, Va . last Wednesday after a 
visit here with her sister, Mrs. Maxie 
Hutsinpiller. Mrs. Sally L. Clark ac­
companied her to ~untington. Mrs. Charles 
Elliott joined her there to accompany her 
home for a visit. 

Announcing the Opening 

WIGS 

of 

HIGHLAND HEIGHTS 
WIG SALON 

Phone 886-2555, Goble-Roberts Addition 

• FALLS • HAIR PIECES 

I PROFESSIONAl STYliNG. I 

Meet it halfway with play 
clothes that keep their cool, 
and fashion sense, stay 
sturdy, bright and colorful all 
through the fun and games. 

~' 
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LAD 'n LASSIE SHOP 
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STORK SHOWER 
Mrs. Jim Caldwell, nee, Carletta Whit­

taker, was honored with a stork shower 
Friday evening, March 16 at Irene Cole 
Memorial Baptist Church. The traditional 
pink and blue custom was carried out in the 
table decorations. Cakes, punch, sand­
wiches, nuts and mints were served by the 
hostesses, Mrs. Dallas Prater, Mrs. Jim 
McClung, Mrs. Vaughn Blanton, Mrs. John 
D. Evans, Mrs. Fred Little, Mrs. Ronald 
Snodgrass, Mrs. Jess Stover, Mrs. Gene 
Crass, Mrs. Oakley Sparks, Mrs. Bill 
Caldwell, Mrs. Jim Curnutte, Mrs. David 
Kenny Caldwell, Miss Margaret Collins. 

FASHION SHOW MODEL 
Phyllis Stanley, of Prestonsburg, was one 

of four women modeling for Hymson's 
Department Store Spring Fashion Show on 
the Town Talk Program, WKYT-TV, 
Lexington, March 9. 

IN FLORIDA 
Miss Marsha Ann Watson is spending this 

week in Daytona Beach, Florida. Ac­
companying her are Connie Engbert, 
Paducah; Karen Hauck, Louisville; Kim 
Stall berg, Pittsburgh, Pa.; Katie and Molly 
Malonie, Dayton, Ohio. They plan also to 
visit Atlanta Underground and 
Disneyworld. 

METHODIST WOMEN TO MEET 
The Ashland District of the United 

Metnodist Women will hold a district 
Woman's Responsibility Day at the First 
United Methodist Church, Catlettsburg, 
Saturday, March 24, beginning at 10 a.m. 
All United Methodist Women in the Ashland 
District are invited, and each officer of the 
local Society is urged to attend, since the 
meeting will be a training and fellowship 
period for all persons who are members of 
the United Methodist Women's groups. 

TO ATTEND CONVENTION 
Mrs. Sally L. Clark, regent of John 

Graham Chapter, Daughters of the 
American Revolution. Mrs. Everett H. 
Sowards, Publicity chairman, and Mrs. 
Claude P . Stephens are in Lexington this 
week attending the 77th annual state D. A. 
R. convention at the Phoenix Hotel. Mrs. 
Sowards will attend the state Officers' Club 
dinner at Spindletop Wednesday evening. 
"Wait on the Lord : Be of Good Courage," 
theme of the National Society for 1972-1873, 
will be the theme of the Conference 
Assembly. 

HAS SURGERY 
Cliff Halstead is doing nicely following 

surgery last Friday at the Highlands 
MedicalCenter. 

HOME FROM FLORIDA 
Mrs. Margaret P. Alley returned home 

last Thursday from a three-month stay in 
Florida . She visited Mrs. Sally L. Newman 
at Holopaw, Dr. and Mrs. J . M. Helm at 
Titusville, and with friends at Ft. 
Lauderdale and other places. 

VISITING I~ NASHVILLE 
Mrs. Tom Bolling and Mrs. Myrtle ~· 

Allen are in Nashville, Tenn. this week on 
business. They attended the Grand Ole 
Oprey there last Saturday. 

HERE FOR VISIT 
Miss May Beam, of Lexington, arrived 

last Saturday for a visit of a week, with her 
sister, Mrs. Carrie Hubbard. Mr. and Mrs. 
Wilbur Shuman accompanied her here, 
returning to Lexington Sunday. 

ATTEND TOURNAMENT 
Mr. and Mrs. Donald Pelphrey, Paul 

Leslie, Mr. and Mrs. Ron Leslie and 
Dwayne Moore attended the state 
basketball tournament in Louisville last 
week. 

WEEK-END GUESTS 
Mr. and Mrs. Jeff Gunnells and son and 

Mrs. Meta Sizemore, of Ashland, visited his 
mother at Emma and Mrs. Carrie Hubbard 
here over the week-end. 

HERE FOR SUMMER 
Mrs. Mossa Mirzainan and son Carl, of 

Tehran , Iran, arrived last Friday to spend 
the summer months with her mother, Mrs. 
Allene Riffe, and Mrs. Grayce Golden. She 
was met at Blue Grass Airport by her 
sister, Mrs. Robert Butt, and daughters, 
Sheryl and Melissa, of Dayton, 0 .; who 
spent the week-end here. Mayor Mirzainan 
will be transferred to Tabriz Airforce Base, 
Iran , soon. 

HOME FROM FLORIDA 
Mrs. Lilliam P. Rimmer returned home 

last week from Orlando, Florida, where she 
spent the winter with her s ister, Mrs. 
Elizabeth Pittman O'Neal. 

VISITORS FROM OHIO 
Mr. and Mrs. Sam Perry, of Norwalk, 

Ohio, spent the week-end here recently with 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. Bill Perry. 

VISITED HERE AND IN COUNTY 
Mr. and Mrs. W. H. Mathis, of 

Waynesboro, Va ., were here and elsewhere 
in the county recently , visiting re latives 
and friends. They were luncheon guests of 
Mrs. Earl Stumbo on Monday. 

UNDERGOES SURGERY 
The Rev. M. Robert Regan is doing nicely 

at The Highlands Medical Center following 
surgery last Friday. Mr. Regan has been 
confined to his home here by ill health for 
months. 

DAUGHTER BORN 
Mr. and Mrs. Carl H. Scutchfield , of 

Louisville, announce the birth of a daughter 
March 15 at Norton Infirmary, Louisville. 
She has been named Mary Ellen. 

INCOME TAX 
REPORTS 

-See-

EUGENE CONLEY 
Day Phone 285-313% 

Second FloorCollJns Bldg., 
Next door to Dermont's. 

1-17-tf. 

ELECT OFFICERS 
River Raisin Chapter, United States 

Daughters of 1812, met March 7, in the 
Henry Clay Room at the Phoenix Hotel in 
Lexington. Following the business meeting, 
officers were elected, as follows: 

President, Mrs. Robert Lee Klaren; first 
vice-president, Miss Elizabeth Brock ; 
second vice-regent, Mrs. Wm. G. Mc­
Murtry; treasurer, Mrs. Ewell H. Gibson ; 
recording and corresponding secreatry, 
Mrs. Wm . G. McMurty ; registrar, Mrs. 
Clifford Cayle; historian, Mrs. Everett H. 
Sowards; Chaplain, Mrs. Fred Osborne; 
auditor, Ms . Virginia Moore Rice; 
parliamentarian, Mrs. Dewey Daniel. The 
guest speaker, Jack K. Hodgkin, Winchester 
artist, gave a talk on Joel T. Hart, the great 
artist-sculptor. Mr. Hodgkin painted the 
portrait of Cassius M. Clay which hangs at 
White Hall . 

VISIT IN OHIO 
Mrs. Bert N. Porter, Mr. and Mrs. 

Stanley Ray Burchett and children, visited 
Mrs. Porter's twin sister, Mrs. Raymond 
Kennedy and family, of lA.tcasville, Ohio, 
Wednesday, March 14. They also visited 
Mrs. Dora May, of Portsmouth, Ohio, and 
Grant May, of Lucasville. 

HOME FROM FLORIDA 
Mr. and Mrs. Ray Collins, Mr. and Mrs. 

Joe Wheeler Burchett returned home 
Saturday after a two-week stay in Holopaw, 
Fla . They visited "Bucky" Burchett and 
family at Corbin, en route home . 

VISIT FATHER HERE 
Mr. and Mrs. John Mann, of New York 

City and Mr. -end Mrs. Robert Mann, of 
Wilton, Iowa, were called here this week by 
the illness of their fath~r, Fred Mann. 

TAU CHAPTER MEETS 
Tau Chapter, Delta. Kappa Gamma, met 

March 10 at the Floyd County Library. The 
meeting was conducted by the president, 
Mrs. Roberta Davidson. Lassie Copley 
gave the devotions. Sarah Clay Stephens 
presented a program on "The Expressive 
Dimension of a Culture." Refreshments 
were served by the hostesses, Violet Allen, 
Lassie Copley and Betsy Rennick. Other 
members present were Janice Allen, Eloise 
A. Hall, Edith Hopkins, Alicia C. Mayo, 
Anna Sue Stumbo and Marie Stumbo. 

HORN CHAPEL WSCS MEETS 
The WSCS of Horn's Chapel United 

Methodist Church met at the church, 
March 5. The president, Willia Mae 
Branham, presided. Mrs. Will Bingham led 
the group in prayer and Mrs. Charles Jeff 
Wells sand a solo . In the absence of the 
speaker, Mrs. Thelma Koroswki, and Mrs. 
Woodrow Branham read from one of Ford 
Philpot's books. The secretary's report was 
given by Marietta Crager. The group 
discussed selling greeting cards and a 
rummage sale to make money for the 
circle. Refreshments were served by Rose 
Burchett and Ella V. Wells to Chloe Owsley, 
Maxine Goble, Polly Harmon, Lula Wallen, 
Dana Bingham, Bess Wells , Belva Wills, 
Alice Bayes, Jeannie Warrix, Marietta 
Crager, Willia M. Branham and guest. 
Verlie McDonald, Karen McMurray, 
Barbara Crager, Jessica a_nd Debbie 
Warrix. 

RELEASED FROM HOSPITAL 
Bruce Spradlin returned home Saturday 

from the Highlands Medical Center after a 
stay of several days, recuperating from 
another heart attack. 

HONORED ON BIRTHDAY 
Mrs. Kermit Baldridge was honored on 

her birthday March 15 with a dinner at the 
Wise Cafe. The family group included Mr. 
and Mrs. Baldridge, Mrs. David W. Allen, 
Donald Baldridge, Mrs. Judy Bradley, 
Karen and Eddie Bradley. At her home on 
Court street, following dinner, she was 
presented many personal gifts. 

VISIT IN LEXINGTON 
Mr. and Mrs. Rudolph Spencer, of 

Garrett, and Mrs. Rebecca Rasnick visited 
Mr. and Mrs. Don Harris and children in 
Lexington over the week-end and several 
days this week. 

ATTEND JEWELRY SHOWING 
Mr. and Mrs. Clifford Wright and Susie 

are in Columbus, Ohio this week attending 
the jewelry showing. 

VISIT MOTHER HERE 
Mrs. Frank Phillips and son, Richard, of 

Nashville , Tenn., spent the week-end here 
with her mother , Mrs. Maman Leslie, who 
is recovering nicely after recent surgery. 

SUNDAY VISITORS 
Mr. and Mrs. David Campbell and son 

Da vid, of West Liberty, visited her grand­
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Ray Collins here 
Sunday. 

Is Dean's Scholar 
John Robert Hereford, son of Mr. and 

Mrs. Thomas Hereford, of Prestonsburg, 
has been named a Dean's Scholar at the 
University of Louisville for the Fall 
semester, 1972-73. To attain Dean 's Scholar 
status, a student must have a perfect 4.0 
point Call A's ; standing. Young Hereford is 
a freshman at the university, majoring in 

HEADS ALPHA THETA 

Thomas John Burchett, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Clyde Burchett, was recently elected 
president of Alpha Theta Chapter of Kappa 
Alpha Order, Transylvania University, 
Lexington. He is a sophomore, majoring in 
pre-med. 

VISIT HERE SATURDAY 
Rev. and Mrs. Larry Mann, of Win­

chester, and Mr . .and Mrs. John Milton 
Caudill, of Louisa, visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Walter Mann last Saturday. 

DINNER HONORS PAR,ENTS 
Mr . and Mrs. Brady Shepherd were 

honored on their 39th wedding anniversary. 
February 28, with a dinner at May Lodge by 
their four daughters, three of whom flew 
from Rochester, N. Y. to be with them on 
their anniversary. The anniversary group 
included Mr. and Mrs. Shepherd, Mrs. 
Elmer Robinson, Mrs. Donald Marcella, 
Mrs. Howard Samples, Rochester, N. Y. , 
Mrs. Bobby Hackworth, Mrs. Ethel May 
Chaffin. Mr. and Mrs. Shepherd were 
presented birthstone jewelry. 

ENTERS LEXINGTON HOSPITAL 
Mrs. Fannie Jarrell left Tuesday for St. 

Joseph's hospital at Lexington where she 
will receive treatment for a heart con­
dition. She was visited by Mr. and Mrs. 
George Glenn Hatcher, and daughters, of 
Frankfort, and Mr. and Mrs. Joe Wheeler 
Jarrell, of Louisa . Bill Bailey accompanied 
her to Lexington. 

Tackett-Wilkerson Vows 
Ex<'hanged At Frankfort 

The marriage of Miss Margaret 
Elizabeth Tackett and Michael Layne 
Wilkerson was solemized Saturday af­
ternoon , Feb. 17 at First Presbyterian 
Church, Frankfort, Ky. The candellight 
ceremony was performed by the Rev. 
Robert Laughlin. 

The bride is the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Kenneth B. Tackett, of Frankfort, and the 
groom is the son of Mrs. Finis Wilkerson, 
Austin , Ky., and the late Mr. Wilkerson, 
formerly of Prestonsburg. 

The bride wore a candlelight gown of 
taffeta and organza accented by pink 
rosebuds on the bodice of sheer sleeves. 
Her bouquet was made up of white car­
nations and sweetheart rosebuds atop a 
white bible. 

Mrs. Craig Clover served as matron of 
honor. He r dress was orchid organza with 
candlelight lace trim on the bodice and 
sleeves and her bouquet was orchid car­
nations and white sweetheart rosebuds. 

Craig Clover was best man. Ushers were 
Tim Murphy, Bradley Williams and James 
Carr. a ll of Murray. 

Mrs. Barbara Davis, Louisville, cousin of 
the bride, a ttended the bride's book and 
Mrs. Johnny Moore served at the reception. 

After a short wedding t r ip, the 
newlyweds are residing in Frankfort where 
Mrs. Wilkerson is employed by the 
Franklin County Board of Education and 
Mr. Wilkerson is employed by the Kentucky 
Department of Agriculture. 
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Mrs. Virginia Turner's Poetry 
Is Published Posthumously . 

Arthritis Chairman Recognized 

A book of mountain poetry, titled "Cat 
Claws and Tree Bark," has just been 
published by the Pikeville College Press of 
the Appalachian Studies Center, Pikeville. 
It is a selection of poignant poems written 
by the late Virginia Casey Turner, wife of 
Virgil 0. Turner, of the Pikeville College 
faculty and a former superintendent of 
Floyd county schools. 
· Mrs. Turner grew up in Garrard county 

and attended Berea College, where she was 
a charter member of the Writers Club. She 
was also instructed by the Kentucky 
novelist and poet, Dr. Hollis Summers, who 
wrote the foreword to the volume. Virginia 
Casey met and married Mr. Turner while 
he, too, was studying at Berea College.He 
returned to his native Floyd county schools. 
Mrs. Turner taught at Maytown and at 
Prestonsburg and, when her husband 
moved to Pikeville College as a professor of 
political science she taught in Pikeville 
high school. 

Mrs. Turner did not publish her poetry 
widely, but preferred to write for herseH 

NOTICE 
Effective April 2, 1973, the charge for 

haircuts will be raised 25 cents above the 
present price. 

PRESTONSBURG BARBERS 
3-7-4t. 

and for those dear to her. Her poems have 
themes of compassion and joy and the 
tender feelings of agony and celebration. 
Dr. Summers says of the book, "It is a 
dreaming Mona Lisa book, often a bright 
telling time but it is also an assertion, a 
speaking out." 

Some poems in the book have appeared in 
Poetry, Approaches, Ladies' Home 
Journal, Twigs, and others. But many 
appear here for the first time. The book, 
issued on March 8, has 114 pages, cloth­
bound, priced at $4.50, and may be obtained 
from the Appalachian Studies Center of 
Pikeville College. 

STUDENTS DEVELOP PLAN 
Three years ago a professor at the 

University of Missouri asked his class in 
ceramic engineering for ideas on how to use 
throw-away glass bottles. Suggested one 
student: "Why not crush the glass and 
substitute it for sand and crushed stone as 
the aggregate in paving material?" In­
trigued by the notion, the class developed a 
proposal, found support (from the U. S. 
Public Health Service and the En­
vironmental Protection Agency), and 
embarked on research and development. 
The resulting product has bee tested on 
university roadways and is gaining 
popularity as a paving material for parking 
lots and roads. 

Left to Right: Miss Burieta Gearhart, 
Floyd county's 1972 Arthritis chairman and 
director of the Kentucky Chapter of the 
Arthritis Foundation, receives Certificate 
of Recognition from Miss Patty Lou Davis, 
Eastern Kentucky field representative for 
the Arthritis Foundation, Louisville. 

Both Miss Gearhart and Miss Davis 
expressed their appreciation to the 
following members of the 1972 Floyd county 
Arthritis Campaign Committee: 

Records And Tapes 

Super Specials! 

Mrs. Ditty Tackett, Prestonsburg Victory 
March chairman; Mrs. Harry_ Burke, 
Prestonsburg Business Gifts chairman; 
Mr. Bill Goebel, Jr., Prestonsburg Business 
Gifts co-chairman; Mrs. Barbara Heinze, 
Floyd county publicity chairman; Mrs. 
Bonnie Spencer, chairman for Allen, Allen 
Woman's Club, sponsoring organization; 
Miss Ruby Akers, chairman for Drift and 
~cDowell, sponsoring organization, Drift 

IN HOSPITAL 

Each week ... 10 different popular and 
country Stereo Albums and 8-Track Tapes ... at a 
fantastic 52.00 OFF the list price. Be sure and 
visit us each week. These Super-Specia ls change· 
each Monday. 

Mrs. Pearl Bingham is a patient at the 
Highlands Medical Center, receiving 
treatment while under observation. 

ATTENDS SALES MEETING 
Mrs. Mary Allene Riffe was in Bristol, 

Tenn., part of last week, attending a sales 
meeting of the E. W. King Company. 

We also offer a complete selection of single 
records, Stereo Albums and 8-Track Tapes at 
everyday discount prices. 

VISIT AT JACKSON 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Buchanan and Sarah 

visited Mr. and Mrs. William B. Burke and 
Baker at Jackson, overnight last Thursday. 

-~ ·~ DAVIDSOM'S 
-~ RECORD AND 

EYE SURGERY SUCCESSFUL 
Mrs. Althea Bradley is doing nicely at the 

home of her daughter, Mrs. Johnny Ellis, at 
St. Paul, Va ., following eye surgery last 
Tuesday at the Abington <Virginia) 
Hospital. She will return this week for a 
checkup. 

Main Street 

a. 

TAPE CENTER 

·Pa intsville 

INTUITIONS 

IS HOSPITAL PATIENT 
Mrs. BeatriceLeslieisa patientatCentral 

Baptist hospital, Lexington. Her son, David 
Banner Leslie, visited her there over the 
week-end. He was accompanied home by 
Mr. and Mrs. Volney D. Allen, of Langley. 

... a new experience in f~shion sportswear 

Bold in. color and contrast. D~amatic in des1gn. That's ( \TUTI 0 \:-;. 
the nrwest member of \.\',quality fashion famih-. Comr discoH~r for 
Your:Self ... co_mp_ose yo~~ own individual look. Casual .. . puli~ht-J 

. · .. or posh.I\TUTIO.\~ · has the fo,ely parts of rich!~ textured po­
l~·este~. to ~re~te ~·our total sports1rear wardrobe for Spring. \\ e show 
three ImagmatiYe combos from the collection: 

a. A. sophisticated combination of black and white 
shown in the skirt, 23.00, jacket, 40.00, and blouse 
16.00, in sizes 6 to 14. ' 

b. Dressy casualness exemplified in a black and white 
tradition. Blouse 16.00, jacket, 45.00, and slacks 23.00 
in sizes 6 to 14. ' ' 

c. Earthy elegance is portrayed in 
this brown and white combo in sizes 
6 to 14. Blouse, 16.00 jacket, 35.00 and 
cuffed slacks, 25.00. 

b. 

Leva's Style Shop 
Phone 886-8241 Prestonsburg 

Woman's Club; Miss Lorena Hall, chair­
man for Maytown, sponsoring 
organization, Maytown Woman's Club; 
Mrs. Ethel Osborne and Mrs. Virginia 
Jamerson, co-chairman for Wheelwright, 
Burton, Melvin and Weeksbury; Mrs. Ruth 
S. Reynolds, chairman for Martin; Mrs. 
Patricia Duff, chairman for Garrett, 
Wayland and Lackey; Mrs. Paul 
Gearheart, chairman for Harold, Betsy 
Layne and Boldman. 

Miss Davis and Miss Gearheart said that 
as a result of the full cooperation of the 
campaign committee and the county's 
volunteers, Floyd county had a successful 
1972 arthritis crive, collecting a total of 
$1,144.74. 

Each chairman of the committee will 
receive a Certificate of Achievement this 
week from the Arthritis Foundation. 

MAYTOWN NEWS 
PAROLE OFFICER, SPEAKER 

The Maytown Womans Club met Feb. 26 
at the home of Mrs. Kenneth Blevins. 
William <Bud> Crum, probation and parole 
officer for the 31st judicial district, spoke 
concerning problems facing the Depart­
ment of Corrections and the interesting and 
constructive work being done. 

Miss Lorena Hall, president, asked for 
reports from the music and sewing 
chairmen. They are to select contestants 
for the Seventh district contest to be held in 
April. Plans were made for the annual Style 
Show that will be presented this year at the 
new Allen Central high school, sometime in 
April. Miss Hall told the club that Girl 
Scouts had collected for the Heart Fund. 
Plans were made for the Red Cross Drive. 

Members attending were Miss Lorena 
Hall, Mrs. Roland Burchett, Mrs. Ed 
Stewart, Mrs. Denny Gibson, Mrs. Hubert 
Halbert, Mrs. Dennis Mayo, Mrs. Mike 
May. 

TIMES WANT ADS GET RESULTS! 

- ·--\ : . 
I'· 
I: 
jl 
'I l, 

J 
i 
l 

CHAPTER MEMORIAL SERVICE 
John Graham Chapter, Daughters of the 

American Revolution met March 13 at the 
home of Mrs. Wm. 0. Goebel on Arnold 
Avenue, Mrs. Sally L. Clark, regent, 
presiding. Mrs. Elizabeth A. Garriott, 
chaplain pro-tem, conducted the ritualistic 
service. Mrs. Clark named the delegate and 
alternates to the 77th annual state con­
ference March 21 at the Phoenix Hotel, 
Lexington. Representing the Chapter will 
be Mrs. Sally L. Clark, delegate, Mesdames 
Everett H. Sowards, Claude P. Stephens, 
Stanley Combs, OpalS. May, Ray Brackett, 
Joe Buchanan, as alternates. The President 
General's Message was read by Mrs. Opal­
S. May. Mrs. Clarke read the article, 
"Restoring the Death Penalty." A motion 
to buy 24 sets of luncheon place mats for 
resale was voted. 

Miss Sue Jett Jaggers, winner of the 
Good Citizenship Award, was presented the 
Good Citizenship Pin given annually by the 
Chapter. Mrs. Clark made the presen­
tation. The Good Citizenship Pilgrimage to 
Frankfort will be April 7. 

The marker fund netted $1.88. The 
business meeting was concluded with a 
memorial service conducted by Mrs. Ruth 
D. Sowards. The candle in a silver can­
dlestick was lighted by her. The American 
flag stood at half-mast. The bronze grave 
insignia with colors of blue and white 
ribbons was at the left of the burning candle 
in memory of Mrs. Inez Cottrell Hobson, 
who died Oct. 25, 1972. She was the daughter 
of the late Fred Cottrell and Lida Richmond 
Cottrell and the wife of Joe Hobson. She had 
been a member of John Graham Chapter, 
D. A. R. for many years, having joined on 
the Revolutionary Service of Patrick 
Ewing, and had served as historian, 
secretary, and chairman of many com­
mittees. At the close of the service, Mrs. 
Sowards presented the bronze insignia to 
Mr. Hobson, to be placed at the graveside 
Marker. The burning candle, was ex­
tinguished, and a prayer concluded the 
service. 

A dessert course was served to Mrs. W. 
D. Jaggers, Sue Jett Jaggers, Mr. and Mrs. 
Fred Cottrell. Mrs. Raymond Schoolcraft, 
Mrs. Larry Greer, Mrs. H. L. Mayo, Mrs. 
Opal May, Mrs. Stanley Combs, Mrs. Tom 
James, Mrs. Claude P. Stephens, Mrs. 
Elizabeth Garriott, Mrs. Sallye L. Clark, 
Mrs. Wm. 0. Goebel, Mrs. J. G. Stepp. 

Poison Prevention 
Aim of Health Dept. 

"Parents, in addition to all their other 
duties, need to be members of a 'poison 
prevention patrol' in their homes," said 
Floyd County Public Health Nurse,Jane 
Wallace. This advice came in connection 
with "Poison Prevention Week," set for 
March 18-24. 

In order to make more parents aware of 
the potential dangers which exist in their 
own medicine chests and cabinets, the 
Floyd County Health Department released 
a list of some of the dangers which parents 
should be conscious of. These include: 

1. Medicines in plactls where curious 
children can reach them. 

2. Deadly insecticides and garden 
chemicals that are improperly stored. 

3. Low cabinets containing dangerous 
household products. 

4. Petroleum products stored in soda pop 
bottles that-to a child-look like 
something sweet to drink. 

5. Old, flaking lead-based paint that, 
when nibbled by a child, can be poisonous. 

6. Bleaches, lye and laundry room 
products that can make a mess as well as 
poison a child's system. 

"If these poisons are accessible to your 
children, you're increasing the chances of 
causing illness or death in your own home," 
Mrs. Wallace said, and she added, "In case 
poisoning occurs despite your precautions, 
call your physician or nearest Poison 
Prevention Control Center at Ashland, 
Kentucky . 

Churches Combine 
For Net Tournament 

The combined efforts of nine local 
churches have resulted in a basketball 
tournament, to be held at the Prestonsburg 
high school gym. 

The first game, Wednesday, March 21 
will begin at 7 p.m. and pits Martin 
Methodist against Fitzpatrick Mission. A 
double-header Mar. 22 will feature 
Maytown Methodist vs. Benedict Chapel 
and Wayland Methodist vs. Louisa 
Methodist. Mar. 23, Maytown Baptist will 
play Lancer Baptist, and Community 
Methodist will meet the winner of the 
Wednesday night game. Semi-finals will be 
Saturday night, and the Sun. afternoon 
finals will determine the winner of this 
sports "first" for the County. 

Personals 
Mr. and Mrs. Buford Crager and sons, 

Kyle and Kip, of Morehead, spent a few 
days of their spring vacation with his 
mother, Mrs. Woodrow Crager, and 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. Will Bingham, 
of the Auxier road. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bobby Crager and 
daughters, Lea Ann and Jennifer Lynn, of 
Flatwoods, visited their parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Willie Hicks and Mrs. Marietta 
Crager during the spring break from 
McDowell elementary school where he is 
principal. . 

Mr. and Mrs. Harry Rice, of California, 
have been visiting her brother, Edgar 
Bingham, and other relatives in the county. 

Clabe Bingham is doing nicely after 
surgery at St. Clair Memorial Hospital in 
Morehead. He had been recuperating at the 
home of his daughter, Mrs. Palmer Hall, 
but has returned to his borne here. He was 
visited Sunday afternoon by his brother, 
Will Bingham, and Mrs. Marietta Crager. 

Mr. and Mrs. Curt Church, of Winston­
Salem, N.C., were week-end guests of her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. W. J. Wills, of the 
Auxier road. 

Mrs. Margaret P. Allen is spending the 
remainder of this week in Pikeville with her 
sister, Mrs. J. R. Herron, while Miss Lena 
Porter is attending the 77th D. A. R. con­
vention in Lexington. 

Miss Patricia Simmons, of Huntington, 
spent the week-end here with her aunt, Mrs. 
Helen Clark, and her grandmother, Mrs. 
John Simmons. Her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Paul Simmons, came here Sunday to ac­
company her home. 

Miss Jane Carter Webb, teacher at 
Brooksville school, spent the week-end here 
with her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Virgil 
Webb. 

Mr. and Mrs. Eddie Tackett and two 
sons, of Lexington, spent the week-end here 
with his mother, Mrs. Joe P. Tackett, Sr. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Frazier and daughter 
have returned to Morehead after a visit of a 
week here with their parents. 

George Preston Archer and Joe 
Buchanan, Jr., students at U. K., are 
spending the week here with their parents. 

Mr. and Mrs. A. L. Peters, of Dayton, 
Ohio, visited Mrs. Helen Clark here this 
week. 

Mrs. C. L. Hutsinpiller is a patient in the 
Highlands Medical Center. 

Mrs. Ruth D. Sowards is improved after 
an attack of flu. 

Joe Buchanan, Jr., of t.exington, spent 
the week-end here with his family. 

Miss Dallas Fay Sammons returned 
Sunday to Morehead State University after 
spending spring vacation with her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Dallas D. Sammons, of the 
Auxier road. 

Rev. Howard C. Church, of Xenia, 0., 
spent the week-end here, returning to Ohio 
Monday. 

VERBAL ABILITY COUNTS 
Stanford University economist Henry 

Levin recommends that school boards look 
for teachers with high verbal scores rather 
than years of experience. Levin, who 
conducted a study of 3,000 metropolitan 
teachers, found in terms of relative cost ... 
the teachers' verbal score is ten times as 
efficient as teachers' experience, per dollar 
of expenditure, for increasing the verbal 
scores of white students. For black 
students, it is five times more efficient." 
Not only does Levin suggest teachers be 
hit·ed on the basis or verbal ability, but 
suggests financial incentives be awarded to 
teachers with high verbal skills in order to 
retain them. 

" -
CITY OF PRESTONSBURG, KENTUCKY 

ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS 
Sealed bids will be received by the City of 

Prestonsburg, Kentucky, at the office of the 
Mayor, at the Ford Building in Prestons­
burg, Kentucky, until 7:30p.m., Thursday, 
April 5, 1973, at which time, in the Council 
Meeting Room at such Ford Building, bids 
will be publicly opened and read aloud, for 
furnishing labor and materials and per­
forming all work, as set forth by this ad­
vertisement for bids. 

The equipment to be furnished is as 
follows: 

1. Rubber-tired loader backhoe. 
The bids must comply with specifications 

approved by the City Counci1, copies of 
which speCifications may be obtained from 
the office of the City Clerk, in the Ford 
Building at Prestonsburg, Ky. 

Bids shall be in a sealed envelope bearing 
the bidder's identification, addressed to the 
City of Prestonsburg, labeled in the lower 
left-hand corner: 

"Proposal. 1. Rubber-tired loader 
backhoe." 

The City of Prestonsburg reserves the 
right to reject any or all bids, which bids 
shall not be withdrawn for 45 days sub­
sequent to the opening of bids, without 
consent of the City of Prestonsburg. 

A sea lamprey is capable of destroying JUDITH D. ARCHER, Clerk 
an a_verage of 20 pounds of fish during its City of Prestonsburg, Kentucky 
lifetime. 3-21-3t. 
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l PLUS 60 CENT ~ 
~ HANDLING CHARGE ~ 
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''Come Back, Next Year"­
The Old Refrain 

Now, we begin to wonder how long the state of Kentucky needs for 
the establishing of one modern camping area. 

Four years ago, the Nunn administration began debating private 
operation of such a facility at Dewey Lake as opposed to its 
operation by the state. Land was acquired, but no camping except 
the "primitive" kind. 

Last year, a few months after Governor Ford took office, a solid 
promise was made: the parking area will have all facilities in­
stalled, ready for the 1973 camping season. 

As of last week, they hadn't finished surveying. The access road 
into the promised camping area has not been completed. Water isn't 
near the area, unless you want to count the lake. Tent "pods" aren't 
ready. In fact, the plans are yet to be drawn so that contractors' bids 
on the work can be advertised. 

We are disappointed in the Department of Parks, the Department 
of Highways and all concerned with this gross failure to live up to a 
promise that was past due when it was made. Visitors from various 
parts of the country are going to be disappointed again, too, when 
they arrive at Dewey Lake and Jenny Wiley State Park and hear 
parks personnel apologetically confess that camping isn't ready and 
that if that is their dish they'll have to go to the Breaks or Buckhorn 
Lake or perhaps farther away even than that. 

There may be extenuating circumstances. We hope there are. But 
that doesn't banish the disappointment. The public still is not served, 
the park loses visitors, the county suffers an economic loss. The old 
refrain again is heard: "Come back, next year." 

But all this isn't anything new to us. 
For several years now we have been trying to get somebody at 

Frankfort to consider a basic need at Dewey Lake and do something 
to protect it from the fate of Fishtrap-sedimentation, as a result of 
surface mining, which will inevitably shorten the life of the lake. 

"We're keeping an eye on it," has been almost the only response to 
these warnings. Meanwhile, Clark Branch on Buffalo, a stream 
which empties into the lake, is being stripped dry; the mining is 
ready to move further down Buffalo; Brushy, another Johns Creek 
tributary which empties into the lake, has already had its face lifted. 
Farther upstream in Pike county, surface operations have long 
contributed their load of silt for deposit in the lake. 

Who cares, anyhow? 
Don't answer that-it might create another disappointment. 

Obituaries 
Mrs. Margaret Conn 

Mrs. Margaret Conn, 84, of Martin, died 
Saturday at Our Lady of the Way hospital 
after an extended illness. 
· Born March 18, 1888 at Martin, she was 
the daughter of the late Jeff and Susie Click 
Crum. Her husband, Elcana Conn, 
preced~ her in death in 1966. She was a 
member of the Arkansas Creek Church of 
Christ. 

Surviving are four sons, Wayne Conn, of 
Vinton, Ohio, Tom, Hatler and Lonnie 
Coon, all of Martin; three daughters, Mrs. 
Annie Sammons, of Pleasant Lake, Mich., 
Mrs. Nollie Sammons and Mrs. Lou Conn, 
both of Martin; two brothers, Oscar and 
Tom Conn, both of Martin; one sister, Mrs. 
Fannie Robinson, of Martin; 39 grand­
children and 35 great-grandchildren. 

Funeral services were conducted Tues­
day at 11 a.m. at the home of her son, Tom 
Conn, at Martin, with ministers of the 
Church of Christ officiating. Burial was 
made in the family cemetery at Arkansas 
Creek under the direction of Hall Brothers 
Funeral Home. 

Mrs. Joanna Davis 
Mrs. Joanna Davis, 80 years old, for­

merly of Garrett, and for the past 19 years a 
resident of Rensselaer, Ind., died March 8 
in Jasper County Hospital at Rensselaer. 
Surviving are her husband, Luther Davis; 
five daughters, Mrs. Charles Smith and 
Mrs. Beckham Allen of Rennselaer, Mrs. 
Martha Quigley, Kalamazo, Mich., Mrs. 
Bill Marshall, Chicago, Ill., Mrs. Curtis 
Hughes, Remington, Ind.; two sons, Kile 
Davis, Wheatfield, Ind., and Carter Davis, 
of Rensselaer; 37 grandchildren, 54 great­
grandchildren and six great-great­
grandchildren. 

The Rev. David Rowe officated at the 
services held from Jackson Funeral 
Chapel. Burial was in Highland cemetery, 
North Judson, Ind. 

CORRECTED OBITUARY 
Mrs. Nannie Boyd, 80, of Stanville died 

March 9 at Our Lady of the Way Hospital, 
Martin, after an extended illness. 

Born November 6, 1892 at Banner, she 
was the daughter of the late Will and June 
Boyd Conn. Surviving are her husband, 
Ernest Boyd, of Stanville, two daughters, 
Mrs. George Conn, Stanville and l\1rs. 
Willard Ratliff, Betsy Layne; seven 
brothers, Hie Conn. Dana, Dewey Conn, 
Martin, John B., Noah, Beverley, and 
Vertle Conn, all of Martin, and Martin 
Conn, Ocoee, Florida, four grandchildren 
and eight great-grandchildren. 

Funeral services were conducted at the 
New Salem Regular Baptist Church with 
ministers of Regular Baptist Church of­
ficiating. Burial was made in Davidson 
Memorial Gardens at lvel, under the 
direction of Hall Brothers Funeral Home. 
Pallbearers were Harry Gray, Banner 
Conn, Hoover Akers, Fred Conn, Ernest 
Dingus, Oscar and Jerry Van Ratliff. 
Willie Conn and Tommy Boyd. 

SURVIVORS OF MRS. JARRELL 
Survivors of Mrs. Millie M. Jarrell. in­

correctly reported last week, are: 
Her husband, Epp Jarrell, of Dana; four 

sons, Joe Jarrell, Dana, Samuel Jarrell, of 
Allen, Carl Lee Jarrell, Ord, Neb .. and 
James Manford Jarrell, Ypsilanti, Mich.; 
four daughters, Mrs. Lillie Baker, Ports­
mouth, 0., Mrs. Emmel Grace Wallen, 
Prestonsburg. Mrs. Ruby Scutchfield, 
Yp;ilanti, Mich., and Mrs. Della Curtis, of 
New Mexico; two sisters. Mrs. Willie 
Waddell. of Betsy Layne, and Mrs. Liddie 
Scalf, Lucasville, 0., 28 grandchildran and 
II great-grandchildren. 

Silas England 
Silas England, 85, of Rt. 3, Warsaw, Ind., 

formerly of Floyd county, died of a stroke 
at 2:55 p.m. March 11 at Parkview 
Hospital, Fort Wayne. He has been in 
failing health the past six years. 

A native of the Middle Creek section of 
this county he was born March 7, 1888 to 
William and Elizabeth Holbrooke England. 
In 1908 he was married to the former 
Cynthia Hale, who preceded him in death in 
1955. 

Mr. England had resided on a farm near 
Warsaw the past 33 years. 

Survivors include two sons, Ireland 
England, Charlotte, Mich., and William 
England, Homer, Mich.; four daughters, 
Mrs. Alfred Prater, Mrs. Ford Manuel, 
Mrs. Grover Allen, all of of Rt. 3, Warsaw, 
and Mrs. Alger Jackson, Rt. 2, Akron; 51 
grandchildren, 83 great-grandchildren and 
two great-great-grandchildren; four 
sisters, Mrs. Hatcher Allen, Silver Lake, 
Ind., Mrs. John Slone, Salye'rsville, Mrs. 
Clora Miller, Prestonsburg, and Mrs. Vicie 
Hopkins, Warsaw. 

Funeral services were conducted at Rose 
Hill United Baptist Church with Charles 
Savage and Doug Ward officiating. Burial 
was in Rose Hill cemetery. 

Mrs. Mazie M. Castle 
Mrs. Mazie Marie Castle, 73, of 1320 

Fontaine Road, Lexington, formerly of 
Auxier, died last Wednesday morning at 
Central Baptist Hospital, Lexington, after 
an illness of several months. 

Widow of Charles Martin Castle, she had 
resided in Lexington the last 15 years. She 
was a daughter of the late George Thomas 
and Mary Conley Burchett and was a native 
of this county. 

Survivors include a daughter, Miss 
Jewell Castle, of Lexington, a son, Staff 
Sgt. Robert Castle, Ft. Meade, Md., and one 
brother, William Lee Burchett, of Auxier. 

Funeral rites were conducted Friday at 
11 a.m. by the Rev. Thomas Nix, and burial 
was made in Lexington cemetery, under 
direction of the Elliston-Stanley Funeral 
Home, Williamstown, Ky. 

Mrs. Catherine W. Patton 
Mrs. Catherine Webb Patton, 88, of 

Langley, died Thursday at the Mountain 
Manor Nursing Home here after an ex­
tended illness. 

Born November 22, 1884 at Langley, she 
was the daughter of the late J. W. and 
Emma May Webb. Her husband, J. B. Pat­
ton, preceded her in death in 1924. 

Surviving are one son, Charlie Patton, of 
Langley; one daughter, Mrs. Beatrice 
Arnett. of Langley; one brother, Charlie B. 
Webb, of Hutchinson, Kansas; one sister, 
Mrs. Annie Risner, of MacArthur, 0.; five 
grandchildren and 13 great-grandchildren. 

Funeral services were conducted Sunday 
at 2 p.m. at the Maytown United Baptist 
Church with the Rev. Johnny Huffman 
officiating. Burial was made in the May 
cemetery at Langley under the direction of 
Hall Brothers Funeral Home. 

Active pallbearers were Charles David 
Patton, Jesse Sammons, Don Martin, 
Eugene Sparks, Ray Allen and James 
Webb. 

Honorary pallbearers were Buddy 
Robinson, T . C. May, Ed Stewart, George 
A. Patton. Buck Patton, Jimmy Patton, 
Lucian Barnett. 

Governor Wendell Ford has received the 
University of Louisville's highest award, 
the first Governor of the Commonwealth to 
be so honored. The University presented 
the Governor its Minerva Award for civic, 
adademic, or professional achievement. 
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Martin County 
Draft Records 

' 
Brought Here 

The Martin county Draft Board's records 
have been moved to the Selective Service 
area office in the Post Office Building, 
Prestonsburg. 

The pre-announced target date of June 
30, 1973, for an all-volunteer armed forces 
will ultimately reduce the number of 
"draft" locations in the state from 120 to 
fewer than 21 area offices, according to Col. 
Taylor L. Davidson, Kentucky state 
director. 

The State Director said, "Under the area 
concept, a local board with uncompensated 
members will continue to function in each 
county. Martin county 'Draft Board' 
members' duties will remain the same, 
mostly that of classifying registrants. 
Voluntary registrars will be appointed and 
their names with locations where 
registration in Inez can be accomplished 
will be posted in government buildings and 
schools." 

Normally, registration can be ac­
complished within the home county, 
although the law does provide that a young 
man may register away from his home for 
convenience. He must register at the age of 
18 (any time during the period of 30 days 
before or after his 18th birthday). Failure 
to register can result in prosecution in 
federal court. Penalities of fine and im­
prisonment are provided for those con­
victed. 

Col Davidson said that, even with the 
closing of the Inez office, everything will go 
on as in the past. Any Martin county draft 
registrant between the ages of 18 and 26 
desiring specific information from his file 
must obtain it from the area office in 
Prestonsburg. The office is open Monday 
through Friday, 8:00 a.m. through 4:30 
p.m. 

According to the state director, any 
registrant can obtain general information 
by calling toll free 800-372-2963. 

"In the phasing down of the 'draft' to a 
projected standby, we are grateful that 
Thomas J. Hardin, Jr., chairman, Harrison 
H. Preece, Clay Wells, Johnny Williamson 
and Dan Copely have consented to continue 
as board members. Their 34 years of 
cumulative Selective Service experience 
will be helpful at a time that the system 
cannot afford to maintain an office in their 
county," Colonel Davidson said. 

Leo A. Marcum is the adviser to 
registrants and in this capacity he, too, can 
be helpful to the yotmg men of Martin 
county, Col. Davidson added. 

Poisoning Threat 
Seen In Mushrooms 

A notice received by the Floyd County 
Health Department from Irving Bell, 
assistant director, State Division of En­
vironmental Services, alerted the depart­
ment to the danger of canned mushrooms 
containing botulism which may be in area 
food stores and restaurants. 

The Federal Food and Drug Ad­
ministration recently confirmed th 
presence of clostridium botulinum, a 
deadly type of food poisoning, in Fred's 
fresh-grown sliced or whole mushrooms in 
four-ounce cans, and a recall has been 
ordered on all canned mushroom products 
on the market which were packed at the 
Fred Mushroom Products Company, of 
South Lebanon, Ohio. 

Labels involved in the recall are Fame, 
Sentry, Deerwood, Dipaolo, Fred's, 
Niehauf's and Naaf's. The following are 
either'imported or purchased by Fred from 
other manufacturers and are not subject to 
recall: Fred's, whole mushrooms, 4 and 8 
oz., button mushrooms, 2, 4, and 8 oz., and 
sliced whole mushrooms in glass, 21h­
ounce; Fame, button mushrooms, 4-oz., 
and Deerwood, button mushrooms, 4-
ounce. 

The recall does not include frozen or 
fresh mushrooms, mushrooms in glass jars 
or imported mushrooms. 

NEW EVALUATION PROGRAM 
The Barren County Board of Education 

has approved a "management by ob­
jectives" program that will include per­
sonnel on the administrative level as well 
as the classroom teacher. 

State Health Dept. 
Gives Preventable 
Disease Statistics 

Kentucky's death rates from preventable 
diseases, such as tuberculosis, decreased 
significantly-nearly 100 per cent-from 
1911-1971. 

That's what the 1971 Kentucky Vital 
Statistics report shows. And Bill Mackey, 
director of the State Department of 

.Health's Division of Research, Planning 
'and Statistics, says that's a good sign. "It's 
an indication that our methods of 

'preventing diseases with known causes are 
working," he says. 

Unfortunately, rates of death from 
diseases such as cancer, for which medical 
authorities have not found methods of 
prevention, have risen consistently within 
the same 60-year period. 

"We know now that about one-fourth of 
the deaths from cancer could be prevented 
by early detection and treatment," says C. 
Hernandez, M. D., Deputy Commissioner of 
Medical Programs. Cervical cancer 
deaths, for example, are nearly 100 per cent 
preventable if the disease is found and 
treated early. It is for that reason that 
women now are being offered cervical 
cancer screening-Pap smear tests­
through most of the local health depart­
ments in Kentucky, he says. 

The so-year health figures are presented 
in a special "health picture" in the most 
recent edition of the vital statistics report 
prepared by the State Department of 
Health's Offices of Biostatistics and Vital 
Statistics. Such reports have been 
published annually since 1911 as the state's 
permanent public record of selected in­
formation on deaths, births, stillbriths, 
marriages, divorces and cases of repor­
table diseases occurring in Kentucky or to 
Kentucky residents. Because time is 
needed to weed out duplicate certificates as 
well as for publication production, the 
report is often distributed a little more than 
one year after the date it carries. 
Provisional vital statistics, showing only 
trends for 1972, will be available in June. 

The 1971 report also shows: 
l. Live birth rate and death rate in 

Kentucky for 1971 were the same as in 
197Q--18.7 live births per 1,000 population 
and 10.3 deaths per 1,000 respectively. The 
infant death rate (death from birth to one 
year of age) in Kentucky was 18.9 per 1,000 
live births in 1971 and 18.7 in 1972. "This is 
the lowest infant death rate among all the 
southeastern states," says Jorge Deju, M. 
D., director of the Division of Maternal and 
Child Health. 

2. Heart disease, the leading killer in the 
state and the nation, accounted for nearly 
40 per cent of all Kentuckians' deaths in 
1971. Cancer ranks second, stroke third, 
accidents fourth, influenza and pneumonia 
fifth. 

3. Suicide, which entered Kentucky's top 
10 killer list in loth place in 1970, exchanged 
ranks with emphysema, which had been 
ninth, in 1971. 

4. Seventeen maternal deaths were 
recorded in 1970, 16 in 1971. 

5. Infant deaths decreased from 19.6 to 
18.9 per 1,000 live births. 

6. Stillbirths increased slightly both in • 
number and rate, from 791 in 1970 to 816 in 
1971, an increase of .2 per 1,000 total births. 
<A stillbirth is any product of conception 
which shows no sign of life after delivery. 
Current Kentucky State Board of Health 
regulations require the registration of an 
stillbirths of 20 or more weeks gestation.) 

7. Deaths from venereal disease num­
bered only five in 1971, but reported cases 
of both syphilis and gonorrhea soared. 
Syphilis-from 953 reported cases in 1970 to 
1,203 in 1971. Gonorrhea--4,660 reported 
cases in 1970, 6,767 in 1971. 

8. Kentucky marriages numbered 35,984 
in 1971, divorces 11,141. 

COURT UPHOLDS DRESS CODE 
The Fleming County Board of 

Education's dress and grooming code has 
been upheld in a U. S. District Court. The 
judge dismissed the action brought by•a 
youth and his parents against the board 
which had suspended him from school 
because he refused to shave. The boy had 
contended his constitutional rights were 
abridged and that he had the right to 
continue to wear a beard irrespective of the 
provisions of the dress code. 

---- -----
:\1(' DOW ELL 
HO~I'IT.\L \OTES 

Patients Discharged 
(March 12 through March 18) 

Grover D. Rollins, McDowell; Jennifer 
Lee Hall, Beaver; Phillip Newsome, Mc­
Dowell; Anna R. Hall, Hi Hat; Sally 
Mullins, Drift; Sam Crawford, Hi Hat; 
Sandra Hall, Dry Creek; William Mack 
Rollins, Wheelwright; Dewey Gibson, 
Raven; Dave Hall, Bevinsville; Edna 
Johnson, Weeksbury; Stella McCown, 
Martin; Katherine P. Haley, Wheelwright; 
Leonard Sexton, Garrett; Darrell 
Shepherd, Grethel; Teresa Shelton, Drift; 
Deborah A. Bentley, Hite; Earnest Clark, 
David; Thelma Adams, Beaver; Dora 
Samons, Weeksbury; Tammy Hall, Halo; 
Johnie Moore, McDowell; Rebecca Hen­
derson, Melvin; Bobbie S. Slone, Pippa 
Passes; Robert D. Little, McDowell. 

BIRTHS 
A son born to Mr. and Mrs. Blaine Paige, 

of East McDowell, March 13; a daughter 
born to Mr. and Mrs. Milford Case, of Drift, 
March 18. 

In early 1972 only 6,000 of the nation's 
400,000 municipal police officers were 
women. Only a third of the 1,330 law en­
forcement agencies surveyed by the In­
ternational Association of Chiefs of Police 
in 1968 had any full-time sworn women 
officers. 

WINNER OF SPELLING BEE. Clara Jean 
Ousley, 12-year-old daughter of 1\lr. and 
Mrs. Jason Ousley, of Manton, will 
represent the Martin elementary school at 
the Floyd county spelling bee in April. 

:\IAGOFFIN MAN DIES 
Salyersville-Price l:Jolbrook, 70, of 

Salyersville, former teacher and truant 
officer in Magoffin county, died recently in 
Central Baptist Hospital, Lexington. He 
was a son of l\1s. Emily Patrick Holbrook of 
Salyersville and the late B. F. Holbrook. 

A 7,500 acre tract of land at 
Disneyland, Florida. has been set aside for 
a permanent wildlife refuge. 

at ART'S AUTO 
1971 TOYOTA 

CORONA 4-DOOR 
1972 TOYOTA 

COROLLA 2-DOOR 
4-speed transmission, very 
low mileage. 

4-speed transmission, new 
tires. 

1968 MUSTANG 
2-DOOR HARDTOP 

289-cu. in. engine, 4-speed 
transmission. 

1970 TOYOTA 
MARK II 4-DOOR 

One owner. 

1971 VOLKSWAGEN 
SUPER BEETLE 

Real nice. See this gas saver. 

1968 OPEL 
STATION WAGON 

4-cylinder engine. 

1967 MERCURY 
COUGAR COUPE 
Automatic transmission. 

1968 FORD 
Y2-TON PICKUP 

New tires. 

1967 CHEVROLET 
Y2-TON PICKUP 

Wideside, long wheelbase. 

1970 TOYOTA 
Y2-TON PICKUP 

New tires. 

ART'S AUTO SALES 
Your Authorized GMC-Toyota Dealer. 

PHONE 886-3861 PRESTONSBURG 

' 

Send a Check 
not yourself. 

• • • 

A personal checking account at The Bank Josephine, the most 
convenient way to pay your bills. You always have a record of 
your purchases and a positive receipt that the bill was paid. 
And, if you have a Checking Plus Checking Account you can 
write your own loan, whenever and wherever you need one. 
Your Bank Josephine Checking Plus Check, written for more 
than the amount in your account, automatically activates your 
pre-approved loan. Just stop by the Bank Josephine and tell one 
of the INTERESTED Bankers you wish to open a Checking Plus 
Checking Account. 

I 
'1-iember F.D.I.C 

I, 
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Machine Wash able 

Raincoats 

Juniors, Misses 
And Ha If Sizes 

$16.99 
TO 

$20.00 
Come, see our collection of 

. Raincoats •...• machine 
washable and dryable and 
treated with Zepel for 
water and stain 
repellency. Pant coat 
lengths, Ba I ma caans 
belted and boy coat styles. 
All of springs beautiful 
pastel colors to choose 
from. Size~ s,t, to 11/12, 
8 to 20 and 141f2 to 24112. 
You get Top Value 
Stamps, too. 

___________ TH_E FLOYD COUNTY TIMES SECTION ONE. PAGE FlVE 
----~·-------

COMPLETELY NEW INVENTORY OF SPRING AND SUMMER MERCHANDISE-BETTER SELECTIONS-LARGER VARIETY. 

INFANTS' 

AND 

CHILDREN'S 

WEAR 

by 

Health-Tex 

And 

H. H. Cutler 

Come and see the most 
complete line of infants' 
and tots' clothing that 
we've ever had in our 
storE'. You'll find 
everything from diapers 
by Curity to dresses by 
Kate Greenaway. 

Also see the nice selection 
of Spring Coats for girls 
and boys. Do your spring 
shopping for that little one 
at Cox's. 

Men's 
100 percent Polyester 

and 
Polyester Blends 

Suits 
and 

Sport 

Coats 

$29.90 
To 

$90.00 

MAKE-PAPPY-HAPPY 

A man likes his comforts. 
Soothe his spirit with one 
of our luxuriously tailored 
suits or sport coats. He'll 
just love the new model 
from Hardwick that 
features two pairs of 
slacks. At a price he'd 
newr believe possible. 

ACCESSORIES 
COSTUME 
JEWELRY 

59¢ to $2.00 

Everything 
you need 
to put the 
finishing touches 
to any outfit. 

HANDBAGS 
$499 to $8 

Choose yours from 
a host of colors 
and styles. 

Rings 'n things, swingy scarfs and handbags, 

SCARVES 
$100To $250 

belts ... you know, those light liHie touches of color and charm. Squares, sashes 
oblongs. Lots of 

Th · b d 5 . pretty patterns and ey put ram ows aroun every, ummer costume. colors. 

... delightful 
dresses 

ATA 
PRICE 

YOU CAN 
AFFORD 

Juniors, 
Misses 

and 
Half 
Sizes 

Puritans 
"Forever 
Young" 

"Barnsvi lie" 

Kay 
Windsor 

Lady 
Windsor 

Perfect Timing! Dresses for Easter that 
have delightfully pretty ideas· for Spring, 
too. Take your pick from our variety of 

. dresses tha .. lead the way to fashion with a· 
sprinkling of flowers, fluid pleats, a fling of 
a scarf .... Just a few of the delights that 

·add da.sh to your wardrobe right now ... on 
into summer. 
I 

Men's 

GOLF JACKETS 
$6.99 To $10.99 

Here's the jacket that goes with 
you anywhere, anytime. A very 
stylish zip-front closure with slash 
pockets. Several styles of Dacron 
and cotton to choose from. 

Sizes S-M-L-XL 

JEANS 
by 

oRbTt 
6.99 

To 

10.00 
Sizes 

S/6 

To 
15/16 

Straight legs, elephant legs, or 
Palazzo Pants .. . Whichever you 
prefer, you'll find it at Cox's. Lots 
of colors to pick from, too. 

Philmaid non~cling 

Slips 3.50 
and 

Half 
Slips 
White 

To 

4.50 

Non-cling nylon tricot slips won't ride 
up or create static. Shadow panel 
front. Slips 32·36 short , 32-44 
average. Half sl ips S,M,L short and 

' overage. 

MATCHING TOWEL SETS 

Floral 
Pattern 

BATH 99~ HAND 59n WASH 
TOWEL '¥ TOWEL '¥CLOTH 

One 
Size 
Fits 
All 

LADIES' 

SWEATER CAPES 

29<e-

$10.00 TO $14.99 
The perfect coverup for cool nights is an orion 
acrylic cape done in the Winter weave. A button­
front sweatery cape ...• hand washable .. .. 
Fringed bottom. Long enough to cover all tunics. 
.. Ideal for pantsuits. Colors- White, Off-White, 
lt. blue and pink. 

And, Remember, You 

Get Top Value 

Stan1ps At Cox's 



FOR RENT-Furnished or unfurnished 
apartments at Briarwood. Phone 886-8697. 

12-13-tf. 

FOR RENT-Five-room house with bath. 
Newly decorated, wall-to-wall carpet. 
Convenient in one block of Post office. 63 
North Arnold ·Ave., Prestonsburg. 

2-28-tf. 

FOR SALE-Sand, washed and screened, 
wet, dry or sacked. Ideal for mine use or 
buildings. SANDS OF ROCKCASTLE 
CREEK, Inez, Kentucky, phone 298-3828, 
day, 298-3314, night. 11-27-tf. 

WATCH REPAIR-If you want the best job, 
br ing watch repairs and jewelry repairs to 
WRIGHT BROS. JEWELERS. 

FOR SALE-Office Machines, office sup­
plies, office furniture (new and used). 
Service on all makes of office machines. 
Phone or write BERT BIBEE, HOME 
OFFICE SUPPLY CO., phone 336-5711, 
Hazard, Ky. 

FOR SALE-Five-room brick home; two 
bedrooms, living room, family room, 
built-in kitchen, H2 baths, wall-to-wall 
carpeting. WENDELL WELLS, Gable­
Roberts Addition, Phone 886-2426. 3-14-zt. 

FOR SALE-Two new, brick, veneer houses 
in Goble-Roberts Addition, P.restonsburg. 
These houses are nearing completion. For 
more information, call Town and Country 
Real Estate, Paintsville, Ky. 789-4895 or 
789-5493. 9-20-tf. 

LOSE WEIGHT safely and fast with X-11 
Diet Plan $3.00. REDUCE excess fluids 
with X-Pel $3.00. Money Back Guarantee 
at Fountain Korner Drug. l-3-12t. 

HOUSE FOR SALE-Owner moving to 
another state, anxious to sell house im­
mediately! Large kitchen and living 
room, three-bedroom, bath, large garage 
with ample storage. Located on Mountain 
Parkwav, 41r2 miles from town. Excellent 
conditio~. QUENTIN LOCKWOOD, 886-
8389. t -3-tf. 

FOR RENT- Trailer, two bedrooms, 
private lot. Call Carlos E. Neeley after 
3:30 p.m., 886-3565. 2-14-tf. 

WANTED- Billing-inventory clerk, in 21-
year age range; five-day week, some 
outside work. SANDY VALLEY EX­
PLOSIVES, Allen, Ky., Phone 874-2837. 3-
14-2t. 

FOUND-Tan-and-white spaniel. Owner, 

i 

call886-2195. 3-14-tf. 

CLYDE DeROSSEn 
PAINTING • DECORATING 

Phone 874-2673 

CONCRnE, MASONRY 
Patios and Sidewalks 

See 

JOE POE 
Wesl l'resiOuburg, 1\y. 

886-3961 after 6 p.m.!. 
10-18-tf. 

MARBLE AND STONE 
SUPPLIES 

e Marble Ludacape ChJ)II 
• Marble Wbulow sm. 
e Llmestoae Wllldow Sllla 
e Marble, Crab Orchard aDd 

UmeatoDe Veaeerfq 
e Vermoat Slate 

Sandy Valley Monument 
aDd Bllflcltq S&oae Co., IDe. 

Pboae174-ZZ73-AUea, Ky. 1-~2t 

UPHOLSTERING 
Have that couch or chair 

reapbolatered. Materials of Scotch-• 
1arded StaiD Repeller, Nylons, 
Coe&ou, US Royal Naugbabyde, 

•• .. yean Experience. 

LEONARD STEPHENSON 

Phone 285-3325 n -11-tf. 

Colla'ete Contractor 
8wiDuDbl& Pools, Driveways, Patios. 

AWN INGS, PATIO A ND 
CAR PET COVERS 

STORM DOORS 
AN D W INDOWS 

Free Estimates 

SHIRLEY OUSLEY 
Phone ~Z8116, Preatouburg 

C. V. ROOP 
Tree Trimming; Also, 
Painting, Gutterwork, Re­
p lacing Broken Windows, 
Roofing and Shingle Work. 

PHON E 886-6496 12-6-tf. 

Water Well 
Drilling 

Most wells drilled In half a 
day by Rotary Machine. 

Kinzer Dn11ing Co. 
1 Alle.a, Ky. -· . '* 

• • -rPh- on_e_8-74--2-2-58_,1 

DAVE'S SEPTIC TANK SERVICE. Phone 
886-3904, Prestonsburg. 12-13-tf. 

ALTERING - Phone Ethel Hale, 886-6102. 2-
7-8t. 

FOR SALE-1972 Mobile home, two­
bedrooms. Take over payments . Phone 
DALLAS JUSTICE, 886-6810. 2-21-tf. 

FOR RENT-Four-room unfurnished 
apartment. Couple preferred . Call 
JEANNETTE FITZPATRICK 886-2557. 2-
21-lf. 

FOR REi·.!T-Two-bedroom furnished house 
on Branham Street. Couples only. Call886-
6293. 1-17-tf. 

FOR SALE- Carpet cleaners and sham­
pooers. Kirby's Classic, Inc., phone 874-
9143, Allen. 1-17-tf. 

CARPENTERS NEEDED- No experience 
necessary. For application, write E-Z 
WAY ENTERPRISES, P . 0 . Box 41279, 
Indianapolis, Indiana 46241. 3-14-4t. 

CONN'·SPAINTINGANDDRYWALL. Free 
estimates . l>hone 478-5227. 10-11-tf. 

PAINTING AND TILING-Gene Slone, 
phone 886-2414, Prestonsburg. 3-16-tf. 

MODERN STEAM WAY. Expert carpet and 
upholstery cleaning. Phone 285-3509. 

1-3-tf. 

VACUUM CLEANERS SALES AND 
SERVICE. New and used, all makes and 
models. Kirby's Classic, Inc., phone 874-
9143, Allen. 1-17-tf. 

CUSTOM DRAPERIES-Exclusive AERO 
Drapery dealer for this area. Save on 
Custom Draperies. Our decorator will 
bring Fabric to you home for your selec­
tion-Free estimate. Call NOW for ap­
pointment. 789-8533 or 789-1752. Paintsville 
Fabric & Sewing Center. ll-1-tf. 

SEPTIC TANK SERVICE. For pumping of 
your septic tank, call TACKETT'S 
SEPTIC TANK SERVICE, 789-1104, 
Paintsville. 4-5-tf. 

FOR SALE-Tract of land, approx. 10 
acres; one tract, approx. 20 acres. On 
Jane Brown Branch, near Plantation 
Motel. TuWN & COUNTRY REAL 
ESTATE, Phone 789-4895; C. H. Stam­
baugh, broker. 12-4-tf 

FOR SALE- House recently remodeled. 
Three-bedroom, fully carpeted, full-size 
basement. See or call CORKEY PATTON, 
285-3350, Maytown. 1-13-8t. 

FOR RENT- Modern apartment. First WANTED-Old pocket watches in good 
avenue, Prestonsburg. Phone 886-2132. 2-6- condition. JIM HOWARD, 886-6231, or 
tf. evenings 886-6910. 3-7-5t. 

FOR LEASE- New store building suitable 
for large business. Plenty parking space. 
Call 285-3289, Martin, Ky., Mrs. E . C. 
Slade. 3-14-2t. 

FOR LEASE-One- and two-bedroom 
apartments. Air-conditioned, electric 
heat, wall-to-wall carpet. Beautifully 
furnished kitchens. Call 285-3289, Mrs. E. 
C. Slade, Martin, Ky. 3-14-2t. 

WANTED TO BUY- 1956 Oldsmobile for 
parts. Call Richard Henson, 886-6683 after 
4p.m. 3-21-3t. 

SAM HALL SEPTIC TANK SERVICE, 
East McDowell, Ky., Phone 377-6561. 
Compare our prices. 3-21-4t. 

HELP WANTED- Two persons to assist in 
sales and service. Earning opportunity 
more than $150 per week. Company 
benefits, life insurance, stock purchase 
plan, etc . Call Richmond, Ky., area code 
606-623-6966, between 8:30a.m. and 9:30 
a .m., only . We are an equal opportunity 
employer. lt . 

FOR SALE- Two slightly used portable 
typewriters. (Underwood and Royal) 
Call JOAN STUMBO FLANERY, 285-
3400. 3-21-2t-pd. 

FOR SALE-40-acre farm at East Point. 
Prices to sell. Phone 886-6114. It-pd. 

FOR SALE- 1969 Chevrolet Biscayne. 
Automatic transmission , 6-cylinder 
engine, AM-FM radio, tape player. Low 
mileage. $1,050. RON REYNOLDS, phone 
285-3025 or 285-3111, Martin. lt. 

PIANO- Take over $6.00 a week payments 
on small piano. I will pay for the delivery. 
Write CHRIS AUBREY, P. 0. Box 7227, 
Lexington, Ky. lt. 

HELP WANTED- Experienced cooks, 
waitresses, dishwashers. TONY'S T. C. 
T. TRUCK STOP, Prestonsburg. lt. 

FOR RENT- Two-bedroom mobile home. 
Call MILLARD HUGHES, 886-2566. 3-21-
tf. 

FOR SALE- Mobile home. 1969, 12 x 60ft. , 
2-bedroom, carpet, central air con­
ditioning, washer and dryer, garbage 
disposal. Phone Jerry Colvin, 886-2100. 3-
21-zt. 

FOR SALE- 22 ft. homemade houseboat 
with 35 h p. Evinrude motor. Carpet, tape 
player, and sleeps four. For a good buy 
Call Phillip Whitten, 886-8897, or 874-2881. 

3-21-2t. 

BUFFET- All you can eat for $1.50, 
Monday through Friday, 11 a.m. to 2 
p.m. , Sunday buffet, 11 a.m. to 6 p.m . for 
$2. TONY 'S TCT TRUCK STOP, 
Prestonsburg. 3-21-4t. 

- . 

AVON 
TO BUY OR SELI.; AVON. CaD ...... 

886-2838 
! 

LENNOX 
CINTRAL HEATING 

and AIR-CONDITIONING 
For free estimates, or service 

Elliott Glass & Electric 
Pres&oDSburg, Ky. tf. 

RANDALL HYDEN 
Paintlag Contractor 

Dry-Walling 
Phone 881-3102 

Pres&ouburg, Ky. 
Call between 5 and 7 p.m. 

NEED REPAIR WORK? 
Refrlgeration- Wirfq- Plumbln& 

Call WILCE ROSE 
Phoae Day, 88f.8331: Night, 8111-3505 

Backho~ • • • Loader 
and Dozer Work 

Call 

GOBLE LUMBER CO. 
Phone 874-2461 

11-27-tf. 

HOUSE FOR RENT OR SALE- Three­
bedroom brick, at 36 Ford Drive, Lancer. 
Call Hindman, 785-3164. 3-7-tf. 

CITIZENS BAND RADIOs-In stock at all 
times, new Citizens Band Radios and 
accessories including Base and Mobile 
Antennas, Coaxial Cable, Connectors and 
Mast. Used Radios also for sale. Phone 
886-6663 after 5 p.m. on weekdays or 
anytime weekends. MASTERCHARGE 
accepted. 3-7-tf. 

FOR RENT- Three-bedroom home. Call 
ALBERT A.BURCHETT,886-3304. 3-14-tf. 

FOR SALE-Nice home, six rooms and 
bath, large basement, on approx. 2 acres 
land, in sight of new Highlands Regional 
Hospital, near Auxier. Sale to settle 
estate. James Centers, Allen, Ky., Phone 
87 4-2688. lt. 

FOR SALE- Black, female poodle. AKC 
registered . Also one female and one 
male pointer puppies. Rhonda 
Faine, Wheelwright, 452-2530. lt. 

FOR SALE-Air-conditioned mobile home 
and lot, or lot only, on Stratton Branch. 
RUBY THACKER, 886-6829, Box 442, 
Prestonsburg. 3-14-2t. 

TRAILER SPACES for rent. Call 886-2474 
or 886-2243. 3-21-4t-pd. 

SALE! SALE! - Cigarettes, $2 .62 ctn. 
Regular gasoline, 31.9 cents gallon. 
TONY'S TCT TRUCK STOP, Prestons­
burg. 3-21-4t. 

FOR SALE- 1967 Buick Special. New tires. 
Goood condition. BILL GILLILAND, 
phone 886-8551, Prestonsburg. lt. 

FOR SALE - Five-room house. Newly 
painted. Kitchen equipped with stove and 
refrigerator. Located behind Van Hoose 
Lumber at West Prestonsburg. ROY 
RICE, phone 886-3120 or 886-2550, West 
Prestonsburg. 3-21-4t. 

FOR SALE- Three-bedroom mobile home 
at Betsy Layne near street leading from 
Adkins Store on US 23, on corner lot 135ft. 
long, all city conveniences . Priced to sell. 
W. H. AMBURGY, 874-2305. 3-21-tf. 

FOR SALE- Six-room brick house at Goble 
Roberts Addition. Call WENDELL 
WELLS, 886-2426 or 886-8371. 3-21-2t. 

FOR RENT- One-bedroom , 3-room 
apartment, refrigerator and stove, 
forced air heat. $125.00. Water and gas 
furnished. Phone Clifford Wright, 886-
8721. 3-21-tf. 

FOR SALE- 1969 Volkswagon. Good 
condition. Call Lonzo Lafferty after 3:30 
p.m. 874-2563. 3-21-lt. 

FOR SALE- 30 acre land and timber land . 
Three-bedroom home . Wall -to-wall 
carpet, drilled well, gas heat, two fire 
places, a new birch kitchen, bath, washer 
and dryer ; also a business place open 
seven days a week as a general mer­
chandise store. Come and see if you're 
interested in a full-time job and a good 
home. Call 377-6487, MARY BELLE 
OSBORNE , East McDowell . 3-21-3t. 

REPOSSESSED SEWING MACHINES- 1. 
Singer Zig-Zag, Sold new for over $280.00. 
Buttonholes , monograms , has shift 
needle, etc. , guaranteed. Assume $7.00 
per month or pay balance of $67.30. 2. 
Dial and Sew, assume $5.00 per month or 
pay balance $36.75. This machine has 
twin needles buttonholes, monograms, 
etc. 3. Dial-A-Stitch, balance $42.25 or 
take over $6.00 per month . To see and try 
these machines locally without 
obligation , write CREDIT DEPT., 
DRAWER F F , BIG STONE GAP, Va. 
24219. 3-21-3t.-pd. 

THREE 1973 ZIG-ZAG SEWING 
MACHINES left in layaway. Beautiful 
pastel color, full size model. All built in to 
buttonhole , do stretch sewing and fancy 
stitching. Pay just $48.75 cash or terms 
available. Trade-ins accepted. Phone 886-
3187. Electro Hygiene Co. 1t. 

HOUSE FOR SALE 
Brick home, three-bedroom, 2111 · 

baths, large family room with 
working fireplace, large poolroorr., 
lots of closets and storage rooms, 
living room and dining room, built-in 
electric kitchen, central heat and 
air-conditioning. Seen by ap­
pointment. Phone 886-2942 or 886-

FOR SALE-1966 Buick. New tires, new 
battery, automatic, power steering and 
brakes . $750. EDWARD HOLMAN, 
Phone 285-3804. 3-14-2t. 

FOR SALE-Building lots on Abbott Road, 
two miles from Prestonsburg . 75 x 150ft., 
$3,500. Phone FRASURE-HILL SUB­
DIVISION, 886-6900 or 886-6278. 3-l4·tf. 

FOR SALE-Used gas-stove, $50.00. Call 
874-9189 after 5. 3-14-2t.-pd. 

FOR SALE-Corn. See Callie Stephens, 
Phone 349-3360, Salyersville, Ky. 3-14-3t.­
pd. 

WILL SELL OR TRADE-New brick 
home, seven rooms, two baths, near 
grade school, fronting 120 feet on 
Highland Avenue. Phone 886-825l after 5 
p.m. 3-6-3t-pd. 

FOR SALE- New 3-bedroom home, brick 
front, double carport. Phone 879-2794; 
after 5, 886-6366. McGUIRE-PORTER 
CONSTRUCTION CO. , Allen, Ky. 3-14-tf. 

FOR SALE- Approximately 12 acres on 
Bull Creek, mostly hillside ; 2 lots, 1 
drilled well, gas available. Phone 879-
2794; after 5, 886-6366 McGuire-Porter 
Construction Co., Allen, Ky. 3-14-tf. 

BIG SALE!-Sofa beds, bedroom suites, 
living room and dining room suites-your 
choice, $99. FRASURE FURNITURE 
CO., phone 886-6900, Prestonsburg. 3-14-
tf. 

FOR SALE-Three-y-ear-old concrete block 
and wood building ; 30 x 60 ft. , full-size 
apartment upstairs, 4 bedrooms, large 
living room, dining room. Kitchen 
combined, large family room. Located on 
US 23, two miles north of Allen. $40,000. 
JAMES CENTERS, 874-2688. 3-14-tf. 

FOR SALE-150 fruit trees. Dig your own. 
$15 each, or two for $25. See HAMLET 
HOWARD, Hippo, Ky., Phone358-4803. 3-
14-2t. 

AUTO AND MECHANICAL REPAIRS at 
your home! Twenty-four-hour service. 
Call Len, 377-2258. 3-14-3t. 

Reduce excess fluids with Fluidex $1.69-­
Lose weight with Dex-A-Diet 98 cents at 
Martin Drugs. 3-14-3t-pd. 

FOR SALE- 14 ft. fiberglass boat, trailer 
and 25 h. p. motor. JESSE LAFERTY, 
Martin, Ky., Phone 285-3022. 3-14-tf. 

FOR SALE- Two houses, each 5 rooms 
with bath. Approx. 21,2 acres good garden 
land. JESSE LAFERTY, Martin, Ky., 
Phone 285-3022. 3-14-tf. 

RUBY'S POODLE PARLOR- Phone 358-
4988, Garrett. Registered Fox Terrier stud 
service. 1-31-tf. 

HOUSE FOR SALE- Three-bedroom, 
family room, dining room, built-in kit­
chen, wall-to-wall carpet, two full baths, 
central heat. 886-6605. 3-7-2t-pd. 

FOR SALE- AKC-registered Dachshunds. 
WILLIAM R. HALL, Phone 886-6112. 2-28-
tf. 

FOR RENT-4,000-sq . ft . building suitable 
for storage. At Allen. Also, 3,000-sq. ft . 
business building. Formerly occupied by 
Conley Furniture Store, Allen. Call 874-
2793. 3-14-tf. 

FOR SALE- Large water tank, approx. 
3,000 gallons . ABEL JOHNSON, 
Wheelwright, 452-2317. 3-14-tf. 

FOR SALE- Air-conditioned home and lot, 
cr lot only, on Stratton Branch. RUBY 
THACKER, 886-6829, Box 442, Prettons­
burg. 3-14-2t. 

FOR SALE- Singer zig-zag sewing 
machine. Sews on buttons, makes but­
tonholes . Pay off balance. Nine 
payments, $7.50 each. No money down. 
Also, all makes repaired. Phone 886-2913 
after 5 p.m . 3-14-4t. 

FOR RENT OR SALE- Three-bedroom 
brick at 36 Ford Drive, Lancer. Call 
Hindman 785-3164. 3-7-tf. 

FOR SALE- New, soft ice cream machine. 
Phone 358-9696, Edward Bentley, 
Wayland. 3-21-2t. 

TWO ELECTROLUX VACUUM 
CLEANERS complete with attachments, 
cordwinder and paint spray. Used but in 
like new condition. Pay $34.45 cash or 
budget plan available. Phone 886-3187 . 
Electro Hygiene Co. lt. 

In 1911, Los Angeles became the first U. 
S. city to appoint women to its police force, 
hiring them to protect young girls and 
prevent or minimize social evils such as the 
sale of liquor to minors. 

Rea I Estate - - -

LICE NSEES 

How Big Is 
BIG MON EY? 

To some people it is making $1,000 a Month. 
To others $5,000 a Month, right in their own 
hometown. - We have both kinds. 

So it's Opportunity if you qualify for the 
STROUT Team. Not everybody does. But 
ask yourself if you are ready for yo<.~r real 
estate license to start bringing you Im­
portant Money. Ask too, do you really Like 
People? And do you have Common Sense? 

If yes, then ask for information on the 
"People-Business." It's mailed without 
obligation. Could be the start To Something 
Big - - - with the World's Largest. 

STROUT REALTY 
P. 0. Box 2757 

Springfield, Missouri 65803 
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CARTER 
FUNERAL HOt.i£ 

In your hour ,of need. turn with 
confidence to us - dignified, 
efficient, professional. 

·Floyd County's Oldest 
Established Funeral Home, 

Now Serving This Area 
For Two ~nerations. 

Prestonsburg, Ky. 

Confidence Is Our 
Most Important Asset. 

MEN AND WOMEN 
WANTED IMMEDIATELY 
FOR POULTRY PROCESSING 

Seven paid Holidays, free hospitalization, free Life insurance. 
New higher pay rate, start at $2.06 per hour. Plenty of overtime. 

Kralis Brothers Poultry Co. 
R. 1, Mentone, Ind. Phone 219-353-2415 

3-7-5t. 

Henry Block has 
17 reasons why you 
should come to us 

for income tax help. 
Reason 4. If the IRS should call you in for 
an audit, H & R Block will go with you, at 
no additional cost. Not as a legal 
representative . .. but we can answer all 
questions about how your tax return was 
prepared. 

[J{]IOO.BLOC• 
THE INCOME TAX PEOPLE 

HOURS : 9 a.m.-6 p.m., Weekdays; 9 a.m.-5 p.m., Saturdays. 
Phone 886-3685. No Appointment Necessary. Open Today. 

8B RICHMOND PLAZA • PRESTONSBURG 

* 

were more than a 
lot of used cars. 

(The dealer guarantees 100 percent to repair or replace the engme 
• . transmission . brake system . rear allele . front axle assemblies • 

electric:o1 system tor 30 days or 1000 miles, whichever comes first) 

1969 VOLKSWAGEN 2-
DOOR BUG. Radio and 
heater, red. 

1969 VOLKSWAGEN 
KARMANN GHIA CON· 
VERTIBLE. Radio, 
heater , red with black 
top. 

-· 

1970 TOYOTA MARK II 
4-DOOR . Automatic 
transmission, radio and 
heater, air-conditioned. 
One owner. Green. 

1968 MERCURY 
MONTEGO 4-DOOR 
MX. Automatic trans­
mission, radio and 
heater, factory air-con­
ditioned, Blue with vinyl 

1 !J71 VOLKSWAGEN 2-
DOOH BUG. Radio and 
h t>ater. green. One 
owner. 

1970 CH EV ROLET 

i l \ 'OLKSWAGEI\' 7-
P,\SSI-:~GER BUS. 
Hadio and heater, 
l{reen. Onf' owner. 

top. · 

1968 DATSUN PICKUP. 
Radio and heater. Red. 

1970 VOLKSWAGEN 
CONVERTIBLE. Black 
top, yellow bottom. four­
speed transmission , 
radio. This car is a one­
owner with low mileage. 

CAPRI CE 2- DOOR. 
IIAHDTOP . Light green 
with dark green vin,Yl 
top , pow er brakes , 
power steering, air-con­
ditioned, tilt steering. 
One owner , low 
mileage. 

1971 GREMLIN 2·DOOR 
SE DAN . &-cylinder 
engine, three-speed 
transmission, radio and 
heater, blue. 

t 971 F ORD •i!-TON 
PfCKUP . Long bed, V-8 
engine. One owner. 
Black. 
1970 TOYOTA MARK II 
4-DOOR. 4-speed trans­
mission. Oen owner. 

·a972 VOLKSWAGEN 2-
DOOR SUPER BUG. 
Radio and heater, tape 

• pla ye r. automatic 
transmission, air-con­
ditioned , white . One 
own e r . Fa c tory 
warranty. 

VANCE VOLKSWAGEN 
Let These Salesmen 

Help You: 
PALMER G. VANCE, 
BERTH. McFADD~ 
DARRELL HOWARD 

INCORPORATED 

~ 
Phone 816-3149 
Rt. 23, North 
Prestonsburg 



WEDNESDAY, MARCH 21, 1973 

80 Are Listed 
For Jury Duty 
At April Term 

Names of 80 prospective jurors have been 
draWn from the jury drtmi for service at the 
next criminal session of circuit court which 
will convene April 2. 

The list will provide both grand jury and 
petit jury panels. Names and addresses of 
those notified for jury service follow: 

Randy Blankenship, Betsy Layne; 
Robert Goble, Prestonsburg; Dingus 
Smith, Allen; Tiny Crum, Prestonsburg; 
Bryant DeRossett, Prestonsburg; Fannie 
Branham, Prestonsburg; Mrs. Jake 
Hamilton, Betsy Layne; Otis Wallen, Water 
Gap; Ray Calhoun, Cliff; Bertha Gibson, 
Langley; Walter Mann, Prestonsburg; 
Julius Mullins, Melvin; Frank Heinze, 
Prestonsburg; Bill Osborn, Prestonsburg; 
H. K. Howard, East Point; Estill Music, 
West Prestonsburg; Willard Campbell, 
Allen; Grover Johnson, Bevinsville; Mae 
Flannery, Martin; Marvin Calhoun, Water 
Gap; W. M. James, Ivel; Roy Ramey, 
Prestonsburg; Blake Meadows, Prestons­
burg; Milford Adkins, Garrett; Orville 
Turner, Garrett; Herbert Blair, Water 
Gap; James A. Scott, Garrett; Earl Moore, 
Cliff; R. H. James, Prestonsburg; Stacy 
Gray, Water Gap; Forest Newsome, 
Wheelwright; Hazel Bentley, Hite; Mrs. 
James W. McKinney, Prestonsburg; Paul 
Crider, Endicott; Hershel Conn, Dana; 
Ronnie Fraley, Wayland; Connie Conn, 
Dana; Mrs. W. I. Akers; Rolla Chaffin, 
Wheelwright; Joyce Dermont, Martin. 

Sam Calhoun, Prestonsburg; Sam 
Roberts, Harold; Junior Lawson, Harold; 
Pauline Salisbury, Martin; Charlie Jones, 
Melvin; Pearl Salisbury, Printer; John 
Conn, Tram; Roy Tackett, East McDowell; 
James Case, East McDowell ; Hattie Lucas, 
Garrett; A. V. Smith, Wheelwright; Odis 
Green, Garrett; Taulbie Sloan, Beaver; 
Taulbie Branham, Water Gap; John 
Wolford, Martin; Homer D. Neeley, 
Prestonsburg ; Dockie Prater, Hueysville; 
Bill M. DeRossett, Water Gap; Eva 
Stephens, Martin; Jane Hall, Grethel; Doty 
Perry, Auxier; Elder Conn, Betsy Layne; 
Ralph Mollette, Auxier; Andy Bolen, 
Martin; Ernest Norman, Grethel; Hi Click, 
Martin; Sam George, Cliff; Janet Whitten, 
Prestonsburg; Okley Robinson, Martin; 
Lee McCown, Melvin; Mrs . Dorothy 

} Johnson, Allen; Bill Honsbell, Jr., 
Wayland; Ellen Meadows, West 
Prestonsburg; Mollie Owens, Eastern; 
Hershell Huff, Drift; W. C. Wohlford, 
Martin; Frank H. Layne, Prestonsburg; 
John P . Pitts, West Prestonsburg; Mrs. Ike 
Woods, Emma; Mrs. Sterling Hamilton, 
Teaberry. 

SMALLEST IN 28 YEARS 
This year's student enrollment shows the 

smallest increase in 28 years, according to 
the Office of Education. At the elementary 
level, enrollment declined for the third 
straight year (by less than 1% percent), but 
high school registration is up by 2 percent 
and college enrollment by 6 percent. 

_ ........ " ~-£ .- ... .., .. . 

Homecoming Queen 
And Her Court 

Insurance Leader 

Delmber Elswick, of Prestonsburg, has 
been named Agent Of The Year - Individual 
Sales by the First Mutual Life Insurance 
Company, of Lexington. During 1972 Mr. 
Elswick led the company in individual sales 
both as an agent and a general agent. 

A native of Hi Hat and a high school 
student, he entered the insurance business 
in 1964 and has been a company sales 
leader each year since then. 

FRANKFORT, Ky.-Gov. Wendell Ford 
is spending half the week in his hometown 
of Owensboro, and his office said Monday 
he will conduct official and personal 
business there. 

The governor is scheduled to leave 
Greater Cincinnati Airport Wednesday 
afternoon for Washington for a Democratic 
National Committee meeting. 

THE FLOYD COUNTY TIMES 

Prestonsburg high school this year had its first basketball 
homecoming since 1970, and Miss Cathy Lynn Whitaker was 
crowned queen with the title, "Miss Blackcat, 1973." First runnerup 
was Miss Diane Burchett, and Miss Ann Hale was second runnerup. 
Shown in photo, from left, are the homecoming queen and members 
of her court with escorts: Billy Risner, Paula Crass, Harry Lee Bur­
chett, Anita Hale, Cathy Lynn Whitaker, Kippy McNally, Dennis 
Walker, Diane Burchett, Connie Halbert, Jimmy Blackburn, Jen­
nifer Cooley, Willie McGuire. 

Stewart M. Miller was named deputy 
commissioner of the Department of Public 
Safety, replacing Paul M. Smith. Com­
missioner Ron L. Johnson, who last week 
took over the department, made the an­
nouncement. Miller is a retired state police 

The Legislative Research Commission is 
seeking to delay implementation of 
regulations on ambulance services until 
July 1, 1974. The request for a six-month 
delay has been sent from the LRC to the 
Kentucky Health Facilities and Health 
Certificate of Need and Licensure Board. . captain. 

SPRING 

PERMANENT SPECIALS 
In Effect Thru April 11. 

$25.00 
PERMANENT 

$20.00 
PERMANENT 

$15.oo s1200 
PERMANENT - - -

ALSO, $10 PERMANENTS. 
CLOSE-OUT SPECIAL ON 

WIGS. ONLY A FEW LEFT ... 

VOGUE BEAUTY SHOP 
120 Graham Street 

Phone 886-2059, Prestonsburg 

SECTION ONE, PAGE SEVEN -------------
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Six persons from the Daviess county 
school system recently attended a 10-day 
seminar at the Nation Drug Abuse Training 
Center in Washington, D. C. and made 
recommendations to the local board. The 
group suggested a library facility for use in 
drug education ; a special team of in­
structors with training in connection with 
drug abuse ; and inclusion of teachers , 
school administrators and parents in a drug 
awareness program for the school district. 

Elect 

JAMES R. SLONE 
for 

SHERIFF 
May Democratic Primary 

It-pd. 

. -
SPRINGTIME BARGAINS ARE 

BLOOMING AT BOB'S USED CARS 
See Bob DeRossett for the. Best in Clean Used Cars. 

1971 BUICK SkYLARk 
2-DOOR HARDTOP 

All power, air-conditioned, 
gold with black vinyl top. 

1969 BUICK WILDCAT 
2-DOOR HARDTOP 

All power, air-conditioned, 
brown with beige top. 

1972 BUICK SKYLARK 
2-DOOR HARDTOP 

All power, air-conditioned. 
Orange. 

1973 CHEVROLET MALIBU 
2-DOOR HARDTOP 

Air-conditioned, all power, 
gold with white top. 

1969 CHEVROLET MALIBU 
2-DOOR HARDTOP 

V-8 engine, automatic trans­
mission, all power, yellow. 

1971 OLDSMOBILE CUTLASS 
2-DOOR HARDTOP 

I 
V-8 engine, all power, green 
with green vinyl top. 

1971 FORD LTD 
2-DOOR HARDTOP 

All power, air-conditioned, 
blue mist with blue vinyl top. 

1972 FORD PINTO 
2-DOOR SEDANS 

Several to choose from . Take 
your pick-you can't lose. 

.1971 VOLKSWAGEN 
VAN 

All extras, local, one owner. 
Ideal for church bus. 

1970 LINCOLN CONTINENTAL 
4-DOOR SEDAN 

All power, air-conditioned, 
white with blue vinyl top. One 
owner. 

BOB'S USED ·cARS 
See ROBERT DeROSSETT or DONALD DeROSSETT. 

PHONE 886-8882 PRESTONSBURG 

Happy Birthday, Dollie R. T erryl 

Mom, I want the world to know that I Love You. 

JOY TERRY MESSER 
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Red Cross Month, 1973 
By the President of the United States of America 

A Proclamation 
Each year, in the spirit of good neighborliness, millions of Americans 

pool their resources and efforts under the Red Cross banner to help 
others in distress or need. 

The services of the Red Cross assist many kinds of people. They help 
provide lifesaving blood for the ill and injured; help restore the shattered 
lives of disaster victims; help our servicemen, veterans, and their families 
in periods of emergency; and help save lives and lessen suffering through 
training in first aid, water safety, and simple nursing skills. 

While these could be called the basic purposes of the Red Cross, the · 
organization also seeks out new areas of concern in American life. The 
Red Cross has helped the elderly to obtain government food assistance, 
the veteran to read just to civilian life, the drug abuser to seek help, the 
migrant worker to better his living standards, and the student to obtain 
tutoring assistance. 

Although the Red Cross receives the cooperation of many Federal, 
State, and local agencies, it derives its major financial support from the 
voluntary contributions of the American people. During the past year 
the Red Cross has been operating under an especially heavy financial 
burden because of outlays for disaster relief following the flood in Rapid 
City, South Dakota, and the Hurricane Agnes tragedy. I urge every 
American to help ensure that the Red Cross has the funds and volunteer 
manpower to fulfill its responsibilities during the year ahead. Helping 
the Red Cross- the Good Neighbor- continue its wide range of assist­
ance programs is one way in which each of us can help our communities 
and our country. 

NOW, THEREFORE, I, RICHARD NIXON, President of the 
United States of America and Honorary Chairman of the American 
National Red Cross, do hereby designate March 1973 as Red Cross 
Month, a month when every citizen is asked to join, serve, and contribute. 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand this third 
day of March, in the year of our Lord nineteen hundred seventy-three, 
and of the Independence of the United States of America the one 
hundred ninety-seventh. 

Published as a Public Service by the Floyd County Times 
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Our Yesterdays 
(Items fa ken from The Floyd County 

Tim~s, 20 and 30 years ago) 

Thirty Years Ago 
(March 18,1943) 

One hundred fifty-seven selectees will leave here next Thursday for army 
service ... The City Council last Monday night voted to buy from Joe Hill the 
Prestonsburg Gas Company for $50,000 ... An "act of God" is credited with 
the escape of three occupants of the Fred Workman home at Allen when a 
wall of the Allen Baptist Church collapsed last Friday before daybreak ... 
Cpl. Shirley Lewis, 24, has been taken prisoner on the Italian front, and Pvt. 
Frank Crabtree, formerly of Prestonsburg has been seriously wounded in 
North Africa ... There died: Green Bingham, 56, of Cliff, at the Prestons­
burg hospital Thursday morning; Martin L. Robinson, at Estill, Sunday, his 
18th birthday; Robert, 7, son of Jack Hackworth, of Bonanza, Wednesday of 
dropsy ; Mrs. Florence Freeman, 77, last Thursday at a Martin hospital; 
Mrs. Betty Miller Patrick, Friday, at Tram; Charles, 14-year-old son of 
Melvin Allen of West Prestonsburg, Saturday at a Martin hospital, believed 
a victim of t~tanus; Jack Hall, 78, of Frasure's Creek, March 9 at a Martin 
hospital; Thomas S. Burton, 72, at Auxier last Wednesday; Mrs. Anna 
Elizabeth McCloud, 73, of Drift, March 4; Darbie Jean Skeans, 7, of Martin, 
last Thursday at the home of her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Darb Skeans. 

Twenty Years Ago 
<March 19, 1953) 

Only two school buildings in this county are of fireproof construction a 
survey made by the Local Legislative Research Committee on Education 
s~ows ... Josh Tye Williams, 62, Prestonsburg drilling contractor, was 
k~ed last Thursday afternoon in a fall over a precipice on Grapevine Creek, 
Ptke_ co~ty . .. Prestonsburg has given up on its two-way radio com­
murucations system, Mayor Curtis Clark said this week . . . The Floyd circuit 
court had not a murder trial docketed for the coming April term . .. H. L. 
McCrary, Pikeville group manager for the Southern Bell Telephone Co., has 
been transferred to Shelbyville. The area has been divided into two districts: 
J. C. Stone is manager at Paintsville, John Stout at Pikeville . . . The 12,000 
acres around Dewey Lake last week were "posted" as a game refuge . .. 
There died: Susie Daniel Wiley, 66, March 14 at Garrett· Tommy Hall 72 

h 14 at Kite. ' ' ' 

Lexington To Cincinnati At 8 MPH 
By SUE WELLER 

Frankfort, Ky.- By foot, horse, train or 
plane, Kentuckians have always managed 
to get where they were going. 

At times, however, "the going" wasn't 
quite as convenient as we find it today. In 
an age of supersonic jets and in­
tercontinential flights within hours, it's 
sometimes hard to imagine travel as it was 
years ago. 

According to J. Winston Coleman in his 
book, "Stagecoach Days in the Bluegrass," 
the first stagecoach line in Kentucky was 
opened at Lexington in August, 1803. The 
coach left Lexington at 4:00 a .m. for 
Winchester, Mt. Sterling and its final 
destination at Olympian Springs in Mont­
gomery County- a 47 mile journey that the 
owner bragged could be made in one day. 

Early roads were made from laying logs 
across the road and covering them with soil 
creating what they called a "Corduroy 
road." This worked fine until bad weather 
came. 

Today, we central Kentuckians think 
nothing of driving up to Cincinnati for the 
day but in the early 1900's a stagecoach trip 
from Lexington to Cincinnati cost 10 cents a 
mile and usually took two days traveling at 
eight miles per hour. 

At the Frankfort Senior Citizens Center, 
there are many who have fond memories of 
travel "back then" and are eager to share 
them. 

"I remember that it took the biggest part 
of the day just to make 25 miles in the 
wagon," reminisces one Senior Citizen. "It 
took so long to get anywhere, we usually 
stayed home." 

"In the summer we'd take excursion 
trains to scenic places in the state," 
remembers another. "It was an all,day·trip 

Revival Services 
Will be held at tbe 

HIGHLAND FREE Will 

BAPTIST CHURCH 

Beginning 

SUNDAY, MARCH 25 
7 p.m. Each Evening. 

Minister 

ARNOLD B. JOHNSON 
Evangelist 

Special Singing Each Evening 
CLIFFORD AUSTIN, Pastor 

Bus Will Be Available, 
Cal1886-3648 or 886-3114. 

from Frankfort to Mammoth Cave by train, 
but it sure was fun!" 

Surreys were popular in the early part of 
the twentieth century. Some were very 
fancy with the traditional "fringe on top." 

"We just lived a block from the grocery 
store so we never needed any tran­
sportation," explains the oldest member in 
the Frankfort Club. "My husband would 
rent a surrey or a wagon sometimes and 
we'd enjoy a Sunday ride. For the most 
part, though, if we wanted to go anywhere, 
we walked." 

A Senior Citizen remembers the 
emergence of the famed Model-T! "That 
was high style back then. Only the wealthy 
could afford such a luxury. Mter all, a Ford 
Roadster cost right around $300 and that 
was a lot of money!" 

Although we've come a long way in the 
area of transportation and the relative 
convenience of today's travel cannot be 
denied, there seemed to be a certain 
amount of nostalgia among those in· 
terviewed reflecting on those "good old 
days." 

"There's one thing the couples of today 
are missing out on," says one woman with a 
mischievous smile on her face. "When we'd 
go out dating with the horse and buggy on a ' 
moonlit night, my date would tie the reins 
around the buggy whip- the horse knew the 
way home!" 

Overweight Trucks 
Barred By Court 

HAZARD, Ky., March 14- A temporary 
injunction was issued last week barring 15 
defendants from operating overweight coal 
trucks on nine highways in Perry county 
and on any highway in the state. 

The injunction was issued at the close of a 
three-hour hearing before Perry Circuit 
Judge Don A. Ward in a suit brought by 
state Atty. Gen. Ed W. Hancock and two 
state departments. 

Ward said only 15 defendants were placed 
under injunction Tuesday because of 
failure by local officials to serve sum­
monses and process papers on the 
remainder. 

COAL LAWYERS TO MEET 
The Coal Lawyers Conference, which was 

reinstituted last year, will meet Oct. 26-27 
at the Broadmoor in Colorado Springs, 
Colo. Selection of the meeting site was 
prompted by the fast-moving coal 
developments in the West. 

As in the past, the Conference is open to 
lawyers r epresenting coal interests, 
whether they are house counsel or retained. 
Lawyer-s who have not yet received a notice 
of the meeting and wish further details 
should contact Robert F . Stauffer, NCA 
general counsel. 

Selective, discriminate, creative photography ... 

• WEDDINGS • PORTRAITS •INDUSTRIAl 

WILLIAM SWARTZ 

Phone 886-8253, Prestonsburg 
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Whisman Sees a 'Dry Spell' 
Ahead in Federal Spending 

Predicting a "dry spell" in federal 
spending in the area, Kentucky 
representative of the Appalachian Regional 
Commission, John Whisman, told a large 
gathering at May Lodge Monday night that 
what is most needed for the future progress 
of Eastern Kentucky as well as the Ap­
palachian region as a whole is what he 
termed a "second alternative" in com­
munity partnership. 

Speaking at a dinner meeting of the Big 
Sandy Area Development Council, 
Whisman confirmed the fears of civic 
leaders and area citizens that massive cuts 
in existing Appalachian programs are 
inevitable and told the group that for a 
time, at least, "you're going to get nothing" 
in the way of large scale federal spending in 
the area. 

His own organization, the ARC, he said, is 
scheduled to be discontinued in two years, 
but he expressed the belief that growing 
federal funds in that period of time would 
allow the Commission's continuation. This . 
year's budget, he said would, be slightly 
higher than in the Commission's previous 
seven years of existence. 

Commenting on President Nixon's 
proposed budget cuts, Whisman said he 
hopes that the withholding of funds for 
programs in the mountains doesn't 
represent a first step in the dismantling of 
the war on poverty. He told the group he 
would consider it tragic if the United States 
gives up its war on poverty " just because 
the first campaign wasn't successful." 

sharing funds spread so thinly over such a 
vast number of communities, Whisman 
said these objectives could never come 
about. 

The solution to this dilemma is what 
·Whisman referred to as the " second 
alternative," a plan which would entail 
what he called a "regional system of 
partnership decision" in which the com­
munities in an area such as the Big Sandy 
valley would, in a sense, pool their 
resources and decide in which specific 
areas the funds were most needed. 
Whisman called this type of fund allottment 
"management by objective" and said that 
mountain communities must learn to 
cooperate and develop the ability to con­

, centrate funds where they are most needed. 
He said priorities would have to be 

agreed upon and decisions reached to 
determine which towns should receive 
funds first and how much should be allot­
ted. By this method, some communities 
would necessarily have to "wait their turn" 
for fund benefits but he stressed that im­
provements in any mountain community 
mean, first, improvement to the area as a 
whole. 

Whisman offered this plan to ease the 
period of difficulty which, according to 
him, lies ahead for the people of the Big 
Sandy valley and the Appalachians as a 
whole-people who, he says, have had 
" more potential for development that 
prospects." 

Announcing 
the Appointment of 

GLORIA POTTER 
As Beautician for 

HIGHLAND HEIGHTS 
BEAUTY SALON 

Prestonsburg, Kentucky 

I CAll FOR APPOINTMENT., 

PHONE 886-3161 
New Hours: Tues. thru Saturday,9 a.m.-5 p.m. 

CATALOG AGENCY 
PHONE 886-3821 PRESTONSBURG 

Reasons given by Whisman for the 
continued funding of ARC while other 
programs have been cancelled were, first, 
what he referred to as the political "clout of 
the Commission, or the strong backing that 
it enjoys in Washington and elsewhere. In 
addition, he said, the Commission has 
delivered its money on projects better than 
anyone else and in that performance has 
gone along with the President's philosophy 
to return decision making power to the 
states and local government. 

· Whisman said that through the predicted 
"dry spell" revenue sharing funds would 
comprise most of what Appalachian 
communities would have to work with, and 
he expressed the opinion that the present 
plan of revenue sharing would prove 
grossly inadequate for any significant 
progress in the Big Sandy and other areas. 
"It won't work, " Whisman told the group. 

THIS IS NOT A WAREHOUSE OR CLEARANCE SALE, 
BUT NEW, CLEAN, SPRING MERCHANDISEI 

Revenue sharing, commented Whisman, 
gives communities "a little too much of 
nothing." After funds are divided among 
the various communities of an area, he 
explained, no one community is left with 
enough to achieve any significant or long­
term projects. He said the Appalachian 
Region needs to progress to the poi,n t where 
it can support its own welfare programs, 
educate its own children and generally take 
care of its own problems. But with revenue 

Gas Firm Told 
It Must Serve 
Near Its Lines 

• t ' 

· The Kentucky Public Service Com­
mission (PSC) has ordered Kentucky West 
Virginia Gas Co. to eontinue providing gas 
service to qualified applicants along its 
gathering lines. 

Kentucky West Virginia is primarily a 
production company but under a Kentucky 
statute is required to furnish retail service 
to nearby customers in Floyd, Pike and 
other counties of this section where it 
operates. 

The company had given notice that it 
would not accept new customers after last 
January 1 because of insufficient gas 
supply. But the PSC ruled that the statute 
does not allow exceptions and that retail 
service would have "a relatively in­
significant effect" on Kentucky West 
Virginia's gas supply. The Public Service 
Commission has allowed restrictions on 
service by retail distributing gas com­
panies because they are gQverned by other 
sections of Kentucky statutes. 

18-Lb. 
11-Cycle 

AUTOMATIC 
WASHER 
Save $600. 

LAWN 
MOWER 

COLOR TV 
Maple, 

Automatic Color. 
Save $50.00. 

REF RIG ERA TOR­
FREEZER 
Save $60.00. 

Full Size 

ELECTRONIC 
OVEN 

Cuts Cooking Time 
In Half 

GARDEN 
TRACTOR 

Variable Speed . 
Plows-Tills- Mows Grass. 

GARDEN 
TILLER 

Forward & Reverse. 
Special 

16988 

RIDING 
TRACTOR 

32-ln. Cut-Save $50 

ELECTRIC 
.DRYER 

White. Save $400. 
Stop, Dry. In Stock. 

SAVE! 

In another order, the PSC denied most of 
a gas rate increase requested by Mountain 
Investment, Inc., Wheelwright. Mountain 
Investment applied for a $16,133-per-year 
increase last August and was granted a 
$2,198 increase, based on higher cost of 
wholesale gas, on Sept. 1. 

WARD'S HAS A CREDIT TERM TO SUIT YOU. SATISFAcriON GUARANTEED. 
HOURS-8:30 A.M.-5:30 P.M., MONDAY THROUGH SATURDAY. 

Building a New Home? 
Make Sure it's Heated Electrically. 

If you're planning to use clean electric heat in your 
new home, follow these hints for safe, comfortable 
and economic operation. 

• SIZE. Choose a heating unit that will adequately 
take care of your family's needs. Not too large, but 
not too small. 

• INSULATION. Did you know electric heating 
costs for a fully insulated home can be as much as 
55 percent lower than a home without insulation? 

• CAULKING. Caulk around windows and door 
frames. Keep the cold air outside and the warm air in. 

• THERMOSTATS. Have yours checked for proper 
operation. Turn off in unused rooms and close doors. 

Electricity is too important to waste. Contact your 
Rural Electric system for money saving, electric 
efficiency hints. 

The electric way ts clean. 

' 

Big Sandv Rural Electric Cooperative 
Paintsville, Kentucky 789-4095 
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began the work of probing the buzzards' 
innards for the gizzards. 

After a half a dozen or so of the 
scavengers had been opened in vain by the 
hunters somebody ambled by to inquire 
what in tunket they were doing. Told of the 
reward offered, the newcomer almost 
collapsed with laughter and finally 
recovered enough to tell them, "You 
derned fools, don't you know that a buzzard 
ain't got no gizzard?" 

"I got acquainted, all right," Coon 
remarked, "but I was careful to delay 
meetin' any of those fellows for a week or so 
till they had cooled down a bit." 

HOPEFULLY YOURS 
John Young Brown, Jr. has made a 

"challengegift"of$lmi1Jion for a research 
center for the aging, challenging the state 
to supply matching funds. One purpose of 
his gift, it is explained, is research which, 
hopefully, may slow down the aging 
process by as much as 10 years. 

I am encouraged. This may have come 
along in time. 

--- 3 ---
(Contmu~d from Page One) 

Adkins, John 1\<litchell, drunk driving and 
no operator's license, by Trooper 
Williamson; Harley Stephens, drunk 
driving, by Trooper Williamson; Walk 
Carver, carrying a concealed deadly 
weapon, by Trooper Stumbo. 

--- 4 ---
(Continued from Page One) 

The suit alleges that Comley and Jack 
Ruth, of Georgetown, president of the 
contractors' association, conspired to in­
fluence Eugene Goss, then commissioner of 
highways, to reject the out-of-state Barter 
firm's bids. 

LOSE STATE PE;RMITS 
Five Jefferson county service station 

operators lost their state permits to con­
duct motor vehicle inspections during 
February. according to a report released 
this week by the Public Safety Department. 
One station was also put on probation for 
the remainder of 1973. 

STRA. 
THEAT E 

PRESTONSBURG, KY. 

Senor 
let me blow 
my own nose, 
please I 

Joseph E. Levine Presents An Avco Embassy 

Thrence Hill in 

"The~ 
Call Me 
Trinity" 

with Bud Spencer Slefen Zooaharias 0an Slu.rtle Gisela Hahn 
Elena Pederrmle and with Farley Granger Prodwed 11.; llail ~ 

Directed17.; E.RQucher PnntsbyDeluxefi.UOAVCO IMU .. Y.ILI.UI .JI·= 
~ ........ ~,.. ~·--·--

If you've seen, "TRINITY IS 
STILL MY NAME," You'll 
Love, "THEY CALL ME 
TRINITY." 

e::;::=======e· 
Prestonsburg 

DRIVE IN 
PRESTONSBURG, KENTUCKY 

FRI. - SAT. -SUN. 
March 23rd, 24th and 25th 

THREE UVES 
UNFUL.f1LLED; 
EMOTIONAL 
AND COMPLEX .•• 

Glenda ~ter 
~~sunday Jackson Finch 

BlOOdy Murray Head 

Sunday" 
Unttad Artists 01!11 COUHI 

PLUS 

THE MAN WITH 
THE GUNSIGHT 
EYES IS BACK! 

LEE 
VANCLEEF 

••RETURN 
of SABAT..(• 

COLOR [PGI~ ~ 
Umted Arturts 

Annabella lncontrera 

-=============== 
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22,000 from the preceding year. Flood 
conditions continuing into May last year 
and wind damage to the Terry boat dock 
may account for the loss, Mr. Murray said. 

On the encouraging side at Dewey is work 
being done by the Department of Parks at 
the Jen~y Wiley boat dock and by the Corps 
of Engmeers on a recreation area im­
mediately below the dam. Concrete pllings 
ha~~ _been poured to provide docking 
facthhes along the shoreline for 50 boats at 
Jenny Wiley boat dock. The lake has been 
drawn down an additional 18 inches for this 
work and for improvements being made at 
Terry boat dock, but heavy rains brought 
the Ja_ke back up to winter pool by Friday 
mornmg. 

Reservoir Manager Murray said that 
unless he has instructions to the contrary 
from t~e Huntington district offtce, Corps 
of Engmeers, the water will continue to be 
held until the lake reaches its summer 
conservation pool, which is five feet higher 
than the winter stage. Normally, im· 
poundment of this additional five feet of 
water begins around April 1. 

The Corps of Engineers last year com­
pleted an access road into its recreation 
area, below the dam, and made various 
other improvements for the public benefit. 
Playground equipment for children already 
has been installed. A contract is expected to 
be awarded soon for the landscaping of 
approximately 10 acres downstream from 
the new access road. This part of the 
overall recreation complex will have 
basketball goals, a ball field and about 35 
picnic tables. 

Coming Events Told 
At Jr. Club Meeting 

The regular meeting of the Prestonsburg 
Junior Woman's Club was held March 15 at 
the Floyd County Library. The president, 
Mrs. C. R. Rice, presided, and the 
devotional was presented by Mrs. John 
Sammons. 

Mrs. Rice made the following an­
nouncements: The 7th district contests will 
be held at Drift, Mar. 31, with registration 
from 9·10 and judging beginning at 10 
o'clock; the KFWC convention, from May 
14-16 at the Galt House in Louisville· a 
KFWC Conservation Seminar to be held at 
the Frankfort Sports Center, April 3; the 
Miss Morehead Pageant, April 12. She also 
reminded members of the GFWC Bi· 
Centennial Plates sale. 

Mrs. John Sammons, Conservation 
chairman, announced that her department 
will be responsible for the April meeting 
which will feature Sgt. Hutchinson, of the 
Kentucky State Police, with a program on 
"Drugs." She asked clubwomen to bring 
recycled items to the April meeting for 
display and she briefly presented some 
items made by her department members. 
Mrs. Sammons announced that little bags 
had been ordered, that clean-up campaign 
of Archer Park was being planned, and 
members are planning to attend a Kiwanis 
meeting, possibly to help with a litter 
campaign in which that organization is 
involved. A pamphlet, entitled ''How to 
Save on Your Electric Bill," w s 
distributed. 

It was announced that the Education 
Department chairman, Mrs. Ronald 
Johnson, had received two library cards for 
clubwomen. Plans for a tea honoring 
county librarians- the club's way of 
celebrating National Library Week- were 
also presented to the membership. 

Mrs . Keith Harrison, Public Affairs 
chairman, spoke briefly on a discussion 
held by the department on the "Equal 
Rights Amendment" and announced plans 
for a public affairs meeting during the 
following week. 

A report was given by the CIP Chairman, 
Mrs. Aubrey Onkst, on the progress of the 
club's project with high school age 
volunteers at the Highlands Regional 
Medical Center. She also reported that a 
canvassing of high schools in the area to 
find volunteers is being planned. 

Special Education chairman, Mrs. David 
P. Allen, told clubwomen of material 
which had been ordered for the special 
education class at Prestonsburg elemen­
tary. She also enlisted volunteers to aid the 
class. These volunteers will be supervising 
play periods, and field trips, teaching 
crart.s, participating in story hours, 
showmg vacation films and home movies 
making room brighteners, and giving 
parties on special occasions. The most 
unusual part of the volunteer projects is the 
"Adopt a Child" segment in which club­
women choose a child to which they would 
send card and do special things for 
throughout the remainder of the school 
year. 

Two new members, Mrs. Dale McKinney 
and Mrs. Fred Meece, were received. Mrs. 
Dick Stai, Heart Fund chairman, reported 
on results of the county drive. She also 
announced that the club had joined the 
National Tennessee Walking Horse 
Association which is devoted to protecting 
horse show exhibitors . 

During the new business session, the club 
voted to donate $25 to the American Red 
Cross and $15 to KFWC for the purpose of 
securing a Safety speaker for the con· 
vention, and approved plans for improving 
the horse show ring at Archer Park. The 
Nominating committee was selected. 

These committee members are Mrs. 
David P. Allen, chairman, Mrs. John 
Christian, Mrs . Harold Cooley, Mrs. Roger 
Jurich and ~Irs Jack Stumbo. A committee 
was appointed to work with the Constitution 
and By-Laws committee chairman, Mrs. 
Bruce Spradlin, on possible revisions of by­
laws. It was also voted by the membership 
to hold an auction at the next meeting and1 

money to be used for the NARC project. 
Hostesses for the evening were Mrs. Jess 

Stover, Chairman; Mrs. James Mc­
Connell,:Mrs. Cloyd Johnson, Mrs. Ted 
Hicks, and ~trs . Aubrey Onkst. 

Floyd Clinics Slated 
Two Outpost Clinics will be conducted the 

last week in March it was announced by the 
Floyd County Health Department The first 
of these will be held March 26 in the 
Keathley Food Market, at the mouth of 
Toler Creek from 10 a.m to 2 p.m. The 
second, a Pap Smear Clinic, will be con­
ducted Wednesday, March 28, at the Floyd 
County Health Department from 9 a.m. to 
11 :30 a.m. and 1 p.m. to 2 p m. 

Area Administrator 
For Social Services 

Sara Honn was recently named area 
administrator for social service programs 
in the Big Sandy Area Development 
District <ADD> by state Economic Security 
CommiSSIOner Gail S. Huecker. 

The commissioner announced the ap­
pointment ali part of what she terms "the 
second step" in the department's mternal 
reorganization . 

Mrs. Honn sees the area administrator as 
a communication link between the state 
and local social service offices. "It is an 
attempt to improve lines of communication 
in hopes that we, as a team of ad­
ministrators, can relate problems peculiar 
to our area, refer them to central office and 
come to solutions on a more timely basis." 

Mrs. Honn, to be headquartered in 
Jackson after April 1, will work closely with 
p~blic assistance offices in Floyd, Martin, 
Ptke and Magoffin counties 

"The area administrator concept will 
help bring the best possible social service 
delivery to the people of eastern Ken­
tucky," she said. 

A native of Jackson, Mrs. Honn received 
her masters o£ social work from Tulane 
University in r-.:ew Orleans. She has been 
with the department since October, 1956 
and employed as an eligibility worker, 
senior field representative and most 
recently as an area program analyst 

ALMA 
D lYE-

Allen, Kentucky 
~ ~ -- ---- ~----------

FRI •• SAT •• SUN •• MARCH 23-24-25 

HAROLD 
and 

MAUDE 
RUTH GORDON .... 
BUD CORT ~00 b,TM-.OO·~·ll!l 

A Paramaunl 
Pidure 

•T~at.IMCotlta.ftll"'•t ....... ""'oeft 
,....,~e.-tableiOtpo•t~ 

PLUS 

Charles 
Bronson 

Jack 
Palance 

THE SCREAM 
OF HIS VICTIMS 
IS THE ONLY SOUND 
HE MAKES 

"Chato's Land" 
R chard Basehart 

James Wh1tmore 

~~-----------­~ - -- --

0 D ~~:~~~~ SELECTIO 

B. 

FORD MUSTANG 

2-DOOR HARDTOP 

FORD LTD 

2·DOOR HARDTOP 

VPRICE VMODELS yoPTIONS 

D. OTORS GIVES YOU 
THE BEST 

VoEALS VoEUVERY 

UYS 

FORO MAVERICK 

2-DOOR SEDAN 

FORO GRAN TORINO 

2-DOOR HARDTOP 

THUNDERBIRD 

2·DOOR HARDTOP 

OUR GOAL: NO UNHAPPY OWNERS 

Dnl With One of These Courteous 8 & D. Salesmen . 

• JERRY LAmm, JR. • JERRY BRYAN LAFFERTY • TEX KEATHUY 
• EDGAR HAWKINS • HAROLD COOlf'f • JAMES lAFFERTY 

B.& D. MO 0 co. 
TWO LOCATIONS: 

PHONE 174-2133 
lANCER-WAHl GAP ID. 

I • 
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Jordan on Staff 
Of Coal Research 

JOINS UNION MOVEMEJ.\'T To the Public ~~~~------~ INCOME TAX 
Paul R. Jordan, native of Wayland and 

former head of the Frankfort Bureau of the 
Associated Press, has been named staff 
assistant to the director for public in­
formation, Office of Coal Research, 
Department of the Interior. 

Until his transfer to OCR this month, Mr. 

The National Education Association has 
announced plans to join forces with the 
American Federation of State County and 
Municipal Employees <AFSCME> to seek 
passage of a national bargaining law. The 
action sought by the group, the Coalition of 
American Public Employees (CAPEl, 
would force collective bargaining on school 
boards and legalize teachers strikes in all 
states. 

The undersigned will appreciate any 
information concerning Joel Martin (b. 
1818) and his wife, Judy Turner Martin. 

Contributions to a fund for the purchase 
of a double marker for the graves of this 
pioneer couple are being received. Those 
desiring to contribute should mail 
donations to: WALTERS. KING 

3-14-2t. Printer,Ky. 

SERVICE 
FEDERAL AND STATE 

See me at my home, 
8 a.m. to 8 p.m. 
W.B.BOYD 

PhDDe lllf.Z'7it-Westmluter8t. 
Preltoubaq_ 

Jordan was public information officer for 
the Office of Saline Water and for 15 months 
was its acting chief. He began newspaper 
work in 1950 with The PaintsvilJe Herald 
and was a reporter for the Huntington (W. 
Va.) Herald-Dispatch prior to his AP work. 

---
Mr. Jordan, his wife, Dorothy Ruth, and 

Hi-year-old son reside at 5201 Heming Ave., 
Springfield, Virginia. 

Reynolds 
Construction Co., 

Inc. 

Stanville, Ky .-Phones 478-5296, 
478-5861 or 432-2270 

Landscaping-House sites -Septic 
tanks and field lines - Water and 
Gas Unes - Dozer and Backhoe 
work - Dirt and rock hauled by tbe 
hour or on contract. 

ELEVENTH ANNUAL GIFT-Lena T. Porter, formerly of Prestonsburg, president 
of the Pikeville Woman's Club, presents the club's $IOO check to Dr. Robert S. Cope, 
president of Pikeville College. The contribution, made annually by the club for 11 
consecutive years, goes to the college endowment fund. Others in photo are Mrs. 
Maurice Bailey, club treasurer, (at left) and Lona Stephens, second vice-president 
(right), 

CLIFFORD REYNOLDS &SON, 
Owners 

ANNOUNCE BIRTH 
Mr. and Mrs. Tom Hicks, III, announce 

the birth of their first child, a son, March 5, 
at Beckley, W. Va. The baby has been 
named Tom Hicks, IV. Mrs. Hicks is the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Marcus Patton, of 
Paintsville. 

NOTICE 
1h lerised Kentuclrr Worlcmen's Compensfllion Law of 

Ja,., J, J973 Mar AHect foul 
AI an llldivtchW (ID yGIU' work, ID a small baBIDess, even as a homeowner 
~ettmes!) · 
As a Professional (Doetor, Lawyer, Dentist, Realtor, etc.) 
Aa a Partnenhfp (Clerical help, Bookkeeper, even relatives.) 
Aa a CorponUOD (Remember, Offleen are employes.) 

Unless fH Are SOLfL Y irr Agriculture: 

Almost EVERY Business; PenDD and ProfeuloDal wttb ONE or more em· 
ployea wtD. be required to comply with provisions of the new law! 

• UDder the old law, yoa had to have three or more employes. 
e ODe employe now places yoa under obUgatlon of the new law! 
e Yw mil)' become sabject by merely employblg a contractor to do work for 

yoa llllder a eoatraet of hire! You may be responsible for IDjary or death to his 
employes! 

The new Kentucky law is one of the most Iibera I in the United 
States! Benefits have been greatly increased. Some are even 
unlimited! 

How Can You As All Employer Protect Yourself? 
By Obtaining Workmen's Compensation lnsuronce! 

Discvss four Situflfion Today With Your Loccrllndependent Agentl 

Hall-Clark Insurance Agency, Inc. 
Phone 886-2318, Prestonsburg, Kentucky 

W'wright Club Hostess 
To Two Women's Clubs 

Wheelwright, Ky .-The Wheelwright 
Woman's Club entertained the Drift and 
Lackey-Garrett-Wayland Woman's Clubs 
with a Hawaiian luau, held at the clubhouse 
dining room in Wheelwright, Tuesday 
evening, March 6. 

The dining room was decorated with 
ferns and butterflies, and a fresh pineapple 
centered each table. Guests found a 
brightly colored lei and flower-wrapped 
favors at each place setting. The buffet 
table was covered with a fishnet, sprinkled 
with shells . Gardenia corsages were 
presented to Miss Ruby Akers, president of 
the Drift Woman 's Club, and Mrs. S. M. 
Martin, president .of the Lackey-Garrett­
Wayland Woman's Club. A cymbidium 
orchid was presented to Mrs. Oscar C. 
Sowards, guest -speaker. 

Mrs. Fred Salisbury, president of the 
Wheelwright Club, presided and gave the 
invocation. 

Mrs. Sowards, past president of the 
Kentucky Federation of Women 's Clubs, 
spoke on America. 

Club members attending were: From 
Drift- Mrs. W. L. Reed, Mrs. G. W. 
Showers, Mrs . Lloyd Stumbo , Mrs. 
McKinley Little, Mrs. Clyde Moore, Miss 
Ruby Akers, Mrs. BiJI Hoffman and Reba 
T. Martin; from Lackey-Garrett­
Wayland-La Faye Hughe~ Blanche 
Barner, Mrs. James A. Duff, Mrs. Rex 
Martin, Alice Hornsby, Imalee Spillman, 
Beatrice Collins, Maxine Martin and Libby 
Martin. Members of the Wheelwright club 
present were Mrs. T. J . Hagans, Mrs. Doyle 
Mullins, Mrs. Forrest Newsome, Mrs. Billy 
Mullins, Mrs Matgaret Jones, Mrs. Clyde 
Little, Mrs. Elmer Ferguson, Mrs. Paul · 
Bailey, Mrs. John J . Bartuka, Mrs. Mary 
Ellen Wilson, 'and Mrs. Fred Salisbury. 
Guests from Pikeville were: Mrs. Oscar C. 
Sowards and Mrs. Burlin Coleman. 

Initiation fees for unions vary con­
siderably, with a general range of $5 to $25, 
although a few unions charge more than 
$100. Dues seldom exceed $10-a-month and 
often are several dollars less. 

--------------------------------------------------------~-----------------------------·--
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GET A NUMBER ONE DEAL 
FROM THE AREA'S NUMBER 

ONE SALES TEAM 

Chevrolet Caprice 
Sport Sedan 

Motor Trend Magazine 
Again Voted Vega G T 
"The Economy Compact 

Car of the Year." 

Chevrolet's Luxury 
Car Is In Stock, 
Now ... Two-Doors 
and Four-Doors. 

Vega GT Hatchback Coupe 

SEE THE COMPLETE LINE OF -<HEVROLETS 
TODAy I AT MUSIC-CARTER-HUGHES. 

These Courteous Salesmen Will Be Glad To Help You With Your Car Needs ••• 

• ED MUSIC • ESTILL LEE CARTER • PAUL PHILLIP HUGHES 
• NELSON BALDRIDGE • CHESTER PACK • BOBBY BURCHETT 

MUSIC-CARTER-HUGHES 
CHEVROLET -BUICK 
Phone 886-2364 So. Lalce Drive 

"Where Confidence Geta BubleA 
and SatJsfaetfou Keeps It" 

Prestonsburg 

HOWARD FURNI URE WAREHOUSE 

GIG A T C REMODE lNG SALE 
I· Fantastic Values -I Still In Progress. I Great Bargains I 

Everything in our store must be sold to make room. 
We will compare prices with anyone-even wholesale 

furniture companies. 
Come in-Give us a phone call-Let us prove what we say I 

' 

I Better Hurry-The Furniture Is Going Fast.) 

THIS IS NO GIMMICK-WE SELL WHAT WE ADVERTISE. 

HOWARD FUR ITUR_E WAREHO SE 
3rd Ave. Prestonsburg, Ky. 886-6231 

IF YOU REALLY WAN1 TO SA YE MONEY! 

t 
t 
t 
t 
t 
t 
t 
t 
t 
t 
t 
' t 



THE FLOYD COUNTY TIMES WEDNESDAY, MARCH Zt, 1973 ---------- SECTION TWO, PAGE TWO 

BANKING INTEREST NO BAR 

To Save Broken Gas Lines 

BEFORE YOU 

eatt 
~}e7!fa. 

304-346- 0951 
nl"l~AK 

DON T GIVE US A Ul , ... , • 

Officers in 'Big I' Programs 

These state pollee officers are available for "Big I" programs In the eastern section of 
the state, as well as other programs related to safety and drugs: Front row, from 
left.-Sgt. Green Long, Harlan, Sgt. Fred Walton, London, Sgt. Aries Hale, Columbia; 
back row-8gt. David Patterson, Richmond, Sgt. Eugene Hutchinson, Pikeville, 
Trooper D. Lykins, Ashland, Sgt. Jack Evans, Morehead, Sgt. Jerry Combs, Hazard. 

PUPIL PERFORMANCE INCREASES BOARD FILES SUIT 
A performance contracting project A condemnation suit seeking to acquire a 

IN APPRECIATION 
We, the members of the Auxier Volunteer 

Fire Department, wish to thank everyone 
who in any way helped to make our recent 
chicken and dumpling dinner a success. 
Thanks seems so inadequate to say what 
your help and contributioos have meant 
now and in our past efforts to raise money. 
Especially do we thank the people of the 
Prestonsburg area for their support-those 
who bought tickets and those who gave 
generous contributions. Also, thanks to 
James Paul Connors who solicited money 
and did a great job delivering plates. 
Maybe with future help and perserverance 
we will realize our dream of an active, 
fighting fire department. 

We will look forward to your continued 
support in the future. Again, a great, big 
thanks to everyone. You are all REAL 
important to us. 

Auxier Volunteer Fire Dept. 

Attorney General Ed Hancock has opined 
a person cannot be barred from serving on 
a school board because the board deposits 
money in a bank where the member is an 
officer, director, or stockholder. In con­
formance with his opinion, the attorney 
general withdrew opinions released in 1964, 
1965, and 1972 which stated it was unlawful 
for a school board member to have an in­
terest in a bank where school funds were 
deposited. 

To Whom It May Concern: 
Upon and after this date of publication, I 

will not be responsible for any debts in­
curred by any person other than myself. • 

3-14-4t-pd. 

REX ROSS 
Stanville, Ky. 

Burke Window & Awning Sales 
North Arnold Ave., Prestonsburg 

"Serving Floyd County 'Since 1953" 

CARPORTS 
ALUMINUM AWNINGS 
STORM DOORS 

STORM WINDOWS 
ALUMINUM AND 
VINYL SIDING 

REMODELING-Any type wall finishes. 

Now Available • • • 
conducted in two elementary schools in site for a proposed school building has been 

The message Janie West Is holding Is the one Columbia Gas of Kentucky, Inc., and Dade county, Florida, is reported to have filed on behalf of the Warren County School 
Columbia Gas Transmission Corporation are delivering to contractors, coal stripping produced achievment gains twice the Board. By filing suit, the board is at-

LIQUID PLASTIC ROOFING 
operators and others who move earth. It's part of the companies' new "CaD Before national norm. In one school, 180 par- tempting to gain what it considers the best 
You Dig" campaign which asks the earthmovers to call the gas companies to learn ticipating students gained an average of 4.8 site for the location of a $1 million school. 

Olvestlgate tbls fabulous advance in plastics before you do anytbl.lg about your 
roof-NO MATTER WHAT KIND OF ROOF YOU HAVE. 

whether there are any plpeUues in their excavation area. The object is to prevent months in reading and 8 months in math The board alleges the owner of the property 
accidental pipeline ruptures that could endanger a bulldozer operator and cause an after four months of instruction. In the has asked too much for the land, and 
outage. About 95 per cent of the companies' outages are caused by buDdozer and other other school, 180 students gained 11.3 negotiations to transfer the property have 

Free Estimates. Hours, 8 to s Monday thru Saturday 
Information evenings: Phone 886-6431. 

LETTERS 
JOE BUCHANAN, Owner 

heavyequlpmentoperators=·--------------------------------------~m::on:ths~:in~r;e:a:di:n:g~a:nd~7~m:o:n:th:s~l:·n~m:a:t:h~.~f:ai:led~ ......................... ~J::::::::::::::::;:::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::;;:~· 

TO THE EDITOR 
IN APPRECIATION 

Editor, 1be Times: 

My teen-age daughter became ill while 
attending the recent district basketball 
tournament at the Prestonsburg 
Fieldhouse, and I would like to express my 
thanks and gratitude to the Floyd County 
Emergency & Rescue Squad for its prompt 
aid and assistance to her. We are indeed 
fortunate to have such a fine group of 
people serving without benefit of personal 
financial remuneration in our midst. They 
do a great job, for which I extend my 
thanks, and thanks also to others in at­
tendance for their help and solicitousness. 

MRS. DONALD LAYNE 
I vel, Kentucky 

A new $27-million airport, capable of 
handling two million passengers a year, 
bas been opened at Brasilia, Brazil. 

THE 
COOK DUET 

Will It At tilt 

DRIFT FREE WILL 
BAPTIST CHURCH 
Saturday, March 31 

7 , ••• 
Everyone Is Invited To Attend. 

3-21-2t. 

Model P~oject 
For Handicapped 
Asked by ROPES 

Region 11 of the Regional Organization 
for Providing Educational Services 
<ROPES> has been invited by the state 
Department of Education to submit a 
formal application for a model demon­
stration projectfor handicapped children in 
fiscal year 1974. 

The proposed undertaking, known as 
"Project Lead," would provide a super­
visor to work with special education 
teachers and aides who would serve 477 
identified handicapped children in this 
region. 

The project was submitted to the Division 
of Special Education, Department of 
Education at Frankfort, and reviewed last 
month, Reo Johns, director of ROPES 
Region 11, and Shirley Beard, ad­
ministrative assistant, will meet April 5 to 
review regulations for funding of the 
project. 

The official proposal is expected to be 
approved or rejected by April with 
program implementation expected by the 
start of the 1974 fiscal year, July 1. 

If approved, a supervisor will be placed 
on the ROPES staff to work with teachers, 
principals, counselors, parents and other 
agencies to expand and improve existing 
programs for handicapped children. 

The supervisor would also be responsible 
for using available funds and human 
resources to improve the exceptional 
children program and upgrade han­
dicapped teacher training programs. 

In order for any local education agency to 
get Title VI funds, it must have a minimum 
of 20 teachers working with handicapped 
students. No local district bas the 
minimum, it was said. 

Work on the Cross-Florida canal was 
about one-third completed when Pres. 
Nixon halted construction for ecological 
reasons. 

5-HP TIIJ,ER 

174• 

bigger 

PORK CHOPS 
END CUT I RIB CUT I 

Lb. 79c Lb. 89c 
CENTER CUT 

Lb. 99c 
Prices Effective thru Sunday. 

Kraft's 

APPLE, 

APPLE-GRAPE~ 

APPLE-GRAPE-STRAWIERRY 
or APPLE-BLACIIERRY JEllY 

3 18-0z. $1 00 Jars 

~~~e~~E DRINK -· Y2 gal. 49C 
Pringle's New-Fangled 9_az. 
POTATO CHIPS_. Twin-Pak 59c 

29-0z. 79c Luck's 2 
PINTO BEANS-- Cans 
Kraft Parkay 3 1-Lb. $ 1 00 
MARGARINE-- -- Boxes 

G:~:~~s CRACKERS 
1-Lb. 39c Box 

Reg. 47c Trend 
DETERGENT POWDER 

Ma':~n DILL PICKLE 
HAMBURGER SLICES 

~:;t 49c 
All-STAR 

LIQUID DnERGENT 

3 Quart Sl 00 Bottles e 

Swift's Pro-Ten 

CHUCK ROAST 

~- 89 
Fischer's Sliced 

PLATTER BACON 

~.89~ 

Swift; s Pro-T en 

SIRLOIN STEAK 

~.sl.S9 
Do1ald Duck Unsweetened 

GRAPEFRUIT 
JUICE 

46-0z. 49~ Can 

CEDAR Hill HOMOGENIZED 

GRADE A MILK 
In Returnable 
Plastic Jugs. 95e Gal. 

Reg. $1.50 

Plus 
Deposit 

ALBERTO BALSAM, 
Y0-5 HARD-TO-HOLD 

OR IEGULAR 
HAIR SPRAY 

NOW 

99~ 

REYNOLDS WRAP 

Summer Isle 3 29-0z. S 1 00 
PINEAPPLE Cans 
Sunshine Hydrox 59 JJ, 

COOKIES ---- --- - 2~~~~· ._ 

------4 ~:~~!~ 8 9 c Holsum 
BREAD 
Purina TUNA 2 131!4-0z. 39 C 
CAT FOOD - _ - - Cans 

LITTLE BEAR 
MARKET 

PHONE 874-2290, AllEN 
STORE HOURS: 

Mon.-Sat., 8 a.m.-8 p.m. 
Sundays. 10 a.m.-8 p.m. 
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Ford Says Coal Production Up 
But Strip Mining Shows Decrease 

Gov. Wendell H. Ford said recently that 
the year 1972 saw an increase in overall 
coal production in Kentucky over 1971, but" 
that there was a marked decrease in strip 
mine operations as well as tonnage from 
surface mining. 

Ford said final figures from the 
Department of Mines and Minerals 
illustrate "a downward trend" in surface 
operations, and "an upward trend" in 
tonnage from underground mining. 

FLOYD CIR1::UIT COURT 
CR 9129 

Marion Laferty, Individually, and Marion 

1 Laferty, Widower of Roxie Laferty, 
Deceased; Chester Laferty, and Mary 
Laferty, his wife; and Lissie Sturgill, 
Widow, Plaintiffs. 

VS: Notice of Sheriff's 
Sale under Execution 

William Laferty, Darc:us L. Sizemore and 
Rolland Sizemore, her husband, Nannle 
Carr, Widow; Manda Roberts and Cereal 
Roberts, her husband; Martha L. O'Hare, 
Divorced; Maggie L. Lewis, Divorced; 
Curtis Laferty and Agnes. Laferty, His wife; 
and Betty L. MulUns and Emzie Mullins, her 
husband, Defendants. 

By virtue of Execution No. 9129 directed to 
me, which issued from the clerk's office of 
the Floyd Circuit Court, hi favor of Cassie J. 
Allen against Rolland Sizemore and Darcus 
Sizemore, Defendants herein, and through 
them by all the parties hereto, I, or one of 
my deputies, will on Monday the 26th day of 
March, 1973, between the hours of 10:00 and 
10:30 a.m. at the courthouse door in the City 
of Prestonsburg, Floyd County, Kentucky, 
expose to public sale, to the highest bidder, 
the following described property, to wit: 

"Beginning on a cedar post at the county 
road 68 feet from the sycamore on the bank 
of Jane Brown Branch ; thence up the 
branch with the line of Joe Branham to a 
sweet gum near the branch ; thence up the 
hill to a twin oak; thence to a pine on top of 
the hill, being a corner to Jack Miller's 
property, thence with' Jack Miller's 
property to Ever.ett Auxier's line, to the 

Kentucky produced 120,271,247 tons of 
coal during 1972, compared to 119,167,582 
tons the previous year. 

Last year there were 729 surface mining 
operations, 113 fewer than in 1971. Surface 
tonnage was also down~,739,385 tons in 
1972, and 66,469,795 tons in 1971. 

In contrast, while there were 410 less 
underground mines operating in Kentucky, 
deep production showed a gain of 3,834,075 
tons. 

"These facts prove the inaccuracy of 
those who say, and have written, that strip 
mining is increasing in Kentucky," Ford 
sais. "They also indicate a very healthy 
coal economy for our state." 

Mines and Minerals Commissioner H. N. 
Kirkpatrick reported that the 1972 average 
mining employment increased from the 
1971 figure of 31,356 to 32,245. Of the 889 
increase, all but 14 represented un­
derground employment. 

The 1971 employment figure for un­
derground mining was 21,242 while surface 
mining employment was 10,114. The 1972 
underground employment total was 22,117 
while surface mining was 10,128. 

In the Martin district the number of 
surface mines last year was 140, two more 
than in 1971, but tonnage production was 
down from 8,669,790 in 1971 to 6,288,458last 
year. The number of underground mines in 
the county last year was 220 and that was 
113 fewer tha~ a year earlier. But un­
derground mine production was 6,288, 458 
tons last year, as compared to 4,990,456 tons 
in 1971. 

(The Martin district serves all of Floyd, 
Magoffin, Martin, Johnson, Morgan, 
Elliott, Lawrence, Boyd, Carter and 
Greenup counties and parts of Knott and 
Breathitt.> 

In the Pikeville-district according to the 
governor's figures, the number of surface 
mines increased by four, from 108 to 112 in 
1972, but their production dropped from 
3,759,191 tons in 1971 to 3,578,221 tons last 
year. Meanwhile in this district, the 
number of undergound operations dropped 
from 408 in 1971 to 329 in 1972, and last 
year's underground tonnage was down to 
13,642,844 from the 13,979,536 tons of the 
preceding year. 

~ county road; thence with the county road to 
( the beginning." 

State Police Probe 
275 Area Accidents, 
28 in This County The F,iJist Nation! Bank of Prestonsburg, 

Kentucky, holds a first mortgage on the 
above-()escribed property in the amount of 
$11,283.60, which is duly recorded in Mort­
gage Book No. 42, Floyd County Court 
Clerk's Office at Pages 257-8 thereof, and 
this sale will be made subject to the said 
mortgage. 

- -
Although state troopers in the area 

served by State Police Post 9, Pikeville, 
investigated 275 accidents in which 143 
persons were injured during January and 
February, only two fatalities were 
recorded, and both of these were in Pike 
county. Twenty-eight of the accidents were 
in Floyd county. 

Said sale will be made to satisfy the at­
~ney fee and courts costs herein in the 
amount of $897.25 and the costs of ad­
vertisement and sale under execution, 
subject to the first mortgage of the First 
National Bank of Prestonsburg, Kentucky, 
as aforesaid. 

Seventy-one were arrested on drunk 
driving charges in the five-county area, 
with Floyd having 14 of these, Magoffin 25, 
Pike 23, Martin 4 and Johnson 5. 

Troopers made 49 criminal in­
vestigations, arrested 37 on criminal 
charges and recovered one stolen auto. 
Twelve of these investigations were made 
in Floyd, with eight arrests. 

Sale will be made on a credit of six 
months, bond with approved security 
required, bearing interest at the rate of 
seven (7) per cent per annum, from day of 
sale and having the force and effect of a 
replevin bond. 

Gov. Wendell Ford has named Ron 
Johnson as Commissioner of the Depart­
ment of Public Safety. A former 
newspaperman, Johnson has served as an 
administrative aide to the governor for the 
past 15 months. He succeeds acting­
commissioner William 0. Newman. 

This March 1, 1973. 

3-7-3t. 

FRANK LESLIE, Sheriff of 
Floyd County, Kentucky 

You don't plan on lt. 
But shouldn't you plan for It? 
No one likes to think about going to the hospital 
Yet one Kentucky family out of every three will 
have someone receive ho"pital care this year. 
That"s why prepaid health care protection such 
as Blue Cross and Blue Shield of Kentucky 
are vital to you and your family. 

II you are an eligible individual, there is a 
Blue Cross and Blue Sh1eld program designed 
for you 

Blue Cross offers a variety of hospitalization 
plans that pay from $25 to $40 a day for your 
room, plus comprehensive benefits with full 
payment for all covered hospital expenses 
Blue Shield provides a choice of two indemnity 
schedules w1lh payment up to ($270) ($405) for 
surgical expense plus allowances for in-hospital 
medical. X-ray and anesthesia. 

You may also be eligible for E:xtended 
Benefits coverage which increases and adds 
specified benefits to your Blue Cross and 
Blue Shield coverage 

So even though you don"t anticipate a 
hospital stay, it doesn't cost anything to get 
the facts from Blue Cross and Blue Shield of 
Kentucky. Simply fill out the coupon below. 
There"s no obligation, no salesman will call. 

Group plans may be formed where there are 
five or more eligible employees. 

+. ' 
Helpmg you get 
good health cate 
you can afford • .. 

~-~---·-·-----------------------------------, 
I 
I 
t 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 

Complete and ma11 th1s coupon to: Blue Cross and Blue Shield of Kentucky. 3101 Bardstown 
Ro.td. LOu•Svllle. Kentucky 40205 Please send me Wllhout obltgaiiOn nongroup •nlormahon 
on health care benef•ts and e l•g•b•hty r&Qu•rements 

(Check all •tems Name (Mr) !Mrs l1M1ss) 

lllat apply) Address- ---

Age g~~ g;~~~ over C•IY- ------ Z•P -------- --

! J •m DGett•ng marned 
1 OA college atudent (Company ad::tres.s) 

Emoloyed by !Company name)_ 

: OPresenHy a rr.embttr of Bh.Je Cross and Blue Shield •ntereSIEtd 1n amprDVlt'g my 

1 benel•ts My Cert•l care No 

: 0 Interested 1n formmg an Emptoyee Group (5 or more omployecsl 

: Farm -~~r~~u~~:.~~~s: ~.ee.~~ .. F!:~ ~:':!~~gent PFCaiB3 
L -- - - -------------------- ------ ------- ---- - ------~ 

THE FLOYD COUNTY TIMES 

Golden Wedding Honorees 

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Saunders, former 
residents of Floyd county, were guests of 
honor during open house Sunday, March 4, 
with 259 guests at the Willard junior high 
school, Willard, Ohio. 

Their children hosted the celebration of 
their 50th wedding anniversary. They were 
united in marriage, March 2, 1923, by the 
late Jonathan Osborne, Methodist minister 
of the Horn Chapel Methodist Church, on 
the Auxier road, near here. 

Mr. and Mrs. Saunders are the parents of 
four children, Mrs. Phil Vanderpool, of Mt. 
Vernon, Ohio, Mrs. Harold Holmes, of West 
Lafayette, Ohio, Charles Saunders, 
Mansfield, Ohio, and Mrs. Ogil Reed, of 
Plymouth, Ohio. They have 19 grand­
children and one great-grandchild. 

Mr. and Mrs. Saunders make their winter 
home in Florida since his retirement from 
the B. and 0 . Railroad in 1969. 

Their daughter Nell and Rev. Harold 
Holmes also celebrated their 25th an­
niversary at the same time. Rev. Holmes 
has been an ordained minister in the 
Church of The Nazarene for 20 years and is 
the pastor of the Church of the Nazarene at 
West Lafayette, Ohio. Mrs. Holmes is 
employed at Cochocton Memorial Hospital. 

The Governor's Traffic Safety Coor­
dinating Committee has endorsed a 
uniform accident reporting form for 
Kentucky, but rejected a mandatory seat 
belt law for the Commonwealth. 

About 20 percent or 5.4 million of the 23 
million members of unions and employee 
bargaining associations in the United 
States were women as of 1970. 

SECTION TWO, PAGE THREE 

Insurance agents holding only a vehicle 
insurance license cannot write any other 
line of insurance according to Kentucky's 
code. 

~hr IDldr 
and 

Old Fashioned Co~trtesy and Service 
Modern Fac_ilities and Equipment 

HALL BROTHERS 
FUNERAL HOME 

AMPLE PARKING 

PHONE 285-3262 MARTIN, KY. 
MEMBER: 

Keatucky FIIDeral Dlreeton Bartal Auoclatloa 
AuocU.ted Flmeral Dlrecton Aasoeladoa 
Nadoaal Fuaeral Dlreeton AuocU.U011 

••• PRESENTING 

WAnS' SPRING '73 

MOBILE HOME SHOW 
Friday and Saturday, March 30-31 

THERE Will BE LIVE RADIO 
COVERAGE EACH DAY OF WAns• 

GALA SHOW AND SALE. COME 
IN-BRING THE WHOLE FAMIL Y1 

WRITTEN WARRANTY ON ALL 
NEW MOBILE HOMES 

FREE SET-UP 
AND DELIVERY 

AROUND-THE-CLOCK 
MOBILE HOME SERVICE! 
Watts1 is now offering 24-HOUR SERVICE on 
any major maintenance problems you might 
have with your mobile home. At Watts', we 
offer quality, price, and, most of all, service. 
Stop by, today. 

Attend Watts' big mobile home show, first to be 
held in this area ... See all that's new in mobUe 
homes for 1973 . . . more luxury, more con­
venience ... more of what makes a mobUe home 
your best buy in modern housing. Look them 
over. Pick the model that best suits you~ need1. 

PRICES 
SLASHED 

ON All HOMES 
IN STOCKI 

SAVE MORE DURING 
SHOW DAYS! 

Extra Savings On 

DOUBLE~WIDES 
AND 

BACHELOR PADS 
By Windsor 

MANY OTHER MODELS 
TO CHOOSE FROM. 

Save More .With Watts,· 
Eastern Kentucky1s 
Largest Volume Dealer. 

WATTS' INTERNATIONAL 
MOBILE HOME SALES 

See OLLIE WATTS, JR., Owner, or KEN HALL, Sales Mgr. 

PHONE 886-6519 PRESTONSBURG 
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A Man of the Mountains 
By GEORGES. MOORE 

(In The Elliott County Sews l 
Senator Douglas Hays of McDowell was 

my closest neighbor for more than twenty­
five years. His full name was Larry 
Douglas Hays but they called him 
Sawloggln' Doug. Allan Trout, in a two 
page feature article about him in the 
Courier Journal said: ''Tough timber­
slashing Doug Hays is a big hearted cuss." 
In the interesting story that followed he 
gave an account of Doug's sawloggin' ac­
tivities from 1901 down to 1950. 

ASHLAND 
FINANCE CO. 

PaysOn 

Current 
Investment 

Notes 

8% 
270-DA Y NOTES 

e Jnt.est payable monthly 
8Rd computed on per 
annum basis 

e lnt.ereat atarts the clay of 
purchue 

e Nota may be renewed at 
the option of the pun:ha.-

e Pllrclluer may redeem at 
any Ume prior to malw'ity, 
with Interest adjuatment on 
10 clay notice or u acreec1 

e Minimum note •1,000 pi• 
any mulUple of •1110 

Fwfvtllerblfenutlla~ 
D)' Keatlleky elflee of 

ASHLAND 
FINANCE CO. 

... U)'YIIIe, Ky. Maaltreet 
u.lea,Ky. JUS.tiiMalaSt. 
llertiRntDe, Ky. liZ Uberty St. 
Muclleater,Ky. ZIIWWteSt. 
llc:ltee,K)'. WaterS&. 
.._...,.,Ky. %11E.Mala8t. 
1e. Wffi!am..., Ky. U.8.111 
Aalud, Xy. 141t Wlllclleater AYe. 

OR 
a-Offlee 117 z.d NaUoul 

lluk Bide., Aalalud, Xy. 
PboM3ZI-'7111 

"He said that he had cut over six 
thousand acres of virgin timber in six 
mountain counties in Eastern Kentucky. He 
reached his high point in the loggin' 
business in 1915. It was at this time that he 
built his logging camp on Mill Creek in 
Knott County. It consisted of a bwtkhouse 
for single men, a kitchen and a dining shed. 
He built stalls for eight mules and 26 oxen. 
It was here that A. 0. Stanley, the suc­
cessful candidate for governor of Ken­
tucky, made a visit to Doug's shanty and 
spent the night with him. He arrived on 
horseback from Hazard. He ate the same 
food as the sawloggers and slept in one of 
their bunks. The next morning Doug 
replenished his saddlebags with an ample 
supply of drinking liquor and sent him on 
his way to Prestonsburg on a mule. It was 
on this mule that a photograph was taken of 
Stanley and widely circulated throughout 
the state." 

Mr. Trout closes his account of Doug's 
timber-slashing activities with these words 
as only he could write them: "But age has 
slowed Doug Hays down at last. He walks 
through the valley of failing lights, and the 
mowttains around him stand stripped of the 
hardwood giants that once were their glory 
and strength." 

Since the senator was not only my 
nearest neighbor but the best personal 
friend I have had over the years, I would 
like to tell soma thing about him that has not 
yet appeared in print. 

During his second term as state senator 
another neighbor, Milton Stumbo, 
represented Floyd County in the General 
Assembly. He and Doug traveled to and 
from Frankfort together. It was a cold 
wintry Sunday and snow began to fall at 
noon. They left for Frankfort early before 
the snow blanketed the highway. 

All went well till they rounded the curve 
in the little town of Frenchburg in Menifee 
County. After they had passed through the 
town, they were surprised to hear the siren 
from a police car blowing for them to pull 
over to the curb. It was a state trooper who 
told them he was placing them under arrest 
for speeding. He took them before the 
county judge. 

The judge turned to the trooper and asked 
what the charges were. The trooper replied 
that they were making fifty miles an hour 
in a twenty five mile speed zone. The judge 
said that the fine would be $21.00. He began 
to give them a lecture on observing the law. 
Before the judge had spoken a half dozen 
words the senator stopped him: "Hold it 
judge and let me talk. In the first place we 
broke no law; we don't break the laws, we 
make them.! am a senator and my friend is 
a representative. We represent Floyd 
County in the General Assembly in Frank­
fort. "If you know any law at all-which I 

Everyday 

Low 
Price! 

(EXCEPT AS NOTED) 

STORE HOURS: 
A.M. DAILY 9 P.M. 

SUNDAY'S 

11 A.M.-7 P.M. 

REG. $1.19 ROUIDS-7S's - - - - - - - - - SPECIAl - 69~ 

OPTO-SPECS SUNGLASSES - - - - - - - - - - - Y2 PRICE! 

REG. 13.69--IOO's 

GAYISCON 
FOAM TAB 

$2.74 
WIL-CAR 

PANTY HOSE 
One size fits all 

SPECIAL 49t 

$1.34 

REGli.AR OR Sl'PER 

Reg. 
11.93 $1.48 

Reg. $1.59 

ADORN 
HAIR SPRAY 

REG. OR HARD TO HOLD 
.6·0z. plus :!-Oz. Free: 

99 

16-0z. Size 

1.66 
Reg. 11.89--12-0z. 

JOHNSON'S 

NO MORE 

TANGLES 
Spray on Creme Rinse 

30's 

10 PACK 

VEL DOWN 
2-PLY 

BATHROO)I TISSUE 
SPECIAL Ql'ALITY 

99 

Reg. 83c-260's 

Reg. 12.0~24-0z. 

40's 

REGULAR 
OR 

SUPER 

31C 
KLEENEX 

FAMILY 

NAPKINS 
140's 

43C 

doubt-you must know that the Constitution 
of Kentucky says that no member of the 
legislature can be arrested on his way to 
and from the legislature while it is in 
session." 

As they continued to argue back and 
forth, a senator from the judge's district 
came into the room. He spoke to Doug and 
asked what the trouble was. He told the 
judge that Senator Hays was right and that 
he had better dismiss the charges. He did 
so. Doug told him that he was going to sue 
Menifee County for a million dollars. The 
judge replied that Menifee County was not 
worth a million dollars. Doug said, "I'll sell 
this WP A courthouse right out from under 
you.'' After he had finished with the judge, 
he turned to the state trooper. 

He said, "Now, son, if you have got a 
suitcase you had better start packing it for 
just as soon as I get to Frankfort I am going 
straight to the governor and have you 
fired." 

Doug was elected Democrat caucus 
chairman of the senate for two successive 
terms. To show their esteem for a fellow 
member, the senators presented him with a 
watch with a solid gold hunting case. It may 
be seen today on display in the museum in 
the old capitol building at Frankfort. It has 
been said, and I agree, that Doug Hays 
could call more people by their first names 
than any man in Eastern Kentucky. 

During the early fifties the assistant 
principal of the McDowell School and I 
spent a week in Frankfort representing the 
Floyd County Board of Education at a 
citizenship conference conducted by 
Columbia University. We took a straw poli 
of the restaurants in Frankfort. Without 
exception the proprietor in each place said 
that the senator was a special friend of his. 
We were staying at the Southern Hotel and I 
asked the headwaiter, John, if he knew 
Doug Hays. He said, "I guess I know him 
better than anyone in Frankfort. When he 
came in here for breakfast, a waiter would 
hand him a menu. He would throw it aside 
and call for me. He would always say, 
"John go in there and have them fix my 
breakfast. I always knew what to have 
fixed for him." 

During Governor Chandler's second term 
there was much controversey over the 
budget. Chandler, as had all governors 
before him, had promised no new taxes. 
Several senators, including Senator Hays, 
had voiced strong opposition. As it neared 
the voting stage, it looked as though Doug's 
vote would be the deciding factor. The 
superintendents were alarmed. It would be 
disastrous for the schools if the budget was 
defeated. I accompanied the superin­
tendent and the assistant superintendent 
from Floyd County to Frankfort to Frank­
fort to urge Doug to vote for it. 

Three of us went to his room at the 
Capitol Hotel and talked with him about the 
matter. He would not commit himself and 
gave us no assurance that he would vote for 
the budget. The following morning we 
visited the state superintendent, Dr. Robert 
Martin, and told him of our conference with 
the senator. He suggested that I go alone 
and urge him to vote with the school people. 

He was still in bed when I went to his 
room. I never mentioned his voting for the 
budget but instead I asked if there was any 
message he wished to send his family when 
I returned home. As I turned to leave he 
said, "Wait a minute. I don't mind telling 
you I am going to vote for the budget but 
don't you tell anybody as I intend to hold 
their feet to the fire until the last minute." I 
won't tell a soul," I lied as I hurried back to 
deliver the good news. 

REWARD 
A reward is offered for information 

leading to the arrest and convinction of the 
person or persons, male or female, who 
stole the American Flag from my front 
porch. 

Thank God, they left the Christian Flag. 
Does anyone have an American flag to 

loan me until I get another? I'm still 100 
percent Christian, American and Cherokee 
Indian-and proud as I can be of all three. 

LOUCILLE MONTGOMERY 
(A character witness for Jesus> 

22 E. Burchett St., Prestonsburg, Ky. 

LIGHTWEIGHT 
EASY TO HANDLE 
REMINGTON 
CHAIN SAW 
MODEL SL-9 

$15995 
S16915 with roller note guide bot 

Cut Trees Up To 30" Thlc:k 
9 lbs.• Light 

This Remington Chain Saw has 
a powerful 46 cc displacement 
engine that delivers more pow­
er per pound than many larger 
chain saws. And it's backed by 
an exclusive 2-year warranty. 
Insist on a Remington Sl-9 
Chain Saw. 

•len bar and chain 

Remington Chain Saw 
prlc:es start at $129.95 

SANDY VALLEY 
HARDWARE 

Phone ~SSjJT Allen, 
874-9150 Ky. 

All advertisements bearing the S. & 
T. emblem will be honored at Sandv 
Valle.v Hardware. . 

e •• Where you'll find ALL those i 
needs for your spring cleaning! Soap 

polishes, waxes, brooms, dust mops 
possible prices! Shop PIG G l Y WIG 

GREEN GIANT 
WHOLE KERNEL 

OR 17-0z. GOLDEN CORN _ _ _ CREAM STYLE - - 5 Cans $1 
GREEN GIANT KITCHEN SLICED 

17-0z. GREEN BEANS_ ___ ..... ._.-.- ..... 4 Cans $1 
ORE IDA FROZEN CRINKLE CUT 

GOLDEN FRIES_ _ _______ 4 16-0z. 

Packs $1 
BIRDSEYE 

CORN ON THE COB_ - - .. ,.. ., 

STOKELY 

2 4-Ear 

Packs $1 
FRUIT COCKTAIL _____ 3 17-0z. 

(GJ!s 89~ 
PAL 

PEANUT BUnER 
KRAFT PARKAY 

MARGARINE 
BORDEN'S 

INSTANT COFFEE 
SMUCKER'S FRESH PACK 

KOSHER DILLS_ 
BORDEN'S DUTCH 

2%-lb. 

Jar 

3 
.89~ 

1-lb. 
Packs $1 

8-01. 
Jar $1.19 

32-0z. 
Jar 59~ 

79~ CHOCOLATE DRINK MIX 2-lb. 
Box 

ROYAL PUDDING & 

PIE FILLING 
Just Wonderful 

HAIR SPRAY 
49C 13-0z. Can 

A 99e Value 

CAMPBELL'S 
CHICKEN NOODLE 

SOUP 
7 IU~2-0z. $1 < ans 

$1 7 6-0z. 
Boxes 

5 Flavors 

DIAL 
ANTI-PER. 

DEODORANT 
69C 6-01. Ca1 

A $1.09 Value 

SUNSET GOLD 
HAMBURGER 
OR HOT DOG BUNS 
4 10-0z. Packs 

C8Packl $1 

B 
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portant cleaning 
detergents, 
nd at lowest 
V for the best! 
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FOOD STAMP 
SHOPPERS 
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WHOLE 
2 ORMORE 

PER BAG WHOLE 

~LA<K BEAUTY 6-TIE CAMOCO 

BROOM _ _ _ $1.49 TWINE MOP_ .. _ "·0 •· 79~ lb. 
CHIFFON LEMON BRILLO 

DETERGENT 3;:;~~$1 SOAP PADS ____ 3 ~:::: $1 

"LEAN"ER __ ·~~:· 49~ PASNiiGOCLEANER ·~~: S1.39 SLICEDR'SiTAcoN 
EENEX 
APER TOWELS __ ------- 3 J~:~L~ $1 2 :"~~:~~:~~~ $1.79 

BUNKER HILL 

HOT DOG SAUCE 
S 10%-0z. $1 

Cans 

MORTON HOUSE 

CHILl with BEANS . 
: PIGGL Y WIGGLY 

3 15-0z. $1 
Cans 

:·.GRADE "A" LARGE 

. EGGS 
DUKE'S 

') DOZEN S9C: VEGETABLE OIL 
~~~~~~ 99~ 

FOR A SPRINGTIME TREAT 
STRAWBERRY SHORTCAKE 

BIRDSEYE WHOLE 

SWIFT'S PREMIUM 

ALL BEEF FRANKS 
12-0z. 69~ 

Package ~ 

TASTE-0-SEA 
SHRIMP SCAMPI LEMON SOLE IN BUTTER 

7%-0z 89C: 10-0z. 69C: Packag~ Package 

MARTHA WHITE 

FLOUR 
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PACKED SINGLY 

lb. 

CUT UP 
PAN READY 

lb. 

VALLEYDALE 
SMOKED 

PICNICS 
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NEW, RED 

POTATOES 
s ::~ S9C: 

ALPO STRAWBERRIES _ ~~-~·· _ 49~ MEAL MIX 
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PORK'N BEAN 
8 16-0 z. $1 

Cans 
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Clark's First Book Fair a Success 

Children peruse books at Clark school during recent book fair. 

The Clark elementary school has just 
completed its first book fair for children. 
Approximately 400 titles, ranging from pre­
school to high sclioollevels, were on display 
in the library for children to explore, and to 
make their own selections. 

Mrs. Louise Howard, librarian, said that 
at least 300 students purchased ap­
proximately 670 books, and 111 books were 
also added to the library for school use by 
all students. 

The most popular of the books displayed 
were those which· consisted of moving 
activities which the child could operate on 
the pages, but the most popular books 
p1,.1rchased were ghost stories for middle 
and upper grade children, and the old 
favorite fairy tales for the younger 
children. Books about sports were also 
favorites. Books purchased should arrive in 
about three weeks, she said. 

Assisting Mrs. Howard with the fair were 
Pauline Hicks, the Right to Read coor­
dinator at the school, and volunteer P. T. A. 
members, Carol Rice, Marlene Coleman 
and Alma Dillon. 

One of the most encouraging aspects of 
the fair according to John K. Pitts, school 
principal, was the fact that many parents 
became involved with their children in 
making book selections. Several books 
were purchased by parents to be read aloud 
to their children who are still too young to 
attend school. 

"This is the type of community support 
and attitude we are trying to build, and we 
hope it continues," Mr. Pitts said. 

As a follow-up on the book fair, the school 
hopes to initiate the "Reading is Fu­
damental" program to complement the 
Right to Read activities now in progress. 

Highland Ambulance 
Service, Inc. 
Betsy Layne, Ky. 

PhOM 478·5252 

Phone 478-5252 

Phone 478-5252 

Charles E. (Bob) Conn 
Owner-Operator 

This is a program of community in· 
volvement, and provides an opportunity for 
s'ervice clubs, unions, or fraternal 
organizations of the area to become in­
volved in an educational project of national 
scope. The general idea of the project is to 
give free books to children rather than have 
them make purchase. 

Mr. Pitts said he or another school staff 
member will be glad to explain the 
program to any organization that expresses 
interest in assisting. Information may also 
be obtained by visiting or calling the school. 

Hammond Discusses 
"Crime Prevention" 

Jim Hammond, Prestonsburg attorney 
and administrative trustee for the 31st 
Judicial District Public Defender Cor­
poration, appeared as guest-speaker at the 
Feb. 19 meeting of the Lackey-Garrett­
Wayland Woman's Club. His subject was 
"Crime Prevention." 

Mr. Hammond said that the rate of crime 
in Floyd County is increasing. He stressed 
the point that public policies must be made 
to protect both sides of the crime. He ex­
plained that the Bi.g Sandy Crime Com­
mission .Council, which is composed of 
public citizens, with funds provided by the 
state. Mr. Hammond said it is important to 
attempt to keep the crime from happening 
and know what to do if the crime is com­
mitted. 

During the business session following the 
program, Mrs. S. M. Martin, club 
president, read a letter concerning the 
"Heritage" plates to be sold by women's 
clubs across the nation. Mrs. Pat Duff will 
be in charge of sales for the Wayland club. 

A nominating committee for club officers 
for the coming year was selected as 
follows: Mrs. Bill Castle, Mrs. Katherine 
Hughes, Mrs. Nancy Tackett, Mrs. Marie 
Mullins, and Mrs. Joyce Stevens. 

As their annual Valentine gift, club­
members baked and sent 12 dozen cupcakes 
to the Golden Rest Home, Lackey. 

Members from the Wayland Club will be 
guests of the Wheelwright Woman's Club at 
a dinner in March. 

The February meeting was held at the 
home of Mrs. Dora Reed, Wayland, with 
Mrs. Olga Trusty as program leader. 

Those present were Mrs. Bobby Joe 
Castle, Mrs. Earl Castle, Mrs. Felix 
Coburn, Mrs. Birchell Duff, Mrs. Arville 
Duff, Mrs. Don Hughes, Mrs. Charles 
Hughes, Mrs. S. M. Martin, Mrs. Eugene 
Mullins, Mrs. John Reed, Mrs. Rudolph 
Spencer, Mrs. J. T. Spillman, Mrs. Jack 
Stevens, Mrs. Milton Trusty, and Mrs. 
Floyd Tackett, members, and Mr. Ham­
mond, guest. 

-
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HARDWARE Phone 874-9150 
Allen, Ky. 

AN AUTHORIZED PREVIEW DEALER 

FOR STANLEY TOOLS 

STANLEY 
"' 

NEW! 

STANLEY 

SCREWSTART™ 
Locate and start screws ... for 
auto and home repairs ... use 
magnet for picking up screws 
and small metal parts. 

For Slotted Screws 

No. &8·159 1B" 

NEW! 

For Phillips Screws 

No. &~·"5 8" 

No. 85-159 18" 

STANLEY 

CENTER SQUARE 
A Tool of Many Uses! 

Use as a square, protractor .. . and for 
locating center of circles easily. 

ND. 46·101 $0.00 

helps you do things right 
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PELPHREY'S 
Pelphrey's TOMATOES are the rinest for flavor and 
quality of any store's in this area. Through a special 
process, Pelphrey's ripen their own tomatoes -and 
the result: a more flavorful tomato that even in the 
coldest season, has a juicy, summer-fresh garden 
taste. Pick up a basket today. 

STEREO TAPES 
Factory Artlsts and labels. 

$5.79 
PORKCHOPS_- - - - -
BANANAS-
LETTUCE- -
MILK __ -
PEACHES_ -
GRAHAM CRACKERS -
FROZEN PIZZA 

Coal Trucks 
Denied Appeal 

Frankfort, Ky. <AP)-Even before op­
ponents could give their side of the case, the 
Court of Appeals last Friday dismissed a 
motion seeking to allow overweight coal 
trucks to resume operation in Pulaski 
county. 

The high court dismissed the motion 
brought by John Mandt, attorney for the 
coal haulers, seeking to dissolve a Pulaski 
circuit court injunction barring the over­
weight trucks from three roads in the 
county. · 

"All your clients have been enjoined from 
doing in this case is the breaking of the law, 
isn't it?" Chief Justice John Palmore asked 
Mandt. 

"The only reason your clients could have 
for dissolving this injunction is that they 
intend to violate the law," Palmore con­
tinued. "That issue is so clear to this court 
that you are just wasting our time." 

The court then dismissed Mandt's motion 
even before opposing arguments could be 
made by Asst. Atty. Gen. David Short, who 
had obtained the injunction for the State 
Highway and Motor Transportation 
Departments. 

Mandt had claimed that complying with 
the weight limits set for the three roads in 
question-U. S. 'l:l, Ky. so and Ky. 1675-
would put the coal haulers out of business. 

The same big trucks have been using 
those roads for 15 years, Mandt argued and 
it would make little difference to allow the 
trucks to continue to operate until the case 
comes to trial on its merits. 

GOOD 

lb. 79c 
lb. lOc 

head 19c 
- -gal. $1.00 

_ 3 cans $1.00 
$1.00 

79c 

CATSUP- - - _ - - - · - 3forS1.00 
FLOUR - - - - 25-lb. bag $1.99 
PRINGLE POTATO CHIPS _ _ _ - _ - 59c 
BR EAO _ _ _ _ _ S loaves $1.00 
COKE, 16-0z. Bottles _ - - - - ctn. 79c 

Get your Hawaiian Tropic Sun Tan Lotion 

RETIRED OR 
DISABLED? 

Here's the 
opportunity 
of a lifetime! 

and Oil at Jerry's. 

A new life awaits you as manager of your own 
Solo Self Service Retail Business. 

Ideal for retired or disabled persons. 

A Solo operation is a combination home and business 
designed to sell gasoline in the most modern way possible. 

Our managers receive --
1. A rent free furnished mobile home. 
2. Paid utilities. 
3. A guaranteed income. 

For information on this exciting new way of life 

CALL (606) 324-4533 COLLECT 

NEWS about money. •• 
IT EARNS MORE FOR YOU 

AT FIRST NATIONAL 
Extra! Extra! See how money grows here! Deposit it faithfully in a 

Savings Account at our hank-where it will be earning the highest 

interest rates permissible by law. And how! 

OPEN A GOLDEN PASSBOOK SAVINGS ACCOUNT, TODAY. 

EARN 

ON TWO-YEAR 
GOLDEN PASSBOOk SAVINGS 

EARN 

ON ONE-YEAR 
GOLDEN PASSBOOK SAVINGS 

Deposits Insured To $20,000 by F.D.I.C. 

FIRST 
NATIONAL 

BANK 
PRESTONSBURG 

KENTUCKY 

EARN 

ON 90-DAY 
GOLDEN PASSBOOK SAVINGS 

"Where Banking 

Is A Pleasure 

• •• And There's No 

Servi[e Charge" 

TWIN BRIDGE BRANCH BANK Martin, Ky. 

l 
~ 

f ' 
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\ ' 
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EAGLE HOMES ••• A Change from the Ordinary. 

Why Not Stop By Anytime From 8 a.m. to 6 p.m., 

Seven Days a Week, and Look Around. 

HALL MARINE 
& MOBILE HOME SALES 

Located On So. Lake Drive At Entrance To Jenny Wiley State Park 

PHONE 886-2776 - PRESTONSBURG 

SPRING IS IN THE AIR 
Yes, Sir, the temperature may not be 70 degrees but the sap is rising and the 

robins are singing. Spring means two things: "Love and marriage/' and "Let's 

go fishing". Hall Marine & Mobile Homes can fix you up either way. If "Love & 

Marriage," why not get started off right with your own home. By the time your 

bride says, "I do/' we can have a beautiful new mobile home blocked up and 

leveled on your lot WITH EITHER A NEW MATCHING WASHER AND DRYER 

OR COLOR TV Set AT NO COST IN MOST MODELS. If it is "Fishing Fever/' 

then Hall's has a complete line of Evinrude motors and practically any size or 

kind of fishing boat and all the accessories, INCLUDING A NEW MATCHING 

TRAILER AT NO COST WITH MOST RIGS. 

BASSMASTER BOATS ... Unexcelled in Craftsmanship, Materials, Price. 

-- --------------- ·------------------------------------------------------------------------------·----------------------------
In Memoriam 

In memory of my husband, Charlie D. 
Childers, who passed away three years ago, 
March 22, 1970: 

He is gone but not forgotten by his wife, 
son, daughter and grandchildren. Our love 
still lingers on for him. 

AT BARKSDALE AFB 
SHREVEPORT, La.-staff Sgt. David 0. 

Linkous, son of Mrs. Anita G. Linkous, 
Boyce, La., has arrived for duty at 
Barksdale AFB, La. A medical service 
technician, he is assigned to a unit of the 
Strategic Air Command. He previously 
served at George AFB, Calif. 

MRS. MILLIE CHILDERS and FAMILY 
603 Simmons St. 

The sergeant is a 1959 graduate of 
Wheelwright (Ky.) high school. His wife, 
Mary, is the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Alex 
Howard, Prestonsburg, Ky. N. Judson, Ind. 46366. 

lt-pd. 

TIMES \WANT ADS GET RESULTS! 

The first federally funded school for 
training horsemen is starting classes at the 
Kentucky state hor,»e park, formerly known 
as Walnut Hall Stud Farm. ... 

REVIVAL_ SERVICES 

The Rev. A. A. frederi'k 
hangelist 

at 

United Methodist Church 
Salisbury, Ky. 

April 1 thr. April 8 
Rev. Frederick has 23 years' ex­
perience in the ministry. Every one 
is invited to hear the messages of 
this dynamic evangelist. All are 

welcomed. REV. MABRY HOLBROOK, Pastor 

SUPPLIES 
Complete Line at Korner Drug. 

WHEEL CHAIRS 
CANES, CRUTCHES 

WALKERS 
Also, For Hearing 

Problems, We Carry 

ZENITH 
HEARING 

AIDS 

KORNER DRUG STORE 

CONN-POTIER 

Mr. and Mrs. Dean Conn, of Harold, 
announce the engagement and forthcoming 
marriage of their daughter, Cathy Ann, to 
Mr. Michael Potter, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Phenis Potter, of Pikeville. 

Miss Conn is a graduate of Betsy Layne 
high school. Mr. Potter will graduate from 
Eastern Kentucky University, Richmond, 
Ky., in May and is employed by Central 
Associated Engineers, of Versailles. 

The gracious custom of open church will 
be observed when the ceremony is 
solemnized at 6:30p.m. Saturday. Aprill4, 
at Calvary Baptist Church, Betsy Layne. 
Rev. Cohen Campbell wi!J be the officiating 
minister. 

Democratic Women 
To Give Scholarship 

The Floyd County Democratic Woman's 
Club met March 14 at May Lodge. Mrs . 
Roland Burchett, president presided over 
the business meeting. After the secretary 
and treasurer's report, Mrs. Burchett read 
the list of committees for the new year. 

The scholarship committee reported that 
it will be contacting the high schools again 
this year to find a worthy student interested 
in this scholarship. Student recipients must 
be registered Democrats. Mrs. Tom G. 
Dingus was re-appointed as associate 
director of the Seventh district, and Mrs. 
Cliff Latta was appointed co-chairman of 
the Legislative committee on the board of 
the State Democratic Woman's Club by 
Ann Stephenson Bock. Next board meeting 
was set for April 14 in Frankfort. The next 
meeting of the Floyd County Democratic 
Womans Club will be held April 11 at May 
Lodge. 

Plans were made for a dinner to be held 
in April at the Plantation Motel dining room 
for the benefit of the Democratic party. 
This is planned for a Sunday. Mrs. Rose 
Collins, Mrs. Ann Latta and Mrs. Mary 
Jane Fitzpatrick are in charge of plans. 

MOTEL CAREER 
Opportunities 

for 

Met~-Women--Couples 

The expanding motel industry 
needs trained people. If you are 
dissatisfied with what you're 
doing or ambitious to improve 
your future, this may be the 
answer! 

For a local interview write to­
day siving your backsround, 
complete address and phone 
number. 

MOTEL TRAININC 
Co. of America 

4420 Madison 
Kllnau City, Mo. 64111 

Consumers' Arbitration Panel Is a ''First" 
Frankfort, Ky.-state Attorney General 

Ed W. Hancock has said that to his 
knowledge Kentucky is the first state to 
create a Consumers' Arbitration Panel 
under the Attorney General's office. 

According to Hancock, when a consumer 
complaint is registered with the Division of 
Consumer Protection and reaches a point 
where it cannot be settled through 
mediation by his office, the Division con· 
tacts both the businessman and the con· 
sumer and suggests oltmtarl arbitration. 
If both parties sign an arbitration 
agreement, a panel is appointed to conduct 
th arbitration. 

The panel consists of one businessman, 
one member of the general public and one 
member of the Consumer' Advisory 
Council. Hancock added that prior to the 
actual arbitration meeting, both parties 
must sign agreements to abide by the 
decision of the arbitration panel. The 
decision. when reached by the panel, will be 
given to the parties involved, within 30 
days. 

Hancock explained that some matters, 
those which may involve litigation by the 
Division of Consumer Protection under 
provisions of the Consumer Fraud Law, 
will not be heard by the Arbitration Panel. 

PHONE 886-6900 Second Floor 
Montgomery Ward Building 

BASSETT 

BEDROOM 
SUITES 

Bed, Dresser, Chest 
Save $100.00 

524995 

Solid Oak or Pecan 

BEDROOM 
SUITES 
No plastic. 

SAVE 

s2oooo 

CARD OF THANKS 
We, the family of Alfored Tackett, would 

like to thank our friends and neighbors who 
helped in any way upon the passing of our 
father and brother. Those who sent flowers 
and brought food will never be forgotton, 
especially the minister, Benny Blanken· 
ship, and the choir, and the Dale Marion 
family and staff for their kindness and help. 

His children and brothers, his sister 
Virginia Reynolds 

Thanks to all 
THE FAMILY 

PRESTONSBURG 

Solid Maple, Pine 
or Oak 

ALL NEtt CLEAN MERCHANDISE. SATISFACTION GUARANTEED. 
• FINANCING AVAILABLE. • FREE DELIVERY. 

SOFA 
BEDS 
$5995 

LIVING ROOM 
SUITE 

Beautiful. 

524988 

MAPLE 

BOSTON ROCKER 

$2988 

Black Spanish 

LIVING ROOM 
Hurry! SUITE 

529988 

STEREO 
AM-FM Radio, 

Tape Player 

L CHECK OUR SPECIALS ON MATTRESSES AND BOX SPRINGS! I 
BUNK BEDS •••• $99.00 MAPLE HUTCH •• $149.95 
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GET YOUR FREE GIFT WITH ANY PURCHASE OF FURNITURE, BEDDING, APPLIANCES 
ONLY AT ARROWOOD'S DO YOU GET SALE PRICES PLUS A BIG, FREE GIFT! 

••• 

Buy Buy Buy Buy Buy Buy Buy Buy 

LIVING ROOM LIVING ROOM BEDROOM SUITES BEDROOM BEDROOM SOLID MAPLE 
SEALY MATTRESS Refrigerator, Electric 

SUITES & BOX SUITES Up to SUITES SUITES SPRINGS 
Range, Gas Range, 

From DINING ROOM Freezer, Washer 
Up to Retail 

$24995 s 29995 - 569995 S18800 $)9900· s 288 00 S32995. S750 oo . FURNITURE S49 - SS9 - S69 or Dryer. 
Each YOURS FREE: 

YOUR CHOICE, FREE: :\'arne Brand Steam Iron, 
YOUR CHOICE. FREE: 3-Pc. Set Early American YOURS FREE: YOURS FREE: YOURS FREE: Bt.:Y THE PAIR, :-.:a me Brand A!\1-FM 

Table or $49.95 - 9xl2 YOURS FREE: $11.99 Bed Spread and 2 Famous Seal:y $49.95 32-Piece Set Blue Willow YOURS FREE: Radio. Choice depends on 3-Piece Table Group or 2 
Decorator Lamps. Braided Rug. $11.99 Bed Spread. Matching Bed Pillows. Innerspring Mattress. Dinner Ware. Good ;\lattress Pad. Purchase. 

Special Close-Qut Prices On 
2-Piece Living Room Suites ••• 

No More At these Prices. 
2·PIECE 

LIVING ROOM SUITE 
Long Sofa, Matching Chair. Good 
Grade Fabric in Olive or Russett. 

Regular $299.95 

Sale $18977 
2-PIECE 

LIVING ROOM SUITE 
3-Cushlon Sofa and Chair. Choice 
Colon: Olive, Gold, Russett. 

While 8 Suites Last. 

Only $17699 
7·PIECE EARLY AMERICAN 
LIVING ROOM GROUP 
Wing Back Sofa and Chair, Gold 
and Green Fabric. 3-Piece Maple 
Table Group, Two Decorator 
Lamps. Regular $369.95 

Sa!e $24977 
Prtce 

2-PIECE SEALY 

SOFA BED SUITE 
Regular $299.95 

~OFF 100.00 

A Steal ~.19995 
3-PIECE 

TABLE GROUP 
Maple Finish 

One Maple Cocktail Table 
Two Maple Step Tables 

Only $2988 

3-PIECE 

TABLE GROUP 
Pecan or Walnut Finish. 

$1 4 99 Per Group 

3-PIECE SPANISH 

LIVING ROOM GROUP 
Sofa, Rocker Chair. 

Regular S599.95 

Sole $48899 
2-PIECE EARLY AMERICAN 

LIVING ROOM SUITE 
Brown Tweed. One Suite to Sell. 

Regular 5699.95 

V2 off $35QOO 

RECLINERS 
Choice of Colors 

2·Piece Bassett Early American 

LIVING ROOM SUITE 
From one of our better Suppliers. 
Choice of Floral Prints or 
Tweeds. 

Regular $499.95 

Now $36977 
ONE GROUP- 2-PIECE 

LIVING ROOM SUITES 
1/3 off 

ONE GROUP-2-PIECE 

Y2 off 
MAPLE 

BOSTON ROCKER 
12 to Sell. 

Only $2800 
Regular $39.95 

9x12 CARPETS 
12 to Sell. 

Regular $49.95 

2-PIECE 
LIVING ROOM SUITES 

Italian Provincial 

Regular $499.95 

~OFF 133.32 

$36663 

2-PIECE VEL VET 

LIVING ROOM SUITE 
One of Our Best Suites. 

Regular $899.95 

ODD CHAIRS 
One Group to Choose From. 

• pr1ce 
12-Piece 

Living Room Group 
3-Pc. Sofa, Rocker, Chair By 
Broyhill, 3-Pc. Solid Maple Table 
Group, Three Decorator Throw 
Pillows, One 28x54·1n. Picture, 
Two Decorator Lamps. 

$89995 

Discount 1 00 • 

.$79995 

SEE ARROWOOD'S THIS WEEK-TWO-WAY DEAL: 
YOU GET SALE PRICES PLUS FREE GIFT! 

Take advantage of all this quality 
at this first·time-ever reduced price! Rich 
satin cover multi-quilted through Sealyfoam®* 
Hundreds of coils. Patented extra firm foundation. 
SAVE $50 ON QUEEN SIZE! 60x80" 2-pc. set $199.95 
SAVE $60 ON KING SIZE! 76x80" 3-pc. set $299.95 

•urethane foam 

SAME FIRM INNERSPRING 
·~ FOUND ATS10T0 520MORE! 

.· . * ~· • v-$eal~ Golden Guard 
......,. 

NOW ONLY 

$59?;~ 
Get all the benef1ts of 
firm Sealy support for 

far less than you'd expect. 
Hundreds of exclusive Dura-Flex 

coils plus patented Dura·Gard founda· 
tion. Plus deep-quilted decorator cover. 

QUEEN SIZE 60x80" 2-pc. set $179.95 
KING SIZE 76x80" 3-pc. set $249.95 

"No morning backache from 
sleeping on a too-soft mattress." 

FROM sgg~; pc. 

Pay Cash and Save Still More! ~ W 
-= 

Extra Discounts­
Our Complete Stock of 

Bedroom Groups ••• 
3-PIECE 

BEDROOM SUITE 
White French Provincial, Triple 
Dresser and Mirror, Full.Size 
Bed and Chest. 

Regular $269.95 

Now $19977 
3-PIECE MAPLE 

BEDROOM SUITE 
D9uble Dresser and Mirror, Five· 
Drawer Chest, Book-Case Bed. 

Regular $199.95 

Sal~ $14977 
Pr~ce 

4-PIECE OAK 
BEDROOM SUITE 

Triple Dresser and Mirrors, 
Five-Drawer Chest, Full-Size 
Bed, Matching Night Stand. 

Regular $299.95 

Sale $24977 
3-PIECE 

BEDROOM SUITE 
Triple Dresser and Mirror, Full· 
Size Bed, Five-Drawer Chest. 

Regular $239.95 

Now $17977 
4-PIECE MAPLE 

BEDROOM SUITES 
Regular $499.95 

Save $100.00 

Sale $39977 
4-PIECE AMERICAN MAPLE 

BEDROOM SUITE 
Triple Dresser and Mirror, Large 
Chest, Drawers, Cannon Ball 
Bed, Night Stand. 

Regular $589.95 

4-PIECE BROYHILL OAK 

BEDROOM SUITE 
Triple Dresser, Twin Mirrors, 
Five-Drawer Chest, Full-Size 
Bed, Matching Night Stand. 

Regular $399.95 

~ OFF 133.30 

No More When These Are Gone. 

3·PIECE OAK 
BEDROOM SUITE 

Triple Dresser and Mirror, Door 
Chest, Head Board and Frame. 

Regular $299.95 
~ OFF 100. 

~113 $19995 
P1eces 

~~~cE BEDROOM SUITE 
One of Our Big, Good Suites. 
Triple Dresser and Mirror, Five­
Drawer Chest, Full-8ize Queen­
Size Bed, Night Stand. Reg. 
$499.95. Sale Discount $100.00. 

Now $39995 
4-PIECE BASSETT PECAN 

BEDROOM SUITE 
One of Our Top Suites. Triple 
Dresser and Mirror, Chest..On· 
Chest, Full Queen-Size Bed, 
Night Stand. Regular $899~95 

Special $59995 
Close-Out 

4-PIECE WEBB OAK 
BEDROOM SUITE 

You Will have to See this one! 
Triple Dresser and Mirror, Large 
Framed Mirror, Full-8ize Bed, 
Matching Night Stand. 

Special $46977 Special $49977 
Close-Out Close Out 

4-PIECE BASSETT 4-PIECE WEBB MAPLE 
BEDROOM SUITE BEDROOM SUITE 

White French Provincial. Triple 
Dresser and Mirror, Canopy Bed, 
Five Drawer Chest, Night Stand. 

Regular 5599.95 

4-PIECE BASSETT 

BEDROOM SUITE 
Slight Damages. 

One of Our Big Suites! 
Come and See this. Triple 
Dresser and Mirror, Full­
Size Bed. Five-Drawer 
Chest, Night Stand. 

Regular s675 

Special Close-Out 

A Fine, Big :\iaple Bed Room 
Suite. Built to Last Years and 
Years. 

Regular $499.95 

4-PIECE BEDROOM SUITE 
OAK 

Slight Damages. 
Triple Dresser and Mirror, Full­
Size Bed, Chest-On-Chest, 
Matching ~ight Stand. 

Special Price Regular $589.95 

Da~;ges $3 8 9 77 
SEALY 

MATTRESS AND 
BOX SPRINGS 

Just Unloaded Solid Trailer Load-

147 Pieres 

Special $ 4· 995 
Group 
Compare at $69.95 Each Each 

{ 
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Kentucky residents who are, or were, in a 

' 'missing status" as a result of the Vietnam 
conflict will be excluded from gross income 
subject to Kentucky Income Tax, according 
to an executive order issued by Gov. 
Wendell Ford. "The sacrifices these in­
dividuals have made and the burdens 
imposed upon their families will never be 
fully compensated. Certainly it is only 
proper that state government respond in 
whatever way it can to those who have 
served so well," Ford said. 

CATTLE AND 
LIVESTOCK 

BUYERS 
WE NEED MEN 
IN THIS AREA. 

Train to buy cattle, 
sheep and hogs. 

We will train QUalified men with some 
livestock experience. For local 
intmiew. writs today including 
complete background, address, 
and phone number. 

WESTERN MEAT PACKERS 
TRAJNING, INC. 

4318Wlodcock, San Antooo, Texas 78228 

Praf'tice Session To 
P recede Rook Tourne) 

Jenny Wiley State Park's annual Rook 
Tournament, to be held Saturday, March 
24, will be preceded Thursday evening by a 
practice session at May Lodge. To be held 
at 7 p.m., the practice session will allow 
participants to become familiar with 
tournament rules and regulations. 

Registration for the tournament itself 
will begin Saturday morning at 9 a.m. until 
11:30 a.m. and play will get underway at 12 
noon at the lodge. Winners will receive 
$25.00 Savings Bonds and runners-up will be 
given Parkers Brothers Games. Both 
winners and runners-up can advance to the 
state Rook TournainE\nt at ·cumberland 
State Park. 

Anyone with questions or those who wish 
to register early should contact Ted Hall, 
Recreation Director, Jenny Wiley State 
Park, 886-2711, Est. 269. 

Charles Pryor, Jr. has been named 
secretary of the cabinet and commissioner 
of finance and administration, replacing 
Donald Bradshaw. Pryor had served as 
Commissioner of Highways for the past 15 
months. He is a native of McCracken 
County, a graduate of Murray State 
University and a former mayor of Sturgis, 
Union County. Bradshaw resigned to return 
to Dupree and Company, Lexington . 

HOT WATER HEAT 
WITHOUT PLUMBING 
Th~ Finest Dimension Yet Achieved in Home Heating. 

NO WAT•"~ T O PUT IM 0" DRAt H 01'11 

Who's Who Students at PU: 

These Prestonsburg Community College students have been selected to appear in 
the 1972-'73 edition of "Who's Who in American Junior Colleges." 

The students are, from left, seated-Regena Cowan, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Glendon Cowan, Prestonsburg; Patsy Sue Laferty, daughter of Mr. and Mrs . An­
derson Laferty, Prestonsburg; Sandy Combs, wife of Jerry Combs, Prestonsburg; 
Dara Fumagalli, David. Standing-Rodney Handshoe, son of Mr. and Mrs . Sammie 
Handshoe, Hueysville; Rickey E. Music, son of Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Music, East 
Point; Freda Williams, wife of James W. Williams, Staffordsville; Betty Carol 
Johnson, Prestonsburg; Duell L. Sturgill, son of Mr. and Mrs. Robert Sturgill , Flat 
Gap; Ralph Jackson, son of Mr. and Mrs. Esknovah Jackson, Salyersville. <Absent : 
Genevieve Hamilton, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Virgil Hamilton, Pikeville.) 

To be selected for this elite group, students are chosen on the basis of their 
scholarship, citizenship, participation and leadership in academic and extra­
curricular activities, plus their potential usefulness to business and society. 

McDowell 
Hospital Notes 

Patients Discharged 
(:\larch 5 through March II ) 

Viola B. Branham, Wayland ; Stephen A. 
Amburgey, Langley; Charlie Shelton, 
Drift , Jay Johnson, Melvin; John A. Cate, 
Teaberry : :\Iary Johnson, Hi Hat ; Sonja L. 
Tackett , Halo; Billy J. Tackett, McDowell; 
Josie Slone, Bevinsville; Nokomis Moore, 
Hi Hat; Janice Hopkins, East McDowell ; 
Daisy Collins, Price ; Betty Slone, Top­
most; Ora Caudill, Estill; Gregory Hall, 
Raven ; Elizabeth Madison, Printer ; 
William Patton, Eastern : Linda Branham, 
Wheelwright : Willa Newsome, East Mc­
Dowell; Lenvil D. Ousley, Risner ; Sandra 
Hall , Melvin ; Anthony Ratliff, Eastern ; 
Clifford Slone , Bypro ; Beckie Hall , 
Galveston ; Hobert Moore, Orkney ; Vallis 
Chaffins. Bypro; Albert Cole, Hunter ; 
Florence Boggs,Langley : Finley Boshears, 
Wheelwright ; Hattie Johnson, Weeksbury ; 
Priscilla Compton , Weeksbury ; Dora 
Mullins, Weeksbury; Daniel Robinson, 
Langley ; Rena Hall , Grethel , Richard 
Hurt , Weeksbury ; Bobby Case, McDowell , 
Ella Newsome, Teaberry ; Ecie 
Nunemaker, Martin: Robert Hall, 
Robinson Creek ; Linda Mullins, Drift ; 
Annette Tackett , McDowell ; William 
Caudill, Melvin ; Leonard Sexton , Garrett ; 
Eugene Ousley, Risner; Barbara Owsley, 
McDowell; Kathleen Vance, Ligon ; James 
Williams, Halo ; Irene Gayheart, East 
McDowell . 

BIRTHS 
A daughter to Mr. and Mrs. Bobby D. 

Owsley, of McDowell, March 8. 

UMW Suit Names 
Board Members 

The United Mine Workers of America has 
filed a $10 million lawsuit against 10 former 
members of its International Executive 
Board <IEB l, 

The UMW charges that between January 
1, 1963 and December 22, 1972 the former 
board members permitted "wholesale 
looting of the union treasury. " The union 
seeks to recover " millions of dollars of 
union funds which were misused or 
misappropriated" by its former officers 
with the approval of the IEB. 

The suit is a counterclaim to a suit filed 
February 14, 1973 against the U.\IW by the 
10 former IEB members in which they seek 
reinstatement to the positions from which 
they were removed December 22, 1972 and 
$5,000 each punitive damages. 

The 10 former IEB members named in 
the UMW suit and their salaries and ex­
penses for 1972 were listed as : Louis Austin, 
District 23 (Ky.), $33,692.18; Michael 
DeGretto, District 2 (Pa .)~ $31,552.78; 
Bruno Olmizzi , District 3 (Pa .), $27,546.03 ; 
James Kelly , District 4 <Pa .l, $28,388.95; 
Wilbert Killion, Dis trict 11 lind .), 
$29,548.71 ; James Ridings, District 19 <Ky., 
Tenn.) , $24,552.41 ; Donald Lawley, District 
21 <Arkansas , Oklahoma ;, $27 ,826.95; 
Frank Stevenson, Dist rict 22 (Arizona, 
Utah ), $17,435.42 : Emmett Thomas , 
District 25 <Pa.), $28,727.72 ; Cecil Ur ­
baniak. District 31 <W. Va .l. $29.274.01. 

RETURN FROM FLORIDA 
Dr. and Mrs. Edward B. Leslie have 

returned home from a visit with Mr. and 
Mrs. Bob Francis in Sarasota, Florida . 

ALLEN NEWS 
The March meeting of the Allen Woman's 

Club was held at the ~orne of Mrs. Lois 
Marshall. The guest-speaker was State 
Trooper Rodney Hutchinson, who spoke on 
highway accidents, their causes and means 
of prevention. He also explained the new 
road signs. A question-apd-answer period 
followed. 

MAn AG SELL-A- AMA 
No uUier libtiJIIIYitem OD the market today doa quite u ID.Ilda f« the 

...._ eavlroameat u bot water eledrtc beat. It mot oaly beats the bome wHb 
a1011Deu that provides uparalleled comfort, bat lt provtdea true beDefttiiD 
llealtlfaJDeq, clfJ.IniiDea• ud ufety 11 well • • • • And, at aa IUIIIUl 
operatllll C»>t .that II comparable to other fuell. Sl.ter aad aHrtcdve 
buebou'd IIIIIU are avaflable iD ~aritlu leqtbl to bleet every ~­
~ 

The president, Delores Smith, opened the 
business meeting with a poem and plans for 
the installation of the officers for the 
coming year. The new officers are Sue 
Frost, president ; Shelby Shumate, vice­
president; Belle Conn, secretary, and Janet 
Lester, treasurer. 

For More lnform•tion, See: 

ELMER RICE, PHONE 874-2295, BANNER, KY. A dinner is planned for April 14 in the 
Allen school lunchroom, proceeds to go to 
the Allen Fire Department. Tickets will go 
on sale in a few days. 

SPRING 
DANCE 

AT 

Refreshments were served, buffet style, 
to the following members by the hostess: 
Delores Smith, Nancy Marcum, Bonita 
Porter, Vicky Boyd, Janet Lester, Sue 
Frost, Shelby Shumate, Belle Conn, Jo Ann 
Adams, and Jerry Martin . 

Sp-6 and Mrs. Oscar Lee Hyden have 
been visiting her mother, Mrs. Josephine 
Hill Hall, after their return from Okinawa. 

PRESTONSBURG COMMUNITY 
COLLEGE 

Mrs. Karen Thacker and son, Dennis 
Charles, are visiting relatives in Michigan. 
She will soon join her husband, Sp-5 Homer 
J . Thacker, Jr., in Frankfort, Germany, 
where he was assigned after his second 
enlistment. He is a grandson of Mrs. 
Josephine Hill Hall. 

Gas §ystem Okehed., 
Rate Hike Denied FEATURING 

"COPPERFIELD" 
Mountain Investment Inc. has been of­

ficially authorized by the Public Service 
Commission to operate a gas system at 
Wheelwright and surrounding areas. 

FROM LOUISVILLE 

MARCH 24, 1973 
9-00 P.M. - 1-00 A.M. 

In the same order, the PSC denied the 
corporation's request for a gas rate in­
crease above the rates approved by the 
commission on Sept. 1, 1972. 

A purchase adjustment clause was made 
a part of the order for future use by the 
company. 

Mountain Investment buys its gas from 
Kentucky West Virginia Gas and the 

~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~.~H~a~r~v~ey_D __ eve_lo_p~e_n_t _Co __ m_p_a_n_y_. _______ , 
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The closer you look, 
the better we look. 

otd GaiQXIe 500 

• 

~· .... -
Ford Gataxie 500 2-Door Hardtop 

With happy stondrud features: 
• 351-cu. in. 2V V-8 Engine • SelectShlft Crulse-0-Malic 
• Power Steering • Power Front Disc Brakes 
• Wiper-Mounted Wa1her Jets • Power Ventilation 
• Bias Belled Tire~ • Plus many more 

make~ happy buy on~ Galaxle 500 today. 
Take a c loser look at the Gataxie 500 now. 
Road Test magazine named it "Car of 
the Year." See the Galaxie 500 and see how 
much more car you get. Lots of new styling, 
features, options and comfort. Select from 
three models- the 2-door and 4-door hardtops 

and the 4-door pillared hardtop. Your Ford 
Deater has a large selec tion available and 
you get immediate delivery. So make a happy 
buy on a new Gataxie 500 today. Road Test 
says it's "the finest family car to be found 
at its price in showrooms today." 

See your friendly Ford Dealer ••• 
He wants to make you happy. 

,., 
a, ly,~ 

v ~ 
• 

We're going to Sell 64 Maytag Automatic Washers and Dryers Within the Next 
10 days! Buy'em By the Pair-Washer and Dryer-Get A Reduced Price. FREE 

Steam Iron When, You Buy the Pair, During Our Maytag Washer and Dryer Sale. 

all brand-new! not used, not open stock, not floor samples! still in 

original cartons! btll' with no down payment--with established credit! 

low mor~thly budget terms! don't miss this outstanding special bu'}•! 

dependable MAYTAO ~ 
Washers· Dryers and 

Dishwashers 
Big Family-Size - Washpower8 

MA YTAG Automatic WASHERS 
• 2 peeds on most models • 3 Temps • Automatic 
water evel con~rol saves water, detergent • Power 

fm Ag:tator - aesigned for all size loads • Perman· 

e ' Press Cycle for today's modern fabncs • Lmt 
ftlter • Perforated washbasket gets dirt away from 

clean clothes • full Time Safety Lid- action stops in 
seconds when lid s opened. Adjustabte leveling legs. 

In the Laundry or in the Kitchen, who knows 
more about clean than .,..,.,..,.,. 

Low Temp- Permanent Press 

MA YTAG Halo•of•Heat~ DRYERS 
No Hot Spotsl Gertie, even heat, surrounds clothes 

• Permanent Press keeps wrmkles out, creases in • 
fone mesr I nt filter - filters 100% exhaust ai r • Full 

openong safety door - easy loading and unloading 

• Electron:c Control - automat1ca' ly shuts off when 
proner oryness has been reached (available 011 models 

606 806, 906) • 3 way venltng 

Decorator Colors Slightly Higher Than White. 

GOODI MAYTAG 

WASHER & DRYER 
Only S49777 For Both 

Pieces. 

White. Standard Tub, Single Speed, Per­
manent Press Cycle. Colors Slightly Higher. 

BETTER! MAYTAG DELUXE! MA YT AG 

Only 

WASHER AND 
DRYER 

s499 77 FORBOTH 
PIECES 

White. Standard Tub Washer, 
Two-Speed, Permanent Press 
Cycle. Dryer Has Automatic Dry 
Control. Colors Slightly Higher . 

Onlv 

WASHER AND 

DRYER 

$529 77 For Both 
Pieces 

Whitt>. Large Tub\\ asher , Single 
Speed, Per manent Press cycle. 
Dryer has Automatic Dry Con­
trol. Colors Slightly Hight>r. 

Only 

OUR BEST! MAYTAG 

WASHER AND 

DRYER 

$579 77 For Both 
P ieces 

White. Large Tub, Two-Speed, 
Permanent Press cycle, Alter­
nate Soak Cycle. Dryer has 
Electronic Dry Control. Colors 
Slightly Higher. 

See Arrowood's Du ring this Giant Maytag Washer and Dryer Sale ..• 
Reduced Prices When Buying Both The Washer and Dryer, plus FR EE STEAM IRON. 

( CASH OR TERMs AVAILABLE-F~n NORM AL INSTALLATION-2 AND s-YUR WARRANTIEs. I 

ARROWOOD'S HARDWARE & FURNITURE 
COURT STREET 
PHONE 886-2703 

T\\O Locations In Prt>stonsburg 
To Ser\'e \' ou Bett<"r 

SO. LAKE DRIVE 
PHONE 886-6116 



Elect 

TEX MITCHELL 
for MAGISTRATE 

May Democratic primary. 

So that All the people of District .!'io. 
4 will be represented. 
3-7-4t-pd. 

Vote For 

·clarence (Big) Martin 
of Stumbo Hollow, Drift, Ky., For 

CONSTABLE 
District No. 3 

May Democratic Primary 

Your Vote and Influence Will Be 
Appreciated 

3-14-llt-pd. 

Vote for 

EARL PATRICK 
of Martin, Ky •• Democratic 

candidate for 

MAGISTRATE, DIST. 3 
Your support will be appreciated. 

3-21·31- d. 

Vote for 

FAIR PRATER 
Democratic Candidate for 

MAGISTRATE 
DIST. NO. 2 

May Primary 

Elect one of your kind, a man who 
wiD be for YOU, not just a select 
few. Elect a man who knows your 
problems. Help me help you. 'l'haak 
you. (Pol. Adv., 2-21-St-pd.) 

Vote for 

KENNETH ROBERTS 
Democratic candidate for 

MAGISTRATE, DIST. 2 
May primary election 

2-21-6t-pd. 

LEROY AKERS 
of McDowell, Ky. 

For MAGISTRATE 
DISTRICT NO. 3 

DemocraUc Primary, May 22, 1973 
Pol. Adv., 3-21-2t-pd. 

Vote for 

MILT HUNT 
for 

CONSTABLE, DIST. 4 
May Democratic Primary 

A sober man who wiD greatly 
appreciate your vote and support. 

2-14-14t. 

Re-Elect 

BILL WELLS 
Magistrate. Dist. No. 1 

Democratic primary 

Your heir 1nd support .\'ill be ap­
preciated. 
3-Hf. 

Elect 

BOB HACKWORTH 
of Martin 

Democratic candidate for 

CONSTABLE DIST. 2 
May Primary 

3-14·21-pd. 

Vote For 

JOHNNY MARTIN 
Democrat For 

CONSTABLE, Dist. 3 
May Primary 

Your Vote ,\ppreciated. Thank You. 
3· 7 -llt -j)(i. 

Elect 

James "Tookie" Prater 
of Garrett, Ky .• 

Democratic candidate for 

Constable, Dist. No. 2 
A good man for the job. Your vote and 

influence will be appreciated. 
3-6-3t. 

FOR CONSTABLE 
District No. 2 

Sollie Holbrooks 
May Democratic primary. 

I run on my record. 2-21-St..pd. 

Announcing 

RALPH HOWELL 
of Orkney, Ky. 

Democratic Candidate for 

CONSTABLE 
DISTRICT 3 

At the May Primary. 
2-14-3t-pd. 

Re-elect 

ZEB OUSLEY 
of Hueysville, Democratic candJdate 

For 

MAGISTRATE, DIST. 2 
At the May Primary 

Your support always has been and 
and always will be appreciated. 

2-14-tf. 

Re-Elect 

W. J. ''Bill'' Reynolds 

State Representative 
95th District {Floyd County) 

(Ailen Turner, chm •• 
Reynolds Campaign Committee) 

THE FLOYD COUNTY TIMES 

Vote for 

Joe Wheeler Lewis 
Democratic Candidate 

for Sheriff 
of Floyd County. 

1. I will assure the people of Floyd 
County that organized crime will 
not be permitted. 

2. I will enforce the Alcohol 
Beverage law to the letter. 

3. All ball games and school 
programs will be protected. 

4. All funerals will have escort. 

5. Churches will be protected if 
necessary. <Pol. Adv. 3·21-tf.) 

Support and Elect 

Mildred (Midge) Halbert 
Of Maytown, Democratic Candidate 

for 

CONSTABLE DIST. 2 

I She is the daughter of the late Lum 
Reffitt and Maggie Reffitt. You have 

L tried the men in this office, elect a 
woman once. 

2·28·6t.-pd. 
. --

AIIOIIcllg 

JASON MOORE 
of Orkney, Candida~ for 

CONSTABLE 
DISTRICT 3 

May Democratic Primary 

Your vote wiU be appreciated. 
3-14-4t.-pd. 

FOR MAGISTRATE 
We Are Authorized to Announce 

DEWEY ROBERTS 
For MAGISTRATE 

In District No. 4 of Floyd County at the 

Democratic primary, May 22, 197.3. 

Qualified and Accommodating. 

RALEIGH BARNETT 
Democrat For 

CONSTABLE, DIST. NO. 2 
May Primary 

Your Support will be appreciated 

3-7-llt-od. 

Stpport a1cl Elect 

Ervin R. Salisbury 
for 

Magistrate, Dlst. 2 
May Democratic primary 

Your vote will be appreciated. 
3-14-2t-pd. 

Vote FOR 

HENRY C. HALE 
of Blue River, Democratic 

candidate for 

SHERIFF 
Your support will be appreciated. 
3-14-31-pd. 

Vote for and Support 

HENRY C. HALE 

FOR SHERIFF 

of Floyd County 

Democratic Primary 
May 29, 1973 

A man of proven ability who will be 
on the job 24 hours a day. 3-21-21-pd. 

Re-Elect 

for Constable 
Dist. No. I 

Democratic rimary 2-14-14t-pd. 

JEFF scon 
(Son of Fellix and 

Mallie Combs Scott) 
of Garrett, Ky., candidate for 

Magistrate, Dist. 2 
Democratic primary. 

Your support and influence will be 
appreciated. 
1·14·14t-pd. 

An101nciag 

HOLLIE HAMIL TON 
of Betsy Layne, candidate for 

MAGISTRATE, DIST. 4 
Democratic Primary 

I ask your vote and support of my 
candidacy for Magistrate. Formerly 
of Mud Creek, I now reside at Betsy 
Layne. I do heavy and highway 
construction work and am now 
working on new U. S. 23 in Floyd 
county. I have been vice-president or 
the Local Union of all heavy and 
highway construction in Eastern 
Kentucky. I am the working man's 
friend. 

I will go to the Fiscal Court of 
Floyd county and work to get your 
county roads and bridges built and 
repaired-this I promise to do im­
mediately, if elected. I need your 
vote, and you need me to represent 
you for the next four years. Your 
vote will be appreciated. Thank you. 

3-14-3t.-pd. 

Elect 

Jimmy "Gabe" Turner 
for Sheriff 

Son of Ernest Turner and 
grandson of the late W. J. "Big Bill" 

Turner 3-14·3t-pd. 

Vote for 

HENRY STUMBO 
Democratic candidate for 

COUNTY JUDGE 
Always working for Floyd County and its people. 

SECTION THREE. PAGE TWO 

ANNOUNCEMENT John :\-1. Phillips is announcing 
that he is a candidate for member of 
the legislature, district 94, which 
consists of magisterial district ~o. l, 
:'1/u. 5, :"o. fi, four precincts in 
magisterial district No. 4, and six 
pr~.>cincts of Floyd County. 

He was rt>ared on Pond Creek and 
is the son of the late James and 
Mary Smith Phillips of Huddy, Ky. 
He worked as a miner for Eastern 
Coal Corporation and Republic Steel 
for ten .Years. For the last twenty­
five yt>ars he has operated Faith's 
Dairy Bu in Pikeville. 

He is married to Faith Runyon 
Phillips, who is the daughter of Lyda 
McCoy Runyon and the late J. A. 
Runyon of Pikeville. 

He has three children: Mrs. Gary 
G. Howard of Frankfort, Ky .. Dr. 
John R. Phillips of Pikeville, Ky .• 
and Lyda K. Phillips. a student at 
the VniHrsity of Kenhacly. lt.-pd. 

Statement by Denzil Ray Hall 

Elect 

I am not seeking reelection as 
Magistrate in District No. 4. I feel 
that I should devote all my time to 
helping my brother, Lovel Hall, in 
his campaign for the Democratic 
nomination for Property Valuation 
Administrator <Tax Commissioner). 

I have done to the very best of my 
ability all that I could to help the 
people of District 4 during my four 
years In office, and would like to 
thank everyone for their support 
given me during my term of office. 

I am not endorsing or supporting 
any candidate other than my 
brother, I know that he will work 
hard and dedicate his full time to the 
duties of the office and to the 
Democratic party. 

DENZIL RAY HALL 
(Pol. Adv.) 

LOVEL HALL 
Property Valuation Administrator 

(Tax Commissioner) 

May Democratic Primary 
The son of Mrs. Mandie Vance Hall, of Grethel, and the late W. J . Hall. A 

graduate of McDowell High School and Prestonsburg Community College. 
Six years' experience as a bookkeeper and assistant director for a federal 
program, helping the people of Eastern Kentucky. 

Vote for a man who will be available at all times to assist the people of 
Floyd County. 
(Pol. Adv.) 

Vote for and Re-Elect 

JAMES R. ALLEN 
A Democrat 

Your County Attorney 
1 was appointed your Count) ttorney January 7, 1972. I was nominated, 
unopposed in :\lay. 1972, as county Attorney on tbe Democratic ticket to fill 
the unexpired term ror this office. I would greatly appreciate an op~ortunity 
to srrve you for a full four-year term. Your vote and support wtll be ap­
pn•ciated. 

<Pol. Adv.l 



) 

l 

THE FLOYP C()UNTY TIMES SECTION THREE, PAGE THREE 
--------------------------=-:.:.:::~~~~~:...:...::......:..!..!.:::=.-----------G----~---e----------:F~in-ance Commissioner Don Bradshaw 

'"Discover Wildlife" . . • enea ogy ourse has estimated that the 1974 General 
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Re-Elect 

EDWARD CAUDILL 
for 

MAGISTRATE, DIST. 3 
Democratic primary, Ma:v 

VOTE FOR 

JAMES J. NAPIER 
OF l\IELVJ:'oo'. KY .. FOR 

CONSTABLE( DISTRICT 3 
uemocratic Primary, May 22,1973 

A Ketired Miner, Member of Local 
5899, Wheelwright, Ky. Sober and 
·Honest. If elected he will make a 
good Constable. 3·14-2t-pd. 

Vote for 

DAVE HARVEY 
for 

CONSTABLE, DISTRICT 2 
May Democri\tic Primary 

3-21-2t-pd. 

GARY MARTIN 
of Estill, Ky., candidate for 

MAGISTRATE, Dist. 2 
' 

Republican primary election 

2-28-4t-pd. 

Vote for 

MERLE M. MAY 
of Martin, Ky., for 

MAGISTRATE, Dist. 2 
Democratic primary election 

3-21-4t. 

RE-ELECT 

GILLIS CONN 
CONSTABLE, DIST. 4 

Democratic primary. 
Your vote will be appreciated. 

3-21-4t-pd. 

ELECT 

Harold A. Baldridge 
For Magistrate 

DISTRICT NO. I 

Democratic T1cket 
May Primary 

tf. 

A11ounclng 

HENRY KIDD 
Ca1dldate for full·tl•• 

MAGISTRATE, Dist. 4 
May Democratic prim~ry · 

3-21-9t-pd. 

Vote for 

DENVER SPURLOCK 
For CONSTABLE, Dlst. 3 

Your vote will be appreciated. 
3-21-1ot.-pd 

TIMES WANT ADS GET RESULTS! 

RE-ELECT 

It-pd. 

Harry Gordon 

ALLEN 
for 

Property Valuation Adminstrator 
(Tax Commissioner) 

Democrat 

For State Representative 
95th Legislative District 

May Democratic Primary (Floyd Co.) 

James ~~Jitter'' Allen 
I am the son of Bill Allen, former owner of Allen Bros. Bus 
Co. and Ora Mae (McGlothen} Allen Veteran Floyd Co. 
teacher. I am married to Emily Martin, daughter of Murph 
and the late tterma l Hall) Martin. We have one son James 
Gregory. My paternal grandparents are the late 
"Preacher" Alex Allen, Minister of The Old Regular Baptist 
Church and Mary (Allen} Allen. My Maternal grandparents 
are the late Millard "Mac" McGlothen former C & 0 Section 
foreman, and Kate (Swartz} McGlothen, Now residing at 
Printer, Ky. 

I am employed by the C & 0 Rwy Co. as freight Agt. at 
Prestonsburg, Ky. . 

Your vote and support will be greatly appreciated. 

(Pol. Adv.) U\llt"n Campaign Committee; Richard "Dick" Allen, chm.) 

Wildlife Week Plans Set Scheduled at Pee 
Assembly will have a $150 million revenue 
sharing windfall when it convenes in 
Jann~rv 

"DISCOVER WILDLIFE: IT'S TOO GOOD TO MISS."-Urgtng all citizen• to make a 
personal effort to achieve a better environment for wildlife, Gov. Wendell Ford signs 
a proclamation making the week or March 18-24 Wildlife Week. With Ford are (from 
left) wildlife conservationists Ed Thompson. Louisville, state director of the League 
of Kentucky Sportsmen: Reid Love, Vanceburg, president of the League; anti Arnold 
Mitchell, commissioner oftbe state Department of Fish and Wildlife Resources. 

Plans are being readied by thousands of 
local and state groups across the country 
for participation in the 36th annual National 
Wildlife Week, set for March 18-24. 

The theme of the 1973 Wildlife Week, 
sponsored each year by the 3.5 million­
member National Wildlife Federation and 
its state affiliates, is "DISCOVER 
WILDLIFE-It's Too Good To Miss." 
Focus of the week will be on the simple, yet 
exciting, joys that can be found by 
Americans of all ages in the outdoor. 
natural world. 

The executive vice president of the NWF, 
Thomas L. Kimball, commented on the 
Wildlife Week's poster symbol, a young 
wood duck shown just emerging from its 

(Steve Mitchell photo>. 

nest. "All that newly-hatched duck has to 
do to break out into the natural world is 
take that first step out of the nest," Kimball 
said. "And it's nearly as easy for people to 
take that same step, to break out into 
nature and see what beauty it has to offer." 

During this year's Wildlife Week, 
Kimball urges that families "get out and 
enjoy our wild resources. The experience 
can open up an entirely new world." 

"Too often," Kimball said, "American 
families see wildlife and the rest of the 
natural world only through attractive 
magazine pictures. It's out there to be 
experienced right now and it really is too 
good to be missed!" 

Fine Arts Week at Alice Lloyd 
To Feature Romersa and Musicians 

Pippa Passes, Ky.-Henry Romersa, 
executive director of the National Academy 
of Recording Arts & Science Institute, 
Nashville, Tenn., will speak at Alice Lloyd 
College on "The Recording Industry" at 
12:30 p.m., Thursday, March 29. Mr. 
Romersa, who is a faculty member at 
Peabody, will also speak on Appalachia's 
Instrumental Heritage at 12:30 p.m., Tues­
day. The public is invited to these and all 
other events during ALC's Fine Arts Week. 
There is no admission charge. 

Floyd county's Allen Central high school 
will have a part in the week's program. 

Following is the schedule of events 
during the March 25-29 Fine Arts Week: 
Sunday, 3 p.m., Voices From Appalachia, 
concert; Interpretation in Three Media-Al 
Stewart composes lyrics, Abner Grender 
composes music, G. Glen Hale draws; 
presentation of first Annual High School 
Art Exhibit Awards; reception for all 
students and guests. 

Monday, 12:30 p.m., Allen Central high 
school choir, Marek Rice, director; 4 p.m., 
Warren Wolf, Workshop in Guitar; 7 p.m., 
concert of classical guitar. 

CITY OF PRESTONSBURG, KENTUCKY 
ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS 

Sealed bids will be received by the City of 
Prestonsburg, Kentucky, at the office of the 
Mayor, at the Ford Building in Prestons­
burg, Kentucky, until 7:30p.m., Thursday, 
April 5, 1973, at which time, in the Council 
Meeting Room at such Ford Building, bids 
will be publicly opened and read aloud, for 
furnishing labor and materials and per­
forming all work, as set forth by this ad­
vertisement for bids. 

The equipment to be furnished is as 
follows: 

1. Hydraulic refuse packer of not less 
than 20 cubic yard capacity rear loader. 

Bid is to include installation of refuse 
packer on a 1973 cab-chassis. 

The bids must comply with specifications 
approved by the City Council, copies of 
which specificiations may be obtained from 
the office of the City Clerk, in the Ford 
Building at Prestonsburg, Ky. 

Bids shall be in a sealed envelope bearing 
the bidder's identification, addressed to the 
City of Prestonsburg, labeled in the lower 
left-hand corner: 

"Proposal. 1. Hydraulic refuse packer 
body." 

The City of Prestonsburg reserves the 
right tooreject any or all bids, which bids 
shall ndt be withdrawn for 45 days sub­
sequent to the opening of bids, without 
consent of the City of Prestonsburg. 

JUDITH D. ARCHER, Clerk 
City of Prestonsburg, Kentucky 

3-21-31. 

CITY OF PRESTONSBURG, KENTUCKY 
ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS 

Sealed bids will be received by the City of 
Prestonsburg, Kentucky, at the office of the 
Mayor, at the Ford Building in Prestons­
burg, Kentucky, until 7:30p.m., Thursday, 
April 5, 1973, at which time, in the Council 
Meeting Room at such Ford Building, bids 
will be publicly opened and read aloud, for 
furnishing labor and materials and per­
forming all work, as set forth by this ad­
vertisement for bids. 

The equipment to be furnished is as 
follows: 

Tuesday, 12:30 p.m., Henry Romersa, 
Appalachia Instrumental Heritage, 4 p.m., 
Composer Workshop, Dr. Frederick A. 
Mueller, Morehead State University; 8 
p.m., Basoon and Keyboard Concert (with 
harpsichord and piano), Dr. Mueller, Karl 
Payne. 

Wednesday,12:30p.m. Allen Central high 
school band, Marek Rice, director, 7 p.m., 
concert, recorders and harpsichord, from 
Berea College, John Forbes, Ray McLain, 
Judy Drake, Edith Weatherford, John 
Courter. 

Thursday, 12:30 p.m., Today's Recording 
Industry, Henry Romersa, executive 
director, NARAS Institute; 4 p.m., "Blue 
Harmony," M. C. Napier stage band, 
Barbara Martin, director; 7 p .m . 
"Anybody Out There," Caney Players. 

972 PONTIAC 
CATALINA COUPE 
Automatic transmission, 
power steering. power 
brakes, air-conditioned, 
stereo tape player. 

1968 BUICK SKYLARK 
CONVERTIBLE 

Automatic transmission, 
power steering, power 
brakes. See this! 

1970 CHEVROLET 
NOVA COUPE 

Six-cylinder engine, stick 
shift. Low mileage, one 
owner. 

Prestonsburg Community College will 
offer a non-credit course in genealogy, it 
was announced last week. 

The classes will cover basic sources, 
record keeping, and elemental problems in 
tracing family histories. 

Instructor for the course will be Prof. 
James Funkhouser of the college faculty. 
Mr. Funkhouser, chairman of the Social 
Sciences and Business and Office Education 
Division and assistant professor of History, 
has had a great deal of experience in 
research methods and has done much work 
in tracing his own family history. 

Classes will be held in Room 149 of the 
Johnson Administration Building from 6:30 
to 8 p.m. for four Thursday evenings, April 
5 through April 26. 

The course is part of the Community 
Service Program at Prestonsburg Com­
munity College. 

TIMES WANT ADS GET RESULTS! 
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INCOME TAX 

SERVICE 
E. P. STEPHENS 

layne Bldg. 

Over 
Ben Frank&n 
Store 

Phones: 886-2893 
886-3490 

The most complete car cleaning 
system in Floyd County. 

CAR WASH 
WITH EACH FILL-UP OF TEXACO 
GASOLINE {12-GAL. MINIMUM) 

We accept Texaco Credit Cards, 
American Express, BankAmerlcard, 
Master Charge and all other Interbank 
cards. If you don't have a credit card, 
inquire about one, here. 

OPEN SEVEN 
DAYS A WEEK: 
8 a.m.-6 p.m. 

D. A D. is your 
authorized dealer 
for Remington 
tires. For beat 
tires at lowe•t 
price•, see our 
complete liDc now 
ID stock. 

D. & D. 
CAR WASH & TIRE SALES 

"SatiafactfOI' Or Your Dirt Back'~ 

NORTH LAKE DRIVE, PRESTONSBURG 

1972 BUICK SKYLARK 
2-DOOR HARDTOP 

Air-conditioned, power 
steering, power brakes, V-8 
engine. Nice car. 

1971 PONTIAC LeMANS 
2-DQOR HARDTOP 
Automatic transmission, 

steering, power 
air-conditioned. 

1970 FORD TORINO 
GT 2-DOOR HARDTOP 
Automatic transmission, 
power steering, power 
brakes. 

1972 FORD PINTO 
2-DOOR SEDAN 

One owner, low mileage. If 
you're looking for a good 
buy in a sharp, little car, 
see this one. 

1968 CHEVROLE:TT ..._ __ _,~ 

IMPALA COUPE 
Automatic transmission, 
power steering, small V-8 
engine, air-conditioned. 

1970 PONTIAC 
CATALINA COUPE 
Black with black vinyl top, 
power steering, power 
brakes, air-conditioned. 

1971 CHEVROLET 
MONTE CARLO COUPE 

Blue with black vinyl top. 
power steering, power 
brakes, air-conditioned. 

1969 DODGE CHARGER 
2-DOOR HARDTOP 
Automatic transmission, 
power steering, power 
brakes, air-conditioned. 

1. Heavy-duty chassis for hydraulic 
refuse packer, adequate in strength. 

Bids must comply with specifications 
approved by the City Council, copies of 
which specifications may be obtained from 
the office of the City Clerk, in the Ford 
Building at Prestonsburg, Kentucky. 

Check Our Selection of New '73's ... Over 60 New 
Pontiacs, Cadillacs and Oldsmobiles To Choose From. 

Bids shall be in a sealed envelope bearing 
the bidder's identification, addressed to the 
City of Prestonsburg, labeled in the lower 
left-hand corner: 

"Proposal. 1. Heavy-duty chassis for 
refuse packer body." 

The City of Prestonsburg reserves the 
right to reject any or all bids, which bids 
shall not be withdrawn for 45 days sub­
sequent to the opening of bids, without 
consent of the City of Prestonsburg. 

JUDITH D. ARCHER, Clerk 
City of Prestonsburg, Kentucky 

3-21-3!. 

Let One of These Salesmen Help You With Your Car 1\feeas: 

ROGER COLVIN, HUGH FUGATE, FRANKIE MIMS, JODY FANNIN, JOHNNY GRAY 

PARKWAY MOTORS 
"At Parkway, It's the Dea I That Counts" 

Phone 886-3811 Prestonsburg 

3 
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To Vie for School Championship 

Contestants In tbe Martin elementary school spelling bee are, from left, flnt row­
Lisa Spradlin, fourth grade: Marla Reynolds, fifth grade: Sherri Ray, fourth grade: 
Ricky Crum, fifth grade: second row-sheila Johnson, sixth grade; Clara Ousley, 
seventh grade; Teresa Sammons, eighth grade; Rita Martin, sixth grade; third row­
Sandy Ousley, eighth grade: Susan Walters, eighth grade, and Jeanette Owens, 
seventh grade. The winner will represent the Martin school in the Floyd county 
spelling bee to be held In Prestonsburg, April 7. 

Block-Cut Mining Urged 
As Stripping Alternative 

Washington-The President's CoWlcil on 
Environmental Quality has recommended 
block-<:Ut surface mining-in which a 
mined-out section is filled in with earth 
from the next cut-as a means of avoiding 
the degradation of mountainous coal 
mining areas by strip .mining. 

"Except for the initial cut," says the 
ColUlcil report, "spoil is not deposited on 
the downslopes, and the land is im­
mediately restored to its original contour." 

Surface mining, it says, has scarred 4 
million acres of land, with half of it still 
Wlreclaimed, and with the water quality of 
lakes and streams degraded. 

Block-<:Ut reclamation, says the report, 
would cost about 56 cents per ton of coal 
extracted, compared to 95 cents for contour 
strip mining. 

The report, requested Nov. 2 by Sen. 
Henry M. Jackson, D-Wash., chairman of 
the Senate Interior Committee, says 
tightened controls are needed immediately 
on strip mining. 

MANUEL-SYMON 

But the White House has concluded that 
an outright ban on strip mining of coal from 
steep slopes would "not be a good idea," 
said Alvin L. Aim, CEQ's director for 
program development. 

A ban on mining of slopes greated than 15 
or 20 degrees could have a serious 
economic impact on a number of Ap­
palachian coal areas, the report said. 

Hardest hit, the report said, would be the 
central Appalachian area. The only 
alternative would be to tum to more costly 
WldergrolUld mining, if investment capital 
was available. 

CEQ, acting to spike rumors that the 
administration's Office of Management 
and Budget rewrote parts of the report, 
released the 250-page document at a news 
briefing. Aim said OMB reviewed the 
report and made some comments, but did 
not make any changes and only suggested 
some very minor revisions. 

"The reP.Qrt carefully does not draw 
conclusions," Aim said. "We wanted the 
report to be objective.'' 

The House last year passed a bill banning 
strip mining on slopes of 20 degrees or 
more, but it died in the Senate. Rep. Wayne 
L. Hays, D-Ohio, has introduced a similiar 
bill this year. 
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East Kentucky's Title Hopes 
Vanish in First-Round Games 

Community Cleanup 
Talked at Meeting 

Wheelwright, Ky.-The Wheelwright 
Community Action Club met Tuesday night 
at City Hall, Wheelwright 

ALLEN 
INCOME TAX 

SERVICE Eastern Kentucky's dream of providing a 
dark horse winner of the Kentucky high 
school basketball tournament faded 
quickly, but it was fWl while it lasted. 

McDoweJJ, representing the 15th Region, 
lost to Madisonville, 84-69; Maysville 
downed Lee CoWl ty, 76-65, Boyd CoWl ty lost 
to Shawnee, 85 to 68, and Clay CoWlty 
bowed to Hichman CoWlty, 61-59--all in 
first roWld play. 

But there's 1974. 
As the tournament began at F,reedom 

Hall, Louisville, the Associated Press 
released its all-state team for the year. 
Robert Mayhill, of Middlesboro, made the 
first team; M. C. Napier's Denny Fugate, 
the second team, and Betsy Layne's Danny 
Hall the third team. 

Players from this section who received 
•honorable mention included Prestons­
burg's Jim Blackburn, John Lemaster of 
Paintsville. Neal Burchett and James 
McCarty of Johnson Central, Eugene 
Moore, of Inez, Tony Lowdenbeck and 
Brent Hall of McKell, Jim Bob Michael, 
Drexel Short and Scott Jenks of Louisa, 
Cliffy Smith and Jeff Brown of Morgan 
CoWlty, Terry Howard of Salyersville, Sta~ 

CARD OF THANKS 
We would like to take this opportunity to 

thank all the wonderful people for the many 
kindnesses shown us upoo the passing of 
our dear mother and wife, Nannie Boyd. We 
especially wish to thank those of you who 
sent flowers, food, or did anything to help. 
We also extend special thanks to the 
ministers of the Regular Baptist Church 
and the Hall Brothers Funeral Home for its 
kind and efficient service, also to the 
pallbearers. These things will all be long 
remembered. 

ERNEST BOYD 
MRS. GOERGE CONN 

MRS. WILLARD RATLIFF lt. 

P&B 
AMBULANCE 

SERVICE 
Incorporated 

PRESTONSBURG, KY. 
Offers 24-hour oxygen 
equipped ambulance service. 
Trained attendants on duty 
at all times. 

CALL THIS NUMBER, 
DAY OR NIGHT. 

886-6664 

Dixon and Larry Moore of Sandy Hook, 
Steve Banks of Whitesburg, Mike Gillum 
and Mike Sutton of Wurtland, Don Gibson of 
Greenup, Jim Kerr of Elkhorn City, Phily 
Pratt and Davey Wooten of Boyd CoWlty, 
Keith Caldwell of Catlettsburg, Miles 
Keller of Ashland Holy Family, Lonnie 
Morris of Breathitt CoWl ty, Steve Dodd and 
Danny Evans of Ashland. 

The aU-state team named by AP includes 
Louisville Male's Wesley Cox, Mayhill of 
Middlesboro, Ted HWldley of Lexington 
Bryan Station, Ernie Whitus of Louisville 
Doss and Kenny Higgs of Owensboro. 

Ideas were expressed and plans made 
on how to keep Wheelwright a beautiful and 
clean place. An Easter program, including 
an Easter egg hunt for small children, was 
scheduled. 

Ideas were dicussed for procuring a 
"Welcome" sign at the entrance of the 
Wheelwright city limits. 

Tentative plans for a youth center await 
the availability of a suitable building. 

The next scheduled meeting will be held 
March 29 at 7 p.m. All citizens are urged to 
attend. 

Office at the home of 

EARL M. ALLEN 
in Old Allen 

Phone 874-2372 
Hours 9a.m. to & p.m. 

SAVE MONEY IN BUYING 
A MOBILE HOME 

Savings Ranging 
From $300 TO $600 On 1973 Model 

Mobile Homes 
Our lots are too small to accommodate more homes, new ones are arriving and 
we must make room. Come in today and look around. 

TWO EXAMPLES OF OUR MANY BARGAINs--------· 

STATESMAN No. 5364 NOBLE No. 6952 

Two-Bedroom (50x12-Ft.) Three-Bedroom (60x12-Ft.) 

ONLY S4,500 NOW S5,995 
Otr Co•plete Service Depart•e•t Will Service Yotr Mobile Ho•• To Y01r Satisfactio1. 

BANK FINANCING FOR YOUR CONVENIENCE ••• AS LONG AS 12 YEARS TO PAY. 
LOW DOWN-PAYMENT-IN SOME CASES, NOTHING DOWNI 

HAMILTON MOBILE HOMES 
See WALKER CLINE or JOHN COMBS. 

U.S. 23, OPPOSITE PRESTONSBURG HIGH SCHOOL, PHONE 886-2680 
Othr Locatio1s: 

Paintsville-See JIM FANNIN, JACK HAMILTON or JOE THOMPSON; Inez- See GARY ENDICOTT. 
Mr. and Mrs. Arnold Manuel, of Martin, 

Ky., announce the marriage of their 
daughter, Wanda L. Manuel, to David H. 
Symon, son of Mr. and Mrs. George Symon, 
of Louisville, Ky., February 10 in the 
Methodist Church, Clintwood, Va., by the 
minister, Leon R. Burger. 

Both are graduates of Martin high school. 
Mrs. Symon is employed at U. S. Shoe, Co., 
Prestonsburg, and Mrs. Symon is employed 
by GWln Coal Co. They are presently 
residing in Martin. 

This Is Not A Sale ••• Just Some Of Our Everyday Low Prlc.es ••• At 

HONORED ON ANNIVERSARY 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Mays, of Price, were 

entertained, March 10, 11 and 12 with a 
celebration of their 35th wedding an­
niversary. The event took place at Hemlock 
Lodge, Natural Bridge State Resort Park. 
During their three-day stay there they were 
visited by many friends and relatives from 
various parts of the state. 

FLOYD CIRCUIT COURT 
CR9278 

The Bank Josephine, a Corporation, PI 

VS. NOTICE OF SALE 

Billy G. McCoy and Neshea McCoy, Deft. 

By virtue of a judgment and order of sale 
of the Floyd Circuit Court rendered at the 
January 26 term 1973 in the above styled 
cause I shall proceed to offer for sale at the 
Courthouse door in Prestonsburg, Ken­
tucky, to the highest and best bidder, at 
public auction, on the 23rd day of March 1973 
at 10:00o'clock a.m. same being a day of the 
regular term of the Floyd Circuit Court, 
upon a credit of six months, the following 
described property to-Wit: 

That certain tract or parcel of land lying 
and being on the waters of Little Paint Creek 
in.Floyd County, Kentucky, and being the 
same property conveyed to the defendants, 
Billy G. McCoy and Neshea McCoy, by 
Heber Baldridge and Gypsy Mae Baldridge 
by deed dated May 13, 1966, recorded in 
Deed Book 190, page 373, Floyd ColUlty 
Court Clerk's Office and being more par­
ticularly described as follows, viz: 

Beginning on the fence post adjoining the 
property of Bill and Daisy McCoy; thence 
rWlning a straight line to the creek to a 
sycamore: thence fro01 the sycamore 150 
feet up the creek to a willow; thence from 
the willow a straight line to the Mayo Trail: 
thence down the Mayo Trail to the place of 
beginning, containing two acres, more or 
less. 

The amount of money to be raised by this 
sale shall be in the principal sum of $1,515.92 
with interest thereon at 7 percent annually 
from the 22 day of November 1972 until 
satisfied and the additional sum of $518.52 
with interest thereon at 6 percent per annum 
from January 26, 1973. and the costs of this 
action. including costs of advertising of this 
sale and the fees and commissions for 
conducting this sale. 

For the purchase price the purchaser 
must execute bond with approved surety or 
sureties, bearing legal interest from the day 
of sale until paid and having the force and 
effeCt of a judgment with a lien retained 
upon said property as a further security. 
Bidders will be prepared to comply with 
these terms. 

Given Wlder my hand, this 28th day of 
February 1973. 

3-7-3t. 

MARSHALL DAVIDSON 
Master Commissioner 

Floyd Circuit Court 

Royalton Lumber Co. 

Sldlnc 

PER THOUSAND 

1,000 GALLON 

SEPTIC 

Tank 

$145°0 

112 H.P. DEEP WELL 

Pump 
ON 30-GAL. TANK 

Floorlnc 

S19500 
PER THOUSAND 

ALL 
LIGHT 

LUMBER PRICES ARE 
INCREASING FAST 

BETTER BUY 
NOW AND 

SO% 
DELUXE 

$16995 OFF 

30" ALL 

Hood & Fan Paneling 
ONLY 

$2995 SEE US 

ABOUT OUR 
OFF 
PER 
SHEET 

SPECIAL PACKAGE 

DEAL ON LUMBER! 
BEFORE YOU BUILD ... OR BUY 

YOU BETTER SEE US! 

COLOR 

Television 
100 PERCENT SOLID STATE 

MODULAR CHASIS 

2-YEAR WARRANTY 

$58995 

3/0 x 6/8 x 1 3/4 BIRCH 

Ext. Doors 

BIG-72" 

Phono Unit 
WITH AM-FM Multiplex 

&-TRACK TAPE SOLID STATE 

$299 95 

Rock 
3/8 $180 

24 INCH 

Bath-Vanity 
Royalton 
Lumber Co. 

PERFORATED 
SEWER PIPE 

19c 
Per Foot 

PER SHEET WITH BOWL AND FAUCET 
SAL1ERS¥lLE 

~185 

I 

( 
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MAYTOWN COMMUNITY NEWS 
Mr. and Mrs. Raymond Manuel and 

children, who formerly lived in Knott 
county, have moved into their mobile 
home, next door to Mr. and Mrs. Manor 
Manuel. 

Mr. and Mrs. James Manuel, of Pickway, 
Ohio, announce the birth of their first child, 
a son, James Dewey, March I. Mrs. Manuel 
is the former Jerri Wallen, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Dewey Wallen, of Indiana, for­
merly of Floyd county. The paternal 
grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. Manor 
Manuel. 

Mrs. Ella Martin, of Eastern, has been a 
patient at Our Lady of the Way hospital. 

Mr. and Mrs. Claude J. Webb and Mecca, 
who formerly resided on Prater Fork, have 
moved into their new mobile home next 
door to Mr. and Mrs. Claude Webb on 
Henry's Branch. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Webb and Matthew, of 
Springfield, Ohio, were week-end guests of 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. Claude Webb, 
and her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Ray Prater. 

Mr. and Mrs. John B. Harris and 
children, Tony and Jamie, of Louisville, 
spent last week-end here with her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Willard Hicks. Mrs. Harris 
attended church at the Baptist Chapel, 
Sunday morning. Other dinner guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Hicks on Sunday were Mr. 
and Mrs. Jimmy L. Allen and Barron and 
Mrs. Sandy Bradley, Dana, Paige and 
Charles. 

The regular meeting of the Maytown PTA 
was held Monday night at the lunchroom, 
conducted by th-e president, Hershel 
Flanery. A turkey dinner is planned for 
Easter, to be held at the lunchroom. 

Miss Billie Jean Post, who is a student at 
Morehead State University, spent last week 
here visiting her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Post. She had as houseguest Miss Jane 
Harvey, of West Liberty. 

Mrs. Beulah Williamson, of Prestons­
burg, and Mrs. Emma Harmon, of 
Shelbiana, were here last week visiting 
Mrs. Lucy Patton and Mrs. G. A. Patton. 

FLOYD CIRCUIT COURT 
CR.8733 

Chester Layne and Jean Layne, his wife, 
Plfts. 

VS. NOTICE OF SALE 

Fred R. Conn and Eulavene Conn, his wife, 
John Elliott Walters, Jeffrey Neal Walters, 
Lois Foley Walters, their mother and next 
friend, Defts. 

By virtue of a judgment and order of sale 
of the Floyd Circuit Court rendered at the 
February 23 term, 1973 in the above-styled 
cause I shall proceed to offer for sale at the 
courthouse door in Prestonsburg, Ken­
tucky, to the highest and best bidder, at 
public auction, on the 6th day of April, 1973 
at 10:30 o'clock a.m., same being a day of 
the regular term of the Floyd Circuit Court, 
upon a credit of six months, the following 
described property to-wit: 

That certain tract or parcel of land 
located in the C. I. Layne Addition to Betsy 
Layne, Floyd County, and being the same 
property conveyed the parties by mesne 
conveyances from the heirs of John E. 
Walters and being more particularly 
described as follows, viz: 

Lots 12, 12A, 13,14,15, 16, 17, 18in the C. I. 
Layne Addition to the Community of Betsy 
Layne, as shown on Map No. 49 and 166 filed 
in the Floyd County Court Clerk's Office 
and based on survey of Prestonsburg 
Engineering Company. 

For the purchase price the purchaser 
must execute bond with approved surety or 
sureties, bearing legal interest from the 
day of sale until paid and having the force 
and effect of a judgment with a lien 
retained upon said property as a further 
security. Bidders will be prepared to 
comply with these terms. 

Given under my hand, this 15th day of 
March, 1973. 

3-21-3t. 

MARSHALL DAVIDSON 
Master Commissioner 

Floyd Circuit Court 

Mr. and Mrs. Roland Burchett and Mrs. 
John Gray and John Houston were business 
visitors in Lexington, Tuesday. 

Thomas Patrick spent last week visiting 
Mr. and Mrs. Gene Dillman and sons in 
Middlesboro and Mrs. Elizabeth Fudge in 
Powell, Tenn. 

Mrs. Amanda Sutton is visiting Mr. and 
Mrs. Jack Crowe in Covington. She was 
accompanied there by Mr. Crowe. 

Shelly Terry is recuperating at home 
after undergoing surgery at Central Baptist 
Hospital in Lexington. 

Last Saturday the following Girl Scouts 
were the overnight guests of Mrs. Paul C. 
Patton: Darlene Robinson, Beverly May, 
Ann Flanery, Debbie Reffett and Shelia 
Allen. Sunday was Girl Scout Sunday and 
they were also observing Girl Scout week. 
Both Junior and Cadette Scouts par­
ticipated in programs on patriotism at the 
United Methodist Church and the Baptist 
Chapel. 

Members of Cadette and Senior Girl 
Scouts Troop 617 attended a meeting at the 
clubhouse, Saturday. Guests speaker was 
Mrs. Connie Christian, area adviser, who 
showed the girls a movie, "The Difference 
Is You in Scouting and Wider Op­
portunities." 

Mr. and Mrs. Taulby Russey and 
children, of Springfield, Ohio, spent a few 
days here last week visiting her parents, 
Mrs. and Mrs. Claude Webb, and other 
relatives. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dennis Kennedy, Anita and 
Heather, of Highland, Mich., spent several 
days here last week visiting her mother, 
Mrs. Ora Bowling. They also visited her 
father at University Hospital in Lexington. 

Mrs. Hugh Kennedy, of Highland, Mich., 
spent several days here visiting her sister, 
Mrs. Charles Ray Patton, Mr. Patton and 
family last week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Roosevelt Thornsbury, of 
Lewiston, Ohio, spent the week-end here 
visiting her mother, Mrs. Ora Bowling. 

Mr. and Mrs. Scott Stephens and 
Elizabeth Marie, of Louisville, spent last 
week-end here visiting his mother, Mrs. 
Marie Stephens. 

Mr. and Mrs. Thurmal Click and Mrs. 
Howard Ramey were in Lexington last 
Thursday on business. 

Miss Lynn Webb was the guest of Mr. and 
Mrs. Stan lay Barner and Bill and Mr. and 
Mrs. Don Hughes and Steve, of Garrett, 
during the state basketball tournament in 
Louisville last week. Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth 
Blevins and several others from here also 
attended the tournament. 

Mrs. Alva Flanery was Sunday dinner 
hostess to her family at her home. 

Several relatives and friends visited the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Felix Dudley on 
Turkey Creek, March 10, to honor Mrs. 
Dudley, who was celebrating her 78th birth­
day. Those who presented gifts and were 
dinner guests of the Dudleys were Mrs. 
Janice Ratliff and Dwayne, Mrs. Edith 
Gayheart and Mr. and Mrs. Paul Compton 
and daughter, Tena, all of Allen; Mrs. 
Joyce Salisbury, Sherry Salisbury, Mrs. 
Ethel Presley, Mrs. Marvin Martin and 
Tammy, Mr. and Mrs. Angelo Dudley, 
Clyde Dudley, Lowell Dudley, Rena 
Salisbury, Tony Salisbury and Mrs. Bee 
Jack Martin. 

Mr. and Mrs. Thurmal Click were in 
Pikeville Friday on business. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. G. Gibson and sons, of 
Mt. Orab, Ohio, were week-end guests of his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Selton Gibson. 

Sympathy is extended to the family of 
Mrs. Katherine Patton who passed away 
Thursday at the Mountain Manor Rest 
Home. Mrs. Patton had been in ill health for 
some time. • 

Howard Ramey spent Tuesday night and 
Wednesday in Portsmouth, Ohio visiting his 
mother, Mrs. Cora Ramey. 

Mrs. Sandra Flanery has returned to 
work at the Personality Beauty Shop here 
after a leave of absence for the birth of a 
baby daughter. 

Mr. and Mrs. Eddie Stewart, of Amelia, 
Ohio, were week-end guests of his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Ed Stewart. 

.. 
TIMES WANT ADS GET RESULTS! 

We make loans to people who 
want to build or buy homes. 

Can we help you? 

FIRST GUARANTY BANK 
of Martin, Kentucky 

Member Federal Deposlllnsurance Corporation 

Biggest Ever~ 

This bass caught last Sunday in Dewey 
Lake by Dexter Music, of Hager Hill, may 
be the largest to be landed there all this 
year. In fact, it may be the largest ever 
caught at Dewey on hook and line. The 
largemouth weighed nine pounds and 
measured 25 inches. 

Nature Trails 
By RUFUS M. REED 

THE ANACONDA. This is a gigantic boa 
of the lakes and streams of Tropical 
America and it is generally regarded as the 
largest and heaviest of all the snakes. A 
body length of 37 feet has been reported, 
with a weight of over 300 pounds. The usual 
length is about 28 to 30 feet. Such a mon­
strous snakes could easily swallow a sheep, 
a goat-or a man! Their jaw muscles are 
flexible and can be stretched to swallow 
large victims. It takes more than 100 
pounds of flesh to make a full meal for this 
snake. But after it swallows its prey, it 
usually lies quiescent for a week or so. 

These great boas kill their victims by 
constriction but do not crush the bones, as 
some writers say. Their victims are killed 
by suffocation and are then swallowed 
whole. For such a large snake to swallow 
some animal with crushed bones would 
prove disastrous, as slivers of bone could 
easily puncture the stomach. 

The anaconda and all the other boas bear 
live young, a dozen or so at each birthing. 
While this snake is a handsome one, it is not 
nearly as handsome as the boa constrictor 
and the highly colored pythons. Its back is 
sprinkled with rows of black spots; the rest 
of the body is light brown. The snake has 
the vicious habits of the water snakes and is 
never handled in side shows like the more 
docile pythons. It has been known to attack 
humans; a friend of mine was rowing in a 
boat somewhere in the tropics and a fifteen­
foot long anaconda tried to get into the boat, 
apparently to attack him. He subdued the 
snake with a boat paddle and finally killed 
it. He brought the hide back and had it on 
display at Inez, Ky. for a number of years. 

THE RETICULATED PYTHONS. These 
gigantic snakes of Asia run the anaconda a 
close second as being the next largest 
snake. Many records have shown it to at­
tain a length of 33 feet. Such a huge snake 
can easily swallow a sheep, a deer or a 
goat. The reticulated python is one of the 
most handsome of the large snakes. As its 
name indicates, the word "reticulated" is 
in reference to the fancy network designs 
on the back, which give it a colorful ap­
pearance. Smaller specimens of the python 
are handled by the "snake charmers" in 
side shows at the circus. 

The pythons are egg-layers and the 
female lays as many as 100 eggs. In the zoo, 
the eggs are hatched in incubators, but in 
the wild, the female piles her eggs in a near 
cone-shaped mound and coils about it, with 
her head resting on top. She remains 
perfectly quiescent until the eggs hatch. 

THE ROCK PYTHONS. These great 
snakes of tropical Africa are the third 
largest of the snakes. Their length often 
exceeds twenty feet; they are docile and 
easily handled in the zoos, but require 
feeding about once each week. They are 
noted for having vestigial claws at the rear, 
which would seem to indicate their 
evolution from lizard-like ancestors. 

The rock pythons are handsomely 
speckled from head to tail, with numerous 
spots of high color. All of the above large 
snakes kill their victims by squeezing them 
so tight the breath is shut off and they soon 
die of suffocation. Few of them are swift 
enough to capture fleet-footed animals but 
prey on those that are old, diseased, crip­
pled or otherwise incapacitated. Thus they 
were designed by nature to help maintain 
the proper balance of the large herds. 

TO ASSIST VETERANS 
Howard R. Osborn, contact represen­

tative of the Bureau of Veterans Affairs, 
will be at the Employment office in 
Prestonsburg. March 22-23, to assist 
veterans and their dependents with claims 
for benefits due them as a result of their 
military service. He will be at the office 
from 9 a.m. until 3 p.m., each day. 

'· 
HAROLD l. CONN 

General Agent 
Servicing 55 

Kentucky Counties­
Including Fayette, Franklin 
and east to the Virginia line 

Specializing in 
• Service to Policyowners 
• Business Insurance: 

Pensions 
Professional Corporations 
Kt>~ Man Insurance 

• Personal Life Insurance 

Harold L. Conn Agency 
P. 0. Box 111 

Stanville, Kentucky 41659 
"Ielephone: 606-478-6825 

"Sportsmanship in Business" 

KANSAS CITY LIFE 
IIVSUIIAIVCf COMPAIVV 

Proof of Success 

During his recent visit in Florida, Jesse 
Laferty, of Martin, joined his son·in-law, 
Delmar Thompson, in harvesting some of 
the state's heavy crop of bass. Mr. Laferty 
is here shown holding a 20 1~-inch bass 
caught in Lake Jackson, Sebring, Fla. A 
purple nightcrawler did the trick. 

Rise in Enrollment 
Forecast for ALC 

Pippa Passes, Ky.-counter to the trends 
at most colleges, applications for ad­
mission to Alice Uoyd College are now 
running about 35 percent ahead of last year. 
According to the latest report by Phillip 
Handshoe, admission director, the College 
has received 316 formal applications so far 
apd many more students have evidenced 
serious interest. 

"Seniors in the high schools we visit seem 
to have a more serious attitude about 
getting an education," Handshoe reports. 
"They like schools with small classes. 
Personal attention from teachers also is 
very important to students today." 

"Last year we toughened up our stan­
dards a little and still we had an increase in 
enrollment." Handshoe says. "This year 
we're being even more careful and 
thorough in reviewing applications. 
Although we're gauging figures more 
conservatively, the prospects for 
significant enrollment increase look very 
good." 

At this date 105 new students have been 
accepted for next year and approval is 
pending on over 200 other applications. 
Since September at least 39 new students 
have enrolled at the college, and a recent 
survey among freshmen indicates a much 
larger percentage of returning sophomores 
than the college has had in recent years. 
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_. o\ltS The,. must be a Winne' at ou' sto,e, and It 'a' could be you! Simply fill out the Entry Blank 

Win A Kodak 
lnstamatic 
Camera 

Win One of 
6 Grand Prize 
Vacations 

with this ad and drop it in our special Sweep­
stakes Entry Box between now and 5:00 P.M., 
March 31, 1973. If your entry is picked during 
our drawing, you win a Kodak lnstamatic 
Camera, Model #P-56MP. But there's more! 

If you're our lucky winner of our Kodak 
lnstamatic, you become eligible to win the 
trip of a lifetime- 7 days and 6 nights at any 
one of these colorful, exotic places. 

• Rio de Janeiro (Brazil) 
• Canary Islands (Spain) 
• Virgin Islands (St. John) 
• Acapulco (Mexico) 
• Hawaii 
• Anywhere. U.S.A. 

And, you pick the spot you like best. Don't 
miss this opportunity of a lifetime. Enter today. 
Complete official Sweepstakes rules are avail­
able at our store. 

This sweepstakes void wherever prohibited by law. 

• • ••••••••••••••••••••• • • • • • • • • • • • 

LUCITf "Lands of Color" Sweepstakes • • 
ENTRY BLANK (please print plainly) • 

NAM • • ADDRESS • • 
ZIP • 

Deposit In Paint Department • 
No Purchase Necessary • ••••••••• ••••••••••••• 

All advertisements Bearing the S & T Emblem 
Will Be Honored at Sandy Vallev Hardwart>. 

When someone you love is far 
aw(!Y, reach out and touch them 
with your voice. 

Dial them long distance. And when you do, dial an 
economy call the One Plus way. There's no cheaper way to 
call them long distance. 



Continuous Session Won't Remove 
Appellate Court Case Backlog 

• By JEANNE BECKETT 
Frankfort, Ky.-ln a sweeping change 

from seasonal recesses, the Kentucky 
Court of Appeals went into continuous 
sesaion, Jan. 1, the first such move in more 
than 75 years. 

Previously there has been three terms 
each year with a winter, spring, and a long 
smnmer recess. Under the new schedule 
there will be only a sumrner recess. 

'lbe change in sessions will not make a 
big dent in the case backlog that faces 
Kentucky's highest court, according to 
Oaief Justice JohnS. Palmore. 

Palmore feels more changes will have to 
be made, with most possibilities resulting 
in a need for constitutional revision. 

'lbe chief justice favors a "spillover 
court." He explains the plan this way: 

"Let's assume the maximum capacity of 

PIAFECT BIIDBED 
IN DNI 
DPEAATIDN 

Rotary Plow 
Attachment for 
7 .6, 10, 12 HP 

Gravely 
Convertibles 

• E:tclusive all-gear-drive 
rotary plow attachment goes 
6-7• deep, up to gn wide 
depending upon soil 
conditions. 

• Wide selection of other 
attachments includes all­
gear-drive Rotary Cultivator; 
Toolholder; also attachments 
for mowing, hauling, snow 
removal. 

• Instant forward-neutral­
reverse for easy control. 

FREE COUNSELING 
We'll help you match the 
IK\uipment to the job with a 
WJde selection of tractors, 
accessories, and features. 
Come in and talk it over, try 
'em out today I 

GET A HEAO START ON 
fOUl VECETAILE GAIDEN 
Four packets of seeds. 
lettuce, radish, tomato, 
carrot-yours just for 
tearina out this ad and 
bringinJ it m. No obligation 
at all. But hurry, offer .. -+-- ends when our supply is 
exhausted. 

PRICE'S 
GRAVELY SALES 

the Court of Appeals is 600 cases a year and 
we are receiving 1200 per year, this means 
600 won't be rendered until next year-and 
each year they get further back. The 
'spillover' court would be a mini-court that 
would take these 600 cases, study them and 
present opinions for approval by the Court 
of Appeals." 

Palmore sees two problems resulting 
from this plan-how to seled the 600 cases 
the "spillover" court would handle and 
determining the guidelines for its 
operation. "Even wi~h the 'spillover' 
court," says Palmore, "it will take skill, 
expertise and time for any group of the 
Court of Appeals to review the cases and 
select the ones that should be handled by 
the special court or agency," the Justice 
said. 

Such a "spillover" court would require a 
constitutional amendment approved by the 
voters. 

The only other alter;native seen by the 
chief justice would be to ask the legislature 
to give the court authority to accept or 
reject appeals, much in the same manner 
as is done by the U. S. Supreme Court. 

Despite its backlog, the Kentucky Court 
of Appeals turns out more opinions in a 
year's time than any other court in the 
United States of comparable size, says 
Justice Palmore. 

Talking of the mental strain on a justice, 
Palmore says, "It never leaves you when 
you go home; it wakes you in the middle of 
the night; it occupies your mind even when 
you are doing things like mowing the grass. 
It is work that can't be judged by the hours 
spent in the office behind the desk." 

"When court is recessed, it doesn't mean 
they are out loafing on the beach," says 
Justice Palmore. He points out that there is 
a tremendous amount of reading that has to 
be done in this type of work. "Every ap­
pellate judge in the United States uses a 
good deal of recess time for that purpose. I 
worked all but one day during the last 
recess of this court," Palmore says. 

At the appellate level, seven justices 
review a circuit court trial. There is no 
jury. Instead, the entire case is presented 
to the Court of Appeals in written form­
resulting in thousands or pages that must 
be studied and considered. Case records 
include every word that is said in the 
original trial, in addition to briefs from both 
attorneys. · 

"These justices are good, serious, hard­
working professionals giving as much of 
their energies and abilities as you can ask 
of men with their age and experience," 
says Palmore. "Therefo•·e, unless or until 
some changes are made, the court will 
probably have go meet the problem by 
spending less time and writing shorter 
opinions in routine cases." 

Rains Bring Respite 
For Area Foresters 

The Division of Forestry got a breather 
after the heavy rains last week, but before 
the rains came division employees had 
tbeir share. of problems with forest fires. 

Doug Robinson, Wess Campbell, and 
Tilton Johnson, and men from the Main­
stream and Nelson Programs had worked 
long hours controlling raging fires. Many 
citations have been written and arrests 
made in the past few weeks. 

Hearing Aid 
Counselor 

TO HOLD FREE HEARING AID 
CONSULTATION 

MONDAY, APRIL 2nd 
STARFIRE MOTEL 
PAINTSVILLE, KY. 

9 AM to 6 PM 

BATTERIES HALF PRICE 
We are pleased to an­
nounce that we have ob­
tained the services of Mr. 
WilHam Mullen, one of the 
most highly respected 
factory trained hearing aid 
specialist for our hearing 
aid consultation. This man 
and his staff will be present 
to counsel with those 
people who have a hearing 
problem or have trouble 
understandlDg. Mr. Mullen 
Invites you to come In for a 
free electronic hearing test 
and demonstration of new 
Bellone Hearing Aids. No 
ObUgatlon. 

Don't miss this op­
portunity-Here is 
your chance to try 
the newest and finest 
Beltone Hearing 
Aids. If you hesitate 
to ns~ a hearing aid 
for fear of being 
stared at, this latest 
lightweight com­
fortable attractive 
model may be the 
answer to your 
prayers. 

Beltone 

So you can have a better 
understanding of your 
hearing problem we wlU 
give you a copy of hearing 
tests for your medical 
records, along with a 
colored lUustratlon of the 
complete ear, absolutely 
free that you may take 
home. 

Hearing Aid Ce1ter 
601 6tk Ave11e 

COURT CHANGES--The Kentucky Court of Appeals 
is now conducting one continuous session. The new 
schedule went into operation January 1, but Chief 
Justice JohnS. Palmore says this will do little to solve 
the heavy caseload of the panel. He hopes for 
constitutional changes that will make possible more 
effective court reforms. (Photo by Ray Krause) 

Buy one, 
get one free 

Consumer Comments 
NCIW ALL WE GO'IlA 
00 IS f'IND :::DMEI!ODY 
W~ toN'T W~T 
THEIR FREE. OKI!:. 

By ED W. HANCOCK 
Attorney General of Kentucky 

As the spring and summer months ap­
proach, many consumers begin to fall 
victims to "car fever." As the fever gets 
worse, some will purchase a new car. 
However, an equally large number of 
consumers will flock to the used car dealers 
to try to make a "good buy." 

If you, or some member of your family, 
are planning on purchasing a used car, here 
are a few shopping tips which will help you 
find that "good buy." 

First, look at the tires. If the tread looks 
new, but the sides look worn, they could be 
recapped tires. 

Second, look for new paint jobs or touch­
ups. If there appear to be bumpy spots or 
waves under the paint, the car has probably 
been in a wreck. 

Third, open the door and get in behind the 
wheel. Grip the wheel at the top and try to 
move it around. If there is movement in the 
wheel, chances are the bearings in the 
wheel need replacing (or, this could be an 
indication of trouble in the axle). 

Fourth, while you're sitting behind the 
wheel, take a look at the interior, floor mat, 
carpeting, arm rests and seats-take note 
of heavy wear. This could be an indication 
of the age of the car. 

Fifth, place your foot on the brake pedal 
and push. If it goes down slowly, this is a 
good indication of a leak in the hydraulic 
system. 

Next, watch out for odometer roll-backs. 
There are severe.) ways you can check on 
the actual mileage of a car. Under Ken­
tucky Law, a used car dealer must, if you 
request him to, furnish you with the name 
of the previous owner of the car. In this way 
you can check to see what the actual 
mileage and overall condition of the car 
was at the time it was traded. Another way 
to check the mileage is by looking at the oil­
change sticker on the inside rim of the 
driver's door. It should show the exact 
mileage at the time of the last change. 

Now, take the car out for a drive. Roll the 
window down and drive the car, if possible, 
through a tunnel or between some tall 
buildings. Listen for strange sounds which 
would indicate engine problems. 

Finally, bring the car to a brisk stop. If it 
doesn't pull to the left or right, chances are 
the front end and brakes are in good shape. 

Remember one thing.lf a deal sounds too 
good to be true, it is probably neither good 
nor true. 

How long have you had that eye shadow? 
How long have you had the eye liners? Do 
the containers have dust or dirt on them? 
Do you and your daughter use the same eye 
makeup? 

The reason for these questions is simple, 
yet important to your health and possibly 
your sight. Many women suffer infection of 

Education Seminar 
For Pharmacists 

"Anticoagulant Drugs" will be the topic 
of a continuing education seminar for 
pharmacists to be held Thursday, March 29 
at Prestonsburg Community College under 
sponsorship of the University of Kentucky 
College of Pharmacy. 

The statewide program is designed to 
furnish current information on drug in­
teractions of interP.St to pharmacists and 
other health professionals in Floyd, Pike, 
Martin, Johnson and Magoffin counties. 

The session will begin a 9 p.m. (EST> in 
the Pike building on the PCC campus. The 
program will be broadcast over the U. K. 
Educational Television Network on closed­
circuit TV. 

This is one of a six-part series designed to 
give pharmacists additional education to 
assist them to better serve patients and 
fellow health professionals. 

Information concerning the registration 
fee for these seminars and other details can 
be procured from Ronald Johnson, 
Prestonsburg, telephone 886-8511, who is 
the local pharmacist coordinating the 
continuing education programs for phar­
macists in the area. Interested physicians, 
nurses and other health professionals are 
invited to participate. · ' 

LEEDY'S 
MONUMENT CO. 

Two Miles West of Prestonsburg 
On Mountain Parkway 

FINEST SOUTHERN BLUE GRANITE. 
ALL COLORS AVAILABLE. 

PHONE 886-2120 
LARRY LEEDY, Owner 

the eyes from misuse of eye cosmetics. 
Many women carelessly contaminate their 
eye makeup. 

Mascara, eye shadow or eye liners, 
misused, can and do lead to the growth of 
dangerous bacteria. When these infectious 
eye makeups are applied to areas around 
the eye, the cosmetics can cause infection 
and even blindness. 

If you have any eye cosmetics in con­
tainers which you haven't used for several 
months,it would benefit you health, and the 
health of others, to discard them. 

Regardless of where you store your 
containers, dust and dirt can collect in 
them and on them. When this is allowed to 
happen, the cosmetics can become con­
taminated. 

a uScrumpdillyishus" oHer 
good Thurs.-Fri., Mar. 22-23. 

Before you apply your eye makeup, wash 
your hands. Your hands may contain 
bacteria which can cause serious infection. 
Also, be certain that any instrument placed 
near your eyes is clean. 

Sundaes are always "scrumpdillyishus" at DAIRY QUEEN*. So we 
made 'em better the only way we knew how. 

If any eye product causes irritation, 
immediately discontinue its use. If the 
irritation persists, see your doctor. 

Dairq 
Queen 

By giving you one free with every one you 
buy. Any size. Any flavor. Rich chocolate 

... golden butterscotch ... chunky 
pineapple ... you name it. Bring a big 
appetite or a friend to a participating 

DAIRY QUEEN and dig into the best 
deal in town. 

11Let'• all go to the DAlBY QUEEN" Many women use saliva as a means of 
wetting or thinning eye cosmetics. This can 
very easily lead to infection, since bacteria 
from the mouth may grow in the cosmetic. 

Never use someone else's eye makeup or 
allow them to use yours. In one such in­
stance, a girl used a friend's eye makeup 
and subsequently contracted a serious eye 
infection which almost blinded her. 

US 23 NEAR MT. PARKWAY PRESTONSBURG, KY. 

If you have a consumer complaint or 
problem, you are invited to call the Con­
sumer Hotline between 8:30a.m. and 5:00 
p.m., toll-free at 1-800-372-2960. 

"Reg. U.S. Pet. Off., Am. D.O. Corp. lCI Copyright 1973, Am. D.O. Corp. 

The perfect 
1st,2nd,3rd,4th, S~h,6th,7th and 8th car. 

1st. If you've got a large family plus an 
overgrown Afghan, the Audi has about the 
same headroom and legroom as the Rolls­
Royce Silver Shadow. 

2nd. If you get a kick out of the way a 
sports car handles, the Audi has the same 
type of steering system as the racing Ferrari. 

3rd. If you're taking a weekend trip and 
enough luggage for 3 weeks, the Audi has 
the same trunk space as a Lincoln Continen­
tal Mark IV. 

4th. If on that trip a scenic road turns into 
one bump after another, the Audi has inde­
pendent front suspension like the Aston 
Martin. 

5th. If you're impressed with luxury (and 

who isn't?), the Audi has a luxurious interior 
like the Mercedes-Benz 280SE. 

6th. If getting to work on time means 
starting the engine on time, the Audi has the 
same type of reliable ignition system as a 
Porsche 911. 

7th. If snow and slush have always meant 
not getting to where you want to go, the 
Audi, like the Cadillac Eldorado, has front­
wheel drive to get you there. 

8th. And if a minor mishap should occur, 
the Audi gets the same expert service as a 
Volkswagen. 

TheAudi. 
It's a lot of cars for the money 

PO ASCHE 

AUDI 

VANCE VOLKSWAGEN, INC 
Route 23 North • Phone 886-3849 

f I 
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amed To Who's Who List 
Larry DeRossett, son of Mr. and Mrs. 

William DeRossett, Rt. 2, Kendallville, 
Indiana, has been named to Who's Who 
Among Students for the 1972 academic 
year. 

A senior at Spring Arbor College, Spring 
Arbor, Michigan, majoring in biolCJiy, he 
plans to teach on the secondary level upon 
graduation. In addition to his academic 
achievements, he is active on the varsity 
basketball team. 

Formerly of Martin, he is the grandson of 
Mr. and Mrs. Clell DeRossett, of Martin. 

STUDENTS ON FOUR-DAY WEEK 
Schools are in session only four days a 

week in Unity District, Maine, but student 
achievement has reportedly gone up. A 
Title Ill project is providing inservice 
training in techniques of individualizing 
instruction to teachers on Friday of each 
week, while students are in classes only on 
the other four days. The program originally 
resulted from a budget crisis after tax­
payers for a second year in a row voted a 
cut in school funds. 

TIMES WANT ADS GET RESULTS! 

CHEAP'S 
MOBILE HOMES 

....... ......, •• '-lui.,..,, 
(There us to be a rHsonl 

COME TO SEE 

91 
of tile ......... ..... . ..,..,.., ...... . 

Every CCNich set up on founct.tlon, 
decorated and landscaped so you 
an 1M how it wm look on your lot. 

.... 'sAn b .... 
Of What You C. 
Bur at Cheap's: 

~2 H. wide, 2 bedrooms. big front 
INiy window, carpet, INick door and 
many other extra features. 

Sells Nationally for 55,995 

Clleap's Prtce-$3795 ......... ~ ... ....,. 
NO FLAT ROOF '~HOE BOX" 

LOOKING TR.ll.ER AT 
CHEAP'S 

AND 
WE 
USE 

NO TRAILER FURNITURE 

in CHEAP'S COACHESI .. .., ...... ........ 
Dlredtr.a ............. ... 

.....altt.SdY•! 
IIIIJfr.aatllnd..._... 
,....., dealer ........ tile 

....... _ •• pnllt 

JP YOO BUY A NEW IIOBILE 110MB 
AND DON'T CONSIDEil CHEAP'S 
P1UC1!:S AND QUALITY YOU'LL 

LOSE MONEY. 

FREE 
300 mile delivery and 
set up on foundation. 

WE TUDE 
fQI ANYTHING Of YAtUE 

Open After Church 
On Sunday for Your Inspection 

OPEN WEEK DAYS 
aa.m.to6p.m. 

SUNDAYS 
12 Noon to 5 p.m. 

CHEAP'S 
Aa.-.... ,., ly. 

"" DIYIIIw., a...·· CMYnlel c.." OIIIJ ........ tlrfye ._.,........ ......... 

Veterans Sponsor Girl Scouts 

The Garrett Girl Scouta are now sponsored by the Garrett Chapter of the Diu bled 
Veterans, Troop leader, Mias Linda Richmond, and assistant troop leader, Mrs. 
Saundra Lafferty, witness the signing of the sponsorship agreement by Chapter 
Commander Ecil Hicks and Adjutant Monroe Vanderpool. The Garrett Chapter of 
Disabled Veterans was organized in 1969 and has approximately 500 members. 

The Garrett Girl Scout Troop 964 was organized in 1970 and has 19 members. Miss 
Richmond has been troop leader since the troop was organized. Mrs. Saundra Laf­
ferty bas been appointed assistant troop leader this year. 

Kentucky 
Afield 

By Hope Carleton 
Dept. of Fish and Wildlife 

Although the new year is less than three 
months old, it has already seen the catch of 
a state record-breaking fish-a 42-pound 
muskellunge. 

The successful fishennan, Glen Terrell, 
Morehead, took the monster-musky out of 
Licking River February 23. His catch 
topped the previous record by 2lbs., 2 ozs. 

It would seem that Kentucky fishing is off 
to a pretty good start this year. With the 
spring season just ahead, the odds favor 
more record-breaking catches in the near 
future. 

In 1972 the Kentucky record fish list was 
revised in four categories-channel catfish, 
rainbow trout, rock bass and sauger. 

The new record channel catfish, which 
weighed 10 lbs, 2 ozs., was caught by Sollie 
Clifton, Jr., Owenton, at Elk Lake Shores. 
It replaced the previous 9 lb. channel cat 
caught by Miller Welch, Lexington, in 1969. 

Jim Mattingly, Somerset, was the angler 
who landed the record 14lb., 6 oz. rainbow 
which toppled the previous 13 lb., 12 oz. 
trout taken by Danny Antle, Louisville. 
Both the record trout were taken in 
Cumberland River below Wolf Creek Dam. 

Brashears Creek yielded a lib., 7 oz. rock 
bass last year which topped the previous 
record by only 7 ozs. The new record is held 
by Ronde)) Pitcock, Louisville, who beat 
out Dick Haas, Frankfort, for the honors. 

The fourth 1972 record, a 6 lb., 1 oz. 
sauger, was caught by William Price, 
Murfreesboro, Tenn., in Kentucky Lake. 
The previous sauger record was held by 
Jim Boone, Benton. Boone's fish weighed 4 
lbs., 1 oz. and was caught in the Tennessee 
River below Kentucky Dam. 

The records are there to be broken, and 
here is the precedure for entering what 
might be a state record fish: 

Obtain a photo of the fish, showing the 
side of the specimen in detail. Have three 
persons witness the weighing of the fish and 
then send the photo, along with a statement 
signed by the angler and the witnesses, to 
the Department of Fish and Wildlife in 
Frankfort. The statement should include 
the method used in the catch, length, girth, 
weight and date and place taken. 

Here are the current Kentucky record 
fish, their weights, and where they were 
caught: 

Bluegill, 3 lbs., 6 ozs., Buchanon Pond 
(Taylor Co.); blue catfish, 100 lbs., Ten­
nessee River; buffalo, 32 lbs., Kentucky 
River; bowfin, 3 lbs., 4 ozs., Kentucky 
River; carp, 54lbs., 14 ozs., Licking River; 
channel catfish, 10 lbs., 2 ozs., Elk Lake 
Shores COwen Co.); flathead catfish, 97 
lbs., Green River; freshwater drum, 31 
lbs., Kentucky Lake; gar, 40 lbs., Ohio 
River; Kentucky bass, 7 lbs., 10 ozs., 
Nelson Co.; largemouth bass, 13lbs., 8 ozs., 
Greenbo Lake (Greenup Co.); 
muskellunge, 42lbs., Lower Licking River; 
rainbow trout, 14 lbs., 6 ozs., Cumberland 
River; rock bass, I lb., 7 ozs., Br~shears 
Creek; rockfish, ..44 lbs., 4 ozs., Herrington 
Lake; stu'11f'M, 38 Ib.s., 8 ozs. , Lam 
Cumberland; smallmouth bass <worl& 
record), lllbs., 15 ozs., Dale Hollow Lake; 
sauger, 6 lbs., 1 oz., Kentucky Lake; 
shellcracker, 2 lbs., 5 ozs.; spoonbill, 72 
lbs., Lake Cumberland; walleye, 21 lbs., 8 
ozs., Lake Cumberland; crappie, 4 lbs., 
Harrods Creek; white bass, 5 lbs., Ken­
tucky Lake; yelloe bass Copen), 5 lbs., 
Herrington Lake. 

2 Floyd Students 
Among Seven Named 
To 1973 Who's Who 

MALONEY'~S 
DISCOUNT DEPARTMENT STORES 

FRIDAY 
SATURDAY 

DOUBLE 
DISCOUNTS! 

Pippa Passes, Ky.-seven Alice Uoyd 
College students have been selected for 
inclusion in the 1973 edition of "Who's Who 
in American Junior Colleges". They are 
Kathy Adams, Jeremiah, Ky.; Gary 
Ferguson,Hazard, Ky.; Sharon Gearheart, 
Hueysville, Ky.; Carolyn Hunter, Printer, 
Ky.; Charlotte King; Pippa Passes, Ky.; 
Ronnie Slone, Gamer, Ky.; and Debbie 
Thomas, Ona, West Virginia. DISCOUNT SALEI 

RED 
WHITE 
BLUE 

BASEBALL 

GLOVE 

MEN'S 

WESTERN 

JEANS 

BASKETBALL 

BACKBOARD 
A liD 

GOAL 
SET 

LADIES' 

))77 

379 POLYESTER 4,, FLARE 
SLACKS 

HORSESHOE SPARK 

PITCHING799 PLUG 399 
WRENCH 

SET KIT 

SAL YEISYILLE 
PAINTSVILLE 
PIESTONSBURG 

"Who's Who in American Junior 
Colleges" provides a national basis for the 
recCJinition of outstanding campus leaders. 
It includes listings from over 500 schools in 
all 50 states. Nominations are submitted 
from each junior college after selection by 
a campus committee. 

BOARD AWARDS CONTRACT 
The Barren County Board of Education 

has awarded the construction contract for 
the new Barren County vocational school. 
The $645,351 bid was complicated by the 
claim of an electrical subcontractor that a 
clerical error resulted in a bid about $32,000 
too low, but on the advice of its attorney, 
the board awarded the bid and left it up to 
the contractor to reach an agreement with 
the subcontractors. 

TO All 

UNITED MillE WORIERS, 

DISTRICT 30: 

Do you want corruptioa bl Diatrlct 
30'!' If you don't want corruption in 
oar District 38. vote for 

ELDER FORREST 

McCOWN 
For 

PRESIDENT 
DISTRICT 30, UMWA 

1 have been a member of Local 
Union 5899 at Wheelwright, Ky., for 
Z8J,ir yean. I know what the needs of 
the disabled miners, wldowa, pen­
siollen and active miners are ... U 
you want a conscientious worker fer 
yoar interests as President of 
District 30, vote for and support my 
candidacy. I have been endorsed by 
International President Arnold 
MlUer. 

3-14-2t-pd. 

Average Family 
PaymentsDebt 
Held at $1020 

Special to the Times 
NEW YORK, Mar. 9-How much does the 

average family in Floyd county owe in the 
form of installment debt? 

To what extent are local residents using 
the buy-now, pay-later plan in their pur­
chases of big ticket items? 

More than they did a year ago, according 
to the findings. There has been a steady 
increase in recent months, locally and 
elsewhere, in the use of installment credit. 

What it means is that consumers have 
finally loosened their pursestrings, after a 
period of restrained buying, to purchase the 
cars, dishwashers, furniture, hi-fi equip· 
ment and other expensive articles that they 
have long been wanting. And, as spending 
for such items picks up, so does the demand 
for credit. 

The net result, nationally, it that in­
stallment debt at the beginning of this year 
reached approximately $129 billion, or 
about $19 billion more than in January, 
1972. 

It was equivalent, on the average, to 
about 16 cents out of every dollar of family 
income, after taxes. 

In Floyd county, based upon the latest 
local income and spending figures and upon 
national studies by the Federal Reserve 
Board and others, the amount of in· 
stallment debt outstanding is estimated at 
$1,020 per family. 

That is the average. It ranges from no 
debt at all, in some families, to con­
siderably more than average in others. 

For the local population as a whole, the 
amount of installment debt at the end of the 
last fiscal year was close to $10,305,000. 

The largest part of it consisted of loans 
for automobile purchases. The remainder 
was for other installment buying, for 
personal loans and loans for home repair 
and modernization. Not in this category are 
mortgage debt, charge accounts and single 
payment loans. 

Making repayments at a regular rate 
takes nearly $1 out of every $6 that a family 
has left after taxes. 

In Floyd county, that amounts to $85 per 
month per family, on average. 

The big question among bankers and 
credit men is whether the American public 
is taking on more debt than it can carry. 

RETURN HOME 
Mr. and Mrs. Jesse Laferty, of Arkansas 

Creek, near Martin, have returned from 
Sebring, Florida where they spent the past 
three months visiting their daughter and 
son-in-law, Mr. and Mrs. Delmar Thomp­
son and children. 

SECTION THREE, PAGE SEVE~ 

Why you 
should buy 
LENNOX central 
cooling now: 
1. Lennox quality central air conditioning is a 

good buy any time. 
2. Pre-season savings during our "Nifty Weather 

Days" sale make it even better. 
3. Prompt installation before hot weather. 
4. Dependable, cool, clean quiet comfort tor many 

summers to come. 

OUTDOOR COOLING UNIT: Compact. Isolated 
compressor and upward discharge fan make it 
quiet. Weatherproof paint keeps it looking great. 

Call now for our low price on 
a Lennox comfort system for 
your home. 

Elliott Glass & Electric Co. 
Phone 886-2781 Prestonsburg 

SUPPOIJ JHf BOY SCOUJSI 

Nifty 
\Wather Machine' M 

Headquarters 

The FUTURE belongs 
To those who SAVE for it. 

FLOYD FEDERAL CAN 
and DOES pay more on 

• your sav1ngs. 
Compare these figures with what you 

are now geHing for your money 
On Two Year Certificates on $10,000.00 and up. You may make a with­
drawal at any time in which event you may forfeit interest on the account 
not to exceed three months. 

% On Two Year Certificates of $5,000.00 and up. 

5 lf2 % On One year certificates of $1,000.00 and up. 

5 ".14 % On Three to Six month certificates of ssoo.oo and up. 

5% 
On Passbook accounts. This is the most flexible plan and rhe one which 
most small savers will find the best suited to their needs. Compare this 
with the 4112 percent rate paid by commercial banks on the same type of 
account. 

ALL ACCOUNTS ARE INSURED TO $20,000.00 BY THE FEDERAL SAVINGS 
AND LOAN INSURANCE CORPORATION. NOONE HAS LOST A PENNY IN A 
FEDERALLY INSURED INSTITUTION SUCH AS OURS. 

INTEREST IS PAID QUARTERLY (MARCH 31, JUNE 30, SEPT. 30 and 
DECEMBER 31) YOU MAY LEAVE YOUR INTEREST IN WHICH CASE IT 
WILL BE ADDED TO THE ACCOUNT AND COMPOUND AT THE SAME RATE 
OF INTEREST OR, ON THE LARGER ACCOUNTS MAY BE PAID TO YOU BY 
CHECK MONTHLY OR QUARTERLY AS YOU PREFER. 

YOU WORKED HARD FOR YOUR MONEY. WHY NOT MAKE IT WOB 
HARDER FOR YOU AT FLOYD FEDERAL? 

WE INVITE YOU TO COME AND LO US TELL YOU ABOUT OUR 
SAVINGS PLANS. 

FLOYD FEDERAL 
SAVINGS AND LOAN ASSOCIATION 

19 South Lake Drive 

PRESTONSBURG KENTUCKY 
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Dairy Values! 
NuMaid . %-lb. 23C 
Marganne. • • • • mug pak 
TableRite 10-oz 69C 
Longhorn Colby Cheese pkg. · 

14%-oz. 
can 

ShowBoat 

Pork & 
Beans 

lOe 
Paramount 55c 
Chili with Beans • • • ~:~oz. 
IGA Thrown Stuffed 6 59c 
Manzanilla Olives • • • j~:z. 
Paramount Polski Wyrob ~2-oz. 49c 
Kosher Dill Pickles • • 1ar 
IGA Crisp 'n Good TI'I(IJiilr or 10-oz. 49c 
Potato Chips • .u·,;,~k/e • pkg. 
Royal Guest ~rinkle Cut S-Ib. age 
French Fnes • • • • • pkg. 
Bush Best 16 19C 
Cut Green or Shelly Beans ca~oz. 

IGA 

Vegetables 
17-oz. can 

YOUR CHOICE -
Garden Run Sweet Peas, 
Golden Cream or 
Whole Kernel Corn 

15e 

Land 0' 
Lakes 

8- 10-lb. 
18- 20-lb. 

Fischer 

Turkey 
lb.49e/~ 

Mellwood Bacon • 
Fischer 12-oz 79c 
All Meat Wieners pkg. · 
Fischer '"I("'"' ggc Bologna • • or ~hie~ • • 1-lb. 

TableRite 

Biscuits 
Old Style 

or 
Buttermilk 

6-pak 
¢ 

THE FLOYD COUNTY TIMES 

COKE or 

can 

TAB 
Hot or Mild 
Webber Sausage 

SECTION THREE. PAGE EIGHT 

15rl off label 

38-oz. size 

Breeze-~ 
laundry 

Detergent 

Renuzit choice of 7 39C 
Air Freshener Aerosol 5.wri~tii'S ~~z. 
Dog House 16·oz 1 oc 
Dog Food • • • • • • can . 
IGA 49C Peach, Apricot or Fig Bars ~:~~z. 
IGA 33 Buttermilk Pancake Mix ~~:: c 
IGA Golden 32-oz. 43c 
Waffle Syrup • • • • bot. 

Hilberg Convenience Meats 

m IGA Fancy 
Beef Beef Precooked 
Steak Patties Beef 

15%.-oz. 99¢ 
pkg. 

Patties 
11%-oz. 79¢ 
pkg. 

Fruit 
Ill Cocktail 
17-oz. 

TableRite can 25¢ 
Whole Fryers 

Halves or 
Sliced 

29-oz. 
can 

lb. 

l'inrapple Oronge, Orat11f1', 

10-oz. 
bot. 

¢ 

Golden 
Ripe 

Crisp Green Peppers • • each 19c 
Fl 'd 0 5-lb. sgc J on a ranges • • • • bag 
California 49c 
Red Grapes. • • • • • lb. 

We reserve the 
right to limit 

all 
quantities. 

TableTreat 34c 
Enriched Sandwich Bread ~o~r· 
IGA 12's cello 39c Cake Donuts • • • pkg. bag 

IGA 
Deluxe 

Coffee Bananas 
IGA J'irwopple Crape.frurt, 46-oz 29C Fruit Drinks ~rop:, F~uit l~unr~ can · 
IGA 12-oz 17C 
Elbow Macaroni • • • • pkg. · 

IGA 13-oz. 69C 
Angel Food Cake • • • pkg. 

IGA Vegetables mix or 
m11ldt 

Green Peas, Whole Kernel Corn, Mixed 
Vegetables, Broccoli Spears, or Caulifower 

10-oz. pkg. 5 for 1 00 

Buy featured 
bonus products and 

2-lb. can 

receive free bonus coupons 
good for valuable gifts Gift Pia~ 

39 
IGA 12-oz 25C 
Medium Noodles • • • pkg. · 100's 

pkg. 

Kraft 7 21 C 
Macaroni & Cheese Dinner pk~~- IGA 

Tea 

lb. 
Kratt 8-oz 29C 
French Dressing. • • • bot.· 

Bags99e 

Gold Award Coupon 
ONE ( l) FREE 

Gold Award Coupon 

~::=:.-./1 with the t '-"\) purchase of 

·. · ·• $7.50or 
· · more 

O.((i•r bpir••.• 

·~~ Redeem Your Saver Cards For 
• These Nationally Advertised Giftsl 

I • 

12-CUP MUFFIN PAN TWIN FLAT SHEETS 4- PIECE CUTLERY SET 
Yours FREE with 4 cards Yours FREE with 7 cards Yours FREE with 6 cards 

ANGEL FOOD CAKE PAN PINK or BLUE BLANKETS 5-PIECE CUTLERY SET 
Yours FREE with 8 cards Yours FREE with 7 cards Yours FREE with 6 cards 

TWIN FITTED SHEETS 
Yours FREE with 7 cards 

FULL FLAT SHEETS 
Yours FREE with 8 cards 

FULL FITTED SHEETS 
Yours FREE with 8 cards 

2 PILLOW CASES 
Yours FREE with 5 cards 

2·PIECE STEAK KNIFE SET 3-PIECE TOWEL SET 
Yours FREE with 2 cards Yours FREE with 8 cards 

2's pak 

Vanity Fair 
Regal Prints 

Towels 

29¢ 
1/orclt:!l ® 

'---------------' 
Gold Award Coupon tel!ffu·il.h.,!.t.Jij 

Vanity Fair Regal Print 45 P.!!I•R••'!"'II•- Bathroom Tissue • • • 4-pak c rea aLtO.· i(·li·m ·t.l q Gold Award Coupon Gold Award Coupon 
; ONE (1) FREE ONE (l) FREE ; ONE (l) FREE 1 
1 Gold Award Coupon Gold Award Coupon 1 Gold Award Coupon 1 
I...._ ~with the ...._ ~ with the I ...._ ~ with the I 
I I 32-oz. bot. of I 10-oz. bag I I dozen of I I'll purchase of '-~~ purchase of I '-~~ purchase of I 
I ' ' • I IGA Lemon ' ' • I IGA I ' ' • I TableRite I 
I · · I · I 
1 · · Liquid · · Potato 1 · · Large 1 

I . Detergent Chips : Eggs : 
I Of(i·r 1- •·l'in·s "1 @l) Olfi•r /'.\I"'''" 111 . @l) O(ji•r /-\fJirt•l "

1 @l) I 
1/nrdt ;: 1 '''J>(tdnr o li,.,, h :! I ndlwlt.w·d r I liurr h :! I n·gulnr 1 

"" I"",. ~ "" . (ITII'I' ~ "" IJ'I<'I' ~ 
, _____________ , , _____________ , , _____________ , 
Gold Award Coupon 

; ONE (1) FREE I 
1 Gold Award Coupon 1 
I ~ with the I I'll purchase of I I one can of I 
I • • • t . I 
1 . Esqu•re 1 
I · · Boot Polish : 
I . . ul I 
I 0/.fr•r /-.~1'"''·' ,.~,1,,. ~ I 

ll .. rdt _I ,.,;, .,. ~ 

'---------------' 

Gold Award Coupon Gold Award Coupon 
ONE (l) FREE ONE (1) FREE 

Gold Award Coupon Gold Award Coupon 

1;--.~ ;~;~ht~~ of 
1
: ~~~ ~~~~~~s~ of 

one pkg. of three 3-oz. 
, , • 1 • • • I bo f Any Brand xes o 

· · · ~~A · · · Jello 
Sp1ces 

. u/ . ul 
01/r·r r \JIIfl'\ I @l) Ol(i·r I \f/11'1'' "'""'''' @l) \/ ., '''J!U t~r ' . ·• '": • 

1., '"' lr - I 1,;, ,. \. \/cJrdt • I I"",. ~ 
, _____________ _, , _____________ , 

ONE (l) FREE ; 
Gold Award Coupon I 

...._ ~ withthe I 
'-~~ purchase of I 

5-lb. bag of I 

oNE < 1 > FREE 1 Health & Beauty Aids 
Gold Award Coupon 1 

--./1 with the I A . 50's 69c 
~ ~~~ purchase of I naCIO • • • • • • • bot. 

'. ' • I Royal Guest : 
· · Krinkle Cut 1 

1 6 pak of I IGA Xtra-Rich or 37 • . • • t IGA Frozen I Castile Shampoo • • • 16-oz. c 
· · Orange bot. 

French Fries• 
I 

Offr•r i ; :>.pifl•,, ~~lwti.w·d ~ 1 

: Arrid Xtra-Dry 97 
nDi·r 1\1';,., "' J@l)u ice 1 Deodorant • • • • • !!z. c 
\I,;,. I& :! I rr·~ular 1 I 

I. \/arrlt :!J prl<•' ~ ~ , _____________ , \. "'"'' ~ , _____________ , 
Gold Award Coupon Gold Award Coupon 

; ONE (l) FREE ONE (1) FREE ; 
I Gold Award Coupon Gold Award Coupon I 
I .._ ~ with the ,...._ __./) with the I 
11
-. purchase of -.~ purchase of I 

I 5-lb. bag of 1-lb. pkg. of I 
1 • • • I • • • t I 
1: . . . OFiroaridna gJuiece

5 
. Fischer 1 
· · Bologna I 

I Ill ()/{' I . I I 
Oj(r·r /- ,,;,,._, @l) .. r·r · ·'111"'·' 11 @l) 1 I Hr~rdt :.! I ruln·rll.•r·d 1 \/,.rcft :! 1 rr·1wt11r 1 

\. fJrtn• ~ \. ,.,.;,,. ~ , _____________ , '----·--------' 

KENNEBEC 
SEED 

POTATOES 
50Lbs. $469 

While They Last! 
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