
Read Each Week by More 
Than 6,000 Families nun 

PRESTONSBURG, KENTUCKY 416S3 SPEAKING OF AND FOR FLOYD COUNTY 

Stumbo ay 
He WillAsl{ 
ClubsP obe 
Spread Over Co\tnty 
Of Private Clubs 
To Prompt Action 
The spread of private clubs through the 

county has led Commonwealth's Attorney 
Harold J. Stumbo to a decision to direct a 
grand jury investigation of all such places 
at the September session of circuit court. 

Two clubs in the Prestonsburg area are 
under closing orders from circuit court. But 
others are operating, and Stumbo said that 
it is not fair to close one club and permit 
others to operate if they are in violation of 
liquor and other laws. 

The court term is viewed as one which 
will be the busiest in several years -
particularly for the grand jury. Four 
homicides are slated for investigation. In 
recent years, such investigations have been 
limited to one or two as the murder rate 
dropped. 

One of the cases to be investigated is of 
long standing, and another originated in 
neighboring Knott county. The old murder 
case up for further probing is the mystery­
slaying on Arkansas Creek of James 
Chaffins, Louisville man, while he was en 
route to Garrett for a visit with relatives. 

The Knott county slaying to be in­
vestigated is t~at of Claude Conley. The 
case came under Floyd court jurisdiction 

(See Story No.4, Page 16) . .., ............... ur.rrnnu n .. 
This Town ••• That World .. nnnn un-..·n n·re . 

BELATED REPORT 
Things have come to a pretty pass when a 

guy makes a hole-in-{)ne and his hometown 
newspaper neglects to mention it. But we 
finally get around to it. Jack Rice, 
Prestonsburg barber, whacked the ball 
from No. 6 tee at the Jenny Wiley State 
Park course squarely onto the green, 
whereupon it took a couple of hops and 
due ed in o the hole Jack lias rwo wit­
nesses to the feat, but Donnie Howard has 
suggested the story would have more 
credence if · I neglected to mention their 
names. 

SO THAT'S WHAT BECAME OF IT! 
Martin Lee ( Bo) May writes from 

Lexington to pile up a little more proof that 
it's a small world, after all. Says he flew a 
thousand miles last May to visit his 
brothers, Fred and Tom, in Austin, Texas. 
There, in the driveway of a large home, was 
what appeared to be the householder's 
attempt to convert a bus into a camper. 
And in big letters on the top of the bus 
appeared these familiar words : 

PRESTONSBURG CITY BUS 
(See Story No.2, Page 16) 

Part of last Saturday's haul of beer, whiskey and vodka is shown as 
Sheriff Frank Leslie (right foreground) is joined by County Judge 
Henry Stumbo (in white shirt) and state and county officers who 
took part in the raids. 

S turday aids Net 
B · Haul~ 4 Arreste 

County and state officers joined in raids 
Saturday which resulted in four arrests and 
the confiscation of a heavy haul of whiskey, 
vodka and beer. 

Arrested on possession charges were Lon 
Neeley, of the Auxier road, Mack Hunt, of 
Tram, and James McKinney, of Harold 
Gap. Donald Tackett, also of Harold Gap, 
was arrested on a warrant alleging that he 
sold a case of beer for $12 to an unknown 
man. 

The raid on Neeley, made by Sheriff 
Frank Leslie, State Police Sgt. Flora and 
Deputy Sheriffs Grady Skeans and Tom 
James, netted 64 pints of whiskey, 17 pints 
of vodka and 635 cans of beer, all of which 
was brought to the Sheriff's office here. 
Seventy~ight cans of beer which had been 

Floyd County Emergency & Rescue 
Squad members furnished searchlights 
while railway employees worked last 
Wednesday night to clear C. & 0. Railway 
Company tracks on Beaver Creek, near 
Allen, of the wreckage of a dozen empty 
coal cars. 

The cars, part of a 150-car train, derailed 
at 2:30 last Wednesday afternoon. The 
tracks were cleared and the cars were back 
on the rails by 1:30 Thursday morning. 

Damage to the tracks extended ap­
proximately 200 feet. The wreck occurred 
when a flat car next to the engine derailed. 
Nobody was hurt. 

chilled also were taken during the raid and 
were destroyed. 

Neeley said a search of his store un­
covered no intoxicants and that the 
premises where the haul was found was 
operated by Estill Hayden under a lease 
contract executed June 1, 1969. He con­
tended the search of Hayden's premises 
was made without search warrant, but the 
Sheriff's office pointed out that both places 
were under the same roof. Hayden was not 
arrested. 

The same afternoon at Tram, State 
Police Sgt. Ellis Ross and Deputy Sheriff 
Claude Flanery confiscated 22 cases of beer 
and 14 half-pints of whiskey in a search of 
the Mack Hunt premises. 

Almost simultaneously, State Police Lt. 
Lykins, Deputy Sheriffs Silas DeRossett 
and 0 to Fannin were raiding the James 
Me . ney premises at Harold Gap, where 
they reported[inding 28 cases of be and 
55 half -pints of wl ,key. 

Bid of$19,900 
Offered by Firm 
On Fire Station 

The $19,000 b1d submitted by Prestons­
burg Building Supply, Inc. for con­
struction of a second fire station here was 
tentatively accepted by the City Council at 
its special meeting Monday night. 

It was the only bid offered. The contract 
provides for a 50 by 50-foot steel building, 
complete with wiring, plumbing and 
heating. 

Construction of the second fire station, 
which will serve the Lancer section of 
Prestonsburg, is one of a series of im­
provements necessary to earn the city a 
fire insurance classification which will 
result in reduced insurance rates. 

Other steps yet to be taken include the 
purchase of another fire truck and the 
laying of larger water lines in the Trimble 
Branch and Court street sections. These 
were discussed at last week's regular 
council meeting. 

The new fire station will be erected on 
city-{)wned property between US 23 and the 
water plant. Site preparation will be done 
while building materials are awaited. It is 
expected that the station will be completed 
within the next six weeks. · 

ANOTHER OF SAME NAME 
The Times has been asked to state that 

the Dennis Lee Blanton who was recently 
listed as having been arrested is not the 
Dennis Lee Blanton who lives at McDowell. 

.. ......., .... &IF"" ._uuw.nnn«:::" 

Court House Happenings 
nnn r n nnnn . 

SUITS FILED 
Opal Maynard vs. Kelly Maynard. Ruth 

Ann Gray vs. Amos John Gray. Rose Mary 
Collins vs. Commonwealth Fire and 
Casualty Insurance Co. William P. Slone, 
Jr. vs. Ruth Patton Slone. Rosemary Leslie 
Slonevs. Billy Slone. George W. Snodgrass, 
admr. vs. Estill D. Baldridge, et. al. 
Darrell Lafferty vs. Louise Lafferty. Helen 
Hagans vs. Delmer Hagans. Virginia Lee 
Hill vs. Hobert Hill. Bryce A. Baker vs. C. 
W. Enterprises, Inc. Nell Ruth Leslie Slone 
vs. Bobby Slone. Ithaca Gun Co., Inc. vs. 
Robert N. Ranier, d-b-a. 

(See Story No. 3, Page 16) 

Five Defendants 
In Liquor Cases 
Delay Hearings 

Five of the seven cases waived within the 
week from quarterly court to the Sep­
tember grand jury are those in which 
defendants are accused of liquor law 
violations. 

Defendants are Sherman Cook, Clarence 
Martin and Ashland Joseph, each charged 
with transporting. 

Two other cases waived were those of 
Versie Mae Duncan, wfio faces child 
desertion and reckless use of a deadly 
weapon counts. 

Pleas of guilty were made in most cases 
heard during the week. The results follow 
(in each case court costs were added to 
amounts of fines levied) : 

Lester Fred Mitchell, drunk driving, $100 
fine; Berlin Conn, reckless driving, $10; 
George Ralph King, fishing without license, 
$10; Elmer Crum, drunk driving,$100; 
Peter M. Conley, improper passing, $10; 
Oscar Hancock, Jr., drunk driving, $100; 
Winsell Spurlock, reduced to reckless 
driving, $10; William Paul Skeens, reduced 
to reckless driving, $100; Fred Contant, 
undersize bass, $15; Martin Auxier, 
speeding, $10; Ashland Davis, no operator's 
license and reckless driving, $10 on each 
count; Jimmy Irick, no operator's license, 
$10; James Stephen Ison, drunk driving, 
$100; Robert Meadows, speeding, $10; 
James D. Slone, drunk driving, $100; 
Jimmy Smith, possession of alcoholic 
beverages, given trial in absentia, $20 and 
30 days in jail; Larry Morris and Larry 
Music, no operator's license, each fined $2; 
Alan Stanton and Dale Stratton, fishing 
without a license, $15 each; Sherbert Slone, 
no operator's license, $2; Gary Blake 
Newsome, reckless driving, $10. 

Allen-Pikeville 
Detour To Open 
First of Week 

The detour around construction on US 23 
between Prestonsburg and Pikeville will be 
opened Monday, the Kentucky Department 
of Highways announced this week. 

North-south traffic will be routed over 
KY 122 near Virgie through Melvin and 
Burton to KY 80 south of Martin to Allen 
where KY 80 and US 23 meet. Length of the 
detour is 40 miles. 

East-west detour will also follow KY 80 
and KY 122 from Allen to Shelbiana, a 
distance of 50 miles. 

The detour will not carry trucks over 
30,000 pounds, which means heavier trucks 
must use an alternate route or travel over 
KY 80-US 23 despite lengthy delays. 

With the help of Appalachian funds, the 
route }Jas been resurfaced and upgraded for 
the detour traffic. 

REPORTS EXPLOSION 
Mrs. Fanny DeRossett reported to the 

Sheriff's office Monday morning that some 
sort of explosive had been detonated on the 
porch of her home at 202 Trimble Road at 3 
a.m., Monday. Fragmented wrappings of 
the explosive were examined by State 
Detective Chester D. Potter. No damage 
resulted from the explosion. 

TURTLE CONVENTION. Floyd county has not suffered unduly 
from drouth this summer, but this congregation of box turtles 
(commonly known as terrapins) on a Right Beaver Creek farm 
spells dry weather. Fifty-one of the slowpoke travellers were 
counted in one shallow waterhole. 

, 'A Funny Thing' Will Happen 

It's Hot - and Dry - But County 
Not Hit As Hard As Some Areas 

Floyd county may be more fortunate than 
other areas of the state as the July sun dries 
things up and as rainfall becomes spottier 
and less frequent. 

Gene Ball, of the Extension Department, 
said this week that gardens and crops over 
the county are good. He added that the 
rainfall this year has been more than 
adequate in comparison with four years 
ago when the rainfall from March to March 
was only 18 inches. The average annual 
rainfall here is 42 inches. 

The Kentucky Crop and Livestock 
Reporting Service said 43 per cent of its 
reporters over the state termed the soil 
moisture short, while roughly half said it is 
adequate. 

The shortage is most pronounced in the 
western part of the state, the service said. ­
TI1e Paducah area has had only one-third of 

an inch of rain in the last 26 days. Camp­
bellsville, in the central part of the state, by 
contrast, received 3.2 inches of rain last 
week. 

The service said that corn, in the driest 
areas, has begun to tassel. Late planted 
corn is beginning to "fire"-turn brown 
before it has matured. Soybeans average 
only 16 inches high, six inches shorter than 
at this time a year ago. 

Tobacco growth has been evening up, the 
service said, with one-fourth of the plants 
averaging more than three feet in height; 
one-half from two to three feet and one­
fourth one to two feet, all shorter than at 
this time a year earlier 

Ironically, the service said Tuesday and 
Wednesday of last week were the coolest 
July da}s in more than 80 years 

At Amphitheatre, Starting Aug. 6 
Film star Thomas Kirk will be featured 

as Marcus Lycus in the Jenny Wiley 
Summer Music Theatre production of "A 
Funny Thing Happened on the Way to the 
Forum." The hit Broadway musical 
comedy will run at the Amphitheatre in 
Jenny Wiley State Park Thursdays, 
Fridays, and Saturdays, August 6-22. 

"Little Mary Sunshine" will play its final 
performance at the Amphitheatre this 
week-Thursday, Friday and Saturday. 

Kirk, a Kentucky native, has starred in 
many movies and television shows, in­
cluding Walt Disney's "Swiss Family 
Robinson," "The Hardy Boys," "The 
Shaggy Dog," and "Bon Voyage." He was 
guest star in the Jenny Wiley Summer 
Music Theatre production of "Anything 
Goes" last summer. This summer he has 
been appearing at the Amphitheatre as 
Horace in "Hello, Dolly!" as Uncle Oscar 
in "Little Mary Sunshine" (through August 
1) and, now, as the slave-trader in 
"Forum." 

In "A Funny Thing Happened on the Way 
to the Forum" Kirk plays the role 
originated by John Carradine on Broadway 

and Phil Silvers in the movie. He finds the 
role in a musical hailed as one of the fun­
niest in Broadway history most 
challenging. 

"Forum" is founded in the comic devices 
that have delighted for centuries and which 
were featured in some of the great films of 
the silent movie era. There are mistaken 
identities, disguises and slapstick comedy. 

Also appearing in the musical are Tim 
Toney as Pseudolus, the cunning slave, 
determined to steal Philia, played by 
Connie O'Connell, for his young master 
Hero, played by Richard D. Brenckman. 
The famous warrior, Miles Gloriosus, and 
Ph ilia's husband-to-be, is played by 
Donovan Sylvest. Hysterium is played by 
Kirk Kirkpatrick. The musical is directed 
by Thomas Jones. 

Tickets are available at the theatre by 
calling 886-3408 and at the following 
locations: the Chamber of Commerce and 
Whizz Auto Parts in Pikeville, Big Sandy 
Drug and Heart of the Highlands in Paints­
ville, and at Francis Department Store and 
Burke Fabric Shop in Prestonsburg , 
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Coal Prices Soaring 
As Industry Booms 
Mobile X-Ray Unit 
Visit Set Aug. 6th 

The mobile X-ray unit donated by the 
Kentucky Elk Lodges will be at the Floyd 
County Health Department Thursday, 
August 6, from 10 to 12 noon and from 1 to 3 
p.m. 

Dr. Russell L. Hall, Floyd county health 
officer, is urging all teachers, foodhan­
dlers, known contacts of tuberculosis cases 
and citizens living in the Prestonsburg area 
to take advantage of this free service and 
have chest X-rays made. 

Any individual who has received a letter 
requesting a larger chest picture made 
should bring the letter and present it to the 
technician on duty at the trailer. 

2 Jailed Here 
On Arson Count 
In Home Blaze 
Two Hueysville residents were jailed 

over the week-end on arson charges after a 
home under construction on nearby Salt 
Lick Creek was destroyed by fire last 
Friday night. 

Jailed by Deputy Sheriffs Albert Salyer 
and Sollie Holbrook were Clyde Vanderpool 
and Phillip Neeley. Warrants alleging 
arson have been issued for Tivis and 
Marvin Neeley. 

The building that was burned was a 
residence being erected by John Jude, 
operator of a sawmill near the scene of the 
blaze. 

Dan Kidd and Isaac Howell were 
released from jail under bond last week 
after it had been determined that Italy 
Spears, 55, of the Harold vicintiy, will 
survive a beating administered him, a few 
days earlier. Spears was brought to the 
Prestonsburg General Hospital. 

A Magoffin countian, Wilson Buck 
Shepherd, was jailed here Friday as an 
alleged parole violator and is being held for 
return to LaGrange prison. It was said at 
the jail that Shepherd had served a part , a 
pen term for manslaughter and arrived 
home on parole last week. Soon thereafter, 
this report says, he attempted an attack 
upon his wife and his brother. 

Others jailed within the week, charges 
against each and names of arresting of­
ficers follow: 

Donnie Glenn Moore, a.w.o.l., by State 
Trooper John Brenner and FBI Agent 
McGuinty; Harold B. Howell, a.w.o.l., by 
Deputy Sheriff Wallace Frazier; George 
Cochran, drunk driving, by State Trooper 
Gary Rose; Larry Douglas Music, no 
driver's license and possession of beer, by 
Park Officer Russell Thornsberry; Glenn 
Hopson, drunk driving, by State Trooper 
Rose; Don Yates, reckless driving, by State 
Trooper Thornsberry. 

(See Story No. 5, Page 16) 

Goss Plans Repair 
Of BL-Justell Span 

State Senator Clifford B. Latta has been 
assured by Commissioner of Highways 
Eugene Goss that work will be initiated 
soon to restore the Betsy-Layne-Justell 
bridge spanning the Big Sandy to a safe, 
usable condition. Mr. Goss has referred the 
project to the Pikeville district highway 
office. 

Guardrails and flooring of the bridge are 
in a sad state of disrepair and certain 
structural weaknesses exist, Senator Latta 
said. The bridge, a one-lane span 
parallelling the old railroad bridge at Betsy 
Layne, is the only highway link for Justen 
with US 23. 

Price for Coal 
Up to $12 a Ton 
And Still Rising 

The federal Mine Safety Act has not 
driven coal operators out of business, as 
was predicted when the legislation was first 
enacted -instead, it has driven the price of 
coal up. 

And the coal business, historically a 
"feast or famine" industry, apparently is 
booming in Floyd and all coal-producing 
counties of the state. 

That means that while many other parts 
of the nation are in the economic doldrums, 
economically depressed Eastern Kentucky 
is prospering along with other coal­
producing areas. 

Coal that two years ago was bringing 
$2.50-$4 a ton is now selling at $9 to $12 at the 
railhead. "You could paint a rock black and 
sell it," one operator said. The big fear is 
that coal will go so high that it will price 
itself out of the fuel market. 

Biggest beneficiaries of the boom are the 
strip-mine operators, and their numbers 
are increasing almost daily. Despite the 
inferior grade of their coal, as compared 
with that of the deep-mine producer, it's 
black, and it brings top prices. And these 
are the fellows whom the safety act almost 
missed - they are not required to buy 
costly machinery in order to comply with 
provisions against "gassy" mines. 

In this county deep mining is restricted 
mainly to the operations of the Island Creek 
Coal Company, and its production has been 
reduced with the closing of several Left 
Beaver Creek openings. A huge deep-mine 
operation on Right Beaver Creek, in the 
Caney Creek area, is under development by 
George E. Evans, Jr., but a railroad must 
first be built and actual loading of coal is 
months away. 

Kyle Vance, of The Courier-Journal, 
(See Story No.1, Page 16) 

.vel Child Die~., 
• 

arents l1tjured 
n Auto Wreck 
An automobile wreck on US 23, near 

Tram, early Saturday evening, resulted in 
the death of a three-year-{)ld I vel child and 
the serious injury of his parents and a 
brother. 

The child, Billy Ray Burchett, died at the 
Methodist hospital, Pikeville, later in the 
evening. His father, James J. Burchett, 37, 
of Ivel, was listed in fair condition at the 
same hospital. His mother, Mrs. Laura 
Stacey Burchett, 27, was transferred 
Sunday to the UK Medical Center, 
Lexington, where her condition was 
described as serious. George Burchett, 9, 
brother of the victim, was in serious con­
dition at the Pikeville hospital. 

Other occupants of the Burchett auto, 
Harry B. and James Gregory Burchett, 
brothers of the victim, and his grand­
mother, Mrs. Susan Gillespie, of Ivel, 
escaped with minor hurts. 

State Police said a car driven by Robert 
Lee Boyd, of Tram, was passing the Bur­
chett auto when the brakes of the Burchett 
car were applied, and may have locked, the 
car skidding over an embankment and 
striking a tree. 

Funeral services for the Burchett child 
were held Tuesday at 11 a.m. from the 
residence, ministers of the Church of Christ 
officiating, and burial was made in the 
family cemetery on Slick Rock fork of Cow 
Creek under direction of the Hall Brothers 
Funeral Home. 

CHEERLEADERS WIN TOP RATINGS 
Excellent and superior ratings were won by Prestonsburg high 

school's varsity cheerleaders at the National Cheerleaders 
Association clinic held recently at the University of Kentucky. The 
squad (above) included: Front, Pam Spradlin; second row, from 
left, Ebbie Keathley and Sherry Halbert; back row, Suzanne 
Keathley, Polly Willis and Kerry Shannon. 

The junior varsity squad attended an N.C. A. clinic, June 28 to 
July3at Lebanon Junction, Ky. This group includes Debbie Buckley, 
Diane Burchett, Peggy Gibson, Ellen Harris, Karen Miller and Amy 
Zemo. They were awarded outstanding ratings. 

Both squads are sponsored by Mrs. Nancy Salisbury. 
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HALFHILL IN GERMANY 
HANAU, GERMANY-Specialist Four 

Charles Thomas Halfhill, Jr., son of Mrs. 
JeanS. Halfhill, of Prestonsburg, Ky., was 
recently assigned as an ultra high 
frequency radar operator for Headquarters 
Battery, 6th Battalion, 59th Artillery. · 

Top Senior Students Here Governor Proposes 
River-Grant Colleges See 

FIRST ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
West Prestonsburg, Ky. 

Sunday School, 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship, 11:00 a.m. 
Youth Meeting, 6:00 p.m. 
Evangelistic Service, 7:30p.m. 
Bible Study and Prayer Service 

7:30p.m. Wednesday 
Radio Broadcast-WDOC, 1:30 to 
2:00 Sunday 

Pastor, Lorie Vannucci 
Sunday School Superintendent, 
Joe Arnett 

• 
we g1ve y 
for your 

money ... 

Whatever savings plan you 

prefer, Floyd Federal pays the 

highest interest allowed by law. 

Your money earns more! So open 

an account, today, at Floyd 

Federal, where your money really 

mounts up. 

Specialist Halfhill is a 1966 graduate of 
Prestonsburg high school and received his 
associate of arts degree from Prestonsburg 
Community College. Prior to entering the 
Army in January, 1969, he worked in the 
car body construction and assembly section 
of Fort Motor Company, in Lorrain, Ohio. 
He completed basic training in Fort Gor· 
don, Georgia and was assigned here from 
the 5th Battalion, 1st Artillery in 
Wachernhein, Germany. 

u more 

s % Regular 
Passbook Account 

5~% 90-Day 
Notice Account 

5 ~% 3 to 12 
Months Certificate 

5%% 1 Year and 
2 Year Certificates 

FLOYD FE 
SAVINGS AND LOAN ASSOCIATION 

Each account insured to $20,000 by an agency of the v.s. Government­
Federal Savings and Loa Insurance Corporation 

19 South Lake Drive - Pr stonsburg, Ky. 

MISS RAYWOOD 
Scholastic honors in Prestonsburg high 

school's graduating class this year went to 
Rebecca M. Haywood, valedictorian, and 
Alice Sue Stapleton, salutatorian. 

Miss Haywood, 18-year-old daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Haywood, of 
Prestonsburg, will attend Eastern Ken­
tucky University on a voice scholarship. 
Other honors won include the Math, Glee 
Club and Typing I medals, the Bosch and 
Lomb Science Award, the UK Alumni 
Association's award for high scholastic 
achievement, membership in "Who's Who 

Oil Firm Official 
Is Kiwanis Speaker~ 
Urges Tax Incentive 

The recent discovery of oil on the North 
Slope of Alaska has "great significance for 
every American, because North Slope oil 
may play a major role in helping to supply 
our energy needs for the remainder of this 
century,'' according to a spokesman for the 
Kentucky Petroleum Council. 

Speaking at a meeting of the Prestons­
burg Kiwanis Club, Clifford N. Goff, 
assistant marketing manager, Ashland 
Petroleum Co., Inc., said that "without the 
tax incentive of the percentage depletion 
allowance and the import quota system, no 
oil company would have undertaken the 
financial risk of searching for oil on the 
North Slope. " 

Goff said the largest previous domestic 
oil was East Texas with five billion barrels. 
Estimates of North Slope oil reserves range 
from five to 10 billion barrels with some 
speculation that overall reserves might run 
to 50 billion barrels. 

Goff said that thf "total demand for oil 
during the rem•inder of this century will be 
230 billion barrels-more than twice as 
much as has been used since the first well 
was drilled in 1818 in McCreary county, 
Kentucky." 

Due to Expansion of our Service Department, Body Shop 
and Parts Department, there are now 

At Eastern Kentucky Mack. These people are needed 
to begin work or training immediately: 

Six {6) Experienced Mechanics 
Three {3) Experienced Body Men 
Two {2) Experienced Parts Counter Men 

Uniforms furnished, Life Insurance furnished, 
Hospitalization Insurance and Disability Insurance 
furnished. Paid Vacation. 

Contact Mr. Phil Nelson for Parts Positions · 
or Mr. Jim McKinney for Service Positions. 

Now is your opportunity to join the team 
of the largest Truck Dealer in this area. 

Eastern Kentucky Mack, Inc. 
?A 

Madt 
TRUCKS 

Hwy. 23 South 
PRESTONSBURG, KY. 

Phone (606) 874-2172. 

MISS STAPLETON 

in High School" and in the National Honor 
Society. 

Miss Stapleton, 18, is the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Herbert Stapleton, also of 
Prestonsburg. She is attending the 
University of Kentucky this summer and 
will enroll at Prestonsburg Community 
College for the fall term. Other scholastic 
awards include the Chemistry, Spanish and 
Math medals, the D. A. R. Good Citizenship 
Award and membership in "Who's Who in 
High School" and the National Honor 
Society. 

IN BUSINESS COLLEGE 
Attending Fugazzi Business College, 

Lexington, are two 1970 graduates of 
Wheelwright high school - Miss Yarlette 
Bailey, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Paul H. 
Bailey, and Miss Janie Curry, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Ellis Curry. 

RAIN CHECK POLICY: 
If an advertised speciol is :10old out, 
ask at the office for a "Rain Check" 
whith ehtitles yo\J to the ~ome it., at 
the $Om~ price ony time withtn two 
weeks. 

U.S. Govl. Inspected Smoked Whole or Half 

Semi- H 
Boneless am 
Fresh Frozen 

Leg-0-Lamb 
Kroger All Meat 

Skinless Wieners 1 ~::.· 59! 
a·~;~~e;ei;ifRoast Lb. 99¢ 
U.S. Choice Tenderay E-Z Carve 

Rib Roast 

Quart 
Jar 

Embassy 

Lb.99, 

Establishment of a system of river-grant 
colleges, to help America develop areas in 
which rivers are located, was proposed by 
Governor Nunn. 

Speaking in Fort Walton Beach, Fla., at a 
meeting of the Tennessee-Tombigbee 
Authority, of which he is chairman, Nunn 
said it is time for Congress "to consider a 
new proposal for enlightened, planned 
utilization of America's rivers and 
streams." 

The need to gain more knowledge and 
seek better uses of America's inland 
waterways "naturally encourages us to 
turn to our colleges and universities for 
help," the governor said. 

Nunn reminded his audience that Ken­
tucky has more miles of natural navigable 
waterways than any other state. 

Morganfield was the scene of many 
skirmishes during the Civil War. During 
World War II, Camp Breckinridge, a large 
prisoner-of-war and training camp, was 
located near there. 

~----

Support the. • • 

DONAHOE'S 
For 

Power Mowers 
Wallpaper 

Paint 

TIRES 
Both 

Automotive 
and 

Bicycle 

Tops Auto Store 
Court St. 

PRESTONSBURG AREA 
CHAMBER of COMMERCE 

Attend every weekly meeting ... 

TUESDAYS AT 12 NOON, 
THE KENTUCKIAN RESTAURANT 

~ 

ANNIVERSARY 
SALE~. ::: 

You can't do as well 
anywhere 
else ... 

Checlc. Your Kroger 

87th Anniversary Mailer 
for 16 Pages of Sale Features 

Plus Top Value Stamp Coupons 
If you did not re..:eive one pick one up at your local Kroger !fore ond request 
your nome to be placed on our moiling list. 

Kroger Country Club 
All lleof Chub Po~ 

f'J'-'V1 
Reg. ~ 

lb. 67; 
\ 

U.S.G!JV'T GRADED 

CHOICE 

Only USDA Choice, grain-fed 
beef is placed in special 
rooms where controlled dim· 
ate speeds up natural tender· 
ing-protects natural juices 
and flavor, That's why you 
can be sure your beef is both 
fresh and tender every time 
you buy Kroger Tondoroy 
Brand Beef. 

AIIWnt 
VIrginia 

Kroger Storts 
Redeem 
Federal 
food 

Stomps 

Hamburger U.S. Choice T enderoy 

Chuck Steak 

U.S. Choke Tenderay 

Rih ·Steaks 
Quarter Sliced Pork loin Cut Into 

Pork Chops 
Fresh, Picnic Style 

Pork Roast 
Koy Bee Brand Frozen 

lb.99i 
lb. 79¢ 
Lb.49, 

. \ 1/\tv~ 
'10steoks $1~ 189• ~lb. Cube Steaks - \b.)q; . 

2 ·lb. $159 ~· Pkgs. 
Kroger Serve & Save 

Sliced Bacon 

All Flavors 

Big K Drinks 
12-oz. 
Cans 

Domino or 
Jack Frost Pure Cane 

Sugar 

Spotlight 

Bean Coffee 
Kroger 

Ice Milk 
Sondwich or Wiener 

Kroger Buns 411·Ct. $1 
Pkg. 

Cottage Cheesel~~·S9, 

3 $1-fvv\ 
for ~ Reg. 

:., lb. 191 

Jumbo 27 Size 

Cantaloupes 
Golden Ripe 

Each89F - . ~ 
Sunri,; Fresh -20. to 22-lb. Avorago 

Watermelon Bananas 
Fresh 1 0 ·lb $379 Blueberries Quart s9c ao~ 

KPi~;;pple Grapefruit 4~~~=~·$1 

/ 
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i4r lfUnyb Grnunty iimrs 
Pllllllllled Every n.nday by 

Prestonsburg Publishing Company 

Sablcrtpdon Rate. Per Year: 
Ia Floyd C01111ty, fi.M 
Ellewbere ill Kentucky, "·• 
OataJde Kentucky, p.• 

Entered aa aecond claaa matter J~me 11, 1927, 
at the postoffice at Preltonlburg, Kelltucky, 
Wider the act of Mm-ch 3, 1m. 

The Danger Could Be Reduced 
The detour from Allen to Pikeville, made necessary by con­

struction of new US 23 between the two points, is not only twice as 
long as the original route but it also is twice as dangerous. 

Too narrow for the great number of cars and trucks that now will 
be forced to travel it, the road up Left Beaver Creek, across Abner 
mountain and down Indian Creek to join US 23 again at Shelbiana is 
twisting, winding, an uphill-and-down course that has more than its 
share of sharp curves - all inviting disaster for the motorist. 

But, on top of all that, is the failure of the State Highway 
Department to include in its plans for improvement of the route the 
filling of the berm, or gravelled shoulder of the road next to the 
surfaced portion, so as to make it more nearly level with the road­
way itself. The road has been resurfaced and, at least for the 
present, is smooth. But that blacktop stands up in places half a foot 
or more above the berm- and it requires no great imagination for 
one to realize what will happen to the driver whose wheel drops from 
the surfacing down, straight down, onto that lower edge. Moun­
tainsides drop o(l down from there; the driver will instinctively veer 
sharply away from that, and the result can be skidding, capsized 
cars and trucks, themselves wrecked and possibly causing following 
or approaching traffic to share the tragic experience. 

It is too late for the Highway Department to widen and 
straighten the detour. But it isn't too late for it to fill in that margin 
of the roadway to approximate the level of the surfaced portion. If it 
doesn't, driving that detour will be a 60-mile tightrope act for many 
thousands of drivers during the months to come, some of which will 
add sleet, ice and snow to a road th.at is never safe under the most 
ideal weather conditions. 

Leuers to the Editor 
Jaycees Ask Questions 

Editor, The Times: 
Do the young men of Prestonsburg and 

Floyd county really care? 
It has come to our attention that the Pres­

tonsburg Jaycees are in danger of having 
their charter pulled for reasons of lack of 
interest and non-participation. 

We stand confounded! We have long 
noted the efforts of the businessmen of your 
community in the development of in­
creased housing, playground facilities, 
parking facilities, industry, and general 
betterment of the city. Are all the leaders in 
your community over 35? Or is it that the 
young men of your community are in­
capable of leadership? 

The Jaycees have a long-established 
record of individual leadership through 
community development but the Prestons­
burg chapter has fallen short . True, there 
are some fine men who are members at the 
present, but they are few . 

Lack of interest seems to be the only 
excuse given for non-participation in the 
Jaycees by the young men of your com­
munity, but are there no underprivileged 
persons in your community? Has 
everything been done that could be? 

Are there no young men of Prestonsburg 
interested in the community? Is every male 
in Floyd county between 21 and 35 
apathetic? 

Young men can change the world! Isn't it 
time your young men did? Or do you want 
the world changed by disidents, rioters, 
drug addicts and sundry intellectuals? 

The Paintsville Jaycees are aiding in 
their community's growth. The Salyersville 
Jaycees are aiding in their community's 
growth. The Prestonsburg Jaycees 
are ... well, they are . . . uh . . .. 

Why? 

THE PAINTSVILLE JAYCEES 
THE SALYERSVILLE JAYCEES 
STANLEY HARRIS, 
Region VI Director, U. S. Jaycees 

AGAINST STRIP MINING 

Editor, The Times: 

In response to Charles McCoy's footnote 
to the article by Rufus M. Reed, I am happy 
to give names of the following, formerly of 
Pike, Floyd and Boyd counties, who are 
opposed to strip-mining: 

Martha Bevins, Ruth Stone, Hubbard 
Stone, all of 116 Deerport Dr., Birmingham, 
Alabama. 

We also would appeal to our Governor. 
We are in favor of pure water, clearing of 
all waste possible and eliminating sewage. 
Put a fine on violators. 

While we are living in Alabama, we have 
assets still in Kentucky and are very much 
interested in the way Kentucky is doing its 
part and exceeding some states in getting 
their say in affairs. 

MARTHA BEVINS 
Birmingham, Ala. 

NOTICE 
The Floyd County Board of Education will 
offer to the lowest or best bidder until Noon, 
Saturday, August 15, 1970, the following: 
175, more or less, folding chairs. The Board 
reserves the right to purchase at the same 
price during the 1970-'71 school year. 

The Board reserves the right to reject 
any or all bids. 

(Signed) WAYNE RATLIFF 
Assistant Superintendent, 
Floyd County Schools 

7-29-3t. 

SUGGESTS HONOR OF PARENTS 

Editor, The Times: 

A teen-age girl, practicing typing, iet me 
see this following article, entitled, "THE 
YOUNG AND OLD": 

"If I do not believe as you believe, it 
proves that you do not believe as I believe 
and that is all it proves!" was once said by 
one of America's greatest writers of in­
dependence, Thomas Paine. 

Today, American youth are struggling 
for a new independence, an independence 
of mind, not of matter. And they have taken 
the world apart and have examined it, 
piece by piece, color by color, religion by 
religion, and youth still believe in it. Some 
have expressed their concern by acts of 
love, some by acts of hate, some by acts of 
fear and others by anger . As the Rev. Billy 
Graham has pointed out, "They are 
searching for a cause to believe in, a flag to 
follow. Under which banner will they 
ultimately march?" 

American youth want and need the older 
generation to guide us Wltil it is time for the 
"torch to be passed". 

Mistakes have been made in the past but 
it is not too late for the revival of freshness, 
vigor and spirit in our great land in the 
future. We should all become aware of what 
is going on around us. What better teacher 
do we have than history? Speaking as an 
American youth, I am asking you to help us 
make it an even better America for our 
children. 

While reading her article, knowing that 
this girl's article made her parents feel "10 
feet tall," I got an idea which will "make it 
an even better America." One of the finest 
feelings children can give their parents is 
the "10 feet tall" feeling. And when parents 
feel "10 feet tall" because of something 
their children do or say, it makes them 
want to do something special for their 
children. 

So it will help, in a great way , for children 
to have a "10 feet tall" day, at least once 
each month, for their parents. Children, 
think of things you can sincerely do or say 
to your parents which will make them feel 
"10 feet tall" And don't be surprised if your 
parents offer you anything you want "up to 
half their kingdom." But don't be foolish, 
like one young girl who asked for the head 
of John the Baptist. Ask for something very 
reasonable that your parents can afford. 
Start a "10 feet tall" day immediately. 
"Honour thy father and mother" (Eph. 
6:2) . 

AVERY COURTNEY 
522 Brookside Dr. 

Mayfield, Ky. 

Miss Margaret Meade 
Dies At Printer Home 
After Long Illness 

Margaret Meade, 49 years old, of Printer, 
died Saturday at the home of her brother, 
Bill Meade, of Printer. She had been in ill 
health for the past 14 years. 

A daughter of the late J. M. and Mandy 
Elliott Meade, she was a member of the 
Church of Christ for twenty years. She was 
never married. 

Miss Meade is survived by two other 
brothers, Robert Meade, of Printer, and 
Joe Meade, of Belleville, Mich., and one 
sister. Mrs. Ollie Carroll, of Printer. 

Funeral ser~·ices were held last Monday 
at 10 a.m. at the Spurlock Church of Christ 
with Benny Blankenship the officiating 
minister. Burial was made in the Meade 
cemetery at Printer under the direction of 
Hall Brothers Funeral Home. 

THE FLOYD COUNTY TIMES 

A LIBRARY FRIE:\' l) .. ~hs. l\la ry Belknap Gray, Louisville, recen tl) returned to 
Owsley County for a ride in th eir la test Bookmobile. !\1rs. Gray innovat ed the 
Bookmobile Program in Kentucky bac k in th e 1 <J .J-O's by purchasing 8 o r 10 
small panel trucks for a few of the poo rer counti es o f Kentu c ky.(Karen Tam Photo) 

Miss Julia Cox, 79, 
Passes Away, July 21 

Miss Julia Cox, 79 years old, of Garrett, 
died last Tuesday at Our Lady of the Way 
hospital at Martin. 

A daughter of the late Matt and Elizabeth 
Howard Cox, she was born in Knott county 
June 20, 1891. 

Survivors include one brother, Elbert 
Cox, of Garrett ; a half-brother, Edward ' 
Griffith, of Lackey ; one half-sister, Mrs. 
Lonnie Lafferty, of Lima, Ohio ; seven 
nephews and nieces, all of whom were 
reared by Miss Cox, Hodley Cox, of Yp­
silanti, Mich. , Clarence Griffith, of Hamlet, 
Ind., Otis Griffith, of South Lebanon, Ohio, 
and Raymond Grigsby, of Butler , Ind., 
Mrs. Ova Coburn, of Ypsilanti, Mich., Mrs. 
Osa Grigsby, of Garrett , and Mrs. Ola 
Howard, of Eastern. 

Funeral services were held Thursday at 
the Rock Fork United Baptist Church with 
ministers of that church officiating. Burial 
was made in the Chaffins cemetery at 
Garrett under the direction of Hall 
Brothers Funeral Home. 

NOTICE 
The order of the Floyd Fiscal Court on 

July 7, 1970, Betty K. Hall, administratrix 
of the estate of Lawrence Keathley, · 
deceased, has been authorized to remove 
and.relocate abandoned graves located at 
the confluence of Right and Left Beaver 
Creeks, Floyd County, Kentucky. 

Any person objecting to such order 
should file their objection with the court 
within 60 days after the first publication of 
this notice. 

Dated 7 day of July, 1970. 

HENRY STUMBO 
County Judge 7-23-3t . 

· '5TRRIIO ·. 
· TH£RTR£ . 
PR£STDN5BURG, KY. 

Now Showing 

lli21"1he 

The 18th amendment 
prohibited drinking. 
It didn't say a word 

about killing, 
double-crossing 

or blowing things up. 

MGM Presents 
A MARTIN RANSOHOFF PRODUCTION 

. METROCOLOR IGPI~ 

CARD OF THANKS 
We the family of Emma Martin wish to 

thank all of those that helped us during the 
illness and passing of our beloved sister. 
We especially wish to thank the ministers, 
the Revs. Clark and Bob Martin, those that 
sent floral offerings, and especially the Hall 
Brothers Funeral Home for its kind and 
efficient service. 

WEDNESDAY thru FRIDAY, July 29-31 
Double Feature Program 

''Sidehackers" 
Plus 

"Road to Nashville" 
Starring Marty Robins and 60 Great 
Country Music Stars. 

r' SATURDAY ONJ;.Y, Aug. J-;­
Triple Featur~J-Program-

"Nightmare in Wax" 

J M=~­
afl ~= ......... 

...... LJlC£ 
TIDIDfll 

CIMERlll Mlltllill • Ell 8AAI8tl • 
!IIlii llll1 IWIIIOUS IIIU I 111111111! 

plus 

'"Blood of 
Dracu Ia' s Castle" 

SUN., MON., TUES., Aug. 2-4 
Double Feature Program 

"A fun drama about 
a swinging lady!" 

RUSS MEYER'S 

NO ONE 
UNDU II 
AOMITT£Dt 

® 
VIXEN. 
IN EASTMANCOLOR 
RESTRICTED TO ADULT AUDIENCES 
I'IIOUClD I DII[CnD IY IUSSIIUll.lll M PIOIIUC11111 

,.. " .. .., ,_. V?.NtN .'RC:XJl..cT(c;N I .-:&:"""' ~ <s 

"SECRET CEREMONY" 

I ROBERi'MiTCHUM] -·-
--PEGf"NASt iCROFT · ~'AI'VIl:LA~ ~ ':= 

..... --··-· ·-· .. ---·-... ~ -.. -.-............. -.. ., _ .. _ .. __ , 
• .-.... IO;U.> 1 _l, , ..as- .... . . ·-

ttl TICMJIICOlDfl• 

IN PHILIPPINES VISIT 
USS DURHAM, July 20--Navy Com­

mander John I. Bradbury, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Arthur Bradbury, of Prestonsburg 
Ky., participated recently in a people-to­
people visit with the citizens in the 
southernmost Philippine community of 
Zamboanga while serving aboard the 
amphibious cargo ship USS Durham. 
Presently deployed in the Western Pacific, 
the Durham is scheduled to return to its 
home port, Long Beach, Calif., at the end of 
September. 

WED., THURS., FRI., 
July29-31 

Double Feature Program 

consider the possibilities 

COlUMBIA ...CTUR£S pNaenta 
A FRANKOVICH PROOUCTION 

NATALIE WOOD ROBERT CULP 

I BOB & CAROL & TED & ALICE I 
ELLIOTT GOULD OYAN CANNON 
[!] Sound"""'bum.;obl• o•S•IIR«ood• ~~] 

tl1t L .'\ sC<·ne • 

h' -'s 1 .\ .. hung up 

.dlnppc·<1 out 

!->j)lillin~ !rom lli.., 

g1 rl ... flrlollliJ ~~ d( 1\\ ;1 

111< frt:·t·w l\' lnu 

T •urro\\t·d- \Hi 

~ -
AnoukAimee 

-plus-

Gary Lockwood 

.IACQl 'FS DF\1 YS 

Model Shop - .. -~· ... ----.. _......... -. 
r; 

SATURDAY ONLY, Aug. 1 

Three Big Shows-.. ~ ............. ~. 
'iJHE KID HE TAUGHT TO SHOOT 

WAS NOW THE MAN HE HAD TO GET! 

and 

"Rough Night in Jericho" 
(Technicolor) 

Dean Mar tin, George Peppard, Jean 
Simmons. 

Plus 

"First Time" 
(Color) 

With Jaqueline Bisset 

SUN., MON., TUES., 
Aug. 2-3-4-

"The Love God" 
(Color) 

Starring 
Don Knotts 

THURSDAY, JULY 30, 1970 

SKY-VUE 
DRIVE-IN 
\\'t>dn('sda) . Thur<.rlllv 

Friday 

THE MIRISLH PRODUCTION 
COMPANY Presents 

"HALLS OF 
ANGER"Gr 

COLOR by Detu>e" Unrted AMISts 
l'lns 

An Aubrey Schenck Product1on 

COLOR by DeLuxe· 

F rida.\ 
.l a!'kput $400 

Sa turda~ 

"Big Comedy 
Fun Show" 

THEIR FIRST FULI.,·LENGTH 
MOTION PICTUR~ IN COLOR 1 

\\~cHALEs 

sd~~~1E NAW'' 
JOElLYNN ·TIM CONWAY 
AND TH~. WHOLE \'c HA, I "> d1t '<'> 

\ nd 

Boy Did I Get A 
Wrong Number 

I' Ius 

The Pink 
Panther 

Ura\\ ing For 

'65 FORD 
Sltlula~ · :\londa_, . 

Tn<'sd a y 

John Rock 
. \\ayne Hudson 
\ 'n fhe 

:Jndefeated 

I 

j 

( 
\ 

., 
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Winston Coleman 
To Edit Kentucky 
Pictorial History 

A pictorial history of Kentucky featuring 
approximately 1,000 illustrations ( 140 in full 
color) will be published in October of 1971 
by the University Press of Kentucky. 

J. Winston Coleman Jr., noted Kentucky 
historian and bibliophile, wiD be senior 
editor, with Lawrence S. Thompson, 
professor of classics in the University of 
Kentucky as associate editor. Seventy-five 
other Kentucky historians, authors, 
librarians, and journalists will assist in the 
preparations of the volume. 

Based on an outline by histoJian Thomas 
D. Clark, the history of the Commonwealth 
will be traced pictorially from the 
prehistoric era to the present. 

The illustrated history is expected to be 
one of the most significant and colorful 
works of its kind ever done, according to 
Dr. Coleman, who points to "the rich and 
varied history of Kentucky, the distinction 
of the contributors, and the fortunate 
existence of large photographic and other 
illustrative resources on Kentucky 
history." Mr. Coleman's own extensive 
photographic collection will be exploited 
for the book. 

Aid from the Kentucky Department of 
~ublic Information in providing 
Illustrations and color sections will permit 
the price of the pictorial history to be within 
the range of students, tourists andothers 
interested in living or investing in Ken­
tucky. 

Helping organize the project and 
providing assistance are former Com­
missioner of Public Information James 
Host (now parks commissioner), his 
successor Kenneth Harper, and Robert 
Goldsborough, deputy commissioner. 

Among the contributors will be 
University of Kentucky scholars A. D. 
Kirwan, Holman Hamilton, James F. 
Hopkins, Mary Wilma Hargreaves, Rhea 
Taylor, Ham~leton Tapp, Clement Eaton, 
Joseph Massie, A. Lee Coleman, Burton 

t Milward, Jacqueline Bull, and Charles 
Atcher; Leonard Curry, Joe Creason 
Richard Hill, and Mrs. Josephine Johnson: 
Louisville; Lowell Harrison, J. Crawford 
Crowe, Julia Neal, Gayle Carver, and 
Kenneth Clark of Western Kentucky 
University; George Young of Morehead 
University; Danny Hatcher and Charles 
Hi~ds of Murray State University; 
Ehzabeth Gilbert and Richard Drake of 
Berea College; Quentin Kean of Eastern 
Kentucky University, and Charles Talbert, 
Henry Harned, Glenn Clift, and Mrs. Wade 
Hampton Whitney. 

McDowell 
Hospital 
Notes 

Patients Discharged 
(July 13 through July 19) 

Johnie W. Keathley, Galveston; Willard 
Eugene Hughes, Hueysville; Gloria J. 
Sartin, Hi Hat; Henrietta Salyers, East 
McDowell; Carrie Stanley, Ligon (ex­
pired); Martha Robinson, Langley; 
Charles Hall, Bevinsville (expired); Wiley 
Gibson, Garrett; Brian Reynolds, Ligon; 
Sylvia Sykes, Minnie; Roy Wright, Printer; 
Tom Martin, Garrett; Maxie Caudill, 
Price; Tony James Hall, Hi Hat; Estia 
Stegall, Hi Hat; Manda Hall, Wheelwright; 
Wanda J. Ross, Hi Hat; Charlie Martin, 
Craynor (expired); Myrtle Humphrey, 
Ligon; Shannon Ray Hall, Melvin; Susie 
Knott, McDowell; Geraldine Robinson, 
Martin; Katherine Little, Wayland (ex­
pired) ; Harry Begley, Lackey (expired) ; 
Alvan Castle, Drift; Mary D. Thornsbury, 
Dema; Sharon K. Slone, Craynor; Laura 
Allen, Wayland; Walker Newsome, 
Teaberry; Janett Bowling, McDowell; 
Christine Hall, Beaver; William Slone, 
Minnie; Cliff Dye, Price; Arlin Moore, 
Topmost; Beaula Newman, Harold; 
Rosetta Castle, Wayland. 

CHEAP'S 
MOBILE HOMES 

"Eastern Kentucky's Largest Dealer" 
(Tbere bas to be a reason) 

COME TO SEE 

91 

of the Finest Mobile Homes 
on display anywhere 

Every coach set up on foundation, 
decorated and landscaped so you can see how 
it will look on your lot. 

Here's An Example 
Of What You Can 
Buy at Cheap's: 

12 ft. wide, 2 bedrooms, big front bay 
window, carpet, back door and many other 
extra features. 

Sells nationally for $4,995. 
CHEAP'S PRICE $3,795 

Including everything and delivery. 
NO FLAT ROOF "SHOE BOX" 

LOOKING TRAILER AT CHEAP'S 
AND WE USE NO TRAILER FURNITURE 

In CHEAP'S COACHES! 
We Buy Our Own Furniture 

Direct from Manufacturer and 
Install It to Suit You! 

Buy from a direct authorized 
factory dealer and save the 

middle man's profit 
IF YOU BUY A NEW MOBILE HOME 

AND DON'T CONSIDER CHEAP'S 
PRICES AND QUALITY YOU'LL 

LOSE MONEY 

Free 300 MOe delivery and set up on 
foundation. 

WE TRADE 
FOR ANYTHING OF VALUE 

Open After Cburcb 
On Sunday for Y onr lospectlon 

CHEAP'S 
Fleminpbarg, Ky. 

"A Dlvlalon of Cheap's Chevrolet Co." 
Only • mlnates drive 

"'-DoWIItoWD Prestoosburg 
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MISS G:{lEENE, MR. CALL WED ENTERTAIN CHILDREN 
Mr. and Mrs. Jesse Laferty, of Arkansas 

Creek, near Martin, have enjoyed visits 
from each of their six children and 13 
grandchildren during the past few weeks. 
Visiting them were Mrs. Delmar Thomp­
son, of Pompano Beach, Fla.; T-8gt. and 
Mrs. Donald Laferty, Wichita, Kansas; Mr. 
and Mrs. Samuel Thacker, Greenup, Ky.; 
Herman Laferty, LoWsville; Mr. and Mrs. 
Fred Hall, Allen; and Mr. and Mrs. Dean 
Laferty, Martin. Grandchildren were Mr. 
and Mrs. Mike Adkins, Great Falls, 
Montana; Mr. and Mrs. Danny Adkins, 
Greenup; Mr. and Mrs. Butch Clifton, 
Dwale; Renee, Sharon, and Sarah 
Thompson, Pompano Beach, Fla.; Debbie 
and Donnie Laferty, Wichita, Kansas; 
Jeanie and Jimmy Thacker, Greenup; 
Tersa and David Hall, Allen, Larry 
Laferty, of Martin. 

The marriage of Miss Brenda Layne 
Greene, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Art 
Greene, Jr., Ocala, Fla., and Mr. Don 
Carlos Call, Jr., son of Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Carlos Call, Louisville, Ky., was solem­
nized at 4 o'clock on the afternoon of 
Saturday, June 20 from the First United 
Methodist Church, Ocala, the pastor, the 
Rev. Bledsoe, officiating. 

Given in marriage by her father, the 
bride wore a formal gown of white organza, 
with a high, stand-up neckline, modified 
empire waistline and cuffs of long, 
sheer sleeves trimmed in venetian lace. 
The bodice and skirt had vertical bands of 
lace, and the hemline was finished in lace. 
Her chapel-length veil was of illusion, 
edged in venetian lace. She carried a bridal 
bouquet of roses and orchids. 

The matron of honor, Karen Adams, and 
brides~aids, · s Mathy Pinson, Debbie 

yle nd arW: eters, were dressed in 
yello and white floor-length gowns of 

contessa, with wedding band 

necklines and empire waistlines, trimmed 
in venetian lace self-ruffle and elbow­
length sleeves, with soft bows and 
streamers at the back. Their short veils 
were attached to maize bows, trimmed in 
matching lace, and their flowers were 
carnations and roses. 

Mr. Call, Sr. served his son as best man. 
Ushers were Dicky Pinson, Mark Pinson, 
Ronnie Macknack and Douglas Call, a 
brother of the groom. 

The wedding reception was given by 
parents of the bride at the Elks Club, Ocala, 
Fla. Mr. and Mrs. Call are residing at 727 S. 
E. Broadway, Ocala, after returning from 
their honeymoon. 

Out-{)f-town wedding guests included 
Mrs. Ernest Layne, Betsy Layne, grand­
mother of the bride; Mr. and Mrs. R. C. 
Layne, Wilmington, N.C.; Keith Webb, and 
Robert Fetty, Woodbury, N.J.; Mrs. Nancy 
Huffman, Ft. Pierce, Fla.; Dennis Call, 
Louisville, and Mr. and Mrs. James 
Bryant, Tallahassee, Fla. 

COMMONWEAL Til OF KENTUCKY 
DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAYS 

NOTICE TO CONTRACTORS 

Sealed bids will be received by the 
Department of Highways, at its office, 
Frankfort, Kentucky, until 10:00 A.M. 
Eastern Daylight Time on the 7th day of 
August, 1970, at which time bids will be 
publicly opened and read for the im­
provement of: 

FLOYD COUNTY, APD 132 (30), AP 36-
56; The Pikeville-Prestonsburg (US 23 & US 
460) Road, from near Dawson Branch 
extending southeasterly to near Tram, a 
distance of 2.246 miles. Grade, Drain and 
Bituminous Concrete Surface Class I. 

FLOYD COUNTY, APD 132 (32), AP 36-
56; The Pikeville-Prestonsburg (US23& US 
460) Road, from near New Allen extending 
southeasterly to near Dawson Branch, a 
distance of 3.030 miles. Grade, Drain and 
Bituminous Concrete Surface Class I. 

FLOYD COUNTY, APD 132 (28), AP 36-
56; The Pikeville-Prestonsburg (US 23 and 
US 460) Road from near Gold Water Branch 
extending southeasterly to the Pike County 
Une, a distance of 1.360 miles. Grade, 
Drain and Bituminous Concrete Surface 
Class I. 

FLOYD COUNTY, APD 132 (29), AP 36-
56; The Pikeville-Prestonsburg (US 23 and 
US 460) Road from ne~ Tram extending 
southerly to Mare Creek, a distance of 1.287 
miles. Grade, Drain and Bituminous 
Concrete Surface Class I. 

FLOYD COUNTY, APD 132 (31), AP 36-
56; The Pikeville-Prestonsburg (US 23 and 
US 460) Road from Mare Creek extending 
southeasterly to near Cold Water Branch, a 
distance of 2.206 miles. Grade, Drain and 
Bituminous Concrete Surface Class I. 

Bid proposals for all projects will be 
available until 12:00 NOON EASTERN 
DA YUGHT TIME on the day preceding the 
bid opening at the Division of Contract 
Procurement at a cost of $2 each. Bid 
proposals are issued only to prequalified 
contractors. Remittance payable to the 
State Treasurer of Kentucky must ac­
company request for proposals. 

7-23-2t. 

Last Weekend 

The Jenny Wiley Summer Music Theatre 

Thursdays-Friday-Saturday 
Next Week 
THOMAS KIRK in 

AMERICA'S FUNNIEST MUSICAL 

A FUNNY THING 
HAPPENED ON THE WAY..,TREIORUM 

Jook by BIJit SIIVEI.OY£ Ill tARRY G£lBART Mu•ic & lr''" by .ST£Pf(N SOHOitEJM 

Thursdays-Fridays-Saturdays, August 6-22 
Tickets: $2.50 Adult, $2.00 Student, $1.00 Child in advance 

$3.00, $2.50, $1.00 at the door. $7 Family 
Available at the Amphitheatre (886-3408) 

Francis Store, Burke Fabric. 

CURB SPECIALS 
Monday through Saturday 

Monday-
HAMBURGER AND FRENCH FRIES .. , . , • , ,.. • SOc 

Tuesday-
CHEESEBURGER AND FRENCH FRIES , , • .. ., 60c 

Wednesday-
BEEF BARBEQUE AND FRENCH FRIES ...... u~ 60c 

Thursday-
CHUCK WAGON STEAK AND FRENCH FRIES .• , , SOc 

Friday-
FISH SANDWICH AND FRENCH FRIES .. o, _ , , SOc 

Saturday-
ROAST BEEF SANDWICH AND FRENCH FRIES 75c 

THE KENTUCKIAN 
P.HON.E 88&..6747 , PR STONSBURG, KY. 

INTERBA~II< 

By now you should have-,received and signed a letter from us offering you 
another of our convenient financial services, the Master Charge card. 

This card can be used at thousands of retail merchants all over America as well 
as over a hundred local retail merchants. The cash advance feature of the card 
will also allow you to obtain cash instantly at any Master Charge Bank. 

If you desire to take advantage of this service, we would certainly like to hear 
from you. All you need do is sign and return the enclosed postage paid reply card 
and your Master Charge Card will be on its way to you! 

As a credit worthy person we are sure that you will appreciate the convenience 
which our Master Charge card offers you. 

c 

Sincerely yours, 

t)-v--
H. D. Fitzpat ck, Jr. 
Vice President 

THE BANK J/D/12/Efl/}(/1//l/IE 
FIRST AND OLDEST \IN FLOYD COUNTY 

PRESTONSBURG- ALLEN, KENTUCKY 
MEMBER FEDERAL DEPOSIT INSURANCE CORPORATION 



PAGE SIX 

Reeds Obsea~ve 50th 
W eddin~ Anniversary 

Mr. and Mrs. B. F. Reed, of Drift, 
celebrated their 50th wedding anniversary 
Sunday, June 21, with a family picnic at the 
home of their son, Alvin Reed. Mr. and Mrs. 
Heed's five children and their families 
attended. They are: Mr . and Mrs. Alvin 
Heed, of Drift, and children, Mr. and Mrs. 
John Heed and Anne, Margaret, and 
Nancy; Mr. and Mrs. Rex Ankrom, of 
Prestonsburg, and children, Kathy and her 
husband, Ronnie Hatfield, and Connie, 
Carl, and Christie; Mr. and Mrs. David 
Heed, of Maytown, and children, Freddie, 
Gary and Scott; Mr. and Mrs. Don Kelly, of 
Hocky River, Ohio, and children, Robin, 
Susan, Timmy, Mike, and John; and Mr. 
and Mrs. Dick Lowry of Berea, Ohio, and 
children, Marianne and Reed. 

Also in attendance were many other 
members of the family and friends, making 
a total of 80 persons. Coming from some 
distance were two of Mrs. Reed's sisters, 
Mrs. Anna Schick, of Williamsport, Pa ., 
and Mrs. Flo Billig, of Shamokin, Pa.; also 
Mr. Reed's 87-year-old sister, from Hagers­
town, Md., Mrs. Elizabeth Rhoads, and her 
two daughters, Mrs. Eva Erdman, of 
Philadelphia, Pa. and Mrs. Hazel Clarke , of 
Ship Bottom, New Jersey. 

Marking the occasion was a 3-tiered 
cake, decorated with golden wedding bells 
and topped with the figures of a bride in a 
golden dress and a groom. Napkins with 
''Ruth and Boyd, June 22, 1920" imprinted 
in gold added to the gold-and-white decor, 
and the table at which Mr. and Mrs. Reed 
were seated had a centerpiece of yellow 
roses and gold carnations. Mrs. Reed wore 
a corsage of carnations and rose buds, and 
Mr. Reed a .::arnation boutonniere given 
them by their children. 

Franklin, Ky., is the home of one of the 
largest mule markets in the world. 

DUFF 
AMBULANCE 

SERVICE 
Incorporated 

Hueysville, Ky. 

Day Phone 358-9391 

Night Phone 358-4564 

24-Hour Service 
I 

WEEKSBURY NEWS 
Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Roop are the 

pan;nts of a son born July 14. The baby has 
been named Shawn Douglas. The maternal 
grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. Homer 
Blandenship; the paternal grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Dave Roop. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Bradford, of Morehead 
State University, spent the week-end with 
their parents, Mr. and Mrs. Pascal Moscrip 
and Mr. and Mrs. Willard Bradford. 

Tommy and Jimmy Fraley spent last 
week with their uncle and aunt, Mr. and 
Mrs. Orville Blevins, Stuart and Stephen at 
Phelps. 

Miss Valeeta Frazier, of U.K., spent the 
week-end with her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Ira Frazier. 

Mrs. Tom Peifer, Becky and Jill, of 
California, have spent the last month 
visiting her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Paul 
Campbell, and relatives in Ohio. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clifford Woody, of Wharton, 
W. Va., spent last week with their son and 
wife, Mr. and Mrs. Uoyd Woody. 

Miss Peggy Bradford is spending her 
vacation visiting her sister, Mrs. Compton, 
in Indiana. 

Mrs. Maurice Sneed, Gregory and Paula, 
of Springfield, Ill., are visiting her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Paul Campbell. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bill McCoy, Jr., of Harold, 
visited his parents, Mr . and Mrs. Bill 
McCoy, last week. 

Dr. Douglas Sword and family, of Inez, 
were yisiting his sister, Mrs. Lloyd Woody, 
and h1s parents, Mr. and Mrs. J. B. Sword, 
last week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Roop and children, of 
Shelbiana, were visiting their parents here 
last week . 

Powell Enterprises 
Buy Sixth Theatre 

Powell Enterprises, Inc . of Pikeville, 
recently purchased the Ohio Theatre 
Fourth Street, Louisville, from Setto~ 
Theatre Corporation of Indianapolis In-
diana. ' 

This brings the total number of theatres 
operated by Powell to six. Previously 
purchased theatres are the Weddington in 
Pikeville, the Kentucky and the Virginia 
Cinema at Somerset, the Strand in Pres­
tonsburg and the Polley Anna Drive-In 
theatre at Millard. 

E. B. (Buster) Powell is president of 
Powell Enterprises, which is based in 
Pikeville, and Ernie L. Powell is vice­
president and general manager of the firm. 

Matter of Names Again 
The suit listed recently as having been 

filed by Elizabeth Susan DeRossett vs. 
Frank DeRossett was not filed against 
Frank DeRossett, of Prestonsburg. The 

1-· defendant in the .action is a son of Bascom 
I · ~'Rossett and re ides at Allen. 

"What's Cooking in Kentucky" 
Cookbook Revision 

To Go to Printer August 1Oth 
Although the printing cost has increased, orders will be ac­
cepted up until August lOth at the old price of $3.50. After 
August lOth the price will be $3.95. Approximate delivery date is 
October l5-30th. 

The revised cookbook will contain over 400 new recipes 
gathered during the past three years from good cooks all over 
Kentucky. It is considered to be far superior to the first prin­
ting. 

Order now for Christmas gifts, as this is the only shipment 
before Christmas. 

Except for a very few (approximately 60) the cookbooks will be 
available only by mail and at Hueysville. 

Mai I check or money order (Please do not send cash) to 

Now 

IRENE HAYES 
Hueysville, Kentucky 41640 

Until August lOth send $3.50, including mailing charges. 
After August lOth send $3.95, including mailing charges. 

· ~ 'CTRRIID ·~ · 
.. CJ TH£ RT.R£ · 
PR£STDN5BURG, KY. 

Now 
19i21ftle 

The 18th amendment 
prohibited drinking. 
It didn't say a word 

about killing, 
double-crossing 

~ or blowing things up. 

PATRICK McGOOHAN • RICHARD WIDMARK 
ALAN ALDA in "THE MOONSHINE WAR" 

C.O•\tilrring MElootE JOt*'SON Wtu. GEER fCI WULAMS 

Sc &y £lHORf LEONARD tTom HK ~ D.-Htl"d By RICHAftD QUINE 
P•t;tduo:rd By MAR f .. ,_ SCHOff ,. ....,..._.,!'OCt......._ K OlDIII 

GMGM 

THE FLOYD COUNTY TIMES 

IN APPRECIATION-Richard Howard, left, board member of 'the 
Kentucky Association for Retarded Children , presents a certifi cate 
of appreciation to Preston Slusher, general manager of the Ken­
tucky Mountain Theater. The KARC re-ceived all proceeds of the 
cast's premier performance of "The Tortoise and the Ha re." Mr. 
Howard, a native of Floyd county, is a member of the Pikeville 
College faculty . 

HOME SERVICE HELD 
A church service was held Sunday, July 

19, at the home here of Mr. and Mrs. 
Kenneth Vanderpool by ministers of the 
Free Will Baptist Church. Ministers were 
the Revs. Bruce Spencer and Clarence 
Lemaster. Dinner was served to Rev. and 
Mrs. Spencer, of Whittaker, Ky., Rev. and 
Mrs. Lemaster and children, Lester and 
Debbie, of Hager Hill, Mr. and Mrs. Paul 
Blevins, Mr . and Mrs. Cyrus Spencer, Mr. 
and Mrs. Marvin Robinson and Mrs. Leona 
May, all of Whittaker . Mr. Vanderpool is at 
home after spending 54 days in a hospital 
receiving treatment for a heart condition 
and a broken hip. 

SPEND SUNDAY HERE 
Mr. and Mrs. Ed Newman, of Ashland, 

spent Sunday here with Mrs. Sallye D. 
Newman, Mrs. Wm. Newman and three 
children, of St. Cloud, Florida. They and 
Mrs. Rebecca Dingus were dinner guests of 
Mr. aud Mrs. Newman at the Wise Cafe. 

TO PRESENT CONCERT 
The Harmonettes Trio from Bay Ridge 

Christian College, Kendleton, Texas, will 
present a concert of sacred music at the 
First Church of God on North Lake Drive 
here at 7:30 p.m. Friday. The public is 
invited. 

CARD OF THANKS 
We would like to take this means of 

thanking everyone who helped us during 
the passing of our beloved brother, son, and 
husband, Amos Lee Duncan. We especially 
wish to thank those of you that sent flowers, 
food , or did anything to help. And a special 
thanks to the ministers of the Regular 
Baptist Church and the Hall Brothers 
Funeral Home for its fine service. 

THE FAMILY 

CARD OF THANKS 
We, the family of Eveline Hall, wish to 

thank all of those that helped us during the 
illness and passing of our belo~ed mother 
and sister. We especially wish to thank the 
ministers of the Old Regular Baptist 
Chur~h, those that sent floral offerings, and 
especially the Hall Brothers Funeral Home 
for its kind and efficient service. 

THE FAMILY 

CARD OF THANKS 
We would like to express our appreciation 

to all of our friends, neighbors, and 
relatives who in any way expressed their 
sympathy during the passing of our dear 
father and husband, Clawson Gibson. We 
would like to thank the ministers of the Old 
Regular Baptist Church, and a special 
thanks to the Hall Brothers Funeral Home 
for its kind and efficient service. 

THE FAMILY 

Lu~~ P. Blackburn was the only 
phys1c1an to ever hold the office of governor 
of Kentucky. He served from 1879-'83. 

1968 PONT I A C F I REB I R D 
2-DOOR HARDTOP 

400-eu. in. engine, 4-speed trans­
mission, dark blue with black vinyl 
roof. 

1969 VOLKSWAGEN 1300 
2-DOOR SEDAN 

Beige with black interior. 

1%9CHEVROLETIMPALA 
2-DOOR HARDTOP 

Misty turquoise with black vinyl 
roof, black all-vinyl interior, 350-cu. 
in. engine, turbo hydra-matic trans­
mission, power steering, power 
brakes, factory air-conditioned. 

1965 OLDSMOBILE 
VISTA CRUISER 

STATION WAGON 
8-passenger, all power, air­
conditioned. 

1969 PONTIAC 
GRAND PRIX 

2-DOOR HARDTOP 
All power, air-conditioned. Local, 
one owner. 

1969VOLKSWAGEN 1300 
2-DOOR SEDAN 

Green. 

1%7CHEVROLETIMPALA 
STATION WAGON 

Maroon with black interior, all 
power, air-conditioned. 

Redistricting Session 
To Await Final Tab 

Governor Nunn plans to wait until the 
1970 census figures become official before 
calling a special session of the Kentucky 
General Assembly to deal with legislative 
reapportionment. 

Redistricting will be necessary where 
population shifts have occurred. The 
census figures are to become official 
Dec. 1. 

The Legislative Research Commission 
has voted to start a study of redistricting 
possibilities as soon as accurate figures 
become available . 

HERE FROM MICHIGAN 
Robert Thomas Gibson, of Ypsilanti, 

Mich., Mr. and Mrs. Dewey Coger and 
children, Belleville, Mich., have been 
spending their vacations with their parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Gibson, of the Abbott 
road. 

CARTER 
FUNERAL HOME 

1966 CHEVROLET BISCAYNE 
4-DOOR SEDAN 

327-cu. in. engine, automatic trans­
mission, power steering, power 
brakes, air-conditioned, fawn beige 
with matching interior. 

1969 FORD 
RANGER PICKUP 

Long wheelbase, 390-cu. in. engine, 
automatic transmission, power 
steering, power brakes, tutone blue 
and white. 

1967 CHEVELLE 
4-DOOR SEDAN 

Tutone blue and black, &-cylinder 
engine, stick shift. 

1%7CHEVROLETIMPALA 
2-DOOR HARDTOP 

Red with black vinyl interior, V-8 
engine, atuomatic transmission, 
whitewall tires, tilt steering wheel. 

1966 BUICK 
ELECTRA225 

Green with matching interior, all 
power, air-conditioned. 

1968 OLDSMOBILE 
TO RON ADO 

2-DOOR HARDTOP 
Emerald mist with saddle tan vinyl 
roof and green knit interior, all 
power, air-conditioned. One owner. 

THURSDAY, JULY 30, 1970 

TROY 
CALHOUN 
and the 

QUIET MEN 

FOR ALL TYPES 
OF ENGAGEMENTS 

Phones 789-3606 
886-6259 

In your hour of need, turn with 
confidence to us - dignified, 
efficient, professional. 

Eligible To Honor All 
Buria I Insurance Policies. 

Phone 886-2774 
Prestonsburg, Ky. 

Confidence Is Our 
Most Important As3ef. 

1967 OLDSMOBILE 442 
2-DOOR HARDTOP 

4-speed transmission, V-8 engine, 
tinted glass. White. 

1966 MERCURY COMET 
SPORTS COUPE 

White with black top and red in­
terior, 200-cu. in. V-8 engine. 

1%5CHEVROLETIMPALA 
2-DOOR HARDTOP 

Standard shift, 283-cu. in. V -8 
engine. Green. 

1966 FORD GALAX IE 500 
2-DOOR HARDTOP 

390-cu. in. engine, standard trans­
mission, whitewall tires. Dark blue. 

1968 CHEVROLET BISCAYNE 
4-DOOR SEDAN 

Ash gold with matching interior, &­
cylinder engine, standard shift. 

1966 BUICK WILDCAT 
4-DOOR SEDAN 

V-8 engine, air-conditioned, power 
steering, power brakes, whitewall 
tires, tin(<!d glass. White. 

1968 OLDSMOBILE 442 
2-DOOR• HARDTOP 

Yellow with black vinyl roof and 
black interior, 400-cu. in. engine, 4-
speed transmission. 

Complete Line of New '70 Chevrolets 
And Buicks Now in Stock. See Them. 
Over 20 New, Air-Conditioned Cars Now In Stock. 

Notice to Bidders These salesmen are ready to show· you your best car buy: 

Floyd County Fiscal Court will accept 
sealed bids for the necessary operation of 
all voting machines, installation of ballots, 
storing and servicing each and every 
precinct, and to perform all work 
necessary to keep the machines in order for 
each election purpose. Said bid to run for a 
period of three years, July 1, 1970 through 
June 30, 1973. Said bid shall be filled with 
the clerk of the County Court. Bids will be 
open at 10:00 a.m., August 20, 1970. Floyd 
County Fiscal Court reserves the right to 
reject any and all bids. 

FLOYD COUNTY FISCAL COURT 
By Henry Stumbo, Judge 

7-30-Jt. 

ED MUSIC, BERT COLVIN, PAUL P. HUGHES, ESliLL LEE CARTER 
NELSON BALDRIDGE, CHESTER PACK, ORVILLE COOLEY 

Mosie-Colvin 
mfilw~ 

Chevrolet-Buick 
"Where Confidence Gets Business and Satisfaction Keeps It" 

Phone 886-2364 So. Lake Drive Prestonsburg, Ky. 

I 



THURSDAY, JULY 30, 1910 

LITILE-HOWELL VOWS SAID 

I Miss Phyllis an Little, Daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Male Little, of Price, became 
the bride of . Shaun Howell, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. A. M. Howell, also of Price, 
Sunday, June 7, at 2 p.m., at the 
Wheelwright Community Church, 
Wheelwright. The Rev. Harold Doster, of. 
Pippa Passes, performed the double-ring 
ceremony. 

Nuptial music was provided by Mrs. 
Libby Hall, pianist, Mrs. June Doster, 
organist, and the selections, "Twelfth of 
Never", "More" and "The Lord's Prayer", 
were sung by Mrs. Betty Frazier. 

Given in marriage by her father, the 
bride wore a floor-length gown of peau~e­
soie, highlighted with a bodice and long 
sleeves of scalloped chantilly lace. The 
chapel-length train was also of scalloped 

• chantilly lace. Her elbow-length, bouffant 
veil was held to a crown headpiece of 
pearls. Her bouquet was a formal cascade 
of large white mums, white porn poms and 
daisies, interlaced with ivy and varigated 
pothos leaves. 

Mrs. Celestine Bailey, of Prestonsburg, 
sister of the bride, was matron of honor. 
Bridesmaids were Mrs. Rheda Robinson, 
Prestonsburg, Miss Brenda Brashear, 
Viper, and Miss Jane Gearheart, Price. 

The matron of honor wore a turquoise, 
floor-length, empire waist gown of silk 
organza with a detachable train and 
matching headpiece. The bridesmaids' 
gowns, being light blue, with matching 
headpieces, were similar to that of the 
matron of honor. Each carried a white, long 

f stemmed rose with matching ribbon of blue 
and white lace. __ 

Serving his brother as best man was Mr. 
Keith Howell, of Toledo, Ohio. Ushers were 
Richie Eckler, of Atlanta, Georgia, Ronnie 
Robinson, of Prestonsburg, and Mr. 
Bascom Horn, Jr., of Lexington. 

Flower girl was Toni Ann Howell, niece of 
the groom, and ringbearer was Malcolm 
Glenn Bailey, nephew of the bride. 

Mrs. Little, mother of the bride, wore a 
lilac suit, trimmed with white lace with 
white accessories. Her corsage was of lilac 
roses. Mrs. Howell, mother of the groom, 
wore a pink brocade dress and matching 
coat with matching accessories. Her 
corsage was of pink roses. 

Assisting at the reception in the 
Wheelwright Clubhouse, was Mrs. Bernard 
Little, of Hi Hat, Miss Pam Newton, Lan­
caster, ., Miss Jackie Jones, Lexington, 
Miss K y Motley, Ezel, Ky., and Miss 
Jennifer Jones, Prestonsburg. 

Upon their return from a wedding trip to 
Cumberland Falls, Mr. and Mrs. Howell 
will reside at Richmond, Ky. where both 
are doing graduate work at Eastern 
Kentucky State University. 

Ferguson's Furniture Co. ' 

South end of Bull Creek bridge, 
across river at S. 1st Ave., 
Prestonsburg, Ky. Good, Used 
Furniture, Televisions and Ap­
pliances. Antiques galore, 
numerous other items. 

nie'' 

Announcing my candidacy for your 

Representative from District 
to the 

Floyd County 
Board of Education 

2 

I am the man who will be concerned, ONLY, with the welfare of 
the children. with or without, HARMONY. 

Favoring To Conditions 

Overdue Help Hind-;: 4ng 

Revisions End I mproverents, 

Long 

Dela~J 
Requ·ed 

Edlational 

N,!dS 

Here's th Kind of 

That wil 
re I 

ake Saving 
sting ••• 

The Highes Interest Rates Permitted 
Under Re at ions Now in Effect. 

PASSBOOK SA 

REG LA SAVINGS 

st 

FIRST 
ATIONAL 
BANK 

Annual Interest Paid On 

TWO YEAR 

SAVINGS CERTIFICATES 

Annual lnteres·t Paid On 

E YEA 
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---- - - --- -- - -- ---

Annual Interest Paid On 
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SAVINGS CERTIFICATES 

GS 
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Rate 

GOLD SSBOOK SAY 
New 

Maximum 
Rate 

FIRST 
NATIONAL TWIN BRIDGE BRANCH BANK 

Martin, Ky. 

Prestonsburg, Ky. 
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RECC DIRECTORS IN MEETING 
Floyd county directors of the Big Sandy Rura I Electric Co-Op, 
photographed at recent meeting, are, from left, Bradis Goble, of 
Lancer, Hawley Scott, Garrett, and John Ed Shepherd, West 
Prestonsburg. 

Personals 
Mrs. Cecil Stapleton, of New Lexington, 

Ohio, and Mrs. Jack Francis and children, 
Jeannie, Jammie and Jackie, of Catletts­
burg, were the Tuesday night guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Denver Daniels, returning to 
Catlettsburg Wednesday afternoon. Mrs. 
Stapleton returned to Ohio Saturday. 

Mrs. Jack Fracis and children, Jackie, 
Jammie and Jeannie, were in Prestons­
burg, Wednesday, visiting Mr. and Mrs. 
Paul Francis. 

REGISTERED AT MT. MANOR 
Registering at the Mt. Manor Nursing 

Horne since July 13 are: Willie Lucas, 
Whitesburg; Nat Moore, Orkney; Wrn. 
Ratliff, Martin; Taralee Daniels, Evarts; 
Lucy Steed, David; Raymond Layne, 
Freeburn; Johnnie Patton, Auxier. 

GUESTS HERE 
Mr. and Mrs. Stanley A. Combs had as 

their houseguests several days last week 
Mrs. Robert McMullen, San Mateo, 
California, and Miss Margaret Hatfield, of 
Dearborn, Michigan. 

SUPPER HOSTESS 
Mrs. Ruth D. Sowards entertained to 

supper at Jerry's last Friday Mrs. Sallye D. 
Newman, Mrs. Wrn. Newman, Jr. and 
three children, of St. Cloud, Florida, and 
Mrs. Rebecca Dingus. 

HOME FROM VISIT 
Mrs. Sallye L. Clark returned horne 

Wednesday of last week from a visit with 
relatives at Cloverlick, W. Va. 

RECEPTION FOR MINISTER, FAMILY 
The Woman's Society and Wesleyan 

Service Guild were hosts to a welcome 
reception, honoring the Rev. Wrn. Pope, 
Mrs. Pope and members of their family, 
Joe Pope and Mr. and Mrs. David Pope of 
Lexington, last Sunday evening at the First 
United Methodist Church. Rev. Pope, who 
is serving his fourth year as pastor of the 
church responded to the address of 
welcome given by Chalrner Frazier, 
chairman of the board. Refreshments were 
served from a table covered with a white 
linen cloth. Colored roses filled the crystal 
bowl for the centerpiece. Iced cakes were 
served by Mrs. Luther Shive!. Mrs. John F. 
Brown poured punch. 

STUDENTS HOME 
Mrs. Kay Ann Ecroyd, student at the 

University of Kentucky, Zella Faye 
Wallace, student at Eastern Kentucky 
University, spent the weekend here with 
their parents. 

VISITING IN VIRGINIA 
Mr. and Mrs. John W. Sutherland, Jr. are 

visiting relatives in Charlottesville, Va. 
during their vacation. 

WEEK-END VISITORS 
Mr. and Mrs. Savage W. Allen and Mr. 

and Mrs. George D. Arnyx of Cincinnati 
were here last week visiting relatives and 
friends. 

ATTEND REUNION 
Mr. and Mrs. T. J. Bingham attended a 

family reunion at Buchanan. Their 
houseguest, Miss Dianne Greene, of 
Ashland, who was spending the weekend 
here, accompanied them. 

90 YEARS OLD, JULY Z5 
Joe s. Dingus, of St. Cloud, Florida, was 

greeted on his 90th birthday, July 25th at his 
home with cards, letters and telephone 
messages. He formerly lived on Little Paint 
Creek. 

RETURN FROM FLORIDA 
Mrs. Ella Noel C. White, Mrs. Gladys P. 

White, Mr. and Mrs. Donald L. Meade and 
children, of Lexington, returned horne 
early last week from a three-week vacation 
at Ft. Lauderdale, Florida. 

VISITING MOTHER HERE 
Mrs. E. A. Smith has as her houseguests 

this week her son, Waldo Smith, and Mrs. 
Smith, of Kingsport, Tenn. 

Magoffin Woman's 
Conviction Is Cited 

"Violations of the Social Security Act will 
be vigorously prosecuted," Daryl E . 
Ratliff, district manager of the Social 
Security Administration, warned last week. 

Mr. Ratliff said he had just learned that 
Mrs. Alice Pinks, a housewife, of Fredville, 
Magoffin county, was convicted recently in 
U.S. district court, Pikeville, of violations 
of the Social Security Act. Mrs. Pinks was 
convicted on the count of knowingly 
withholding knowledge of marriage of a 
dependent child to qualify for Social 
Security Benefits. 

" A fine of not more than $500 or im­
prisonment of one year, or both, is provided 
in the Social Security Act as punishment for 
such conviction," Ratliff said. He added 
that the defendant was committed to the 
custody of the attorney general or his 
authorized representative for im­
prisonment for a period of one year. 
Execution of the sentence was suspended 
and Mrs. Pinks was placeq on probation fo,.r 
a period or three years. 

He stressed the importance of getting 
correct information from the nearest social 
security district office concerning these 
regulations which govern the proper and 
timely reporting of events which terminate 
entitlement to Social Security Benefits. The 
conviction of Mrs. Pinks for violation in­
volving failure to report an event which 
would end Social Security payments should 
serve as a warning to all persons, Mr. 
Ratliff pointed out. When intending to cause 
Social Security payments to be made where 
none are authorized, a conviction of each 
such violation can mean as much as $1,000 
fine, or imprisonment of one year, or both, 
he advised. Any suspected irregularities of 
this nature are fully investigated by the 
Social Security Administration. 

REUNION SCHEDULED 
The James Stephens family-Haywood 

reunion will be held Sunday, Aug. 9, at 
Central Park, Ashland. All relatives are 
welcome. 

Advertisement for Bids 
Project No. Ky. 67-DC-1A17 

FLOYD COUNTY 
BOARD OF EDUCATION 

Separate sealed bids for the construction 
of an addition to the Prater Creek 
Elementary School, Dana, Kentucky, for 
the Floyd County Board of Education will 
be received by The Floyd County Board of 
Education at the office of The Floyd County 
Board of Education until 1:00 o'clock p.m. 
(E.S.T.), August 15, 1970, and then at said 
office publicly opened and read aloud. 

The Information for Bidders, Form of 
Bid, Form of Contract, Plans, 
Specifications, and Forms of Bid Bond, 
Performance and Payment Bond, and 
other contract documents may be 
examined at the following: 

1. Floyd County Board of Education, 
Prestonsburg, Kentucky; 2. Office of 
George Lee Shannon, Architect, Fitz­
patrick Building, Prestonsburg, Kentucky. 

Copies may be obtained at the office of 
George Lee Shannon located at Fitzpatrick 
Building, Prestonsburg, Ky., upon payment 
of $25.00 for each set. Any unsuccessful 
bidder, upon returning such set promptly 
and in good condition, will be refunded his 
payment, and any non-bidder upon so 
returning such a set will be refunded $25.00. 

The owner reserves the right to waive 
any informalities or to reject any or all 
bids. 

Each bidder must deposit with his bid, 
security in the amount, form and subject 
to the conditions provided in the In­
formation for Bidders. 

Attention of bidders is particularly called 
to the requirements as to conditions of 
employment to be observed and minimum 
wage rates to be paid under the contract. 

No bidder may withdraw his bid within 
30 days after the actual date of the opening 
thereof. 

Signed: 
CHARLES F. CLARK 
Superintendent 
Floyd County Schools 

7-30-3t. 
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JUNIOR WOMAN'S CL 
SIXTH ;ANNUAL HORS 

The Prestonsburg Junior Woman's Club 
announced this week that it will stage its 
sixth annual horse show, August 29 at 
Archer Park, with an afternoon per­
formance at 2'and an evening performance 
at 6. 

SLATES 
ow 

tl1J.1~ies and ribbons, Mrs. Paul P. Hughes; 
cq.~ssiions, Mrs. Albert Burchett and Mrs. 

HALL BROS. Funeral Home 

Mrs. Aubrey Onkst is general chairman 
of the events. Others assisting are: 

Judges' committee, Mrs. Harold Cooley 
and Mrs. Ronald Hager; publicity, Mrs. 
Montie D. Rice and Mrs. Seldon Horne; 
entries and numbers, Mrs. David Allen and 
Mrs . James McKinney; programs and 
class sponsors, Mrs. David J. Willis and 
Mrs. Dixon Nunnery; admissions, Mrs. 
Charles Johnson and Mrs. Roger Waugh; 

Notice to Bidders 
The Floyd County Comprehensive Health 

Program offers to the lowest and best 
sealed bidder, until close of the work dav 
August 10, 1970, all office supplies. 

Detailed information may be obtained by 
contacting the Prestonsburg office of 
Comprehensive Health. 

The Floyd County Board of Health 
reserves the right to reject any or all bids. 

lt. 

Colvin; grounds, Mrs. Ralph Rorrer 
Paul Honeycutt. 

~<J,ridtlals wishing to rent stalls may 
col\l:et Mrs. Jack Stumbo. 

and trophies wishing to rent stalls. 
rnal,oontact Mrs. Jack Stumbo. 

and trophies will be awarded in all 

T<tlter a horse in the show, contact Mrs. 
Jav·l•!\Uen or Mrs. James McKinney. 

Hall & Clark 
1nsuran" Agency 

ce for Every Need 

Wo~" 

Tel. 886-2318 
Ky. 

$1.00 Each Will 
the Blankets 
You Choose .. .. · .. 

// 
"ROSEOF . j'" 
A machine wash · . Fiberwoven• blanket of 60% "Rayon, 3~ Purrey Poly-
ester, lU% Acrylic. Charming rose &prays on tinted grounds. Delhttully wann. 
Brilliant roses scattered across a blanket. A joy to own ••• a belttful gift. 

:'=:·. 

NYLON BINDING r.P.!'JUiar 9 .98 
Peach, Pink, or Blue on tinted grounds. 

'1211 x 80'' ••••••••••• Practlcal size for twin or double beds 

COME AND SEE THE NEW EASY CARE 100'/• Pt.YESTER 
WASH 'N' WEAR BLANKET 

NORTH STARe 
a blanket by 

"PARADISE" 
1000/o Purrey8 Polyester fiber makes this the kind of blanket you've 
dreamed about. North Star quality in every fiber. This winter-weight 
blanket is soft •.• warm ••• washable. A treasure to own .•• a joy to 
give. NORTH STAR has created seven brilliant colorings with match­
Ing Nylon bindings: 

Hot Pink, Antique Gold, Oriental Blue, Moss Green, Canai'y, Tan-
gerine, White 72x90 in. Size. NOW 7 98 

Reg. 8.98 

Martin, Kentucky 

PHONE 285-3262 

OUR MOTTO: To Serve Those Who Are Bereaved ... 

In time of sorrow we are here to help ease the burden for those 
left behind. Call on us at any hour . 

·' ·.· 

No Charge For Use of Our Finely-Appointed Chapel. 

CC.;"hathan0 MANTILLA 
e Fiber woven 

e 50% Purrey Polyester, 50% Rayon acrylic 

e luxuriously bound with Schiffli 

embroidery 
e Beautiful, soft, luxurious 

lil!t.'~''} ,., .... ,.,~"''r·"''''·'' .... _ .. _ . ...,_ ... _._._._ ... ·.·.·-··.· .. _ .. _._._._ ..• _ ............. -~. . .. ;:: 
.1.-;(: 

I 

' 

REGULARLY 
8.98, NOW 

72x90 
IN. SIZE 

Wh ·: t '. r ·eHr way to sltt.p under a ~ oft fiberwoven blanket 
(If ?uo, y pc.:y .. star ar.d a~·yl ' c and the binding ... o to•Jch of 
sheer luxury, Schiffli embroidered to add the colorful touch to 
any bedroom. A charming gift . Avoilobl~ in 3lue, Pink, 
Whi•P., Go!d, GreP.n. Easily washable. Mothproof. Non·aller· 
genic. 

1 00% POL VESTER 
STARLIGHT THERMAL 

Regularly 8.98 
NOW 

A 
THERMAL 
llANICET 

Cool in tht tumm.,. 
and warm in the 
winter with a 
light cover) . The 
modern way to 
sleep. 

Worm ... Beautiful . . . Practical. A thermal blanket you will 
be proud to own because it is worm and it will remain beauti­
ful washing after washing. This is the first and only pol}·estcr 
blanket (including the binding). This thermal bianket is 
unique in every way. A joy to own . ... A treasured gift. High 
style colorings. Azalea, White, Coral, Moss Green, Antique 
Gold, Blue. 

COX'S - WHERE YOU GET THOSE WONDERFUL BUNKET BARGAINS 
AND TOP VALUE STAMPS, TOI 

• • • 

• 
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FINAL REDUCTIONS 

SPRING AND SUMMER 

MERCHANDISE 

NOW REDUCED 

SEMI-ANNUAL SUMMER c EARANCE SALE FINAL REDUCTIONS 
At 

SHOE STORE 

( 

Store and Shoe Store 
New Fall Clothes Arriving Daily. Prestonsburg, Ky. 

RETURN HOME 
Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Culey and family 

returned to their home in Virginia Beach, 
.Va., July 18 after spending several days 
with her parents, Rev. and Mrs. Moses 
Kitchen. A family get-together was enjoyed 
with a picnic at Jenny Wiley State Park. 
Attending were Mrs. Edith Elkins, Mr. and 
Mrs. Tommy Rice and daughter, Mr. and 
Mrs. Roy Rice and two daughters, Hattie 
Kitchen, Kathaline Gibson and two sons, 
Louis and Nickie Elkins, Mr. and Mrs. 
Culey and five children. 

TO UNDERGO HEART SURGERy-
E. R. Burke and Mrs. Burke left Friday , UNr:-ERGOES SURGE~Y 

of last week, for San Antonio, Texas, where : Miss Jane Ann Kendrick returned home 
the~ spent the weekend with their son, Dr. f rec~ntly from Central Baptist Hospita.l, 
Lucian F. Burke, and family. Surlday, they Le_xmgto!l, where she had surgery. She 1s 
went to Houston, Texas where Mr. Burke domg. mcely. ~er mother, Mrs .. May 

Ar••l• Awt81t C .. ,,. tf c•rltt 

(Chriltiu) 

entered a hospital to undergo open heart Kendrick, was wtth her at the hospital. 

429 Arnold Ave. 
• Saday Scllool, 11 a.m. 

Wenblp Serme., lla.m. 
aad7:•p.m. 

Saperilltelldeld, E. L BJermaa 
MbUster, Ed Bama 

HONORED ON 89TH BIRTHDAY 
Mrs. Daisy Banks was honored with a 

dinner on her 89th birthday, July 17, at the 
home of a daughter, Mrs. Viola Bingham. 
Covers were laid for Mrs. Banks, Mr. and 
Mrs. Bryan Miller, Miss Daisy Miller , Mrs. 
Stella Lafferty and Polly, Mrs. Tommy 
Pigman, Mrs. Lena Carter, of Ashland, 
Mrs. Abbie Warix, of the Auxier road. Mrs. 
Banks was presented a birthday cake and 

surgery, Wednesday of this week. Their 
children, Mrs. Joe Buchanan, Wm. Baker 
Burke, Dr . Winston Burke, Dr. Lucian F. 
Burke and Edmund Burke will be with their 
father during and after surgery. 

HOME FROM HOSPITAL 
Mont Gibson has returned home from 

Veterans Hospital in Lexington. He visited 
his son, John Gibson, Mrs. Gibson Velva 
and Jeff in Shelbyville before returning 
home. 

Cash In On These Terrific Values 
During White Sale Days at Cox's! 

AND, REMEMBER, AT COX'S YOU RECEIVE 
TOP VALUE STAMPS WITH EACH PURCHASE MADE 

PHONE 886-3020, PRESTONSBURG 

MUSLIN SHEETS 

FINE WHITE MUSLIN 
72x108 and 199 
twin fitted sheets ••••••••• 

81x108 and 
full fitted sheets •••••••••• 

42x36 Pillow 
per pair 99C cases .......... . 

Cannon muslins are sturdy, made from selected Ameri­
can fibers and have over 130 threads per square inch. 
Fashion sheets are colorfast. These are long wearing, 
economical sheets. 

;.~ . 

Rose Dream Fashion Muslins 

pink or lavendor on white 

Full flat 2 9 9 
or fitted 

Beautiful and feminine 

Pillow 159 
Cases, pair 

CANNON® 

• ROYAL FAMILY 
PERCALE SHEETS 

72x108 
tWIN FITTED . . . . . . . . . . 

• • • • • • • • • • 

PILLOW CASES • • • • • • • • 1 39 
pair 

Cannon's exclusive Combspun process gives 
added luxury, added smoothness and added 
life. Selected staples are skillfully blended for 
strong yarn and perfect weave. 

All Cannon fitted sheets 
have Fle.x-o-matic 

str tch edges 
for easy bed making 

HOME FROM HOSPITAL 
Miss May Beam, who had surgery at 

Central Baptist Hospital, Lexington, has 
gone to her home there. Her sister, Mrs. 
Pearl Bingham, left Monday to assist in 
nursing her. 

SPENDING WEEK HERE 
Mr. and Mrs. Eddie Wingham, Dayton, 

Ohio, are spending their vacation of a week 
here with her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Thomas Lemaster. 

VACATIONING IN NEBRASKA 
Mr. and Mrs. Garland 'Rice, of Paints­

ville, left Wednesday for·a vacation of a 
month at their farmhouse at Falls City, 
Nebraska . Mrs. Mary Grace Garland drove 
them to Nebraska. She will return home in 
two weeks. 

VISITORS FROM FLORIDA 
Charles Gibson and sons, "Chucky" and 

Raymond, of Tampa, Florida, have been 
here visiting his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Mont Gibson. Chucky and Raymond 
remained for the remainder of the summer. 

GO TO AUGUSTA, GA. 
Mrs. Boyd Nuckles, nurse at Mr. Manor 

Nursing Home, accompanied a patient, 
Mrs. Mamie Youngblood, from Comb's 
Airport to Augusta, Ga., last week. 

VISITED GRANDPARENTS 
Mr. and Mrs. Richard Egbert and 

Marilyn, of Columbus, 0., recently visited 
her grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. Mont 
Gibson, on Trimble Branch. 

TO OCCUPY PULPIT 
The Rev. Jack Weller, minister..at-large 

in Ebenezer Presbytery and author of 
"Yesterday's People", will occupy the 
pulpit of the First Presbyterian Church 
here Sunday in the absence of the pastor, 
the Rev. Milton E. Skiff. The Rev. and Mrs. 
Skiff and children are spending their 
vacation with her parents in Maine. 

SHOWER FOR MRS. LIMING 
Mrs. Stephen Marshall Liming, nee, 

Josephine Archer, was honored with a 
miscellaneous shower on July 21 at the 
First United Methodist Church. The color 
scheme of pink and 'white was carried out in 
the table setting and room decorations. The 
refreshment table had an overlay of white 
silk linen with a woven border and center 
stripe of wide silver lame. The centerpiece 
of pink and multicolored roses, in­
terspersed with greenery in a crystal bowl, 
was flanked by candelabra holding pink 
candles. Miss Marthann Archer presided at 
the punch bowl while Miss Sheryl Ralston 
served iced cakes. Bridal mints and nuts 
were on the table. Gift tables were laden 
with useful gifts of china, crystal, linens, 
miscellaneous household items and silver. 
Hostesses were Mrs. Arnold Clark, Mrs. 
Paul C. Combs, Mrs. Marshall Davidson, 
M>c• •• Chrum" H .• , ... .,,,.,,. w'i 
Greenwade, Mrs. Arthur Haywood, 
Astor Meade, Mrs. Claude Newberry, 
E. Dick Roberts, Mrs. Blaine Smith, . 
Sarah Clay Stephens, Mrs. Jack F. Wells, 
Mrs. Clifford Wright. 

TEXAS VISIT 
Mrs. Wm. Pope left Monday for a visit 

with her mother, Mrs. D. P. Yoder in 
Abilene, Texas . She will be there three 
weeks. 

HERE FROM ARIZONA 
Charles "Blockey" Layne and family, of 

Phoenix, Arizona, recently visited relatives 
here. 

Mr. and Mrs. John E. Layne returned 
here Sunday after a few days' stay at their 
home in Ashland. 

Mrs. Lillian P. Rimmer is visiting her 
daughter, Mrs. Richard Webb, and family 
in Lexington. 

--------
Mrs. Wm. 0. Allen, of Pikeville, visited 

her mother, Mrs. Carol M. May, here last 
week. 

Mrs. Walker $pears is 'ldsiting her 
daughter Mrs. May Kendrick, on Central 
Avenue. 

Mrs. Ruth D. Sowards was Sunday dinner 
guest of Mr. and Mrs. G. H. Rice in Paints­
ville. 

Mrs. Claudia F. Leete and Miss Sarah 
Clay Stephens were business visitors in 
Ashland last Tuesday. 

Mrs. Sidney Sutphin, of Lexington, spent 
the week~nd here with her mother, Mrs. 
Johnnie Crisp. 

Men's-Women's 

Children's 

All Sales Cash and Final 

I' 
Dr. and Mrs. Palmer L. Hall, of 

Morehead, announce the engagement of 
their daughter, Miss Pamelea Hall, to Mr. 
George C. Hill, Morehead. 

Miss Hall and Mr. Hill are attending 
Morehead State University, where Miss 
Hall is a member of Delta Zeta sorority. 

Miss Hall is the granddaughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Clarke Bingham, of Prestons­
bl,!l'g. -

The wedding will be Saturday, 
Aug. 8, at 1:30 in the Morehead United 
Methodist Church. The gracious custom of 
open church will be observed. The recep­
tion will follow the ceremony at the home of 
the bride's parents at 503 N. Wilson Avenue. 

ON VACATION IN EAST 
Rev. and Mrs. Milton Skiff left Monday 

for a three-week vacation in Pennsylvania 
and the New England states, including 
Maine. They were joined by their three 
children who have been visiting their 
grandparents in Erie, Pa. 

ENTERTAIN GROUP 
Mr. and Mrs. Frank H. Layne en­

tertained to supper last Wednesday evening 
Mr. and Mrs. E. R. Burke, Mr. and Mrs. 
Joe Buchanan, Mrs. Ruth D. Sowards. 

HOMEMAKERS HOLD ANNUAL PICNIC 
The annual picnic of the South Prestons­

burg Homemakers Club was held July 20 at 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Haywood 
on Cardinal Drive. Members and guests 
enjoying the occasion were: Mr. and Mrs. 
Gene Ball, Beth and Sarah, Mrs. Theckley 
Short, Mrs. James Allen, James Kenneth 
Allen, Mr. and Mrs. Jim Derossett, Mrs. 
Jimmy J. Derossett, Becky and Jim, 
Glenda Stanley, Mrs. Marshall Mahan, 
Mrs. Lillian Pelphrey, Mrs. Mrs. Wm. 
Pope, Mrs. Eddie Worland, Mr. and Mrs. C. 
R. Tankersley, Mrs. Ottis Bussey, Mr. and 
Mrs. Blaine Hall, Gregg Carpenter, Phillip 
and Rebecca Haywood. The club presented 
Mrs. Ball with a gift, expressing ap­
preciation of her membership during ber 
stay here. Mr. and Mrs. Ball will move soon 
to Ashland. 

ATIEND GIFT SHOW 
Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Burchett and Mrs. 

Wm. Bolling have returned from Atlanta , 
Ga., where they attended the Gift Mart. 

LAD 'n 
LASSIE'S 

BIG 
HALF-PRICE 

7th District K.F.W.C. 
To Host Conference 

Mrs. Wm. Hoffman, of Drift, governor of 
the Seventh district, Kentucky Federation 
of Women's Clubs, has announced that the 
state fall conference will be held Sept. 21-23 
at Jenny Wiley State Park. A meeting was 
held recently at the Prestonsburg Woman's 
Club Craft House, Archer Park, to com­
plete plans for this conference. 

There are 14 clubs in the district, which 
will host between 350 and 400 delegates. The 
following represented their clubs at the 
planning session: 

Mrs. Wm. Hoffman, and Mrs. Nick 
Cooley, Drift; Mrs. Elizabeth Davidson and 
Mrs. Hazel Fitzpatrick, Jenkins; Mrs. 
Alvin Stinnett, Mrs. Jas. W. Justice, Mrs. 
Robert Linton, and Mrs. David Mulliken, 
Pikeville; Mrs. L. B. Fairchild, Mrs. Jack 
Stumbo, and Mrs. J. D. Adams, Prestons­
burg; Mrs. Alma Frazier, Salyersville; 
Mrs. Fred Salisbury and Mrs. Alma 
Souleyrette, Wheelwright. 

The fall conference was last held at 
Jenny Wiley State Park in 1964. 

Mrs. Claudia F. Leete and Mrs. Effie 
Milby were in Lexington, Wednesday of last 
week, on business. 

Mr. and Mrs. Stanley A. Combs have had 
as their houseguests his niece, Mrs. James 
Butler, Phoenix, Arizona, and daughter, 
Mrs. Sue Williams, Denver, &lorado. 

Mr. and Mrs. Marshall Davidson and 
Debbie returned home last week from a trip 
to Disneyland and other places in 
California. 

Mrs. Claudia F. Leete and Mrs. Edna 
Morris, of Paintsville, spent last weekend 
in Ashland with Mr. and Mrs. Phillip 
Morris and family. 

Presforubarg 

Dairy Queen 
At entrance to Mta. Parkway 

Phone llllf.Ml4 

SALE A11ss our oN t"\~S eJtl~~ri[J 
We've really scared up some 
savings at lad 'n Lassie .. 

%OFF 

On Boys' and Girls' 

Summer 
Merchandise 

Visit Lad 'n Lassie, today .•. Save on our 
sale merchandise and look over our new 
Fall Cottons now in stock. 

Located Richmond Plaza 

PHONE 886-3142 
PRESTONSBURG, KY. 
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FOR SALE-3 bedroom home in Prestons­
burg. Four years old. Call 886-6308 be­
tween 9 and 5. 2-12-tf. 

CLEARANCE SALE. 1969 Mobile Homes; 
brand-new, completely furnished. Two 
bedrooms. As low as $2995. WHITE HALL 
TRAILERS SALES, Prestonsburg. 12-4-
tf. 

FOR SALE-Sand, washed and screened, 
wet, dry or sacked. Ideal for mine use of 
buildings. SANDS OF ROCKCASTLE 
CREEK, Inez, Kentucky, phone 298-3828, 
day, 298-3314, night. 11-9-tf. 

FOR SALE-House and lot. Call CLAUDE 
NEWBERRY, 886-6147 or 886-8971. 6-3-tf. 

FOR SALE-Four-bedroom home, bath, 
small basement, large garden. Joins 
highway on Mountain parkway four miles 
from Prestonsburg. GERTRUDE AR­
NETT, phone 886-3534 or 886-2525. 4-2-tf. 

FOR RENT-Choice sites for Mobile 
Homes on Mayo Court, Prestonsburg. 
Call886-2989. 4-1-tf. 

FOR SALE-Small farm, 6-room house 
with bath, 11 acres land, fruit trees, city 
water and gas. $12,000. DOROTHY BICK­
FORD, Auxier, Ky., phone 886-6782. 6-18-

FOR SALE or trade-Four-unit apartment 
building. Suitable for owner and three 
tenants. May be seen by appointment 
only. GENE D. JUSTICE, Pikeville, Ky., 
phone 437-6789 or 437-6202. 7-9-tf. 

FOR RENT-Store room, carpeted, with or 
without showcases. Formerly occupied 
by The Pawnshop, downtown Prestons­
burg. ABIGAIL BOLLING, phone 886-
6205. 5-28-tf. 

WATCH REPAIR-If you want the best 
job, bring watch repairs and jewelry 
repairs to WRIGHT BROS., JEWELERS. 

FREE FILM FOR CAMERA-Never have 
to buy film any more. Black and white or 
color. Free film at WRIGHT BROS., 
JEWELERS, Prestonsburg and Martin. 
Stop in for details. 9-22-tf. 

FOR SALE-Office Machines, office 
supplies, office furniture (new and used). 
Service on all makes of office machines. 
Phone or write BERT BIBEE, HOME 
OFFICE SUPPLY CO., phone 436-5711, 
Hazard, Ky. 

FOR SALE-Air-conditioners. Several 
sizes priced to sell. Some slightly 
damaged. MONTGOMERY WARD, 
phone 886-3821, Prestonsburg. 6-4-tf. 

FOR SALE-Two-bedroom home, partially 
furnished in Martin. WANDA LEE 
CASTLE, Box 857, Martin, Ky., Phone 
285-3190. 7-22-3t. 

HI, JOHNNY!-Don't delay! Get that extra 
key today. DONAHOE'S TOPS AUTO 
STORE, Court St., Prestonsburg: Ky. 

USED FURNITURE-Across street from 
Ray Howard Furniture on Third avenue, 
RAY HOWARD USED FURNITURE 
OUTLET. Dealers welcome. 6-13-tf. 

FOR SALE-Crank shafts, rods, pistons, 
bearings, gaskets, all auto machine shop 
services. Wholesale and retail. KEENE 
MACHINE SHOP, phone GE7-7236, 
Pikeville, Ky. 12-5-tf. 

WANTED-White Persian male kitten. 
MRS. JAMES D. ADAMS, 886-6119. 7-9-tf. 

FOR SALE-Gene Gray prints, framed and 
unframed, numbered and unnumbered. 
Large selection. Also, Ray Harm prints. 
FRANCIS STORE, Prestonsburg. 7-30-Jt. 

TRAILER SPACE FOR RENT-Call MAE 
KENDRICK, 886-8802. 7-30-tf. 

FOR SALE-Located on a 17 acre tract of 
land, at Wheelwright, Ky. is one five­
room house, a new, twoo{!ar garage­
block construction. One small residence 
occupied and one larger one, that is 
unoccupied. There is a lot of building 
space. All this is offered at the low price 
of $9,000.00. TOWN & COUNTRY REAL 
ESTATE, 58 Main Street, Paintsville, 
Ky., Cam H. Stambaugh, Broker, phones 
789-4895 & 789-5439. lt. 

PLUMBING- HEATING 
NEW WORK- REPAIR 

J. Ernest Compton 
Ca II 886-3637 

Prestonsburg, Ky. 

Need Repair Work? 
Refrigeration-Wiring-Plumbing 

Call WILCE ROSE 
Phone Day, 886-8331; Night, 88&-3505 

RANDALL HYDEN 
Painting Contractor 

Dry-Walling 
Phone 886-3102 

L 
Prestonsburg, Ky. 

Call between 5 and i p.m. 

I 

WATCH REPAIR 
It costs no more to have your 
watch repaired by a graduate 
watchmaker. 

CLYDE BURCHETT 
JEWELER 

Phone 886-2734, Prestonsburg 
6-18-tf. 

WANTED-Lady interested in selling 
cosmetics. Excellent opportunity with 
good territories available. Call 285-3048, 
after 5 p.m., or write MRS. RECTOR, 
Box 906, Martin, Ky. 41649. 7-23-4t. 

SLIM-JIM, the No. 1 home exerciser in the 
world. Contact DORA RECTOR, phone 
358-4576, Garrett, Ky. 7-23-2t-pd. 

FOR SALE-12,500-b.t.u. airo{!onditioner; 
100 sq. yds. outdoor-indoor carpet, and all 
household furnishings. Moving. DEWEY 
MAY, 408 N. Lake Drive, phone 886-
3693. 7 -23-2t. 

FOR SALE-1963 Comet Convertible. V-8, 
4-speed. Call886-6539. 7-23-2t-pd. 

FOR SALE-Motorcycle, 1970 BSA 250 c.c., 
perfect. Call JIM CARTER, 886-3993. 7-23-
2t. 

WANTED TO BUY -1963 Floyd county 
annual. Will pay $5.00 and shipping. 
Please write MRS. CHERRYL PAR­
SONS BOONE, 45 W. Washburn St., New 
London, Ohio 44851 3t. 

FOR SALE-Motorcycle, 350-cc Yamaha. 
If interested, call 886-3897, from 8 a.m.-9 
p.m. 7-16-tf. 

FOR SALE-71h-Ton Air-Conditioner. 
Guaranteed to be in excellent condition. 
Ideal for large business. call 886-3897, 
between 8 a.m.-9 p.m. 7-16-tf. 

FOR SALE-Cattle rack to fit 34-ton truck. 
NORMAN L. HICKS, Rt. 850, David, Ky. 
Call 886-3322. 7-16-4~ 

GENERAL CONSTRUCTION 
COMPANY 

Ernest "Red" Osborne, Owner 
Third Street, Prestonsburg 

Are you planning to build or 
remodel? Call "Red" Osborne for 
expert work on aU General 
Construction, Remodeling, 
Plumbing, Heating and Air­
Conditioning. 
Free Estimate Call Collect 

PHONE 886-2515 
or 886-2975 

FOR SALE-18-ft. white with red trim 
Custom Craft boat. 75 h.p. Evinrude 
motor. Trailer included. Call CARLOS 
NEELEY,886-3565. 7-15-tf. 

FOR SALE-Motorcycle, 1968 BSA 650c.c. 
Less than 5,000miles. See or phone PAUL 
NEIL ALLEN, 886-8931. 

FOR SALE-Chevrolet Pickup Truck Air­
Conditioner. Reg. $259.95. Now $175. 
Montgomery Ward, phone 886-3821, 
Prestonsburg. . 7-16-tf. 

FOR SALE-18-cu. ft. automatic washer. 
New, with damaged front. Reg. $269.95. 
Now $200. Montgomery Ward, phone 886-
3821, Prestonsburg. 7-16-tf. 

FOR SALE-Used automatic washer and 
dryer. Good condition. $75. Montgomery 
Ward, phone 886-3821, Prestonsburg. 7-16-
tf. 

FOR SALE-3-bedroom house on Arnold 
Avenue. carpet. Phone 886-2349 after 5' 
p.m. 7-8-tf. 

FOR SALE-Beautiful Country Home-6 
rooms and bath. Located between Auxier 
and East Point. Good water, gas, plenty 
grazing land. Two barns, good fencing. 
call 886-2840 or 1186-0175 or See MARVIN 
CRIDER. 7-9-tf. 

FOR SALE-A three-bedroom brick, 
located in the Goble Roberts Addition, 
Lancer, Ky. Has three bedrooms, 
beautifu1 kitchen, with plenty of cabinets, 
living room, bath with shower, utility 
room. Garage, and a level lot size 75x107 
feet. This house is in a convenient 
location, just a few yards from the new 
shoe factory. Has all city services. For 
appointment to see, call1186-0225. TOWN 
& COUNTRY REAL ESTATE, Cam H. 
Stambaugh, Broker, 58 Main Street, 
Paintsville, Ky., phones 789-4895 and 789-
5439. lt. 

FOR SALE-1963 Volkswagen. Phone 886-
2786; after 5, 886-2852. 7-30-2t. 

UPHOLSTERING, all types. All work 
guaranteed. BATES UPHOLSTERY, 
Weeksbury, Ky., phone 452-2257. ll-30-2t­
pd. 

VANDA BEAUTY COUNSELOR 
Cosmetics now interviewing for part­
time earnings opportunity. Earn money 
for children's school clothes! Write 
EDRA WALKER, Paintsville, Ky. 7-30-St. 

FOR SALE-Two houses, six lots in Goble­
Roberts Addition. JOHN B. NEELEY. 
Phone 886-2555 or 886-2951. 6-18-tf. 

FOR SALE-Three-bedroom brick home. 
Also a four-bedroom brick. Wall-to-wall 
carpet in both. modern kitchens. 
MALINDA CONLEY, phone 886-3441 or 
886-2135. 6-18-tf. 

ZIGZAG SEWING MACHINES, new, used 
and repossessed. Some as low as $39.95. 
Also all makes repaired. Phone 886-
2913. 7-23-2t-pd. 

FOR SALE-Gravely tractor, completely 
rebuilt, with all attachments. Reasonably 
priced. OAKLEY PATTON, phone 358-
4515, Wayland. 7-23-tf. 

PAINTING and WALLPAPERING. can 
886-2294 after 4. CECIL HYDEN, Pres­
tonsburg. 6-25-12t-pd. 
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BAKERY PIES, Reg. 59c 
SAUSAGE 
PORK CHOPS . 
FRYERS 
HAMBURGER 
SLICED BACON 

Licensed Administrator 

Mrs. Eleanor Robinson, of East Point, 
has received a license as administrator of 
Mountain Manor Nursing Home in com­
pliance with Chapter 216A of the Kentucky 
Revised Statutes and the ru1es and 
regulations of the Kentucky Board of 
Licensure for Nursing Home Ad­
ministrators. 

Mrs. Robinson, a former employee of the 
Bank Josephine here, was employed as 
administrator in January, 1969. She has 
attended seminars for advanced nursing 
home administration at the University of 
Oklahoma, and the American Nursing 
Home Association Management workshop 
at San Juan, Puerto Rico. Mrs. Robinson 
has also received the Kentucky Nursing 
Home Association Merit Award. 

Ninetyo{)ne counties in Kentucky p1 ovide 
family planning services through local 
health departments. 

FOR SALE at East Point, Ky. 5-room 
house, wired for electric stove. A real buy 
at $6000 on 12 acres. Can be financed. For 
more information call, collect, 744-7020 or 
see John W. Rice, phone 886-2146 lt. 

WANTED-Fountain workers, fulltime. 
Day work only. No Sundays. Apply in 
person. ROSE DRUG STORE, Prestons­
burg. 1t 

FOR SALE-7-room home; 3 bedrooms, 1% 
baths, carpet in living room, dining room, 
20x20 carpeted family room with 
fireplace, built-in dishwasher. Large, 
level lot Phone 886-3641. 7-30-2t-pd. 

AVON CALLING-
Continuing Demand For Avon's Complete 

Line Of Cosmetics Creates Additional 
Territories For Representatives. You 
Serve Customers Near Home And Can 
Earn Well. Write Avon Manager, P.O. 
Box 685, Prestonsburg, Ky. 41653 

FOR SALE-Modern, three-bedroom 
home. Central heat and airo{!onditioning, 
two full baths, large , private patio, 
double garage, kitchen complete with 
built-in oven, cook top and dishwasher. 
Conveniently located on paved street 
among other beautiful homes, in 
COLLEGE HEIGHTS Estates. Shown by 
appointment. Phone 886-3856. 7-23-2t-pd. 

LOTS FOR 
MOBILE HOMES 

Large lots, in the country, for 
mobile homes now available. 

Phone 886-3821 
or 285-3986 

7-30-tf. 

To Whom It \lav (:on<'ern: 
• 

On and after publication of this notice I 
will not be responsible for any debt in­
curred by any person other than myself. 

GLENN SLONE 
Langley, Ky. 

7-23-2t-pd. 

FOR SALE-3-bedroom house on South 
Lake Drive. New owner can assume a 
V.A. loan at 51'4 per cent interest for 
almost half of asking price. Call Helen 
Anderson at 886-2301 or Glenn Anderson 
at 886-2396 or 886-2106. Shown by ap­
pointment only. 6-25-tf. 

EXCAVATION 
WORK 

Inloader work - Dirt or gravel 
hauled or removed, other clean­
up work; House seats prepared, 
basements, etc. 

See or call: 

W. C. "Casper" Smith 
Phone 452-2429 

Melvin, Kentucky 
7 -30-2t-pd. 

I 
Pelphrey's TOMATOES are the finest for flavor and 
quality of any store's in this area. 'I hrough a special 
process, Pelphrey's ripen their own tomatoes -and 
the result: a more fla\orfut tomato that even in the 
coldest season, has a juicy, summer-fresh garden 
taste. Pick up a basket today. 

PELPHREY'S NOW HAS 
THE NEW 

DIET PEPSI 
39c 

21bs.99c 
lb. 49c 
lb. 27c 

3 lbs. $1.69 
lb. 49c 

1\IAYTO 
The revival referred to in last week's 

Maytown news was an error. The revival is 
to be held in the basement at the home of 
missionaries Misses Barbara Wynsma and 
Lois Holmquist at Eastern, Ky. starting 
August 17 and led by Rev. Lee Edward 
caudill, of Versailles, Indiana. 

Miss Patty Webb has spent several weeks 
in Cincinnati visiting Mr. and Mrs. Bob 
Waddles and Sherri. 

Mr. and Mrs. Claude Webb, Mrs. Susan 
Dingeldein and Dawn, Jeff Stewart, Beckie 
Stewart and Stephanie Turner attended a 
family reunion at the home of Mrs. Dial 
Salisbury at Stockdale, Ohio last weekend. 

The Maytown United Methodist Church 
welcomed its new pastor, Rev. John Huff­
man, and family with a potluck dinner in 
the church basement after morning ser­
vices last Sunday. The MYF gave Rev. 
Huffman a boutonniere and Mrs. Huffman 
a corsage. They also surprised Mrs. Marie 
Stephens with a corsage. A large group 
attended, including guests from Martin and 
Salisbury. The morning services were 
conducted by the MYF under the leader­
ship of Mrs. Marie Stephens . Program 
leader was Bill Robinson. Others taking 
part were Jan Hicks, Oma Faye Reffett, 
James Robinson, Belinda Jones, Glenna 
Robinson,and Mrs. Violet Allen gave the 
welcome for the adu1ts. Taking part also 
were Susan Compton, with special music 
and a duet by Belinda Jones and Jeannie 
Frasure. Others helping with the program 
were Eric May, Gregg Halbert, Nancy 
Northrop, Ann Rowe, Claudette Refft!tt and 
Mae Rita Hagans. 

Miss Lynn Webb is spending the sununer 
in Cedar Lake, Ind. with Mr. and Mrs. 
Walker Prater and family. 

Mr. and Mrs. Roland Burchett spent 
several days last week vacationing at 
Smoky Moutains National Park, Gatlin­
burg, Tenn., and Cherokee, N. C. 

Merle Webb, of dar Lake, Ind., spent 
last week here visiting his parents ,l\lr. ami 
Mrs. Tom Webb. 

Miss Beckie Rotunda, of Englewood, 
calif., is visiting Mr. and Mrs. James E. 
Allen. 

Mrs. Violet Allen, Mrs. Elb:abeth Hayes, 
Miss Beckie Rotunda, Mrs. Tramble 
Turner and Mrs. Ali Hayes visited 1\lrs. 
Sylvia Raines in Gr dy, Va. last \\"ed­
nesday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Justin Turner, of iur­
freesboro, Tenn., have been visiting Mr. 
and Mrs. Champ Gibson and other relatives 
here. 

Miss Janie Bailey is doing volunteer work 
at Our Lady of the Way Hospital this 
summer. 

Mr. and Mrs. Kedrick Blevins announce 
the birth of their fourth child, a son, named 
Kelvin Milford, July 15 at the etho<.list 
Hospital, Pikeville. 

Mr. and Mrs. Sid Bailey and Janie were 
shopping in Pikeville, Wednesday. 

Mrs. Howard Likens, Missy, Susie, Pam 
and Timmy, Ronda and Ann Rowe, Mrs. 
Sid Bailey, Mrs. Sue Osborne and Mrs. 
Polly Martin visited the Golden Years Rest 
Home at Lackey last Monday and treated 
the old folks to another watermelon feast. 

Janie Bailey, Susan Compton, Beulah 
Patton and Judy Stewart attended the foods 
judging camp at Camp J. M. Feltner in 
Johnson county, last week. 

Mrs. L. E. Roberts visited Mr. and Mrs. 
George A. Patton, Thursday evening. The 
Pattons held open house for Mrs. Roberts to 
visit with old friends. Those attending were 
Mrs. Shannon Gibson and Teddy, Mrs. 
Hubert Halbert, Stephen, Elizabeth Ann 
and Wesley, Mrs. Howard Ramey, Mrs. Ed 
Stewart, Mrs. Ruby Halbert , Mrs. Roland 
Burchett, Mrs. Edward Robinson, Bess 
Ratliff, Mr. and Mrs. Thomas Patrick, Mrs. 
Elizabeth Allen, Mrs. Henry L. May. Mrs. 
Amanda Sutton and Mrs. James E. Allen. 
Mrs. Roberts also visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Thurmal Click earlier in the evening. 

Mr. and Mrs. Tom Ousley are the parents 
of a son born at the Methodist Hospital, 
Pikeville, July 21, and named Thomas Ray. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lowell Martin are 
vacationing in Indiana and Ohio. 

Mrs. George Begley is a patient in an 
Ashland hospital. 

Mr. and Mrs. Billy Barnett and children, 
of Ypsilanti, Mich., have moved into the 
Bill Sturgill house on Wilson Creek. 

Mrs. Shannon Gibson and Teddv were 
business visitors in Huntington last week. 

Rev. John Huffman will be attending 
classes at Emory University, Atlanta, Ga., 
for a month . 

Invitation To Bid 
The Floyd County Board of Education 

offer to the lowest and best sealed bidder, 
until 12:00 noon, August 1, the following: 

Fleet insurance for: 
1. School busses 
2. Maintenance and transportation 

vehicles 
3. Driver Education Cars 
Also bids for contract hau1s that bring 

children to the main bus runs. These bids to 
be accompanied by performance bonds. 

Detailed information on the above may 
be had by calling the School Superin­
tendent's office - 886-2354 or 3522 

The Board reserves the right to reject 
any or all bids. 

CHARLES CLARK 
Superintendent 

Floyd County Schools 
7 2:! 2t. 

COKE, 16-oz. Bottles 
PEPSI, 16-oz. Bottles 
STEREO TAPES,4- or 8-Track 
PEACHES, No. 21f2 Cans 
WAGNER'S ORANGE DRINK 

• ctn. 69c 
ctn. 79c 
~ $5.79 

~ 4 for $1 
qt.29c 

Save More, Every Day, At Jerry's! 

N NE\YS 
Mr. aud Mrs. Jack Crowe, of Covington, 

stopped het e last week to visit her mother, 
Mrs. Ar11arr1da Sutton. They were on their 
way hon1e after vacationing in Florida. 

Georgt• W. Allen celebrated his 84th 
birtl.day last Sunday. His birthday cake 
was baked by Mrs. Mane Stephens. 
Helatives vtstting hun during the afternoon 
were Mr. and Mrs. George A. Patton, Mr. 
and :\Irs. llubet·t Halbert, Stephen, 
T•.lizabeth AJu1, and Wesley, 1\lt s. Amanda 
Sutton, Mr. and Mrs, Thomas Patrick, Ray 
Allen and Mr. , nd Mrs . Jack Crowe. 

Mr. aud 1\lr s. Hay Prater, Mr. and Mrs. 
Danny Flannery and Michael, 111eresa 
Prater and Nita Htcks visited Mrs. Hazel 
Doughtery an l child! en at Beattyville, 
Sunday. 

Gregg Halbert has been visiting his 
uncle, Jad; Slone, and family in Ypsilanti, 
Mich. 

!\lr. aud 1\lrs. Don lt'rasure and children, 
of Cedar Lake, Ind., were visiting relatives 
here and at Brush 0 eek last week. 

!\lr. and Mrs. Hhomer Osborne, of 
Eastern, and Valetta and Don Halbert, Jr., 
of Lexington, were visiting this week in 
Lima, Ohio, with Hershel Osborne, and 
1\lrs. Bradis Laferty. The Laferty family 
had just returned from the west coast, 
where they spent a few days with Romis 
Gene, who receutly finished a tour in Viet 
Nam. 

Mr. and Mrs. Billy Barnett have returned 
to this county from Taylor, Michigan to 
, take their howe 011 Wilson Creek. 

-
Logan Hicks, Age 81, 
Garrett Resident, Dies 
At Pikeville Hospital 

I./Pan Hicks, 89, of Garrett, died last 
ionday at thl.' Methodist hospital at 

Prkeville aft an extended illness. 
A son of the "tte I <;aac and Matilda Hicks, 

he was born Oct. 18, 1880 in Knutt county, 
and was a retired miner. He was twice 
married -- first to Pau1a Mosley, and 
following her death, to Nancy Ann Johnson, 
"ho also preceded bim in death. 

Survivors include two sons, Claudie 
Hicks, of Garrett, and Elvie Hicks, of 
Covington, Ky.; two step~aughters, Mrs. 
no::de Caudill, and Mrs. ie Mae Johnson, 
both of Covington, and a sister, Rosie 
Moore, of Mousie. Also surviving are 11 
grandchildren and 27 great-grandchildren. 

Funeral services were held Thursday at 
10 a.m. at the Stone Coal Regu1ar Baptist 
Church at Garrett with ministers of that 
church officiating, Burial was made in the 
Martin cemetery at Garrett under the 
direction of the Merion Funeral Chapel. 

mNNER <>UESIS 
Mr. and \1ts Stanley A. Combs had as 

their dinner guests last Saturday Mrs. 
Elizabeth IlayPs, Woodlaud Hills, 
California, and 1\lr. and Mrs James E. 
Allen, of Maytown. 

Barlie Sammons, 70, 
Former Martin Man, 
Victim In Florida 

Barlie Sammons, of Ft. Lauderdale, 
Florida, formerly of Martin, died Saturday 
at Pompano Beach, Florida. He was 70 
years old. 

Born Aug. 22, 1900, a son of the late James 
and Sarah Frazier Sammons, he was twice 
married - first to Mahalia Walk, who 
preceded him in death, and later to Gracie 
Belle Sammons, who survives. 

Other survivors include one daughter, 
Mrs. Edith Kendricks, of Pompano Beach; 
five brothers, Raymond, Robert, Thomas 
Q., and Rupert Sammons, all of Martin, 
and William A. Sammons, of Louisville, 
and five sisters, Mrs. Susan Sammons, 
Mrs. Lynn Peters, Mrs. Zelze Lafferty and ' 
Mrs. Ruby Mullins, all of Martin, and Mrs. 
Erma Mayo, Winchester, Kentucky. 

Funeral services were held at 2 p.m., 
Saturday, at the Church of Christ on 
Arkansas Creek with burial made there at 
the Sammons cemetery under the direction 
of Hall Brothers Funeral Home. 

Kelcie Faye Bryant, 13, 
Dies At Parents' Home 
At Wales, Thursday 

Kelcie Faye Bryant, 13, diec Thursday at 
her home at Wales, after a sudden illness. 

A daughter of Ellen Collins Bryant and 
the late B. H. Bryant, she was born 
November 1, 1956. 

Surviving besides her mother are one 
brother, Vernon Ray Bryant, of Wales; two 
sisters, Stiggie and Esta Pearl Bryant, both 
of Wales ; four half-brothers, Roy Bryant, 
in Ohio, Homer Bryant, in Michigan and 
Troy and Orville Bryant, both of Melvin; 
one half-sister, Mrs. Thelma Jean 
Newsome, Michigan, and an aunt with 
whom she lived, Ethel Collins, of Wales. 

Funeral services were held Sunday at 10 
a.m. at the Joppa Regular Baptist Church 
at Melvin with Regular Baptist ministers 
officiating. Burial followed in the Tackett 
cemetery at Melvin under the direction of 
Merion Funeral Chapel. 

Claims for a veteran's burial expense, 
not to exceed $250, may be filed within two 
years by the undertaker or person who bore 
the expense. 

Carl D. (Dave) Collins 

Custom Cabinets 
AND 

Remodeling 
Phone 886-3311 

Prestonsburg, Ky. 

AIR-CONDITIONING 

BIG 

CLOSE-OUT SALE 
BUY NOW AND SAVE! ENJOY THE 
REST OF THE HOT SUMMER DAYS 
AHEAD WITH HOME-COOLING AIR­
CONDITIONING 

EDUCTIONS ON ALL UNITS 
MONTGOMERY WARD 

Phone 886-3821 Prestonsburg, Ky. 

All. t-: 11'1 IHI(' \'\11 FtLI.\ \IH 10. PITIO~ED 

RAMSEY MOBILE HOME SALES 

WE 
INSTAll 

J' ll<il \ 11.1.1 , h 1-' '\'It' I' h.\" l'HP'\ F t;l7-6626 

Linzie Hale's Aluminum Products, 
Sales and Service 

Aluminum Awnings 
Carports and Marquees 
Aluminum Siding 
Storm Windows and Doors 
Glass and Screen Repair 

FREE ESTIMATE 

Ornamental Railings and Columns 
Roof Shingles and Roof Repair 
Concrete and Paneling 
Kitchen Cabinets 
Aluminum Guttering 

15 YEARS' EX PERl ENCE 

886-2264 South Lake Drive Prestonsburg, Ky. 
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· FRESH 
CHICKEN LIVER 
FRESH CHICKEN 
GIBLETS 
BREAKFAST LINK 
SAUSAGE 
SWIFT'S ALL-MEATI 

BOLOGNA PIECE 
SWIFT'S JUMBO 

BOLOGNA SLICED 

lb. S9C 

lb. 69C 
RANCH ROASTED 

CHICKENS 3 Lb. Or More tb. $1.69 
TENDER & JUICY 

CUBE ·sTEAKS 
STANDING 6th & 7th RIBS 
RIB ROAST 
E-Z CARVE 
RIB ROAST 
DELMONICO 
STEAKS 

Lb.$1.33 

lb. 99C 

Lb.$1.09 
Lb.$1.99 

W H THIS COUPON 

HERSHEY'S 5 ¢ 
CHOCOLATE 1 lb. 
SYRUP can 

GOOD ONLY AT FOODLANDS LISTED 
EXPIRES SAT. AUG. 1, 1970 

HOUT COUPON . . . 21 C 

VALUABLE 
- -::.. ~- -- --

!TH THIS COUPON 

QT. BTL 4 ¢ 
IVORY qt 
LIQUID btl. 
GOOD ONLY AT FOODLANDS LISTED 

EXPIRES SAT. AUG. 1, 1970 
WITHOUT COUPON ... 79C 

THE FLOYD COUNTY TIMES 

• 4 THIGHS •4 PCS. BREAST 
•4 WINGS •4 LEGS 

TENDERBEST 

RIB STEAK 

lb. 
51. 
SHORT 
RIBS of BEE . 
M ED. SIZE F ES 
SPARE RIB 
SLICED 
PORK LIVER 
SMOKED 
POLISH SAUSAGE 

ARMOUR'S 

BACON THICK 

2 LB. PK. 

$1.59 
lb. sse 
lb. 79C 
lb. 49C 

'SCHNEID E R'S 2 lb. 
WIENE S pkg. 

HAM 
SANDWICHES 

POTATOES 
10 Lb. Bag 

VAN CAMP 1 lb. 4~z. lSC 
PORK & BEANS cans 
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CUT-UP 

FRYERS 

33C 

HEALTH & BEAUTY AIDS . 
STORCK KING SIZE41 lb. 4oz. $1 RIGHT GUARD 3oz. 49¢ 
BREAD loaves ~DE~O~D~O !!!RA!!..!N~T ---=c=an:....____;;.,__ 
FOODLAND (ALL FLAVORS) 59¢ NORWICH 39¢ 
ICE CREAM 1h ga I. !!AS~P_!.!I R~I.!.!...N __ ___:2:..:..50::...::' s:..___..:::.......=.._ 

PAINTSVILLE 
JUICY CALIFORNIA 

LEMONS 

DOZEN 47c 

.. 

PRICES EFFECTIVE THRU 
SAT. AUGUST 1, 1970 

McCORMICK'S 

TEA BAGS 
lOO's 

SAVE 23c 

I 
WE RESERVE THE RIGHT 
TO LIMIT QUANTITIES 
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Dial886-2510 To Place 
A Times Want Ad! 

Prestoubrrrg 

Dairy Queen 
At eatranee to Mtn. Parkway 

Phooe 88Wtl4 

1-Day Heart (:linic 
Scheduled, Aug. 12 

A one-day consultative and diagnostic 
heart clinic for medically indigent children 
will be held in the Pike County Health 
Department, August 12. 

Physicians from the departments of 
Pediatrics and Medicine at the Unive\-sity 
of Kentucky Medical School will conduct 
the clinic. 

Co-sponsored by the Kentucky Heart 
Association and the State and County 
Health Departments, this clinic provides a 
diagnostic service for the patient along 
with recommendations for treatment and 
management of the case. It also provides 
an opportunity for the referring physician 
to consult with the clinician regarding his 
patient. 

Only patients who have been referred by 
a physician and have a written referral will 
be admitted to the clinic. Counties in this 
clink area are Floyd, Johnson, Magoffin, 
Martin and Pike. 

The Veterans Administration recently 
announced the allocation of another $5 
million for various construction projects at 
some of its 166 hospitals. 

Theonlything that looks funnier than a Volkswagen 
carrying 17 6 cubic feet of things is someone else's 
wagon carrying 176 cubic feet of thing s. 

THE FLOYD COUNTY TIMES 

CHEERLEADER TRAINING AT MOREHEAD - Cheerleaders 
from Maytown high school brushed up their techniques, routines and 
formations during a training camp sponsored by the American 
Cheerleaders Association and conducted on the campus of Morehead 
State University. Front row from left are: Jeannie Frasure, Denice 
Blevins and Becky Stewart. Back row from left are: Terrie Harris, 
Patti Gibson and Oma Reffitt. 

Maytown Working 
On '71 Homecoming 

LANGLEY, Ky .-Plans and work for the 
1971 Maytown Homecoming continue, with 
the first draft of the booklet now half 
finished. The few not yet heard from are 
urged to comply with requests for data and 
photos immediately. 

Extension Service 
BY JACK M. FRIAR 

County Extension Agent 

Sherri Martin, of the Garrett high school 
4-H Club, won the senior division of the 
Northeast Area clothing judging contest. 
Myra Green, also of the Garrett high club, 
was third in the contest. 

In the junior division, Lora Hopkins of the 
Maytown Club, finished third, and Ann 
Flanery, of the same club, was sixth. Also 
qualifying for the state contest was Karen 
Conn, of the Prater Club. 

The clothing judging contest was held at 
the conclusion of the special clothing 
judging camp held July 1 at the Feltner 
4'-H Camp in he John c ty. Girls from 
Pike, Magoffin, Ma i , Lawrence, and 
Johnson counties attended. 

All five Floyd county members will be 
judging in the state cont stand at the State 
Fair in . . 

~ ... 

·. . 

Sportsmen Seek 
Environment Dept. 

The League of Kentucky Sportsmen, a 
37 ,000-member conservation group, is 
coordinating an environment improvement 
program to introduce for approval to the 
1972 General Assembly. 

The League is seeking the creation of a 
Kentucky Department of Environment, 
according to its president, Lt. Edgar Paul, 
of the Louisville police force. He said the 
League's Legislative Committee will draft 
the proposal and present it to the 
Legislative Research Commission. 

Paul also said the League requested a 
conference with Gov. Louie B. Nunn and 
three state officials whose duties deal with 
environmental improvement: Ralph 
Pickard, director of the Air and Water 
Control Commissions; Elmore Grim, 
director of Strip Mining and Reclamation, 
and Minor Clark, commissioner of the 
Department of Fish and Wildlife Resour­
ces. 

The conference will discuss the im­
plementation and enforcement of current 
statutes regulating state functions with 
regard to environment. 

The League's Natural Resources Com­
mittee, headed by the League executive 
vice president, Reid Love, will handle the 
conference. 

lOSE WEIGHT 
Get amazing results when you take our product called 
SLIMODEX. No prescription needed. You must lose ugly 
fat or your money batk. SLIMODEX is a tablet and easily 
swallowed. No starving, no special exercise, no harmful 
drugs. SLIMODEX costs $3.00 and is sold on this 
GUARANTEE: if not salisfled for any reason, iusl return 
the unused portion to the makers and get your full money 
back. SLIMODE X is sold by: 

FOUNTAIN KORNER DRUG STORE, Prestonsburg, Ky. 
MAIL ORDERS FILLEP 

-
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Smith Is Promoted 
To Warrant Officer 

Okey Lee Smith, an eight-year Army 
veteran, has been promoted from the rating 
of staff sergeant in the Army's Adjutant 
General's Corps to that of warrant officer 
while on duty in Heilbronn, Germany. 

A son of Mrs. Ida M. Smith, of Estill, and 
the late William Russell Smith, he entered 
the Army Oct. 24, 1961 after graduating 
from Wayland high school and attending 
Alice Lloyd College at Pippa Passes. His 
last stateside assignment was to the Army 
ROTC Instructor Group at Dickinson 
College, Carlisle, Pa. He holds the Vietnam 
Campaign and Service medals, the Good 
Conduct medal (three awards) and the 
Army Commendation medal with oak leaf 
cluster. 

CUSTOM 
PICTURE·FRAMING 

Dealer of 
Collector's WUdllfe PriDts 

By 
RAY HARM 

GUYCOHELEACH 
DON ECKLEBERRY 
CHARLES HARPER 
ANNE 0. DOWDEN 

THE SHACK 
Prestonsburg, Ky. 

Authorized Dealer for 
Frame House Gallery 

of Wildlife Art 

Call JOE ISBELL 
886-8301 

When Ambulance Service is required you must have the fastest, 
most efficient possible. 

Ambulance service is our only business ..•. done right, it 
requires full time effort. 

24 Hour 
Emergency Service 

Air-Conditioned 
Two-Way Radio 
Oxygen Equipped 

ALAC AN 
B C SERVICE 

PRESTO SB RG, KENTUCKY 
GREG CRUM, PHONE 886-6410 

Southern States 

Every effort is being made to make the 
second edition of the booklet different from 
the first in many respects. In addition to an 
honor group of distinguished Maytown 
alumni and citizens, the 1971 booklet will 
contain a group of mothers recognized for 
various contributions to the community, 
one of nurses and L.P.N.'s, another uf 
servicemen, a fourth of "Charming 
Charmers" (pre-school toddlers), out­
standing personalities featured in the 
original celebration of 1968 but not in that 
booklet, and a section known as "Special 
Specials," whose precise nature presently 
remains an editorial secret. Edna Click, 
editor-in-chief, Bonnie Spencer, Libby Ree 
Flanery, Violet Allen (ex-<lfficio member ), 
and others on the staff are qusy. 

The unusual cover design for the 1971 
booklet was done by Audrey Mae Hayes 
Cairns, Maytown alumna, now resident of 
Jacksonville, Florida, a well-known artist 
whose work in portraiture is specially 
noted. Mrs. Cairns has participated in the 
Benedictine Art Awards annual exhibit in 
New York City, as well as in various others. 
She has studied extensively under the 
famous artist, Howard J. Ahrens, of New 
York. She has consented to serve as 
chairman of the 1971 exhibit during 
Homecoming. 

~ S;UMMER APPLIANCE SPECIALS 

Vance Volkswagen, Inc. 

Homecoming officers express thanks to 
all who sent contributions this spring, 
specially to Kendall May, of Cincinnati, for 
$25 and to Ernest Hagans, of Pikeville, for 
$20 recently received. 

Phone 886-3849 Rt. 23 North 
PRESTONSBURG, KY. ~\,ITtlORIZ£.0 

O(AL(R 

VISIT CAVERNS 
Mr. and Mrs. Crit Mitchell, Jr. and 

children, of Grethel, recently visited 
Forbidden Caverns, near the G~at Smoky 

SAL 
We're Opening for Business at 01r New Location in a Big Way! •. 

SALE OF ALL MOBILE 0 ES IN STOCK 

J L Y 4 thru A GUST 2 
SAVE NOW Featuring the Top 10 Leading Brands of Mobile Homes ... 

On The Two Makes of Double-Wide Mobile Homes Also On Sale 

MOBILE HOME AlL MO I E HOMES WILL BE PRICED INSIDE THE UNIT 

FREE COCA-COLA 
FOR ALL •• 

Refreshments furnished 
through the courtesy 

of your 
BIG SANDY RECC 

FREE! REEl F EE! 
WITH !:VERY MOB I E HOM SOLD DURING THIS 

SALE, PURCH SER WILL RECEIVE A 

ABSOLUTELY FREEl 

Save at White Hall, Kentucky's largest mobile home dealer- 10 lots 
located throught the state. Top quality at lowest prices! Direct factory 
to you. 

WHITE HA L TR ILE SALES 
WE ARE NOW LOCATED ON SOUTH LAKE DR IV , PRESTONSBURG, 

ACROSS FROM FA M & HOME STORE. PHONE 886-3596. 

FREE GIFTS 
For The 

KIDDIESI 

Enjoy the Comfort 
of Modern Living 

in a 

TOTALlY -ELECTRIC 
MOBilE 

··:" 

.• ......... . 
I 

Live better ... pay less thru Aug. 1 
Unico 28 Cu. Ft. Freezer 
905 lb. capacity. Slim·wall design. Urethane 
insulation. Lift·out baskets. Defrost drain. 
No. KH·23. 

Unico 18.5 Cu. Ft. Upright Freezer 
Holds 637 lbs. food. Slim·wall design. Ure· 
thane insulat ion. Defrost drain. Glide·out 
basket. No. KV·l8. 

' 
Unico 12.6 Cu. Ft. Refrigerator 
Large frozen food space. Full-width meat 
chiller. Extra·rigid construction. Whisper· 
quiet. No. KR-12. 

Unico 15.49 Cu. Ft. Refrigerator­
Freezer Combination 
11.34 cu. ft. refrigerator section defrosts 
automatically. 4.15 cu. ft. freezer. 
No. KC15B 

Unico 36" Elecric Range 
Infinite heat top controls. Automatic pre· 
heat oven. Removable plug·in elements. 
No. D457W·l. 

Unico 36" Gas Range 
Lift·up removable top. Lo·temp oven con· 
trol. Roll ·out smokeless broiler. Superior 
Uni·Burners. No. D417W·l. 

Unico 10,200 BTU Air Conditioner 
115 volts. Reserve capacity. Quiet opera· 
tion. 5 automatic settings. "Instant instal· 
lation." No. UBA·l02JM. 

Unico 18,000 BTU Air Conditioner 
230 volts. Extra cooling power. Quiet opera· 
tion. 5 automatic settings. "Installation." 
No. UBA183K. 

Unico Automatic Dehumidifier 
Dial dryness you want. Humidistat main· 
tains automatically. Light signals when full. 
Removes up to 42 pints of water per day. 
Portable. No. KD·42. 

Price cut 
to $289 

Price cut 
to $269 

Price cut 
to $215 

Price cut 
to $269 

Price cut 
to $199 

Price cut 
to $199 

Price cut 
to $219 

Price cut 
to $315 

Price cut 
to $99.95 

Use Southern States BETTER· THAN-EVER Budget Payment Plan 

FARM & HOME STORE 
Phone 886-2149 Prestonsburg, Ky. 
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Presents Annual Scholarship 

Marvin Music, Distributor, Inc., presents its annual scholarship to the Prestonsburg 
Community College Scholarship Fund for 1970.'71. Marvin Music, Jr., vice-president 
of the firm, made the presentation to Ernest Randy Patton, center, recipient of this 
year's scholarship. Also present for the presentation was Robert R. Allen, academic 
dean of the college. 

(--------------~-------------------------

Jenny Wiley Invitational Play 
Scheduled for Aug. I and 2nd 

The Jenny Wiley State Park Invitational, 
slated for Saturday and Sunday, Aug. 1-2, 
will be 36 holes medal play and will be open 
to all amateur golfers, Walt Conway, golf 
pro employed by the state to stage this and 
other state park tourneys, said last week. 

Although the meet is open to all 
amateurs, it will be closed when, and if, the 
registration reaches 100. The entry fee is 
$10. 

Saturday's first-round score will 
1 determine the flight classification of en­

trants. Five flights are planned, 20 to the 
flight. First prize for winner of the first 
flight will be a golf bag. Merchandise prizes 
will be awarded others in the flight. The top 
prize in the championship flight will be a 
set of irons, and a set of woods for second 
place. 

Conway will oversee 14 state park 
tournaments during the sununer. Three 
already have been held, he said, with 
pleasing results-the Bourbon Open, 
Kentucky State Amateur at Lincoln 
Homestead and the Pine Mountain In­
vitaional. 

He was Bourbon Open champion in 1963, 
Daniel Boone champion at Frankfort in 
1968 and is club champion of the Frankfort 
COuntry Club. Conway resumed golf after 

Grayson State Park 
May Triple Campsites 

With the state Parks Department taking 
over the development of Grayson Reservoir 
Park, plans call for an increase of the 
present 1,762 campsites to possibly as many 
as 5,340 - a triple expansion. 

This goal was expounded by Gov. Louie 
B. Nunn when Col. Morris D. Roush, of the 
U.S. Army Corps of Engineers, presented. 
the state with an easement permit for the 
park. The present 570-acre camping and 
picnicking area is to be expanded even­
tually into a 3,800-acre park. The location is 
in Grayson and Elliott counties. 

Grayson Reservoir Park becomes the 
38th in the state system. 

CARD OF THANKS 
We would like to take this means of 

thanking everyone who helped us during 
the passing of our beloved father, brother 
and husband, Everett Layne. We especially 
wish to thank those of you that sent flowers, 
food, or did anything to help. And a special 
thanks to the ministers James Harmon and 
Bill Amburgey, and the Hall Brothers 
Funeral Home for its fine service. 

f returning last March from Vietnam, where 
he spent 15 months. THE EVER TT LAYNE FAMILY 

Administrator's Notice 
Administration has been granted on the following estates, and all persons having 

claims against any of same are hereby notified to file their claims, properly proven 
according to law, on or before Sept. 1, 1970 with the administrator of such estate at the 
address shown below: 

Name Estate Address 

Lucille Patton Fannie Wells Auxier, Ky. 
Martin B. Burchett Bertha May Weddington Emma, Ky. 
Wilma Dean Sizemore Fannie Sizemore Minnie, Ky. 
Alice Burchell George Burchell Dwale, Ky. 
Barbara 0. Johnson I. B. Johnson Buckingham, Ky. 
Verna Justice John Justice, Jr. Hi Hat, Ky. 
Dorothy Bentley Hatfield Bentley E. McDowell, Ky. 
Laura Childers Forest Childers David, Ky. 
Rosa Newsome F. D. Henson Hi Hat, Ky. 
Ralph Moore Fannie Harris Price, Ky. 
Carl Rowe Charles Edward Rowe Melvin, Ky. 
Belva C. Matney Emma COx Martin 1108 1st Circle 

Ashland, Ky. 
Hallie Hager Everett D. Hager David, Ky. 

Versia Duncan Amos Lee Duncan Garrett, Ky. 
Rosha Moore Albert Moore Garrett, Ky. 
Sallie Adams Woodrow W. Adams Salyersville, Ky. 
Debia Tuttle Tom Tuttle Minnie, Ky. 

7-16-3t. 
C. OLLIE ROBINSON, 
Clerk, Floyd COunty COurt 

FOR HARMONY 

CONTINUED PROGRESS 

IN 

FLOYD COUNTY SCHOOLS 

RE-ELECT 

0. R. (PETE) HOWARD- DIST. 1 

DR. J. H. ALLEN - DIST. 2 
TO 

Floyd County Board of Education 

THE FLOYD COUNTY TIMES 

Francis Stores recently donated its seventh annual scholarship to the Prestonsburg 
Community College Scholarship Fund. Gordon Francis, president, and Hansel 
Cooley, (right), assistant manager, present the check to Glen Cowan, center, business 
officer for the college. 

PRESENTS ANNUAL SCHOLARSHIP 
Music-Colvin Chevrolet-Buick recently presented its annual scholarship to the 
Prestonsburg Community College Scholarship Fund for 1970.'71. Estill Lee Carter, 
sales manager, is shown presenting the check to Glen Cowan, right, business officer 
for the college. 

'Litter Camera' 
Contest Slated 

A "Litter Camera Contest" to promote 
youth's interest in a cleaner environment 
has been announced by James Shropshire, 
commissioner of Natural Resources · 

The contest includes two divisions-still 
and motion pictures. 

The winner in each division will receive 
the Kentucky Recognition Award at the 
1970 Environmental Conference to be held 
at the Phoenix Hotel, Lexington, Oct. 25-27. 
The winning film and photograph will be 
shown at the conference. 

The winning photograph also will be 
eligible for a national contest sponsored by 
Keep America .'3eautiful, Inc. 

Movie films must be 16 mm or super 8 
mm, either color or black and white. Still 
photographs must be 8 by 10, either color or 
black and white glossy. 

Entries should be mailed to "Litter," 
Frankfort, Kentucky, 40601, no later than 
midnight, Oct. 1, 1970. Complete rules and 
entry forms may be obtained at the above 
address. 

Shropshire says contestants should at­
tempt to ~how how Kentucky's natural 
beauty is being marred by litter, although 
other themes may be used. 

Kentucky students, age 12 thru college 
level, are eligible for the contest. Out-of­
state students attending Kentucky colleges 
also are eligible. 

The contest is being sponsored by the 
Division of Clean-Up and Beautification, 
Department of Natural Resources, and the 
Make Kentucky a Cleaner, Greener Land 
Committee. 

Dean's List Students 
At Pikeville College 

Pikeville College's spring semester 
Dean's List included nine Floyd countians. 

They are Sandra T. Blankenship, 
Weeksbury; Goldie E. Hamilton, Beaver; 
Russell Shepherd, David; Fonzo Dean 
Akers, Grethel; Glenna Jean Allen, 
Grethel; Elster Eugene Blackburn, Allen; 
Terry Lynn Blackburn, Emma; Buleah 
Hamilton, Beaver; Judith Stamper Mar­
shall, Martin. 

GENERAL 
CONTRACTING 

REMODELING- ROOFING­
PATIOS- CONCRETING 

Call after s p.m. 

886-2687 
or 

CARD OF THANKS 
We, the family of Rhodina Akers, wish to 

thank all of those that helped us during the 
illness and passing of our beloved mother 
and wife. We especially wish to thank the 
ministers of the Regular Baptist Church, 
those that sent floral offerings, and 
especially the Hall Brothers Funeral Home 
for its kind and efficient service. 

THE FAMILY 
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Chaner f\;o ...... .?.~'?.~................. .. National Bank Region No .••. ~ ...... . 

REPORT OF CONDITION. CONSOLIDATING 
DOMESTIC SUBSIDIARIES, OF THE 

IlJE FIB ST NATIONAL BANK _ ____ _,_.of PRESTONSBURG 

IN THE STATE OF ........ KllNTlJ.Cia .........• AT THE CLOSE OF BUSINESS ON .... JlH!!L~Q .................. 1970 
PUBLISHED IN RESPONSE TO CALL MADE BY COMPTROLLER OF THE CURRENCY, UNDER TITLE 
12 UNITED STATES CODE SECTION 161 

Cash Jnd due from banks (induding $ 

U.S. I reasury st:curlltes 

NONE 

ASSETS 

unposted deb1ts) 

Sc~.:urJtie5 of other U.S Government agendcs and corporations • 
Obligations of Slates and polltu:al subdivisions 
Otht.:'r :o.l'..:Ulltu~s ( mdudm~ S NO~E corporate stock) 
Tradwg a..:count Sl't..:untJes 

h·Jcr t funds sqld. and ser..:unoes purch.tsed under agreements to resell 
Loans 
B;mk premise!! , furniture and fixtures. and other ~ssets representing bank premises 
Real estate owned other than bank premises 
Investments lll subsidiJnes not consolidated 
Customers· habthty to this b•wk on a'ceptances outstandmg 

Other ao,~ets (mdudmg S NONE ·- d1rect lease financing) 
!O!Al ,\SSLTS 

LIABILITIES 

Demand <.it:posJts of mdiYtduals, partnerShipS. and corporations 
1 1me and s.avmgs deposits of mdivtduals., partnerships. and corporations 

Dl"posits of Umted States Government 

Dl·poslts of States and politu.:al subdtvl~tons 

Oc-postts of fore1gn governments and offu:ml mstttut•ons 

Oepo~1ts of ~ommerctul banks 

C'ert•h..:d and offkcrs· chcds. etc 

TOTAL DLPOSllS 
(il) rotill demand deposits 
(b) fotal time and savings dt:pos1ts 

~ 23,12~.~~3.01 
s 9,327,786.70 
s 13,801,906.31 

Federal funds puu.:hased and secunt•cs sold under agreements to repurchase 
liabLhttl'S for borrowed money 

Mortgagl" mdehtc:dness 

A~. ... cpldlh~:..c.,t: ... l.lteJ L} ur fo1 J ..... :.uunt uf th,s b.tn~ and ouhtandmg 

Other habilllli..'S 

TOTAl UABIL!TIES 

Ml'<ORITY l"TLRLSI IN CONSOLIDATED SUBSID!ARI~.S 

RESERVES ON LOANS AND SECURITIES 

Resl'rve for b<H.1 debt lOSSl~ on loans (set up pursuant to IRS rulings) 

Other re<;cn·e., 011 loans 
Reservt:s on .,ecuritu:s 

TOTAL RlSFRVFS ON LOA'lS AND SECURITIES 

Lapllal notes and lh:b~nturcs 
Due 
Due 

Equ1ty ,;apltal-total 

l'referrcd :Hock-tot<:~! par value 

1\o. ~hares outstanJing 
Common Stock-total par .,·aJue 

> 
$ 

CAPITAL ACCOUNTS 

~o. share~ authonzed 30,000 
~o. shares outstandmg 30 ._000 

Surplus 

UndJVtded profits 
Reserve for r.:ont•ngen~.:tes and other capttal reserves 

TOTALCAPIIAL A(COU'lTS 
TOTAL L1 \BILl filS . RESERVES, AND CA PITAL ACCOUNTS 

MEMORANDA 

u 

Dollm IL "·!' 
............. 4 .... 639. 209 .j1o 

···•· .2. . 85.8. 920 ' 31 • 
... .... ..J:I9~ ~ 

.. .470 .. 661 . 42 I• 
. ......... .. . ..... 36 ooo. oo I• 

............ . .. NON .•..•....... I• 
• . .......... - ... liON . . 1· 

::··::::::·~~ . ~~~ ~~~: M I; 
...... . .... liON .. ... -··· I! 

.............. NON ............. , 

.... . ~~~~ ~<,O Of : 
24 RR7 Qt.<; gq .: 

6. .909 4137. .89 .• 
.B .26.1 .. 90.6. 31 , 

..... · .. ·:::·~ j~J J~~:: u [: 
. ................ . .NON . . ..... .8 ... 5. l• 

.... .. _6 ]44 .. ' 
.. . . .... 98 889 .63 

................. ... NON ..... 
NON ......... NON······· 
NON .. ,. 
12·;; oiia· 1 ao . 

23 ~~~ 693 01 : 

.... PI 6!_2. 14 
.................. ~~~ ......... ' 

2311612 14. 

.. NON, .. .. 
1 

1 402 640 84 
...................... ' 

..... ..... )00 9()0 .. pp 

.................... 9..00 000 .. 00 I 

.... . .. . zo~ 640 ... 6.4 
NON 

1 402 640 84 
24 887 945 99 

A ver;.~ge of total derosJts for the 15 calendar days endmg with call date ~ ........... Z:l. .. ... 4.Z..l.. .a.~l .. ]')., 
A"·crage of total loans for the 15 calendar d~tys ending with call date ........... 16 ... 421 .. 3.62 .... 3.0 

lntl're\t lOlkdr.:d not cJrncd on 11\Slilllmentloans mcluded m total capital ac:counts ........ ., ....... NON . ....... . 
' 

----~==========~==================~· ] 
1, ,Rus_s_~ P. I-Ia_gfi!.W9()_CL_ ~a ~:h.~-~-~ ..... , of the above-named bank do 

~am~: and 1111..: ol olllcl"r authomcd to \lgn rcporl) 

hereby d~d.He that thl'i report of r.:ondttton is true and ~orrect to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

INTERNATIONAL SAVOR FARE! That's 
JERRY'S 5-Nations approach to 
steakburger enjoyment! Each is served 
with its own national flag-America, 
England, Italy, Mexico, France-
collect them all! 

FRANCE: Merci, La Belle France, for your subtle 
appeteasing Parisian Bleu Cheese! Slathered over 
JERRY'S "Voila Steakburger", it's a little bit 
of oo-LA-LA! Served with golden brown French 

fries (of course!), and tangy 
cole slaw: $1.35. 

• 

(The "sandwich only", with flag: 95¢) 

Where 
eating is 
a family 
affair! 886-6320 

Collins &-Bentley 
Prestonsburg, Ky. 

u.s. 23 & 460 
PRESTONSBURG 
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Local Southern States 
Group Elects Wallen, 
Calhoun to Board 

Jess Wallen and Dode Calh01m, both of 
Water Gap, were elected to the local 
Southern states advisory board at the 
annual membership meeting held at the 
Prestonsburg high school cafeteria, July 
13. More than 100 stockholder-members 
and their families attended the session. 

Mr. Wallen was named chairman of the 
advisory board while Uoyd Wells, of 
~, was chosen secretary. 

Elec;ted to the local Southern States farm 
bi)iDe advisory committee were: Mrs. 
.!dward Hatfield, of Water Gap, and Mrs. 
<llarlie Lafferty, of Prestonsburg. Mrs. 
Hatfield was chosen as chairman of the 
farm home advisory committee and Mrs. 
Lafferty was named secretary. 

Jess Wallen was chosen as a delegate to 
represent the local membership at the 
Southern States Cooperative's 47th an­
niversary annual stockholders' meeting in 
Rictunond, Va., November 12 and 13. Dode 
Calhoun was named alternate. 

Elected as delegate and alternate to a 
district election meeting to be held in 
Lexington this fall were Billie Merritt, of 
Bonanza, and Wes Campbell, of Water Gap, 
respectively. 

One of the highlights of the meeting was 
the financial report of Southern States 
Cooperative given by L. L. McClure, of 
Huntington, W. Va., a regional represen­
tative of the organization. According to the 
report, the cooperative will pay a 2 per cent 
patronage refund to its farmer-members 
this year. Total volume for the year ended 
June 30, was over $137,000,000, up about 11 
per cent over the previous year. 

Kenneth Meade, manager of Prestons­
burg Farm and Home Store, gave the 
report on local operations and services. 

There was also a ceremony honoring new 
board members at which they received 
lapel pins. Retiring board members were 
presented the cooperative's Leadership 
Award in recognition of their services. 

Door prizes, string band music, and a 
sandwich bar and cold drinks were also 
features of the session. 

Want Ads Work! 

MOBILE 
HO ES 

SALES OR 
RENTALS 

A Nice Selection of 
Used Mobile Homes 

8-, 10- or 12-ft. wide models, 
one-, two- or three-bedroom. 

Furnished or unfurnished. 

ADy of these units can be rented, set 
up oa your own lot with 88 per cent of 
rent rebated toward the purcbase. 

Hall Marine & 
Mobile Home Sales 

OPEN SEVEN DAYS 
A WEEK 

Located oo South Lake Drive 
At entrance to Jeaoy WHey State 

Park 

PHONE 886-2771 or .... m7 
PRESTONSBURG, KY. 

SERVICE DEPT. is located at 
Stanville, Ky., Phone 4'78-M83 

Hold Family Reunion 

Mr. and Mrs. Adams, famlly reunion hosts 
and former Floyd coiUlty residents. 

The home of Mr. and Mrs. W. E. Adams, 
Route 2, Sardinia, Ohio, was the scene July 
12 of a family get-together. All relatives of 
Mrs. Adams spent the day at her farm 
visiting and renewing old friendships. The 
following relatives attended: 

Mrs. Sylvia Wright Raines, Grundy, Va.; 
Mr. and Mrs. Bert Hicks and daughter, 
Terri Lynn, Payne, Ohio; Mr. and Mrs. 
Ebner Hicks, Cincinnati, Ohio; Mr. and 
Mrs. Ezra Osborne, Payne, Ohio; Mr. and 
Mrs. Troy Beverly, Dianna, Mary Sue, and 
Timmy, Fairborn, Ohio; Mr. and Mrs. 
Marshall Onley, Mike and Barbi, Cin­
cinnati, Ohio; Mr. and Mrs. John Fulk, 
Susan Kay and Patricia Ann, Pauling, 
Ohio; Mr. and Mrs. Dehner mcks, Pamela, 
Stephane, Eric and Michael, Portsmouth, 
Ohio; Mr. and Mrs. Garrett Keith Hicks, 
Glen Keith and Lisa Kay, Conway, Ohio; 
Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Larry Osborne and 
Stephan, Payne, Ohio; Mr. and Mrs. Floyd 
Lee, Payne, Ohio; Mrs. Art Carroll, An· 
nette and Tricia Lynn of Fairborn, Ohio; 
Mr. and Mrs. Gene Retuman, Cincinnati, 
Ohio; Mr. and Mrs. Richard DeMarco and 
Deanna Rae, Hamersville, Ohio; Mrs. 
Havana Coburn Winkle, Georgetown, Ohio; 
Mr. and Mrs. Edwin Reffett and sons Bill 
and Eric, Georgetown, Ohio; Mr. and Mrs. 
Forest Coburn and Robert, Mt. Orab, Ohio; 
Mr. and Mrs. Forest Coburn, Jr. and son 
James Douglas, Sardinia, Ohio; Mrs. Lula 
Coburn, Garrett, Ky.; Mrs. Marsella 
Coburn Bradley, Garrett, Ky.; Mrs. 
Martha Bradley, Hueysville, Ky.; Mr. and 
Mrs. Ebb Gibson, Wlllard, Ohio; Mrs. and 
Mrs. Arthur Coburn and son Danny, Lima, 
Ohio; Mrs. Anna Case, Sardinia, Ohio; 
Mrs. Carolyn Sue Bradford, Columbus, 
Ohio. 

Three from County 
In 1970 'Who's Who' 

Three Alice lloyd College students from 
Floyd county have been selected for in· 
elusion in the 1970 edition of "Who's Who in 
American Junior Colleges." 

They are Estill Newsome, Bevinsville, 
and Mary Shelton and Pat Shelton, of Drift. 

"Who's Who in American Junior 
Colleges" provides a national basis for the 
recognition of outstanding campus leaders. 
It includes listings from over 500 schools in 
all 50 states. Nominations are submitted 
from each junior college after selection by 
a campus committee. 

A total of five Alice Uoyd students will be 
included in the 1970 edition. 

THANK YOU 
Due to so many names on the register 

that I did not know where to send cards to, I 
want to take this opportunity to thank ev.-y 
one for every expressions of sympathy 
upon the passing of my mother, Mrs. Grace 
Sparks, and for the love and kindness of the 
Mountain Manor Nursing Home, the 
minister, Bob Martin, the singers from tbe 
choir of the Free Will Baptist Churclt at 
Auxier, and the wonderful services of tbe 
Floyd Funeral Home. From the bottom of 
my heart, thank you and God bless YGIJ. 

LOUCILLE MONTGOMERY 

MAKE THE BIG MOVE! 

SEEK EXPERTS FOR 
MONEY MATTERS! 

You'll find the people at our bank a 

good source of financial advice! If you 

are seeking a personal or auto lof!n, 

come to our bank for help. 

FIRST GUARANTY BANK 
of Martin, Kentucky 

Member Fede Deposit lnsuraoce Corporatfeo 

THE FLOYD COl.NTY TIMES Tlft!RSDAY. JULY 31, 11'71 

Community College Students 
Are Rated Even with Others 

The VA suggests that G. I. insurance 
policyholders who receive VA com­
pensation or pension payments may want 
to consider having their insurance 
premiums deducted from their monthly 
checks. 

NOTICE 
Upon and after publication of this notice 1 

I will not be responsible for debts incurred 
by any person other than myself. 

LAWRENCE CONLEY 
A study by a doctoral student at the 

University of Kentucky on the performance 
of community college transfer students 
compared to students who took all their 
academic work on the central UK campus 
reveals no difference in the performance of 
the two groups. 

Dr. Ronnie N. Sutton, a native of 
Brodhead in Rockcastle county and 
presently director of admissions at Western 
Kentucky University, concluded in his 
doctoral thesis that "there is no disad­
vantage, in terms of the factors considered 
in this study, for the student who chooses to 
attend a local community college for the 
first two years of a baccalaureate 
program." 

He used a matched-pair design with the 
rationale that there might be a significant 
difference in the community college 
students as a group and the "native" 
students as a group, selecting 140 pairs of 
students and matching them on the basis of 
the following six characteristics: 

The region of the state served by a 
community college, sex, high school 
grades, college entrance scores, college 
major, and the high school attended. 
Academic performance in college was 
measured in terms of grade-point 
averages. 

The respective grade-point averages for 
the transfer students and the native 

students were: 2.83 and 2.64, cumulative at 
graduation; 2.88 and 2.54, cumulative in the 
lower division; 2.78 and 2.73, cumulative in 
the upper division. A comparison within 
each year revealed transfer student 
averages of 2.76, 2.98, 2.61, and 2.88 and 
native student averages of 2.51, 2.58, 2.57, 
and 2.83 for the first, second, third and 
fourth years, respectively. 

Lackey, Ky. 7-16-.'Jt 

Your vote for 

Dr. Sutton said a community college 
graduate who is able to persist to 
graduation at UK may expect to receive 
grades in his local college that will average 
0.3 of a letter grade higher than grades he 
would receive in the lower division on the 
central campus. 

DR. JAME D. ADAMS 
for The student may expect his grades to fall 

in the first semester after transfer to a 
point equal to what he would have earned if 
he had attended central campus classes in 
ldJ lower division work. Also, Dr. Sutton 
revealed, he may expect his cumulative 
academic record to be higher - due to 
higher grades in the lower division - than 
it would have been if he had attended the 
central campus for all his course work. 

School Board, Division No. 1 
"He may expect to complete his degree 

with an equal number of hours attempted 
and in the same amount of time that would 
be required if he had completed all 
requirements for graduation on the central 
campus," Dr. Sutton concluded. 

will be appreciated. 

The All-American Truck • • • • The 

Sold By The Largest Dealer For Mack 
Coal Trucks In The United States • • • • 

Eastern Kentucky Mack, Inc. 
Prestonsburg, Kentucky 

50 Of 
60 Met~ & Used 

ltutks On 
l ' 

lt lnttime 
Out 0 

MORE THAN $350,000 IN PARTS 
STOCKED IN OUR PRESTONSBURG DEALERSHIP. 

We Have The Largest Service facility In Appalachian Region 

EA TERN KY. 
MACK, INC. 

PHONE (606) 874-2172-0R- (606) 874-2141- Hwy. 23 S- PRESTONSBURG, KY. 
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This is a storewide sale, including our name brand merchandise- Hotpoint, 
Kelvinator, Maytag, Bassett, Sealy, Kroehler, Cochrane, Crestwood - All 
names that ou recognize. See us during this sale .. We'll make the price right! 

Dinette Suites 
37 TO CHOOSE FROM. 

A RED-HOT SALE SPECIAL! . . 

9-Pc. Dinette 
Table and Eight Chairs 

Regular ONLy 
$149.97 .7 

Early American -Modern 
French Provincial - Spanish 

Living oo 
Suites 

86 Suites in Stock To Choose From 
Large Selection of F abrica and Colora 

This week-end 

25% Discount 
Living Room Tables 
Finest and Largest Selection in the Mountains 

Solid Maple, Cherry, Marble Top 

Reclining 
Chai s 

YOU WILL HAVE TO SEE THIS CHAIR 
TO BELIEVE THS LOW PRICE 

s59.88 
Bedroom Suites 
We have 7 4 Bedroom Suites in Stoclt 

Maple- Pecan- Cherry- Oak­
Walnut. We Invite You to Come and Look 
At this Fine Selection. 

All Yours At 

25% Discount 
Solid Mapl .. 1 >"'-· 

DilliNG ROOM FURNITU 
l07 Pieces of the Finest Solid Maple 
Room Furniture, And at A Price You 
Like. 

25%Disc unt 

Da 

PECIAL CLOSE OUT 

SCREEN DOORS 
WN CHAIR 

SPECIAL CLOSE OUT PRICE' 
On All 

SUMMER MERCHANDISE 
Swim Pools, Porch and Lawn Furniture, 
Beach Toys, Ball Gloves and Balls, Tennis 
Racquets, Croquet Sets, Lawn Mowers, 
Porch Swings, Many Other Items .. 

Hot point 

Electric Range 
Full 40-in. Range with 
clock timer, large oven 

Reg. $369.95 

SALE$ 6 .7 
Hotpoint 

Electric ange 
Full 40-in. Range with 
clock timer, large oven, 

deluxe trim. 

Reg. $399.95 

SALE $299. 

_Standard trim 

Reg. $299.95 

SALE $2 • 
Enterprite 

7 

7 

Electric Range 
Full-size range, clock 
timer, oven window. 

Reg. $279.95 

SALE $199.77 
Enterprise 

Electric Range 
Full 36-in. standard Range. 

Reg. $229.95 

SALE $179.77 
Enterprise 

Gas Range 
Full 36-in. Ran.ge 

White- avacado- copper 
Reg. $229.95 

SALE $179.95 
Enterpme 

Gas Range 
Standard trim 
Reg. $219.95 

SALE $159.77 

PAINT SALE 
LATEX FLAT WALL PAINT 

OUTSIDE WHITE HOUSE PAINT 
ALUMINUM PAINT 

METAL ROOF PAINT 

Y•;:, ~:~~· $3.99 gallon 

Enterprise 

Gas Range 
Deluxe Range, clock 

timer, oven window, large 20-in. oven. 
Reg. $289.95 

SALE $236.77 
Enterprise Deluxe 

Gas Range 
All deluxe features 

Reg. $249.95 

SALE $199.95 
Enterprise 30-in. 

Eye-Level Range 
A real buy! 1 

SALE $349.95 
White - avacado - copper 

Hotpoint 

Refrigerator 
9.6 cu. ft., 51-Ib. Freezer. 

Reg. $229.95 

SALE $178.88 
Hotpoint 

Refrigerator 
12 cu. ft., 86-lb. Freezer, 

automatic defrost. 

SALE $259.95 
(with trade) 

White- copper- avacado 

Hotpoint 

Refrigerator 
14 cu. ft., 102-lb. Freezer, 

automatic defrost. 

$299.95 
(with trade) 

White- copper- avaca ... 

Hotpoiat 

Refrigerator 
14 cu. ft. deluxe, no-frost 

ONLY $329.95 
(\t'kh trade) 

-CONDITIONERS and FANS AT SPEOAL CLOSE 
FREE DELIVERY - FREE NORMAL INSTALLATION - UP TO 24 MONTHS TO PAY 

PAGE FIFTEEN 

FR·EE!- FREE! 
Steam Dry-Iron 

with the purchase of 
any appliance during 

this sale. 

PLUMBING SUPPLIES 
Deep Well Pump ¥2-b.p. $129.77 
Bath Outfit 3-Piece White steel $129.77 

Water Heater 30-Gallon Gas $59.77 

Y2 -ln. Plastic Pipe 2C per foot 
4-ln. Plastic 

Sewer Tile $1.99 10-ft. joint 

Sealy Mattress 
and Box Springs 

While 50 pieces last .•• 

$39.00 each 

* Compare at $119.90! 

$79.90 perset 

* Compare at $129.95! 

per sl'l 89 • 9 
* Compare at $139.90 

per set $99 • 0 
HUFFY LAWN MOWER 

SPECIAL CLOSE-OUT! 
3-h.p. 

Huffy Lawn Mower 
Reg. $69.95 

Cl~~~~~ut $49.97 
5-pc. 

Maple Dinette 
Maple Extension Table, 

Four Mates Chairs 
During this sale, only 

$129.77 

Swing Sets 
SPECIAL CLOSE -OUT PRICE 
$10.00 Discount 

Only if in Carton 

7-pc. 

1\tlaple Dinette 
Large maple Extettsion Table, 

6 high-back Mates Chairs. 
Durin1 this sale only 

$199.95 

T PRICES! 

Wm. ARROWOOD HARDWARE & FURNITURE 
Street, Phone 886·2703 Two Locations In Prestonsburg To Serve You Better South Lake Drive, Phone 886-6116 
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These were booked to Prestonsburg 
police coart: 

Martin Auxier, spee:liQc at 85 miles in a 
50-mile zone, by Policemen Thomu Black· 
tun and Lonnie Herald; Turner Laferty, 
drunk driving, by Policeman Blackbum; 
Rubin Montgomery, drunk driving, by 
State Trooper PbUlip Tucker; John F. 
DeRossett, operatina a motor veblcle wbile 
license revoked or suapended, by 
Policemen Blackburn and Hale; Gary Lee 
Castle, drunk driving and no ~tor's 
Jicen8e, by State Troopen Bf9ina and 
Tucker. -------
Cites Ky. Statute 
Setting Fee at 17 

Referring to a recent assistant attorney 
general's opinion -.,lding tbat a sheriff may 
not charge a fee m advance for aenlng a 
process or maki~Jg an arrest in a 
misdemeanor case ut must colllct fees 
from court costs, Slleriff Frauk Lel1le this 
week cited the list of fees prepared by the 
Kentucky Sheriffs' Association as 
authorized by KRS 64.080. 

This statute, accordiq to the 
~ation, p:ovides a fee of f1 in such 
caill This II tbe amount Sledtr Leslie had 
cUrpcl. 

CARD OF TRlNII. 
We wish to express our ~:appreciation 

to all our friends and ~who ex-
tended sympathy to us d the passing 
of our loved one, John W. land, Sr. 

They 8l"e residing at 425 Main street, 
Wheetwlilbt. Ky. 

We thank those who sent lloral tributes, 
food or extended other actsC'lJdndness. We 
express special appreciation to Rev. 
William Pope for his consollll words, the 
choir of the Firat United Mtlllodist Church 
for the beautiful music aad the Carter 
Funeral Home for its kind and efficient 
service. 

MRS. MINNIE GRACE SUTHERLAND 
MR. AND MRS. JOHN stmfERLAND, 

JR. 

C'MON IN! THE 
SAVINGS ARE FINE! 

Take tM plunge at B. A D. dnrlnl tbeJr ead-of-m.aa ules 
special. You'll eome up aU llllllel aad dollan allead! BJ& 
atoek of late-model used can, and several bnuld MW .... ._.. .c..... .. Mft. 

1969 Fori ltltJit 500 
4-Doef ltr.top 

AD er, aiM a ZlbDed. Loaded 
wlllljlltras. Greea wblte vinyl 
top. 

1969 httlac Grt.. "11 
l•tttr Hardtop 

Loaded! oodiUonlog, _.. 
black top. 

1967 ltSa~rt 
2-Door ••P 

All extras, aiM: JF 7llb"lng. 

1967 Gtvtllt 
1-leor Har• 

V-8 e-ngiM, dpdard shift, 
black vinyl 

1966 Ply 
2-Doer 

ltlndtrt 
.top 

V-8 eqioe, auto,.. transmission, 
wHia power, solid nt. One owner, 
like ... 

1969 Po1tiK TO 
2·htr Hardt" 

t .. eedtranmdutoo, V-IHCIN,aU 
exau. Greea. 

1961 .... ctry (IIIII' 

2·Dttr H•r•top 
V-8 .,me, aut.&aaUe tra•mlsaloo, 
ll'eiBII wUia whllle 'rillyl tep, wl6 

1969 For• Gtl11lt SOO 
2-Door Htr.ttp 

V .. .,me, automatic traumilaloo, 
er. 

1967 Cbwroltt a.pllt 
S,ort Co1p1 

V-8 ellll-.; ltalldard traosmklll., 
solid bla& 

1961 01•••1111• 442 
2-Doer lllr•top 

19 P1y•01t~ Sptrts hry 
'·Dtor Hardtop 

V-8 eniiM, .atematlc tramn'srta•, 
with pow•, ltlae. Sharp. 

1961 Cllnrtltt l•p•l• 
4-Dotr Btrdtop 

automatic 
...... J..ike new. 

'11'' •• ,..-nroltt Fleetsl•• 
Ttl Plcbp 

V-8 e~1111-.. wlth eaUle rack. 

1965 CIIIYroltt Fltttsidt 
~-Ttl Pick., 

v..a engiDe, standard hnsuliu .... 

SEVERAL NEW 
1970 VOLKSWAGENS IN STOCK . 

ALSO, TWO, LIKE '68's A liLAB 
AR Real Ga Savers and Loaded w h Extr 

TRAOEATB.&D.WHEREYO GET 
USED CAR WARR NTY, BACKUP SERVI E, THE 

. -- -· . 
WeMakeYeullappyToKeepUaHappy." 

DRIFT CLUB A NOUNCES SECOND 
ANNUAL HORSE SHOW FOR SEPT. 13 

--- 2 ---
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WHAT'S NEW? 
Pity the modem youngster I There not 

only is nothing new under the sun for him­
whatever it is that he finds is so old the S1lt 
hal dried it up. 

U one of this unJlappy generation were 
find a dinosaur track, fresh iD the mud 
would not generate half the exciteme 
lieycle created our neighborhood, o 

The Drift Woman's Cub willllpoDIOr' its 
second annual horae show at the Drift ball 
park September 13 at 2 p.m. 

The show wUl feature the following 
clares: Lead Une, Five Gaited Pony, 
Pony (to 48 inches), Western Pleasure, 
Open Pltllsure, Amateur Walking Hones, 
Amateur Racking, Englllb Pleasure, Open 
~ Horses, Racking Ponies (to 
58 incllef), Open Pleasure aa., Open 
Racking Jorses, Open Walking Horses and 
Open Fi aited Hwses. 

With exception of the Lead Line upon a far~ff time. This vehicle 
pedalled through e dust which lay d 
a country road We youngsters g 
glimpse of it but re denied tbe pri · 

Class, 81 trophy and four cups wUl be 
a awarded in each cJaas. Awards wUl be 
e given to.U. entries in tbe Lead Line Class. 

of touching the y marvel or of 
with the dashing list. So what did w 
We followed the ks as far as we d 
go from the ho . 

That, of co , was in the days _,.. 
dust squirted between your toes 
you walked . . . ore lives were clu 
up even with a one, a talking IIUII•e 
(record-playet to you), a r-io, 
automobile or y of those newf'-1180 
things that I've t now persuaded m1Jelf 

Three CISh prizes wiD be given in each 
class wl1ll the exception of the Lead Line 
Class. 

Concellion stands will be operated by the 
club. Proceeds from the show wUl go to the 
Drift Woman's Club Sbcolarsbip Fund and 
to other community projects. 

Pltltto shows some of damage by Dewey Lake road, ap. 
are here to stat 

v~ statistics registered in Kentucky 
fro~ 1852-1862are housed in the Old Capit9J. 
in ~kfort. Cental registration of birOls 
and d.liaths only began again in 1911 and are 
houselin the State Health Building, Frank­
fort. parently the result of heavy coat · .... lrlr traffic. Joe Creason the one in his QJurier-

--- 1 ---
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asked Bruce Stephens, Jr., Kentucky River 
Coal Corp. executive, and others the 
reasons behind the boom. He wrote in the 
LouisYille newspaper of his findings: 

StepbeDa and others credit the price spurt 
to a comllination of factors, mainly the new 
Mining Health and Safety Act, whieb 
requires expensive new equipment in 
undergJ'CUid mines. 

A shortqe of railroad hoppers and low 
estimatel of coal needs by some utlliti• 
helped • the trend. And strikes in four 
mining l&ates, including Kentucky, have 
taken tbllr bite out of production. 

"The llllety law hasn't done anything for 
safety, but tt sure has hit the consumer In 
the eye," lekl Cloyd McDowell, secretary 
of the Har._ County Coal Operators Assn. 
"The consumer is paying for something 
foolish tbat Congress did last winter." 

"The prosperity you hear about isn't u 
big as it might seem," he said, "because 
you don't put $1 million worth of equipmeat 
tbat you don't need in a mine without 
hurting in the pocketbook." 

McDowell said Harlan operators 
nevertheless are raising miners' pay $2 to 
$4 a day to hold their workers. 

Blue Diamond Coal Co. ~t Leatherwood; 
Perry county, recently raised miners' pay 
voluntarily by 90 cents an hour even thougll 
it had a contract in force with the Southern 
Labor Union. 

The demand for coal and the resulting 
industry-wide price rise have created some 
problems, too, especiallY for mouniain 
operators. Reports wetf! fldnlln most of 
the coal counties tbat recruiters from high­
paying Western Kentucky operations have 
succeeded in hiring men in Eastern Ken­
tucky. 

Of aU problems, however, operators are 
growling loudest over a continuing shor­
tage of rail hoppers to ship their coal. 

"If we could get the hoppers, you'd see 
some real prosperity," McDowell said. 
"We could ship 30 per cent more coal. The 
operators would make more, and I'd say 
the miners could make 40 per cent more 
tban they're making now." 

Today there are fewer hopper cars than 
there were In 11160, according to the 
Association of AIDerican Railroads. 

The continued rille in exports is adding to 
the problem. for the 
Louisville & Railroad said ex-
ports tie up twice as long as do 
domestic shiJ,DM! 

And while 
new technical 
to push demand ~ 

One 
systems that 
coal and still 
restrictions. 

in short supply now, 
10p11nents are expected 

higher. 
is wllution control 

it possible to burn 
low sulpher emission 

(Continuect.trom Page 'One) 

MARRIAGE LJc;:INSES 
William Can!fbeiJ, III, 20, Water Gap, 

and Deborah Jean Hall, 20, Mar11D; Volney 
Brent Allen, 20, Langley, and lAnda Lou 
Robinson, 20, Prestonsburg; otlia.slone, 18, 
David, and Nancy Slone, 18, Wes& Prestons· 
bq; Malcobn T. Shepherd, 1J, West 
Preltonsburg, and Peggy BraoiMpn, 17, 
Preltonsburg; Larry Joe Joh• Nl, 22, 
Palfttsville, and Lorene Peft.J, 21, 
Prtlkmaburg. 

Notice of Sale · 
The unclirsigned will on Sa day, 

August 8, 1970 at 10 a.m. (EST) olrer for 
sale to tile hipest •d best bidder at Its 
place of business at Wayland, Ky., the 
followin8 delcribed automobiles to satisfy 
storage and wrecker service charges: 

One 1163 Corvair twCMloor sedan, Serial 
No.~. 

One Paotlac Tempest four-door sedan, 
Serial No.IOIPlOU&e. 

One 1• Pontiac BomaevUle Convertible, 
Serial No. IS2875Xl331e. 

FRALEY-DEARING 
MOTOR SAl '.8, l8C. 
Jy • E. ne.iDI 

7-Ja.a. 

Eat at --- 4 ---
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because Conley died at a Floyd county 
hospital. 

Journal columD :~bout the oldtime ,poun­
tain preacher 't1ao had spent two. hours 
delivering a ll;mon on the eftll of 
moonshine drinldog, "If you do ~e to 
drink," the old lellow finally condnded, 
"buy it from Brother Adron -he nlakes it 
powerful good.' 

Salyers Restaurant 
GarreH, Ky. 

Where the school crowds co. 
Other slayin11 scheduled for in· 

vestigation are tbaee of Guy Bate. on 
Jack's Creek and Lemuel 0. (Sammie) 
Foley, Jr., on Brandy Keg, near here. 

Sudwiebes-Sof~rt-orders. 

0 
F 
F 

• 

Diseases of the heart were the Jta1ding 
Ph.~idayor~ 

cause of death of all Kentuckians 35in 
Mr .• tin. ALBERT SALYERS, Owoen 

1967. 

• 
PRESTONSIURG, KY. 

LADIES' SUMM 
Reduc 

MERCHANDISE 
To /2 Off 

90% ~~~r SUM MERCHANDISE 
1/2 OFF Yes, We Said .. 1/2 OFF 

SPECIAL 
RACK OF SUMMER DRESSES 
VALUES TO $24.95 Now $5.00 

SPECIAL 
RACK OF SUMMER BLOUSES 
VALUES TO $12.00 

SPECIAL RACK 
OF LADIES' 

VALUES TO $24.95 

Now $3.00 

FOR THE MEN! HERE'S THE BARGAINS 
YOU'VE BEEN WAITING FOR ... 

BUY ONE 

SPORT SHIRT 
Get 
One FREE 

BUY ONE 

SPORT COAT 
GetAnother $750 

For 

BUY ONE PAIR 

DRESS SLACKS 
Get Another $2 00 

Pair For 

BUY ONE 

SUIT 
Get Another $1 o 00 

For 

Ask Barbara Burke, Barbara Howard or Mike Helton About Our 

NEW FALL MERCHANDISE 
NOW ARRIVING DAILY 

SEE OUR NEW FALL SELECTION OF 
KUPPENHEIMER SUITS AND SPORTCOATS 

Shop B. F. CASUAL, Homtof Nationally-Advertised Merchandise. 
Owned and Operated -Y Ruthie and Bill Goebel, Jr. 

0 
F 
F 
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